
Festival Photos 
A 14 

tax increase 
by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

Floyd Countians can expect to see 
higher property taxes this year as the 
Floyd County Board of Education 
voted to pass a general fund tax in­
crease at its regularly scheduled 
meeting at Adams Middle School 
Tuesday evening 

The board's decision followed a 
special public hearing prior to 
Tuesday's meeting to allow the pub­
lic the opportunity to comment on the 

"'new tax. However, only one person 
spoke at the thirty-minute meeting 
before board chairman Ray "Shag" 
Campbell broke off the monologue 
to begin the regular monthly board 
meeting. 

Superintendent Stephen Towler 
introduced discussion on the new tax 
rate, and said that although regret­
table, it was necessary. 

"I can assure you that no one in 
this room enjoys a tax increase­
even though it is a slight increase. a 
very slight increase," Towler said. 
''(H ) . . " owever , It IS necessary .... 

Towler instructed the board that 
the fom percent increase was allow­
able under the Kentucky Education 
Refonn Act. but any further increase 

would be subject to a public vote. 
Only board members Eddie Bil­

lips and James A. Duff opposed the 
tax increase, which passed 3-2. Bil­
lips said outside the meeting hall that 
the board's decision did not affect his 
opinion. 

"My position hasn't changed ... ," 
Billips said. "I think we owe it to the 
public to give them a more exact 
accounting before we ask for more of 
their money." 

Billips said that he felt the in­
crease might be warranted if the board 
were to hold a special public meet­
ing, offering a specific, detailed out­
lay of the Floyd County School 
system's annual income and expen­
ditures. 

"We just ought to show them 
where the money is going," Billips 
said. 

The general fund tax levied in the 
1991-1992 fiscal year was 58.6 cents 
per each $100 valuation on real prop­
erty, and generated an estimated 
revenue of$3,729, 624. 

The new tax approved by the board 
Tuesday for the 1992-1993 fiscal year. 
61.6 cents per $100, represents a four 
percent increase in revenues from 
local taxation over the last fiscal year. 
and is expected to yield $3,920.571. 

Principal goes to court 
with appeal of dism·ss 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

A Floyd County principal who 
was fired in July for filing a false 
employmentapplication has appealed 
the ruling of a three-member tribunal 
that upheld his dismissal to Floyd 
Circuit Court. 

Lewis"Spike" Berkhimer, former 
principal at Wheelwright High 

Airplane, deer 
collide at airport 

• StateRepresentativeGregStumbo 

. ) 

escaped serious injury Monday morn­
ing when the plane he was flying 
struck a deer as he was trying to land 
at the Big Sandy Regional Airport in 
Martin County. 

Stumbo was arriving from 
Frankfort when he landed at the air­
J>911 at 12:30 a.m. As his plane was 
rolling to a stop, a deer ran out of 
nearby bushes and under the plane. 

A piece of plastic between the 
propeller and the fuselage was bro· 
ken on impact Pieces of deer hide 
and hair were found under the plane, 
but the animal could not be found. 

Martin, Allen 
the places to be 
for festival fun 

Four days of fun in Floyd County 
will begin Thursday October 15 at 
Martin with the opening of the 23rd 
annual Red, White and Blue Days 
and culminating Sunday at Stumbo 
Park at Allen with WMDJ's annual 

• Day in the Park. 
Martin'sRed, White and Blue Days 

will include a gospel sing on Thurs­
day; and live entertainment, food, 
games, crafts and clogging on Fri­
day. 

On Saturday, October 17, the day­
long agenda includes a car show, a 
flag raising ceremony and a parade, 
which begins at 3 p.m. 

The Red, White and Blue festival 
was established by Marcella Bailey 
as a means of honoring the region's 
veterans. 

School, was fired by interim superin­
tendent Eldon Smith for failing to 
include on his application that he 
pleaded guilty to contributing to the 
unrulinessofaminorin 1976 in Ohio. 

Berkhimer's attorney ,John Caud­
ill, appealed his client's firing to a 
three-member tribunal which heard 
the case September 21 and 22. The 
panel ruled that Berkhimer's firing 
was justified and that Berkhimer be 
allowed to submit a valid employ­
ment application with the Floyd 
County School System. 

The appeal is based on I 0 points 
which deal with constitutional issues 
raised by Caudill, one being that 
Berkhimer was denied his due proc­
ess rights by the state's Office of 
Educational Accountability because 
OEA refused to tum over the results 
of an investigation into the charge. 

Other points raised by Caudill 
include an open records and an open 
meetings violation and statutatory 
timelines that deal with when 
Berkhimer was notified that he was 
ftredandtheamountoftimehehadto 
appeal his termination. 

The appeal asks the court to re­
verse the decision of the tribunal and 
that Berkhimer be reinstated as prin­
cipal at Wheelwright 

WEDNESDAY • ~o~...., £\.¥I otfpr~ 
551 400 s 00 

October 14, 1992 LEWIS B1NDERY 
190 LANDOR DR 
ATHENs, GA 

·They're off!... · . · .·· .. · 

Window into history 
Eastern Kentucky Racing Incorporated president and Kentucky Downs owner Clyde Woods made history 
Saturday afternoon as he placed the first legal paramutual wager on horse racing In Kentucky east of 
Lexington. (photo by Geoff Belcher) 

Woods' bet 
is history 
for region 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

The air was filled with smoke and 
anticipation Saturday afternoon at 
Kentucky Downs as gold-sequined 
waitresses served cash-laden custom­
ers who eagerly awaited the fiTSt race 
with visions of daily doubles dancing 
in their heads. 

At 12:15 p.m. exactly, Kentucky 
Downs owner and Eastern Kentucky 
Racing Incorporated President Clyde 
Woods placed the frrst ever legal 
wager on horse racing in Kentucky 
east of Lexington, thus ending a six­
month long battle to allow Eastern 
Kentucky the same privilege as has 
been enjoyed by the rest of the state 
for decades. 

Eastern Kentucky Racing director 
and attorney Ched Jennings said 
Monday that although many who 
were unable to attend Kentucky 
Downs' grand opening due to previ­
ous commitments and involvement 

(See Races, page two) 

Stumbo criticizes Boysen, OEA; 
edUcation group returns fire 

Representative Greg Stumbo 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

Floyd County Education Forum 
members passed a resolution Mon­
day criticizing an "attack" on state 
Education Commissioner Thomas 
Boysen and the Office of Education 
Accountability by State Representa­
tive Greg Stumbo last week. 

Stumbo last week accused Boy­
sen of being a "prima dona" who 
surrounded himself with high paid 
employees and said that the Depart­
ment of Education is "right back in 
themessitwasin"beforeKentucky's 

Council to explore alternatives : 

Education Reform Act was passed. 
Forum members said the timing 

of Stumbo's remarks "makes it ap­
pear that he is using his official posi 
tion to prevent the state's oversight 
of KERA's implementation and en­
forcement in Floyd County." 

The resolution added that mem­
bers were "proud" of Stumbo's ef­
forts to pass KERA, but urged the 
house majority leader to let the proc­
ess of reform work. 

"He knows the problems of this 
school system as well as anyone­
and he knows that, unfortunately. this 
system has qotresolved its problems, 

and that continued state intervention 
is necessary," the resolution said. 

It was also reported last week that 
in August, Stumbo apparently tried 
to use his legislative influence to 
obtain information from the Office of 
Education Accountability concern­
ing an investigation into Wheelwright 
principal Lewis Berkhimer who was 
accused of Sexually touching a stu­
dent and who was fired in July for 
filing a false employment applica­
tion. Berkhimer was fired in July for 
filing a fraudulent application. The 

(See Stumbo, page two) 

Job cuts proposed to address shortfall 
by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

The city of Prestonsburg is losing 
over $20,000 per year, Councilman 
Billy Ray Collins said at Monday 
evening's regularly scheduled city 
council meeting, and that annual loss 
may cost three city employees their 
jobs. 

The city's municipal parking lots 
are costing the city much more reve­
nue than they bring in, Collins said, 

due to leasing, payroll and worker's 
compensation expenses and the un­
reliability of the city's metering sys­
tem. 

Collins suggested that the council 
remove the three attendants at the 
municipal parking lot across from the 
Floyd County Courthouse and install 
a pay·meter and permit parking sys­
tem, thus saving the city employee 
expenses. Collins also recommended 
that the city install new meters at the 
city's two other municipal lots and 

asked city administrator Mark Wells 
to compile a earnings/loss record for 
each lot so that the council could 
determine a more efficient means of 
maintaining the lots while collecting 
the needed revenue. 

"We're just trying to fmd ways 
and means to trim and cut (the city's 
budget) without wiping the city out," 
Collins said. 

Councilman Mike Vance sug­
gested that alternative means be 
sought before firing the municipal lot 

More assistance, volunteers needed for program : 

employees, reasoning that there could 
beanotherwaytosavethecitymoney 
without putting the three men out of 
work. 

Collins and the council's other 
traffic committee members were di­
rected to have a more in-depth report 
available at the council's next regu­
larly scheduled meeting. 

Among other items discussed at 
Monday's meeting: 

(See Shortfall, page six) 

Cooking up aid for seniors 
by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

Growing old, often alone, can 
become a trying time when it be­
comes difficult to run simple errands, 
perform simple household tasks or 
muster up enough energy to cook a 
good nutritional meal. 

For some, being admitted to a 
nursing home is one meal away. 

For others, staying in their own 
homes is possible through the will­
ingness of people volunteering their 
time and senior citizen centers pro­
vidingthemaheartymealafivedays 
a week. 

"There are over 180 seniors on a 

Big Sandy counties will share 
in return of coal permit fees 

The Floyd, Johnson, Pike, Martin 
andMagoffin Fiscal Courts are among 
42 Kentucky county governments that 
will receive shares of more than 
$702,000 in returned coal mining fees 
this week. 

of these fees may be returned to the 
coal-producing counties from which 
they came and the county govern­
ments may use the money for com­
munity projects. 

waiting list in five counties that need 
a meal a day," Sandy Williamson, 
volunteer sc-.rvice coordinator forB ig 
Sandy ADD, said ''For some sen­
iors. they're just one meal away from 
being placed in a nursing home." 

In conjunction with National Day 
of Volunteering on November 14, 
local senior citizen center directors 
are working with Williamson to fo­
cus on the daily needs of older citi­
zens. 

Patsy Evans, director of the 
Prestonsburg Senior Citizens Center, 
said the Prestonsburg center provides 
one meal a day for 35 citizens in the 
Prestonsburg area and 40 others are 
on a waiting list. 

Country music star Steve Wariner 
will headline WMDJ's annual Day in 
the Park celebration on Sunday, Oc- Hand-delivered, made with love 

The returned funds are part of the 
rebate that coal-producing counties 
receive from the Kentucky Depart­
ment for Surface Mining Reclama­
tion and Enforcement's pcrmilting 
and acreage fees. 

Of the $702,154.12 in returned 
mining fees, Floyd County will re­
ceive $35,748.66; Johnson County 
will receive $4,793.17; Pike County 
will receive $139,009.66; Martin 
County will reccive$16,376.83; and 
Magoffin County will receive 
$11.572.50. 

A "Meals on.Wheels" program is 
offered through the Prestonsburg 
center where volunteers prepare the 
meals at the center in the mornings 
and then are delivered to the 35 sen­
iors in a car which Evans won in a 
drawing held at Big Sandy ADD. tober 18 at Allen Prestonsburg resident Ora Lee Wireman can count on a hot meal during * A variety of m ~sical entertainment the week from Zelia Collins a driver for the Prestonsburg Senior Citizen's 

is on tap for the event, all fre~ o~-Center. The Prestonsburg Center p~ovldes a meal to 35 elderly persons 
charge to the public. !I · fl~ays a week. (photo by Susan A1lan) 

', ·f(. 
According to state law, one-third (See Seniors, page six) 
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Making history .•. 
A sizable crowd turned out Saturday for the opening day of Kentucky Downs, participating In a history­
making occasion that marked the first time legalized horserace wagering was conducted In Eastern 
Kentucky. Kentucky Downs simulcast the opening day of Keeneland's fall meet Saturday. (Photo by Geoff 
Belcher) 

Races----------------(Continued from page one) 

with Prestonsburg's 11th Annual 
Jenny Wiley Festival, opening day 
attendance was nearly double the 
anticipated amounl 

Over 450 men, women and chil­
dren arrived Saturday to watch the 
simulcastoftheopeningoftheKeene­
land meet, Jennings said, wagering 
more than $61,000. More than 200 
people showed up Sunday as well, 
Jennings said, wagering another esti­
mated $40,000. 

State Representative Greg Stumbo 
said Monday that the outpouring of 
support for the facility was very 
encouraging, not only for those who 
are financially involved with Eastern 
Kentucky Racing, but also for every­
one in the entire region. 

"There are a lot of people who 
criticize Eastern Kentucky for a 
(perceived) lack of entrepeneurial 
spirit ... ," Stumbo said. "They say that 
everybody wants to take their money 
and leave. I think Clyde Woods ought 
to be commended for believing in the 

region and (proving them wrong)." 
Stumbo said that the phenomenal 

success of Kentucky Downs' grand 
opening should help convince the 
Kentucky Racing Commissioners, 
who are currently mulling their pre­
vious decision to deny 1993 live 
harness racing dates to Eastern Ken­
tucky Racing, that there defmitely is 
amarketfortheindustry in this end of 
the state. 

"This definitely has to have 
helped," Stumbo said. "One of the 
biggest problems before was that there 
was nothing to base the (local de­
mand) on, there was no way anybody 
could predict how the track would be 
received ... now (Woods) is going to 
have tangible numbers that he can 
take to the meeting and hopefully 
alleviate some of the commissioners' 
anxieties." 

Jennings said Monday that Lynn 
Jones, one of the few supporters for 
the Eastern Kentucky facility on the 
Kentucky Racing Commission, had 

called him earlier in the day to offer 
his congratulations and continued 
support. 

Jennings said that Eastern Ken­
tucky Racing representatives, includ­
ing former Governor Julian Carroll, 
will meet with the racing commis­
sion on Wednesday, October 28 to 
resubmit the proposal and applica­
tion for Kentucky Downs' live track. 
Jennings added that the corporation 
was treating the live racing facility 
and the intertrack wagering parlor as 
separate entities and had requested 
1993 simulcast and wagering dates 
regardless of the commissioners' 
decision on the track, but that he 
hoped that wouldn't be necessary. 

"I think that attendance at Ken­
tucky Downs will continue to in­
crease as the public becomes more 
aware ... ," Jennings said. "I would 
suspect that as more and more people 
enjoy Kentucky Downs, the greater 
the need (will be) for a live racing 
facility." 

s tum bo ---------------(Continued from page one) 

charge of sexually touching a student 
was dropped by the state at a Septem­
ber appeal hearing. 

Stumbo sent two letters to OEA 
director Dr. Penney Sanders asking 
for those records so they could be 
forwarded to Berkhimer's attorney, 
John Caudill, a former law partner of 
Stumbo's. 

"I believe that Mr. Caudill is en­
titled to this information and I would 
request that you forward it to me so 
that I maypassiton to him," Stumbo's 
letter said. "In the event that you do 
not agree that he is entitled to this 
information, please respond as soon 
as possible in writing so that I can 
inform him that you have failed to 
make disclosure and provide the in­
formation to a member of the Gen­
eral Assembly." 

Caudill said Tuesday that he didn't 
ask Stumbo to get OEA 's records. 

"I asked Greg to see if OEA had 
complied with the law in submitting 
a report to the LRC (Legislative 
Research Commission)," Caudill 
said. "I wrote Greg a letter asking 
him to check on that OEA never 
did." 

Caudill said he was not aware that 
a second letter was sent to Sanders. 

Stumbo's August 14leuersaid he 
had received complaints from per­
sons who were interviewed by OEA 

during their investigation of 
Berkhimer. 

"I do not see what purpose of 
monitoring is served by turning your 
personnel loose with what they be­
lieve to be prosecutive and investiga­
tive powers •.. ," Stumbo's letter said. 
"I am deeply concerned about these 
allegations ... " 

Stumbo was listed as a witness for 
Berkhimer at an appeal hearing on 
his firing which was held September 
21-22. Stumbo did not testify. 

Caudill said Stumbo was to be 
called to testify about OEA reporting 
their results to the LRC. 

"There's no big conspiracy here," 
Caudill said. "This whole thing has 
been blown way out of proportion." 

Calls to Stumbowerenotretumed. 
The forum's resolution did not 

address the OEA issue and praised 
Boysen for his presence at a public 
hearing held last Tuesday to discuss 
the school district's shon-term plan 
for improvemenL 

The short-term plan was mandated 
by the state after a state education 
investigation into the district in May. 
Boysen called the Floyd County 
system a "catastrophe in leadership." 

" ... The Floyd County Education 
Forum wants to again publicly thank 
Commissioner Boysen and his staff 
for coming to Floyd County to hear 

Vote for 

JEFFREY PRATER 
School Board 

Member 
District 5 

comments of local citizens on the 
progress of education under KERA 
and the Floyd County Board's shon­
term plan for addressing various 
shortcomings and failures previously 
identified by the commissioner's 
staff," the resolution said. "We ap­
preciate very much his efforts and his 
remarks. 

"We believe that, with the ongo­
ing assistance of his office, the Floyd 
County School System may be able 
to address the failings of the past and 
move into an new era of reform, as 
(envisioned) by K.ERA," the resolu­
tion said. 

Boysen declined to comment 
Tuesday on Stumbo's or the forum's 
statements. 

OBSERVE THE 
WARNING SIGIS. 
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H )00 1\aYe chesl pan lasllng !Vol 
lriii\Aes 01 more. see a doctlr . 

• a·aAmerican Heart 
V Association 

Special thanks to everyone 
who helped with the Pig Roast 

and all those who came 
to show their support. 

"Together We Can Make A Difference!" 

Fund drive at 
Fern Hill home 
aids students 

An Autumn Afternoon in the 
Mountains at Fern Hill will be held 
Sunday, October 18, as a kickoff for 
a scholarship fund drive in honor of 
the late BenT. Combs, federal judge 
and former governor of Kentucky. 

Fern Hill is the home in Stanton 
which he shared with his wife, Sara 
Walter Combs, an attorney. The peak 
leaf-color season outing, to be held 
from 1-4 p.m., will feature a picnic 
lunch, hiking the 170-acre farm, a 
putting green, miniature horses to 
pet, tennis,' scenery and fellowship 
for the whole family. 

Guests will be encouraged to 
contribute to the new Bert T. Combs 
College Opportunity Scholarship 
Fund at St. Catharine, where Sara 
Combs is a trustee. 

Bert Combs' 1985 battle as the 
lead attorney for 66 of Kentucky's 
poorer school districts eventually led 
to the passage of the Kentucky Edu­
cational Reform Act "Ben symbol­
ized the value of higher education," 
said Sara Combs. "That's why I have 
chosen this means of honoring him, 
offering educational opportunities for 
the students that he supported. 

"Unfortunately, many students 
today come from families who can­
not afford the full cost of tuition. The 
Bert T. Combs College Opportunity 
Scholarship Fund is the answer to 
their needs." · 

According to Martha Layne 
Collins, president of Sl Catharine, 
the long-range goal is to offer at least 
one scholarship in every county. St. 
Catharine's rapidly growing students 
population now number 360, repre­
senting 21 counties, seven states and 
six nations. 

Combs' law firm, Wyatt, Tarrant 
and Combs, is sponsoring the Fern 
Hill event 

Reservations are requested. For 
information on making reservations 
and donations, contact St. Catharine 
CoUege,1-800-747-3377 or606-336-
8052, extension 231. 

Early Times 
$1499 Alltaxcs 

112 Gallon each p>~d. 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 
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Beautiful Products 
Beautiful Career 

Choices 

$35°0 worth of FREE products 
for the first 5 new representatives. 

Call Today! 432-5442 

1-{e{en s ![Cowers 
Now Serving Betsy Layne, 

Stanville, I vel and Mud Creek 

NO DELIVERY FEE! 

• Flower Arrangements In A Balloon! 
• New Shipment Madame Alexander Dolls 

• Plants. Silks. Cards. Trolls. Stuffed Animals 
• Country Crafts and Hollday Items 

!J{efen 's ![fowers 
Crossroada Plaza • PlkevWe-{Near Wal-Mart) 

1-800-354-4107 432-2587 
Visa. MasterCard Welcome 

GmndOpening 
QUALITY VIDEO 
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Guaranteed 
To Be Here 

Or Rent For 

FREEl 
If we don't have this celebrated erotic thriller in stock 

when you come in, rent any other movie FREE. 

Offer ends Wednesday, October 21. 

We're loaded with copies/ 
Offer ROOd only lor mu\le featured Free rental must be used rmmediatrly 
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South Lake Drive 
Next to Kentucky Motel 

886-6717 
Hours: 

Mon.-Thurs. 
10-9 

Saturday 
10-10 
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TO THE FOLKS OF EASTERN KENTUCKY 

Dale 

Rick 

Carolyne 

Ron 

w.c. 

AND FLOYD COUNTY 
AN OPEN LETTER: 
This month WMDJ AM/PM radio celebrates 

our "lOth" birthday ... are we proud? "Very!" 
Box530 H h 

·(' Martin, Ky. 41649 owever, more t an anything, we are humble, 
\• (606) A74-8005 

(606) 874-8006 appreciative and thankful. .. thankful for you, 
Fax (606) 874-0057 

the people who believed in us and what we 
have done and are doing ... 

We fully realize we are nothing without you ... we feel the 
spirit of the hills and people of Eastern Kentucky. . . A 
growing strong spirit that whispers "keep going, keep 
trying, keep doing the things that make you better and 
stronger," always mindful that He is watching ... for with 
Him and through Him all things are possible .. . 

To our advertising family of businesses we serve, "Thank 
You" for your faith in us. We know our success depends 
upon your success ... 

Your efforts and concerns matter to us ... 

To our radio staff ... "you're the greatest!" We have 
grown together, to rise to the top ... we're proof that honesty, 
sincerity and genuine caring still matter in this cr~zy world ... 

To Ben J ... thank you for believing in a kid from Spurlock 
with a dream ... please know that "I love you." 

We must guard against being smugly satisfied with what 
we are and what we have done. We must grow, we are so 
small and life is so big ... 

We're proud and thankful to be "your radio station." 

Mr. Crisp Sheri Chuck 

Mona 

Jared 

Bill 

Dan 

Bob 

We'll see you Sund_ay at the DAY IN 
THE P K with Steve Wariner. 

100.1 FM/1440AM 

Celebrating 

10 
Great Years! 
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Editorials : 

Huh? 
by Scott Perry 

Those who have fought long and hard to bring a mea­
sure of accountability to Kentucky's system of education 
have to be a bit bewildered this week at the news that one 
of education reform's chief sponsors, state Rep. Greg 
Stumbo, is upset at the way accountability is being mea­
sured. 

Stumbo has suggested that the state's Office of Educa­
tion Accountability and Education Commissioner Dr. Tho­
mas Boysen ought to devote their attention to implement­
ing the 1990 Kentucky Education Reform Act instead of 
investigating alleged improprieties in a variety of local 
districts 

What's the difference? 
Boysen, the OEA and the state board of education have 

come down hard on ten school districts, including Floyd 
County, where school management and education reform 
have mixed like oil and water. Implementing education 
reform requires that obstacles to it be cleared, first. That's 
a difficult task in a state where education has traditionally 
run a distant second to politics. 

In the two and a half years since the reform act was 
enacted, some districts have, unfortunately, required a 
force feeding of accountability. 

If criticism is due, Mr. Stumbo, it should be leveled at 
those who stand in the way of reform, not at those who 
hope to make it happen. 

Double exposure 
Far be from us, a child of the inglorious 60s, to rag on 

the artistic license taken by some of today's entertainers, 
but hypocrisy is hypocrisy in anyone's generation. 

The She Queen of Sleaze, Madonna, wins the insin­
cerity sweepstakes for championing the cause of AIDs 
through one side of her mealy mouth while pushing 
sexual promiscuity as a form of self expression through 
the other. 

The unfortunate victims of her two-faced absurditi~s 
are the youths of America and the world who are enticed 
to dance to both of her tunes. 

· ;:;::·=· ... :·· ; . :;;:· .::·:····. :;:;·;:,::···: , ,: ·:;' ·'::' 

Coffee 
If we were rating the outcome of Sunday's 

presidential debate (and it just so happens 
that we are) we'd give the edge in round one 
to Ross Perot. 

Perot gets the nod for his snappy one­
liners, including this comr back on the 
accusation that he didn't have the experi­
ence to be president: 

"Well, they've got a point," Perot said of his 
lack of political experience. "I don't have any 

. experience running up a $4 trillion debt. . .l've 
got a lot of experience not taking ten years to 
solve a ten minute., o; " 

Bush and Clinton, on tne other hand, came 
across like trained chimps, obviously having 
had rehearsed their mannerisms as well as 
their presentations. 

Clinton had that TV evangelist look while 
Bush might have been pushing insurance. 

Over a . . the d.;bat ac;n' murt of a 
debate w:1'ch stands to on ccnsidering 

that the candidates aren't much, either. 

One of the most terrifying news items to hit 
the papers in recent weeks didn't get much 
attention from the state editors, who buried 
the story in the back pages of the dailies. 

The headline read: "282 Pass Kentucky 
Bar Exam" 

Egad. 
Nearly 300 new lawyers, all fired-up to 

peddle their briefs, file their suits and settle 
their cases. 

Some will find the practice of law too 
crowded and will opt for less demanding 
careers .. .like law-making. 

Others will sink into the abyss, becoming 
ambulance chasers, corporate shysters, IRS 
agents, or-~asp-evef1 journalists. 
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-Letters to the editor·----
Letters To The Editor 

Letters to the Editor are welcomed by the Floyd County 1imes. 
In accordance with our editorial page policy, alllettersmustinclude the signature, address and telephone num­

ber of the author. 
Letters must be received no later than 10 a.m. Tuesday for publication in Wednesday's issue and 10 a.m. 

Thursday for Friday's issue. 
Letters may be sent to Editor, The Floyd County Times, P.O. Box 391, Prestonsburg, KY 41653. 
Letters may be edited for clarity and length. 

Campaign to aid 
God's Pantry 
is successful 

Editor: 
Cablevision's September Com­

munity-Oriented campaign was tre­
mendously successful. We raised over 
$600.00 for God's Pantry East from 
customers who donated their $10.00 
connection fees. The money will be 
used to help the needy in Floyd 
County. 

Cablevision also, had a food drive 
which brought in over 2000 lbs. of 
food. New and current customers told 
us they liked the campaign-getting 
cable for themselves while support­
ing a worthy organization with their 
tax -deductib1econtributions. We also, 
rewarded customers who responded 
to the campaign with a "Good Neigh­
bor Rebate" worth $15.00off a future 
cable bill. • 

We're extremely pleased by the 
response we received to the cam­
paign, because it shows our commu­
nity is very supportive of the work 
this organization is doing and the 
people are willing to provide addi­
tional funding through this program. 

Thank you, for your interest and 
support of our efforts, as wen. 

Dan Perry 
Cable Vision 
Prestonsburg 

' •' :;:;::. ···:·:· 

Leadership 
demonstrated 

Editor: 
I have served with State Repre­

sentative Russell Bentley for several 
years in the Kentucky House of 
Representatives. Throughout my 
experience with Rep. Bentley, I have 
found him to be a hard working, 
dedicated legislator whose foremost 
concern is meeting the needs of the 
92nd House District and the Com­
monwealth. 

Rep. Bentley has continually 
demonstrated his leadership abilities 
during his work in the legislature. He 
chairs a vital legislative subcommit­
tee of the Counties and Special Dis­
tricts Committee and he is an invalu­
able member of the important Appro­
priations and Revenue committee. 
His sound judgment and viewpoints 
are held in high regard in the General 
Assembly, and he is a strong voice 
for the people of the 92nd District. 

Rep. Russell Bentley is an intelli­
gent, dedicated, and conscientious 
legislator who is extremely concerned 
about creating and securing jobs, 
improving education forourswdents, 
and providing good roads. He has the 
experience and the ability to continue 
to be an effective representative for 
the 92nd District. 

Jody Richards 
Majority Caucus Chainnan 
Kentucky House of Representa-

tives 

··:·=·::'.: ,• '::' ::; :· .·· 

History book brings 

memories of Floyd home 

Editor: 
Thanks so much to those who put 

together the Floyd County History 
B~. ~ 

Once I received my copy I could 
not put it down. Everything I remem­
ber about Johns Creek, Eureka and 
Prestonsburg was mentioned in the 
book. I especially liked the story about 
Johns Creek. 

As a child, I remember the crystal 
clear water, the willow trees, the sand 
beaches and the visits to "Jip .. 
McGuire's farm, while living there. 

We had fresh food from the gar­
dens, pure drinking water and good 
clean air that made us sleep like 
babies. 

No one realized it at the time, but 
to me Johns Creek was like living in ~ 
Shangri La. 

I wish I could go back and wallc 
down that dirt road past the McGuire 
fann grabbing hands full ofblackber­
ries on the way home. but "progress" 
has changed all that. 

The Floyd County History Book 
brings it all back and leaves me with 
wonderful memories. 

Clara Evelyn (Clark) Root 
Cincinnati, Ohio 

(Continued on page five) 

,:;:·.::.: ···,:-· .. :·. ·. 

Break by Scott Perry 

Isn't it odd that we have so many lawyers 
but so little justice? 

Go figure. 

Does anybody really care how candidates 
for Vice President stand on the issues? 

It's not like the U.S. veep has anything to 
do with running the country, or anything to 
do at all, for that matter • 

They're basically just along for the ride. 
The voters don't select presidential running 

mates, nor do we get to cast a vote for them. 
Yeah, yeah, we know. The Vice President 

is just a heartbeat away from the presidency. 
If it's so critical a job, why don't we get to 

say who gets it? 

According to a report issued this week by 

the Southern Regional Project on Infant 
Mortality, we're closing the barn doors after 
the horse escapes when it comes to funding 
solutions to the problems of teen-age preg­
nancy. 

In Kentucky, for example, the report notes 
that we spent $266 million to provide aid to 
the families of teen parents compared to just 
$4 million spent on pregnancy prevention 
programs. 

Meanwhile, the number of births to teen 
parents continues to rise, as do the costs of 
caring for these families who are unable to 
care for themselves. 

Teaching teens to think with their heads 
instead of their libidos may not solve the 
problem--it may even be impossible to do-­
but we ought to devote a little more attention 
and a whole lot more money to prevention. 

Particularly when you consider the threat 
of AIDS· and its unyielding conclusion. 
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-Letters----------
School entrance is safer 
thanks to Floyd deputies 

Editor: 
Since loaded coal trucks, and other 

vehicles over 80,000 pounds, were 
routed around Prestonsburg, Ken­
tucky via Route 114 (Mountain Park­
way), the truck traffic on Middle 
Creek has grown increasingly worse. 
As increased traffic is a contributing 
factor in many auto accidents, I have 
been concerned about the safety of 
my grandchildren who ride a bus to 
Clarlc Elementary School. 

The entrance to the Clark School 
was made somewhat safer with the 
addition of a turning lane, However, 
getting back onto the road was an 
ordeal. 

I want to take this opportunity to 
thank Deputy Hershel Owens and the 

other Floyd County deputies who 
have contributed to slowing and di­
recting traffic. Every morning a dep­
uty is at the entrance to the school, 
stopping traffic to allow buses and 
others to safely enter the highway. 

I want to extend my thanks and 
appreciation to the Floyd County 
Sheriffs Department for their con­
cern and commibnent to keeping our 
highways safe. 

Betty L. Perry 
Prestonsburg 

Disgrace to human race 

Editor: 
I agree 100 percent with Brent 

Kelsey's September 18 letter about 
Bill Clinton's draft record. I don' tsee 
how Clinton would have the guts to 
call any boy or girl to battle, when he 

ran from it himself. 
He says no college student should 

have to go to the Army. What does 
this say to the poor boys or girls who 
couldn't afford to go to college? This 
is a disgrace to the human race. He 
doesn't believe in equal rights. If he 
can't tell the American people the 
truth, how could anyone believe him? 

I would like the people to look at 
the Clinton and Gore ticket on the 
environment. Anyone who hasn't 
read AI Gore's book should read it. 
He is against the coal mines; and that 
is one of Kentucky's biggest re­
sources. 

Coal miners should look at Clin­
ton. He has the right-to-work law in 
his own state, and talked the union 
into supporting him. 

Ann George 
Prestonsburg 

-Other Voices--------
Gallup Poll reveals American attitudes 
about terminal illness and hospice care 

by Chris Conley would be "very interested" in consid- are more and larger hospice programs 
Executive Director eringusingacomprehensive program and a higher percentage of retirees, 
of Hospice of the Big Sandy of care in which physicians. Nurses, respondents were somewhat more 

counselors and other professionals likely to consider hospice services. 
Nine out of ten Americans say kept them comfortable and alert at College graduates and higher income 

they would prefer to be cared for and home, while emotional and other respondents exhibited higher interest 
die in their own home or a family support was given to family mem- than others. 
member's home if they were facing a bers (a description of some aspects of Despite an apparent informational 
terminal illness, according to recent hospice care). An additional 28% gap, the hospice concept, with roots 
Gallup Poll fmdings announced by indicated that they would be "some- dating back hundreds of years, is 
the National Hospice Organization what interested." only 18 years old in America but has 
(NHO) in Arlington, Virginia. At the Yet, at the same time, slightly experienced tremendous growth here 
same time, the survey revealed some over one-fifth (or 22%) of the people recently. Today, hospice care is one 
unfamiliarity with the tenn "hospice" who had high interest in the described of the fastest growing segments of 
which NHO believes could keep services did not opt for hospice when the health care provider community, 
people from seeking this kind of care. asked to choose "by name". The poll with the number of programs dou-
Survey results show that even more showed that confusion or unfamiliar- blingjust since 1983 and many urban 
educational effort is needed before ity with the tenn "hospice" caused centers experiencin' a rapidly ex-
hospice becomes a pennanent part of hesitation of respondents who said panding daily patient census. 
our everyday health care vocabulary. they were either "somewhat" or "not Hospice of Big Sandy, which has 

The Gallup Poll results tell us at all likely" to consider using hos- been serving patients and their fami-
people want what we have to offer. pice. lies since September, 1984,has grown 
"The quality of life for people with a steadily during its eight years of care. 
limited life expectancy is vastly "We need to redouble our already The annual patient census has grown 
improved at home with hospice care. considerable efforts to educate people from 12 patients to 76 in that time. 
But we're concerned that too many about what hospice is," says Conley. The program also exJ)anded its area people are unable to associate the Public and professional education 
term "hospice care" with the services is already a priority of Hospice of Big of service to include Floyd, Johnson, 

they say they want Although not Sandy. Present efforts include: pub- Magoffin and Martin counties. 

addressed in this survey, this also lication of a brochure and quarterly 
Hospice growth can be attributed, 

tells us that they may be very unlikely distribution of a Hospice newsletter; in part. to the fact that the hospice 

to Jcnow if a hospice program exists close contacts with community or- patient/family-centered care model 

in their community. ganizationssuchaschurchesandcivic appeals to people in this age of the · 

Hospice is a special kind of care groups for speakers on issues directly proliferation of life-prolonging high 

designed toprovidesupportforpeople relating to hospice work; keeping technology which extends life often 

in the fmal stage of a terminal illness close touch with discharge planners at the expense of the quality of that 
life. Other factors such as longer life 

and their families. Hospice care seeks at local hospitals regarding appropri- expectancy, a growing senior popu-
to enable patients to carry on an alert, ate referrals for hospice care; provid- lation, rising numbers of AIDS pa-
pain-free life and to manage other ing speakers to any local agency or tients, skyrocketing health costs and 
symptoms so that their last days may service group on issues of death and growing acceptance by medical pro-
be spent with dignity and quality at dying, as well as hospice care and fessionals and the public of the hos-home or in a home-like setting keeping close contact with all the pice concept of care have contributed In the survey, respondents were families which Hospice ofBig Sandy to the growth of hospice. asked to assume they were terminally has served. 
ill and had only six months to live. An Women were more likely than men Hospice of Big Sandy which has 

overwhelming proportion-86 per- (by 16%) to express very high inter- an average daily census of 15, served 

cent- said they would want to re- est in this type of care, which may be 76 patients and families last year. 

ceive care (and ultimately die) in reflective of the fact that women carry Volunteers from Floyd, Johnson, 

their own homes or those of family more responsibility for family health Magoffin and Martin counties, who 

members. According to the survey, care decision in many American number 20, contributed more than 
500 hours of service in 1991. 60% of respondents reported that they households. In the South, where there Two private, non-profit groups 
assisted NHO with this research ef-
fort - the newly-formed National 
Hospice Foundation of Washington, 

-Other Voices 
D.C., which funded the Gallup Poll 
research as one of its first educational 
efforts and the Hospice Foundation 
of Miami, Florida, which assisted 
with funding for dissemination of the 

VERDICT IS IN ON ments; very few brought convictions survey results. 
INDEPENDENT COUNSEL that withstood appeal. How many ResultsoftheGallupPollarebased 

would ever have been serious legal on a survey of randomly selected 
by Scripps Howard fodder if divorced from Washington's telephone households in the conti-

News Service political wars? The heavy cost to the nental United States. The survey was 
targeted individuals-public servants conducted in February and March of 

Now that Independent Counsel forced to hire lawyers and live under this year by the Gallup Organization 
Lawrence Walsh has completed his 5 the threat of criminal indictment- under contract with the National 
1(2-year, $32-million investigation lends the question urgency. Hospice Organization. For a survey 
of the Iran-Contra scandal, Congress The independent counsel law of 1,000 randomly selected adults, 
should do the nation a favor and al- makes it easy to trigger the appoint- the sampling tolerance is plus or 
low the law that created Walsh's job ment of a special prosecutor-then minus 3.0%. This means that if 100 
to lapse when its warrant runs out gives that prosecutor a freedom from different samples were drawn and 
Dec. 14. constraints unique in our legal sys- surveyed from the same population 

In the abstract, the case for inde- tern. His budget and staff unlimited, during the same time period, 95 times 
pendent counsel seems reasonable: his focus confined to a single case, he out of 100 the results would vary no 
The Justice Department has an in her- knows not the usual necessity of more than plus or minus 3.0% from 
ent conflict of interest when it comes weighing one potential crime against the results if all adults were surveyed. 
to investigating crimes committed by another and prosecuting only when There are currently 1830 hospice 
the president or his associates. There- on balance, that step is in society's programs in the United States (28 
fore, a mechanism is needed for interest. programs in Kentucky) and hospices 
appointing independent agents to To institutionalize this hyper-po- served over 210,000 tenninally ill 
investigate such crimes impartially. tent prosecutorial weapon is to invite persons and their families in 1991. 

In practice, however, independent the very excesses we have seen- Hospice costs are covered by the 
counsels have been overused and have such as Walsh's insistence on retry- federal Hospice Medicare Benefit, 
never shaken their political taint. ing CIA official Clair George after by Medicaid in some states (includ-
Worst of an, they have opened the most jurors voted to acquit him on ing Kentucky), by CHAMPUS, a 
door to something disturbingly Jike each of nine counts related to program for military personnel and 
persecution. George's allegedly misleading Con- their dependents .and most private 

In its 14 years, the law has brought gress. insurers. 
the naming of 11 independent coun- Far better to assume that any 
sels. It is not, then, a device reserved wrongdoing by people in government For more information on hospice 
for rare betrayals of trust on the scale can be handled by the nonnal judicial or referral to a local hospice program 
of Watergate. Instead, its premise system. Then, when the exceptional in your area, call Hospice of Big 
seems to be that lawbreaking is rife in abuse comes along,as it did in Water- Sandy at 789-3841 or 1-800-489-
the executive branch. gate, by all means enlist an indepcnd- 3841 or call the National Hospice 

Lawbreaking? Most of these in- ent prosecutor of stature. To do that Organization's National Helpline at 

vestigations ended without indict- no special law was ever needed. 1-800-658-8898. 

u 

Around the 

The Numbers Game: KentuckyLotteryResutts 

Saturday's 
Results 

October 
10 .: 03·08·23·26-35® 

Next Estimated Jackpot $40 million 

WEATHER WATCH 
Wednesday 
Breezy and warmer. High 75-

80. 

Wednesday night 
Increasingly clouds. Low in mid 

50s. 

Thursday 
' Considerable cloudiness and 

mild. High in mid 70s. 

Thursday night 
Chance of late night showers. 

Low in mid 50s. 

Friday 
Scattered thunderstorms. High 

in lower 70s. 

Information provided by the 
Jackson Weather Service 

' • ......1, -

Regional News Briefs 

Special judges help to clear 
Magoffin court system 

Since May, Chief Regional Circuit Judge 
Stephen N. Frazier and Vice-ChiefRegionalJ udge 
James A. Knight, acting as Special Judges by 
order of Chief Justice Robert F. Stephens, have 
been spearheading an extensive and cooperative 
effort aimed at resolving thousands of cases 
pending in the district and circuit courts in Ma­
goftin County. 

In May, personnel of the Administrative Of­
fice of the Court began an inventory of pending 
cases in Magoffin district court Inventory re­
vealed over 2,800 pending cases. 

To date 1,430 district cases have been dis­
posed. Special court sessions began on October 5 
andwillcontinuethroughDecemberifnecessary. 
- staff report 

Out-of-court settlement 
reached in PCB lawsuit 

General Electric Corporation andAllis-Chalm­
ers Corporation have reached out-of-court settle­
ments with fonner salvage workers who claim 
they were negligently exposed to cancer-causing 
PCBs, an attorney said Monday. 

Dave McCrea, the workers' attorney, said he 
could not release details of the settlements, in 
which both companies continued to deny liabil­
ity. The GE settlement was filed Monday and 
Allis-Chalmers settled late last month, McCrea 
said. 

The development leaves Kentucky Power Inc., 
Westinghouse Electric Corporation and Mon­
santo Company as defendants in the corporate 
negligence case. 

The case involves 44 people who claim they 
were negligently exposed to PCBs-polychlori­
nated biphenyls-while working at Libby Iron & 
Metal Company Inc., a defunct Pikeville scrap 
yard. 

The workers allege they were exposed to PCB­
laden oil when they dismantled transfonners and 
capacitors to get at the copper inside. Their suit 
says the defendants knew for years that PCBs 
were dangerous, yet failed to warn people. -
Lexington Herald-Leader 

Horseback rider 
arrested for DUI 

A Ransom man was lodged in the Pike County 
Detention Center early Saturday after being ar­
rested for riding a horse while intoxicated. 

Mark A. Whitt, 20, was taken into custody by 
Kentucky State Trooper John Hunt and charged 
with operating a non-motor vehicle under the 
influence of alcohol and attempting to elude po­
lice. 

The citation filed by Hunt alleges that Whitt 
was sitting on a horse in the middle of KY 1056 
at 3:40 a.m. talking to another allegedly intoxi­
cated operator of a motorcycle. 

When Hunt turned on his lights and attempted 
to block the road, Whitt allegedly "let out a 
scream and took off." 

Hunt followed Whitt and arrested him when 
the horse hit a tree head-on and then fell on top of 
Whitt, pinning him to the ground. 

Pike County District Judge Howard Keith Hall 
set bond for Whitt at $2,000, 10 percent 

Hall said that 1991 changes in the statutes 
allow law enforcement officials to cite individu­
als for operating while intoxicated even if the 
vehicle in question is not motorized. - Appala­
chian News Express, Pikeville 

Accupuncture for addicts 
Chinese traditional medicine believes there are special relations 
between strategic points on the skin and various body functions. 

d 

Stimulating these four points in ,.,.-..-·~~·w .... ---.. 

the ear has shown to be 
effective in reducing 
craving for drugs and 
alcohol. 

'Spirit's gattt' and 
'Sympathetic'· 
Needles here relax 
the body and adjust its 
chemical balance. · 

. 'Kidney' 
and 'Liver' 
Needles here 
strengthen the 
function of the . . 
two organs, 
key body systems · 
in the processing 
of drugs an~ al~ohol. 

·.: · · 
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sen i 0 fS ---------------(Continued from page one) 

In the five-county area, 466 eld­
erly persons receive meals through 
the program. 

But the lack of state or federal 
funding for such programs makes it 
difficult for senior citizen centers to 
offer the service and centers must 
rely on donations. 

"It costs $3,800 a year to feed a 
person one meal a day, five days a 
week," Williamson said. "We hope 
our latest project, National Day of 
Volunteering, will make a difference 
in some one's life and raise public 
awareness and funds for senior citi­
zens that need a meal." 

Williamson said that the meals 
providemorethanjustfoodforsome, 
it also allows elderly people living 
alone to build special relationships 
with volunteers that often go beyond 
delivering something to eat. 

"It's more than just a meal," Wil­
liamson said. "It gives seniors per­
sonal contact with the drivers, who 
often do other things for them, lilce 
getting their mail. It becomes almost 
like a family-type relationship." 

Seniors' needs, however, don't 
stop at the dinner table. 

Their needs range from the most 
simple ones, such as someone to sit 
and talk with, to help with house­
cleaning and home repairs. 

Volunteers are needed to provide 
transportation; to assist seniors in 
filling out social security forms; to go 
to court with elderly persons; to 
assist at adult day care centers; and to 
go grocery shopping for seniors. 

"It's a two-way street, you get 
back as much or more than you give," 
Williamson said. "Some people are 
hesitant to volunteer their time be­
cause they feel they don't know how 
to do certain things. We provide train­
ing for anyone who wants to volun­
teer." 

Williamson hopes events and ac­
tivities planned to celebrate National 
Day of Volunteering, which is the 
ideaofUSA Weekend magazine, will 
help seniors twofold by calling atten­
tion to the problem and giving a shot 
at national recognition. 

Organizations that participate on 
November 14 by planning commu­
nity activities will be eligible to re­
ceive a $1,000 prize to be used for a 
charitable cause. 

Williamson said she hoped enough 
community suppon can be generated 
to sponsor activities that will raise 
awareness on the plight of senior 

citizens. 
Events planned on November 14 

include: 
• a bowl-a-thon at Rebel Lanes. 

Contact Mary Risner at 886-8779; 
• Domino's Pizza is offering $1 

off any pizza in exchange for a $1 
donation to the Meal on Wheels pro­
gram; and 

• a talent show to be held by the 

Prestonsburg Community College's 
Single Parent Homemaker class. 

Williamson suggested businesses 
or organizations may want to sponsor 
a senior citizen for year, make contri­
butions to the program or plan an 
event with their employees. 

For more information contact 
Williamson at 886-2374. 

Shortfall---- (Continued from page one) 

• Work has begun on the nature 
walk along the riverside at 
Prestonsburg Community College. 
The walk is the product of a collabo­
ration between the Floyd County 
Fiscal Court; the city of Prestonsburg; 
Bocook Engineering; Mountain En­
terprises; Kentucky Power; PCC; 
Cliff Latta III; Kentucky/West Vir­
ginia Gas; D.B. Kazee; and the Uni­
versity of Kentucky Design and 
Construction office. It is a seven­
tenths of one mile handicapped-ac­
cessible walking trail for nature lov­
ers and health enthusiasts. Later, 
nature exhibits and exercise equip­
ment will be added. 

• the city will begin maintaining a 
general ledger to keep track of all 
payments, receipts, disbursements 
and budgetary comparisons in order 
to help the council make more effec­
tive use of revenue. 

• Fire Chief Tom Blackburn, Fire 
Marshal Larry Adams, the 
Prestonsburg Fire Department and 
all agencies who participated in the 
Friday, October 9 Fire Prevention 
Week parade were congratulated­
the city will issue appreciation no­
tices to all involved- and efforts 
have been made to make the parade 
an annual event 

• The council voted to adopt new 
standard operating procedures for the 
Prestonsburg Fire Department The 
new procedures follow nationwide 
recommendations made by the Oc­
cupational Safety and Health Admini­
stration and the National Fire Pre­
vention and Protection Association. 

• City Attorney Larry Brown, 
Mayor Ann Latta and the Big Sandy 
Area Development District have been 
contacted by Cable Dimensions, a 
fiberoptic cable television company, 
in an attempt to form a consonium of 
cable suppliers and customers. 

• Vance expressed concern that 
children rushing into the street to 
catch candy thrown from floats and 
vehicles participating in parade pro­
cessions face unnecessary danger. He 
suggested that the city either put an 
end to the practice, rope off the side­
walks to keep children out of the 
streets or designate one panicular 
area where candy could be thrown. 
The council will communicate with 
other cities to see how they cope with 
the problem. 

• The local chapter of the Ken­
tucky Black Lung Association will 
conduct a roadblock fundraiser on 
Nov em her 7. Members of the Purple 
Heart association will conduct a road­
block November 6. 

Councilmen George Archer, 
Danny Hamilton and Gorman Collins 
Sr. were absent from Monday's 
meeting. 

The Prestonsburg City Council 
meets on the second and fourth 
Mondays of every month. The public 
is urged to attend. 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 

When In the Future? 
This sign was erected during the school 
board election FOUR years ago. Three 
new schools in other areas of Floyd 
County have been completed and are 
being used while the children of Left 
Beaver continue to use buildings con­
structed before World War II. 

Now is the time to elect someone who 
will stand up and fight for our chil­
dren. Ed Patton has fought the· school 
board before and will fight again to see 
that the children of Left Beaver are 
made full partners in the Floyd County 
School System. 

American Red Cross 
Floyd County Chapter 1917 

NEEDS YOUR HELP! 
Please mail your contributions to: 

American Red Cross 
Floyd County, Chapter 1917 
Thomasine Robinson, Chairperson 
P.O. Box 111 
Martin, Ky. 41649 

We can't help if you don't! 

October 19-24 
On All Fall & Winter 

Merchandise 

Buy 1st item at full price 
Get 2nd item at half price* 

Bobbie's Boutique 
2711 Louisa Street • Catlettsburg, Ky. 

1-739-5059 
*Excluding jewelry & accessories 

*Do our children deserve less because their 
parents choose to live on Left Beaver? 

*Are our athletes going to be able to host 
basketball tournaments or will the di~­
crimination continue? 

-· 
(• School Board Mem.ber 

• 

~~r- ••• ' . - . 
"It's a Vote for You." 

(Adv. paid by candidate) 

I, 

• 
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DISTRICT COURT 

Editor's Note: All first offense 
DU/s are allowed to db two days 
public service in lieu of $200 of the 
total court costs and fines. 

Danny W. Martin, 29, of Garren, 
speeding (26 mph over), $47.50 and 
referred to Stale Traffic School (STS); 

Anita B. Dixon, 20, ofLarkslane, 
speeding (16 mph over) and failure to 
use child restraining device, charges 
merged, $4 7.50 and STS; Mark E. 
Collins, 24, of Martin, speeding (26 
mph or greater) $47.50 and STS; 
Shannon M. Smith, 20, of Raccoon, 
speeding, $57.50; Ricky Slone, 34, 
of David, AI and disorderly conduct, 
charges merged, $82.50; 

Ira H. Rose, 42, of lvel, AI and 
disorderly conduct, $82.50, five days 
probation and referred to ADE; 

~ Rhonda Tackett ofMelvin, DUI (BA 
.12, fJistoffense), $407.50; James V. 
Ritchie, 20, of Talcum, speeding (73 
in 55 zone), $47.50; 

John Reynolds, 30, of Martin, 
possession of marijuana (less than 8 
ounces), $72.50; Glennis A. Gay-

heartJr.,19,ofBeaver,recklessdriv­
ing and attempting to elude, DUI 
(fii'st offense, BA .13), charges 
merged, $407 .50; 

William B. Hall, 19, of Lexing­
ton, no insurance, failure to register, 
$582.50; Charlie Robinson, 19, of 
Hueysville, reckless driving, attempt­
ing to elude, DUI (first offense, BA 
.23), disorderly conduct, charges 
merged, $207.50, two days public 
service and ADE referred; 

Robert Baldridge, 57, of Langley, 
DUI (second offense, BA refused), 
operating on suspended license, no 
insurance, $1,092.50, seven days in 
jail; Ronnie L. Carroll, 19, of Tram, 
disorderly conduct and AI, charges 
merged, $82.50; 

Cecil McKinney, 29,ofHager Hill, 
improper passing, $47.50 and STS; 
Gina M. Hale, 24, of Auxier, AI, 
$82.50; Robert R. Ratliff, 39, of 
Honaker, AI, fourth degree assault 
anddisorderlyconduct,$82.50; Tony 
Michael Ratliff, 35, of Honaker, AI, 
disorderly conduct, and resisting 
arrest, charges merged, $72.50; 

Gene Slone, 54, of Prestonsburg, 

AI and disorderly conduct, $82,.50 
three days probation; Shon Hall of 
Wayland, AI and possession of mari­
juana, $107.50 and three days proba­
tion; 

Earl Wallen, 40, of Mousie, AI 
and disorderly conduct, charges 
merged, $82.50 and three days pro­
bation; 

Oakie Prater, 40, of Garrett, AI 
and disorderly conduct, $82.50 and 
three days probation; 

Scotty Wright, 21, of Langley, 
DUI (frrst offense, BA refused), no 
insurance, $217.50 and two days 
public service. 

PROPERTY TRANSFERS 

John A. and Helen Oark to Jef­
fery A. and Christina A. Clark, prop­
erty on Mare Meade Branch; Juanita 
Rogers to Maxine Gibson, property 
on Branham Creek; 

TimothyGeneFrancistoSylvester 
and Joann Francis, property location 
not listed; Dorothy T. and William 
Martin, Everett Ray and Berta Turner, 
Bobby Glenn and Alberta Turner, 

East Kentucky Democratic headquarters 
by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

Even as racing fans doubled down 
at the opening day of Kentucky 
Downs and Jenny Wiley Festival 
participants prepared for the parade 
Saturday, political pundits celebrated 
the spectacle of the Eastern Ken­
tucky Democratic Headquarters 
grand opening. 

Delores Dingus, county co-chair 
of the headquarters with Floyd County 
Judge/Executive John M. Stumbo, 
saidMondaythatthemaingoalofthe 
Eastern Kentucky Democratic Head-

~• quarters was to convince Floyd 
Com1tians to vote the straight Demo-

cratic ticket at the November 5 gen­
eral election year and to stimulate 
interest in local politics. 

"Although the school board race is 
non-partisan," Dingus said, "we hope 
this will bring voters out for that race 
as well." 

John Doug Hays was scheduled to 
speak at a special meeting at the 
headquarters Tuesday evening in an 
effort to drum up support for his Fifth 
District congressional campaign and 
to urge people to get out and vote. 

Supporters ofHays, Wen dell Ford, 
Bill Qinton and AI Gore may pick up 
signs and bumper stickers endorsing 
the candidates during the headquar-

Pikeville College Awards Scholarships 
to Floyd County Students 

Pikeville College awarded schol­
arships to top Floyd County students 
enrolling for the fall semester. These 
recipients have achieved a high stan­
dard of academic excellence on their 
secondary grade point averages and 
on the ACT. 

Anthony Lee Little, the son of 
Frank and Wilma Jean Little of 
Melvin is a graduate of Wheelwright 
High School. He has been awarded 
the prestigious Presidential Scholar­
ship which provides full tuition, full 
room and board, and a stipend for 
books. The requirements for this 
scholarship are a4.0 GPAand a score 
of28 on the ACT. 

Sandra Dillon of Prestonsburg, a 
graduate of Gymnasium Herzogenau­
rach in Germany received the Appa­
lachian Honors Scholarship which 
pays one-third of the tuition cost. The 
requirements for this award are a 
3.93 GPA and a score of 26 on the 
ACT. 

The Residential Scholarship pro­
vides full room and board to qualify­
ing students. The requirements for 

Anthony Lee Little 

this scholarship are a 3.83 GPA and a 
score of 23 on the ACT. 

The students who will receive this 
award are Brad Hall ofWeeksbury, a 
graduate ofWheelwright High School 
and Jody Johnson of Hi Hat also a 
graduate of Wheelwright High 
School. 

Southeastern Asia has tiny hanging parrots which sleep hanging upside 
down like bats. 

ters' office hours, 11 a.m. until3 p.m. 
Monday through Friday. 

Dingus said a staff will begin 
manning headquarters telephones this 
Thursday, October 15. 

For further information, please 
contact Delores Dingus at 886-9193. 

Gorman forms 
consumer council 

Local consumers who fall victim 
to fraudulent and misleading prac­
tices will soon find it much easier to 
get help, following the establishment 
of a regional consumer protection 
council by Attorney General Chris 
Gorman. 

Members of the Pikeville area 
council, which is currently being 
established by Gorman and Pike 
county commonwealth's attorney 
John Paul Runyon, will serve resi­
dents of Pike and surrounding coun­
ties. Consumers are encouraged to 
file complaints with the council, 
which if substantiated will then be 
forwarded to the Attorney General's 
Consumer Protection Division for 
appropriate action. The council itself 
will focus on education, enforcement, 
mediation and ideas for new legisla­
tion. 

"Fair trade, not just free trade, is 
the guiding principle of our nation's 
economy," Attorney General Gor­
man said. ''This COWlcil will actively 
enforce that principle, bringing a new 
standard of protection to the consum­
ers of Pikeville and the surrounding 
counties." 

The council will be headquartered 
atthePikevillechamberof commerce. 
Volunteers who wish to serve with 
the group may contact Runyon at 
432-1407, or the Attorney General's 
office at (502) 564-4002. A phone 
number for the council will be an­
nounced at a later date. 
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AT PRO-HAIR WE STRIVE TO CARRY 
THE FINEST PRODUCTS AND SERVICES 
AT PRICES TO FIT THE FAMILY BUDGET. 

TWO ABSOLUTEL V UNIQUE PRODUCTS WITH RESULTS SO 
ADVANCED THAT PROBLEM HAIR BECOMES A PLEASURE! 

WE CARRY PERMS FROM 
NEXXUS, MATRIK REDKIN, ZOTOS, 

HELENE CURTIS & JERRY RHEDDING 
STARTING AT $29~95 

WITH SHAMPOO, CUT & STYLE INCLUDED. 

PRO-HAIR 
Proudly Introduces 

ENFASI 
A new line of Italian-inspired 
products exclusively yours 

at 
PRO-HAIR 

IT'S TIME FOR A PERMI 
r-------------------------------, 1 ADULT PRO-SAVER 1 
I PRO-HAIR, PRESTONSBURG $ OO I 
I 886-1460 3 OFF I 
I PRESTONSBURG VILLAGE FULL SERVICE - CUTS • PERMS • COLOR : 
I Expires 11/15192 

L-------------------------------~ 

Jimmy Paul and Donna Turner,David 
Lawrence and Peggy Turner, Olin 
Andrew Elliott II and Myra Elliott to 
Tommy and Barbara Roop, property 
location not listed; 

Carada Hunt to Carada and Norma 
Faye Hunt, property on Mare Creek; 
James Branham, Carlos Akers and 
Kermit Newsome to Shawn Douglas 
Tackett, property on Big Mud Creek; 

Debra Case to Michael Case, 
property on Left Beaver Creek; 
Michael Case to Clarence and Audrey 
Lynn Hamilton, property on Left 
Beaver Creek; Robie Dean Miller, 
Melissa Miller Slone and John David 
Slone to Robie Dean Miller, property 
location not listed; 

Alden Nettie Hall to Tony Hall Jr., 
property on Jacks Creek of Left 
Beaver Creek; John Earl Hunt to 
David and Paula Layne, property 
location not listed; 

Howard Wayne Trimble to Jackie 
Trimble Rowe, property location not 
listed; Mortgage Guaranty Insurance 
Corporation to Kathy Thacker, prop­
erty in Abbott Creek Subdivision. 

Welcome to 

THE JENNY WILEY 
HOEDOWN 

October 16, 1992-7:00-10:00 
Location: Pines Building, 

Pines Camping Ground, 
Jenny Wiley State Park 

Mr. Richard Jett, caller 
Oogging, Western Line Dancing, 

Square Dancing, Polkas, & Waltzes. 

Special Entertainment! 
Door Prizes and Cake Walks! 

Concessions will be sold. 
Come on out for 

Fun, Fitness & Fellowship! 
No alcoholic beverages allowed. 

Costs $3.00 Per Person 
For more Information call: 

(606) 349-5717 

Vote For and Elect 

CHARLES E. OUSLEY 
For 

SCHOOL BOARD 
District 5 

I will work to return control of our school 
system to the people. Our students will 
be first in my decisions. 

Vote for 
honest and effective leadership 

without political corruption. 
(Adv. paid for by candidate) 

Special Discounts On 
Home Insurance 

You'll be smiling too, when you have a loss-free 
recQrd with Grange. We'll give you special discounts! 
And you might just qualify for other Grange home 
discounts, too! 
Call today. See how Grange can save you money. 

HATTON-ALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY 
Denzil Allen, General Agent 
483 S. Lake Dr 
886-2371 

I J 

Up to 

Your partner in protection 

48 Months Financing 

Pikeville 
National® 

Bank .and Trus~ Company 

Member FDIC 
F=o1 example: 7.99% A. P.R. for 48 monthly payments will be $24.41 per $1,000.00 
borrowed. You can borrow up to 100% of tne purchase price o1 your new car with 
approved credit. 

~) 



A8 Wednesday, October 14, 1992 

Lottery retailers warned of scam 
The Kentucky Lottery Corpora­

tion issued an emergency warning 
October 12 to its statewide network 
of retail stores, warning them to 
beware of a possible scam. The 
Kentucky Lottery has a network of 
approximately 3500 stores across 
Kentucky. 

In a letter to retail store owners, 
KLC President Brian Potter urges 
them to beware of someone pretend­
ing to represent the Lottery. "Several 
of you have been contacted by an 
individual inviting you to join a 
Kentucky Lottery Retailers Associa­
tion." wrote Potter. ''This individual 
has reportedly solicited monies from 
some of you ... the Kentucky Lottery 
has NOT authorized anyone to create 
a retailers association." 

Meet Morehead State 
in Prestonsburg Thesday 

Morehead State University repre­
sentatives will host an infonnation 
night in Prestonsburg on Tuesday, 
October 20, to inform prospective 
students and their parents of the 
opportunities available on the cam­
pus. 

The "Meet Morehead State" pro­
gram will beginat7 p.m. at the Jenny 
Wiley Convention Center. 

"Those students who wish to 
continue their education will have 
the oppatunity to speak with current 
students about concerns of college 
life," said Sandy Barker, MSU ad­
missions counselor and coordinator 
of the off-campus activity. "We hope 
to provide answers for their ques­
tions in an informal atmosphere at a 
location that is convenient for them." 

MSU students. who are majoring 
in various fields, will serve as hosts 
for the evening's activities. Infonna­
tion about admissions, housing and 
financial aid will be provided. 

Additional information is avail­
able from MSU's Office of Admis­
sions, (606) 783-2000, or toll free at 
1-800-262-7474 in Kentucky and 1-
800-354-2090 from adjoining states. 

The Kentucky Lottery notified the 
Kentucky Attorney General's Office 
that state laws may have been bro­
ken. "We've been assured they will 
move quickly," says KLC spokes­
man Greg Donaldson. 

"The Kentucky Lottery has al-
ways preferred to deal directly with 
individual retailers," says Donaldson. 
"President Potter's door is always 
open. His phone always answered. 
Our presidents have always made it a 
custom to go out and visit retailers 
personally and get to know them." In 
addition, Kentucky Lottery Corpora­
tion created an informal retail advi­
sory committee to represent the col­
lective interests of the store owners 
and the corporate chains. 

The Kentucky Lottery currently 
pays its retailers a five percent com­
mission plus a one percent cashing 
bonus. In addition, retailers are paid 
one percent of every winning ticket 
they sell over $600 in value. And 
recently, KLC President Brian Potter 
unveiled a new incentive plan that 
can pay retailers even more if they 
meet prescribed sale goals. "We be­
lieveourretailershaveagreaterstake 
in the business than lottery retailers 
in any other state in the nation," says 
Potter. "I am concerned that this 
current scam may jeopardize the close 
business relationship that has helped 
the Kentucky Lottery become 
America's most successful state lot­
tery!" 

Hicks attends 
• • grooming seminar 

Deanna Hicks of Coral Reef Pet 
Center attended a Groom America 
Seminar held in Knoxville, Tennes­
see, on October 8. hosted by Sally 
Liddick and Gwen Shelly. 

John Stazko and Mario DiFante, 
international grooming speakers, 
discussed new grooming techniques, 
grooming shop operations and man­
agement Mrs. Hicks has been groom­
ing pets for 16 years. 

The Floyd County Times 

Puppet Show · 
Preschool students at Allen Elementary School were taught the Impor­
tance of the food Qroups by means of a puppet show. The presentations 
were given by Christian Appalachian Project. Judy Halbert Is the pre· 
school teacher and Rhonda Blair Is the aide. This was part of the study 
In the thematic unit on apples. 

Love Letters to be staged 
during Founder's Week 

Love Letters by A.R. Gurney will 
be presented in Faith Chapel on Oc­
tober 15 and 22 at 7 p.m. each eve­
ning. The October 15 performance is 
especially coordinated with the 
"LightingoftheCampus"which will 
begin at 8 p.m. and the "Birthday 
Party around the Flag Pole" with 
special entertainment by David 
Morris, fiddler for the KentuckyOpry, 
at 8:30p.m. 

Love Letters is referred to as "a 
truly unique and imaginative theatre 
piece." It is comprised of letters be­
tween Andrew Makepeace Ladd ill 
and Melissa Gardner, childhood 
friends both born to wealth and posi­
tion, whose lifelong correspondence 
begins with birthday party thank-you 
notes and summer camp postcards. 
The exchanges continue over their 
lifetimes as they grow up together, go 
their separate ways, but continue to 
share confidences. The exchanges 

create an evocative, touching, fre­
quently funny but always telling pair 
of character studies in which what is 
implied is as revealing and meaning­
ful as what is actually written down. 

Basil B. Clark, Assistant Profes­
sor of Speech and Theater at Pikev­
ille College and his wife, Emma Ray 
Clark, teacher at Brushy Elementary 
School in Pike County will perform 
the character readings. 

There is no charge for admission 
to the performances and the public is 
invited to attend this and all functions 
associated wilh Pikeville College 
Founders' week. The play. Love 
Letters, is not recommended for 
young children. 

A.R. Gurney is lhe sole and exclu­
sive author of Love Letters. Love 
Letters is being produced at Pikeville 
College by special arrangement with 
Dramatists Play Service, Inc. 

Volunteers sought for exchange program 

Spanish Heritage (SHE), a not­
for-profit student exchange organi­
zation dedicated to promoting Span­
ish language and Hispanic culture in 
North America, is seeking enthusias­
tic volunteers to be area representa­
tives foritsprogram in Floyd County. 
Area representatives serve as liai­
sons for high schools, host families, 
students, and SHE offices as well as 
recruit qualified North American 
teenagers to go abroad. Volunteers 
are reimbursed for their expenses. 

If you feel this is an ideal way to 
learn about Spanish and Latin Ameri­
can culture while sharing Floyd 
County with eager high school teen­
age students, please call Leslie col­
lect at (202) 588-8102 or 1-800-888-
9040 for further information. 
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Get Started Progra111 

Nutri/Size'"' 

8 
19 Weeks 

Angelo Long 
N utri / System 

Client 

$ 

3 Weeks of Program Services 
For Umlted Time Only •••••••• Expires October 17, 1992. 

nutri/systcrm 
Old Size 

-~4 ,, /11!; 
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• MIN~£ 
*Nutri/System meals additional. Weight loss and maintenance 

vary by Individual. 
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Weddington Square • Pikeville 
Mon.· Thurs. 10-7 • Fri.-Sat. 9·1 

437-0398 

z 
N 
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11 days only! Now thru Sunday, Oct. 25 

Weddington Plaza Only! 

traditional men's 
suits, sport coats and 
slacks from a better 

men's store 

%off 
original store's prices 

Exceptional savings on famous name 
menswear - the labels have been removed, 

but you'll recogniz~ the quality. Solids, 
glen plaids and other patterns in 1 00% wool, 

silk and other fabrics. 

Use Watson's convenient layaway ·-=-•. ·14 
plus 4 great ways to charge. - · 

we have the best advertised orlces- we'll orovell! 11 vou lind our advertised Items at lower orlces 
within 14 davs. simPlY brlnu In our comoelltor·s ad and we'll match our comoetltors' orlce minus 1 OOfo! 

• 
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MSU Band Festival participants 
The Prestonsburg High School band earned a "good" rating at Morehead State University's recent Blue and 
Gold Festival of Marching Bands. Adjudicators for the "non-competitive" festival were members of the 
Kentucky Music Educators Association. Twenty-eight marching bands from high schools In Kentucky, Ohio, 
VIrginia and Indiana took part In the event. Holding trophies earned during the festival, representatives from 
the band pose with MSU officials. Joe Briley Is the band director. 

FDA advice on Halloween make-up 
by Patricia A. Leathem 
Public Affairs Specialist 
Food and Drug Administration 

• Ghost and gotilins and other scary 
creatures are about to appear, many 
with the aide of Halloween makeup 
kits. The Food and Drug Administra­
tion has several suggestions for safely 
using Halloween makeup kits to 
reduce the risks of children suffering 
skin or eye irritations. 

FDA advises parents to carefully 
supervise their children's use of 
Halloween makeup kits. It is espe­
cially important to follow label direc-

• tions in applying and removing the 
1 makeup. Many kits contain warnings 

against use on or by children under 
certain ages. The reason is that young 
children's skin is very sensitive. 

Halloween makeup kits contain 
items such as waxy sticks of makeup, 
small tins of greasepaint or appliques 
such as beards and mustaches to be 

applied with adhesives. Some ingre­
dients in kits contain spirit gum adhe­
sive, which is flammable. Care should 
be taken to keep the kits away from 
an open flame. Spray on hair colors 
from aerosol containers areal so flam­
mable and should not be used near 
fire or flame. Cover the child's face 
to avoid spraying in the eyes. 

It is especially important to take 
care in applying makeup around the 
eyes. Some kits contain ingredients 
that are not safe for use in this sensi­
tive area. The label should contain 
any warnings or cautions that should 

be followed when using the makeup. 
FDA recommends that consum­

ers be especially conscientious about 
following label directions for removal 
of makeup. Some makeup should be 
removed with cold·cream,others with 
soap and water. Use of the proper 
agent can reduce the potential for 
skin irritation. Makeup should never 
be removed with a dry cloth or paper 
towel since this can cause skin irrita­
tion. 

• Lexington Ballet to perform in Paintsville 

Paintsville Tourism Commission 
will present the Lexington Ballet on 
Thursday, October 22, in the 
Paintsville High School Gym. The 
Ballet will start at 7 p.m. 

The Lexington Ballet will present 
a Halloween Spectacular the Phan­
tom of the BalleL 

Proceeds from the Ballet will go 
to the Paintsville Football Boosters 
to help pay for the new locker room 
facility at the football field. 

The featured work on the Hallow-
-.een Program is Phantom of the Bal­

let-Artistic Director Karl 
Kaufman's ballet version of Phan­
tom of the Opera. From the depths of 
the Catacombs, the Phantom will 

ascend and mesmerize the young 
dancer Christine-and the audience. 
With the promise of success, our 
caped figure will intimidate and 
control out young heroine and de­
mand artistic perfection and unflinch­
ing devotion. With the 6lending of 
suspenseful drama and exquisite 
choreography set to the music of 
Richard Sttauss, Phantom of the 
Ballet promised to be a treat for the 
senses. 

Tickets for the Ballet are available 
fromanymemberoftheBoosterClub 
or see or call Nancy Brugh, Chuck 
Melvin or Lee VanHoose. Tickets 
are $3 for adults and $1 for children, 
12 and under. 

1993 F-150's 

AIR • AUTO • CASSETTE 

All rebates, including first-time buyer, assigned to dealer_ 

Som~ kits may be marked "FDA 
Approved" or "FDA Tested." FDA 
cautions that it does not authorize 
such statements. FDA does not ap­
prove any individual cosmetic or 
makeup kit. The Agency's legal au­
thority over cosmetics is restricted to 
taking action against those products 
that are harmful. 

In years past FDA has received a 
number of complaints of adverse 
reactions to some of these products. 
If a child suffers a reaction requiring 
the attention of a physician, take along 
the kit to help the physician identify 
the ingredient that caused the reac­
tion. All cosmetics are required by 
FDA to list ingredients. 

If an adverse reaction occurs, FDA 
urges these to be reported to the 
manufacturer as well as to the FDA. 
Name and address of the manufac­
turer can be found on the label. 
Complaints may be flied with FDA's 
Cincinnati District office. The toll­
free number for reporting problems 
with products regulated by FDA is l-
800-437-2382 . 

Recognition 
of 

Sudden Infant Death 
Syndrome 

Awareness Week 
Oct. 11 - Oct. 17 

) 

JW Theatre 
awarded grant 

Jenny Wiley Theatre has been 
awarded a $14,709 challenge grant 
from theKenblcky Arts Council. The 
challenge grant matches by ten per­
cent the$150,014.67 the theatteraised 
last year. 

Over 300 KAC grants, worth a 
total of $2.2 million, have been 
awarded to arts program providers in 
Kentucky to support cultural pro­
gramming during the 1992-93 fiSCal 
year. 

The grant will be used for theatre 
operating costs, said Tedi Vaughan, 
Jenny Wiley Theatre general man­
ager. 

Early Times 
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FEEL LIKE A PUMPKIN 
AGAIN THIS FALL? 

Let me help you-like I've helped hundreds of 
others. Together we can make dieting a thing of 
the past. You provide the will; I'll provide the 
way-The Diet Center Way. I'm ready when 
you are! 

What's more wonderful is you can lose 20 to 
25 lbs. by Thanksgiving and 35 to 50 lbs. by 
Christmas. 

Call \II at 
Diet Center 

1811-1111 
In New Dollar General 
Store Building, 304 N. 
LakeDtive 

Diete 
Center(· 

Limit~ TiiM 0111] 
No Rc:giatration Fee 

• STRAND TWIN 
Absher PRESTONSBURG, KY. • 606-886-2696 

Enterprises 

NO BARGAIN NITE THIS WEEK -
STRAND I STRAND II 
HELD OVER Starts Friday, October 16 

"THE OSCAR RACE BEGINS WITH 
'THE LAST OF THE MOHICANS: 

DON'T MISS IT!" "Consenting 
Adults'' 

- Jeff Craig, SIXTY SECOND PREVIEW 

THE LAST 
OF THE 

MoHICANS with Kevin Kline 

© 1"200NT1£1HCOOIJlYFOX 1&11 -
SHOWTIMES: 7:00 & 9:15 SHOWTIMES: 7:00 & 9:15 

SUNDAY MATINEE-All Seats $3.00-0pen 1:00, start 1:30, over 3:30 

Ci!IE INC. 

Mothers and Doctors 
Know 

Special Babies 
Need 

Special Care. 
You can lean on 

The Baby 
Connectton® 

The Baby Connection is a new 
program from Cooley Medical to 

help new parents monitor infant 
apnea - a cessation of breathing which 

affects thousands of infants. 

At Cooley Medical we offer: 

• A coordinated team effort involving physicians, 
hospital and parents to provide safe and loving 
care for the monitored baby at home. 

• Before leaving the hospital, parents will be given 
complete instruction in how to care for their 
baby with the use of the monitor. 

• Certified CPR instruction from a CME Regis­
tered Nurse for advanced life support. 

• Follow-up, in-home reviews of information, 
weekly phone calls, monthly home visit, reports 
to physician. 

• Twenty-four-hour, around the clock professional 
and technical service to the new parents. 

• The Baby Connection is under the direct super­
vision of a Certified Pediatric Nurse•, and is 
staffed only by Registered Nurse~. 

"Certified by Board of Pediatric Practitioners and Nurses. 

~The Baby 
LQjConnectton® 

7 days a week - 24 hours a day 

21 North Arnold Avenue 
Prestonsburg 
606-886-0333 

1-800..489-0000 

Mayo Professional Park 
South Mayo Trail, PlkevJile 

606-432-0055 
1-80D-66Q-0246 



Quinciano C. 
Asuncion 

Retired Philippines Attorney and 
businessman Quinciano C. Asuncion 
ofTaytay, Rizal, Philippines. brother 
of Dr. Virginia A. de Guzman of 
Martin, died on October 10, in an 
automobile accident at Layfayette, 
Indiana, following a brief visit here 
with Dr. de Guzman and her hus­
band,Dr. Ray de Guzman. Mr. Asun­
cion and his wife and daughter had 
stopped here briefly en route from 
Europe to the Philippines. 

Mr. Asuncion served in the U.S. 
Army during World War II and par­
ticipated in the "Bataan Death 
March." He was a Japanese prisoner 
of war from early 1942 until war's 
end in October 1945. 

After his retirement as an attorney 
at law, he was a land developer and 
builder. 

He is survived by his wife, Liway­
way Asuncion; four sons, Renay 
Asuncion of Chicago, Illinois, Sito 
Asuncion of Seattle, Washington, 
Boyette P. Asuncion and Pomping S. 
Asuncion, both of Sunnyvale, Cali­
fornia; and by two daughters, 
Ludivina Solis of Chicago, Illinois 
and Nelia Asuncion of San Fran­
cisco, California. 

He is also survived by three broth­
ers, Enrique Asuncion and Tinay 
Babette Asuncion, both of Cavite, 
Philippines, and Ernesto Asuncion 
of San Francisco, California; and by 
four sisters, Augustina Poblete of 
Cavite, Philippine Islands, Dr. Vir­
ginia A. de Guzman of Martin, Li­
gaya Baustista ofMiami Beach, Flor­
ida and Josephine Ladaga of Chilli­
cothe, Ohio. 

A funeral service will be held for 
Mr. Asuncion this week at Sunnyvale, 
California, and later at Taytay, Rizal, 
Philippines with entombment there. 

Susie Puckett 
Susie Puckett, 75, of Ada, Ohio, 

died Monday, October 5, at Lima 
Memorial Hospital. 

Born May 14, 1917 in Floyd 
County, she was the daughter of the 
late Harry and Sarah Anderson 
Manuel. She was preceded in death 
by her husband, Cecil Puckett, on 
April16, 1954. She was a nurses' aid 
at Lima Memorial Hospital, where 
she was also a private duty nurse, and 
at Oaks Convalescent Center. She 
attend Lonesome Valley United 
Baptist Church in Alger, Ohio. 

Survivors include three sons, Paul 
Puckett of Waldo, Ohio, Irwin Puck­
ett of Defiance, Ohio, and Phillip 
Puckett of Butler, Indiana; four sis­
ters, Angie Bays of Prestonsburg, 
Goldie Frazier of Ada, Ohio, Gladys 
Spradlin of McGuffey, and Phoebe 
Merritt of Alger, Ohio; 14 grandchil-. 
dren and 15 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Thursday, 
October 8, at the Lonesome Valley 
United Baptist Church with Elder 
Amos Hackworth officiating. 

Cora G. Watts 
Sparkman 

Cora G. Watts Sparkman, 73, of 
Pippa Passes, died Wednesday, Oc­
tober 7, at the East Kentucky Health 
Services Center at Mallie following a 
sudden illness. 

BornNovember6,1919 shewas 
the daughter of the late Woolery and 
Stella Inez Slone Watts. 

Survivors include her husband, 
Victor Sparkman; three sons, Robert 
Sparkman and Joey Robert Spark­
man, both ofPippaPasses, and Jimmy 
Sparkman of Dema; five daughters, 
Fern and Lema Sparkman, both of 
Auxier, Ann Sparkman, Sue Spark­
man,andJacqueline Sparkman, all of 
Pippa Passes; one sister, Hilda Ash­
ley of Wheelersburg, Ohio; one 
brother, Merdia Watts of Hindman; 
and seven grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Saturday, 
October lO,at 1 p.m.,attheHindman 
Funeral Services chapel with the 
ministers Lawrence Slone and Roger 
Hicks officiating. 

Burial was in the Dclza Sparkman 
Cemetery at Pippa Passes. 

Russell Johnson 
Russell Johnson, 61, of Hi Hat 

died Friday, October 9, at Highland~ 
Regional Medical Center, following 
a long illness. 

Born July 22, 1931 in Halo, he 
was the son of the late Riley and 
Pearlie Osborne Johnson. He was a 
disabled factory worker for T.W.R. 
Factory in Cleveland, Ohio. He was a 
member of the Regular Baptist 
Chmch. 

Survivors include one daughter, 
Mrs. Pat McLemoreofPhil Campbell, 
Alabama; three sons, Leamon Russell 
Johnson of Glen, Mississippi, Terry 
Johnson of Sand Mt, Alabama, and 
Michael Johnson of Haleyville, Ala­
bama: three brothers, Hershell 
Johnson and Riley Johnson Jr., both 
of Cleveland, Ohio, and Thomas 
Johnson ofDema; seven sisters, Mrs. 
Lana Childers of Bevinsville, Mrs. 
Marie Woodrow and Mrs. Rose Annie 
Martin, both of Prestonsburg, Mrs. 
Louise Elswick of Hi Hat, Mrs. 
J auneta Caudill and Mrs. Emily f::dge, 
both Cleveland, Ohio, and Beulah 
Tackett of Belleville, Michigan; five 
grandchildren and three step-grand­
children. 

Funeral services were Monday, 
October 12, at 11 a.m., in the Joppa 
Regular Baptist Church at Melvin 
with the Clergymen Ellis Holbrook, 
Walter Burke, Curtis Hall and Hobart 
Bates officiating. 

Burial was in the Newman Ceme­
tery at Hi Hat under the direction of 
Hall Funeral Home. 

Tivis Neeley 
Tivis Neeley, 43, of Hueysville, 

died Monday, October 12, at the 
University of Kentucky Medical 
Center in Lexington following a short 
illness. 

Born August 17, 1949 in Floyd 
County, he was the son of Chester 
and Dottie Ratti ff Neeley of 
Hueysville. 

In addition to his parents, he is 
survived by one son, Tivis Jason 
Neeley of Prestonsburg; four daugh­
ters, Tresa Lynn Neeley, Penny Kay 
Neeley, Deborah Collins, and Polly 
Sue Neeley, all of Prestonsburg; four 
brothers, Ronnie Neeley, Cesco 
Neeley ,Russell Neeley, and Michael 
Neeley, all of Hueysville; five sis­
ters, Beatrice Adams ofWillard, Ohio, 
Barbara Neeley of Hueysville, Helen 
BountelloofBen Bolt, Texas, Vickie 
Singleton of Hindman. and Sherry 
Shepherd of Gunlock. 

Funeral services will be Thurs­
day,October IS, at 11 a.m., at the Salt 
Lick Community Baptist Church at 
Hueysville, with the Clergymen 
Elden Bailey, Jacobson Jarvis and 
others officiating. 

Burial will be in the family ceme­
tery at Hueysville, under the direc­
tion of Hall Funeral Home. 

FLOYD COUNTY 
CATHOLICS 

WELCOME YOU 
ST. MARTHA CHURCH 

Water Gap 
Masses: 7 p.m., Sat.; 11 a.m. Sunday 

Religious Education Classes: 
Sunday, 9:45-10:45 a.m. 

Inquiry Class, Mon. at 7 p.m. 
Pastor: Father Joseph Muench 

Phone 874·9526 

ZION 
DELIVERANCE 

CHURCH 
WAYLAND, KENTUCKY 

Sunday School 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

Wednesday Prayer Service 7 p.m. 
Saturday Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

ADA MOSLEY 
PASTOR 

:J--{ouse of 
!f{owers & (jifts 
"From Our House To Your House" 

Fresh and Silk Funeral Arrangements 
Green Plants 

"'· Ffe¢,I>~I!Y~f:~:t§.''au k9baiFvh~ra,fHomes 
Across the street from Carter Funeral Home 

886-6948 

Christine Sweeney 
Christine Sweeney, 63, of 

Prestonsburg, died Friday, October 
9, in Highlands Regional Medical 
Center following an extended illness. 

Born December 25, 1928 in 
Prestonsburg, she was the daughter 
of the late Starlin and Mary Goodman 
Sweeney. She was a self-employed 
housekeeper and was of the Baptist 
faith. 

Survivors include two brothers, 
Fred Sweeney of Prestonsburg and 
Frank Sweeney of Hinesville, Geor­
gia; and three sisters, Stella Sweeney 
and Julia Sweeney, both of 
Prestonsburg, and Maggie Allen of 
Allen. 

Funeral services were Monday, 
October 12, at 11 a.m., in the Floyd 
Funeral Home chapel with the Rev. 
Manford Fannin officiating. 

Burial was in Davidson Memorial 
Gardens at I vel under the direction of 
Floyd Funeral Home. 

Serving as active pallbearers were 
Jimmy Nichols, Bobby Carr, Johnny 
Hall, George Music, Thurman Laf­
ferty and Frankie Slone. 

Honorary pallbearers were Bill 
Callihan, Teddie Frasure, Marvin 
Goodman, Dennie Whitten, James 
Nichols and Ray Slone. 

Maude McComas 
Maude McComas, 90, of Crid­

ersville, Ohio, formerly of Eastern, 
died Friday, October 9, in the 
Wapakoneta Nursing Home follow­
ing a long illness. 

Born January 23, 1902 in North­
em, she was the daughter of the late 
Jack and Clarinda Moore Warrens. 
She was preceded in death by her 
husband, Arthur Ray McComas. She 
was a member of the Stone Coal 
Regular Baptist Church at Garrett 

Survivors include two sons, Edwin 
McComas of Sandusky, Ohio, and 
Glenn McComas of Cridersville, 
Ohio; one daughter, Wanda Lambert 
of Lima, Ohio; two brothers, Holley 
Warrens of Waverly, Ohio, and Wil­
lie Warrens of Prestonsburg; eight 
grandchildren, 16 great-grandchil­
dren and two step-great-grandchil­
dren. 

Courtney Lee Ann 
Griffith 

Courtney Lee Ann Griffith, 2 1/2, 
of Whitesburg, Tennessee, died Sat­
urday, October 10, at the Knoxville 
Childrens Hospital, Knoxville, Ten­
nessee, following a long illness. 

Born April 2, 1990 in Kenton, 
Ohio, she was the daughter of Ronald 
and Elizabeth Burehfield Griffith of 
Whitesburg, Tennessee. 

In addition to her parents, she is 
survived by one brother, Mark Grif­
fith at home; her great-grandmother, 
Ellen Smith of Garrett; step-grandfa­
ther, Otis Slone of Pippa Passes. Her 
paternal grandparents are Arlene 
Stone Griffith of Pippa Passes and 
the late Melvin Griffith and maternal 
grandparents are the late Jake and 
Pearlie Burchfield. 

Funeral services were Monday, 
October 12, at 11 a.m., at the Hall 
Funeral Home chapel with the Cler­
gymen Don Hackworth and Sterling 
Bolen officiating. 

Burial was in the Tom Martin 
Cemetery at Garrett under the direc­
tion of Hall Funeral Home. 

Montana (Tean) 
Osborne 

Montana (Tean) Keathley 
Osborne, 56, of Banner, died Sun­
day, October 11, at her residence 
following a long illness. 

Born April2, 1936 at Harold, she 
was the daughter of the late Wallis 
and Eunice Warrix Keathley. She 
was a member of the Lancer Baptist 
Church. 

Survivors include her husband, 
Ellis Osborne; two sons, Jimmy Lee 
Osborne and Gregory Dean Osborne, 
both of Banner; one sister, Nancy 
Spurlock of Harold; and three grand­
children. 

Funeral services were Tuesday, 
October 13, at 1 p.m., at the Hall 
Funeral Home chapel with the Cler­
gymen Cohen Campbell, Dan 
Heintzelman, Jennings West and Tim 
McClanahan officiating. 

Burial was in Davidson Memorial 
Gardens at I vel under the direction of 
Hall Funeral Home. 

Ramon Hamilton 
Ramon Hamilton, 56, of Phyllis, 

fonnerly of Teaberry, died Saturday, 
October 10, at his residence. 

Born June 27, 1936 at Teaberry, 
he was the son of the late Henry and 
Martha Hamilton. He was a disabled 
steel worker, formerly employed by 
the McClouth Steel Company in 
Trenton, Michigan. 

Survivors include two sons, Bill 
Hamilton and Jim Hamilton, both of 
Taylor, Michigan; two daughters, 
Judy Walden of Taylor, Michigan 
and Diana HaUleyofRomulus, Michi­
gan; two brothers, Troy Hamilton of 
Teaberry and Wheeler Hamilton of 
Craynor; one sister, Olgia Trounter 
ofW arsaw, Indiana; and seven grand­
children. 

Funeral services will be Wednes­
day, October 14, at 10 a.m., at the 
Samaria Regular Baptist Church at 
Teaberry, with the Regular Baptist 
Church ministers officiating. 

Burial will be in the Roe Henson 
Cemetery at Teaberry under the di­
rection of Hall Funeral Home. 

Eugene Tackett 
Eugene Tackett, 45, of Hi Hat, 

died Monday, October 12, at the 
McDowell Appalachian Regional 
Hospital following a long illness. 

Born December 15, 1946 at Bea­
ver, he was the son of Jim and Han­
nah Jones Tackett of Hi HaL 

In addition to his parents, he is 
survived by his wife, Alexandra 
Platkus Tackett; two sons, Ricky and 
Jamie Tackett, both of Hi Hat; one 
daughter, Judy Hall of McDowell; 
four brothers, Curt Tackett and Danny 
Tackett, both of Hi Hat, Berry Tack­
ett of Hunter, and Donald Tackett of 
Canton, Michigan; six sisters, Gla­
dys Tackett and Geraldine Petty, both 
of Melvin, Gladis Slone of Ligon, 
Irene Lee of Hi Hat, Ethel Faye 
Johnson of Lincoln Park, Michigan, 
and Martha Mae Nobile of Martin; 
and two grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be Thurs­
day, October 15, at 10 a.m. at the 
Little Nancy Old Regular Baptist 
Church at Hi Hat with the Regular 
Baptist Church ministers officiating. 

Burial will be in the Newman 
Cemetery at Hi Hat under the direc­
tion of Hall Funeral Home. 

Auxier Freewill 
Baptist Church 

Sunday School ....•. -................... 9:<45 a.m. 
Morning W011hip ...... _ ... _ .•..• _ .. 11 :00 a.m. 
Sun. Youth Meeting .................... 5:00 p.m. 
Evening Worahip Se1vic81 ......... 6:00 p.m. 
Thursday 
Prayer Meeting ................. , ......... 7:00 p.m. 

Pastor, Bobby Joe Spencer 
Asst. Pastor Southle Fannin, Jr. 

BEAUTIFUL 
MEMORIALS 

• Monuments 
• Markers 
• Vases 
• Granite 
• Bronze 
• Cemetery lettering 
• Custom design 

Phone or Fax 

285-9961 

Merion Bros. 
Monument Co. 

Located 2 miles from Martin 
on Rl122 

One of the Area's Most Selected 

Funeral services were Tuesday, 
October 13, at 10 a.m., at the Hall 
Funeral Home chapel with the Regu­
lar Baptist Church ministers officiat­
ing. 

Burial was in Davidson Memorial 
Gardens at I vel under the direction of 
Hall Funeral Home. 

Serving as pallbearers were Ken­
neth Spurlock, Toney Adkins, Ste­
ven McKinney, Davis Evans, Davis 
Evans Jr., Kevin Evans, Roger 
Owens, Timothy Evans, Jimmy 
Osborne Jr., Ronnie Owens, Joel ,------------.---------~~~~~~--~~ 
Spradlin, and Victor Keathley II. 

In Appreciation 
The family of Joyce Hall Weddington wishes to thank our friends 

who have been so thoughtful in this time of sorrow. Your generous 
gifts of your presence, prayers, flowers, food, cards and donations 
to Community Methodist Church are much appreciated. Special 
thanks to the Rev. Raymond Snider and Rev. Arnold Turner Jr. for 
their words of comfort; the Choir ofCommunity Methodist Church, 
under the direction ofPaul Smith, for uplifting music; friends who 
collaborated with Dr. Phillip Simpson in the composition of an 
eloquent eulogy; the Methodist Women of Community Methodist 
Church for a lovely dinner for family and pallbearers following the IIi 

burial; Sheriff Paul Hunt Thompson, the Floyd County Sheriffs ., 
Department and the Prestonsburg Police Department for their 
assistance in traffic control and Floyd Funeral Home for their very 
professional services. 

Card ofThanks 
The family of Jennifer Lynn Ousley would like 

to extend their appreciation to all those friends, 
neighbors and loved ones :who helped comfort them 
during their time of sorrow. Thanks to all who sent 
food, flowers, prayers or spoke comforting words. A 
special thanks to the Regular Baptist ministers for 
their comforting words, the sheriffs department 
for their assistance in traffic control and the Hall 
Funeral Home, for their kind and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
JENNIFER LYNN OUSLEY 

! I-) 

· , ' 
' - \ 

/ 

-J 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 
(606) 874-2121 

Larry Bwk2, Manager 

.• · 
NELSON-FRAZIER FUNERAL HOME 

Phone: 285-5155 
Owned and Operated By: 

Roger Nelson and Glenn Frazier 

··A proud tradition 
Our funeral home has been responding 
to the needs of the community for many 
years. To continue this proud tradition 
of helping families in their time of need, 
we now offer the Sunset s~ritySM 
Plan. 

Sunset Security8 " offered by us as a 
member of the Kentucky Funeral 
Directors Burial Association, ~s a plan 
that lets you reduce the stress your 

Through Sunset S~rity'", you can 
pre-arrange a fun~ral now. The plan 
offers an inflation-proof feature that leiS 
you save money by freezing the cost of 
a funeral at today's prices. And it 
provides special tax-saving advantages. 
We'd like to give you a "Personal 
Record Guide'' and tell you about the 
Sunset Security&" Plan. Just complete 
the coupon below and send it to us. 

loved ones will experience at the tune of 
a funeral. 

HALL FUNERAL HOME 
. Martin, KY 

PHONE: 285-9261 or 285-9262 
"The Home That Service Built" 

Hall Funeral Home now offers 24-Hour Obituary Line. Just dial285·3333 
and receive a recorded message of the days funeral announcements. 

SUNSET SECURITYSM 
lP;;;.e-;o;w-e ;;;';with a-::pe-;;;nal R;;d Guide"" and Wor-;;;;;lion on •ttleSunsctSec:ur:-, I ity"' Plan. . I 

Name 

Address 

City State Zip 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I , .. , Traci Burke, Funeral Director · Embalmer 

'X,Jasona6£t, 'X,JCiobft, a11lf Courteous Serviu since 1952 
Pre-need burial Insurance available. LTelephone I I 

L __ ;..::::::..::::.-=..::=..=-.:=-:=..:=..:=..;;:::..: -=-= - - - - - _j I 
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Season announced at Jenny Wiley Theatre 
Even though the stage at Jenny 

Wiley Theatre is now covered with 
fallen leaves and the 1992 season is 
over, work continues at a furious 
pace. Why the hurry? Because the 
1993 season is just around the corner 
and it takes all year, every year, to 
bring the quality shows that are pro­
duced at Jenny Wiley Theatre. 

1993 promises to be another ex­
citing season offamily entertainment 
with the addition of three new shows 
to the theatre's repertoire and the 
return ofiDo! I Do! originally staged 
at Jenny Wiley Theatre in 1978. The 
new shows include the Rodgers and 
Hammerstein musical version of 
Cinderella, the country music favor­
ite, Pump Boys and Dineues and the 
Appalachian Heritage tale, Foxfrre. 

Cinderella is, of course, based on 
the timeless fairy tale. The duo of 
Richard Rodgers and Oscar Ham­
merstein made theatrical and motion 
picture history with such classics as 
Oklahoma!, Carousel, South Pacific, 
The King and I, The Sound of Music, 
nd Cinderella. 

The other prominent figure in this 
work is Julie Andrews for whom the 
stage version was written. However, 
Miss Andrews didn't debut the lead­
ing role on Broadway, but live on 
CBS Television on March 31, 1957, 
instead. This history-making event 
brought live theatre to live television 
and established Rodgers and Ham­
merstein as masters of many enter­
tainment genres. 

Cinderella is, without a doubt, a 
show for the entire family. Children 
of all ages will be enchanted with the 
fairy tale and adults will enjoy the 
fabulous musical numbers including 
"Do I Love You Because You're 
Beautiful?" Cinderella begins June 
18, 1993. 

Pump· Boys and Dinettes is also 
SW"e to be a family favorite. The Tony­
award nominee for best musical fea­
tures 20country music songs guaran­
teed to get your feet tapping and your 
funnybone tickling. 

Pump Boys and Dinettes is set in 
the Double Cupp diner located on 

.lfighway 57 somewhere in the South. 
It is there we find the Cupp Sisters, 
Prudie and Rhetta. They are enter­
tained and wooed by four gentleman 
from the gas station next. door (you 
guessed it-the Pump Boys). 

The story of Pump Boys and 
Dinettes is simplistic and doesn't 
require much thought The show is 
actual! y a night of songs. One crowd­
pleasing number is ''The Night Dolly 

Parton Was Almost Mine," which Touchingandthought-provoking, 
pays tribute to the singer whose pic- Foxfrre also features some country 
ture hangs prominently on the wall of music when Annie's country-west­
the gas station. em singer son arrives to round out the 

Pump Boys and Dinettes is a story. It is a night of sheer enjoyment 
musical comedy with lots of spirit and Cronyn quite adequately and 
and all of it with a great country reverently pays tribute to a way of 
flavor that celebrates the Southern life that has almost become extinct. 
way of life. If you enjoyed Big River Cronyn and Tandy's credits while 
music, this is the show for you. working together include the feature 

Ourthirdshowintheamphitheatre 1 fa.lm Cocoon and, on Broadway, The 
next summer also celebrates the Gin Game and I Do! I Do!, the fourth 
Southern way of life. In fact, Fox fire show at Jenny Wiley Theatre in 1993. 
written by Hume Cronyn and Susan I Do! I Do! will be produced in­
Cooper, takes its name from the doors only at the Wilkinson-Stumbo 
Appalachian publication that depicts Convention Center Oocated directly 
the richness and honesty found in front of the theatre) and is a two-
uniquely in our culture. character play. 

Cronyn, who is best known for his 
theatrical and motion picture pair­
ings with his wife, Jessica Tandy, 
also starred in the original stage and 
film productions. 

Foxfrre is about Annie Nations, a 
widow living out the last years of her 
life on her farm in Rabun County, 
Georgia Throughout the course of 
the play, Annie recounts her life and 
times with her late husband, Hector. 
As the action unfolds, the audience is 
slowly allowed to figure out the play's 
sentimental secret 

This musical comedy version of 
the original play titled The Four 
Poster, chronicles a couple's 50-year 
marriage and its trials tribulations. 
The songs are inspiring and witty and 
the action keeps the audience moving 
along on the whirlwind ride called 
marriage. 

I Do! I Do!, Foxfrre, Pump Boys 
and Dinettes, and Cinderella premiere 
next summer atJenny Wiley Theatre, 
and, yes, reservations can be made 
now by calling (606) 886-9274. 

Regional lottery winners listed 
Kentucky Lottery winners for the 

month of September have claimed 
over $25,000 in prizes. Lottery play­
ers must claim a prize over $600 at a 
lottery regional office or at lottery 
headquarters. Prizes under $600 can 
be cashed at a lottery retailer. 

Winners reported and the winning 
games for the Prestonsburg Region 
September 1 through September 30 
are as follows: 

Chenne Robinson of Regina, 
$2,000, Magic Money; Mark Hall of 
Wheelwright, $1,000, Heat Wave; 
Glenn Ravenscraft of Hager Hill, 
$905, Lotto KY; Thelma Freeman of 
FedsCreek, $5,001, Powerball; Gra­
cie Spencer of Jackson, $620, Lotto 
KY;VemonJohnsonofVirgie,$800, 
Pick 3, and Doris Scott of Pikeville, 
$620, Lotto KY. 

Also Chester Bartley of Pikeville, 
$620, Lotto KY; Ethel Caudill of 
Staffordsville, $785, Lotto KY; Wil­
liam TolerofJackson,$1,000, 3 Card 
Cash; Cheryl Webb of Inez, $903, 
Lotto KY; Clarence McCoy of For­
rest Hills, $903, Lotto, KY; Sarah 
Robinson of Regina, $1,000, Break 

Ft. Knox, and Charles Haney of West 
Liberty, $1,000, JackpoL 

Others were Betty Tackeu of Vir­
gie, $700, Pick 3; Patricia Stacy of 
Kermit, West Virginia, $1,000, 3Card 
Cash; Danny Ratliff of Pikeville, 
$963, Lotto KY; Jerry Johnson of 
Speight, $700, Pick 3; Georgia Nay­
lor of Harold, $1,000, Couch Potato; 
Randal Ratliff of Honaker, $2,000, 
Magic Money; Willard Tackett of 
Virgie, $975, Lotto KY, and Cheryl 
Lewis of Prestonsburg, $1,000, 
Couch Potato. 

TilE AMERICAN HEART 
ASS<I:IATION 

MEMORIAL PRCERAMe 

1-800-AHA-USAl 

American Heart 
Association 

This space provided as a public service. 
1992, Amencan Heart Assoc1ahon 

A VOTE FOR ME~ A VOTE FOR CHANGE! 
I DON'T have any board members backing me. 
IDQN'T have any immediate family members working for the board, so when 

it comes time to STAND liE and VOTE for something, I ,CAN VOTE how I 
think is RIGHT for the people. 

People, HQ~ will tell me how to vote on any issues such as-PURCHAS· 
lNG LAND FOR NEW SCHOOLS, LOCATION OF LANDS, THE BUILD· 
lNG OF NEW SCHOOLS, and NEW GYMNASIUMS-ILL D..Q WHAT I 
THINK is right for OUB KIDS and for the people of my district. 

People, I DQN'T believe in DOUBLING our TAXES. BARE ALREADY 
TAXED lll DEATH! I would check the budget to see if there was money that 
I felt wasn't being used properly and I would put this money to use in the order 
it should be put. As you pay your school taxes on your property and your cars, 
DO YOU FEEL AS I DO? I feel our kids haven't benefited a bit from the 
douhlinf of our school taxes. 

My priority will be for the kids' fii:S ~ years of school-l:Q LEARN lliE 
BASICS-READING--WBITING--ARITIIMETIC. THEN the kids would 
still have &years left to learn Computers, Algebra, and Science.IE.:nlll CAN'T 
READ a Science book, HOW CAN YOU PASS SCIENCE? x.QJl HAVE nl 
KNQW lliE. BASICS FIRST! 

IT'S TIME FOR A CHANGE! 
On November'3rd-VOTE FOR 

HATTIE ''COOLEY'' 

OWENS 
Paid for by candidate 

CARTER-HUGHES TOYOTA 
'89 TOYOTA VAN 

Customized and loaded, 
dark blue 

$9,485 
'88 DODGE CARAVAN 

Auto., A/C., AM/FM. 
Very nice! 

$8,950 · 
'88 CHEVY CORSICA 

Auto., A/C., 
Low miles. 

$5,445 
'88 BUICK SKYLARK 

2-tone gray paint. 
Very sharp! 

$4,465 
No one will sell you a new Toyota for less. 

NOONE! 

PRE-OWNED 
VEHICLE 
SPECIALS 

'92 TOYOTA 
COROLLA 

Auto., A/C., AM/FM. Low miles. 
7 to choose from 

$10,285 
'92 TOYOTA 

TERCEL 
Auto., A/C., AM/FM. Low miles. 

5 to choose from 

$9,595 
*Prices do not Include Tax and License. 

UG 
430 So. Lake Drive, Prestonsburg 

886-3861 • 800-489-3861 

'90 TOYOTA CAMRY 
V 6, auto., A/C, 

AMIFM cassette 

$.10,495 
'88 HONDAACCORD LXI 

-Loaded. 
Must drive this one! 

$6,995 
'87 TOYOTA 2-WD 

X -tra cab, long bed. 
Very rare! 

$5,985 
SPECIAL! 

'78 OLDS DELTA 88 

$550 
No one will sell you a new Toyota for less. 

NOONE! 
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Orthopaedic Mini 
Clinic to be held 
at shrine temple 

El Hasa Shrine Temple will be 
holding their Eighth Annual Ortho­
paedic Mini Clinic on Friday, No­
vember 6, from 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. for 
the purpose of screening children 
from the Tri-State and surrounding 
area with an orthopaedic condition 
(problems with bones, muscles, liga­
ments) that could be treated and 
helped by being admitted to one of 
the Shriners Hospitals for Crippled 
Children. The clinic will be held at El 
HasaTemple(Rt 180,Cannonsburg, 
next to the Boyd County High School 
Football Stadium, Ashland, Ky.). 

The clinic is entirely free and open 
to any child from infancy up to age 18 
who presents himself to the clinic. 
There will be a team of medical spe­
cialists from the Lexington unit of 
Shriners Hospitals for Crippled Chil­
dren present to conduct the screen­
ings and examinations and will be 
assisted by local physicians. This is a 
screening clinic only to determine if 
the applicant requires follow-up or 
assistance at the orthopaedic hospi­
tal. If further assistance is necessary, 
the application will be transferred to 
the Lexington unit and further treat­
ment will take place there. No appli­
cation is needed in advance. Applica­
tions will be available upon arrival to 
the clinic. 

It is the desire ofEl Hasa Temple 
that many children will be reached 
during this upcoming clinic. For more 
information, you may call El Hasa 
Shrine Temple at (606) 928-9529. 

The Floyd County Times 

The Beatles are back at MSU 
The Student Government Association at Morehead State University will sponsor "1964" As The Beatlesln a 
Homecoming concert on Friday, October 16, at 9:30 p.m., In the Academic-Athletic Center. There Is no 
admission charge but donations will be accepted at the door to benefit SGA's Scholarship Endowment Back 
by popular demand, the musicians will present nearly 100 minutes of the Baatles songs from a repertoire of 
mora than 50 ofthalr smash hits. The performers have spent years researching the "Fabulous Four" and have 
Incorporated vintage costumes, haircuts, mannerism and authentic sound In an endearing tribute to the 
Beatles. Additional Information Is available by calling (606) 783-2071. 

Prestonsburg Community College 
to link up with World Food Day 

Prestonsburg Community College 
will host this year's annual World 
Food Day Friday, October 16. This 
year's topic is Nutrition: Linking 
Food, Health and Development 

raphy; Debbie Stumbo, nutritionist 
and Eula Hall, community/social 
activitist, Mud Creek; and Brenda 
Cockeham, extension specialist, 
Johnson County. 

tijastic, associate professor of His­
toryandchairoftheDivisionofSocial 
Sciences, PCC. 

-~ DONATEBLOOD. 

~~·Ler" IT ONLY HURTS WHEN YOU DON'T. 

Central Kentucky Blood Center 
PRESTONSBURG STAT/ON 

(MuniCipal B ldg ) 
N. Lake Drive / Prestonsburg. Kentucky 41653 

!J(f£o/Io/.9LL 
October lSth-7.:00 p.m. 

MARTIN FREEWILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Martin, Ky. 
Speakers: Johnny Collins 

Clinton "Buddy" Jones 

Special Singing Nightly 
Everyone Welcome 

Pastor, Bobby Baldridge 

Card Of Thanks 
The family of Alvin Barnett wishes to gratefully 

acknowledge the thoughtfulness and kindness of 
friends, relatives and neighbors in the loss of our 
loved one. Thanks to all who sent food, flowers, 
prayers or spoke comforting words. We are espe­
cially grateful to Revs. Don Crisp and Rando1ph 
Crisp for their comforting words, the Sheriffs 
Department for their assistance in traffic control 
and the Hall Funeral Home for their kind and 
efficient service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
ALVIN BARNETT 

Pastoral care 
workshop set 

In order to help in the search for 
solutions to world hunger and pov­
erty, the 1992 Teleconference will 
examine some of the factors that have 
led to a consensus among govern­
ments of the world. 

Scheduling for moderators is as 
follows: 

• Noon-12:58 p.m.,inRoomJ112, 
Dr. Douglas Hennan, associate pro­
fessor of History and Political Econ­
omy at PCC will preside. 

Continuing education sign up 
fonns from the Catholic Universit'J 
of America, ADA and AHEA, are 
available for the clergy, registered ~==~==~~~~=~====~===~~~ 
dietitians, dietetic technicians, home 

The McDowell Appalachian 
Regional Hospital will host area 
clergy for a Pastoral Care Workshop 
on Tuesday, October 20. The pro­
gram will begin at 4:30 p.m., and a 
complimentary meal will be served 
at 6:00p.m. 

The workshop programs will be 
presented by Rev. Charles N. Wilcox 
and Rev. Thomas W. Schuler, chap­
laincy program consultant for Appa­
lachian Regional Healthcare. The 
programs are open to clergy person 
of all denominations. Workshop 
subjects will be of special interest to 
all clergy. 

Those planning to attend the work­
shop should call the hospital at 377-
3400, extension 401 to make reserva­
tions for the complimentary meal. 
Reservations should be made no later 
than Friday, October 16, 1992. 

Health screenings 
at community fair 

Employees, businessmenofFloyd 
County businesses, and other indi­
viduals are invited to take advantage 
of free health tests, screenings, and 
checks as well as health information. 

Community Health Advocates 
{CHAP) of the Christian Appalachian 
Project is sponsoring a Community 
Health Fair this Friday, October 16, 
from 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. at the First 
Baptist Church on First A venue in 
Prestonsburg. 

Health services will include cho­
lesterol checks, screenings for blood 
sugar, blood pressure and weight, 
and eyes and ear testing. There will 
also be informational booths for 
workplace safety, cancer prevention, 
stress management. weight reduction, 
nutrition and smoking. 

Participants of the health fair will 
receiveFamilyCircle's Back to Good 
Health, a cook book, as a memento of 
their visit. 

The local panel to discuss the is­
sues regarding Nutrition: Linking 
Food, Health and Development in 
the Big Sandy area community is 
drawn from scholars and community 
leaders with diverse backgrounds, 
including Dr. John Shiber, assistant 
professor of Biology; Dr. Dorothy 
Carlson, associate professor of Edu­
cation/Psychology; Bob McAninch, 
professor of Political Science; Tho­
mas Orf, assistant professor ofGeog-

Judge Caudill 
attends Judge's 
Judical College 

District Judge Danny P. Caudill 
representing the 31st judicial district, 
which includes Floyd County, at­
tended the 1992DistrictJudgesJudi­
cia1 College held at Lake Barkley 
State Park, September 27-0ctober 1. 

Workshops and seminars ad­
dressed topics including special edu­
cation students in juvenile court, child 
support enforcement, legislative 
changes affecting district court, media 
issues, evidence code, child sexual 
abuse, and DUI decisions. Small 
group discussions and mock trials 
provided the means for utilizing in­
formation exchange between partici­
pants. 

The judicial college, which is one 
of many programs the judges may 
attend to fulfill their continuing edu­
cation requirements, was sponsored 
and conducted by the Administrative 
Office of the Courts with program 
curriculum designed by the District 
Judges' Association Education 
Committee. 

Birthday candles are one way 
to make light of your age. 

Anonymous 

Zion Deliverance 
Church 
Wayland, Ky. 

Saturday and Sunday, 
October 17 and 18 

7:30 p.m. each night 

f~~!~~,g~f.H.'!.~~~~i,At~ 
Ada Mosley, Pastor 

Everyone Welcome! 

• 1:00-1:58 p.m., Room J112, 
panel moderator is Eileen Lewan­
dowski, assistant professor of Com­
munications and coordinator, Ap­
palachia Civic Leadership Project 

• 2:00-3:00 p.m., Room J112, 
moderated by Dr. Thomas D. Ma-

economics and social workers who 
plan to attend the entire three hours. 
The general public is invited to at­
tend this important teleconference. 

For further infonnation about the 
World Food Day Teleconference, 
contact Dr. Nnamdi Anoskie, World 
Food Day site coordinator and/or 
Professor Weddle, WFD sponsor at 
886-3863. 

REVIVAL 
Beginning October 18, 1992 

at the hour of 6:00 p.m. 
Weeknights, at the hour of 7:00p.m. 

BRO. DEWEY CONLEY 

-Special Singing Nightly-

*****EVERYONE WELCOME***** 

Pastor, Bro. Darrell Howell 

Card of Thanks 
The family of Edna Hall Hale wishes to thank all 

those friends, neighbors, and family who helped them 
in any way upon the passing of their loved one. Thanks 
to those who sent food, flowers, prayers and words of 
comfort expressed. A special thanks to the Regular 
Baptist ministers for their comforting words, the 
meJllbers of the Providence Regular Baptist Church, 
Dry Creek, Ky., the sheriffs department for their 
assistance in traffic control and the Hall Funeral Home 
for their kind and professional service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
EDNA HALL HALE 

Card ofThanks 
The family of Rosie Ellen Bates Cole wishes to 

thank all of those who were so kind and consider­
ate during our time of grief. We want to thank 
those who sent food, flowers and gifts oflove. We 
especially want to thank the Regular Baptist min­
isters for their comforting words, the sheriffs de­
partment for their assistance in traffic control, and 
the Hall Funeral Home for their kind and profes­
sional service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
ROSIE ELLEN BATES COLE 

Card Of Thanks 
The family of Anthony McKinney wishes to 

thank everyone who so thoughtfully helped 
during our time of sorrow; to everyone who 
sent flowers or brought food, it was deeply ~\ 
appreciated. Thanks to all those who came to 
comfort and be with us. Thanks to the Old 
Regular Baptist ministers, the ~elson-Fra­
zier Funeral Home and the Shenff's Depart­
ment for their assistance in traffic control. 

THEF~YOF 
ANTHONY McKINNEY 

1st Anniversary of 

Dedication 
and Feast Day 
Sunday, October 18 . 

5:00p.m. 

St. Lukf, Catfio{ic Cfiurcli 
Salyersville, K~. 

Come celebrate with us! 

(jospe{ Singing 
at 

Auxier Freewill 
Baptist 

Saturday, October 17th 
7:00p.m. 

Everyone Welcome! 
Pastor, Bobby Joe Spencer 



Editor's Note: As a service to the 
many clubs and committees that meet 
in our community, the Floyd County 
Times' CommunityCalendarwillpost 
meeting and public service announce­
ments. Articles for the Community 
Calendar must be submitted in writ­
ing to the Times no later than 5 p.m. 
Monday for Wednesday's publica­
tionor5p.m. WednesdayforFriday's 
publication. These cannot be taken 
over the telephone. 

Discussion/support 
group to begin at PCC 

Continuing Education/Commu­
nity Services of Prestonsburg Com­
munity College wi11 offer, beginning 
October 20, a Discussion/Suppon 
Group for people of the Big Sandy 
Valley, who would like to explore 

\ with group interaction. The group 
will meet from 4:30-5:45 p.m. from 
October 20-December 8. The group 
facilitators are Carol Mulling and 
Lynn Weddle,PsychologyandNurs­
ing Professors at PCC. The meetings 
are free and open to the public. 

Dr. Amendiondo to speak 
at ~~us-TOO" group 

Dr. Oscar Amendiondo from the 
Lexington Radiation Therapy Center 
will speak to the "US-TOO" prostate 
cancer support group at Prestonsburg 
on0ctober20. The meeting will be in 

~ the Highlands Regional Medical 
Center classroom No.2, at 7 p.m. For 
information call 789-5335. 

Training session 
There will be a training session for 

parent members of the site-based 
decision-making councils on Thurs­
day, October 15, at 7 p.m., at Betsy 
Layne Elementary. Layne Tackett 
will be the instructor. 

Meals served free 
-through Big Sandy 
Action Program 

Big Sandy Area Community Ac­
tion Program, Inc. will participate in 
the USDA ChildandAdultCareFood 
Program administered by the Ken­
tucky Department of Education. 

Meals will be served at no sepa­
rate charge to enrolled participants at 
the center and are provided without 
regard to race, color, national origin, 
sex, religion, age, or handicap. 

Participants eligible for free and/ 
or reduced price meals must have a 
complete application with documen­
tationof eligibility information which 
may include a Food Stamp or AFDC 
case number, or actual household 
member and income information. 

For information regarding the 
program, contact Jane Smith at 886-
1986. 

Advertisement 

Accidental 
discovery may 
end obesity 

WASHINGTON - Researchers may 
have discovered a way to end obesity­
by accident! 

In a study with a potential chole~terol 
lowering agent, scientists noted an 
unusual side effecL Instead of lower 
cholesterol levels, patients receiving a 
natural plant colloid lost weight while 
body weight in a control group remained 
constanL 

The scientists say the mechanism be­
hind the weight loss is not clear, but sug­
gest it is partially due to a decrease in the 
intestinal absorption of calories. Scien­
tists in another study published in the 
British Journal of NuJrition, found that 
patients consuming thesamecoUoid lost 
weight in sptte of being instructed not to 
alternonnal eating patterns. Despite this 
evidence, other scientists may not agree 
on the weight loss benefits of colloids. 
Someday, pending funher study, there 
could be universal agreement that col­
loids are helpful in confronting the prob­
lem of obesity. 

National Dietary Research, whose 
research topics have been the subject of 
articles published in recent medical and 
nutritional journals, has successfully in­
corporated a series of colloids into a 
chewable food tablet called FS-1. When 
used as directed, FS-1 replaces high 
calorie fats with lower calorie nutrients, 
thus providing optimum nutrition with a 
minimum number of fat calories. Ac­
cording to an article published in the 
American Journal of Clinical NulriJion, 
consciously limiting the amount of food 
one consumes is not necessary to lose 
weight, provided you limit the fat. 

A Florida company has obtained el!­
clusivedistribution rights to FS-1, which 
is available through pharmacies and other 
health care professionals. 

C 1992 OnUcron ln1<mational 

AVAILABLE AT: 

Cooley Apothecary 
#2 Town Center 

886-8106 
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Lyle Lovett in concert 
Lyle Lovett and his Large Band 

will be in concert at UK's Memorial 
Coliseum on Wednesday, October 
14, at 8 p.m. Reserved seating is$15. 
Tickets are available at the Ticket­
master Outlets or call 257-TICS. For 
more information, call Steve Daniels, 
John Herbst, or Shannon Vibbert at 
(606) 257-8867. 

Pancake breakfast 
The Betsy Layne Senior Citizens 

will be having a breakfast from 8 a.m. 
to noon on Saturday, October 17. 
They will be serving pancakes, sau­
sage, milk, juice and coffee. The cost 
of the breakfast will be $3, which will 
be used for the Betsy Layne Senior 
Citizens program. 

Head Injury Support 
Group to meet 

The East Kentucky Head Injury 
Support group meets the 3rd Satur­
dayofeachmonthattheFioydCounty 
Library in Prestonsburg at 10:30 a.m. 
People with head injuries and their 
families and friends are invited to 
attend. For more information call the 
following number: 946-2308, 437-
0553,886-2027, or 385-4827. 

Fall Festival at Harold 
The Harold Grade School P.T.O 

sponsors their annual Fall Festival on 
Saturday, October 17, from 5-8 p.m. 
at the Harold Grade School. This 
year they will have arts and crafts and 
food judging. The evening will be 
full of fun and games for everyone. 

a 

Conservation District 
meeting planned 

The Floyd County Conservation 
District will meet Tuesday, October 
20,at3:15 p.m. inthedistrictofficeat 
37 South Lake Drive in Prestonsburg. 
All interested persons are invited to 
attend. 

Zebulon Lodge to confer 
Master Mason Degree 

Prestonsburg's Zebulon Lodge 
No. 273 will confer the Master Ma­
son degree on two candidates Satur­
day, October 17, beginning at 6 p.m. 
Dinner will be served at 7 and the 
work will continue. All master ma­
sons are invited to attend. 

Mountain 
Christian Academy 
to sponsor breakfast 

Moun~in Christian Academy will 
be sponsbring a pancake breakfast 
beginning at 7 a.m. at Martin Youth 
Center on Saturday, October 17 dur­
ing Red, White, and Blue Days. 

"Walk for Hunger'' 
God's Pantry East "Walk for 

Hunger" will be October 17, at the 
Red, White, and Blue Parade in 
Martin. All donations are appreci­
ated. 

To show appreciation of support 
there will be free food after the walk 
and several gifts are to be awarded. 
For more information, contact Deb­
bie Amburgey at 886-8598. 

f:iift]~ 
~ 

A Watson's Wise Buy 
means quality and value 
at an everyday low price. 

Floyd students 
become advisers 
at Morehead 

Three Floyd County residents are 
among the 70 resident advisers (RA' s) 
for the 1992-93 school year at More­
head State University. 

Kelly Hairston,daughlerofSharon 
and Bill Caudill of Langley, is a jun­
ior education major. She \san RAin 
Mignon Hall. 

Brian Meadows, son of Evelyn 
Meadows of David, is a sophomore 
sociology major. He is active in the 
Student Correctional Association and 
a Phi Kappa Phi honoree. HeisanRA 
in Cartmell Hall. 

Thomas Poe, son of Thomas and 
Susie Poe of Prestonsburg, is a junior 
accounting major. A memberofTheta 
Chi fraternity, he is an RA in Alumni 
Tower. 

1993 TEMPOS 

AIR • TILT • OVERDRIVE 

Resident advisers work with stu­
dents to establish a community at­
mosphere in the residence halls, ac­
cording to Ruth Ann Harney, area 
coordinator for Thompson/Fields 
Halls and the RA Program. They help 
students adjust to campus and resi­
dence hall life by organizing various 
programs and activities. 

All rebates, including first-time buyer, assigned to dealer. 

Early Times 
$1 499 Ali IJJCS 

1 ·2 Gallon each J ., .J 

------- ] 
J & J Liquors 

Betsy Layne • 4 78-24 77 

Solid turtleneck tops for the entire family -

misses 7.88 plus-sizes 8.88 
6.88 mens 

6.88 girls 7-14 

toddlers, girls 4-6X, boys 4-7 

9.88 
5.88 
4.88 

Fashion fleece separates by Hush Puppies 
and Day Kids. 

Nylon trilobal a·ctlvewear sets for k1ds. Reebok Princess or Desire leather aerobiC 
shoes for women 

Playtex sport and f1tness bra m white or be1ge 

8.88 each 9.88 each 
girls & boys 2 to 6X girls 7-14 

Weddington Plaza-Pikeville 
Mon.-Sat. 10-9. 

Sun. 12:00-6:00. 

14.88 19.99 29.88 34.88 JOUr ChOICe infants toddlers boys 4-7 
& girls 4-14 

.... rtson·s 
family fashions at great prices! 

.. ===·· Use Watson ' s conventent layaway, plus 4 great ways to charge 

10.88 

Mayo Plaza-Paintsville 
Mon.-Sat. 10-9. 

Sun. 12:30-6:00 . 

LOW Price Guarantee - If you_find our adve~tised items at lower prices within 14'days, simply 
brmg m our competitor's ad and we'll match their price minus 1 0%! 
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• Trojans celebrate homecoming 
with 22-14 victory over KSD 

Last Friday was a special day for 
the Wheelwright Trojans football 
team. The Trojans celebrated home­
coming for the last time in the history 
of the school. Also last Friday, the 
Trojans and some Trojan faithful 
made the long walk down the rail­
road tracks that leads from the high 
~hool to Brackett Field. 

It was a successful evening for 
Wheelwright as the rains held off 
long enough to get the homecoming 
ceremonies in at half time, and the 

Castle MVP •.• 

walk down the tracks brought back a 
lot of memories. But the important 
thing in the midst of all the memories 
was a 22-14 Wheelwright win over 
the Kentucky School for the Deaf 
that snapped a three game losing 
streak for coach Donnie Daniels • baH 
club. 

"Defensively, we played good," 
said Daniels of his team· s effort. "We 
had a few mental breakdowns on 
defense. The wet field didn't help our 
running game any." 

The rains began to fall just when 
the team and some of the loyal 
Wheel wright followers left the school 
for The Last Trojan Walk. The rains 
continued to fall once the game started 
and the field became a slippery gridi­
ron. 

It didn't take the Trojans long to 
get on the scoreboard as they punched 
the ball across on their first posses­
sion. Arnold Adams took a hand off 
from quarterbackS teven Shelton and 
galloped 43-yards for the frrst score. 

Muntu Oden ran the two-point 
conversion and Wheelwright was on 
top 8-0. 

The celebration did not last long 
as the Colonels of KSD, made their 
presence known by taking the foot­
ball 56 yards for the score. The drive, 
which took three plays, culminated 
when freshman Pat Harris ran in from 
9-yards out for the touchdown. Har­
ris ran in the two-point conversion to 
tie the game at 8-8. 

The slippery field held back both 
offenses as they could find no trac­
tion for running the football. Daniels 
attributed the lack of quality shoe 
spikes for his team as a problem that, 
if the Trojans make the playoffs, will 
be rectified. 

"We dido 't have time to get the 

shoes we wanted for our team, or the 
money," said Daniels. "If we get into 
the playoffs, we'll correct that" 

Wheel wright's defense caused all 
kindsofproblemsforKSD'squarter­
back Terry Hensley. Hensley was 
sacked six times in the game for a loss 
of36 yards. 

With 2:43 left in the first quarter, 
Wheelwright reclaimed the lead at 
16-8 on a 37-yard pass play from 
Steven Shelton to Charles Johnson. 
Oden ran the conversion. 

KSD received the football with 
9:24 left in the second period; but the 
possession found them deep in their 
own territory on the 5-yard line after 
a Wheelwright punt took a Wheel­
wright bounce and was downed on 
the five. 

On the second play of the series, 
Anthony Jackson fumbled the foot­
ball on their own 1-yard line and 
Todd Daniels fell on the ball as the 
Trojans took over. The play turned 
out to be a big one for Wheelwright as 
Shelton, on a keeper, plunged across 
for the touchdown to make it a 22-8 
game. 

In the second period, KSD came 
knocking on the door as they moved 
the football to the Trojans 9-yard on 
a 33-yard completed pass from Hen­
sley to Shane Lord, bringing up a 
frrst and goal. The Trojans defense 
caughtHarrisbehindthelineofscrirn­
mage for a 4-yard loss pushing the 
Colonels back to the Wheelwright 
13. Harris carried on a second down 
play and reached the line of scrim­
mage before he was wrapped up. 
Hensley connected up with Idris 
Osborne on a short gainer of 8-yards 
to the Trojans five bringing up a 
fourth-and-goal. Hensley was sacked 

(See Wheelwright, B 6) 

.Red Skins surround Adams 
Middle School for 24-8 win 

The Cumberland Red Skins ele­
mentary football team went on the 
warpath this past Saturday and all but 
scalped the Adams Middle School 
B lackcats as they rolled to a 24-8 win 
in the fourth game of the Coleman 
Oil Football Oassic at Pikeville. It 
was the second annual bowl event 
that brought eight teams from differ­
ent parts of Kentucky to Pikeville. 

It was the running game of Tim 
Dixon that made the difference. All 
Dixon did was to rush for 261-yards 
on just eight carries. He scored four 
touchdowns in being named 
Cumberland • s Most V aluablePlayer. 

Adams quarterback Mike Castle 
was MVP for the Blackcats. 

The Classic proved to be a busy 
time for the ambulance crew that was 
stationed nearby. While two ambu­
lances were used, both were kept on 
the road hauling out athletes during 
the four games. Four injuries occured 
in the frrst three games and one in­
volved a Hazard cheerleader. Adams 
lost two players - Jon Morris and 
Jason Blackburn- to injuries. Mor­
ris was hit hard on a carry as he was 
driven out of bounds. The solid car­
pet area where the players are to 
stand proved to immovab1eas Morris 

MIKE CASTLE OF ADAMS receives his trophy after being named the jammed his elbow to the mat The 
Most Valuable Player for the Adams Middle School Blackcats In the 
Coleman 011 Classic at Pikeville Saturday evening. (photo by Ed Taylor) (See Adams, :S 4) 

WHEELWRIGHT FOOTBALL PLAYERS led The Last Trojan Walk Thursday afternoon as they marched from 
the high school to Brackett Field for the final homecoming game at Wheelwright High School. The Trojans 
pulled out a 22·14 win over KSD. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Eight score as Prestonsburg 
rolls past Magoffin County 

Chuck Rowe 
Sports Writer 

As the Prestonsburg Blackcats 
continued their quest for the district 
title, Coach Bill Letton's squad trav­
eled to Magoffin County last Friday 
to face the Hornets as the Hornets 
looked for their flrst win of the sea­
son. The Blackcats,looking for a trip 
to the playoffs, were playing their 
best football of the year heading in to 
Friday night's game with the Hor­
nets. 

Magoffin County received the 
opening kickoff and had the ball for 
only three plays before Aaron Tucker 
picked off a Jason Wages' pass and 
returned it to the Hornet 41-yard line. 
The Bl~ckcat offense picked up two 
frrst downs before a clipping call 
against the Blackcats put the ball 
back on the 41-yard line. On second 
down and 20 from the Hornet 41-
yard line, TuckerhitJason Crisp with 
a touchdown pass with 9:43leftin the 
frrst quarter. Marcus Araujo's kick 
was good to make the score 7-0. 

The Hornet offense got a frrstdowrl 
on a 16-yard pass from Wages to 
Jamie Hoskins that moved the ball to 
the Magoffin County 42-yard line. 
The Blackcat defense tightened up, 
holding the Hornets to five yards on 
three plays, bringing up a punting 
situation. 

With the ball on their own 26-yard 
line, the Blackcats needed only two 
plays to score as Dewayne Garza 
. carried the ball 21 yards to the Black­
cat 46-yard line. On the next play, 
Seth Hyden carried the ball across 
the end zone from 54 yards out with 
6:56left in the frrst quarter. Araujo • s 
kick was good and the score was 14-
0. 

The ball changed hands three times 
as a Hornet pass was intercepted, 
Prestonsburg fumbled,and Magoffm 
County quick kicked and the Black­
cats took over on own 47-yard line. 

to make the score at the end of the 
frrst quarter 21-0. 

The Blackcats held the Hornets to 
a punting situation early in the sec­
ond quarter and took over the ball on 
the Hornet 49-yard line. After pick­
ing up a first down and then having a 
fourth and four, Tucker kept the ball 
and ran 30 yards for a touchdown, but 
a clipping call against the Blackcats 
brought it back and Prestonsburg had 
to punt. 

The Hornets took over the ball on 
their own 25-yard line and six plays 

later the Hornets had to punt on a 
fourth down and 20. The punt trav­
eled to the Blackcat 46-yard line and 
Gana returned it 28 yards to the 24-
yard line. A personal foul call against 
the Hornets moved it to the 11-yard 
line. Garza ran the ball twice and the 
second time drove into the end wne 
from six yards out with 6:04 remain­
ing in the second quarter. Araujo's 
kick wa.<> good and the score was 28-
0. 

(See Prestonsburg, B 7) 

On the first play from scrimmage, A DEFENSIVE GEM Is Prestonsburg's Todd Clark as he continues to lead 
Tucker found May for a 47-yard the Blackcatsdefense. Clark had elghtflrst hits and threeasslsta against 
touchdown pass with 1:10 left in the Magoffln County Friday night. (photo by Ed Taylor) 
frrst quarter. Araujo • s kick was good 

ALookAtSports---------~Ed~~~~~~----~-------
BOARD OF CONTROL TO MEET 
AT JENNY WILEY LODGE 

The Kentucky High 
School Board of Con­
trol will hold its annual 
fall meeting at ~.enny 
Wiley State Park this 
Friday and Saturday, 
October 16-17. The 
Board of Control and 
the staff of the KHSAA 

will be present. Reports and appeals are 
among the items to be discussed. 

Time of the meeting Friday is scheduled 
for noon and the public is encouraged to be 
in attendance. 
EXPANSION DRAFT ..• 

Next month • s expansion draft may bring 
some surprises as to which players from 
different teams may go unprotected. Own­
ers from the Major League clubs are be-

coming fed up with the inability of high 
salaried players not being able to perform 
as expected. 

But the players are not the ones to take 
the blame. It's the owners! And now some 
will try to unload the millionaires (hope­
fully) on the two expansion clubs. 

Cincinnati will have to make a hard 
decision on which players will be protected 
and which ones are e;w;pendable. With no 
manager or general manager, I suppose that 
Marge will try to deal with this one herself. 
She has vowed to cut her $35 million salary 
budget down to $24 million and to do that 
some players besides just Greg Swindell 
(free agent) will have to go. Bill Doran is a 
good prospect to be playing for one of the 
expansion teams next year. Remember, 
every club has to put players in the pool. 
After the frrst round, each club then can add 
to the protected list. 

GRIFFEY TO MANAGE REDS? 
We can throw another name into the ring 

as to speculation about who will be the next 
manager of the Cincinnati Reds. Ken Grif­
fey Sr. has announced that he is interested 
in taking over the helm of the National 
League ballclub. 

Griffey, a former Reds player, will be 
considered along with Tony Perez and Ron 
Oester. Who knows what Marge will do? 
Maybe she will become the first female 
manager. Lord, help us! 

GREAT VISIT WITH NATIONAL 
LEAGUE UMPIRE JERRY LAYNE 

When Johnny HallofHallFuneralHome 
called and informed me that Jerry Layne 
would be in town this past Friday, I was all 
excited about being able to sit down and 
talk to a big league umpire. Layne, for­
merly of Floyd County, had just completed 

his fourth year as a National League um­
pire. 

I reached Jerry by phone and we agreed 
to meet at Jerry • s Restaurant Friday morn­
ing because he had to leave at noon to go to 
Ashland. 

From the time that I talked to Layne on 
the phone until the time we were to meet, 
thousands of questions went through my 
mind as to what I wanted to ask him. 

I mean, we can get a view of the sport of 
baseball from a player's perspectiveorlook 
at it from a manager's angle. But how often 
do we consider how the men in blue look at 
the game. So questions were running 
through my mind about what to ask. 

Now, I have been in situations like this 
before. Lots of questions to ask but when it 
comes time for the actual interview, you 
forget everything that you wanted to ask. 
But this time would be different, I con-

eluded. As I thought of the questions I 
wanted to ask Mr. Layne, I would wrjte 
them down. And I did. Do you know what? 
I lost the list! 

But the interview went very well and I 
did manage to jot down some things- for 
the second time - that I wanted to ask. 

Jerry Layne was great. He was very 
considerate and very informative. We talked 
for about an hour and fony-five minutes 
and I enjoyed every minute of it. 

Some people, during interviews, will 
not talk unless you have a bunch of ques­
tions to ask. Not Layne. Just get him talking 
about the spon and profession that he loves 
and you have a notebook full of notes. 

After shaking hands and depaning he 
gave me an official National League base· 
ball and I asked him if he would autograph 
it for me. He was pleased to do so. 

(See A Look At Sports, B 2) 
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Oh yes. After we parted, a 
thousand more questions came to 
my mind and I said what I have 
said many times before - why 
didn't! ask him about this? Well, 

.I decided, I would just wait until 
he umpires his first play ff game 
or World Series and then do an­
other interview. 
RECEIVED SOME NICE 
LETTERS." 

Sometimes you wonder if there 
is anyone out there who really ap­
preciates what we try to accom­
plish here in the sports depart­
ment of the Floyd County Times. 
1ben we get two letters in one 
week expressing to us their thanks 
for some stories that we covered 
in the paper. 

The most recent one was on 
the golf tournaments that have 
graced our pages over the past 
months. 

I enjoy golf. I really do. Being 
out there with the athletes is a joy. 
I have stated before and I will say 
it again: We have some very fme 
young people in Floyd, Pike, 
Martin and Magoffm counties­
some very talented players. I, for 
one, appreciate each and every 
one of them. I hope they go far in 
life. 
BASKETBALLS TO START 
BOUNCING.-

Thump, thump, thump! It will 
all officially get started tomorrow 
as the high school basketball 
season gets underway with all the 
schools calling practices for the 
upcoming seasons. Then it will 
be an everyday event as players 
will practice, sweat, threaten to 
quit and talk about what a hard 
coach they have. 

But, wlten the season gets 
underway, the pains of practice 
will all be forgotten with the ex­
citement of a new season. 
SEASON WINDING DOWN_ 

Football season is only three 
weeks (counting this week) away 
from being over (except for 
Prestonsburg and, possibly, 
Wheelwright). Where has the 
season gone? It seems to have 
passed so quickly. 

I have enjoyed this football 
season very much. The more I 
cover the game, the more I love it. 
But basketball is my spon s lust 
love and I am looking forward to 
il 

Coach Bill Letton and his squad 
will play their biggest game of the 
year this Friday night when they 
face the Sheldon Oark Cardinals 
in what many are saying is the 
district title game. The winner of 
this game is certainly in the driver's 
seat for a district title. Of course, 
Prestonsburg :s the defending title 
holder and the Cardinals would 
like nothing more than to go horne 
with a win. 

The difference in competition 
may be the difference in the out­
come of this one. Prestonsburg 
certainly has played one of the 
toughest schedules of any team in 
the area. While Sheldon Clark has 
not played the quality of teams 
that the Blackcats have faced, the 
Cardinals still are a dangerous 
ballclub. This will be one of the 
best of the year! 

Wheelwright still has a shot at 
a playoff berth. The Trojans will 
have to win their next two district 
games in order to secure a playoff 
spot Allen Central at home Fri­
day night and a big road game at 
Elkhorn City to close out the sea­
son, stands as obstacles to 
Wheelwright's first playoff berth 
in several years. 

Coach Donnie Daniels and his 
staff certainly would love to finish 
the football program at Wheel­
wright with a playoff berth. Here's 
hoping that they get iL 

Until next time, good sports 
everyone and be good sports! 

< 

Sports Quiz 
by Larry Duncan 

SUPER OWLS 
1. Name the flfst ever player to 

score a touchdown in Super Bowl 
history. 

2. Name the only New York Jet to 
score a touchdown in Super Bowl 
play. 

3. Nm , the first ever k"c· c tr 
connect on a field goal in Super Bowl 
play. 

4. Name the lowest scoring Super 
Bowl game to date. 

5. Name the only team to fail 
scoring a to tr.hdrwm i11 a ()up"r Row! 
game. 

6. Name the flrst t;ver dc1ens1ve 
player to be named MVP in a Super 
Bow1 game. . 

7. Name the only Super Bowl game 
when two players were both named 
MVP. 

8.Narnt th 'Oilly wO 
who have los tour ~ 1pcr 
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Smallwood to head up Left 
Beaver Youth Service Center 

ATTENTION The Left Beaver area has a new 
service center and it is headed up by 
Keith Smallwood who opened the 
center back in June of this year. The 
center, known as the Upper Left 
Beaver Youth Service Center, is 
funded by the State of Kentucky but 
comes under the direction of the local 
county board of education. 

"Our primary purpose here is to 
provide for the young people and to 
make referrals for needy students," 
said director Smallwood. "I'm more 
like a local agent and coordinate 
between the student and agencies like 
the health department, social serv~ 
ices, local churches and Lions Club." 

Under the options component, the 
local center choose to go with recrea-
tion for the students. . 

"We didn't have to," explained 
Smallwood. "But we have no social 
activities here in the area except for 
the ball games." 

Smallwood, with the help of 20 
volunteers and a lot of city people, 
refurbished the old Wheelwright 
swimming pool building and inserted 
games for students to enjoy. 

Last week, following the home­
coming parade in Wheelwright, 
Smallwood opened the doors to the 
center for the first time and over 200 
students enjoyed the facilities and a 
time of refreshments. 

"We want the parents of these 
students to come by and check us 
out," said Smallwood, "and see what 
we have to offer. We cleaned the 
building and did some painting. We 
redid the floors and plumbing. We 
went out and purchased$3 ,000 worth 
of recreation equipment from ping­
pong tables to various equipment for 
the outside." 

The center also received a small 
grant that was used to buy video 
equipment. The proceeds from the 
video games is used to pay the center's 
utilities. 

"Parents seem to like what we are 
doing," said Smallwood. "It's a place 
that the kids can go to and be safe. 
While it is not a restricted place, we 
do have some basic rules that they 
need to observe. We're not trying to 
burden them down with a lot of rules." 

Smallwood expressed his appre­
c ia · ~ o eve, i who helped with 
the center and all those who donated 
the refreshments for the opening day 
event 

The center will be open four hours 
a day on Tuesday, Wednesday and 
Thursdays from 6:30p.m. until10:30 
p.m. 

"We don't open on Mondays 
bl!cause that is usually when the jun­
ior varsity football team plays. And 
we close it on Fridays because the 
varsity plays then," explained the 
center's director. 

Smallwood said that the center 
would be open on Saturdays but it 
will be all volunteer time. 

"We'll average around 40 kids a 

Don't limit your jig 'n' pig fishing to 
pitching and flipping. If you do, you'll be 
missing plenty of chances to throw a 
very effective lure. 

Many anglers sometimes forget that 
a jig 'n' pig also will produce in more 
open water - along rocky shorelines 
for example - when fished like a plastic 
worm. Cast, let it fall, then use a slow 
bottom-bumping retrieve. 

Using this approach also makes it 
possible to go to lighter line ( 15 or 1 7 
pounds instead of the 25 or 30 you use 
in heavy cover) and a lighter jig. It's a 
look some largernouths have never seen. 

When used in this manner, a jig 'n' 
pig resembles a crawdad And bass love 
crawdad.s. For extra appeal, use a 
crawdad cover scent It's a combination 
that can't lx heat for big ba.,~. 

LendeU Martin has qunlified far the 
BASS Masters Classic and several 
other pro circuit championship events. 

DON'T 
BE 

A 
SINKER 

WEAR YOUR LIFE JACKET 
~c. ;[) 

day," stated Smallwood. 
The center, while providing a place 

of entertainment, also has some fu­
ture plans. 

Keith Smallwood 

"We will be holding child care 
classes later," said Smallwood. "We 
will have a D.A.R.E. program later 
next month and in January we will 
have a child birth class." 

Other programs will include a 
physican care program for children 
who can't afford medical help. 

"The center is open to all ages," 
said Smallwood, who also plans to 
offer personal tutoring services. "We 
can't afford to hire anyone else so I 
will do some tutoring for those that 
need it 

''I'm a jack of all trades," he stated 
laughingly. Smallwood commented 
that the services, while located in 
Wheelwright, are available to every­
one in the community. 

"It's a place they can feel safe 
whentheycomehere,"hesaid "What 
is done and said here will be confi­
dential. We want them to know that 
they're not being looked at." 

Smallwood related how the center 
wants to give back to the community 
what the community has put into iL 

"We want to later offer GED 
classes and we have a lot of other 
things coming," said the new center 
director. 

Smallwood graduated from 
Wheelwright High School in 1981 
and then later attended the University 
of Kentucky. Smallwood moved to 
the community where he coached 
baseball and worked with the foot­
ball program and became a substitute 
teacher in the Floyd County school 
system. 

"I have been involved in commu­
nity services all_my life," said Small­
wood. "I am familiar with the com-

It' 

Whirlpool Washer 
Model LA8860XW 
• Whi&on-White Styling 
• 6 Automatic Cycles 

munity and I feel I know the needs of 
the community. I have worked on a 
one-on-one basis with the students 
here in the high school and they look 
on me as a friend rather than a source 
in the structure." 

A three-on-three basketball league 
for boys and girls, as well as families, 
is planned in the near future for the 
center. 

"You know, I love Floyd County," 
Smallwood said from a sincere bean. 
"I live here and I want to see, not only 
our community to come together, but 
the two schools (McDowell and 
Wheelwright) when they consolidate. 
The two schools need to dove tail 
together." 

Keith Smallwood is a big man 
with a big hean ; it is big enough for 
not only Wheelwright but the com­
munity and all of Floyd County. 

Early Times 
$1499 All lms 

1·2 Gallon each P••d 

J & J Liquors 
netsy Layne • 478-2477 

NEW KEY 
WILL BE NEEDED 

EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 26, 
1992, in an effort to eliminate un­
authorized vehicle access into the 
Dewey Lake Wildlife Management 
Area, all locks on gates located in 
or near this area will be changed. 
All keys currently in use will no 
longer provide access into this area. 
Anyone requiring official access -
public utilities,land management 
agencies, property owners (prop­
erty owner must show proof)-must 
obtain a key prior to October 26 
from the Resource Manager, Corps 
of Engineers, Dewey Lake. Please 
con tact the office at ( 606) 886-6709. 

Dairy Queen of Prestonsburg 

SPORTS FAN OF THE WEEK 

If you are the sports fan circled here ... it's your lucky day! 

Bring this photo to the Floyd County Times office at 27 South 
Central Avenue (down the street from the courthouse) to claim 
your Gift Certificate, which will entitle you to a free 8-inch ice 
cream cake of your choice, redeemable at Dairy Queen of 
Prestonsburg. 

' Savin 

Whirlpool Dryer 
Model LE8860XW Electric 
Model LG8861 XW Gas 
• While-on-White Styling 

• 3 Wash/Rinse Water Temperature • Large Capacity for family-Size Wash Loads 
Combinations 

• 3 Water Level Selections 
• Single Wash & Spin Speed 
• Magic Clean• Self-Cleaning Unt R~er 
• Double-Duty Surgila~ Agitator 
• A~matic Bleach Dispenser 

On-The-Spot Financing 
All payments based on credit approval 

MIKE'S 
B&W TV & APPLIANC 

886-9682 
North Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Mon. - Sat. 9:00 to 5:00 

• Flexibilitf 
- 5 Drying Cycles 
- 3 Temperature Selections 
- Air Drying 

• Convenience 
• Mini-Hamper Door Design 
-Extra-Large Top-Mounted Unt Screen 

: I 



30 Cars to Choose from at 
Close-out, Clearance Prices on 

a full line of General Motors Cars. 
• Every vehicle has been reduced in price 
• Each car comes with a factory warranty 
• Trade-ins accepted 
• GMAC or bank financing 
• Credit approval within 

the hour 

Chevy Lumina-one of 
1992s hottest selling cars. 
Two to choose from. 

Save $5,000 off sticker price on this terrific, 
quasar blue convertible. 

This Sedan De Ville is priced at $10,000 
under sticker price. 

Three 1992 Oldsmobile 
Cutlass Cierras to 
choose from. 

Plus Buick Regal • Pontiac Grand 
· Prix • Pontiac Grand Am 

• Olds Cutlass • Olds Delta 
• Pontiac Sunbird • Buick 
Century • Buick Skylark 

The price you see is the 
price you pay! 

MUSIC-CARTER-HUGHES SALES PROFESSIONALS: 
• Estill Carter 
• Palmer Vance 
·Bob Lawson 

• Paul Hughes 
• Ralph Roop 
• Larry Huff 

• Chris Carter, New Car Sales Mgr. 
• VIrgil Slone, Used Car Sales Mgr. 
• Roy Duncan ·Gary Meade 

South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg o Phone: 886·9181 o 800·844·9181 
New Sale. Hours: Mon.-Wed., 8-7; Thurs 8-8; Fri., 8-7; Sat, 8-5; Service: M F, 8-5; Thurs., 8-8 

Parts: M-F, 7:30-5:30; Sat. 9-1 



ADAMS QUARTERBACK Mike Castle hands off to running back Jon Morris In the Coleman Oil Classic Saturday 
afternoon. The Blackcats fell to Cumberland 28-8. Castle was named Most Valuable Player for the Adams 
squad. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Adams Middle School girl's basketball 
team awarded over $2500 for uniforms 

Coaches Charles Collins and Gay 
Hatfield got some good news last 
week after receiving a check for over 
$2,500 from the Women's Sports 
Foundation and L'eggs. The girl's 
basketball team will now have new 
uniforms as a result of entering a 
"team dream" 150-word essay that 
told what a girl's sports team would 
do if they won a $5,000 prize. 

"It's like manna from heaven," 
said school principal Janice Allen. 

Eight teams nationwide won the 
$5,000 prize. All 395 schools that 
entered, including Adams Middle 
School, shared equally in $1 million 
raised through sales of L'eggs ho­
siezy. 

According to Coach Hatfield, the 
money will be put to good use in 
purchasing uniforms for this year's 
team. 

"We have over 50 girls out for the 
team this year," Hatfield stated. "We 
will need new uniforms for the girls 
as we try to break. them down to A, B, 
and c teams." 

Adams Middle School is the de-

fending Floyd County girl's champi­
ons and will return a strong squad 
again this year. 

Studies show that girls who par­
ticipate in grade and high school 
sports are more likely to perform 
better academically and have a good 
self image. They are more likely to 
exercise throughout their lives, re­
ducing their risks of breast cancer, 
heart disease and other health prob­
lems. Yet girl's sports programs re­
ceive only $1.50 for every $10 given 
to athletic programs overall, even 
though almost four out of every 10 
high school athletes are girls. 

In response to this need, L 'eggs 
and the Women's Sports Foundation 
developed the L'eggs Team Dream 
program. High schools all over the 
country were invited to submit their 
girl's sports teams' dreams. 

A panel of celebrity athletes judged 
the essays. The panel included figure 
skater Debi Thomas, cycling cham­
pion Connie Paraskevin-Young and 
track Olympian Benita Fitzgerald plus 
high school girl's sport experts. They 

selected two high schools from each 
of four regions to receive the $5,000 
bonus. 

The winners of the $5,000 awards 
are the Fayette (Alabama) Academy 
volleyball team; the Fayetteville 
(Arkansas) High School basketball 
team; the basketball and volleyball 
teams ofFrcmontHigh School, Ro~ 
burg, Oregon; Joy Ranch Christian 
School's track and field team, 
Hillsville, Virginia; all teams at Lake 
View High School in Chicago, Dli­
nois; Mercy High School volleyball 
team, Bulingame, California; the 
basketball and uack teams of Ro­
gersville (Tennessee) Middle School; 
and the Shelby (Michigan) High 
School softball team. 

The Women's Sports Foundation 
is a nonprofit educational organiza­
tion that promotes and enhances the 
sports experience for all girls and 
women in sports. The Foundation's 
programs include education, advo­
cacy and recognition in addition to 
grant programs like the L 'eggs Team 
Dream. 

The· importance 
of education. 

assessment is riot 
w-here w-e are, 

but w-here w-e're 
• go1ng. 

The new learning goals for Kentucky schools are much higher 

and far different from the goals students had before the Kentucky 

Education Reform Act of 1990. Now, with KERA. students are 

involved in a process of continuous learning. Teachers are helping 

students apply in real~life situations what they learn in the classroom. 

And that's what the new assessment program measures - how w ell 

students can use what they know. Today 's scores show where our stu~ 

dents are starting. W e've got a long w ay to go, but the new system will 

move u s forward. So, although scores seem to be lower, w e've really 

just raised ou r expectations. Look for scores to improve next year and 

in the years ahead . For assessment information call1 ~8oo~KDE~KERA. 

a ...... 
Support beHer· school• . 

for Kentucky's kicls. 

A MESSAGE F R O M T H E PARTNER S HI P F OR K E NTU C K Y SC HOOL R EF ORM 

Adams------- <Continued from a 1) 

injury was not as serious as rrrst 
thought 

Dixon had a 58-yard touchdown 
run in the first period and had runs of 
31, 72 and 57 yards for his other three 
TDs. 

nine-yards and another first down. A 
6-yard pickup by Luster and 
Lafferty's 14-yard run put the ball on 
the half-yard line where Luster car­
ried it into the end zone for the touch­
down. Luster also ran the conversion 
play with 1:42 left in the game. 

Market 
305 N. Mayo Trail 

Old US 23 • Pikeville 

432·5959 
t~E'N MONARCH 49e pack 

Best Value Kings $4.99 ctn. 
VICEROY KINGS, $7.71 After Coupon 

GPC KINGS $5.37 After Coupon 
Pyramids $6.9i 

Raleigh Extra Klngt 

Adams had a nice drive going on 
the opening kickoff only to see it stall 
out Josh Luster and Morris were the 
main ball carriers until Morris' d~ 
parture. Matt Lafferty carne on to be 
impressive out of the backfield. Lus­
ter gained 52-yards on 17 carries for 
Adams with Morris racking up 58-
:yards on 10 carries. Lafferty carried 
I five times for 21-yards rushing. 

At the conclusion of the game 
each team was presented with a tro­
phy and a Most Valuable Player from 
each team was named. 

~-----~$_7._~_A_fl~_c~o~~~----------~,,~ 
BEECHNUT, Buy 2, Gat 1 FREE! 

Both teams played to a scoreless 
tie in the rrrst period but on a third­
and-one play at the start of the second 
quarter, Dixon broke two tackles and 
ran 58 yards for the touchdown to 
give Cumberland a 6-0 lead. 

Again, Adams looked impressive 
on defense as they moved the foot­
ball from their own 25 to 
Cumberland's 3(), 

However, following a 5-yard ill~ 
gal procedure penalty, Castle had a 

pass intercepted by Dixon giving the 
football back to the Red Skins. Six 
plays later, Dixon scored from 31 
yards out to make it a 12-0 game at 
halftime. 

Adams kicked the football off to 
Cumberland to begin the second half 
of play. It didn't take the Red Skins 
long to get their war hoops going on 
a second-and-six, Dixon took a hand­
off and outraced everyone 72-yards 
for a touchdown and an 18-0 score. 

Adams ran three plays before being 
forced to punt But the Red Skins had 
the football for only one play as 
McGuire carne up with an intercep­
tion for Adams. 

The Red Skins attacked again with 
5:42 left in the fourth period when 
Steve Golden went through four 
.would-be tacklers and galloped 43-
-yards for the touchdown to put 
:Cumberland up 24-0. 

Adams avoided the shutout on a 
good drive of their own as Luster and 
Lafferty tried to make up for the 
absence of Morris. Luster picked up 
3-yardsforanAdams' firstdown.He 
then had two carries for three and 

Adams had only 137-yards total 
offense, all coming on the ground. 
Cumberland rushed for 347 yards 
with Dixon leading in that category. 
Castle had two passes intercepted 
and Cumberland was intercepted 
once. Cumberland lost the ball on 
one fumble while Adams did not have 
a fumble in the game. 

Adams was penalized 15 yards on 
three flags and Cumberland received 
two penalties for 30 yards. 

King B or Shoe Peg 75¢ Twist 

LEVIGARRETI 
99~ Pk., $11.88 Carton 

Trophy-But 1, Get 1 FREE! 

Photograph Copies ............... $2.95 
We can now laminate your photos. 
Promotional Cost Pd. bt Manufac1Urer 

SURGEONGENEIW. WARNING:Cigarene Smoke 
Contains Clllbon Monoxila. 

Ask fo r your free Ky. lottery Pull· Tab 
with each $10.00 purchase of Ashland 
gas. 

Mountain 
Christian Academy 

is sponsoring a 

at 

Martin Youth Center 
Saturday, October 17th 

during 

Red, White & Blue Days 
Begins at 7:00a.m. 

Handyman Specials 
Prices include delivery and set-up, but do not include 

tax and title fees. 

BU 6989 12x65 2 Bedrooms 1975 $3,995.00 

Ask For 
Mike, Ken or 

Wheel'n Deal'n Dave 

478-9246 
Only at 

606-4 78-9246 J 

• 
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WAL-MART'S 
Everyday 

Low Prices and 
Lots of Special 

Sale Pri.ces 
Sale ends on Tuesday, October 20. · 

~~~-~~~~~~~~A~~~--~~ 
BUG O~F WINDSHIELD WASHER $1 OO KEROSENE STORAGE CONTAINER $ 00 

5-gal. size ............................... Everyday Low Price 5. 
~-~~~-~:-~::.~~~.:.~~~ ............ Everyday Low Price 88¢ 
E·Z FLOW FURNACE ALTER$--4-pack size 

Everyday low Price 
Small Size .... Pk. S2.00 l=~::e 120x30x1 ....... Pk. s4.00 
STORM WINDOW KIT-Fits four windows $1 48 
Size 36x72 in ............. _ .. _ ........ Everyday Low Price • 
FOAM PIPE COVER by Manco-3-Pack 
Fits 1~-in. x 1/4-in. Everyday Low Price $3.24-Sale $3.00 

3/4-in. x 112~n. Everyday low Price $3.46-t-Sale $3.00 
THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL WATER PROOANG sa 38 
FORMULA, 1-gal. size ........... Everyday Low Price • 

9-INCH CAULKING GUN $1 96 
Model #27811 ......................... Everyday Low Price • 

~~~r;O~~ .. ~-~~.::~~-~-~~-~=~veryday Low Price $1.00 
CANNON WASH CLOTH8-Size 12x12 in. $

3 96 12-pack, Assorted Colors ....... Everyday Low Price • 

CANNON BASIC BATH TOWELS $
1 78 Assorted Colors ...................... Everyday Low Price • 

Matching Hand Towels ............ Everyday Low Price $1.46 
Matching Wash Cloths ................ Everyday Low Price 96¢ 

HOME DESIGN BED BLANKET-Fits twin and full size beds 
72x90 in assortment of solid $

4 96 and print colors ....................... Everyday Low Price • 

STANDARD SIZE, TWIN PACK BED PILLOWS $5 00 
Size 18x24 .............................. Everyday Low Price • 

3·PK. 175-CT. BOX KLEENEX 
Item # 25253 2fS5 00 
(Also 3-Pk., 95-Cl) ................ Reg. $2.96--Sale • 

WONDER SOFT PAPER TOWELS 4/$1 00 
Reg. 37¢-Sale • 

~~~~~~:e ~:.~~:~ ....................... Everyday Low Price 96¢ 
42 USES-ULTRA TIDE 
Reg. and with bleach 6-lb., 2-oz. and $6 97 
with bleach 6-lb., 14-oz ........... Everyday Low Price • 

FLUORESCENT SHOP LIGHT-2·Tube, 40-Watts S7 97 
Model #FSL 240 LA ................ Everyday Low Price • 

2·PACK STANDARD UGHT BULBS 51$100 
60 and 100 Watts, by Wai-Mart ... Reg. 28¢--Sale 

~~~g~-~~~~:.~.~~~-~~iJeryday Low Price S3. 96 

1-gal. Size .. -······ Everyday Low Price $1.17-Sale • 

~:~~~~~-~~ ••.••••.•••• Everyday Low Pr1ce S3.86 
OMEGA AUTOMOTIVE BATIERIES $37 84 For Cars and Trucks ........... Everyday Low Prtce • 

VALVOUNE ALL CUMATE MOTOR OIL 

~:rt~~=-~~~~-~=-~~~~~ia~0~: Price 94¢ 
Umit 4 cases per customer 

~:Vr!~a~!R~~~ -~~~~day Low P11ce s1 0.46 
RV ANTI-FREEZE "~5 00 · Gal-size ••..•••• Everyday Low Price $2.96-Sale ~ ~ • 

Candy, Costumes, etc. 

WE HAVE IT FOR YOU 
AT VERY LOW PRICES, 

ALWAYS! 

SUPER NINTENDO ENTERT AJNMENT SYSTEM$ 
16 Bit, Model #SNS SHA .... Everyday Low Price 89.96 

DAEWOO 2·HEAD VCR-Model #DUR-5088N 
Wilh 5 separate features .......... Everyday Low Price $169.81 

While quantities lasl ............................... Sale $150.00 

~LAROIDVIDEOTAPES-3-Pack, T-160 $ 
HIQh Grade, 8-Hour Tapes .......... Reg. $9.00-Sale 7.00 

SANYO PORTABLE CD·STEREO RADIO 
CASSETTE RECORDER-Model #MCD-Z2(k) sag 00 Everyday Low Price $99.00-Sale • 

POP WEAVER'S POPCORN-18-Pack $ 
Butter Flavor or Lite ................ Everyday Low Price 3.97 

FOLGERS CUSTOM-ROAST COFFEE 
2.5-lb. can, Item #50887 .......... Reg. $3.83-Sale 2JS700 

10.Pack CANDY BARS (M & Ms, Mars Brands) $
2 00 Everyday Low Price $2.50-Sale • 

FUDGE BROWNIE MIX by Pillsbury 
15-oz. box .... Everyday Low Price $1.00-Sale 2fS1.50 

PLANTERS DRY ROASTED PEANUTS 
Wai-Mart label by Planters in a special . i\ Jt

3
. OO 

glass container, 18-oz. size ...... Reg. $1.97-Sale·" .... · 

.a_~AP·•It!Aa 
AMERICAN EDmON MEN'S FLANNEL SHIRTS 
M, L, XL ........................................... Reg. $6.88--Sale SS.QO 
XXL, XXXL ............ - ...... - .. : ... - ........ Reg. $7.46-Sale SS.QO 

BOBBIE BROOKS LADIES' TURTLE NECKS 
S, M, L, XL ...................................... Reg. $7.76-Sale SS.97 

ATLANTA BRAVES WESTERN DIVISION CHAMPS 
T-Shirts .................... - ........................ Reg. $9.83--Sale sa.OO 
Baseball Shirt ................................ Reg. $19.83--Sale *17 .00 
Sweat Shirt ................................... Reg. $17.83--Sale •15.00 

BUZZARD·PRUF MEN'S COVERALLS 
S, M, L, XL ................................. Everyday Low Price '40.96 
XL, Tall ............ _ ........................ Everyday Low Price S43.96 

COLGATE INSTANT SHAVE CREAM 
13.2-0z. Size-Twin Pack with $1 SS 
30 cent coupon ....................... Everyday Low Price • 

VOS SHAMPOO AND CONDITIONER 
Economy Size $

1 34 24-0z ................. Everyday Low Price $1.48-sale • 

FINESSE SHAMPOO AND CONDITIONER 
Professional Size $2 SO 
22-0z ................. Everyday Low Price $3.38-Sale 1 

FLEX SHAMPOO AND CONDITIONER 
20% More Free $1 SO 
18.Qz. Size ............................. Everyday Low Price 1 

JERGENS LIQUID SOAP, 7.5-0z. or 
JERGENS ADVANCED THERAPY LOTION 76¢ 
2.5-0z. Tube .............. Everyday Low Price 87¢-Sale 

® 

ALWAYS THE LOW PRICE 
ON THE BRANDS YOU TRUSf 

STORE HOURS: 
Mon.-Sat. 7:00 a.m.-11 :00 p.m.; 

Sun. 11:00 a.m.-7:00p.m. 

. 

~ W, ~ • SMNow with easier, new access to 
Prestonsburg Village. 

\ 
\ 
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LONE TROJAN IS Wheelwright's Arnold Adams as he trots up field for a touchdown that gave Wheelwright a 
6-0 lead over KSD Thursday evening. Wheelwright won their fourth game of the season with a 22-14 win over 
the ""olonels. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Include pike in your fall fishing plans 
Frozen-fingers pike is what I call 

them. That's when it's too wann to 
wear gloves and cold enough that 
after handling minnows all day, and 
sticking your hands in the water a few 
times, you end up with cold hands 
and frozen fingers. 

That's when tubilees and other 
bait start moving shallow. The time is 
late October. The air is crisp. The big 
pike are biting. What a great time of 
year. 

In the fall you will find big north­
em pike up on big weedy flats, flats 
covered with cabbage, coontail and 
milfoil. These big pike are in the 
vegetation loading up on the easy 
pickings. Fall almost always means 
working vegetation unless you're in 
Canada, then you 'II want to put some 
time in on the rocky points or the 
mouths of the big rivers. 

I like to use a big heavy jig (3/4 oz 
Fire-Eye) for these big, heavy pike. 
You hook on a big sucker minnow, 
lob it out and work it over and around 
the tops of the weeds. 

If the pike are aggressive forget 
the jig and minnow and work them 

with a big flashy spoon. There's only a couple of times 
A magnum Rapala is also a hot during the year when anglers can 

lure for late fall pike fishing. Use a talceadvantageofthebig,andimean 
jerking method. Jerk the rod tip to big pike. That's early in the spring 
pull the lure underwater, then as you and late in the fall. Fall has one good 
reel in the slack, let the lure slowly thing going for it. a lot of anglers 
drift up. When you get the slack tight- have hung up their fishing gear and 
ened, jerk the lure again. Big pike are hunting. In many cases you can 
will slam the lure as it's rising to the have prime fishing territory all to 
surface, so don't be surprised when yourself in the fall. It could possibly 
you jerk and something jerks back. get lonely, except you can expect 

Sometimes in the fall a cold front guests ... big toothy ones. 
will move through and drive the fash America Outdoors Feature Serv-
deep. You can vertical jig with a ice 
sucker minnow. Fish it right along Sports Quiz Answers the edge of the weedline. Backtroll, 
drift, or use your electric motor. 

Another good cold front technique 
is to take a 2/0 hook with a big sucker 
and a steel leader and skim it over the 
top of the weeds. Use a jerking mo­
tion for the retrieve. Occasionally let 
it drop and give it a little jerk. This 
motion really drives trophy pike 
crazy. When you hook the sucker just 
go in the mouth and out the nostril. 
When nothing else is working this 
technique is dynamite. You work it 
likeajerkbaitandthey justwhack'em. 

1. Max McGee of the Green Bay 
Packers in Super Bowl I; 2. Matt 
Snell in Super Bowl Ill; 3. Don 
Chandler of Green Bay in Super Bowl 
1;4.Miami 14, Washington7inSuper 
Bowl VI; 5. Miami lost to Dallas 24-
3 in Super Bowl VI; 6. Chuck Lon­
gley of Dallas in Super Bowl V; 7. 
Super Bowl XII Randy White and 
Harvey Martin of Dallas; 8. Bud Grant 
of Minnesota (0-4) and Don Shula of 
Miami (2-3) and Baltimore (0-1) 

******* 
Red, White 

& 
Blue Day 

CAR 
SHOW 

Oct. 17, 1992 
sponsored by: 

First Guaranty 
Nat'l Bank 
Martin KY 

Wheelwright 
(Continued from B 1) 

behind the line of scrimmage for a 
loss of yardage and KSD turned the 
ball over to the Trojans on downs. 

Wheelwright's defense kept the 
Colonels at bay until 1 :08 left in the 
third period. Jackson took a hand off 
from Hensley and on sweep ran 70 
yards for the touchdown for the fmal 
22-14 score. 

"We got to play a lot of young 
players," said Daniels, "and that has 
to help later. We now will look at 
Allen Central and Elkhorn City (two 
district games). This we will give us 
some momentum going into the fmal 
three games. 

"Steven (Shelton) played well for 
us the last part of the game," con tin• 
ued the Wheelwright coach. "But we 
still don't have the intensity we had 
the frrst of the year. But we got the 
win and it has got us back in the right 
direction." 

Adams rushed 18 times for the 
Trojans for 107 yards and one touch­
down. Oden, who could not get it in 
gear, fmished with 40 yards on ~6 
carries. Shelton was two of five m 
passing for 56 yards. They rushed for 
157yards. TheTrojanshad213yards 
offense. 

Harris finished with only 4 7 yards 
rushing on 13 carries before leaving 
the game and being taken to the 
McDowell hospital with an injury. 
He was later released from the hospi­
tal. Jackson, on the strength of his 70 
yard TO run, led the Colonels in 
rushing with 93-yards on 13 carries. 

Hensley was two of five in pass­
ing for 41 yards. KSD was penalized 
four times for 20 yards and they 
fumbled the football three times. KSD 
totaled 259 yards on offense with 218 
coming on the ground. 

KSO WHEELWRIGHT 

FllSTDOWNS 7 
RUSHES ATTEMPTS 35 
RUSH~G YRDS 218 
PASS~G COMP-ATT 2·5 
PASS~GYROS 41 
FUMBLES.LOST 3 
PENALTIES.YRDS 4-20 
SACKE[).YRDS LOST 6-36 

KSO ................................... B 0 6 0 - 14 
ww .................................. tss o o · 22 

W • Adams~ run (Oden 11.11) 

KSO • HaniB II 11.11 (HaniB run) 

6 
40 
157 
2-5 
56 
1 

~25 

~16 

W- JoMson 37 pass from Shelon (Oden run) 
W - Shelton 1 11.11 {11.11 faied) 
KSO - Jackson 70 run (11.11 laied) 

Your Smile Is My 
#1 Concern 
(606) 874-9134 

Very Affordable Dentures 
$150 PerUpper 

Beginning at or Lower 

Dr. R.D. Marshall; D.M.D. 
Located beside New Bridge 

Allen, Ky. 

1993 AEROSTARS 

AIR • V-6 • TILT • CRUISE • AUTO 

ABSOLUTE 
AUCTION 

Saturday, October 24, 1992 
10:00 a.ID. 

TERMS: 
20%downdayof 
sale. Balance within 
30 days upon receipt 
of deed. Announce­
ments day of sale 
take precedence 
over all printed ma­
terial or advertising. 

Two-story home, approximately 2,000 sq. ft., that sits on a lot approximately 
3/4 of an acre. This home Is constructed of wood and has an above-ground 
basement of cinder block. The house has a living room, dining room, kitchen, 
4 bedrooms, and 11/2 baths. There Is lots of closet space for storage. Relax 
on the front or side porches. Mature shade trees on property. 

"GET ACTION ... HOLD AN AUCTION" 

SALE CONDUCTED BY: 

• PINSON AUCTION & REALTY CO. 606/432-5983 
BOX 453 606/437-6019 
PIKEVILLE. KY. 41501 606/437-7346 

Gayle Pinson • Real Estate Broker 
Larry Blake Pinson - Auctioneer - Agent 

$ "Make Every Dollar Count-Call Pinson" $ 
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Prestonsburg---------- <continued from B 1) 

~n the Hornets' next play from 
scnmmage, Hyden picked off a 
Wages pass, intended for Bill Wire­
man, and returned it 41 yards for a 
touchdown with 5:18left in the first 
!half. Araujo's kick was no good to 
illlake the score 34-0. 

The next play from the Hornet 
offense would almost duplicate the 

li last as Robbie Risner was in the right 
place at the right time picking off a 
Wages pass and returning it to the 
Hornet 14-yard line. A personal foul 
call against the Blackcats moved them 
back to the 29-yard line but, two 
plays later, on second down and nine, 
Jody Cornette sprinted 28 yards for a 
touchdown with 3:16 in the first half. 
Araujo's kick was no good to make 
the score 40-0. 

On the kickoff return, Wireman 
returned the ball to the 34-yard line 
where he was hit and fumbled the ball 
right into the hands of Risner as he 
ran 34 yards for the touchdown with 
3:02 left in the first half. Araujo's 
kick was no good and the score at 
halftime was 46-0. 

The Hornets put their first points 
on the scoreboard early in the third 
quarter after recovering a Blackcat 
fumble on the Prestonsburg 38-yard 
line. Afterpickingup two frrstdowns, 
the Hornets were within scoring range 
as they moved the ball to the three 
yard line and had a first down and 
goal. 1 hey needed only one play as 
Brandon Jenkins took the ball into 

,, theendzonewith 7:381eftin the third 
quarter. Wages attempt for the two­
pointconversionwasunsuccessful to 
make the score 46-6. 

The Blackcat offense picked up 
two first downs before the Hornets' 
defense held them to a fourth and six 
on the 23-yard line. Araujo came on 
to try a 40 yard fieldgoal and the kick 
was no good but a roughing the kicker 
call was made as Arajo saw no more 
action the rest of the game. That 
brought up a first down and 10 on the 
Hornets' 14-yard line. Three plays 
later, on frrst and goal, Blake Leslie 
took the ball into the end zone on a 
three yard run for a touchdown with 
3:00 left in the third quarter. John 
Stout's kick was no good to leave the 
score at the end of the third quarter 
52-6. 

After picking up four frrst downs, 
the Hotnets put another score on the 
scoreboard as they went 62 yards on 
seven plays and fmished the drive off 
with a 24 yard touchdown run by 
Greg Dyer with 11:52 left in the fourth 

quarter. The pass for the two-point 
conversion was incomplete and the 
score was 52-12. 

Prestonsburg taking the ball on 
their own 33-yard line, drove into 
Hornet territory to the 33-yard line 
on five plays that set up a fourth down 
and three pass from Keith Marsillet 
to Jason Spurlock for a touchdown 
with 9:01 to end the Blackcats' scor­
ing. Leslie ran the ball for the two­
point conversion successfully to ex­
tend the lead to 60-12. 

The Hornets started their last scor­
ingdriveform their own 18-yard line 
and drove down to the Blackcat 5-
yard line that brought up a third down 
and four. The next play, Jenkins car­
ried the ball into the end zone with 
3:491eft in the game. Dyer's run for 
the two-point conversion was no good 
and the final score was 60-18. 

Seth Hyden was the leading rusher 

for the Blackcats carrying the ball 
four times for 78 yards. Dewayne 
Garza rushed six times for 66 yards. 
Garza tossing in one touchdown and 
Hyden tossing in a pair of touch­
downs along with an interception. 

The leading rusher of the game · 
was the Hornets' Brandon Jenkins 
carrying the ball 16 times for 111 
yards. Greg Dyer tossed in 34 yards 
on seven carries. 

1 2 3 4 
6 8 
6 12 

PHS 21 25 
MCHS 0 0 

First downs 
Rushes-yds. 
Passing yds. 
Comp.-att. 
Fumbles-lost 
PenatJes-yds. 

PHS 
13 

30-282 
121 
3-8 
3-2 

4-40 

MCHS 
13 

36-174 
174 

6-16 
1-1 
4-40 

PRESTONSBURG BACK DWAYNE GARZAstlffsarmsa Magoffln County 
defender In Friday night's 60-18 win over the Hornets. Garza scored a 
touchdown playing briefly against the Hornets. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Special of the Month 

PURCHASE $100.00 OF PARTS 
RECEIVE A SET OF MUD FLAPS 

FREE 
Contact: Ken, Gary, Joe 

YARD SALE 
OCTOBER 14TH, 15TH & 16TH, 1992 

Allen, Ky. 

606-87 4-2151 800-826-7 413 
These specials are available at these advertised prices during the month of October only! 

Prestonsburg • Phone 886-9005. Open: 7 a.m.-10 p.m., Mon. thru Sat., 9 a.m.-9 p.m., Sunday 
ERNIE GULLETI, Manager 

SEVEN GREAT SPECIALS 
THURSDAY, FRIDAY AND SATURDAY ONLY! 

CHICKEN 
LEG 

QUARTERS 

LB. 19¢ 

4 LB. 

RAINBOW 

GRAPE 
JELLY 

JAR 99¢ 
KOOL-AID 

KOOL 
BURST 

6PK. 99¢ 

ROCKY TOP 
OR 

LOTSA POP 

2LITRE 2/$1 
10 LB. 

·WHITE 
POTATOES 

99¢ 
KAHN'S 

BOLOGNA 

LB. $1 49 

SAV-MORE ' 

WHITE BREAD 

160Z. LOAF 29¢ 
The store you've been 
asking for ... and more! 
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SOUTH AMERICAN 
CONNECTION._. 

. Marcus Araujo, place-kicker for 
the Prestonsburg Blackcats, has had 

few problems splitting the uprights 
this season. The left-footed kicker 
from Salvadore, Brazil hit 18 con­
secutive PATs before missing two 

STILL ONE OF THE STATES LEADING kickers Is Marcus Araujo of 
Prestonsburg. The left-footed kicker has nailed 24 of 28 extra point 
attempts this season. Seth Hyden {32} holds as Araujo kicks another 
one. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

INJURIES DON'T SLOW UP Jason Crisp, Prestonsburg, as he lines up on 
the line of scrimmage against Magoffin County Friday night Crisp has 
had a broken finger and busted nose In recent games but keeps coming 
back for more. Crisp had a TO reception against the Hornets. (photo by 
Ed Taylor) 

P,~,Jt·~ t~,. aJ~t,. Week J.te~;8 tit~. v -tl Ul~ . · · "' -· 
· This week 

SAV-MORE 
recognizes the player of the week 

in Floyd County High School Football 

SETH HYDEN 
JR. Prestonsburg 

- Scored 2 touchdowns 
- Rushed for 78 yards 

vs. Magoffin County 

l 
-MOR 

North Lake Drive • 886-9005 

The Store You've Been Asking For and More 

The Floyd County Times 

Friday night in the Blackcats' 47-26 
victory over Shelby Valley. For the 
season. the foreign exchange student 
is 20 for 22 on PATs. He has at­
tempted just one field goal this sea­
son, missing wide from 42 yards last 
Friday. 

Laurel who went on to score again 
with 36 seconds JefL 

HIGHLAND PAVING 
Notables? South Laurel finished 

with 587 total yards on offense, after 
recording 561 the week before against 
Pulaski County. Will Warren was the 

Free Estimates 
Driveways, roads and parking lots. 

13 yrs. experienGe. 
Weeksbury, KY 

But what makes Marcus' success 
so unique is that he had never played 
football before this season. Growing 
up in Brazil, he played football. 
commonly known as soccer. 

South Laurel ace? The junior tail­
back rushed for 107 yards and one 
TD and had 133 yards receiving and 
oneiD. 

Phone: 452-2078 or .. ~52-2059 

The national record for consecu­
tive PATs is 134 set by Kim Braswell 
of Avondale Estates, Georgia. from 
1965-68. 

INSTANT POINTS ••• 
Sheldon Clark's Brad Tiller has 

become Mr. Excitement in the moun­
tains this year. Two weeks ago against 
Tug Valley (W. Va), the junior tail­
back carried the ball four times for 
14 7 yards and three touchdowns. He 
scored another touchdown on a pass 
reception, another on an 82-yard 
kickoff return and had yet another 
TD (an 89-yard kickoff return) called 
back for a penalty. Through Sheldon 
Clark's ftrst four games, Tiller was 
averaging% yards per game, 24 yards 
per carry. 

IDGH SCORING? YOU 
BETCHA! 

Both teams combined for933 total 
yards on offense. 

SUPER-SOPH .... 
Paul Laurence Dunbar's Mikal 

Smith continues to impress after back­
to-hack 200-yard games. Smith, a 5-
10, 170-pound sophomore rushed 20 
times for 209 yards and three touch­
downs. including a 58-yard TD run 
just before halftime, as Dunbar de­
feated Tates Creek 19-17. It was 
Dunbar's first win over the Commo­
dores in three tries. 

This performance comes on the 
heels of an outstanding night against 
Henry Clay two weeks ago. Smith 
recorded 231 yards on 33 carries in 
that Bulldog victory. 

Smith moved to ·Lexington from 
Arizona this summer when his fa­
ther, Lovie, accepted a position with 
Bill Curry's staff at the University of 
Kentucky. 

TOUGH GOING FOR TRIGG 
COUNTY •.• 

The Trigg County Wildcats picked 
up their ftrst win of the year Friday 

(See High School, B 11) 

Old-Tinte, Good-Tim.e 
Halloween Dance 

Friday, October 30th, 7 p.m. 
National Guard Armory, Auxier Road 

Prize for the best-dressed hillbilly 
Cakewalks • Games for the kids 

Square Dancing • Clogging 
Only $2.00 per person entry 

The 106 points scored last Friday 
night when South Laurel defeated 
Madison Central57-49 goes down as 
the most points scored by two teams 
this season in the state of Kentucky. 
Very Jinle defense was evident as 
South Laurel trailed 43-35 entering 
the fourth quarter. But one defensive 
stand ruled the outcome. With SL. 
leading 50-49, Central went for a 
two-point conversion that was 
stopped at the two-yard line with 
3:06 left in the game. The ensuing 
onside kick was covered by South 

Early .Times 
$1 499 Alllaxcs 

Come to dance or just to watch! 

1 2 Gallon · . each PJid 

''J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478 -2477 

Sponsored by Floyd County's own 
Good Time Cloggers 

OUR PTICAL 
We ftll all eye doctors prescriptions. Choose from hundreds of 

frames before having your eyeglasses made. 
Discover the difference the right pair of eyeglasses can make in your 

total appearance and comfort. 

Antique Ftligree Tr_lm 

Stainless 

Silicone Pads 

Cable Temple 

High Fashion 

Soft Fle:z: Pads 

Rimless 

Bausch & Lomb 
Polo • Ralph Lauren 

Christian Dlor • Porsche 
Carrera • Liz Claiborne 

Laura Blaglottl • Giorgio 
Guccl • Gloria Vanderbilt 

Disney • Nlntendo-Nickelodeon 

Spring HlDge 

Handmade 

Silicone Unlflt Bridge 

Plastic/Metal Combo 

Call for examination appointment • 886-2154 or 789-2020 
No extra charge for One-Hour Service • Medical Card Accepted 

r------------, COMPLETE EXAM 
+ EYEGLASSES 

$185°0 ~ustax 
1) Choose from Special Selection of frames 
2) Single-vision. plastic lenses only 
3) Prescription limited to +3.00 cylinder, 

sphere to -7.00 or+ 6 .00 
4) Tlnt extra charge 
5) Must be 16 years or younger 

MUST PRESENT COUPON AT TIME OF EXAM 
COUPON EXPIRES 11 -25-92 

Valid at Minix One Hour Optical 

L Prestonsburg and Paintsville only. FCTI 
___________ .. 

r------------, EYEGLASSES 
Buy One Get One 

FREE 
1) Choose from Special Selection. 
(2) Additional Charge for Straight Top Bifo­

cals - Only $15 - 0 Invisible $30 - Progres­
sive 560. 

(3) Prescription Umlted To +3.00 Cylinder. 
Sphere To - 7.00 or+ 6.00 

(4) Plastic Lenses Only 

MUST PRESENT COUPON AT TIME OF EXAM 
COUPON EXPIRES 11 -25·92 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

Valid at Minix One Hour Optical I 
L Prestonsburg and Pamtsville only FCT 1 

___________ _. 

r-----------, 1 Minix Eye Clinic, Inc. 1 

! $}5 off ! 
I I 
I COMPLETE EYE EXAM I 
I for eyeglasses, cataracts, glaucoma I 

,. -;. Mu• pNMnt cou-
1 ~~i!'J :-{:_ pon at time of rep.. I 
I .llt: ~ tradoa I 

i(~liMailW'!!'" ! Good tlilnl 11·15-ft 

I J Not valid with any I 
1 otller coupon-, c1q. 1 

countll or lnauranee 
I ..::~._.:s:IIDII'-" beneftta. I 
I Valid at Min1x One Hour Optical I 
I Prestonsburg and Paintsville only I 
L FCTI 

___________ _. 

PRESTONSBURG PAINTSVILLE 
Food City Shopping Center 

886-2154 
308 Main Street 

789-2020 



FLOYD COUNTY FOOTBALL 
STANDINGS AND STATS 

TEAM OVERALL DISTRICT 
PRESTONSBURG 6-1 3-0 
WHEELWRIGHT 4-3 2-3 
ALLEN CENTRAL 1-6 0-5 
BETSY LAYNE 0-6 N/C 

•••• 
LAST WEEKEND SCORES 

Wheelwright 22 KSD 14 
Whitesburg 52 Betsy Layne 0 

Prestonsburg 60 Magoffin County 1 8 
•••• 

FLOYD COUNTY SCORING LEADERS 
Player School TD Conv/XP{FG TP 
Seth Hyden P'Burg 9 1-0-0 56 
Dwayne Garza P'Burg 8 0-0-0 48 
Arnold Adams W'Wright 5 5-0-0 40 
David Gilliam ACHS 5 2-0-0 32 
MuntuOden W'Wright 4 2-0-0 28 
Aaron Tucker P'Burg 4 0-0-0 24 
Marcus Araujo P'Burg 0 0-24-0 24 
Jody Cornette P'Burg 4 0-0-0 24 
Steven Shelton W'Wright 3 0-0-1 21 
Jason Crisp P'Burg 3 0-0-0 18 
Kevin Patton ACHS 2 1-0-0 14 
Brad Blackburn ACHS 2 0-0-0 12 
Gary Arnold B'Layne 2 0-0-0 12 
Glenn May P'Burg 2 0-0-0 12 
Charles Johnson W'Wright 2 0-0-0 12 
Glenn Floyd ACHS 1 Safety 

. 
8 

Blake Leslie P'Burg 1 1-0-0 8 
Doug Hammonds B'Layne 1 0-0-0 6· 
Thomas Ratliff P'Burg 1 0-0-0 6 
Adam Roberts B'Layne 1 0-0-0 6 
Rocky Hamilton B'Layne 1 0-0-0 6 
Matt Porter P'Burg 1 0-0-0 6 
Jason Spurlock P'Burg 1 0-0-0 6 
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$$$ REWARD $$$ 
FOR THE RETURN OF ELVIS 

Elvis is our seven-week old German shepherd-mix pup. 
He disappeared from our home on Main Street Auxier early 
Sunday, Sept. 27. He is a mixed breed, with no actual value 
other than what he means to us-- he is more like a family 
member than a pet. Elvis is black with tan eyebrows, light 
tan under his chin, on his chest and on all four legs. He has 
big floppy ears that also have a little tan on them. 

If you have seen him, please call Geoff at 886-8506. We 
are offering a $50 cash reward for his return, no questions 
asked. We will also find you another puppy if you want. 
Thank you. 

1993 ESCORT WAGONS 

AUTO • AIR • AM/FM. • MORE 

Robbie Risner P'Burg 1 0-0-0 6 
Matt Johnson W'Wright 1 0-0-0 6 Crowned Homecoming Queen! 
Cruise Caudill W'Wright 
James Osborne ACHS 
Clint Shutts P'Burg 

0 1-0-0 
0 1-0-0 
0 1-0-0 

2 
2 
2 

Alena Gall Meade was crowned Homecoming Queen 1992 during halftime 
ceremonies Thursday night at Brackett Field. Meade will be the final 
football homecoming queen for the Trojans. She was escorted by 
Charles Johnson. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Wheelwright JV s fall to Johns Creek 26-8 
by Sheldon Compton 
Corresponding Writer 

The Wheelwright Trojans enter­
tained a spirited Johns Creek Bear­
catsjuniorvarsity team Monday night 
at Brackett Field. 

over on downs. half before the Trojans could mount 
a scoring drive. 

It turned out that form of high 
spirit proved to be a helpful factor as 
the Bearcats posted a 26-8 victory 
over a young and upcoming Wheel­
wright junior varsity team. 

The Bearcats threatened early on 
their first possession moving the 
football deep into Trojan territory. 
But the Bearcats could not sustain the 
drive, coughing up the football on a 
first-and-goal situation as 
Wheelwright'sdefenseshowedgood 
defensive determination. 

ball movement themselves taking 
over the football with 7:24 left in the 
second quarter. The Trojans made 
good on the series keeping posses­
sion of the ball for 4:17 before Matt 
Johnson scored to complete the 62-
yard drive. Johnson scored the con­
version run that gave the Trojans 
their first and only lead at 8-6. 

Johns Creek extended their lead in 
the third period on Varney's second 
touchdown of the game after the 
Bearcats struggled through a series 
of plays that was hampered by penal­
ties. V amey also ran the conversion 
play for a 20-8 score. All rebates, including first-time buyer, assigned to dealer. 

Wheelwright took the opening 
possession and pulled together an 11-
yard drive that mustered four fast 
downs. But the young Trojans failed 
to score allowing Johns Creek to take 

Johns Creek took the fust lead of 
the game in the second quarter facing 
a second-and-eleven situation. On the 
play, Bearcat Jeff May took a hand­
off and raced 4 7 yards for the touch­
down making it a 6-0 game after the 
failed conversion. 

Wheelwright showed some good 

The Bearcats struck back with an 
impressive scoring drive of their own 
sparked by a 26-yard run by Fred 
Varney and ending when Varney ran 
the ball into the end zone from 24 
yards out to give the Bearcats a 12-8 
lead. 

The clock expired to end the first 

Johns Creek scored their final 
touchdown in big fashion as Varney 
found an opening for 46 yards giving 
the game its fmal score of 26-8 after 
the conversion with 2: 16 left 

Wheelwright had 183 total yards 
led by Johnson with a solid 167 on the 
ground. 

• WE GLADLY ACCEPT USDA FOOD STAMPS.• 
Prices effective Wednesday, Oct. 14 thru Sunday, Oct. 18 

We reserve the nghtto I 1m it quant1t1es • Not responsible for pnnter's errors. 

MARKET 
Betsy Layne, Ky. 

• GROCERY I FROZEN I DAIRY· 

'• 

• MEAT DEPARTMENT • 

NeWvORK $ 99 
STRIP STEAK_ .... -......... 3 

THORN APPLE VALLEY 
SLICED $289 
TURKEY BREAST.La .. 

cliUci< BONELESS $ 59 THORN APPLE VALLEY 

PORK THORNAPPLEVALLEY 
LOIN ................................................. La. .SLICED 99¢ 
JIMMY DEAN $14 9 BACON .............................. 12 oz. 
SAUSAGE""""""", LB. ROLL THORN APPLE VALLEY 

fi~t .................... . -... -...... La.$1 29 !~.~~~.~~; .. ··--·••$1
19 

HORMEL LITTLE SIZZLERS 
SAUSAGE 
LINKS ......................................... LB. 89¢ ~~~~~~~-...................... ~ 79¢ 

MOORE'S ggce 
POTATO CHIPS .......................... e oz. 
FLAV..O.RICH $179 
ICE CREAM SANDWICHES ........ 12 PK. 

PREGO $169 
SPAGHETTI SAUCE ............. 3o oz. 

~~~~~~~~~~~-~~~~~-.. 34 oz. $299 
MAXWELL HOUSE $399 
INSTANT COFFEE .. - ............. 12 oz. 
SENECA $199 
APPLE JUICE ............................. 84 oz. 

::::~HES .. - ................. - ........ 2 112 CAN 99¢ 
~~~~~---·---....................................... 48 oz. $1 89 

~;~~~~~ ..................................... 1e oz. gge 
MORTON HOUSE $1 09 
BEEF STEW .......... - ........... 24 oz. CAN 
STOKELY'S 79¢ 
TOMATO JUICE ............... 48 oz. CAN 

ARMOUR 79¢ 
CHILl WITH BEANS ............... 1s oz. 

~~~ F000 .................................... 20 LB. $279 

~U~~~CH ................................... 1 GALLON 89¢ 
BOUNTY 79¢ 
PAPER TOWELS __ , .. JUMBO ROLL 
TIDE $749 
DETERGENT ---------.FAMILY SIZE 
KRAFT AMERICAN $179 
CHEESE SINGLES -·-·------12 oz. 
PILLSBURY 89~ 
BISCUITS ........... _ ........... - ......... 4 CANS 

TREET SWEET $199 
ORANGE JUICE .................... 112 GAL 

~';:~~CH FRIES ...................... - .. 2 LB. $1 59 

~~~~~~~~~ ................................... 28 oz. $1 79 

ceo~~LERS ··--·-·-······-·-·· ...... 28 oz. $1
79 

WITH 6 LOCATIONS YOU'RE BOUND TO RUN INTO US! -Pikeville··· Zebulon • Belfry • Betsy Layne • Elkhorn City • Hambley Blvd. 
NOTE: Prices and sale items may vary at Velocity Markets other than Betsy Layne Store. 
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GRIDIRON 
Win Up To 

$250 
$50 Weekly Prize 

R 1. Only one entry per person each week. 
2. Games to choose from are listed within 

the advertisements on this page. 
3. Write your choices for the winners on 

. the entry blank below. 

U 4. A $250 Grand Prize will be awarded 
for a perfect score of 12, including the 
exact number of total points scored in 
the tie-breaker game. A $50 prize will 
be awarded weekly to the highest score 

L if no contestant correctly guesses 12. 
In case of a tie, the tie-breaker will be 
used. 

5. Entries must be received in our office 
by 5 p.m. each Friday. Entries can be 

E dropped off at the Floyd County limes 
office, or mailed to the Floyd County 
limes, P.O. Box 391 , Prestonsburg, 
Ky. 41653. 

6. Winners will be announoed in the loi-s lowing Friday edition of the Floyd 
County Tiines. 

7. Decision of the judges is final. 

GAMES 

COMMITTED TO PROGRESS 
IN EASTERN KENTUCKY 

1. SHELDON CLARK @ PRESTONSBURG 

s 
Late Model car and Truck Parts 

Day, 886-2736 ~ Frank A. Adams 
Ownar 

3. ALLEN CENTRAL@ WHEELWRIGHT 

THE HOCK .SHOP - PAWN SHOP 
~.:::~- - ~,: 

Pink Ice Rings 
Pink Ice­

f£veryone 's :favorite 
Starting at 

Not exactly 
as pictured $2ooo 

886-2367 
Court Street 

Prestonsburg 
4. KENTUCKY@ LSU 

Glyn VIew Plaza 

~ 
I"] b 'kl~l l"l(!(! 0 1~. 

Now you can 
have your car 
serviced by the 

Jl~ .. --~ 

(#f) Service 
Department 
in the USA. ~' 

... even if it's not a Toyota! 
Call for an aonointment or com~ by today. 

6. ALABAMA@ TENNESSEE 

CARTER. 
HE~i!!~!!l 

First 
Commonwealth 

Bank MemberFDIC 

Pr..toniburg • Malfln • Betsy Layne 

2. BETSY LAYNE @ KSD 

THE BOB HARMON FORCAST 
Sat., Oct. 17- Major Colleges- Div. 1-A 

• Air Force 27 Colorado State 21 
• Arizona Stale 33 

Auburn 24 
Oregon State 14 

·Florida 20 
• Ball State 21 Akron 20 
• Baylor 26 Houston 24 

Brigham Young 24 
• Central Michigan 34 
• Clemson 23 

•wyoming 17 
Kent State 7 
Duke 10 

• Colorado 22 Oklahoma 20' 
• East Carolina 22 Cincinnati 21 

Florida State 24 • Georgia Tech 1 0 
Fresno State 24 ·Hawaii 22 

• Georgia 28 Vanderbilt 1 0 
Iowa 24 • Illinois 16 
Kansas 28 • Iowa State 14 
Kansas State 31 • Utah State 7 

• L.S.U. 26 Kentucky 20 
• Louisiana Tech 35 East Tennessee 6 
• Louisville 23 Tulsa 22 
• Maryland 26 
• Memphis State 40 
• Miami, FL 40 

Wake Forest 21 
Arkansas State 7 
T.C.U. 7 

Miami, OH 27 • Ohio U. 10 
Michigan 38 
Michigan State 24 
Mississippi 23 
Mississippi State 33 
Missouri 28 

'Indiana 7 
• Minnesota 21 

Arkansas 17 
• South Carolina 8 
• Oklahoma State 20 

Nevada-Reno 25 
• New Mexico State 27 

• Nevada-Las Vegas 20 
Pacific 23 

• Ohio State 27 Northwestern 12 
• Penn State 27 

Pittsburgh 23 
R~gern 28 

Boston College 14 
·Temple 14 

Army 13 
• San Diego State 31 

South'n MS (Oct. 15) 21 
Texas-EI Paso 15 

• Tulane 7 
• Southern California 24 California 23 
• Stanford 27 Arizona 20 
• SW Louisiana 24 Fullerton State 13 
• Tennessee 28 Alabama 21 
• Texas A & M 24 Rice 8 
• Toledo 23 Bowling Green 21 

Utah 31 • New Mexico 17 
Virginia 30 

• Virginia Tech 27 
• North Carolina 14 

North Carolina State 24 
Washington 27 • Oregon 7 

• Washington State 23 U.C.L.A. 21 
• West Virginia 23 
• Western Michigan 26 
• Wisconsin 23 

Syracuse 20 
Eastern Michigan 13 
Purdue 13 

r--------------------, OFFICIAL ENTRY BLANK 
1. 7. 

2. 8. 

3. 9. 

4. 10. 

5. 11. 
6. 12. ________ _ 

TIE BREAKER GAME: Wake Forest@ Maryland 

Total Points Scored ----------
Name _________ _ __ Phone ____ _ 

Address _ _ _ ___ _ ________ __ _ 

------------ Zip _ ___ _ 

L---------~----------~ 
• ., fii.Zfl. 
tooOIIIU.6 of PRESTONSBURG 

CARRY OUT or 
DINING ROOM SERVICE 

TRY OUR PAN PIZZA • CALZONES 

Pizza Baked to Your Order 
Italian Dinners 

Giovanni's Delicious Sandwiches 
Giovanni's Famous Salads 

500 S. LAKE DRIVE Phone: 886-8070 
P h.tuu.ln OuUz.J.Jr .Ens t SemiCP 

·12. HOUSTON@ DENVER 

\1.1thl" Clly ol Pru1Mtbur8 
)ClOp,.. lllclo•ng 

$6 00 mlf'llmum <Mdcr 

1. Prestonsburg 

2. Betsy Layne 

3. Wheelwright 

4. LSU 

5. N.C. State 

G. Tennessee 

7. East Carolina 

8. Lou is ville 

9. Minnesota 

10. LA Raiders 

11. San Francisco 

12. Houston 

~·'~ A Great Way to Remember 
~ _ this Special Time ..• 

lHopson for you and for 
auAuTY JEWELERs that special someone. 
Expert Repair Service 

Have your sports jersey 
number customized in #22 
earrings, pendants and necklaces. 

113 COURT ST. PRESTONSBURG 
LARRY JOE HOPSON, OWNER 

(606) 886-2734 7. CINCINNATI@ EAST CAROLINA 

EAST KENTUCKY BEVERAGE 
PIKEVILLE • PAINTSVILLE • HAZARD 

8. TULSA @ LOUISVILLE 

Exquisire Serenity 

$299 
Twlf'l Set 

Plu~.lllam ;\lore 

FuU 2 Pc. Set 
Queen 2 Pc Sel. . 
King 3 Pc. Set 

E1ceptional Buys: '---. ___ ...,. 

Prestonsburg Village 

886 8668 FURNITURE 

• 9. DETROIT@ MINNESOTA 

Shop 

HALL OF FRAMES 
CUSTOM FRAMING-PRINTS 

• Now Available • 
Reproduction art in boxed Christmas Cards. 

LEANIN'_i.TREE . 
M-F,l0-5 
Sat.,ll-3 

Call 
886-8158 

128W. Court 

, --, 
: Buy any Biscuit Sandwich : 
I GET ONE FREE CiOODTIME. I 
I Just bring in this GREAT TASTE:" I 
1 coupon and when you ~.;::: .:. .. '<: . c : I 
I buy any biscuit ,:_11·~·:/,: .,:,_· ,, • I 

sandwich, the second ~'f;':._•, _":;.;·.,. . _;•'; .·~ 

: ~O:ed i~:~epe~:~p~:~ ~~Y~.~~f.~~~'/'·lk ~ • , . I 
I percustomer,pervisit. (t-,:~/J!_. ' · "' ' 'l I 

Please present coupon 'f-.;_::r~ ·· ..;-' Good only 11 I 
I when ordering. Not . ~.~\ ~. -:;;.(:'j'.} PalotsvUie I 
I valid with any other _ ... ft~~··· Prestonsburg 1 

offer. P"·eville 1 Valid until lA I 
Cash value 1/20 of 1 cent 12-13-92 SalyersviUe 

I ~woo~~ I 
1 11. ATLANTA@ SAN FRANCISCO Louisa I 

o 1988 McOonalcrs Colporai!On 

~---------------------~ 

"l 
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~:~ :First (juaranty 9{fltionaf 13anK_ 
Ai~ 

Martin Office 

WILL BE CLOSED 
Saturday, October 17 

in observance of 

RED, WHITE & BLUE DAY 

ARNOLD ADAMS, Wheelwright, picks up 16-yards on this carry against KSD Thursday night as the Trojans 
~lebrated homecoming with a 22-14 win over the Colonels. Adams rushed for 107 yards and scored a touch­
down, (photo by Ed Taylor) 

The Prestonsburg Branch Drive-thru service 

WILL BE OPEN SATURDAY 
9-12 

High School---------- ceontinuedrromBs> -==================== 
with a 21-19 district victory over 
South Hopkins. However, Trigg 

County, now 1-5, may have the tough­
est schedule in the state. The Wild­
cats faced Murray. Bardstown, Fort 
Campbell, Cadwell County and Ful­
ton County to open the season, and 
they close out 1992 against Lone 

HOLBROOK 2000? 

,..,Oak. The combined records for these 
non-conference teams so far is an 

Fairview's Nathan Holbrook, the 
state's leading rusher for 1992, topped 
the 1,000-yard mark two weeks ago 
during Fairview's 44-28 win over 
Ironton (Ohio) St Joe. Last week, 
Holbrook racked up 275 yards and 
five touchdowns in Fairviews • 59-24 
win over Magoffm County. For the 
season,Holbrookhasrushedfor1,389 
yards (231.5 yards per game) and 17 
touchdowns. astounding 27-7. 

.. 
SOMETHINGS IMPROVE WITH AGE but Prestonsburg running back 
Seth Hyden Is doing It all as a junior this year. Hyden scored two 
touchdowns against Magoffln County Friday night and continues to lead 
the county In scoring. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

TO 
THE VOTERS 

OF 
DISTRICT 5 

The Floyd County School System 
has reached a point of great opportu­
nity. Either it can wander in a political 
wilderness for another forty years, or 
it can reach the promised land of edu­
catJonal opportunities for our chil­
dren. 
The decision is yours. Choose an 

educator to help lead the system for­
ward. 

Choose PhyiJis Burnett Honshell. 

lliCT 
PHYLLIS BURNETT HONSHELL 

BOARD MEMBER IN DISTRICT 5 
Nwnber 5 on the ballot Pol. adv. pail lor by candida18 

He's on pace to finish with more 
than 2.300 yards this season. 

THE ASHLAND 500 
Coach Vic Marsh's Ashland 

Tomcats are nearing the prestigious 
500-win plateau. The countdown to 
500 stands at 493 all-time wins. With 
four games remaining in regular 
season play. Ashland will be hard 
pressed 10 achieve that mark this 
season. But lhe Tomcats, 4-2 after a 
loss to Portsmouth last week, could 
hit the magical mark should they win 
their remaining games and advance 
to the semifinals of the state playoffs 
(win three playoff games). 

Floyd Countians for · 
Clinton -Gore 

Get Out the Vote 
Organizational Meeting 

Early Times 
$1499 f.IIIJ•OS 

1.2 Gallon coch pod. 

~------
J & J Liquors 

Betsy Layne • 4 7 8 -2477 

May Lodge 
Jenny Wiley State Park 

Paid for by the Floyd County Democratic Party 

14 WAYS MR. GOODWRENCH 
BUILDS YOUR CONFIDENCE I 

FLETCHER s H·ALLS 
No one knows your GM vehicle better than Mr. Goodwrench. Our technicians have the right tools, equipment and training to repair 
your GM car or light truck. Plus, we use genuine GM parts, the kind designed for your GM vehicle. 

As a Mr. Goodwrench dealer, we make 14 specific pledges to you, our valued customer: 
1. We will greet you promptly and courteously, and will listen and react to your service problems. 
2. We wi)) inspect your vehicle to make sure our work is done right. 
3. Our service department reception and pick-up hours will be convenient. 
4. Our service work and genuine GM parts have a 90-day or 4,000 mile limited warranty. Ask for details . 
5. We will quote you a price on most popular service jobs that will be the total price, including parts and labor. 
6. We will not proceed on additional work, if required, without your authorization. 
7. We will, on request, give you a written estimate of work required after diagnosis is completed and before any work is 

done. 
8. Our service and parts prices will be competitive when you compare our parts and service values to other service 

sources in our area. 
9. We offer "while you wait" service on many service operations. 
10. We will have replaced parts available upon request, except parts required for warranty claims. 
11. We will make available low-cost or courtesy transportation except for heavy-duty or commercial vehicles. 
12. Our service and parts personnel are General Motors trained and have the proper tools and equipment. 
13. We will maintain a balanced inventory of genuine GM parts. 
14. We will provide and maintain attractive, clean restrooms, reception rooms and waiting rooms. 

So, stop in and see the difference Mr. Goodwrench service makes. 
You'll be glad you did. 

432-5551 : • ' • '' o • o/i ' I I. ' · • · : , , ; 1- '• ' : ~ I "- 'I " ' • · II ,I :' : '~ ~ · : ·: ' ' I • ' ,',. : 'ol ; ' ; 

·· · , : : ·· · · '-· · ~ r . •~"'; .. ·· •·· ,,. ·. ·' ·· ·:,·· . · 
!' . :• ,'' ' ~: ' ' ·I ' ' • • ~ ~~·, t' •" • /.1 : .. ..... , .. . 
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YON 
OCTOBER 16th, 2:00 p.m.-11 p.m 

Family Pack 
Split 

CHICKEN 
BREAST 

¢ 
lb. 

1 Lb. Roll 

BALLARD'S 
SAUSAGE 

¢Savel~ 

Frozen 

10 Oz. Pkg. 

BALLARD'S 
SAUSAGE LINKS 

¢save9~ 

CORN 
FLAKES 

9~~ 
box 

' 

T 

$2.99 each 

Limit 3 with coupon and $20 purchase 

Save 
$ZJO lb. 

ROAST· 
BEEF 

$ 69 
lb. 

Grade 'A' 

MEDIUM 
EGGS. 

59~oz. 
EE DAYS ONLY 
THURSDAY, OCT.15 

FRIDAY, OCT. 16 
SATURDAY, OCT.17 

Columbia Bacon 
16 oz. pkg. 

·~,...___ __ ___. 

TV Crinkle Cut Potatoes 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE 

21b.bag 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE 

TV Sandwich Bags Carnation Hot Cocoa Mix Blue Bonnet Margarine Qtrs. 
80 ct. 10 ct. pkg.- Milk Chocolate or Rich Flavors 21b. 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE 
·.:-.. ~~"'{" 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE 

Pops•Rite Popcorn Birdseye Corn on the Cob Welch's Grape Jelly 
2 lb. bag -White or Yellow 4 ct. pkg. 32 oz. 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE 

Ore-Ida Shredded Hash Browns Mt. Olive Hamburger Dill Slices Deli Turkey Breast 
24 oz. 32 oz. Jar Buy 1 lb.-Get 

BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE BUY ONE-GET ONE FREE ~ 1 LB. ANY DELl SALAD FREE 

.I 
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Solitaire 
by Mike Rosenberg 

BRINGING IT ON HOME 
"This is the end, beautiful 

friend." 
-James Douglas Morrison 

After 65 days, 13,118 miles, 
and 31 of the lower 48 states, I've 
finally come home to roost. 

I unscientifically calculated 
thatifl'ddrivenduenorth,across 
the North pole, and then south. I 
would have popped up some­
where in the neighborhood of 
Sydney, Australia. Don't quote 
me on that-a map scale, dental 
floss, tapeandarulercanonlybe 
so accurate. 

I recrossed the Mississippi 
without much fanfare. The looks 
I gotformycar's Wildcats sticker 
in Tennessee at the beginning of 
the trip were nothing compared 
to the glares from people around 
Evansville when they saw both 
UK and Duke stuff in my rear 
windshield. I escaped without 
injury. 

After stopping to see former 
Floyd County Times staffer Ron 
Marstin in Louisville, I spent a 
night visiting a friend in Lexing­
ton. I was within two hours of 
home, but it would have been 
against the rules to return to the 
old stompin • grounds before I 
finished the whole journey. 

Much of the remaining trip 
was spent visiting friends. I went 
back to Duke to see my compatri­
ots there and motored up to 
Washington, D.C. On the way, I 
crossed the Chesapeake Bay 
Bridge-Tunnel-an amazing feat 
of engineering- and stopped at 
Assateague National Wildlife 
reserve. I saw beautiful wild 
ponies galloping in the distance. 
At Assateague, I walked on the 
beach to completeoneofthe main 
objectives of this trip-collect­
ing shells from the three major 
bodiesofwaterborderingthe U.S. 

, (I'm not counting the Arctic 
Ocean.) 

To get to Assateague, I had to 
cross Chincoteague island, which 
has about the land area of down­
town Prestonsburg. Somehow, I 
got lost in this liule place and 
spent an hour driving down ev­
ery street trying to find the bridge 
(Where's that confounded 
bridge?) to escape the island. 
After a while, the locals began to 
wave at me as I circled the blocks. 

After D.C., I went to Philadel­
phia to see my Grandfather and 
some other friends, to Westport. 
Connecticut, and then to Indiana 
University of Pennsylvania to 
visit my best friend. After two 
days there, I turned south and 
made it home in time for my 
father's birthday. I let out a bar­
baric yawp in my driveway and 
fmally considered the trip (ex­
cept for substantial unpacking 
which still isn't done) over. 

Now that I've rolled across 
the length of the country, I can 
finally join the ranks of the "been 
there, done that" people. I don't 
claim I've seen everything there 
is to see. But I've seen enough to 
have a story for every occasion 
for the next few years. I feel sorry 
for my unborn kids and grand­
children. They're the ones that 
will bear the brunt of my stories 
after my friends stop listening. 

Jack Kerouac said in his fa­
mous novel On The Road that he 
found a country that refused to 
open its eyes to the realities of the 
day. No one in Kerouac's time 
wanted to admit there could be a 
threat to their everyday lives. That 
was the 1950's. Forty years later, 
I found a country that's seen too 
many bad things and is trying to 
shut its eyes again. 

For example, few people dare 
show courtesy to a stranger. As a 
single male traveling alone, I 
could be some kind of psychotic 
looking fora victim. As Wednes­
day said in the Addams' Family, 
"They look like everyone else." 
People try to insulate themselves 
from any possible threat. When I 
was taking my tour of Carlsbad 
Caverns. there was a family of 
three behind me. The trail was 
wet and the eight year -old daugh­
ter almost slipped off the edge. I 

(See Solitaire, C 2) 

Small World 
IN THE NEWS 

There was a story in last 
Wednesday's issue of our paper about 
a couple in Frankfort winning three 
million dollars in a Kentucky Lotto 
drawing. They live in Frankfort now, 
but both Sandy and Joe Wallen are 
from Floyd County. 

The former Sandy Woods grew 
up in Betsy Layne, the daughter of 
Lorraine Woods and sister of Jim 
Woods, the handsome guy she plans 
to go to California to visit. She is also 
the niece of Walter Frasure of Allen. 

Susan Wallen, Postmaster at I vel, 
called Rhonda Blackburn at her of­
fice, Vantage Point Advertising in 
Pikeville, to tell her the good news. 
Both had gone to grade school and 
high school with Sandy, and of course 
they have been jubilating about her 

good fortune. 
The girls had sort of lost track of 

her and so enjoyed the news story of 
where she lives and works, and that 
the couple has two grown-up chil­
dren. 

Chad V amey, the artist at Vantage 
Point, was overhearing part of the 
conversation and he caught the com­
ment that both Sandy and Joe say 
they will keep their jobs. 

"Keep their jobs!" he exclaimed. 
"I knew a guy who won free fries at 
McDonald's and quit his job!" 

**** 
REMINDER 

Lloyd and EleanorCrum who have 
made many contributions to Floyd 
County and provided employment 
for many people now live in semi­
retirement at Allen. 

by Aileen Hall 

Their sons, Greg and Randy, have 
busy careers of their own, but once in 
a while they have a favor to ask. 

Greg put his car in a garage a few 
weeks ago for some service that would 
take more than a day, then something 
carne up that caused him to need 
tmnsportation. He asked his mother 
if he might borrow her car for the 
afternoon. 

Not only was she willing, but she 
insisted that he keep it until he got his 
own car back. "Oh, no," he insisted, 
"I don't want to do that. You might 
need it." 

"It's fine for you to keep it," 
Eleanor assured him. "I can remem­
ber when I didn't even have a car­
and you can't." 

**** 

APOLOGY 
Last week I wrote about one of our 

readers, Tiny Layne Combs, who lives 
in Howell, Michigan-but I spelled 
her name Tina. 

I know our names and their spell­
ing are important so I take this oppor­
tunity to apologize-and to say Hi 
again to an old friend. 

***"' 

STATUS REPORT 
I won't mention this man's name 

at all, but he is an acquaintance I see 
on a fairly regular basis. 

"How are you doing this morn­
ing?" I asked. 

"I just have one complaint," he 
told me, "and she goes to work at two 
o'clock." 

Genius of art found in handiwork of children 
by Mark Vanderpool 
Contributing Writer 

The voices of children may be 
heard. at first, as distant echoes as 
one enters the labyrinth of cold cin­
der blocks that form the body of 
Charles F. Clark Elementary School. 
Is it just the acoustics that make such 
places seem hollow? 

The corridor opens into a large 
gymnasium/cafeteria with white 
walls and a harshness in the lighting. 
There is talking and laughing and a 
bit of mischief quickly suppressed as 
the sources of the voices stand re­
vealed. Many curious eyes follow as 
a stranger crosses the room. 

On the other side is found a small 
cubbyhole that used to serve as a 
boys' locker room. It no longer ex­
udes the smell of dirty gym socks. It 
no longer echoes the mighty tones of 
pep talks. This room has been trans­
formed into the glorious, multi-col­
ored ambience of an art studio. 

Here exists a haven where new 
genius may be found, new joy ex­
pressed. and new friendships made. 
Here exists a greenhouse where young 
Rembrandts and Picassos may be 
cultivated. Perhaps in here is found 
the heart and the soul of the place. 

This is the Children's Museum of 
Art. It is the brainchild of Ralph 
Clark-a Houstan native and an 
experienced art teacher who moved 
here in 1987. After searching high 
and low and asking everyone, from 
the mayor to the local librarian, about 

finding a place to continue his work, 
he finally discovered just what he 
was looking for in the school that 
bears his name. 

"It all happened when I talked to 
many different people in the commu­
nity and I never turned up a work 
space and when I approached the 
school asking if they had any unused 
area it was this old locker room that I 
moved everything out of and turned 
it into an art studio and we began the 
program," said Clark. 

"The Floyd County Public Library 
sponsors this program. And the par­
ent registration first goes through the 
library. Parents can call the library 
and the library then refers the call to 
me and I talk to the parent and learn 
about the child and what particular 
art interests they may have. 

"There's one boy coming from 
Pikeville who is very interested in 
cartooning and so I'm going to work 
with him in cartoons this fall. And 
there's one nine-year-old girl that is 
going to be in the fall program who • s 
very interested in writing children's 
books and illustrating them, so it 
would be nice if she wrote a book 
about our world here in the moun­
tains and illustrated it ... that would 
be very good." 

"So it all happened when I talked 
to many different people in the com­
munity and never turned up a work 
space and when I approached the 
school asking if they had any unused 
area it was this old locker room that I 
moved everything out of and turned 

it into an art studio and we began the 
program. 

''There's never any discipline 
problem in this art class because all 
of these children want to be here 
which makes a big difference. They 
are really artists. They want to be 
here and when they are here, they 
want to draw. It's not like it's part of 
their school day. This is something 
extra that really interests them." 

Clark says that the children tend to 
get a boost in self-esteem when they 
see what they are able to accomplish 
as artists. Looking at a series of draw­
ings by the same child often reveals 
remarkable development. 

It is quite a rarity for a school in 
this area to have its own full-time art 
teacher and many children come from 
surrounding counties to be a part of 
the program. Also, several of Clark • s 
students have been enrolled in the 
program for a second time. 

Clark says he is hoping that the 
creative studio environment and ac­
tivities in the visual arts will help to 
stimulate and bring out the individual 
creativity of each child. It is also 
important, in Mr. Clark • s estimation, 
that the children are exposed to" good 
art." 

"It just seems that after they know 
what good art is, it becomes a part of 
them and affects what they produce. 
really. They become aware of good 
design and from their natural creative 
instinct it comes out in their pic­
tures." 

In addition to drawing, sculpting 

and other work in the visual arts 
Clark is avidly reviving the story~ 
telling tradition. Children in the 
workshop are given the opportunity 
to tell their stories. such as "What I 
did during summer vacation," and 
have it recorded on audio tape. Clark 
is presently working to expand 
"Mountain Children's Adventures" 
on audio tape into other area ·schools. 

Registration for the program is 
open through October 16. The work­
shop will meet after school, one hour 
per week for 14 weeks. The tuition 
fee is $50. This covers both instruc­
tion and material costs. While this 
may be a little much for many fami­
lies to afford, every indication from 
the parents whose children have been 
through the program is that it • s worth 
iL 

The Clark Elementary SchooiPT A 
sponsors scholarships for the students 
during every session. This allows 
many children to attend who would 
otherwise be unable. Four scholar­
ships will soon be awarded for the 
upcoming fall session, based upon an 
evaluation of work presently being 
submitted by hopeful young art stu­
dents. 

For schedules and more informa-

tion parents may contact the Floyd 
County Public Library at (606) 886-
2981. 

Poison Oak------ by Clyde Pack 

WANTED: A GOOD ROCKING 
CHAIR 

When compared to the alterna­
tive, I guess there's nothing wrong 
with getting old. From that perspec­
tive, I'm looking forward to it. 
However,itsortofsurprisedmewhen 
I came to realize that all those people 
upon whom I've always looked at 
with awe and wonder because of their 
age and wisdom, are now younger 
than I am. If Bill Clinton is elected 
president, the cycle will just about be 
completed. 

First there was my preacher. Then 
my doctor and both my bosses at 
school. And, of course, there's Dan 
Quayle. Soii_~et~ing's definitely 

wrong with thlS ptcture. 
I guess I really first started notic­

ing than I'm suddenly older than all 
these folks when the doctor I'd had 
for nearly 30 years-a fine old gen­
tlemen in his seventies-retired. 
Quite naturally, as all good physi­
cians would have, he recommended 
another particular doctor to care for 
me. Having complete faith in his 
judgment.. I accepted his recommen­
dation and scheduled an appointment 
with his successor. 

Even though my old doctor had 
said that my new doctor was younger 
than he, I never really gave it much 
thought I figured he'd be in his early 
sixties, or something. 

Wrong! 
When I met for the first time, I was 

totally unprepared for the kid who 
walked in and introduced himself. I 
mean, he looked like a young Doogie 
Howser. 

"I've got neckties older than you," 
I told him. 

"Thanks .. .! think," he answered. 
Through further conversation, I 
learned he was 31 years old. 

Since the care he's given me had 
been okay, I've finally accepted him. 
I've also accepted the fact that my 
preacher is young to have been one of 
my students ... and could have been 
had he not changed high schools. 
And. despite their ages, I can work 

with my bosses. 
But, when I suddenly realized that 

I could be older than the President of 
the United States, it was quite a blow. 
Thinking about Clinton being accused 
of trying to avoid a draft that I was 
already too old for, or Quayle and AI 
Gore being high school students when 
I was already in college, makes me 
think that I'm about ready for the old­
folks home. 

Perhaps if Bush or Perot wins, that 
feeling that I'm a tired old antique 
might be postponed for a while. 
Realistically, though, the likelihood 
of that happening seems slim to none. 

(See Poison Oak, C 2) 

Kim's 
Korner 

Topics and duck phones 
Topics and how I come up with 

them is the question I get asked 
most often. The 
majority, (as 
most of you 
readers well 
know), are col­
umns about chil­
dren. mine, and 
others. 

A few times, 
I have dabbled in political topics, 
and to be honest, I loved it. But, 
causing a stink over something I 
choose to write about, is not my 
objective in this column. 

This particular column is the 
third I've written for this week's 
issue. 

The first two were political and 
concerned issues about our "sys­
tem" and how we could under­
standably use a "new" one. 

However, I chose not to turn 
either of them in. Most of the 
column I'd first written was about 
our presidential candidates and 
was written strictly on my opin­
ion. 

After reading it aloud to others 
for their reactions, I found myself 
seeing differently than I'd seen 
things when I'd sat down to write. 

Politics is definitely a subject 
that can be discussed at length, 
and when you're on a deadline, 
well, let's just say, it's time to 
change ... the subject that is. 

So, that second column began, 
and the topic was a "new system," 
and was not intended as a discus­
sion of our political system. But 
the more I wrote, the more politi­
cal it got. I was so sick of politics 
that I trashed the two columns and 
began t!lis one. 

Being in a non-smiling frame 
of mind, I found it hard to come up 
with a topic to write to bring a 
smile to your faces. 

Which is exactly my main 
objective each week. 

I began recalling the instances 
I'd dealt with earlier in the week 
that made me smile. But, ifl wrote 
them, certain people would hang 
me with the nearest rope. 

As I was becoming more and 
more disgusted, searching my 
mind for something to make my 
readers smile, it hit me. 

So, here it comes and, in all 
honesty, I' II probably be hung with 
the nearest rope an way. 

Earlier last week, Mrs. Rey­
nolds and I were going 50 differ­
ent directions at once in the library 
atA.M.S. We had the usual class, 
part of another group researching 
a project, and myself back in the 
video production room with four 
students producing a video. 

Now, the V.P. room is off to 
the back of Mrs. Reynolds' office. 
In her office, on her desk, sits this 
phone. 

The phone, (which looks ex­
actly like a duck), is only used for 
the computer line, so when it rings 
(a term used very lightly) one 
knows it's a very important call. 

WeU, as we were well into our 
many different projects, the duck 
began to quack. 

Yes, I said quack. 
I ran out the V.P. door, through 

Mrs. Reynolds' office, out the 
office door, as she was explaining 
instructions to the class. 

Hating to interrupt her, I knew 
I had too, so, I said "Mrs. Rey­
nolds, the duck," but she didn't 
hear me. 

Meanwhile the duck is quack­
ing like crazy. I was afraid who­
ever was on the other end would 
hang up, so, I yelled, "Kim, duck!" 
At that point Mrs. Reynolds threw 
her arms above her head and hit 
her knees to the floor. 

Imagine my face, "Not that 
duck," I said pointing to her of­
fice, "This duck." 

She jumped to her feet laugh­
ing hysterically and ran to the 
phone. 

We've laughed for days over 
this one. And now you guys can, 
too. 

Forme, maybeaftcrthis I won't 
be able to write. She may break 
my hand. 

I don't think so. She enjoyed it 
too much. 

But, I do bet the duck phone 
gets replaced soon, real soon. 

Till next week, keep smilin'. 
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caught her, set heron her feet and 
tried to strike up a conversation 
with the parents. They looked at 
me like, "Who do you think you 
arc to speak to us?" It wasn't an 
isolated incident. I got similar 
reactions almost everywhere I 
went. I'm not criticizing the de­
sire for safety-I just think that a 
simple "Hello" and a smile aren't 
too threatening. Sometimes 
manners are as important as 
safety. Besides, I don't think I 
look that threatening. 

I wish the United States had 
youth hostels and rail passes like 
Europe does. I would have loved 
to bop from town to town, staying 
with people my age who were 
doing what I was doing. My 
cousin had great experiences 
hitchhiking, hosteling and Euro­
railing it around Europe. I 
wouldn't even think of trying to 
hitchhike across the U.S. 

That's not to say I didn't have 
a great time. This trip wa~ the 
highlight of my young life and, 
like the cliche goes about educa­
tion, it's something that no one 
can take away. I've seen and done 
so much on this trip that it will 
probably take me a few years to 
fully understand the magnitude 
of the whole thing. 

When I graduated from col­
lege, I was the only one of my 
school friends that wasn't either 
going straight into a job or grad 
school. There's a feeling gradu­
ating seniors get that we should 
move right into the rest of our 
lives. This trip's made "You're 
only young once" clear to me. I 
don't know when I'll be able to 
see any of these places again. If I 
hadn't taken time now, I might 
never have seen them. My advice 
to all pre-graduates-why rush? 
There's a whole world out there 
to explore. Just take a friend­
it's a lot less wearing when you 
drop out of the mainstream for a 
couple of months. 

I'm really glad to be home 
getting reacquainted with the area. 
Ifmyparentshadn'ttoldmeabout 
the new traffic patterns in front of 
Wai-Man, I'd have run into 
something. Don't feel alone in 
construction delays. Every major 
highway east of the Mississippi is 
in similar shape. 

I have to close with some 
thank-you's. First and foremost 
to my parents, without whom this 
journey would have been impos­
sible; to Scott Perry and the Floyd 
County Times tor running my 
ramblings; to the other Journey­
men: Scott "Skippy" Wells, Tony 
"Psycho" Skeans, Mark 
"Maxwell" Vanderpool, Mark 
"Slope" Ratliff, "Doctor" Dave 
Stanford. Dusty "No Nickname 
Required" Weathers and any 
others I've carelessly omitted;and 
to you, the readers, who have 
followed my little adventure. I 
hope you enjoyed it Until we 
meet again, whenever that may 
be, it's time to walk on down the 
hall. 

Listen to Jeremy. 
Later days. 

Poison Oak-
(Continued from C 1) 

Maybe I just as well had better go 
shopping for a good rocking chair. 

***** 
And speaking of age, when I was 

a kid in Muddy Branch, I read a lot of 
comic books. Superman was one of 
my favorite characters. I was a kid 
He was a grown man. 

Now, according to a piece I read in 
the paper last week, I find that the 
man of steel is only one year older 
than I am. Come on, now. Who are 
they trying to kid? That means that 
when I was eight, Superman was 
only nine. Yeah, right Like some 
nine-year-old kid could have devel­
oped muscles like that or have a girl 
friend as pretty as Lois Lane. Those 
comic book people must think we'd 
fall for anything. 

And if that's not enough, the ar­
ticles stated that DC Comics is plan­
ning to kill Superman in issue num­
ber 75, due on newsstands on No­
vember 18. 

That's ridiculous. Everybody 
knows you can 'tkill Superman. Next, 
they' II try to tell us that Popeye was 
never in the Navy. 

Prepare for 
Bishop's visit 

Bishop Robert C. Morgan, of the 
Kentucky Methodist Conference, 
will be honored with a dinner on 
November 24 In the Family Life 
Center of the Prestonsburg First 
United Methodist Church. At that 
time, he will be presented with a 
quilted throw that had been hand­
appllqued with the official emblem. 
Thethrowwasdeslgned and made 
by members of the Sewing Circle 
of the church. The church's pastor 
Rev. Russ Holland Is shown mak­
Ing a few stitches on this gift. 

(photo by Mary Sue Moore) 

Retirement seminar 
to be held 

Virginia S. Goble, a member of 
theexecutivecouncil of the Big Sandy 
District, Kentucky Retired Teachers' 
Association (BSRT) recently an­
nounced that there will be a pre­
retirement seminar for all teachers 
approaching. retirement in the Big 
Sandy District October 17, at 9 a.m., 
in the Johnson Building at 
Prestonsburg Community College. 

The seminar is sponsored by the 
BSRT and the KRTA. 

East Point Homemakers 
hold regular meeting 

The East Point Homemakers met 
at the Little Paint Church of God 
October 6, at 12:30 p.m. The meeting 
was called to order by Amita Snav­
ely. The devotional, "While there is 
Time," was given by Priscilla Hager. 
A new member, Sandra Baldridge, 
joined the club. 

Members answered the roll-call 
with ideas about recycling. 

Homemakers are making finger 
puppets for children at the Highlands 
Regional Medical Center. 

Each member is asked to bring a 
can of food to all meetings to be 
donated to the church for the food 
pantry. 

Information concerning the Area 
Homemakers' meeting held recently 
at Salyersville was shared by the 
group.SixpersonsfromFioydCounty 
won blue ribbons on their arts and 
crafts items. 

Next month's meeting date is 
scheduled for November 3, at 12:30 
p.m. The lesson will be "Holiday 
Ways to Recycle Gifts, Gift Wrap,. 
and Decorations." Members were· 
asked to bring a Christmas tree orna­
ment to enter in the contest at that 
time. 

The lesson, "Collecting, Select­
ing, and Decorating with Old Things" 
was given by Frances Pitts. 

Those present were Mary Nell 
Bingham, AmitaSnavely, Ruby Hall, 
Dorothy Harris, Shirley Callihan, 
Priscilla Hager, Betsy Baldridge, 
Sandra Baldridge and Frances Pitts. 

Prestonsburg Woman's 
Club holds meeting 

The executive board oftheGFWC/ 
KFWCPrestonsburg Woman's Club 
met at the clubhouse at Archer Park 
on Thursday, October 8, at 7 p.m., 
prior to the regular club meeting held 
there at 7:30 on that same date. 

President Garnett Fairchild called 
the meeting to order. Mrs. Fairchild 
stated that she and Bur.ieta Gearhart 
have registered to attend the GFWC 
Southeastern Region meeting to be 
held November 12-15 at the Grove 
Park Inn, in Ashville, North Caro­
lina. She reminded members of the 
board that the KFWC Seventh Dis­
trict Fall meeting would be held on 
October 17 at the Landmark Inn in 
Pikeville. 

The president reported that she 
had received a letter from GFWC 
soliciting money for the planned 
memorial to women in the military to 
be erected in Washington, D.C. She 
then reminded the group that the club 
must place an ad in the "Kentucky 
Club Woman" magazine, in order to 
be a 100 percent club, and she asked 
for new ideas for the text to be used 
for the coming year. It was suggested 
that the ad state the number of years 
that the Prestonsburg Woman's Club 
has been in existence. 

Third Vice President Drema Miller 
reported that the deadline for submit­
ting names and advertisements to be 
used in the club's Birthday Calendar 
had passed. 

The following board members 
were present for this meeting: Garnet 
Fairchild, president; Drema Miller, 
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third vice president: Kathy Lowe, 
recording secretary; and Dianne 
Clatworthy, treasurer. 

The regular October meeting fol­
lowed there at 7:30 p.m. Garnett 
Fairchild called the meeting to order. 
She presented Roberta Sloan, devo­
tional leader, who read" A Collect for 
Club Women," and led the group in 
The Lord's Prayer. Mrs. Fairchild led 
the singing of "God Bless America,'* 
which was followed by the Pledge of 
Allegiance to the American Flag. 

Following the welcoming of those' 
in attendance, the president called on. 
Kathy Lowe who read the minutes of 
the September meeting and Dianne 
Clatworthy, who gave the financial 
report 

She call on Sandy Burchett to 
distribute the ballots for voting on 
prospective members who had at­
tended the recent membership din­
ner. 

Burieta Gearhart presented infor­
mation on joining the Eastern Ken­
tucky Concert Series and expressed 
the desire that this concert might 
become a part of the club. 

The president call on Drema 
Miller, who presented the club 
member Beverly Hackworth, who 
with Loretta Allen, a guest, gave an 
interesting and informative program 
on the steps and techniques involved 
in ceramics. 

Sandy Burchett, membership 
chairman, reported to Mrs. Fairchild 
that the entire slate of prospective 
members had been approved for 
membership. These are Mesdames 
Gladys Allen, Jane Bond, Sharon 
Bingham, Karen Davis, and Anna 
Marie Berkebile. 

Hostesses for this event were 
Mesdames Maxine Bierman, Eula 
(Judy) Johnson. Roberta Sloan, Bev­
erly Hackworth, and Joyce Allen. A 
dessert course was enjoyed 

Others present were Loretta Al­
len, a guest, and these members: 
Gamet Fairchild, Drema Miller, 
Kathy Lowe, Lyda Howard, Dianne 
Clatworthy, Sandy Burchett, Burieta 
Gearhart. and Elizabeth Ramey. 

The next regular meeting will be 
Thursday evening, November 5, at 
the same location. The devotional 
leader will be Betty Porter. The pro­
gram leaders will be Eileen Burchett 
and Phyllis Herrick with the program 
to be the completion of the arts proj­
ect. Hostesses will be Lucille Nun­
nery, Ethel Burke, Shirley Callihan, 
Betty Porter, and Ditty Tackett. 

Alice 0. Martin has recent 
houseguests at 

Turkey Creek home 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mayo and their 

former son-in-law, Myron Whipple, 
all of Midland. Michigan, were re­
cent house guests of Alice 0. Martin, 
at Turkey Creek •. Friends will recall 
Mr. Mayo as a former basketball 
coach at Garrett High School. 

Several visitors came to see the 
Mayos and Mr. Whipple while they 
were here. Among them were Olga 
Trusty, Roberta Sloan, Nora Martin, 
Roy Martin, Doug Fitzpatrick, re­
tired Judge Hollie Conley, Darrell 
Combs, Tava Terry, Ashland Salis­
bury, Mr. and Mrs. Royce Mayo, and 
their daughter, Peggy Rice, Mr. ru1d 
Mrs. David Martin and their sons, 
Nicholas and Daniel Goldie Salyers 
and Ruby Akers. 

You can beat 
colo rectal 

cancer. 
Sandra May is 
living proof 

"At first I thought it was hemorrhoids. 
It started off as just cramping, then 
turned into diarrhea. I'd get real hot 

and sick to my stomach. I had 
headaches and went down to 

89 pounds. I had these symptoms 
for about five years." 

Sandra May, of Staffordsville, had 
developed a lesion in her colon, or 
large intestine. And like many of us, 
she put off getting it checked. "I was 

just sure it was cancer." 

Still, she caught it in time. "Dr. Basha 
(her surgeon) said if I had waited very 
· much longer, it would have been 

widespread cancer." Although the 
surgery, performed by Dr. Basha at 
Highlands was not easy, "I just put 
myself in his hands because I knew 
he'd bring me through ... and he did. 
I'm just sorry I put if off as long as 
I did. I would urge anyone that has 
symptoms to go to a physician and 
have tests run ... especially if you're 

over 40. Then you have a chance of 
being cured. I was 39." 

'The good Lord really blessed me. 
I just feel great now. Highlands 

Regional is one of the most efficient 
hospitals ... fine doctors ... nurses ... 

I was treated great." 

Get a cancer screening 
and a free cancer risk test 

Cancer of the colon, breast and 
prostate are major killers. But 

prevention and early detection can 
beat them. 

FREE Prostate Screening 
See the dates and locations 
listed here or call for more 
information. 
Don't delay! Do it today! 

The Mayos attended a Sloan reun­
ion at Pippa Passes while they were 
here. They and Mr. Whipple also 
visited with Anna Dudley of Lark's 
Lane and Alice G. Martin of Garrett, 
and family members in Ashland. 

They returned to Midland on 
October 8. 

United Methodist 
Women hold regular 

monthly meeting 
The United Methodist Women met 

<On October 5, at 7 p.m., in the Family 
ILife Center of the church. 

(See Society Events, C 3) 

WIDE SELECTION 
OF FENCING PRODUCTS 

HOME OF ARMADillO X, AMERICA'S 
RNEST AND BEST SELUNG UNE OF 

CHAIN 4,HK FENCE 

Free In-Home 
Estimate 

• FNtlci'lg piMll 
IOitycunMdl 

• inllaltd by 
S.a Auilor· 
lzed conllactcn 
•Various~ 

ooloral ~· 
U.1.21--....... 

886-8135 

Support and Vote for 

Dr. Mary Hall 
Number 2 on the Ballot 

for 

School Board Member 
Educational Division No. 4 

52L proven {eatfer for the 
peop{e of ![{oytf County! 

Paid for by the Candidate 

FREE PROSTATE SCREENING LOCATIONS 
First come, first served .•• arrive early! 

Saturday, Sept. 26, Prestonsburg 
9:00 a.m.-3:00p.m. 

Saturday, Oct. 24, Inez 
9:00 a.m.-3:00 p.m. 
Office of Dr. Don Chaffin 
Hwy. 40 E. 

Highlands Medical Offices, 
2nd Floor 
US 23 N. 

Saturday, Oct. 31, PaintsviUe 
9:00 a.m.-3:00 p.m. 
Highlands Medical Offices 
520 N. Mayo Trail (next to 
Shoney's) 

For more information, Call-A-Nurse - 1-800-844-NURSE 



• 

The meeting was called to order 
by President Helen Neeley. "The 
Purpose of the United Methodist 
Woman" was said in unison. 

Rose Glenn gave the lesson en­
titled "Ecumenical and Justice, World 
Thank Offering." 

The minutes were read by Roslyn 
Burchett and the treasurer's report 
was given by Geneva Carter. 

Next month's meeting will be the 
pledge service for missions. United 
Methodist Woman's organizations 
are women in mission. 

Members are urged to save food 
labels to be sent to the Hill Crest 
Bruce Home. 

Plans for a dinner honoring Bishop 
Robert Morgan on Novem her 24 were 
discussed. 

ThosepresentwereRuth Worland, 
Alice Harris, Fannie Runnels, Mable 
Allen, Jane Wallace, Geneva Carter, 

~ Vera Ford, Helen Neeley, Rose 
Glenn, Debbie Holland, Rebecca 
DeRossett, Elizabeth Ramey, 
Dorothy Harris, Rose Langefield, 
Gladys Blackburn,Edna Carol Green­
wade and Roslyn Burchett. 

Mrs. Green has 
recent guests 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Goble and 
son James of Columbus, Ohio, were 
here recently attending to business 
and visiting with Mrs. Perry Greene. 
Another family member visiting with 

• Mrs. Green recently has been her 
daughter, Annabelle Maggard of 
Pearisburg, Virginia. 

Lamplighters hold meeting 
The Lamplighters of the First 

Baptist Church (Irene Cole Memo­
rial) held their semi-monthly meet­
ing in Fellowship hall there on Tues­
day, October 6, the church's pastor, 
the Rev. Michael Taylor, in charge. 
Rev. Taylor read and explained a 
passage from Proverbs. 

The scripture reading and the fel­
lowship were enjoyed by Rev. Mi­
chael Taylor, Thomas Foy, Lucy C. 
Regan, Myrtle Allen, Ada Meade, 
and Minerva Cooley. 

Miss Maurine Mayo has 
recent houseguest 

Mrs. Roy C. Clark of Nashville, 
Tennessee, was the recenthouseguest 
of her aunt, Maurine Mayo, here. 
During that time, she also visited 

with some of her other relatives and 
friends. and she and her aunt spent a 
few days in Lexington. While there, 
they were the guests of Miss Mayo's 
sister, Anna Allen and family, for­
_merly of Prestonsburg. 

Sr. UMYF toy drive 
underway at 

First United Methodist 
The Sr. UMYF of the First United 

Methodist Church is conducting a 
toy drive. It is asked that you being 
your good used or new toys to the 
church and put them in the 7th and 
8th grade Sunday School classroom 
at the earliest possible convenience. 

Mrs. Eileen Burchett with 
grandchildren in Winchester 

Mrs. Eileen Burchett has been in 
Winchester for the past several days 
with her grandchildren, Carlye, 
Adam, and Charles Burchett, chil­
dren of Dr. and Mrs. Thomas J. 
Burchett, there, while their sister, 
Mary Burchett, has been a patient at 
the Children's Hospital in Baltimore 
following surgery there. Mrs. 
Burchett and the three grandchildren 
with whom she has been staying were 
at the Burchett home here during the 
weekend, and she expects to return 
here this week. 

Relatives and friends will be glad 
to know that the condition of Mary is 
satisfactory. Dr. and Mrs. Burchett 
have been in Baltimore with their 
daughter throughout this time. 

Mrs. Ormerod and 
granddaughter visit in 

Columbus 
Mrs. Helen Ormerod and her 

granddaughter, Kristen Ormerod 
visited Mrs. Ormerod's sister, Mrs. 
Arnold Pack, and Mr. Pack in Co­
lumbus, Ohio, recently. 

Annie Allen Circle WMU 
holds regular meeting 

MembersoftheAnnieAllenCircle 
WMU of the First Baptist Church 
(Irene Cole Memorial) held their 
regular monthly meeting on Monday 
evening, October 5, at 7 p.m., at the 
home of their president, Julia Curtis, 
on the Middle Creek Road. 

Mr. and Mrs. Verble Lee Bishop 

• Exchanged vows August 10 
Tammy Kristina Kilgore and 

Verble Lee Bishop were united in 
marriage on Monday, August 10, at 7 
p.m., at the Third A venue Free Will 
Baptist Church, Prestonsburg. 

The double-ring ceremony was 
conducted by the Rev. Manford 
Fannin, pastor of the church. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Tommy and Shirley Kilgore of David 
and granddaughter of the late Jay and 

Kittie Shepherd, and Boone Kilgore 
of Blue River and the late Lula 
Kilgore. 

The groom is the son of Linda 
Bishop Craft of Gable-Roberts and 
the late Verble Bishop of 
Prestonsburg. 

The couple now reside at Luke Air 
Force Base in Glendale, Arizona, 
where the groom is stationed as a 
member of the United States Air 
Force. 

Ten free shade trees 
Ten free shade trees will be given 

to each person who joins The Na­
tional Arbor Day Foundation during 
October 1992. 

The free shade trees are part of the 
nonprofit Foundation's efforts to 
encourage tree planting throughout 
America. 

The ten shade trees are Red Oak, 
Weeping Willow, Sugar Maple, 
Green Ash, Thornless Honeylocust, 
Pin Oak, River Birch, Tuliptree, Sil­
ver Maple and Red Maple. 

The trees will be shipped postpaid 
• at the right time for planing between 

November l and December 10 with 

enclosed planting instrucuons. The 
six to twelve inch trees are guaran­
teed to grow, or they will be replaced 
free of charge. 

Members also receive a subscrip­
tion to the Foundation's news maga­
zine, Arbor Day, which includes 
regular features about tree planting 
and care. 

To become a member of the Foun­
dation and to receive the free trees, 
send a$10 membership conttibution 
to Shade Trees, National Arbor Day 
Foundation, . 100 Arbor Avenue, 
Nebraska City, NE 68410, by Octo­
ber31. 
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In the absence of the president, 
Eva Collins, Mrs. Curtis conducted 
the meeting which she opened with 
prayer. Due to the absence of Docia 
Woods, secretary, the minutes were 
read by Sarah Laven with Rebecca 
Rasnick recording notes for the 
Novem her meeting. Mrs. Rasnick, 
treasurer, gave the financial report. 

Lucy Regan gave the devotions 
and read the prayer list for Baptist 
missionaries observing birthdays 
during the month of October. Prayer 
for them was held. 

Faye Patton presented the pro­
gram, entitled, "We are the Body of 
Christ," and asked that special prayer 
be given for Sam and Mary Waldron. 

Concern for a WMU long-time 
member, Maman Leslie, who at that 
time was recuperating from surgery 
at the University of Kentucky Medi­
cal Center in Lexington, was ex­
pressed, and it was decided that flow­
ers would be sent to her on behalf of 
the group. 

The hostess served refreshments 
of sandwiches, salad, dessert, punch, 
and coffee to: Rebecca Rasnick, Ruby 
Garrett, Faye Patton, Lucy C. Regan, 
Ruby Lamping, Roberta Sloan, Sarah 
Laven, Myrtle Allen, and Ada Meade. 
Faye Patton closed the meeting with 
prayer. 

It was announced that the next 
meeting had been scheduled for 
Monday evening, November 7, at 7 
p.m., with Patsy Evans and Vivian 
Fraley as hostesses with the location 
to be announced at a later date. 

Mrs. Leslie home 
from hospital 

Relatives and friends of Maman 
Leslie are welcoming her home fol­
lowing her hospitalization at the 
University of Kentucky Medical 
Center. With her during recent sur­
gery were her pastor, Rev. Michael 
Taylor; friends, Lucy Regan, Helen 
Clark, and Julia Curtis, all of 
Prestonsburg; and Mrs. Leslie's son 
and daughter-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald G. Leslie of Lexington. 

She was accompanied home b~ 

Spouse Abuse 
Crisis Line 

another son, Dick Leslie of 
Prestonsburg. Her daughter, Mary 
Alice Phillips of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, is with her this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Pettrey and 
Mrs. Rasnick have 

recent guests 
1-800-649-6605 

Floyd County Homemakers 
attend area meeting 

Floyd County Homemakers who 
attended the recent Area Homemak­
ers meeting held in Salyersville were 
ArnitaSnavely, Mary Nell Bingham, 
Dorothy Harris, Shirley Callihan, 
Helen Boyd, Margie Yates, Jean 
Watson, Marena Hale, Alice Rowe, 
NancyRobelts,Nancy'smother,Mrs. 
Crook, Sylvia Allen, Elizabeth Little, 
Sue Wells, Helen Music,JanJoseph, 
and Jotm and Frances Pitts. 

Winning cultural arts awards at 
the meeting were Floyd County 
Homemakers: Freda Hicks, Ada 
Meade, Helen Boyd, Alice Rowe, 
Nancy Roberts, and Marena Hale, 
winning blue ribbons; Mary Nell 
Bingham and Mary Sue Moore, red 
ribbon~; and Kay Willis, Linda 
Chaffms, and Jan Joseph, white rib­
bons. 

Other homemakers submitting 
cultural arts were Sue Wells and 
Marge Yates. 

According to Frances Pitts, Floyd 
County home economist, "those 
winning blue ribbons will be sending 
their cultural arts to the State Home­
makers Annual Meeting in the 
spring." 

M.·s. Rebecca Rasnick and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Pettrey had with them 
overnight Saturday, Mrs. Rasnick's 
grandson, Frank Harris and Mrs. 
Harris, of Lexington. 

Also visiting them recently were 
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Caudill of 
Detroit, who were spending some 
time here with relatives and friends. 

Jenny Wiley Chapter AARP 
to hold dinner-meeting 

Gladys Allen, president of the 
Jenny Wiley Chapter, AARP,recently 
announced that the regular dinner­
meeting of this organization will be 
held Friday, October 16,at5:30 p.m., 
in the dining area of Highlands Re­
gional Medical Center. Following 
dinner there, an interesting program 
will be presented. Mrs. Allen and 
other officers urge all members and 
prospective members to attend. 

Flowers at First United 
Methodist Church 

Flowers at the First United Meth­
odist Church, during services there 
this past Sunday morning were "in 
loving memory" of Roben B. Cook, 
from the Cook family. 

KY CARPET FACTORY OUTLET 
& TILE CITY U.S.A., INC. 

SINCE 1970 
THE LARGEST IN STOCK CARPET OUTLET IN EASTERN KY • 5 CREWS AVAILABLE TO INSTALL YOUR CARPET 

SHOP US FOR QUALITY & LOW PRICES 
RESIDENTIAL- COMMERCIAL 

ALL BRANDS LINOLEUM IN STOCK 
CERTIFIED TECHNICIAN AVAILABLE FOR CARPET & UPHOLSTERY CLEANING 

i•t5isA ~ 

ld 
l.l 

'P.ud&'P~~-~ 

RAILROAD STREET -DOWNTOWN, ALLEN 874-2859 

DIAMOND 
SOLITAIRE 

Sug. Ret. $99.95 1 

Our Reg. Low $59.95 

$4997 
5 DIAMOND 

Sug. Ret. $129.00 
Our Reg. Low $79.95 

$5997 
DIAMOND SOLITAIRE 

.-_..4~'1=. Sug. Ret. $139.00 
·~ Our Reg. 

Low $89.95 

$6997 
...r.riiiT11tltnrrlmA~ 
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Babies need to have their Social Security numbers OUR SAVIOR 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 

11 :00 a.m. Sunday 

Sixth birthday 
Klsha Rose Marie Hinton, daugh­
ter of Kenneth and Vanessa Hinton 
of Mulberry, Florida, celebrated her 
sixth birthday Thursday, October 
8. She Is the granddaughter of 
Rhoda Stanley and Arthur Stanley 
of Prestonsburg and Gene Hinton 
of Dana and Shirley Handly of Flor­
Ida. Her great-grandmothers are 
Ruth Ousley and Carmla Stanley of 
Middle Creek. She Is the great­
great-granddaughter of Cressle Jo­
seph of Prestonsburg. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenls Clark 

Wedding anniversary 
A celebration was held Saturday, 

September 16 at Honaker to cele­
brate the 62nd wedding anniversary 
of Ken is and Martha Risner Clark. 

By George W. Smith 

Q: Will I really have to get a 
Social Security number for my 3-
month-old daughter?-K.K., Boise, 
Idaho 

A: Not yet. Uncle Sam wants to 
keep track of everyone, big or little. 
A Social Security number does ex­
actly that. Your da~ghter does not 
require a Social Security number this 
year but will need one by the end of 
'93.1fyou claim a dependent who is 
at least 1-year-old by the end of your 
taxyear,youmustlistthedependent's 
Social Security number on your tax 
return. If you do not, or if you list an 
incorrect number, you may be sub­
ject to a $50 penalty. 

Q: I was recently divorced. What 
is the tax consequence of any prop­
erty settlement received? What hap­
pens with the half of our house that 
my fonner husband owned that was 
given to me? When I sell the house I 
will receive the entire proceeds and 
there will be a profit.-S.O., Bak­
ersfield, Calif. 

A: Tax wise? Nothing much ... now. 
When property is transferred as a 
result of a divorce the tax basis 
(usually the pur~hase price plus any 
improvements and certain other ad­
ditional costs) of the property also 
changes hands to the other spouse. 

September ~: A son, Bradley 
McCade, to Ada and Jimmy Little of 
Estill; a daughter, Anissa Brook, to 
Frances and David R. Slone of Mar­
tin. 

September 9: A son, Tyler, to 
Melissa Ann Hall of Vest. 

September 10: A daughter, Ash­
ley Shalyn, to Rebecca Ann and 
Bobby Wayne Hall of Topmost 

September 11: A daughter, 
Cathryn Shaye, to Erma Jean and 
Robert Joseph of Georgetown; a 
daughter, Danielle Leigh-Ann, to 
Jeanne Lee Blanton of Dwale. 

This basis (call it cost) is the amount 
on which gain or loss will be deter­
mined when the property is eventu­
ally sold. When sold, the wife (in this 
case) will receive all the proceeds. 
She also keeps the previous spouse's 
cost basis. Consequently, he or she is 
responsible for any income taxes due 
when the property is later sold at a 
profit. It seems right 

Q: My father passed away and I 
inherited his IRA. Can I roll this IRA 
into mine?-G.P., Muncie, Ind. 

A: No. If a person, other than the 
decedent's spouse, inherits an IRA 
from someone who dies, no rollover 
treatment is allowed. The amount is 
fully taxable in the year it is received. 

Q: My daughter is working this 
summer ate: pizza shop. She will earn 
about $1,500. This is about the same 
amount she eamt:d iast yex-. S !he had 

all her income taxes refundc:d last 
year. The same will probably ruappen 
this year too. Isn't there a fornn that 
she files so that her employer won't 
deduct any more taxes?-D.R •• Bill­
ings, Mont 

A: Yes. Fonn W-4, Employees 
Withholding Allowance Certilficate, 
will do the trick. Students who will be 
working during the summer nnonths 
may be able to avoid the withhmlding 
ofincornetax(notFICApayroll taxes) 
from their wages. 

Students who did not havre any 
income tax liability for 1991 and do 
not expect any for this year q[ualify 
for the exemption. Enter "' 1992 

First birthday 

EXEMPT" on line 7 of Form W -4 
and check "Yes" to the question on 
line 8. 

However, it won't work if she has 
more than $600 of income from other 
sources such as dividend and interest 
income. Her boss probably has an 
extra W-4 form in his desk drawer. 

Q: Is death the ultimate solution to 
capital gains? Do heirs inherit the 
current market value of stock and 
property? Docs the estate pay the tax 
on any capital gain before distribu­
tion?-B.R., Washington, D.C. 

A: The basis of property inherited 
is usually its fair market value at the 

Halloween Carnival 
set for Saturday, 
October 24 

The P'IA of Clark Elementary 
School will hold its annual Hallow­
een Carniwl on Saturday. October 
24, from 6 p.m. to 9 p.m. 

Twenty·five cents will admit a 
person to t.tc Clark gymnasium where 
a variety of activities offering prizes, 
challenges, competition, savory de­
lights and :riendly scares are avail­
able. 

Childrea are encouraged to wear 
Halloween costumes and participate 
in the costLme contest 

Prizes can be won at the Toilet 
Seat Thro'>', Goldfish Dip, Lollipop 
Tree, Teacier Squares, Dart Throw, 
Bingo and B-ball Free Throw booths. 

Homem1de cakes baked by stu­
dents' parents can be won at the Cake 
Walk Boot1. 

Those ~king a "spooktacular" 
scare can visit (if they dare!) the 
Haunted Hl>use staffed by teachers 
and parent volunteers. Those who 
prefer the ~tacular can have their 
faces paintd or their jewelry en­
graved. 

Refreshnents will be available for 
those who bring or acquire an appe­
tite. 

An auctton of items donated by 
local merc1ants will conclude the 
evening's a::tivities. 

The public is invited. 

date of the decedent's death. If a 
federal estate tax return has to be 
filed your basis in property inherited 
will probably be listed at fair market 
value. If a federal estate tax return 
does not have to be filed, your basis 
in the property is its appraised value 
at the date of death. There is no capi­
tal gain tax paid by the deceased on 
the date of death. 

Slpp lilly• Room, Carrlllgt HoLM HcQt 
Pllntlvllle, Ky. 

Rev. Rolland Bentrup 
297·1604 

Listen to 
WKLW (600 AM) "Chapel Window" 

12:05 p.m. Every Sunday ...... 

DRIFT WOMAN'S CLUB 
5th Annual 

J2Lutumn 13eauty Pageant 
November 7, 1992 

McDowell High School 
6 p.m. 

AGE DIVISIONS 
Baby Miss 
Toddler Miss 
Wee Miss 
Tiny Miss 
Little Miss 
Junior Miss 
Miss Autumn 

0-12 months 
13-23 months 
2-4 years 
5-7 years 
8-10 years 
11-13 years 
14-18 years 

BEAUTY & PHOTOGENIC CATEGORY 
PRETTIEST DRESS & PRETTIEST EYES 

(We now accept color and B&W photos) 
(ENTRY DEADLINE ...... NOVEMBER 6) 

CALL: 377-2487, 377-2917, 377-2437 

Entry forms can be picked up: 
Lad 'n Lassie-Prestonsburg 

Brooks Pharmacy-Betsy Layne 

.~ Fashion Bazaar-Martin 
/" Hi-Lite Pizza-Minnie • 

~ 
./ 

Mr.Clark,anAlzheimer'svictim, 
no longer speaks or dances, yet Mrs. 
Clark, at times feels that he has a 
remembrance of her as his loving 
wife. Mrs. Clark cooked and served a 
huge meal for the celebration at her 
home, which overlooks their wed­
ding day site. Many friends and family 
members were there to share the sto­
ries and enjoy the pictures taken. 

September 13: A daughter, Jes­
sica Nicole, to Daphine and Ronnie 
Thacker of Hi Hat 

September 15: A son, Corey 
Martin, to Mallie Lorene and Roy 
Wayne Haley of Eastern; a daughter, 
Alexandria Kaye, to Robin Denise of 
Hueysville. 

Amanda Rae Ousley, daughtter of 
Dewey and Melissa Ousley of:Spur­
lock, celebrated her first birthday 
at her grandmother's house In 
Lackey on August 27. She Htad a 
pink and purple cake with Mllnnle 
Mouse on lt. She Is the granddaugh­
ter of Delmas and Kathy Conlley of 
Eastern, and Dewey and Vllflnnle 
Ousley of Spurlock, the great­
granddaughter of Avanell C10lllns 
of Lackey, Gerlle Conley of Mmusle, 
and Jake and Phoebe Brandy of 
ConleyFork.OcleColllnsoflackey 
Is her great-grandmother. Amanda 
Is the fifth generation In the f;amlly 
still living. 

Boor SALE 97 

Those present were Josephine 
Branham of Honaker; Shirley and 
Susan Belcher of Grundy, Virginia; 
Faith AkersofLexington; Linda Kaye 
Gearheart and her daughters, Heather, 
Ashley and Crystal, all of Harold; 
Ranson and Christine Meade of Betsy 
Layne; Fed Clark of Honaker; Miles 
and Alene Kidd and son of Honaker; 
Jerry Meade and family of Pikeville; 
Johnny Meade and family of Betsy 
Layne; and Velma Lawson of Ha­
rold. 

Regional fire school 
planned at Mayo 

The 1992 Big Sandy Regional Fall 
Fire School will be held on the cam­
pus of the Mayo State Vocational 
Technical School in Paintsville, on 
Saturday and Sunday, October 17 
and 18. 

Classes in basic f1refighting, fire 
code enforcement, emergency vehicle 
driving, and emergency medical tech­
nician in-service will be offered. 

This program is sponsored by 
Workforce Development Cabinet, 
Office of Adult and Technical Train­
ing, Fire/Rescue Training Branch, 
Northeast Region. It is hosted by the 
Paintsville Fire and Rescue and the 
Paintsville Tourism and Convention 
Bureau. 

For more information call Bob 
Barringer at (606) 789-8461. 

September 16: A daughter, Sab­
rina Kay, to Arlene and George 
Dwayne Hill of Martin. 

September 17: A son, Roy Silas, 
to Agnes Layne and Roy Dean Burke 
of Halo. 

September 19: A daughter, Jerrie 
Dawn, to Anglea and Steven Lynn 
Helton of Weeksbury; a daughter, ,-----------~ 
Cecelia Dawn, to Brenda and Mark 
Howell of Pikeville. 

September 20: A son, Trevor Jor­
don, to Ruby Carol and Gregory Cook 
of Topmost; a daughter, Kristol 
Dawn, to Ruby and Dwayne Eddie 
Grigsby of Garrett. 

September 22: A son, Zachary 
Keith, to Stephanie and Keith Bentley 
of Garner. 

September 23: A daughter, 
Alyshia Dawn, to Angela Lou and 

CHRISTMAS SEALS~ 
THE #1 HOPE 

FOR THE 
#3 KILLER: 

LUNG DISEASE. 

Roy Gene Collins of Allen. ._ ____ _____ _ __j 

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:· 

From this day forward, no one 
other than the immediate family 
members of Raymond Gear­
heart will be permitted to be 
buried in the family cemetery. 

· The family of 
Raymond Gearheart 

ftrestone 
PERFORMANCE 

SALE! 
EJIST KY TIRE 
AND AUTO SERVICE CENTER 

5040 Bucks Branch 
Martin, KY 

285-9813/285·9962 

I VISA I 

• 

112 Mile North Of wat-Mart on u.s. 23 
Prestonsburg, KY 

886-9879/886·9887 

Toll Free 11 C800> 264-9813 

Open Mon-Frl8am- 6pm 
Sat sam- !pm 

r-----------, . 
I OIL AND 1 
I FILTER CHANGE I 
I floo. J1U5 Wo II dra•n I 
I rn~~~~~c::~··~ ~~.~~ 'o~n•• I 
I ;j !~~~.·~=~ ~~~;~.~W- SJ495 I I ea11 and 11gt1t truc:ks, and I 

most Ntnans. Toyo1as. 
J 'WI't and Honda• I 
W'!:!!'~9~L--- ~·~ ~J 

·Any partocopatong Fo reslone retaoler 
wdl replace your lrre!S on a pro-rata 
basos ot they do nrot achreve the 
guaranteed moleage 160.000 moles 
on FR480. 40.000 liD 55,000 moles 
on other Forestone radoals J Actual 
tread tole may vary1. See us lor a 
copy ot our treadwe1ar hmoted war 
ranty and speed r<atong and t.re 
sal,' ty ontormatoon 

Reg.29.99 

MENS Dk. Brown 
BOYS 10'12-7 - $4 LESS 

MENS black 
oily SUEDE 

J'trestone 

FR480® Radial 
·Steel-Belted Construction 
·All-Season Tread Design 
·Original Equipment Choice 

Si:e 
185/70R14 BLK 
195/70R14 BLK 
215/70R14 OWL 

..£dl::a.._ 
$54.95 
$59.95 
$64.95 

FIREHAWK GTX® 
• Steel-Belted Constr~ction 
• All-Season Tread Design 
• H-Speed Rated· 

Size Price 
175/70HR13 BLK $48.99 
185/70HR13 BLK $51.99 
185/70HR14 BLK $51 .99 
205/70HR 14 BLK $54.99 
21 5/70HR15 BLK $58.99 

Radial ATX® 
Make Your 

4WDPerform 
• Steei·Belted Construction 
• All Terrain li'ead Design 
· Easy to Handle 

AS LOW AS 
$74.95 

23575R15 OWL SL 
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Largest Selection Of Fabric & Craft Supplies 
In Eastern Kentucky 

• Bridal Satin and Lace 
• Quilting and Craft Suppllea 

Winter reminders • Over 20 Styles of Baskets 
• Foam Rubber Sheets In one to five Inches thick 

Spring Maid Curtains 

Copyright 1992 KVMA 
Kentucky Veterinary Medical 
Association 
Some almanacs are predicting a 

somewhat severe winter for Ken­
tucky, with more snow than usual 
and perhaps some severe cold snaps. 

Whether the predictions actually 
come to pass is a matter of conjec­
ture, because when you remember 
the bitter winter of 1977-78, you 
realize that when Kentucky gets bad 
winter weather, it's really bad. And 
animals may have a tough time. 

Golden anniversary 

Usually all that is necessary is to 
remember that animals need more 
food when the temperature drops 
below their comfort threshold, that 
they always need an available supply 
of water and that they sometimes 
need a windbreak. 

Considercaule. Cows with a typi­
cal winter coat are comfortable at 32 
degrees Fahrenheit, if their coats are 
dry, and if the wind chill factor is 
taken into account Asaroughruleof 
thumb, food intake should be in­
creased by one percent for every 
degree below 32 degrees. For ex­
ample, when the temperature is 15 
degrees and the wind is 15 miles an 
hour, the effective temperature is zero. 
Therefore, a 32 percent increase in 
food is necessary. 

Addison and Cora Collins of Bypro celebrated their 50th wedding ann I· 
versary on September 12, with the Wheelwright Free Will Baptist Church. 
There were 92 In attendance. The celebration was hosted by their 
children. They have seven children and numerous grandchildren. They 
were married on September 11, 1942. 

GFWC/KFWCDriftWoman'sCiub 

The GFWC/KFWC Drift 
Woman'sClubmetSeptember21 at 

.Jhe Left Beaver Fire Station #2, Mrs. 
Doris Lawson, president, presiding. 

Violet Hall conducted the devotional 
followed by the Pledge of Allegiance 
totheFlag. Theminuteswerereadby 
Mrs. Celia Little, secretary and the 
treasurer's report was given by Mrs. 
Jerri Turner, treasurer. 

Committee chainnen 1992-93 
were announced by the president­
Conservation, Ruby Akers; Educa­
tion, Cheryl Hall; Home Life, Karen 
Slone; International Relations, 

t:f.ldred Salisbury; Public Affairs, 
Violet Hall; Membership, Roney 
Clark; Arts and Crafts, Celia Little; 
Community Improvement, Cheryl 
Hall; By Laws, Katheryn Youmans; 
Press Book and Women's History 
and Resource Center, Ruby Akers. 

The official call to the 74th annual 
conference, seventh district, will be 
held at the Landmark, October 17, in 
Pikeville. The delegates are Jerri 
Turner and Celia Little; alternates are 
Roney Clark and Cheryl Hall. 

The 24th annual Horse Show was 
discussed and the 5th annual Miss 

Autumn Pageant will be held at the 
McDowell gymnasium, November 
7, at 6 p.m. Entry blanks can be 
picked up at Lad and Lassie, 
Prestonsburg; Brooks Pharmacy, 
Betsy Layne; Stop and Shop, 
McDowell; Hi Lite Pizza, Minnie; 
Fashion Bazaar, Martin; Kid Stuff, 
Pikeville. For more information call 
Geraldine Ward, 377-2487; Violet 
Hall, 377-2917; Roney Clark, 377-
2437. 

AreportwasgivenbyRuby Akers, 
delegate to KFWC Fall Board in 
Louisville at Executive West The 
presidents special projects are in the 
area of education. SOAR, Conserva­
tion, Recycling an dan Environmental 
Scholarship. 

Refreshments were served by the 
hostess,J erri Turner to Doris Lawson, 
Ruby Akers, Cheryl Hall, Roney 
Clark, Violet Hall, Katheryn 
Youmans, Geraldine Ward and guest, 
Wesley Turner. 

Adopt-A-Teacher program was 
discussed. Jerri Turner, Karen Slone 
and Cheryl Hall were selected. 

The next meeting will be in charge 
of the membership committee, Octo­
ber 19th. 

~~-----------------------------------------

All animals need water. For cattle, 
the need is constant. Allowing ponds 
to freeze over without opening places 
for cattle to drink may cause them to 
walk out on the pond and fall through 
the ice. 

If the coat gets wet and there is a 
wind, the evaporation factor will 
lower body temperature even more. 
A wind-break will help offset this. 

The specifics vary from animal to 
animal, but all animals which live 

Grethel Homemakers 
The Grethel Homemakers held a 

meeting on October 6 at the Grethel 
Baptist Church Annex. The meeting 
was called to order by vice-president, 
Barbara C. Newman. 

Devotions were led by Glenna 
Evans, based on Proverbs 10:5, "In 
the Master's Hand." 

Roll call was answered by giving 
a consumer tip that they use regu­
larly. 

Farming fatalities is reduced by 
35 percent from last year's report 

The lesson, ••collecting, Select­
ing and Decorating with Old Things," 
was taught by our Floyd County ex­
tension agent. Frances Pitts. Lesson 
sheets were distributed to the group. 

The next meeting will be changed 
to Thursday, November 5, at 6:30 
p.m. Each homemaker is to bring a 
homemade Christmas ornament to 
compete in the Homemakers' Floyd 
County contest. 

Thirteen Kentuckians lost their 
lives in farming accidents during the 
first six months of 1992, according to 
a preliminary farm fatality summary 
issued by Kentucky Farm Bureau. 

The total was the lowest first six 
months death toll recorded in the 10 
years that Farm Bureau has surveyed 
farm fatalities, and represents a 35 

~rcent reduction from last year's 
report, when 20 fatal accidents were 
reported from January through June. 

Tractors were involved in 11 of 
the 13 deaths, according to Joe 
Claxon, safety director for Farm 
Bureau. Eight victims were killed in 
tractor overturns, two were run over 
by the machines and one died when a 
large hay bale rolled off a front end 
tractor loader and onto the driver. 

One other victim was killed when 
aforkliftoverturnedandonedrowned. 

According to Claxon, the 1992 
figures continue a downtrend in farm 
accidents, attributable to several fac­
tors, including a decline in the num­
ber of working farmers, added safety 
features on newer machinery and 
increased safety awareness among 
farm operators. 

Still, he noted, farming poses 
unique dangers not always seen in 
other hazardous professions. 

"Farm tractors are the key to pre­
venting accidents, because they are 
involved in the great majority of farm 
deaths," he said. "The power of these 
machines combined with the uneven 
terrain on Kentucky farms adds up to 
a lethal combination." 

Farmers also tend to work well 
past normal retirement age, he said. 
Five of the 13 victims this year were 
65 or older, a trend which has shown 
up in mostoftheFarm Bureau's farm 
death reports. 

Casey, Edmonson. Franklin, Henry, 
Hopkins, Magoffln, Morgan, Owen, 
Pulaski, Wayne and Webster. 

Federal-State Market News 
Wednesday, October 7, 1992 

Gateway Livestock Market 
Cattle and calve receipts: 1228 
Total livestock receipts for the week: 1720 
Cattle weighed at time of sale. (Compared to last week) Slaughter 

cows, steady; slaughter bulls, steady to firm; feeder steers, steady; and 
feeder heifers, steady to $1 higher. 

SLAUGHTER COWS: breaking Utility and Commercial 3-4, 
$43.25-47.25; high Cutter and boning Utility 1-3, $46-49.50; heiferette 
to $58; Cutter 1-2, $43-46; Canner antl low Cutter, $37-43; few 
lightweight Canner, down to $35. 

SLAUGHTER BULLS: individual yield grade 1, 1975lbs., indicat­
ing 83 carcass boning percent, $68; yield grade 1-2, 1430-2060 lbs., 
indicating 79-81 percent, $59.50-63.25; yield grade 2, 1210-1460 lbs., 
indicating 77-79 percent, $53-59.50. 

FEEDER STEERS: Medium to Large Frame No.1, 300-400 lbs., 
$92-102; 400-500 lbs., $84.50-94; 500-600 lbs. $78-84.50; 600-700 
lbs., $79-83.25, includes part load 676lbs., $stl.75. Small Frame No. 1, 
295-400 lbs., $85-92; 400-500 lbs., $78-85; 500-600 lbs, $74.25-79; 
600-700 lbs., $70-75. Large Frame No.2. Holsteins, small package 255 
lbs., $90; few 635-770 lbs., $58-61.50. 

FEEDER HEIFERS: Medium to Large Frame No.I, couple pack­
ages 298-308, $97.50-99; 300-400 lbs., $80-85; 400-500 lbs .• $76-
82.75; 500-600 lbs., $74-78; 600-700 lbs., $72-76; package 708 lbs., 
$74.50. Small Frame No.1, 295-400 lbs, $67-76;400-500lbs., $67-72; 
500-625 lbs., $64-70. Medium and Large Frame No. 2. 325-450 lbs .• 
$70-76.50; 550-625 lbs., $63.50-68. 

STOCK COWS AND CALVES: Medium and Small Frame No. 1-
2, indicating 3-10 years of age, with 125-300 lb. calves at side, $4 70-790 
per pair. 

STOCK COWS: Medium and Large Frame No. 1, indicating 2-8 
years of age, bred 3-8 months, $500-720 per head. Medium and Small 
Frame No. 1-2, indicating 3-10 years of age and bred 2-7 months, $330-
500 per head. 

STOCK BULLS: $610-770 per head. 
BABY CALVES: $80-125 per head. 

outdoors have the same needs whether 
they are companion or farm animals. 

25% off Already Low Prlces.--f-.lew Merchandise Arrives Dally 

Ashe's Textile Factory Outlet 
1/2 Mile North of Prestonsburg, U.S. 23, 886·1622 There are.other specific things to 

watch out for, such as anti-freeze 
poisoning. Some animals, especially 
dogs, have a taste for the ethylene 
glycol, which has a sweetish flavor 
and an attractive odor. 

(Across from East Kentucky Flea Market) Open: 9 a.m.·S p.m. 7 days a week 

Minute amounts, however, are 
lethal, and damage, even if your ani­
mal does not die, is irreversible. 

Micheal Bl Minix, M.D. 
Ophth~lmologist 

Puddles of antifreeze are often 
seen in driveways and on streets where 
radiators have flowed over, and in 
subfreezing weather may be the only 
liquid available. 

Other animals, notably cats, util­
ize the warmth of automobile en­
gines to keep warm. While dogs 
usual! y get under a car, cats will often 
get on the engine itself or under the 
hood somewhere near it. Starting the 
engine often kills the animal. 

Usually blowing the hom a couple 
of times before cranking the engine 
will startle the cat and it will leave the 
engine area. 

Dogs being walked outside also 
need to be watched carcf ull y for frost­
bite on their feet, and for salt caked 
between their toes. 

Dr. Minix announces the association of 
David Garrett, M.D., cataract and glaucoma 

and 
William N. Offutt IV, M.D., cataract, corneal 

transplant and plastic surgery of the eye 

Appointments in Paintsville at Mayo Plaza. 
789-2019 1-800-273-3717 

Office visits and surgery in Paintsville. 

~ 

These are only some of several 
cold weather dangers facing animals. 
Your veterinarian can give you spe­
cific information on how much cold 
your particular animal can take with­
out danger, and on specific dangers 
in your geographic area. 

CARTER FUNERAL HOME 
Don't be afraid to ask, it's better to 

prevent than to correct. Your veteri­
narian would also rather help you 
head off dangers than to correct later 
damage. 

47 SOUTH LAKE DRIVE • PRESTONSBURG 
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You don't need to be a genius to 
save money nowadays. You can save 
just by being smart. 
That's SMART-Saving 
Money And Resources 
Together-a series of 
energy management 
programs and ideas designed 
to help you conserve energy 
and manage your electric bills 
more efficiently. 

How To Get SMARr. . 
You can start now by ordering 

your very own SMART PAC. This 
do-it-yourself starter kit will help you 
achieve greater energy efficiency in 
your home. The items in the SMART 
PAC can be easily installed in one 
evening, literally putting you on the 
SMART track overnight. 

Here's What You'll Get 
f An energy-saving showerhead 

that will save 20 to 40 gallons of water 
during a 10-minute shower. f A 15-watt 
fluorescent bulb producing as much 
light as a 60-watt conventional bulb 
while using only one quarter of the 

PHONE 886·2774 
• Pre-Need Service Available 

energy. f An insulating blanket for 
your water heater which will save as 
much as 10% of your water heating 
energy. f Two three-foot sections of 

polyethylene wrap for your hot 
water pipes that will cut the heat 

1 I 

loss between your water tank 
and the point of use. 

f Twelve insula­
. tors which will help 

reduce the heat loss 
around switch plates 

and outlets in your 
outside walls. 

It'll Cost More Not To Buy It 
The SMART PAC costs just $23, 

but it could save you about $45 a 
year on electricity costs. In fact, to 
buy these items separately would 
cost you about $40. So you see, 
saving money and resources is easy. 
You just have to use your head, and 
the SMART PAC. 

To Order SMARr PAC. 
You can begin by filling out and 

mailing the coupon below. Or call 
1-800-282-2118 toll- free. 

r-------------------------------, Please send me... Clip And Mail Check Or Money Order Payable To: 

Check One: 
OSMARTPACI at $23.00each. 
OSMARTPACII at $26.00each. 

(No water heater wrap, two light bulbs.) 

Water Heater. 
Size 0 60 gallons or Jess Q 61-81 gallons 
Fuel 0 Electric OGas 

~~il REso~ 

~~~ ~ ~ 
~ $ 

--SM 

NIAGARA, SMART PAC 
230 Route 206 
flanders, NJ 07836 
OrCall1-800-282-2118 

Name ------------------------------

Address-----------------------------

City _________________ State---Zip - --

Phone~( ----L------------------------

L-------------------------------~ 4:> 1992 American Electric Power 

April was the most dangerous 
farming month during the first half of 
'92, when five fatalities were re­
corded. Three accidents occurred in 
January. two in March and May, and 
one in June. No deaths were reported 
in February. 

SHOW TIMES: 
Friday, O:t. 16, 5 p.m -9 p.m. 
Saturday, O:t. 17, 9 am. -5 p.m. 
Surday, O:t. 18, 11 a.m -4 pm. 

1stAnnual Countn, Peddler Show-<~ ,"-<oaoo.,~~~t~""Y 
H ·~~ W y· . . 1\.\,, ~Country 

The 13 counties which reported 
farm fatalities are Adair, Barren, 

DONATE BLOOD. 
• It only hurts 

when you don't 

Present This Ad 
Receive 50~ OFF 

Adults $4.00 
2 -10 yrs $1.50 

untington, est ~a&,. Peddler 
Hunting!!>nCivicCenter 0 Show 

Off of 1-64 take Hal Greer Blvd. Exit, g_o left to 3rd avenue, 
_ go 8 blocks to the romer of 3rd and 8th street. Gviv Center on the romer 

R>r Local Information: Cabell Huntington Convention & Vistor.; Bureau (l}:t) 525-7333 
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Finding good medical care for older Americans 
Finding the best possible medical 

care, a difficult search at any time of 
life, becomes more difficult just as 
you begin to need it most: after reach­
ing age 60 or 70. 

While most older people are basi­
cally healthy and report themselves 
in good to excellent health, many 
tend to underreport specific health 
problems and mistakenly think they 
are caused by "old age" rather than 
disease. Yet old age does affect old 
people' s health, mainly by causing 
them to react differently to various 
diseases and drugs than the young. 

• Some diseases may show differ­
ent signs in older people. For ex­
ample, a heart attack may occur in an 
older person without chest pains, and 
appendicitis may occur without the 
same abdominal tenderness that a 
younger person usually experiences. 

• An older person may have sev­
eral health problems and take several 
medications at the same time. These 
often interact and cause a confusing 
array of symptoms and reactions that 
need to be considered in deciding 
upon the proper medical treatment. 

• Drugs act differently in older 
people than in the young, making 
unusual reactions from drugs more 
likely with increasing age. 

The older person needs a doctor 
who is aware of these special needs 
and problems. But finding such a 
person may be difficult because 
doctors in the United States do not 
routinely receive special training in 
the care of the elderly, relying mainly 
upon personal experience. Only re­
cently has geriatrics- the study of 
the care of the aged- begun to be 
included in medical school curricula. 
Geriatrics is not a separate medical 
specialty like pediatrics or cardiol­
ogy. 

Another problem is that many 
older people who have been treated 
by the same doctor over the years 
lose their family doctor to retirement 
or death. 

The health care of the aged should 
improve, however. The over-65 age 
group is expected to constitute 20 
percent of the population by the year 
2030 (versus 12 percent today and 4 
percent in 1900). As the number of 
older patients increases, so should 
the number of medical students and 
practicing physicians studying geri­
atrics. 

As a start towards finding a doctor 
who has a special interest in treating 
older people, you can contact your 
county medical society or state or 
local agency on aging. Other pos­
sible sources of information include 

local referral services, medical 
schools, or university medical cen­
ters. 

Dental health is an important part 
of total medical care at any age. The 
American Society for Geriatric Den­
tistry, whose goal is to maintain and 
improve the dental health of older 
people, has a listing of dentists inter­
ested in aging patients. For more 
information, write to the Society at 
1121 W. Michigan Street, Indian­
apolis, IN 46202. 

Another area of concern to older 
people is their emotional well-being. 
Thelateryearsoflifesometimesbring 
with them periods of loneliness, 
depression, or anxiety. The Ameri­
can Association of Geriatric Psychia­
try publishes a directory of psychia­
trists across the country who have 
reported an interest in treating older 
people. To obtain the names, ad­
dresses, and phone numbers of geri­
atric psychiatrists in your state, call 
the Association at ( 617) 891-3530 or 
write to them at 1440 Main Street, 
Waltham, MA 02254. 

The following checklist may help 
you in finding a new doctor or dentist 
or in evaluating your present one: 

•Are you comfortable with your 
doctor? Can you openly discuss your 
feelings, and talk about personal 
concerns such as sexual and emo­
tional problems? 

• Do you believe your doctor will 
stand by you, no matter how difficult 
your problems become? 

• Does your doctor listen to you 
and answer all your questions about 
the causes and treatment of your 
physical problems? Or is he/she 
vague, impatient, or unwilling to 
answer? 

• Does your doctor take a thor­
ough "history" on you and ask about 
past physical and emotional prob­
lems, family medical history, drugs 
you are taking, and other matters 
affecting your health? 

• Does your doctor seem to pre­
scribe drugs automatically rather than 
deal with the real causes of your 
medical problems? 

• Does your doctor attribute your 
problems to "old age?" 

• Doe~ your doctor have an associ-
ate to whom you can tum should your 
doctor retire or die? 

Unfortunately. some doctors still 
equate aging with inevitable mental 
and physical decline. Dr. Robert N. 
Butler, first director of the National 
Institute on Aging, tells of a 101-
year-old man who complained to his 
doctor about a pain in his left leg. 
"Well," said the doctor, "what can 

you expect at your age?" The man 
replied, "But doctor, my right leg 
also is 10 1, and it doesn't hurt a bit!" 

Remember that, like the man in 
the story, you are a consumer, en­
titled to ask questions when selecting 
a doctor, and to expect reasonable, 
satisfying answers, not age-worn 
cliches. 

A good doctor/patient relationship 
is based upon mutual respect and 
open communication. The doctor 

WHA TYOU'RE SAYING about 
one of my previous columns has been 
most impressive. I refer to the one 
about senior!! who want to work­
often nectl to work--but who face 
the loss of needed social security 
benefits if they do so. 

Almost everyone who wrote 
agreed that seniors who need to work 
to supplement their social security 
benefits should be allowed to do so 
without losing these payments. As 
Margaret in Missouri put it: "Let's 
not forget that over the last 20 years 
when people were supposed to be 
Raving lhr their rr.llrement, we've 
had high lnnutlon und at least two 
very serious recessions ... (also) high 
medical cosL'I. So for many of us, like 
me, social security is the only thing 
we have, and it's often not even 
enough to pay the rent ... For us, 
working is the difference between 
surviving or not ... " 

Another reader, Harold, from 
Texas said, "I feel they (the politi­
cians) don't realize how they scare 
older people by talking about it (so­
cial security) the way they do. Let 
them cut nutthednuhledippcrs ... the 
people, mostly in government, who 
get social security and other pensions 
w_e, the taxpayers, pay for ... " 

Yonni from Nevada disagreed 
with my suggestion that people who 
live on their investments (and I should 
have made it clear that I meant, who 
live very, very well!!!!) should be 
treated the same as those who depend 
on salaries or wages. That is, if the 
iatter are penalized with loss of bene­
fits, so should the former if they earn 
over a certain amount). Yanni feels 
one thing should have nothing to do 
with another, and she's persuaded 
me to come over to her side. Social 

23rd Annual 
Red, White 

& Blue 
Days 

City of Martin 
Oct. 15, 16 &. 17 

Honoring 
All Veterans! 

*Thursday, October 15-6 p.m. * 
Gospel Singing - Martin Methodist Church 
Main Street across from school 
Everybody welcome to sing. 

*Friday, Octob~r 16-Mtemoon * 
• Judging Downtown Merchant Window Display 
• Local Live Entertainment in Municipal Park 

Country Persuasions & Rhinestone Cowboys 
FOOD • GAMES • CRAFTS • CLOGGING 

*Saturday, October 17-All Day* 
8 a.m.-1 p.m., car Show in the First Guaranty Bank Lot 
1 p.m .• Flag Ralstng- Municipal Parking Lot 
Twenty-one Gun Salute-Taps 
National Anthem- Marty Green sings "Kentucky Boys" 
2 p.m., Parade Une Up-Enter by old 80 from Allen 
Meet at Our Lady of the Way Hospital 
3 p.m .• Largest Parade Ever! Bands & Floats! 
See Uncle Sam sponsored by Ffl'st Commonwealth Bank! 
'Walk for the Hungry" sponsored by God's Pantry - Trophies 
and gifts for the Walkers. Food and Drink Free. Contact 
Midge Halbert for details 886-8598 

Following Parade-Live Entertainment by 
Country Persuasions & Rhinestone Cowboys. 

FIREWORKS AT DARK! 
• Red, White & Blue Days founded by Marcella Bailey 

should allow you an active role in 
deciding when to seek medical atten­
tion, whether to accept the doctor's 
advice, and when to seek a second 
opinion from another doctor. :~nd 
you, the patient, owe your phys1c1an 
cooperation and honesty, and owe 
yourselfacontinuinginterestinseek­
ing the best medical care. 

(Information provided by Our 
Lady of the Way Hospital) 

Security is a trust compact between 
people and their government, and no 
one who is entitled to it should be de­
prived of it for any reason. She also 
makes the point that older people 
have troubleenough.gettingjobs even 
if they're ~ell qualified, (Age dis­
crimination is often hard to prove.) 

This subject has pulled a lot of 
mail and I only wish I had the room to 
cite all your comments. They're all 
interesting and informative. Please 
continue to let me know how you feel 
about this very important issue in. all 
our lives. Write to me c/o King Fea­
tures Weekly Service, 235 East 45th 
Street, New York, N.Y. 10017. 

TREATING WEAKENED 
IMMUNESYS1EMS in older people 
is an increasingly important area of 
geriatric medicine. According to the 
July, 1992 issue of "Internal Medi­
cine" magazine, exercise (under 
doctors' supervision, of course) and 
reducing stress and depression can 
enhance immunity in this age group. 
The Centers for Disease Control also 
advise elderly folks to be immunized 
routinely, including diphtheria/teta­
nus boosters every 10 years, influ­
enza A and B vaccines yearly, and a 
pneumococcal vaccine. 

CHRISTMAS SEALS~ 
THE # 1 HOPE FOR 

THE #3 KILLER: 
LUNG DISEASE. 
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Minix Eye Clinic, Inc. 
welcomes to the staff 

Maurice J. Oakley, M.D. 
eye surgeon specializing in cataract-implant, 

laser, muscle and eye surgery 
and 

Howard Crum, 0.0. 
family optometrist 

For appointment, call 

Glyn-View Shopping Center 308 Main Street 
Prestonsburg Paintsville 

886-3717 • 886-2154 78 - 717 • 78 -2 2 

Beautiful Homes ••• 

EASY TO OWN 

to qualified property owners 

• Built almost anywhere .. .in cities and remote areas. 
• Primary homes and vacation cottages by a company you can trust. 
• Jim Walter ... ln the homebuilding business since 1946 .. . more than 291,000 

homes built. 
• Instant FIXED-RATE mortgage financing. 
• Credit approval within 48 hours in most instances. 
• You pay no points or closing costs. 
• We'll also build for cash. 
• Homes built from the "shell" stage- completely finished outside, 

unfinished inside- up to 90% complete ... you do the rest, or have it done, 
to save money. 

• More than 30 models- 2to 4 bedrooms, 1, 2 & 21/2 baths, 1 & 2-story 
models. 

• More than 100 model centers open daily and on weekends. 
'In addition to offering convenient financing and 
lowest possible prices on the homes we build. 
we oMer a COMPLETION ALLOWANCE of up to 
$2,000 toward the purchase of items of permanent 
Improvement such as well , floor covenng. septic 
system, etc. A Jim Walter representative will gladly 
g1ve you details. 

·For cash paymgnt, e1ther down payment or total 
pnce, made at the t1me you agree tn purchase one 

of our homes. we'll offer you an additional credit of 
15% of the amount paid. 

• These offers may be withdrawn without notice. 
"Cambridge floor plans subject to minor changes. 
Artwork deptcts actual home and m11y include adcMions and 
personal items proYtded by the customer and/or options not 
part of our standard offenng. Shrubs and landscaping have 
been adde<j 

ICl J•m Walter Homes, Inc., 1992 Copyright strictly 

Jim~JaHe;HaMES 
The nation's largest builder of Ofloyour~OI, singte-fam1ly homes. Since 1946, 0\lel" 291,000 buitt. 

Call Toll Free 1·800·492·5837 (ASK FOR EXT. 60) 
for free brochure or visit our model home center. 

SOUTH POINT, OH LONDON,KY 
U.S. Rl52 (Macedonia Rd.) Daniel Boone Pkwy. 

Ph: 614/894-3881 WV003622 Ph: 606/878-6240 

Open 7 Days a Week. Weekend Hours- Sat. B A.M . to 6 P.M., Sun. 1 P.M. to 6 P.M. 
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THE CHOPPING BLOCK 
by Philomena Corradeno 

If you consult a spice chart, you '11 
see one spice, more than any other, 
has unlimited use: pepper, used in 
almost any food from soup to nuts 
and desserts. 

We reach for pepper so matter of 
factly that we forget we're adding 
bouquet as well as flavor. For black, 
the berries are picked when slightly 
underripe; for the less pungent white, 
when they are thoroughly ripe. 

Today's recipes include a ground 
turkey loaf with fruity sauce, and 
Chicken A vgolemono inspired by the 
classic Greek lemon soup. Leftover 
sauce may be refrigerated, covered, 
to use over vegetables. 

PEPPERED TURKEY LOAF 
2 tablespoons instant minced on-

ion. 
2 tablespoons water 
2 slices firm-textured white bread 
2 large ribs celery, cut in chunks 
1 large carrot, cut in chunks 
1/2 medium green bell pepper 
1 pound ground turkey 
1 egg, beaten 
1 can (8 ounces) tomato sauce 
1 1!4 teaspoons salt 
112 to 1 teaspoon ground black 

pepper 
Apricot Mustard Sauce* 
Preheat oven to 400F. In cup 

combine onion and water; set aside to 
soften, about 10 minutes. In food 
processor fitted with metal wing 
blade, whirl bread until crumbs form; 
transfer to a medium bowl. Process 
celery until minced (makes about2/3 
cup); add to bread. Repeat with carrot 
and green pepper (about 1/3 cup each). 
Add to bowl; add turkey, egg, tomato 
sauce, salt and black pepper; toss 
lightly just until well mixed. Place 
mixture on a baking pan; form into a 
10-inch long oval, or, place in 9 x 5 x 
3-inch loaf pan. Bake until cooked 

, through, 50 to 60 minutes. Cool in 
pan for five minutes. Serve with 
Apricot Sauce (recipe follows). 
Makes six to eight portions. 

*APRICOT MUSTARD 
SAUCE 

1 can ( 16 ounces) apricots in 
syrup, drained 

1 cup chicken broth 
2 tablesp'oons Dijon-style pre­

pared mustard 
112 teaspoon salt 
114 teaspoon ground black pep­

per 
112 teaspoon paprika 

In blender place apricots, chicken 
broth and mustard; whirl until smooth. 
Transfer to saucepan. Add salt, black 
pepper and paprika; heat until hot. 
stirring occasionally. Makes 2 1/4 
cups 

PEPPERED CIDCKEN 
AVGOLEMONO 

1 can (about 14-ounce) full-
strength chicken broth 

1 112 tablespoons cornstarch 
2 tablespoons fresh lemon juice 
1 teaspoon dill weed, crushed 

1 teaspoon ground black pepper, 
divided 

1/8 teaspoon salt 
1 egg yolk 
1/4 cup all-purpose flour 
114 teaspoon salt 
2 whole (about 1 1/2 pounds) 

boned, skinned chicken breasts (cut­
lets), halved 

I tablespoon butter or margarine 
1 tablespoon vegetable oil 
In medium saucepan combine 

chicken broth, cornstarch, lemon 
juice, dill weed, 1(2 teaspoon black 
pepper and salt Cook and stir over 
medium heat until mixture comes to 
a full boil. Reduce heat and cook one 
minute longer. In small bowl lightly 
beat egg yolk. With wire whisk blend 
three tablespoons broth mixture into 
egg yolk; whisk into saucepan. Heat 
just until hot BUT DO NOT BOIL; 
cover and set aside. In small bowl 
combine flour, salt and remaining 1/ 
2 teaspoon black pepper; mix well. 
Dredge chicken breasts in flour mix­
ture to coat both sides, shaking off 
excess. In medium skillet melt butter 
and oil over medium heat until bub­
bling. Add chicken; cook until center 
is no longer pink, three to five min­
utes on each side. Serve with re­
served sauce along with steamed rice, 
if desired. Makes four servings. 

SPANISH-STYLE BEAN 
AND SAUSAGE STEW 

1 pound Great Northern or navy 
beans 

2 tablespoons olive oil 
1/arge onion, chopped 
1/2 pound slab bacon or salt pork, 

cut in 1/4-inch pieces 
2 cloves garlic, chopped 
112 pound prosciutto or smoked 

ham, cut 1 14-inch thick 
5 cups water 
3/4 pounds dry chorizo or pepper-

oni, cut in 112-inch pieces 
1 tablespoon paprika 
2 sprigs parsley 
2 bay leaves 
1 small tomato, chopped 

112 teaspoon ground cumin 
Salt and ground red pepper to taste 
Pick over beans. With cold water, 

rinse beans in a colander. In a large 
pot. cover beans with cold water with 
two inches of water over the beans. 
Drain beans; dry pol 

Heat oil in the same pot over 
medium heat; saute onion, bacon and 
garlic until onion is wilted. Cut pros­
ciutto into one-inch pieces; add to 
pan. Add beans, water, chorizo, pa­
prika, parsley and bay leaves. 

Bring to a boil, cover, reduce heat 
and simmer 45 minutes. Add tomato, 
cumin, salt and red pepper, cook 15 
to 25 minutes more, or until beans are 
tender. Remove and discard bay 
leaves. Skim fat (if serving at once). 
Remove from heat and let stand, 
covered, fiveminutesbeforeserving. 
Serve with crusty bread. Makes six to 
eight servings. 

SPINACH-PROSCIUTTO­
MUSHROOM SALAD 

1/2 pound prosciutto, cut 118 inch 
thick 

9 cups torn fresh spinach (or Bibb 
or Boston lettuce) 

6 ounces fresh mushrooms, thinly 
sliced 

She"y Vinaigrette* 
Cut prosciutto into julienne strips, 

about 1 1(2 inches long. Place spin­
ach in large salad bowl. Toss with 
half the Sherry Vinaigrette (recipe 
follows). Arrange sliced mushrooms 
on top and sprinkle with prosciutto. 
Spoon on remaining vinaigrette. 
Serve. Makes six to eight servings. 

*SHERRY VINAIGRETTE: In 
small bowl, whisk together six table­
spoons fruity olive oil, three table­
spoons minced parsley, two table­
spoons sherry vinegar, two cloves 
garlic, minced, 1/4 teaspoon dried 
thyme leaves, and salt and pepper to 
taste. 

COUNTRY RIB BARBECUE 
2 zucchini, cut into thick diagonal 

slices 
11arge (16-ounce) can California 

cling peach halves in juice or exJra 

HOME TIPS 
THREAD SPOOLS-I keep 

empty thread spools and reuse them 
for embroidery thread. Betty S.,Phila­
delphia, Pa. 

HANDY HOLDER-I priced a 
storage container for used plastic 
shopping bags, and it was outrageous! 
I decided to make my own. 

I cut an opening in a two-liter 
plastic soda bottle below the neck 
about an inch wide and three inches 
long-large enough to stuff the bags 
into. 

Then I cut another similar open­
ing about two inches from the bottom 
for removing the stored bags. I roll 
the bags from the bottom to eliminate 
the air in them. The capacity of a 
single bottle is more than adequate 
and takes very little space on a shelf. 

I like the organization it gi~es my 

kitchen. I hope others can use it, too. 
Gina B., Rochester, N.Y. 

SUBSTITUTE CLEANER­
The other day while cleaning the 
house, I was just about to do all the 
mirrors when I realized I had run out 
of glass cleaner. My husband sug­
gested I use the windshield wiper 
fluid we have for our cars. I filled up 
my spray bottle and went to work. All 
I can say is, I married a brjlliant man, 
because the fluid worked perfectly! 
Regina F., Chatfield, Minn. 

HANDY PHONE BOOK­
When moving to a new town, take 
your old phone book along. I've found 
that I needed numbers and addresses 
several months after moving from 
my former residence. The old phone 
book came in handy. MariaL.,Jason­
ville, Ind . 
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• • OffERS GOOD THRU OCT. 31 WHITE/DARK COMBINATION • 

•1 pt. Mashed Potatoes 
elfz pt. Gravy •1 pt. Cole Slaw 
•4 Buttermilk Biscuits 

K FC. U 5 E S 0 N L r 

• • • • 
EVERY • • 
DAY •: 

100% VEGETABLE OIL I 

• •• •• •• • • •• • • • • • • 
• Wednesday CHECK • "Gotto Have It" 

• • n •• 
• • • 
• I •: • • •• • • • . 9 .. • • • • • • • •• • 9·. •a • •• • • . - . 
• • Offers Good At These Locations: N b d , C . , iJ : • 
• • •Grayson •Ashland •Russell •Prestonsburg 0 0 Y S 00k1n - • • 
• • •Pike.ville •Hazard •J.ack~on Like Today's KFC • • 

• •Burlington, 0. •Galllpohs, 0. • • • : 

• Special FOR OUR I I Popcor • DAILY • • 
• (Special Good All Day, Every Wednesday) Chicken • IN-STORE I 
• 3 PC. DINNER • 
• SPECIALS! • •3 pes. KFC Chicken •Cole Slaw $1.9 • •Mashed Potatoes & Gravy •Biscuit Small 
• 

E~co~ • $2.99 $5 .• 9 • Large • -

light syrup 
3 pounds country pork spareribs 
3/4 cup catsup 
1/3 cup honey 
3 tablespoons prepared mustard 
2 tablespoons cider vinegar 
1 tablespoon grated fresh ginger 
1 large clove garlic, minced 
2 firm tomatoes 
6 large mushrooms 
Blanch zucchini in boiling water 

three minutes; drain well; set aside. 
Drain peaches, reserving all liq­

uid. Place ribs on charcoal grill about 
six inches from source of heat; cover 
and cook slowly, about one hour, 
turning occasionally. Or place ribs 
on oven broiler rack and bake at 350F. 
one and one half hours, turning occa­
sionally. Combine reserved peach 
liquid with catsup, honey, mustard, 
vinegar, ginger and garlic. Bring to a 
boil in small saucepan. Boil five 
minutes, stirring frequently. Brush 
ribs with sauce last 20 minutes of 
grilling or 3/4 hour of baking. Cut 
each tomato into six wedges and 
thread them on metal or WET bam­
boo skewers, along with zucchini 
slices, peach halves, and mushrooms. 
Grill or bake last 10 minutes of ribs' 
cooking time, brushing generously 
with sauce. Makes five or six serv­
ings. 

BARBECUED QUARTERED 
DUCKLING 

1 (4- to 6-pound) frozen whole 
duckling 

2 (8-oz.) cans tomato sauce 
1!2 cup finely minced onion 
2 teaspoons sugar 
1/2 teaspoon salt 
Dash black pepper 
1 tablespoon vinegar 
1 tablespoon Worcestershire 

sauce 
Few drops liquid smoke season­

ing 
Thaw duckling in the refrigerator 

in its original package for 24 hours. 
Remove giblets and neck from body 
cavity. Wash, drain and pat dry with 
paper towels. Cut into quarters. Score 
skin with a sharp knife at one-inch 
intervals over entire surface. 

In. saucepan, combine tomato 
sauce, onion, sugar, salt, pepper, 
vinegar, Worcestershire and liquid 
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smoke seasoning. Bring to boil. 
Reduce heat and simmer, covered, 
about 20 minutes, stirring occasion­
ally. Cool. (If made in advance, store 
in covered jar in refrigerator.) Meas­
ure out 1/2 cup of sauce; cover and 
refrigerate. Pour remaining sauce into 
a bowl or zipper lock plastic bag and 
marinate duckling, refrigerated, for 
at least one hour, turning bird two or 
three times. 

Arrange hot coals at back of fire 
box. Place a foil drip pan with 1/2 
inch of water in front of briquettes. 
Cook duckling over drip pan for 2 1/ 
2 to three hours during which time 
more coals may be added to fire box. 
Bird is done when drumstick feels 
very soft when pressed between pro­
tected fingers and instant meat ther-
mometer registers 165F. Brush re­
served sauce occasionally over bird 
during last 30 minutes of cooking. 
For crisper skin, turn duckling over 
midway through grilling. Serves four. 

WOOD 
LAWN 

BUILDINGS 

WE DOlT ALL! 
FROM . 

ESTIMATES TO 
INSTALLATION 

'TO EASY 
ANANCE PLANS 

• Many styles to choose from 
• You paint to maiiCh your home 

environment 
• Wood floor included 
• Financing plans to fit your 

needs 
Free 

In-Horne 
Estimate 
u.s. 23 North 

Pre1ton1burg, Ky. 
886-8135 

E. B. Gevedon, M.D. 
Allergic Disorders of Adults & Children 

• Sinus Disorders • Asthma 
• Allergic Disorders of the Eye • Bronchitis 
• Allergic Disorders of the Ear 
• Allergic Disorders of the Throat 
• Bee Sting Testing 

• Food Allergies 
• Skin Allergies 
• Antibiotic Testing 

M~jor Insurances Accepted 
New patients now being accepted. 
Please call for more information. 

Family Allergy Services, Inc. 
E.B. Gevedon, M.D. 
Allergy and Immunology 
Specialist 
Medical Plaza at Mid-town 
1205 Montgomery Avenue 
Ashland, Kentucky 41101 
(606) 324-4222 or 324-4223 

SAFE 
TRICK OR TREAT 

Sunday, October 25th, 5:00 p.m.-7:00p.m. 

~oM1r~ ~Y\1\: Prestonsburg 

. . Parents, bring your kids! Kids, bring your parents! 
• Fill up your trick-or-treat bag with safe treats from dozens of area sponsors. 
• See the ~-new Fantasy Land (signing guides will be available for hearing impaired children . 
Jbe area IS also wheelchair accessible) . 

• For children up to 12 years old. 
• Please bring one can of food per child as an entry fee. All canned foods will be donated to God's 

Pantry. 

Safe Trick or Treat is an annual event sponsored by the Rotary Club The Holiday Inn and area 
individuals and businesses. ' ••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• •••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••a•••••••m••••~-----------------------------------~ 
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SHOP HERE FOR A 

Prestonsburg • Phone 886-9005 
Prices good October 14 thru October 17,1992 

Open: 7 a.m.·10 p.m., Mon. thru Sat. 
9 a.m.·9 p.m., Sunday 

FROZEN 

YOUNG TURKEY 

We reserve the right to 
limit quantities and 

correct printing 
errors. 

LAY'S 

SLICED BOLOGNA ........................... 12 oz. 
USDA 
STEAKS/PORTERHOUSE OR T-BONE .................. LB. 

FARM FRESH 
PORK STEAKS ............................................. La. 

BREAST · 

LB. 

COUNTRY PRIDE 59¢ 
CUT-UP FRVERS ....................................... La. 

LAY'S QUICKSTART 69¢ 
FRANKS OR BOLOGNA .......... 12 oz. 
LAn 9¢ 
SLICED HAMIDEWXE OR RED PEPPER ... 5 oz. 

LAn~~ 9¢ 
SMOKED COOKED HAM .......... a oz. 

un 9¢ 
BOLOGNAsTJcK oR CHUNK ............................ LB. 

~BQ SPARE RIBS ................................... La. 349 

DIXIE BELLE --~ c .J 

¢ 

DOUBLE 
COUPONS 

Tuesdays 
and 

Sundays 

(CREAMY OR 
CRUNCHY) JUMBO ROLL 

18 oz. 160Z. 

GROCERY ITEMS 
RALSTQH 9¢ CORN FLAKES_. 111~ 

CRISCO 17 VEGETABLE OIL ~ 

119 DOfiiNO 

SUGAR/POWDERED OR 2LB. 

NESTLE I 
SEMI-SWEET MORSELS 

89 

GRAPE JELLy·-·--·-·----·--··· --2 LB. 
109 
f$1 BUSH 

HOMINY /WifTE OR GOlDEN 

ARMOUR 
1U~ 89¢ CHILl W/BEANS 

IUVES 9¢ CAT FOOD 
HOSPITWTY 9¢ STUFFING/CIICKEH OR CORNBREAD ~ • oz. 

TV .,._10.75 oz. 5¢ TOMATO SOUP_ 
RAINBOW 
APPLE SAUCE 11 ~ 9¢ 

., 
:a 
m 
en 
:J: 

¢ 
SLB. 

FROZEN 
RAINBOW 

POT PIES 

7 oz. 

TV 

7¢ 
JENO'S 

PIZZAS 

7.4 oz. 

WAFF·LES 

10PK 129 

DAIRY 
KRAFT 

¢ 

¢ 

FRESH 
GREEN CABBAGE 

1l 
:tJ 
0 
c 
c: 
0 
m 

PARKAY MARGARINE~-~ 

BABY 
SWISS 

LB. 359 
. . 

LB. 5¢ 

DELl · . 
HAM 

SALAD 

LB. 349 

APPLE 
FRITTERS 

4/$1 
TRY OUR NEW ICE CREAM CAKES FOR YOUR NEXT SPECIAL OCCASION 

QUARTERS 

¢ 
LB. PK. 

TV 

..---- ----.... CREAM CHEESE 
!'. '\. 

~ 7 ¢ ,\~ 
8 oz. 

TV 

BISCUITS 
(HOMESTYLE OR BUTTERMILK) 

¢ 
4 PK • 



~62 STEP SIDE CHEV­
ROLET PICKUP. Every­
thing original, except mir­
rors. Good condition. Also, 
two 14" mud grip mounted 
wheels with spikes and older 
modei"New Holland Bailer" 
in good condition. Call886-
3106. 

1974 CHEVROLET BUS. 
54-passenger. Good condi­
tion. $650. Phone: 886-
~4. 

AUCTION SALE: Every 
Wednesday night at 7. Mt. 
Parkway Flea Market. An­
tiques, furniture, ceramics, 
much moral 

"GONE WITH THE WIND" 
limited edition collector 
dolls. New 1992 series. 

Also, President Bush 
~ and Governor Clinton 

Election '92 collector 
pocket knives. 

Thomas Hereford Building 
Downtown Prestonsburg 

FALL CLEARANCE 
AUCTION 

SATURDAY, 
OCT. 17, 10 A.M. 

STALLARD MARTIN, 
AUCTIONEER 

large work desks; office 
desks; tables; cabinets; 

~a chairs; dividers; shelving; 
carpeting; wood flooring; 

bolt upholstery; paint 
and stain. 

AT BARGAIN OUTLET 
ST. JUDE CHURCH 

LOUISA, KY 
On Mayo Trail Ad #2566 
off Hwy. 3 at "Southern 
States· sign. Phone 

606-638-020 1. 

CAMPER TOP FOR LWB 
wide bed, full size pickup, 
~5; 1980 Hon craw cab 
Chevy 4 WD pickup, $1,500; 
one Angus bull and one 
Angus heifer (eight months 
old). Call358-2278 or 358-
4291 (mornings or leave 
massage). 

KILL ROACHES 
Buy ENFORCER OvarNita® 
Roach Spray, or OvarNita® 
Past Control Concentrate. 
Makes 2 gallons. Kill 
roaches overnight or your 
money back; GUARAN­
'ltEDI Available at Sandy 
Valley Hardware, U.S. 23, 
lvel, Kentucky. 

CORN FOR SALE: Near 
U.S. 23 intersection at Al­
len, Kentucky. Call606-874-
2238. 

FOR INTERNAL PARA­
SITES, tender pads, and ear 
problems, ask BROOKS 
PHARMACY, 478-2273, 
about TRIVERMICIDE, 
PADKOTE, MITEX & EAR 
~NKER POWDER. Avail­
able 0-T-C. 

''"·. :. ·: ;.·:·:.: -:· .... ::,:' ::· ~·::::;.:·::·:.::·::·: : '::.::' 

GUNS FOR SALE 
.25 automatics, regularly 

$69.95---flow $49.95. 
Derringers regularly 

$69.95-also $49.95. 
New .20 guage shotgun, 

full choke, regularly 
$119.95-now $89.50. 

Ruger Black Hawk Caliber 
30 M-1 Carbine, 7 112 inch 
barrel, was $349.95- now 
$299.95. Tach 9 assualt 

pistol with 32 round mag and 
hard case, was $349.95-

now $229. Tokarev 9 
mm automatic pistol, blue 
finish, was $189.95-now 
$159.95; chrome finish, 

was $229.95---flow $189.95. 
For more information 

call Buffalo Run, located 
near the German Bridge 

Campground, at874-9166. 

FOR SALE: Monogram 
machine, $1,500. Also, 
hand made quilts, $200 
each. Call 886-2186. 

FOR SALE: Pop upcampar. 
1987 model with sink, stove, 
icebox. Good tires. Excel­
lent condition. Extra clean. 
Call 886-1 01 2, ask for Don. 

FOR SALE: King size wa­
terbed. Almost new. $75. 
Call886-8637. 

FOR SALE: Trailer doors 
and Lifetime picnic tables. 
Phone: 874-2935 or 874-
0141. 

FOR SALE: Nintendogame 
deckwithtwogames. Phone 
886-8911. 

FOR SALE: Utility trailers. 
4x8, 5x8, 6 1/2 x16. Great 
for hauling 4-whaalars,lawn 
mowers, cars, etc. Call ~85-
9901. 

FOR SALE: King size wa­
terbed with overhead mir­
rors, bookshelf headboard 
and drawers underneath. All 
equipment included. Excel­
lent condition. Also, crib bed 
that converts into youth bed. 
Good condition. Call 886-
6591. 

FOR SALE: Wolff 24SX 
tanning bed with supplies. 
Less than 1 ,000 hours. 
Serious inquiries only. 
$2,000. Call 377-6672. 

FOR SALE: One used MSI 
(SunJat)tanning bed. Good 
condition. Less than 2,000 
hours. $2,000 firm. Phone 
874-9538. 

HOUSE COAL FOR SALE: 
Call 2!35-3053 for more in­
formation. 

PIANO FOR SALE: Late 
model. Call 886-6686. 
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886-8506 ' 

NIGHTLINE 
Place your ad after 
normal business hours. • 
Leave a message, we'll call you back. AFTER 5 P.M. 

HOUSE COAL FOR SALE. 
Block or lump coal. We 
deliver! Phone 874-2042. 

HOUSE COAL FOR SALE. 
Hand picked. Block or 
Stoker (treated). Delivered. 
Call 886-6318. 

ONE FIREPLACE WITH 
BLOWER, mantle and 
harth--ready to install; one 
2 112 ton Lennox heat pump 
with thermostat. Call 886-
6900, 9-5; or 87 4-9327 after 
6. 

lr 

REDUCED TO $119,000 
located at Harold, near 
the Bank Josephine, the 
almost like new home 

has four bedrooms, and 
consists of 2,200 sq. ft. 

with two baths, family room 
and is very well decorated. 
Call REAL ESTATE INC. 

for more information 
at432-6161. 

CABIN AND LOT FOR 
SALE. Five minutes from 
Cava Run Lake. $1 0,000. 
Call 606-447-2506, eve­
nings. 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Four bedroom, 1 112 bath 
brick home. Central heaV 
air, fireplace, two outbuild­
ings. Four acres of land. 
Ten minutes from 
Prestonsburg. $57,000. Call 
886-6788. 

FOR SALE: 2-apartment 
house on Wastminister 
Street, Prestonsburg. Cen­
tral heat and air. Large lot. 
Good rental property or nice 
home. Phone: 377-1062 or 
377-6716. 

I( 

FOR SALE ON LAND FOR SALE: House at 
CONTRACT. A-Frame McDowell, Rt. 122. Located 
house under construction on across from Pic-Pac and 
Rt. 80 between post office. Plenty of living 
Prestonsburg-Martin. Fin- space. Price negotiable. 
ish yourself. Wonderful Free gas. Call377-2431 or 
opportunity for first time 452-2224. 
home buyer. For details 
phone 886-6900, Ron Fra-
sure. 

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
house on Highland Avenue 
in Prestonsburg. Newly 
remodeled. $19,500. Call 
886-2541 or 297-4223 after 
5. 

11 
~~ r. If' I~· 

FOR SALE: Threebedroom 
house. Large yard. New 
roof and new vinyl siding. 
Located in Wheelwright. Call 
886-6051. 

~~ ~ll l'r-~~ ~D I~ ~~~ ~~ r I~ ~~ 
.. _. 

rf~ ~ ~ ~ I~ 1-1 I'~ ~~ ~~~ ~ ~ ~A ~: 
foo. 

~~ r~ 
~ ~~ 

~ [j 
~~ , ... , .. 

r- 10 
~~· ~to ... ~lr l4~! ~~ 

FOR SALE: Two 3 bed­
room homes. One is lo­
cated near Porter Photogra­
phy on U.S 23, Watergap; 
other is located one mile 
north of Floyd Funeral Home 
(near power J')lant) on U.S. 
23, Prestonsburg. For more 
information call 886-3859 
anytime. 

-~ 
~ 

HOURS: 
9:00- 6:00 Monday- Saturday 

1 :oo -6:00 Sunday 

EVERYTHING $1.00, INC. 
MATT'S DISCOUNT OUTLET 

Located in Coal Run Section • 839 North Mayo Trail 
Pikeville, KY 41501 

(606} 437-9100 

Joe Tate- President 
Nina Tate- Manager 

A al E Alteratisas 
Allen, Ky. 

Phone 874-8151 

DONNA CASTLE has Joined A & E Alterations. DONNA 
has had 10 years experience In St'Wing and alterations. Give 
us a call or bring things ln. Store hours: 7:30 a.m.-4:00p.m. 
Mon.-Fri. Ask for: Donna Castle or Evelan C. Akers. 

(1"' I'~ 
~:n '~ -... -

AoAMS CoNSTRUCTION CoMPANY 
Featuring Decorative Pea-Gravel, Ready Mix, Gravel & 
Sand: various sizes of stone for 

• DRIVEWAY • LANDSCAPING • RECLAMATION 
• RETAINER WALLS 

Call Dotty Duncan - Superintendent 
at 874-2991 

or stop by the office located on U.S. 23 South at Allen. 
Free Estimates - Haul Bill Extra 

HEY LOOI\.! 
Scott's Furniture and Carpet. Midnight 
Movers. You call-we haul. Lots of new and 
used furniture, appliances and antiques. 

Located on Rt. 122 
2 1/2 miles above Martin. 

I AM CARGO INSURED!!! 

Phone: 285·.J705 

Coral Reef 
Pet Ceater 

1324 South Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 

I We offer Day Care Services for your Pet. I 
Open 6 daya a week-7 a.m.-5 p.m. 

Deanna Hicks, Groomer/OWner 
886-8063 

·~ 

THE BODY SHOPPE 
Fitness Center 

Bevinsville, Ky. 

452-9595 
Open 6 days a week-11 a.m.-9 p.m. 

Monthly Rat&-$4000 per person 

6 Toning Tables and other 
exercising equipment 

Aeroblc.-3 dsy• s WHk 

Owned and operated by Wilma McKay 

r---------------, 
I DeShea's Beauty Salon I 
: Formerly the Red Carpet Beauty Salon : 

I $1 0.00 off on all I 
I Perms, the month of October I 
I I 
I Redkin • Scruples • Zoto's I 

: Owned & Operated by Karen Ward : 

1 Bring In Coupon. 886-2777 .J 
._ ______________ _ 

Mountain Service 
-~~-~874-0213 
t. "--' Spectan.,. ...... in Heating 

~jt·o,'j ...... ~ A/C. Refrigeration, 
Appllance 

and Electrical Repairs. 
Commercial/Residential 

24-Bour Emergency Service 
James W. Daniel, Jr.-owner/Operator 

12 Years Experience 

HALBERT'S VINYL SIDING 
&GUTTERS 

Box 314 

Martin, Kentucky 41649 

Vinyl Siding, Gutters, Roofing & Dry Wall 
(606) 358-9581 

358-9773 DON HALBERT 

THE AFFORDABLE 
MERCHANDISE SHOP 

Is now in the old Dollar Store beside Shopwise 

Small line of new clothing and accessorleal 
Good and gently used clothing. 

Stop in at the 

AFFORDABLE MERCHANDISE SHOP 
or Call 285-9476 

HIGH LIFE ESTATES, PIN­
HOOK: Large home on a 
nice secluded lot. Forest 
setting and beautiful view. 
Located off 4-lane (U.S. 23) 
between Pikeville/ 
Prestonsburg. Very nice 
subdivision. Last house on 
dead end street. 5,000 sq. 
ft. includes large garage, 
workshop and storage room. 
Decking and more. Asking 
$150,000. Must see to 
appreciate. Call for appoint­
ment, 478-2676. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Lo­
cated in Betsy Layne. Two 
bedrooms, large utility room, 
living room and kitchen. 
$29,500. Call 478-4290. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: West 
Prestonsburg. Nice two 
bedroom. Carpet, central 
air. Good rental. Priced for 
quick sale. $31,900. Ca!l 
606-887-4 731. 

LAND FOR SALE: Four 
acres (more or less) bottom 
land. Dwale. Call874-9790. 

LOTS FOR SALE: Middle 
Creek area. Call Bill Stumbo, 
606-886-1907. 

UNFINISHED CABIN FOH 
SALE on 1.4 acre lot on Cava 
Run Lake near Long Bow 
Marina. $6,900. Also have 
lots for sale. Phone: 768-
2374. 

WAYLAND. TWO BED­
ROOM HOME FOR SALE. 
Some appliances and furni­
ture. $16,200. Front Street. 
Must see. No phone calls 
please. 

1984 DODGE CONVERT­
IBLE. White, automatic. 
$2,300. Call874-2332 after 
5. 

~ 
MasterCard 
'-X.../ 

1984 DODGE TURBO Z. 
Black. $2,500. Call 452-
2818. Also, 1982 6-cylinder 
4WD Chevrolet. Good con­
dition. Radio , heater. 
$1,350. Call377-6280. 

BAD CREDIT? NO 
CREDIT? Turned down for 
auto loans at other car deal­
ers? We will arrange low 
cost financing even if you 
have been turned down 
before. No co-signers nec­
essary. Phone applications 
accepted. For more details 
call Mr. Green, 437-6282. 

FOR SALE: 1987 Honda 
Accord. Hatchback. Blue, 
automatic, power windows. 
56,000miles. Call 874-8113 
after 5 p.m. 

FOR SALE: 1985 Toyota 
Mini Van LE. Double sun­
roofs. All the extras! Call 
886-9956 for details. 

FOR SALE OR RENT 
Three bedroom ranch style 
brick home. Refrigerator, 
stove, washer and dryer. 
Located two miles up Brandy 
Keg Road. Deposit required. 
Serious inquiries on ly. 
Phone 886-6824. 

COMMERCIAL BUILDING 
FOR RENT OR LEASE. 
5,040 sq. ft. Martin. 285-
3404. 

COMMERCIAL BUILDING 
FOR RENT or lease. Lo­
cated on Abbott Road, just 
off new Rt. 23. $395/month. 
Call886-8187 (days) or 886-
2166 (evenings). 

FOR RENT: Near college. 
Unique one bedroom apart­
ments. Furnished and un­
furnished. L~ase, security 
depos~ and references 
required. No pets! 886-
3565. 

FOR RENT: Downtown 
Prestonsburg. Two bed­
room apartment and one 
bedroom efficiency apart­
ment. HeaVair, washer/ 
dryar, all utilities paid. Call 
377-1 062 anytime. 

FOR RENT: Newly painted 
and remodeled two bedroom 
house with garage. Central 
heat and air, refrigerator, 
stove, washer and dryer. 
Near intersection of U.S. 23 
and Rt. 1428 at New Allen. 
Deposit required. No pats. 
Phone: 886-9988 or 886-
0003 after 6. 



D2 Wednesday, October 14, 1992 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The following items will 

be offered for sale at Public 
Auction on October 16, 1992 
at 1 0:00 a.m. at Hilltop 
Machinery located on U.S. 
23 North of Paintsville, KY 
41240. 

Fiat Allis Dozer 14C 
S#019305 

·1985 Chevrolet Dump 
Truck Model CC70064 
Kodiak S#7755 

All items are sold "as is­
where is". Seller reserves 
the right to bid and to reject 
any or all bids. Items are to 
be paid fallowing the sale, or 
satisfactory arrangements 
are made with seller. An­
nouncement at sale takes 
priority over ad. Purchaser 
to pay all taxes and transfer 
fees. 

THE BANK JOSEPHINE 
COLLECTION 
DEPARTMENT 

W-10/17, 10/14, F-10/9 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

FOR RENT: Furnished two 
bedroom house at Harold. 
$250/month plus $200 de· 
posit. Utilities not included. 
Call Greg Campbell at 87 4-
2052. 

FOR RENT: Three bed­
room, 1 112 bath trailer on 
Mt. Parkway. Call886-3451. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
mobile home in good condi­
tion. Large yard and out­
building. Call 886-9007. 

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
apartment. Conveniently 
located. Central heat/air. 
Reasonable rate. Deposit 
and references required. 
Call 886-2244. 

ONE BEDROOM APART­
MENT FOR RENT. 
Prestonsburg. Furnished, 
utilities paid. $31 0/month. 
Call 886-6900. 

PRESTONSBURG. One 
bedroom furnished apart­
ment. $400 per month utili­
ties paid, plus $200 security 
deposit. Phone 886-8944 
or after 6 phone 886-001 0. 

TAKING APPLICATIONS 
FOR TWO BEDROOM 
APARTMENTS. Located at 
Eastern. Call 358-9142. 

TOWN HOUSE FOR RENT: 
Two bedroom. $350/month 
plus deposit. Call Goble 
Lumber, 874-9281. 

TO MINE 
Pursuant To Application 

Number 436-5074, 
Operator Change 

In accordance with 405 
KAR 8:010, notice is hereby 
given that JAM Coal Com­
pany, Inc., P.O. Box 320, 
McDowell, KY 41647 intends 
to revise permit number436-
5074 to change the opera­
tor. The operator presently 
approved in the permit is 
JAM Coal Company, Inc. 
The new operator will be S & 
H Coal Company, Inc., HC 
80, Box 1 070, Dema, Ken­
tucky 41859. 

FOR RENT: Office space. TRAILER FOR RENT: Un-
2.400 sq. ft. with parking. furnished. Two bedroom. 
Burl W. Spurlock, 886-2321. Sah Licit Call358-4524after 

The operation is located 
1.60 miles southeast of 
Orkney in Floyd County. The 
operation is approximately 
1.5 miles southeast from 
Spewing Camp Branch 
Road's Junction with KY 
122. The operation is located 
on the McDowell U.S.G .S. 7 
1/2 minute quadrangle map 
at latitude 3711 24' 40", and 
longitude 822 43' 22". 

FOR RENT: Trailer space 
located across bridge at 
Harold. Call 432-5415 or 
432-2311, ask for Peggy. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
trailer at Corn Fork. No HUD. 
No pets. $100 deposit re­
quired. Call 886-0631. 

FOR RENT: Furnished 
trailer. 1 1/2 miles west of 
Prestonsburg. Phone 886-
9973. 

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
efficiency apartment. Nice 
neighborhood. Centrally 
located. Utilities included. 
No pets. Phone: 886-6320. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Five 
bedrooms. McDowelL Gas 
heat. Private. $350/month. 
References and deposit 
required. Call 886-6686. 

5. 

TRAILER FOR RENT OR 
SALE: Stumbo Hollow. 
$190/month, gas and water 
included. Call 886-6713. 

TRAILER FOR RENT: Two 
bedroom. Located in 
Prestonsburg on nice cor­
ner lot near Prestonsburg 
Community College. $300/ 
month plus deposit. 886-
1414. 

TRAILERS FOR RENT: 
One furnished; one partially 
furnished. Depositrequired. 
Nopets. Call874-8151;after 
5 call874-2114. 

TWO BEDROOM FUR­
NISHED TRAILER on Bull 
Creek. $300/month (utili­
ties paid). $100 security 
deposit. Call 874-9802. 

The application has been 
filed for public inspection at 
the Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement's Prestons­
burg Regional Office, 1346 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. Writ­
ten comments or objections 
must be filed with the Direc­
tor, Division of Permits, #2 
Hudson Hollow, U.S. 127 
South, Frankfort, Kentucky 
40601. All comments or 
objections must be received 
within fifteen (15) days of 
today's date. W-10/14 

TWO-STORY COUNTRY 
HOME FOR RENT. Unfur­

LARGE TWO BEDROOM nished. Three bedroom, two 
APARTMENT FOR RENT. large baths. Call886-61 01. 
MountainParkway. Washer/ 
dryer hookup. Private. 

~~~~~month. Phone 886- ·,ffJfip.[qyffi~fl'f".f 

.::-~-:,.:,_·-i:~·:va/JaB1~::::i:!::i ·:·:•: 
School-Based Decision Making 
At Betsy Layne Elementary School 

On September 21, 1992 the teachers of Betsy layne Elementary School 
elected by a 213 vote to enter into school based decision making under 
section 14 of the Kentucky Education Reform Act of 1990. Two (?l 
parents will be elected by parent members of our PTA to serve on thts 
SBDM council. 
Parent council members shall be a paren~ stepparent or legal guardian 
of a student currently enrolled in the school and shall not be the relative 
of a school employee. Relative shall mean father, mother, brother, 
sister, son·in-law or daughter -in-law. Parent council members shall not 
be district employees. 
A nomination form is available at the school office. It contains the 
qualifications as defined by the law and our district policy. Nominations 
must be submitted in writing to the principal at the school fiVe (5) school 
days prior to this election. Nomination deadline is October 15th, 1992, 
4 p.m. If you have any questions, contact Fonzo Akers, school princip~ 
at 478·9751 or the PTA president, Dale Morton at 478-4354. Thts 
election is scheduled for October 20th, 1992 at7:00 p.m. in the cafete­
ria of Betsy layne Elementary School. 

LEGAL NOTICE 

$500 WEEKLY, NEW! 
EASY I 

Stay home, any hours. 
Easy Assembly, $21,000; 
Easy Sewing, $36,600; Easy 
Wood Assembly, $98, 755; 
Easy Crafts, $76,450; Easy 
Jewelry, $19,500; Easy 
Electronics, $26,200; Match­
making, $62,500; Investigat­
ing, $74,450; TV Talent 
Agent, $40,900; Romance 
Agent, $62,500. No selling. 
Fully guaranteed. FREE 
information. 24-hour hoi­
line. 801-379-2900, Copy­
right #KY165YH. 

In accordance with Chapter 65 and 424 of the Kentucky Revised Statutes the following 
information and supporting data may be inspected by the general public at Floyd County 
Extension Office, 106 Courthouse Annex, Prestonsburg, KYon 10/14-16, 1992 between 
the hours of 7:30a.m. and 4:00p.m. 
Floyd County Extension District Board 
Billy Merritt, Chairman, Floyd County Extension District Board, HC 70, Box 8035, 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653. 

Board Members: 
Vice Chairman: Donald Hicks, 87 W. Old MCr., Prestonsburg, KY 
Secretary: Dorothy Harris, HC 72, Box 197, East Point, KY 
Treasurer: Kermit Howard, Box 164, Dwale, KY 
County Judge Executive: John M. Stumbo, Courthouse Annex, Prestonsburg, KY 

SUMMARY FINANCIAL STATEMENT 
FOR FISCAL PERIOD 07/01/91 to 06/30/92 

Beginning Cash on Hand (date) ••..•.•••.•••••••••••••••••••••.••..•.••.•• $ 72.317,08 
Building Fund .................................................... $114,156.43 

Receipts 
Property Taxes ......................................... $ 77.217.83 
Assessments ........... . ................................ $ __ _ 
User Fees ................................................ $ __ _ 
Miscellaneous .... . .. . .................................... $ 8.286,17 

Total Receipts .......... $ 85,504,00 
Expenditures 

Administration ........................................... $ 29.651.22 
Salaries ................................................... $ 28,673,22 
Operations ................................................... $ __ _ 
Debt Retirement. ................................................ $ _ _ _ 
Other ............................................................... $ _ _ _ 

Total Expenditures ..... $ 58,324,44 

E d. B 1 e (date) $213.653.07 n 1ng aanc ............................................................... .. 

1, the undersigned, Treasurer of Floyd CountY'{)istrict Cooperative Extension Education 
Fund hereby certify that the above is a true and correct record of the accounts of the Floyd 
Coun'ty District Cooperative Extension Education Fund, Prestonsburg, Kentucky as of 
Sept. 30, 1992 

Kermit R. Howard, Treasurer 
Floyd County District 
Cooperative Extension Education Fund 

Subscribed and sworn to before me by the foregoing Affiant, Kermit R. ~oward, this 30 d~y 
·f Sept 1992 My commission expires: March 23, 1993. Molly Chaffins, Notary Public, 0 

· • · W-10/14 State of Kentucky at large. 
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TWO LPNs. FULL TIME. 
One 3rd shift; and one 
relief for 2nd and 3rd. 

Paid benefits. Forty bed 
nursing home in Berea, 
Kentucky. Calf 606-986-
4710, Berea Health Care 

Center. 

WANTED 
Hard working Sales 

Associate and Assistant 
Manager. Apply in person 
Wednesday or Thursday 

only at the Shoe 
Department, Dawahares, 

Downtown Pikeville. 

PARK RANGERS 
Game wardens, security, 
maintenance, etc. No expe­
rience necessary. For infor­
mation call 219-769-6649, 
ext. 7619, 8 a.m.-8 p.m. 7 
days. 

$200-$500 WEEKLY 
Assemble products at home. 
Easy! No selling. You're 
paid direct. Fully guaran­
teed. FREE information. 24 
hourhotline. 801-379-2900, 
Copyright #KY165DH. 

EARN EXTRA MONEY 
FOR CHRISTMAS. Now 
taking applications for Avon 
Representatives. Call Jan­
ice at 452-4344. 

HURRICANE WORKERS 
NEEDED NOW! Both men 
and woman for skilled and 
unskilled jobs. High income 
potential. For information 
call 1-602-837-9554, ext. 
0185. 

INSURANCE AGENTS 
AND SALES MANAGER 
POSITIONS AVAILABLE. 
No experience necessary. 
Will train. Call for appoint­
ment, 874-9897 or 874-
0115. 

NIGHT DRIVER NEEDED. 
COL preferred but not nec­
essary. Starting salary $5/ 
hour. 1-2 days per weak. 
Must ba at least 30 to apply. 
Prestonsburg/Pikeville/Haz­
ard areas. Call 615-790-
6313, if no answer please 
leave message. 

PART TIME TELE· 
MARKETING. Evenings. 
Exceptional telephone skills 
required. May lead to full 
time position. Call886-001 0, 
ask for Greg. 

TIRED OF ASKING YOUR 
HUSBAND FOR MONEY? 
Sell Avon and make your 
own. Call Janey at 886-
2082. 

WANTED: Lady to live in 
with elderly couple. Every­
thing furnished with nice 
salary. Call587-2243 after 
4 p.m.; if no answer call587-
1065. 

WANTED: Lady to live with 
elderlywoman. Lighthouse­
keeping. For more informa­
tion call 886-9626. 

Employment 
AvailafJ/e 

WANTED: Reliable person 
to stay with elderly lady in 
Prestonsburg area. Call 
452-4138. 

AKC REGISTERED GER­
MAN SHEPHERD puppies 
for sale. All shots and 
wormed. $150 each. Call 
874-9281, days; 874-2318, 
evenings. 

FREE KITIENS TO GOOD 
HOME. Healthy and cared 
for. Call 886-3538, if no 
answer try evenings, nights 
or weekends. 

ROTTWEILER PU.PS FOR 
SALE. AKC registered. Four 
weeks old. Had shots and 
have been wormed. Call 
358-9444. 

CARPORT SALE: 118 East 
Graham. Thursday-Friday, 
October 15-16. 

YARD SALE: Now through 
Friday, October 16. Refrig­
erator, bedroom suit, dryer, 
clothes, curtains, bedspread 
and much more. Three miles 
up 121 0 (green and white 
trailer on the right). 

COAL MINE SAFETY 
TRAINING 

Dust and noise survey. 
Annual retraining, 

underground and surface. 
Each Saturday 9 a.m. 

Calf 285-0650 

ECONOMY TREE SERV­
ICE: Tree cutting, topping, 
removal, dead limbing and 
cabling. Twenty-one years 
experience. Licensed, in­
sured and bonded. Bill 
Rhodes, owner. Dump 
truck, chipper and winch. 
Callt-800-742-4188 toll free 
for free estimates. (local 
606-353-9276.) 

HALBERT'S VINYL SIDING 
AND GUTIERING. We also 
do all types of home remod­
eling. Twelve years experi­
ence. Call358-9581 or 358-
9773. 

NEED A RIDE? Call Martin 
City Cab Service, Inc. Now 
accepting Medicaid. 285-
0320. Also, stop by Judy's 
Produce at railroad track in 
Martin. 

R.A. TAYLOR PAINTING 
COMPANY. Interior and 
exterior; commercial and 
residential. Experienced 
with references. Call 886-
8453. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The Floyd County Fiscal Court and the Floyd 

County Solid Waste Commission has proposed th~ 
Area's Solid Waste Management Plan. The plan, If 
approved, will serve as the basis for handling solid 
waste in this area. 

The following county is within the Solid Waste Man­
agement Area subject to this plan: Floyd County .. 

The plan is available for public inspection dunng 
regular business hours at the following locations: 
Floyd County Solid Waste, Courthouse Annex, 
Prestonsburg, KY, Public Library, Prestonsburg, KY., 
Wheelwright City Hall, Wheelwright, KY., Floyd County 
Extension Office, Courthouse Annex, Prestonsburg, 
KY., City Hall, Martin, KY., College Library, PCC 
Prestonsburg, KY. 

Additional information about this plan is available 
from the following persons: Lyda Howard, Vivian 
Conn, Chuck Stamper, Scott Walker, Robert McAn­
inch and Janice Shepherd, 886-8061 . 

Any person wishing to comment on the plan may 
do so by submitting written comments no later than 
thirty (30) days from the date this public notice is pub­
lished to: John M. Stumbo/Judge Executive, Court­
house Annex Building, Prestonsburg, KY 41653. 

The governing body will respond to public com­
ments within fifteen (15) days after the end of the 
public comment period. The plan will be submitted to 
the Kentucky Natural Resources and Environmental 
Protection Cabinet. 

CONCRETE WORK 
Driveways, carports, 

basements, etc. Also, will 
do block work, roof 

shingling and remodeling. 
Free estimates 
Calf 886-6718. 

SEWING MACHINE 
REPAIRS: Calf 447-2200 

(Knott County) or 
1-800-447-2188 for 
more information. 

SHAMROCK MINER 
RETRAINING AND 

TECHNICAL SERVICE 
We provide safety training, 

dust sample and 
noise surveys. 

Calf 432-7342; or 
4 78-4960, nights. 

4 19 Second Street 
Pikeville, Kentucky 

TREE TRIMMING OF ANY 
KIND, hillside cleaning and 
yard work. Phone: 87 4-9833 
or 874-D257. 

FREE BIBLE STUDIES 
Would you like to 

understand the book 
of Revelations? 

For a free Bible study 
write to: 

Revelation 
Box 776 

Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

SHOTGUN MATCH 
Each Friday and Saturday 

at 6 p.m. No sleeved or 
bored guns .. 069 choke 
welcome. One mile off 

Rt. 80 on Rl 122, Bucks 
Branch Road, Martin. 

Phone 285.0050. 
Note: You must be sober! 

$2,500 CREDIT CAROl 
Guaranteed same day ap­
proval! Also qualify for NO 
deposit Major Bank Card 
and cash advances. 1-8oo-
264-6789, ext. 3273. 

DRIVER EDUCATION AT 
PCC. Become a licensed, 
safedriver. Fee: $175. Call 
886-3863 for information. 

THE QUILT SHOP AT 
PUMPKIN CENTER HAS 
REOPENED. New ma­
chine. Give your children a 
quih for Christmas. Bring 
your tops-we have the rest. 
Also have quilts for salel 
Faye Patton, 358-3441. 

VISIT THE LARGEST 
PANELING CENTER in 
Eastern Kentucky at Goble 
Lumber. Over 80 different 
prefinished panels in stock 
and as low as $3.99 per 
panel. Call Goble Lumber, 
874-9281. 

WANTED: Individuals/ 
Families to contract with 
Mountain Comprehensive 
Care Center to provide resi­
dential care for people with 
mental retardation/develop­
mental disabilities. If inter­
ested call Mary Goff at 886-
1320 or write to: P.O. Box 
1340, Prestonsburg, KY 
41653. E.O.E. 

· ·susin:~:~,t~:> 
I · OJ?portqij!fY :'': 

CONTRACT DEEP MINER 
NEEDED. 36~-42R coal. 
Raleigh-Kanawha County, 
WV area. Must be finan­
cially able to provide equip­
ment insurance and neces­
sary bonding. Reply to: 
Paint Creek Coal Company, 
Rt. 2 Box 264D, Mt. Oak, 
wv 25880. 

COCA-COLA/PEPSI 
COLA VEND ROUTE. 

$100,000 potential. You 
need $14,000 cash 

to start your business. 
1-800-825-2573. 

WANT TO BUY TIMBER by 
the boundary. Call 886-
3313. 

WANTED: A Warm Morn­
ing gas heater. 65,000 BTU 
or larger. Call 886-9626. 

1985 RIVEROAKS 14x80. 
Excellentconditionl Tweten 
Miller ale, house windows, 
French doors, 8' sheetrock 
ceilings, 1 0' beamed living/ 
kitchen ceilings, solid wood 
cabinets, island kitchen, two 
large bedrooms, two baths, 
garden tub/shower in mas­
ter bath. Masonite siding, 
underpinning, one 9x7 and 
one 14x16 deck included. 
Shingled roof and seamless 
gutters. Phone 874-?566. 

OOUBLEWIDES NOW 5% 
DOWN II Only $1825 down 
for a deluxe 28x56 new 
drywall home. Free delivery 
and set up. No gimmicks! 
ActNOW-lim~edoffer. The 
Affordable Housing Mart, 
537 New Circle Road, Lex­
ington; 800-755-5359. · 

LIMITED TIME-S% DOWN 
$631 down. New 14 wides, 
two bedrooms. Plus low 
monthly payments. Act 
now II The Affordable Hous­
ing Mart, 537 New Circle 
Road, Lexington; Phone: 
(800)-755-5359. 

NOT 10% DOWN I ONLY 
5% AT THE AFFORDABLE 
HOUSING MART. New 
1993 16' wide home starting 
at only $857 down. 14' wide 
homes only $667 down. 
Limited time offer. 537 New 
Circle Road, Lexington; 1-
800-755-5359. 

Bolen Appliance 
Service 

• Repairing, Buying, Selling 
Washers, Dryers, Stoves 

and 
Refrigerators. 

New and Used Parts. 

Special Orders. 
When you want the Best, 

Call: 

358-9617 or 946-2529 

NETWORK 
MARKETING 

Low Investment and time. 
478-4338 

evenings, 437-1405 

HOWARD'S 
BODY & FRAME SHOP 

t.Uoyd Howard, owner 

Rt. 581 Tutor Key 
789-1717 

Specializin~ in frame and 
uni·body repair 

• Free towing on frame repaiif 
·FREE ESTIMATES " 

flOOIS, P mos, W AJJ.S, 
Duvo.s, fOUNIIAJ'JON 
·11oa Wou, ~m, 
I11DG1 Won & lbNJL ; 

Cwus (JUglf-Baa·•,•l• 

TRAILER 
FOR SALE 

Call: 
478-4530 

SPA-TO-GO® 
Fully Assembled 

Artist Concept 

PORTABLE SPA 

Buy Today $139 
Uss Today Deliverecl 

Installed 

FAMILYSPA $1699 
Seats 5 Delivered & 
(350-gal.) Installed 

(606) 297·6649 ~~~r 

MANAGER 
Construction ., 
Equipment 
Dealership 

Prestonsburg, KY 
We arc accepting ap­
plications for the Man­
ager's position of our 
J.l.Case dealeiShip in 
P~onsbu~. K]{. We 
need a person with 
experience in tlJC con­
struction, mining, or 
automotive industry. 
'.ibis peiSOO will super­
vise the shop, parts 
department and rental 
sales. The position 
requires the capability 
of developing in Sales 
Management Appli-
cant must be proven 
leader, have excellent 
communication and 
organizational skills 
and be dedicated to 
giving oustanding ser-
vice to our customeiS. 
Excellent pay and 
benefits. 

•

Wilson 
Equipment 
Company 

P 0. Dox 11520 
Lexington, K]{ 40576 

NOW AC~EPTINy APPLICATIQNS 

' 

For l-and 2-bedroom apartments. 

/ "''" 1{g,gency Par/(Ylpartments 
u.s. 23 (Below Hospital) 

886-8318 
from 9 a.m.-3 p.m. 

7-20·11. ../ 

' 

JoB OPPORTUNITY 
Jerry's Restaurant ig 

Prestonsburg is now taking ap­
plications for the fall/winter sea­
son. Waitresses and cooks. 

Jerry's offers BC/BS insur­
ance, paid vacations, meals & 
uniforms. 

APPLY IN PERSON ONLY! 

No phone calls, pleas~ 
App.lications may be obtained 

Mon.-Fri. 3-4 p.m. only! 



1980 FAIRMONT 14x70. 
Three bedrooms, fireplace 
and new carpet. Only $150 
permonth. 1985MANSION 
14x70. Three bedrooms, 
front kitchen. Clean home. 
Only $150 per month. Fi­
nancing available. Call for 
details, 1·800-755-5359. 

1983 MANSION 14x52 
TWO BEDROOM mobile 
home. Call 377-2297 for 
more information. 

16' WIDES--5% DOWN. 
Starting at only $857 down. 
No gimmicks! limited of­
fer-act now! The Afford­
able Housing Mart, 537 New 
Circle Road, Lexington; 1-
8~-755-5359. 

SAVE THOUSANDS 
NOW!!! 

NEW 32 WIDE AND 28 
WIDE DOUBLEWIDES 

Patented and copyrighted 
New Process is the latest 
breakthrough in mobile 
home technology and saves 
you thousands in freight, 
delivery and set up charges. 
Available now and only at 
SHOWPLACE HOMES. 

Save $5,000 
2x44 Show Winner 

Residential, shingle roof, 
vinyl lap siding, three bed­
rooms, two baths, northern 
built, total electric, vaulted 
ceilings, all appliances, de­
luxe garden bath with sepa­
rate shower, upgrade insu­
lation, huge eat in kitchen, 
deluxe cabinets, utility room, 
pantry, walk-in closets and 
much more. Delivered and 
set up on your lot. 

$22,995 
l..Aiss than $256/month 

OR 
28x44 Show Winners 

Five floor plans to choose 
from. Same deluxe features 
as the 32x44 plus a shingled 
bay window. Delivered and 
set up on your Jot. 

$19,995 
Less than $223/month 

Free Delivery and Set Upl 
Over 40 model homes on 
display. 

New 16x80 
$17,9951 

New14wldes 
$10,9951 

Financing Available with 
7%down 

Central Kentucky's biggest 
display. If we don't have it, 
nobody does I 

SHOWPLACE HOMES 
The most trusted name 

In manufactured 
housing. 

1160 New Circle Road 
Lexington 

1-800-998-7684. 

SWORD INSURANCE 
AGENCY 

DWALE, KENTUCKY 
Earnest A. Sword 

Agent 
We Want Your Business I! 

• Auto •commercial 
•Mobile Home •ute •Home 

•Disability Income 
·workman's Compensation 
tiMedicare Supplements 

•Major Medical •Fanns 
•Bonds •Fire •cancer 

•Annuities •coal Trucks 
(606)-874-9265 
(606)-87 4-989 7 
(606)-874-0115 

We'll help you get the 
coverage you need at a 

price you can afford. 
Call us today! 

MAJOR MEDICAL, 
MEDICARE SUPPLEMENT 
~NO DEDUCTABLE. 

Saw moneyl Increase 
benefits. Call Lynda 
Spurlock for a quote. 

285-9650, days/evenings. 

CARPENTRYWORK: New 
homes, remodeling, drywall, 
painting, shingling, concrete, 
blockwork. Eighteen years 
e~rience. Call James 
Wlitkins, 886-3052. 

,;;~;tcarp~ntry .. 
':-:·::··, Wotk,''::-,:'~:=:,::= ,,·,:,: 

NEW HOMES AND 
REMODELING 

Any type of roof work; 
decks; vinyl siding; any 
type mobile home work; 
utility buildings; concrete 
work; pole barns; interior/ 

exterior painting; any 
type remodeling. 

17 Years Experience 
Free Estimates 

Roger Honeycutt 
886-0633 

CARPENTRY WORK. 
Remodeling, drywall, 
new homes, painting 
(interior and exterior), 
wood decks, storage 
buildings, concrete 

work, patios, driveways, 
carports, walkways, 
steel buildings, etc. 

Twelve years experience. 
Charles Scott 

886-9522 

CARPENTAYWORK: New 
homes; remodeling, addi­
tions; house painting, inte­
rior and exterior; concrete 
driveways, patios, footers, 
etc.; shingling and roof re­
pairs; decks and storage. 
Twenty years experience. 
References. Call Don 
Johnson, 886-6318. 

ELECTROLUX 
Authorized factory 

oudet sale 
October ONLY! 
Big dscounts on 
new machines. 

Knott County, 447-2200; 
or 1-800447-2188. 

FOR HIRE: Backhoe, $30 
per hour with operator. Also, 
have gravel for sale at $9.75 
per ton. Will haul and spread 
gravel for $25 per load. Call 
874-8165, ask for Mike. 

GRIGSBY CONTRACTING 
Brick, block, stone laying. 
Concrete work. Will fum ish 
references. Free estimates. 
Call 886-3420, ask for 
Robert. 

ALLEN FURNITURE 
ALLEN, KENTUCKY 

Living room suits, daybeds, 
gun cabinets, bedroom suits, 
recliners, odd chests, dinette 
sets, bunk beds, odd beds, 
loungers, used washers, 
dryers, refrigerators and lots 
morel Phone: 874-9790. 

ROSE'S USED 
FURNITURE 

Patio door; sink bowls; 
cherry china cabinet; desks; 
dressers; chests; beds; fire­
place stereo; stoves; refrig­
erators; washers; dryers; 
gas and coal heaters; ward­
robes; bedroom and living 
room sets; dinette set; hide 
a bed; countertop stove; 
color TVs; organ; trombone; 
old clarinet; Kustom PA 
system; office desk and file 
cabinet; computer cabinets; 
glassware; crafts and more. 
Come on by, say hi and 
browse till your heart's con­
tent. Between red lights at 
AllenandLanceronRt.1428 
(across bridge to Goble 
Roberts). 886-8085. 

PORTER PLUMBING 
COMPANY 

ALLEN, KENTUCKY 
Commttrcial, residential 

and service work. 
Licen-sed and insured. 
Rotor rooter service, 
drain deaning, etc. 
CALL US FIRST! 

874-2794. 

The Floyd County Times 

,~;(,·- Babysitting 

;,_i·.u-·i:.'J: Servic~,,,_:::.::tt,, 
CHAFFINS AND SONS NEW PRESCHOOL (AGES 
HEATING AND COOLING. 3-5) TO OPEN SOON. 
24 Hour Service. Call 886- Limited admission. On U.S. 
0342. 23at~arold. Call478-2136, 

evemngs. 

-'.tMedical Milestones 
Developmerrts in Treating Alzheimer's Disease 

By Roger J. Bulger, M.D. 
Dr. Bulger is Prf'sidenr 

of the Association of 
Academic Health Centers 
and a past President of the 
University of Texas Health 

Science Center 
at Houston. 

Researchers 
have recently 
come up with a 
discovery that 

coul lea to treatments, 
perhaps even prevention of 
Alzheimer's disease, a con­
dition that robs elderly 
Americans of their dignity 
and personality while cost­
ing $9 billion annually. 

Oddly enough, the 
research involved an ani­
mal that doesn't get 
Alzheimer's on it:;, own, 
the laboratory rat. By 
injecting the brains of labo­
ratory rats with a small 
fragment of a protein 
called beta amyloid, the 
researchers produced a par­
allel degeneration of rat 
brain cells. 

The researchers found 
that the beta amyloid pro­
tein, when injected into the 
hippocampus, the region of 
the brain that controls 
memory and reasoning, 
attached to those cells, 
accumulated there and 
destroyed them. Twisted 
mats of beta amyloid, 
known as plaques, are 
found in the brains of 
Alzheimer's sufferers. 

The researchers also 
noted that beta amyloid has 
a region that resembles 
Substance P, a short chain 
of protein that transmits 
signals between nerve cells 
and through the spinal 
cord. They then found 
Substance P could bind to 

Scientists studying 
certain proteins in part of 
the brain hope to some­
day develop a treatment 
for Alzheimer's disease. 

the cells that would have 
been targeted by beta amy­
loid and protect them. 
What's more, unlike most 
molecules, Substance P can 
pass from the bloodstream 
into the brain. Substance P 
injected into rats protected 
their hippocampus regions 
from later injections of beta 
amyloid. 

While much research 
remains to be done, there 
may be reason to hope that 
within a decade the mys­
tery of Alzheimer's disease 
will be revealed and that 
treatments to arrest or pre­
vent the disease can be 
developed. 

Medical Milestones is 
provided as a public ser­
vice by Americans for 
Medical Progress. For 
information about its edu­
cational programs or to 
subscribe to its bimonthly 
bulletin, Breakthrough, 
reporting on medical dis­
coveries, cures, and treat­
ments, write AMP at 
Crystal Square Three, 
1735 Jefferson Davis 
Highway, Suite 907, 
Arlington, VA 22202; or 
call (703) 486-1411. 

!Minority Health Update I 
Facts From the National Heart, Lung, and Blood Institute 
Favorite Black and 

Hispanic foods-high in fats 
and calories-could be 
recipes for trouble. Surveys 
show Blacks and Hispanics 
are more likely than the gen­
eral population to be over­
weight 

For example, about 44 
percent of Black women and 
42 percent of Hispanic 
women are oveJWeight, com­
pared with 27 percent of all 
U.S. women. 

Those extra pounds mean 
an added risk of heart disease, 
the nation's top killer, and 
high blood pressure, the chief 
cause of stroke. High blood 
pressure is especially com­
mon in Blacks. 

Shedding that extra 
weight-and risk- may not 
be as hard as you think. Be 
more active. Cut back on 
calories and consume less fat 
and saturated fat 

Fortunately, this needn't 
mean giving up the foods you 
like. Nutritionists have con­
verted many traditional Black 
and Hispanic recipes into 
heart-healthy meals . They 
suggest: Use beans and grains 
with small amounts of meat 
Choose skinless chicken or 
turkey to replace neck bones, 
ham hocks, and fatback. Use 
a little vegetable oil, instead 
of lard or butter. Choose fruits 
for salads, instead of avoca­
dos or olives. Use more spices 
l\nd less salt. Broil , steam, 

roast, and grill, instead of fry­
ing or basting with fat 

Here's an old favorite, 
"Picnic Potato Salad," revital­
ized into a healthy dish of 
only 92 calories per 1/2 cup 
serving: 

Combine: 1/2 cup plain 
low fat (1%) yogurt; 1/2 cup 
mayonnaise-type salad dress­
ing; 1 tbsp vinegar; 1 tsp salt; 
1 tsp fresh, chopped parsley; 
2 tsps prepared mustard; 1 
clove garlic, minced; and a 
pinch of freshly ground black 
pepper. 

Add : 6 cups peeled, 
cooked potatues, diced; I cup 
coarsely chopped celery; 1/2 
cup sliced radishes; and 1/4 
cup sliced scallions, with tops. 

Mix well and refrigerate. 
You'll get about 16 servings. 
You may wish to substitute 6 
cups of diced, cooked 
cauliflower for the radishes 
and potatoes. 

Either way, your family 
can enjoy down-home cook­
ing that's lower in calories 
and fat, but still rich in taste. 

For more nutrition infor­
mation, write the NI-ll..BI Info 
Center, PO Box 30105, 
Bethesda, MD 20824. 

Good Ne~s Department, 
Here are a few facts you 

may be happy you learned: 
The E nvironmental 

Protection Agency has set 
stringent regulations to keep 
lead out of drinking water 
and Nibco's HydraPure 
plumbing system meets the 
requirem ents. 

You can get a free mem­
bership in the Arthritis 
Foundation from your physi­
cian, report experts at 
SmithKJine Beecham. 

You can use MasterCard 
Cim.Js ATMs to get local cur­
rency at the be~t exchange rate 
overseas, says travel expert 
Arthur Frommer. 

A moisture-repellent barri­
er such as Caldesene 
Medicated Powder can protect 
infant skin from diaper rash. 

Local travel agents can 
help you have a truly roman­
tic wedding or anniversary on 
the " Love Boat" through 
Princess· St. Thomas Bridal 
Coordinator. 

Betty Crocker's Suddenly 
Salad mixes are quick and 
easy ways to make meals 
come alive with flavor. 

Doctors say honnone thcr-

apy may slow the damage due 
to aging. 

Although dry eye is a com­
mon problem, it's easily treat­
ed with drops such as Murine 
from Ross Laboratories. 

Termite damage can be 
stemmed with a professional 
application of Vikene gas 
fumigant from DowElanco. 

You may be able to shop 
smarter with a book called 
The JOY Of Outlet Shopping. 

A new lipstick, Lip 
Advance Lasting Lipcolor 
from Cover Girl, lasts for 
hours. 

Coast, the largest manufac­
turer and importer of audio 
and video cases and equip­
ment, is offering discount 
coupons on leisure activities. 

Dr. Lee Salk's last book, 
"Familyhood," is now in local 
bookstores. 

A new video game from 
Novo Nordisk Phannaccuticah 
teaches children about Uia­
betes management. 

One of the best protections 
from dangerous ultraviolet 
rays is a sunscreen such as 
PreSun Active. availahk in 
local pham1acics. 

AT YOUR 
SERVICE 
You look to us for in-depth 
world, state and local news, 
for entertainment in the 
comics, crossword and other 
puzzles, and for the wit and 
wisdom of our syndicated 
columnists and feature 
writers. 

In addition to all we provide 
you, we're wving you a 
directory of our services for 
you to use and profit from. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS-
All wedding and 
engagement 
announcements are 
published free of charge. 
Call us for a form or pick 
one up at the office during 
business hours. Please 
submit your wedding 
announcement at least two 
weeks in advance. 

CARRIERS­
Newspaper routes become 
available from time to time. 
If you'd like to join our team, 
stqp by the office and ask 
for a newscarrier 
application. 
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The Floyd County Times 

NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC SALE 

October 16, 1 992 at 11 :00 
a.m. a 1987 Hyundia Excel, 
serial number KMHLF31J3-
HU239904 will be sold the 
highest bidder for CASH "as 
is where is" atthe First Guar­
anty National Bank, Martin, 
Ky. to satisfy the unpaid 
balance of a Installment 
Contract signed on October 
21, 1988. The vehicle may 
be inspected prior to the sale. 
The undersigned reserves 
the right to bid. The buyer 
will pay all taxes and trans­
fer fees. 

First Guaranty 
National Bank 

Collection Department 
Martin, Ky. 41649 

W-9130, 1017, 10114 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant To Application 
No. 836-0183 Renewal 
In accordance with the 

provisions of KRS 350.055, 
notice is hereby given that 
Coal-Mac, Inc., P.O. Box 
3428, Pikeville, KY 41502, 
has filed an application for a 
Renewal of a surface coal 
mining operation located 0. 7 
miles southeast of Teaberry 
in Floyd County. The opera­
tion will disturb 195.51 sur­
face acres and will underlie 
36.95 acres, for a total per­
mit boundary of 232.46 
acres. 

The operation is approxi­
mately 0.4 miles east from 
KY979's junction whh Tinker 
Road and located on 0.4 
miles east of Mud Creek. 
The latitude is 372 24' 37". 
The longitude is 822 37' 28". 
The surface area is owned 
by: Coal-Mac, Inc., Delmar 
Kiser, The Bank Josephine, 
Edgar Howell, Beaver Val­
ley Coal Co., Rexal & Gar­
net Hamilton, Turner Elkhorn 
Mining Co., Casey 
Newsome Heirs, Dorothy 
Blanton, and John & Char­
lene Adkins. The operation 
will underlie property owned 
by: Tilda Ray Estate, Orville 
Hamilton and Willard 
Johnson. 

The operation is located 
on the McDowell & Pikeville 
U.S.G.S. 71/2 minute quad­
rangle maps. The operation 
will use the mountain top 
removal, contour and auger 
mining methods. 

The Renewal application 
has been filed for public 
inspection at the Department 
for Surface Mining Recla­
mation and Enforcement's 
Prestonsburg Regional Of­
fice, 1346 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653. 
Written comments, objec­
tions, or requests for a per­
mit conference must be filed 
with the Director of the Divi­
sion of Permits, #2 Hudson 
Hollow Complex, U.S. 127 
South, Frankfort, Kentucky 
40601. 

W-9/23, 9130, 10/7, 10/14 

LEGAL NOTICE 
The Floyd County Board 

of Education will be devel­
oping a district wide plan for 
facilities over the next sev­
eral months. The Board of 
Education wishes to have a 
community business leader 
living in our school district 
assist in the planning proc­
ess. This individual will be a 
member of the Local Plan­
ning Committee which will 
be formulating our plan. 

If you or someone you 
know would be an effective 
citizen on this committee, 
please call the Superin­
tendent's office and place 
their name in nomination. 
Please provide their name, 
address and phone number. 
The Board of Education will 
make this selection at an 
October board meeting. 
Nominations must be made 
by October 14, 1992. 

Should you have any 
questions, please call Dr. 
Stephen Towler, Superin­
tendent. 

Floyd County Schools 
Central Office Phone 606-
886-2354. 

s/Stephen Towler 
Superintendent 

Floyd County Schools 
W 10f1, 10114, F-10/9, 10/16 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant To Application 

Number 836-5173 
Renewal 

In accordance with the 
provisions of KRS 350.055, 
notice is hereby given that 
Buck Coal, Inc., 300 South 
Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653, has ap­
plied for a renewal of an 
underground and contour 
mining operation located 1 
mile north of Craynor in Floyd 
County. The operation will 
disturb 69.2 surface acres 
andwillunderlie839.0acres, 
and the total area within the 
permit boundary will be 
908.2 acres. 

The proposed operation 
is approximately 1 mile west 
from KY 979's junction with 
Hamilton Branch Road and 
located southeast of Hamil­
ton Branch. The latitude is 
372 27' 17". The longitude is 
822 39' 47". 

The proposed operation 
is located on the McDowell 
U.S.G.S. 7-1/2minutequad­
rangle map. The operation 
will use the contour and 
underground methods of 
mining. The surface area is 
owned by Timothy Ray 
Akers, Homer Hall, Barbara 
Hall, Shannon and Jennifer 
Mulkey, Morris Newsome, 
Richard Hall and Elkhorn 
Coal Corporation. The op­
eration will underlie land 
owned by Milford Howell, 
Larry Compton, Ted Evans, 
Butler Evans, David Akers, 
Emit Howell Heirs, Arnold 
Newsom, Cecil Hamilton, 
Anna Newsom, Gustavia 
Howell, Della Jones, Robert 
Howell, Squire Hamilton, 
Levi and Mary McKinney, 
Frank and lvaleeMcKinney, 
Pauline Tackett, J. Lee Hall, 
Dorothy Blanton, James K. 
Hall, Morris Newsom and 
Denzil A. Hall, Denzil A. Hall, 
Virgil Hall, Martha Evans, 
Denver R. Evans, Astor Hall, 
William Moore, 0. C. Hall, 
Demas Evans, Freeman 
Evans, Orville Hall, Oscar 
Akers, Ishmael Akers, Timo­
thy Ryan Akers, Richard 
Hall, Homer Hall, Barbara 
Hall, Shannon and Jennifer 
Mulkey, Morris Newsome. 
Miles Williams, Ottis Hall, 
Ellis Branham, Elkhorn Coal 
Corporation, Maxie Howell. 
and Bill Hall. 

The application has been 
filed for public inspection at 
the Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement's Prestons­
burg Regional Office, 1346 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653-1397. 
Written comments, objec­
tions, or requests for a per­
mit conference must be filed 
with the Director of the Divi­
sion of Permits. #2 Hudson 
Hollow, U.S. 127 South, 
Frankfort, Kentucky 40601. 
W-9/30, 1017, 10/14, 10/21 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD Of EOUCAllON 
STEPHEN W. TOWLER, SUPERMEHDOO 

ARNOLD AVENJE 
PRESTONSBURG. KENTUCKY 41&63 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 
October 5 1992 October 20 1992 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

OFFICIAL TITLE OF POSI­
TION: Full Time Substitute 
School Bus Driver 
JOB LOCATION: All areas 
of Floyd County School 
District 
SALARY RANGE: $33.00 
per day. 
CONTACT PERSON: Earl 
D. Ousley, DirectorofTrans­
portation 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIPTION: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
MINIMUM REQUIRE­
MENTS: Certification as 
required by Kentucky De­
partment of Education. 
Applicant must have high 
school diploma or GED. 
Applicant must have the 
Commercial Drivers License 
(COL). 
ADDITIONAL JOB RE­
QUIREMENTS: none 
Applicant must submit an 
up-dated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 

Education no later than 
October 19, 1992 to be 
considered for an interview. 
• Applicant will be notified for 
an interview as soon as ar­
rangements have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not discrimi­
nate on the basis of race, 
color, national origin, age, 
religion, marital status, sex, 
or handicap in employment, 
educational programs, or 
activities as set forth in Title 
IX & VI, & in Section 504. 

F-10/9, W-10/14 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant to Application 

Number (836-0179), 
Revision #3 

In accordance with the 
provisions of KRS 350.055, 
notice is hereby given that 
Branham & Baker Coal 
Company, Inc., 148 South 
Lake Drive, Prestonsburg 
Kentucky, 41653, has filed 
an application for a major 
revision to an existing sur­
face coal mining and recla­
mation operation. This revi­
sion proposes to add an 
additional 0 acres of surface 
disturbance and 0 acres 
previously permitted for 
augering for a total proposed 
permit acreage of 1200.68 
acres located 1.6 miles 
northeast of Hippo, in Floyd 
County. 

The proposed major revi­
sion area is approximately 
.5 miles northeast from St. 
At. 850's junction with Prater 
Fork Co. Road and located 
.3 miles west of Turner's 
Branch. The latitude is 37 
degrees 32' 43". The longi­
tude is 82 degrees 50' 30". 

The proposed major revi­
sion is located on the Martin 
U.S.G.S. 71/2 minute quad­
rangle map. The surface 
area to be affected by this 
revision owned by James 
"Doc" Ratliff proposes to 
change 4.4 acres previously 
permitted for Forestland 
postmining use to pasture­
land postmining landuse. 

The revision application 
has been filed for public 
inspection at the Department 
for Surface Mining Recla­
mation and Enforcement's 
Prestonsburg Regional Of­
fice, 1346 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 
41653. Written comments, 
objections, or requests for a 
permit conference must be 
filed with the Director of the 
Division of Permits, #2 
Hudson Hollow Complex, 
U.S. 127 South, Frankfort, 
Kentucky 40601. 
W-1 017, 10114, 10/21, 10/28 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCAllON 
STEPHEN W. TOWLER, SUPERMEHDOO 

ARNOLD AVENJE 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 41 &53 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 
October 5, 1992 October 20, 1992 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

OFFICIAL TITLE OF POSI­
TION: School Bus Driver 
JOB. LOCATION: Prestons­
burg area 

SALARY RANGE: $33.00 
per day. 
CONTACT PERSON: Earl 
D. Ousley, DirectorofTrans­
portation 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIPTION: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
MINIMUM REQUIRE ­
MENTS: Certification as 
required by Kentucky De­
partment of Education. 
Applicant must have high 
school diploma or GED. 
Applicant must have the 
Commercial Drivers License 
(COL). 
ADDITIONAL JOB RE­
QUIREMENTS: none 
Applicant must submit an 
up-dated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
October 19, 1992 to be 
considered for an interview. 
·Applicant will be notified for 
an interview as soon as ar­
rangements have been 
completed. 

The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not discrimi­
nate on the basis of race 
color, national origin, age: 
religion, marital status, sex, 
or handicap in employment, 
educational programs, or 
activities as set forth in Title 
IX & VI, & in Section 504. 

F-1 0/9, 1 0/16, W-1 0/14 

To raise the sum of 
$3,544.36 principal, plus 
interest in the amount of 
$633.36 as of April14, 1992, 
and interest thereafter on 
the principal at $1.1653 per 
day from April14, 1992 until 
the date of Judgment, plus 
interest on the Judgment 
amount (principal plus inter­
est to the date of Judgment) 
at the rate of 4.26%, com­
puted daily and com­
pounded annually, until paid 
in full and for the costs of this 
action, pursuant to Judg­
ment and Order of Sale, . 
being Civil Action No. 92-31 
on the Pikeville Docket of 
the United States District 
Court for the Eastern Dis­
trict of Kentucky entered on 
June 24, 1992, in the case 
of United States of America 
vs. Estate of Everett Wiley 
Collins c/o Ollie Jean Collins, 
et al, I, or one of my Depu­
ties will sell the following 
described property at public 
auction to the highest and 
best bidder at the front door 
of the Floyd County Court­
house at Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky, on the twelfth day 
of November, 1992 (Novem­
ber 12, 1992) at the hour of 
11 :00 a.m., local time, on 
terms of ten percent (10%) 
of the bid price on the day of 
sale with good and sufficient 
bond for the balance, bear­
ing interest at the rate of 
4.26% per annum until paid, 
due and payable in thirty 
(30) days and said bond 
having the effect of a judg­
ment, or the purchaser may 
pay cash at time of sale. 
Upon a default by the pur­
chaser, the deposit shall be 
forfeited and retained by the 
Marshal as a part of the 
proceeds of the sale and the 
property shall again be of­
fered for sale subject to 
confirmation by the Court. 

Beginning at a marked 
rock near the C C & 0 right­
of-way; thence across the 
bottom to a marked rock at 
foot of hill; thence a straight 
line up the hill to a hickory 
marked; thence a straight 
line to top of hill to a point 
between two black oak trees 
both marked with (9) marks 
to each tree; thence down 
the point with center of same 
to C & 0 right-of-way; thence 
up the creek direction with 
said right-of-way to the 
beginning so as to include 
(2) acres more or less. 

Being the same (or part of 
the same) land conveyed by 
Deed recorded in DB 178, 
Pg. 454, Floyd County 
Clerk's Office. 

Such sale shall be in bar 
and foreclosure of all right, 
title, interest, estate claim, 
demand or equity of redemp­
tion of the defendants and of 
all persons claiming by, 
through, under or against 
them provided the purchase 
price is equal to two-thirds 
of the appraised value. If the 
purchase price is not equal 
to two-thirds of the appraised 
value, the deed shall con­
tain a lien in favor of the 
defendant reflecting defen­
dant's right to redeem dur­
ing the period provided by 
law (KRS 426.530). Ken­
neth C. Poore, United States 
Marshal, Eastern District of 
Kentucky. 

W-10/14, 10121, 10128,11/4 

ADVERTISEMENT 
FOR PROPOSALS 

The City of Prestonsburg 
is considering a leasing 
program to lease some or all 
equipment in the City's 
Public Works Department. 
If you are interested in 
making a proposal or need 
more information, please 
contact Mark Wells at 886-
2335 by October 30, 1992. 

MARK WELLS 
City Administrator 

W-1 0/14 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCAllON 
STEPHEN W. TOWLER, SUPERINTEHDOO 

ARNOLD AVENUE 
PRESTONSBURG. KENTUCKY 41&63 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 
October 8 1992 October 23 1992 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

OFFICIAL TITLE OF POSI­
TION: Handicap School Bus 
Aid 
JOB LOCATION: Prestons­
burg area 
SALARY RANGE: $24.52 
per day. 
CONTACT PERSON: Earl 
D. Ousley, DirectorofTrans­
portation 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIPTION: . 
Assist handicap students in 
loading and unloading. 
Assist students to and from 
home on the school bus 
route. 
MINIMUM REQUIRE­
MENTS: Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Contact the Depart­
ment of Transportation for 
additional requirements. 
ADDITIONAL JOB RE­
QUIREMENTS: none 
Applicant must submit an 
up-dated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
October 22, 1992 to be 
considered for an interview. 
*Applicant will be notified for 
an interview as soon as ar­
rangements have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not discri mi­
nate on the basis of race, 
color, national origin, age, 
religion, marital status, sex, 
or handicap in employment, 
educational programs, or 
activities as set forth in Title 
IX & VI, & in Section 504. 

W-10/14, 10/21, F-10/16 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD 
OF EDUCAllON 

STEPHEN W. TOWLER, Ed. D, 
SUPERINTENDENT 
ARNOLD AVENJE 

PRESTONSBURG, .KENTUCKY 41&63 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 
POSTING 
NOTICE 

October 7 1992 October 21 1992 
DATE OPEN . DATE CLOSED 

OFFICIAL TITLE OF 
POSITION: Head Start 
Bus Driver 
JOB LOCATION: Clark 
Elementary School 
SALARY RANGE: 
$8.25 per hour (4 hours 
per day) 
CONTACT PERSON: 
Pete Grigsby, Jr., As­
sistant Superintendent 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIP­
TION: Is responsible in 
transporting Head Start 
children to the Head 
Start Center. 
MINIMUM REQUIRE­
MENTS: High school 
diploma or G. E. D. cer­
tificate, and must have 
completed the bus 
driver's training. Must 
be able to pass the 
C.D.L. certification. 
ADDITIONAL JOB RE­
QUIREMENTS: Have a 
genuine love for small 
children. 
Applicant must submit 
an up-dated, signed 
application to the Su­
perintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
10-21 -92 to be consid­
ered for an interview. 
·Applicant will be noti ­
fied for an interview as 
soon as arrangements 
have been completed. 
The Floyd County 
Board of Education 
does not discriminate 
on the basis of race, 
color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital 
status, sex, or handi­
cap in employment, 
educational programs, 
or activities as set forth 
in Title OX & VL. 

10/9, 10/14 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
OF BLASTING 

SCHEDULE 
Permit #836-0233 

Pursuant to Kentucky 
Public Law 405 KAR 
1 6:120E, section 3, Adding­
ton Inc., 9431 U.S. Route 
60, Ashland, KY 411 02-
9527, phone number (606) 
928-3433 proposes the fol­
lowing schedule: 

The blasting area consists 
of approximately 291.60 
acres and the blasting site is 
located approximately 0.50 
mile south/southwest of 
Wonder in Floyd County and 
located approximately 0.63 
mile west from Clark Branch 
Road's junction with Buffalo 
Creek Road and located in 
Clark Branch and Wolf 
Branch of Buffalo Creek and 
Cow Creek of Levisa Fork, 
at latitude 37-37-12 and at 
longitude 83-37-30. 

Blasting will begin on or 
about November and con­
tinue for not more than 
twelve months. All blasting 
is to be conducted during 
daylight hours Monday 
through Sunday. No blast­
ing will be performed be­
tween sunset and sunrise. 

Entry to the blasting ar­
eas will be regulated by signs 
or barriers. An authorized 
representative will prohibit 
access to the blasting area 
by unauthorized persons at 
least ten (1 0) minutes be­
fore each detonation. Warn­
ing, Blast and all-clear sig-

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD 
OfEDUCAllON 

STEPHEN W. TOWLER, Ed.D, 
SUPERINTENDENT 
ARNOLD AVENUE 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 41&63 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 
POSTING 
NOTICE 

October 7 1992 October 21 1992 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

OFFICIAL TITLE OF 
POSITION: Head Start 
Teacher 

JOB LOCATION: Clark 
Elementary School 
SALARY RANGE: 
$7.62 per hour (7 hours 
per day, 170 days per 
year) 
CONTACT PERSON: 
Pete Grigsby, Jr., As­
sistant Superintendent 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIP­
TION: Responsible for 
planning and implem­
entation of daily pro­
gram which facilitates 
the emotional, physical, 
intellectual, and social 
growth development of 
children enrolled in a 
Head Start Center. 
Must be able to pass 
the C.D.L. Training for 
bus drivers. 
MINIMUM REQUIRE­
MENTS: Must have a 
C.D.A. (Child Develop­
ment Associate) and a 
high school diploma, 
and/or Associate in 
Early Childhood Devel­
opment. 
ADDITIONAL JOB RE­
QUIREMENTS: Have 
desirable personality 
characteristics, pa­
tience, genuine love for 
small children. Ideally, 
a combination of edu­
cation and experience. 
Be in good health. Evi­
dence of emotional 
maturity and stability. 
Applicant must submit 
an up-dated, signed 
application to the Su­
perintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
1 0-21 -92 to be consid­
ered for an interview. 
*Applicant will be noti­
fied for an interview as 
soon as arrangements 
have been completed. 
The Floyd County 
Board of Education 
does not discriminate 
on the basis of race, 
color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital 
status, sex, or handi­
cap in employment, 
educational programs, 
or activities as set forth 
in Title OX & VL. 

10/9, 10/14 
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nals will be audible within 
one-half mile of the blasting 
area and will be utilized prior 
to and following the blast­
ing. A one minute series of 
long blasts five minutes prior 
to the blast signal will be 
given as a warning signal. A 
series of short blasts one 
minute prior to the shot will 
be given as a blast signal. A 
prolonged blastfollowing the 
inspection of the blast area 
will be given as an "all clear" 
signal. 

Blasting may occur at 
times other than those out­
lined in the blasting sched­
ule; if in the event explo­
sives are loaded and rain, 
lightning, atmospheric con­
ditions, management prob­
lems or safety to the opera­
tor or public deem it neces­
sary, all personnel within 
one-half mile of the blasting 
area shall be orally notified 
and a signal as described 
above will be sounded be­
fore detonation. W-10/14 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
OF BLASTING 

SCHEDULE 
Pursuant To Permit 

No. 836-5259 
In accordance with the 

provisions of 405 KAR 
16:120, Buck Coal, Inc., 300 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653 (606) 
886-9049, proposes the fol­
lowing blasting schedule. 
The blasting site consists of 
approximately 8.0 acres 
located in Floyd County 
approximately 0.2 miles 
northeast from Route 1929's 
junction with Hoods Fork 
Road. That latitude is 372 
26'15"andthelongitudeis 
822 42' 41". 

Detonations of explosives 
are proposed to occur from 
sunrise to sunset, Monday 
through Saturday. 

The blasting schedule is 
for the period from October 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant To 
Application 

Number 436-5107, 
Operator Change 
In accordance with 

405 KAR 8:010, notice 
is hereby given that Old 
Style Mining Company, 
Inc., HC 71, Box 1750, 
Prestonsburg, KY 
41653, intends to re­
vise permit number 
436-51 0 7 to change the 
operator. The operator 
presently approved in 
the permit is Courtney­
Gory Collieries, Inc., 
P.O. Box 428, Pres­
tonsburg, KY 41653.' 
The new operator will 
be P.B. & C. Energy, 
Inc., 3241 KY Route 
1428, East Point, KY 
41216. 

The operation is lo­
cated within the City of 
Prestonsburg and ad­
jacent the Big Sandy 
River. The operation is 
approximately 1.50 
miles West from KY 
Route #3's junction with 
KY Route #1428 and 
located 0.05 miles 
Northwest of the Big 
Sandy River. The op­
eration is located on the 
Prestonsburg and 
Lancer U.S.G.S. 7 1/2 
minute quadrangle 
maps at latitude 37 
degrees 40 minutes 15 
seconds,andlongitude 
82 degrees 45 minutes 
23. seconds. 

The application has 
been filed for public 
inspection at the De­
partment for Surface 
Mining Reclamation 
and Enforcement's 
Prestonsburg Regional 
Office, 1346 South Lake 
Drive, Prestonsburg, 
KY 41653. Written com­
ments or objections 
must be filed with the 
Director, Division of 
Permits, #2 Hudson 
Hollow Complex, U.S. 
127 South, Frankfort, 
Kentucky 40601. All 
comments must be 
received within fifteen 
(15) days of today's 
date. 

1992through October 1993. 
Entry to the blasting area 

will be regulated by si~ns 
and barriers. An authorii!fd 
company representative will 
prohibit access to the blast­
ing area by unauthorized 
persons at least ten (1 0) 
minutes prior each detona­
tion. The warning signal will 
consist of one (1) minute 
series of long horn blasts 
five (5) minutespriortodeto­
nation. A series of short horn 
blasts one {1) minute prior 
to detonation will then be 
sounded. The all clear sig­
nal will be a prolonged tmrn 
blast lasting up to two1~) 
minutes following inspection 
of the blast area. Events 
which could necessitate 
blasting at unscheduled 
times includes, but are not 
limited to, rain, lightening, 
other atmospheric condi­
tions, or deteriorated explo­
sives which involve person­
nel, operations or public 
safety. W-10/14 

All LegalS, 
must be 

in by Noon 
Monday. 

FLOYD COIJm' BOARD 
OF EDUCATION 

STEPHEN W. TOWLER, Ed.D, 
SUPERINTENDENT 
ARI«lLD AVENJE 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 411511 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 
POSTING 
NOTICE 

Oc!oberZ 1992 Oc!ober 21 1992 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 
OFFICIAL TITLE OF 
POSITION: Head Start 
Teacher Aide 

JOB LOCATION: Clark 
Elementary School • 
SALARY RANGE: 
$4.98 per hour (7 1/2 
hours per day) 
CONTACT PERSON: 
Pete Grigsby, Jr., As­
sistant Superintendent 
BRIEF JOB DESCRIP­
TION: Will assist 
teacher in planning and 
implementing a daily 
program which facili­
tates emotional, physi­
cal, intellectual and 
social growth develop­
ment of children enj 
rolled in Head Start/ 
(Must be able to pass 
the C.D.L. training for 
bus drivers) 
MINIMUM REQUIRE­
MENTS: High school 
diploma or G.E.D. cer­
tificate. Must have had 
the Adult Basic Learn­
ing Examination 
(ABLE). Ideally, pos­
sess a Child Develop­
ment Associate (CDA) 
credential. (Must have 
copy of diploma or 
G.E.D. certificate and 
A.B.L.E. test to apply).• 
ADDITIONAL JOB 
REQUIREMENTS: 
Desirable personality 
characteristics, pa­
tience, understanding 
and possess a genuine 
love for small children. 
Ability to form a good 
working relationship 
with staff, parents and 
public. 
Applicant must submit 
an up-dated, signed 
application to the Su­
perintendent of the 
Floyd County Board ciJ 
Education no later than 
10-21 -92 to be consid­
ered for an interview. 
• Applicant will be noti­
fied for an interview as 
soon as arrangements 
have been completed. 
The Floyd County 
Board of Education 
does not discriminate 
on the basis of race, 
color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital 
status, sex, or handi­
cap in employment, 
educational programs, 
or activities as set forth 
in Title OX & VL. • 

1019, 10114 
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How to tell the boss you're leaving 
DEAR BRUCE: I have worked 

for the same outfit for the last three 
and a half years. I have absolutely no 
beef with them whatsoever. How­
ever, I have been offered a better job. 
Better from the immediate standpoint 
of more salary. But more important, 
the opportunities toadvanceare much 
greater than my current situation. 

The problem is, I don't know how 
to tell the boss I'm leaving. I've al­
ready told my new employer that I 
had to give this fellow two weeks' 
notice, that he's entitled to it and I 
wouldn't leave without doing so. He 
agreed. 

they were leaving. It's a natural order 
of events. There's nothing immoral 
or disloyal about changing jobs to 
better oneself. 

If the employer is honorable, he 
deserves the longest possible warn­
ing time so he can make his plans. If, 
on the other hand, his history is one of 
abuse to employees who tell him 
early, then two weeks is sufficient 

vate fmns that issue these warranties. 
Oftentimes, private warranties are 

so fat and juicy, there's no way in the 
world the companies can deliver the 
goods. They take the premium and 
either go belly-up or take off. Either 
way, the consumer comes out on the 
short end. 

As long as the warranty is issued 
by the manufacturer of the automo­
bile, I think you're reasonably safe. 

Having said that, given your siw-

ation of low mileage, I would be 
inclined to take the warranty, be­
cause so many covered items are as 
much or more a function of age as 
they are a function of mileage. I would 
go for it, if I were you. 

(Send your questions to: Smart 
Money, P.O. Box 5202, Hudson, FL 
34674. Questions of general interest 
will be answered in future columns. 
Due to the volume of mail personal 
replies cannot be provided.) 

Dl .. -
STALLARD MARTIN 

Broker-Auctioneer 886-0021 "Specializing in 

·Sales 
886·9500 

~ASSOCIATES; 

WAYNE JOHNSON-t78-5143 
DOUG WIREMAN-78g·3918 
BETIY MARTIN-886.0021 

• Auctions 
Supplier of good will 

The new job starts in about three 
months. What do I say? Do I tell the 
boss now, or do I wait until two 
weeks before?-A.B.,Portland, Ore. 

DEAR A.B.: You know this 
company better than anyone else. 
What is their track record in this 
situation? Some companies immedi­
ately say, "Clean out your desk," or 
something similar to that. If that's the 
case, then I would not tell them until 
a couple of weeks before the new job 
was beginning. 

DEAR BRUCE: I'm buying a 
new automobile and I've been of­
fered an extended warranty. I drive 
about the average 12,000 miles a 
year. For about $600, I can have ·the 
car warranty extended from 12,000 
to60,000miles(orfiveyears, which­
ever comes sooner). There's not a 
question in my mind that I'll keep the 
car five years. What do you think?­
O.N., Rochester, N.Y. @ 234 North Lake Orin 

N•"·-• Preotollllbq. lll:y. 416153 

MIKE DAVIS-686.()081 
SHEILA WEST--674·94n 

• Appraisals 
Hayward Scott Is a supply coordinator for Mountain Top Bakery. The 
bakery supplies cookies for many different labels and also supplies jobs 
to Eastern Kentuckians. 

DEAR O.N.: You're truly the 
averagedriver-12,000milesayear. 

You're not buying a warranty for 
60,000 miles, but rather 48,000 be­
cause the fust 12,000 are covered 
anyway (at least I gather so). 

MIDDLE CREEK ***NEW LISTING*** 
$55,000. This three-bedroom, on•bath home 
with living room, kltchenldlnlng combination 
and utility room Central heat and air. Situated 
on a nice lot. 

People, Places & Things ... bJ lh·th Jones First of all, I am only comfortable 
with guarantees issued by the manu­
facturer of the automobile, not pri­
vate companies. In most jurisdictions, 
there is little or no regulation of pri-

ABBOTT MOUNTAIN-$52,900. Three·bed­
room, two·bath home with over 1700 sq. h. of 
living space. Featuring living room with c• 
thedral ceiling and fireplace, formal dining 
room, large laundry room and partial base­
ment Owner says make an offer. For more 
details call Allied Auction & Realty. 

Mountain Top Bakery, located on 
upper John's Creek Road in Meta, 
Kentucky has been in operation for 
about two years. The bakery itself is 
a 375,000 square foot building. It is 
an independent baker of cookies and 
crackers. Mountain Top Bakers work 
with many different labels, such as 
Keebler, Nabisco, Girl Scout, and 
others. The bakery's parent is Con­
solidated Biscuit, which is based in 
McCombs, Ohio. 

Hayward Scott is a supply coordi­
nator for Mountain Top Bakery. He 
is in charge of buying and maintain-

• inginventoryofallmaintenanceparts 
and equipment. He also oversees the 
preventive maintenance program at 
the bakery. 

Scott graduated fonn Cumberland 
High School in Cumberland, Ohio. 
He also graduated fonn the Harlan 
Area Vocational School. Heattended 
Eastern Kentucky University for two 
years and has taken numerous courses 
offered by various manufacturers. 

In his career, Hayward Scott has 
worked in many different fields. He 
has been an outboard mechanic. He 
was a disc jockey at WDHR WPKE 
in Pikeville. (Coincidentally, his 
brother, Craig Scott, is the host of the 
nationally aired radio show, Country 
Calender.) Scott worked for years as 
a parts and service manager in the 
auto industry. 

Scott has worked extensively in 
the coal industry. He's been a ware­
housing supervisor, a maintenance 
supervisor, a purchasing agent, and 
mine manager. After all this work in 
the coal industry, why would a man 
switch to a factory job? 

"There was a very good reason," 
said Scott. ''The mine I worked for 

~ had been sold and the owners moved 
their mining operation to West Vir-

Controlling theft 
seminar planned 

With the Christmas season around 
the corner, area businesses should be 
thinking about increases in sales and 
also, unfortunately, increases in shop­
lifting. 

To help local retailers combat this 
expensive problem, the Small Busi-

. , ness Council of the Pike County 
Chamber of Commerce will be spon­
soring a free seminar entitled "Shop­
lifting and Internal Theft Control" on 
Thursday, October 22, from noon to 
1 p.m. at the Chamber office. The' 
speaker for this event will be Mr. 
Gary Coleman, K-Mart's loss con­
trol manager. 

• 

Everyone is invited to attend this 
seminar but should register in ad­
vance by calling the Chamber at 432-
5504 by October 20. This is provided 
as a free service; however, partici­
pants are asked to bring their own 
lunch. 

Additionally, the Chamber has 
available a short video on "Shoplift­
ing Prevention." Those interested 
should call the Chamber to schedule 
an appropriate viewing time. 

CHRISTMAS SEALS~ 
THE #1 HOPE 

FOR THE 
#3 KILLER: 

LUNG DISEASE. 

TAMERICAN 
LUNG 

~~c~,?r£!tJJ£~ 

ginia where it's easier to get mining 
pennits. Consequently, I was out of 
work and had to seek employment in 
other fields." 

Scott said that working at the 
cookie factory was very different from 
working in the mines. He said it was 
good to have air conditioning, a 
heater, and his own office. He also 
said it was much cleaner and better 
than the mines but the wages are 
lower. 

He believes that Mountain Top 
Bakery opened in this area due to an 
abundant supply of workers and the 
the willingness of area people to work. 
The bakery has given employment to 
many unskilled young workers. The 
bakery currently operates 3 shifts a 
day, 5 days a week. Approximately 
300-400 people are employed by the 
Mountain Top Bakery. 

The factory tries to give some­
thing back to the area besides jobs. It 
often gives items to charities. · Just 
recently,MountainTopsenttwotrail­
ers full of cookies to the victims of 
Hurricane Andrew. 

Winn-Dixie posts 
increase in earnings 
for first. quarter 

Wino-Dixie Stores, Inc. an­
nounced a 25.2 percent increase in 
earnings over last year for the first 
quarter of ftScal 1993 at the annual 
shareholders meeting held recently. 
Net earnings from operations of$33.4 
million represented $.44 per share 
for the first quarter of fiscal 1993 
compared to $26.7 million, or $.35 
per share for the first quarter of last 
year. 

Sales for the first quarter of fiscal 
1993 totaled $2.4 billion, up $58.2 
.nillion, representing a 2.5 percent 
increase over the previous year. 

Winn-Dixie opened or acquired 
five new stores averaging 49,100 
square feet during the first quarter 
and closed 14 stores averaging 25,500 
square feet. Twelve stores were 
remodeled or enlarged during the 
period. Currently, there are 36 new 
stores under construction and 44 
locations being remodeled or en­
larged. 

You didn't indicate what kind of 
work you do, or how difficult or easy 
it would be to replace you. In the 
event that you are an integral part of 
a small enterprise, and it would take 
a considerable amount of time to 
replace you, my inclination would be 
to tell the employer early on that you 
are leaving. If he has a history of 
understanding and working with you, 
and wanting you to work with him to 
train people, then I would tell him. 

Let's face it, most of us have had 
to tell a boss we're leaving. And all of 
us, as bosses, have had to sit down 
with employees who were telling us 

Don't 

I'm Recyclable! 

0='1 
(':, (\ 

'~(-;;/ 
A Home Like Yours Ocsen·es A Sign Lil\c Ours 

DOROTHY HARRIS, Brok• 

886-9100 
H00-264=9165 

REALTOR ASSOCIATES; 

~ AFTER 5;00 p.M, [9 l.:.J Ellen Holbrook-174-i558 
100., •ous1oc Elnt Sttvtnt-..,.14 ® 
OPPORTUNITY J<artn Jalllll0n"a.i1$3 IIEAliOII 

Gltn Holbrook - 3U-21M 
Brtncbl Sturgll "zu...s 

Independently Owned And Optrlted. 

9 GOOD REASONS TO LIST WITH 
CENTURY 21 AMERICAN WAY REALTY!! 

ABBOU CREEK: 4 bedrooms, 2.5 baths w"~ ;\c111c:h~n, family rvom, 2 ~ IIIII 1110Ja. 
Appr(lximataly 3000 sq. fl shuatad on 2 larg SO . ""*F. 
PRESTONSBURG: A reai"GEN" describes t!lj.' ;\c1 -.drvom home on hcrMIIIlt. c.dlrlllllll­
with a garage, deck and 1 beautHui stone fb SO .~.f. 
PRESTONSBURG: Newly decorated 3-bedroo,.. ·.._ c1 homt with a ful balllltiW, large famly room 
with glass doors opening onto a large priVI.SOa: _.,deck. New central heat and lir. U.OU·F. 
WAYLANP: Do you like sitting in front of a co>''~ ;\c1 • and you art looking for a home with ftnctcl 
yard lor the kids in a good neighborhood. T SO • .,,ay be for you. ~1-F. 
.PAHA;. SPECTACULAR Is tho only way to dosc:r~~ · .._ c1 ,mtl Over2800tq. fl ofllvlngspac:t on almge, 
beautifully landsscaped private lol4 bedroc SO a: • .o, lots of wood and glaa S.. utillllttand 111111 
maintenance. S~10.F. 
MABE CREEK: 2 acres mil of level property wft~ • ;\c1••dfrontabt. 1991 FIMt.od 14165tralltrwlth 
block foundation, back porch and ail applia. SO .-F. 
PRESTONSBURG: Convenient locaton with 1 .,.,.. .._c.\ '-d yard. EnJoythnummedn thlt 3-t.clroom, 
2·bath brick home. It offers a nice family roo1 SO a: ••• j)ptd ldtchtl\ 1-car gll'llgtlnd Ill uNinlllled 
basement M·OOS.F. 
PRESTONSBURG· Two-bedroom apartmenl SO \c1.1kt Drive. 50 1125 lot zonecl fDr commercial 
use. H-008-F. 
PLEASANT HILLS· Ranch-style home whh 3 ·~O \c1 ~baths with lnllt Ina, grap1 m11 and utBity 
building. Y~IB-M. ~ 

WOULD YOU LIKE TO SEE YOUR HOME HERE? 
TELL US WHAT YOU WANT .. .IT'S AS GOOD AS DONE!! · 

US 23 PRESTONSBURG449,i00. Three 
bedrooms, 1 1/2 batha, living room, kitchen! 
dining combo, and utility. Privacy and con· 
venlence are special feature• you will appre· 
elate. Call for details I 

HAGER HILL JOHNSON CO.~EW LISTING. 
$45,900. Conveniently located to US 23 and 
Hager Hill Market, tastefully decorated with 3 
bedrooms, living room, kitchen/dining room 
combo, bath, utility, carport and fenced lot. 
Great nelghbomood-a great deal. Call Allied 
Auction & Realty, 886-9500. 

PRESTONSBURG -$125,000-Beau­
tiful 4 BR , FA, garage. A.e1ZF 

ALLEN- $100,000 • ~ BR, 2 1/2 ABBOTTCREEK-$52,500·Charm· 
baths, 3,100sq. ft. +1·, garage. A-805F ing 3 bedroom with fireplace. A./576F 

MIDDLE CREEK- $22,000 - 15 vacant lots for one low pricel 
MARnN- $49,500 • 3 bedroom home with 5 acres +I· of privacy. 
PRESTONSBURG -$92,500 · Large 3 BR , inground pool, big lot. 
PRESTONSBURG - $49,500 -In Townl Cozy 3 BR, nice yard. 
ARKANSAS CREEK - $35,000 • Investment Property I 14 acres+/­
WOODLAND HILLS ESTATES $75,000 · Log house, 4 acres. 
SPURLOCK - $92,500 - Country charm In this 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath. 
ENDICOTT- $129,000 - Grocery/ sporting goods store w/5 apts. 
AUXIER - $100,000 ·Commercial building with 3 BR apt. lrg. lot. 

A-838F 
A-437F 

A.e20F 

A·715F 
A·712F 
A·734F 

A·76fE 
A·792F 

A·793F 

Thl' Bl·st Sellers 

886-3700 Bill Gibson, GAl, CAl Broker 
Marcie Estepp 789-1943 
Joyce Allen 886-2523 
Greg DeRossett 886-001 0 

PALS 
MEMBER-=:; 

Jo Bentley 886-8032 

You're Invited! 

OPEN HOUSE 
.m. 

Middle Creek 
Explore all the room this 5 bedroom home has to offer. The large 
family room is great for entertaining indoors and you can use the patio 
and over 8 acres for your outdoor fun! 
Directions: Approx. 3 miles from traffic lights at the Prestonsburg 
Village Shopping Center on the Mtn. Parkway. House is on the left. 
Refreshments! Door Prize! 

Call the office for more details. See you there! 

The Best Sellers 432-8181 .. ta 

WAYLAND--Just Reduced-You don't need to bring anything but the family to move into this home. 3 bedrooms, 1 bath, 
natural stone fireplace. Also includes 3 bedroom suites, living room suite, dinette set with hutch and six chairs, TV, end tables, 
coffee table, recliner. refrigerator and stove. Also enjoy the 18-h. above-ground pool for the kids I And a 16x20 bam. Priced 
to sell. 

PRESTONSBURG--Good investment. Five apartments that 
carry their weight. Two 2-bedroom and three 1-bedroom. 
Privacy fence, and parking in back. Call now for more details 
on this moneymakerl 

GARBEU-Located on Route 80, New Listingl3 bedrooms, 
2 baths, approx. 1,152 sq. ft. An affordable home at $28,500.00. 

~-Life has its rewards and they are all found in this 
beautiful home. Includes 4 bedrooms, 3 baths, 2-car garage 
plus a carport, finished basement with wet bar. Nice neigh­
borhood. 

PERMELE CNEAB PAYIP) New Listing. Cozy 1 1/2-story 
home with 3 bedrooms and 1 1/2 baths. A really good buy at 
$49,900.00. Call Today! 

U.S. 23 SOUTH-Everything goes with this 3-bedroom home I 
Property contains approx. 3 acres. Owner wants to sell out 
quickly. Owner is selling home, furniture, small outbuilding, 
tools, mower, plus a car! Call today! 
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Internal Revenue Service is always open to suggestions 
Q: I wish the IRS could explain a 

little more in detail about passive 
income and losses especially in Pub­
lication 17 (Your Federal Income 

. Tax). I purchased a rental house and 
I don't understand these rules. Maybe 
a few more examples would be help­
ful. Do they take suggestions? -
B.T., Atlanta 

A. Yes they do. Not only do they 
take suggestions, they welcome them. 
Your ideas and comments should be 
mailed to: Internal Revenue Service 
Technical Publications Branch, 1111 
Constitution A venue, NW, Washing­
ton, DC, 20224. 

Q: My son will have a series of 
operations resulting from facial bums. 
The costs will be very expensive and 
are not all covered by our hospitali­
zation insurance. Is this deductible? 
The laws were recently changed for 
this kind of medical expense.-J.L., 
Austin, Texas 

PCC professor 
published 

This week, Prestonsburg Commu­
nity College received a copy of Dr. 
Reza Akhlaghi's most recently pub­
lished paper "A Pal-Type Lacunary 
Interpolation Problem." This es­
say was published In one of the 
world's most prestigious mathe­
matics journals, Acta Mathematics 
Hungarica, a production of the 
Hungarian Academy of Sciences. 

Weight Watchers sold 
to parent franchiser 

Weight Watchers ofKentuckiana, 
Inc., has been sold to the parent fran­
chiser Weight Watchers International, 
a subsidiary of The H. J. Heinz 
Company. 

The announcement was made 
jointly by area directors Kay and Jim 
Morrissey and Weight Watchers 
International President Lelio Par­
ducci. 

The Morrisseys opened their 
Weight Watchers class in Louisville 
September 18, 1967. The sale was 
announced shortly after the 25th 
anniversary of Weight Watchers 
coming to Kentucky and Southern 
Indiana. 

There are currently 195 classes 
being held weeki y in Kentuckiana in 
87 different cities and towns. The 
Morrisseys said the Weight Watch­
ers Program will continue unchanged 
in this area. 

AT&T price reduction 
for long distance calls 
within Kentucky 

AT & T has reduced it prices for 
direct dialed long distance calls within 
Kentucky by an average of 3.6%. 
Prices for intrastate business services 
also were reduced. The price reduc­
tion became effective September 3, 
1992. 

The reduction is a result of a 
Kentucky Public Service Commis­
sion order for South Central Bell to 
reduce access charges-those charges 
AT&T and other carriers must pay 
Bell to connect to the local telephone 
users. 

"We're very pleased that we can 
pass these savings along to our Ken­
tucky long-distance callers," said 
Carolyn Marek, AT&T'sState Man­
ager-Government Affairs. 

"With this reduction, we've made 
state-wide calling more affordable, 
state business more competitive, and 
Kentucky more attractive to new 
business," Marek added. 

Marek said a ten-minute direct­
dialed AT&T call from Frankfon to 
Lexington made during the business 
day, which previously cost $2.30, is 
now only $2.13; a ten-minute call 
across the state from Paducah to 
Jackson during the evening rate pe­
riod which previously cost $2.99 now 
costs only $2.82 and a ten-minute 
call between Lexington and Louis­
ville during the night/weekend rate 
period that previously cost$1. 79 now 
costs $1. 72. 

The monthly charge for subscrib­
ers to AT&T's discount calling plan, 
Reach Out(R) Kentucky, has been 
reduced from $10.40 to $9.90, with 
additional period minutes costing 
about 8.6 percent less than previous 
rates. 

A: The deduction for cosmetic 
surgery is quite limited now. How­
ever, you can still include as a medi­
cal deduction the amount you pay for 
cosmetic surgery if it is necessary to 
improve a deformity arising from or 
directly related toacongenitalabnor­
mality, a personal injury resulting 
from an accident or trauma or a dis­
figuring disease. Otherwise, there is 
no tax deduction. 

are the tax consequences?-L.R., 
Green Bay, Wis. 

A: Ifyoucashoutthepolicies, you 
will owe tax only on the amount that 
exceeds the total premiums you paid. 
Chances are that you probably paid 
more in premiums than you'veaccu­
mulated in cash value. However, any 
dividends and interest earned by the 
policy would be subject to tax. 

benefits but am not sure how much. 
How can I find out?-F.R., Reno, 
Nev. 

Security retirement bcnefit'l, you must 
have credit for 10years ofworkor40 
quarters of coverage. To ascertain if 
you have enough work credits, visit 
any local Social Security Admini­
strationofficeorcalll-800-772-1213. 
They have a form that you can use to 
check your work record and deter­
mine if you meet the minimum re­
quirementforbenefitpayments. They 
can also determine the amount you 
will receive if you qualify. 

years time at 7 3/4 percent annual 
interest, compounded quarterly? -
J.L., Raleigh, N.C. 

A: GeneraJiy, to qualify for Social 
A. At 7 3/4 percent annual interest 

compounded quarterly, the $1,500 
annual contribution would accumu­
late to $23,439 after 10 years. After 

THE TAX ADVISOR 

Q: I have several whole life insur­
ance policies that have a sizable cash 
value. I would like to cash them in 
and put the money elsewhere. What 

Q: I have worked off and on at 
various jobs most of my adult life. As 
a result, I am not covered by any 
employee pension plan. However, I 
believe I qualify for Social Security 

lb. 
"SILVER PLATTER" FRESH 

Assorted Pork Chops 
lSOLD IN PKCS. OF 10-10.5-LBS.J 

"IN THE DAIRY CASE" 

Kroger orange Juice 

U.S. GRADE A 

Kroger WAMPLER I LONGACRE 

Skim Milk Whole 
Chicken Fryers Gallon 

$f19 
Pound 

liSt 

GEORGE 

15 years you would have accumu­
lated $22,500 and earned approxi- • 
mately $21,403 of interest income. ' 
Or, a total of $43,903. But why stop 

Q. Every year I faithfully pay 
$1,500 toward my IRA. How much 
would I accumulate in my IRA in 10 

at $1,500, go for the $2,000 maxi­
mum. Ifyou'remarriedandcan use a 
spousal account, the maximum is 
$2,250. 

12-Pak 
12-oz. cans 

CAFFEINE FREE DIET PEPSI, MOUNTAIN DEW, 

Diet Pepsi or .pepsi Cola 

WITH PRICES LIKE THIS . .. 
PEPPERONI OR WHY SHOP ANYWHERE ELSE! 

Mama Rosa summer's Eve Deluxe Pizzas Douche 16-oz. Pkg. 4-Pack Bonus Package 

JFor'S ,, •• 
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How to avoid family 
bad credit mix-ups 

DEAR BRUCE: I love my fa­
ther, but he's a deadbeat You would 
be a rare person in our area, if my dad 
hasn't, in some way, done you in on 
some kind of a deal. Whether it's a 
department store, individual store, 
landlord, my pop's been there, and 
stuck you. 

I, on the other hand, have done 
everything in my power to keep my 
creditreputation above reproach. The 
fact is that it's causing me no end of 
problems because of my name. I'm a 
jWlior. Every time I apply for credit, 

_. it gets rejected. And there's always a 
~ hassle until I prove it's the old man 

~ho has the bad credit and not me. 
Is there anything that I can do or 

say to the credit-reporting agencies 
to get this straightened out? We do 
have the same name, except he doesn't 

·use senior. But I have to use junior 
since he's still alive. Obviously, I 
don't want my initials in the paper­
Reader 

SMART MONEY 

BRUCE 

DEAR READER: It's a shame 
that a son has to be responsible for his 
father's misdeeds. It's unfortunate 
that he's developed this reputation. 

Have you thought about changing 
your name? For example, if your 

,.. name is John R. Smith, why not J. 

• 

Robert Smith? At least, it's a little 
different from your dad's. 

Furthermore, you are allowed to 
put a letter in your file with the major 
credit-reporting agencies. I would do 
so. Simply point out that you are who 
you are, and be certain to include 
your age since that's one thing that 
could not be confused with your dad. 

I think the letter, plus legally us­
ing your first initial only and a middle 
name, might take a great deal of the 
confusion out of this. 

As always, use junior after your 

name. At least it can be more easily 
explained when the time comes, as it 
will some time. 

DEAR BRUCE: I am a beauti­
cian and I just bought out my boss. 
There are two ways that I can work 
this deal with the older women and 
one guy who work here: 

One way is on a percentage basis. 
That's the way it's been here up until 
now. They get half of what they pro­
duce. I get half, and I pay all the bills 
(insurance, rent, lights and so forth). 

That would be a real good deal 
except for one problem. It's pretty 
hard to keep track of what they're 
cutting and what they're doing. It 
wouldn't be hard to bury a perm or a 
haircut (Before you say it, I will, "It 
takes one to know one.") 

My other option (and what I want 
to do), is go to a straight rental. They 
pay me so much per week, per chair, 
and whatever they take in is theirs. 
What do you think of the idea?­
L.P., Detroit 

DEAR L.P.: We11, you're not 
exactly cutting a new furrow here. 
The idea of renting barber positions 
is common, and it does overcome the 
problem you've described, which is 
stealing. 

I have no problem with renting, as 
long as you come up with a number 
that they can live with and you can 
live with. It should be a "yes/yes" 
deal. Of course, this makes them 
independent operators, which elimi­
nates the need for you to carry any 
workers' compensation, collect taxes, 
and so forth. 

You are strictly a landlord in this 
position. And as long as you are play­
ing it straight, and charge them a 
fiXed amount every week (without 
regard to what business is like), I 
would be more comfortable this way. 

It also requires a ton less book­
keeping on your part. And it rewards 
the person who hustles, and penal­
izes the one who does not, more di­
rectly than the percentage basis. 

(Send your questions to: Smart 
Money, P.O. Box 5202, Hudson, FL 
34674. Questions of general interest 
will be answered in future columns. 
Due to the volume of mail, personal 
replies cannot be provided.) 
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Candidate for Congress John Doug Hays held a press conference at 
American Standard at Paintsville to announce his opposition to the 
North American Free Trade Agreement and General Agreement on 
Tarrlffs and Trade. 

Prestonsburg is site for small 
business council meeting 

Members of the General 
Assembly's Task Force for Small 
Business will join small business 
owners and managers from across 
the region at an upcoming Small 
Business Council Meeting on Tues­
day, October 27 at the Holiday Inn. 
Georgia Johnson with Johnson Bros. 
Enterprises in Pikeville is chainnan 
of the event and will coordinate the 
activities. The meeting begins at noon 

Unemployment 
rate increases 

In the Big Sandy region, the un­
employment rate rose from a revised 
10.1 percent in July to a preliminary 
10.3 percent in August. Local rates 
ranged from 7.9 percent in Johnson 
CoWlty to 14.4 percent in Magoffm 
CoWlty, one of three counties in the 
ADD with a rate at or above 10 per­
cent 

The monthly sample of claimants 
of unemployment insurance benefits 
showed 43.3 percent had worked in 
mining, 16.1 percent in trade, 11.7 
percentinconstructionand 10.4per­
cent in services . 

with a luncheon and will conclude by 
1:30 p.m. Sponsored by the Ken­
tucky Chamber of Commerce, the 
meeting will include discussions on 
legislative issues of concern to small 
business including health care, work­
ers' comp, and the constitutional 
amendments. 

"We have three primary goals with 
the regional meetings," said Steve 
Stevens, director of small business 
for the Kentucky Chamber of Com­
merce. "First, we want to educate 
small business owners, managers, and 
personnel on current legislative is­
sues having small business impact. 
Second, we will listen to the needs 
and concerns of small business people 
across the state and react as their 
advocate in Frankfort. Finally, we 
want to Wlite the small businesses of 
Kentucky to network, speak, and work 
together for a more cooperative small 
business environment" 

The Holiday Inn is located on US 
23 S. in Prestonsburg. Tickets are 
$15 per person, including lunch. 
Reservations should be made at least 
three days in advance through Bev­
erly Standiferofthe Kentucky Cham­
ber of Commerce at 502/695-4700. 

Havoline 10 Wt. 
Motor Oil 

Prestone 

• Each Quart /LIMIT ONE CASE 
Reg. Price Thereafter 

Antifreeze 

99 
Sale 
Price 4.49 
'fl:t!f'e • I .SIJ 
t:; J.99 
After Maif.fn Rebate 

1!~11-m 
Valve Cover 

Gaskets 

FromJ99 
Pain table 

Spray 
Unr:fercoat To IT.99Each 

Prices Good Through Saturday, October 17th, 1992 o We Reoerve the Right to Umit Quantities o Complete Wormnty Information Available at All Advance Auto Ports Stores 

PRESTONSBURG, KY 886 3594 
650 NORTH LAKE DR. • 

PDQ' SPECIAL ORDER MERCHANDISE NOT SUBJECT TO SALE PRICES 

STORE HOURS: 
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SUNDAY 10 A.M.· 6 P.M. 
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New AT&T products offer high-tech phone 
features to small and mid-size business customers 

AT&T announced recently a vari­
ety of products and enhancements to 
its office phone systems, including 
an incoming caller identification 
feature for itsP ARTNER System and 
a new DEFINITY (R) Communica­
tions System for smaller business 
customers. 

Mark Weaver, marketing manager 
for AT &T's General Business Sys­
tems business unit, said AT&T' s goal 
is to offer customers the features and 
technology they need without arlifi­
ciallimits tied to the size of the opera­
tion. "The backbone of our product 
strategy is investment protcction,and 
we are committed to providing cus­
tomers with communication systems 
that can grow in size and sophistica­
tion," said Weaver. 

The new PARTNER System fea­
ture, incoming caller identification, 
lets businesses be more responsive to 
customers. The caller's phone num­
ber is displayed as the phone rings, 

,and small businesses can quickly 
recognize that a regular customer is 
on the line. 

For example, the owner of a neigh­
borhood delicatessen frequently gets 
the same customers ordering 
lunchtime deliveries to nearby of­
fices. With caller identification, the 
customer can be greeted, by name, 
when the call is answered. 

A new voice messaging system 
for AT &rs PARTNER (R) II sys­
tem-PARTNERMail(TM}-offers 
customers Auto Attendant, Call 
Answer, and voice mail. Partner Mail 
lets users send and retrieve voice 
mail messages at any time of day or 

night, and is especially useful for 
companies with sales reps on the road, 
who need a quick and efficient way to 
communicate with both customers 
and colleagues. 

A smaller PBX -the DEFINITY 
System Generic 3s-makes the ad­
vanced capabilities and sophisticated 
technology of the DEFINITY system 
economical for customers with as 
few as 40 telephone lines. 

According to Weaver, the system 
is ideally suited formulti-sitecompa­
nies with small satellite offices or 
single-location busines.<;es that require 
sophisticated PBX functions. 

The company also introduced 
enhancements to its MERLIN LEG­
END CommWlications System. The 
system, introduced last year, has the 
flexibility to operate as a key system, 
a PBX, or a hybride, changing as the 
customer's business needs change. 

The new Integrated Solution III 
(IS III) is a multi-application PC 
platform integrated with the MER­
LIN LEGEND System that can si­
multaneously run AUDIX (TM) 
Voice Power-AT&T's PC-based 
voice mail system-call accounting, 
and system administration. 

IS III also includes AT&T Fax 
Attendant, an automated fax man­
agement system that lets users trans­
mit, receive and broadcast fax mes­
sages 24 hours a day, from any touch­
tone phone, as easily as they send and 
receive voice mail messages. It en­
ables users to broadcast documents 
to as many as 1 ,000 locations, leav­
ing the office fax machine free to 
send and receive other messages. 

Advanced Home Care, Inc. receives highest level 
of accreditation from national organization 

Advanced Home Care, Inc., with 
offices in Prestonsburg, was recently 
Accredited with Commendation by 
the Joint Commission on Accredita­
tion of Healthcarc Organizations. Of 
the 1 ,502 home care organizations 
surveyed between January 1, 1991 to 
July 30, 1992 only 18 percent have 
achieved this highest level of accredi­
tation. 

Advanced Home Care, which 
provides home medical equipment 
and oxygen services, received the 

Red Ryder 
Gas Shocks 

99 
Each 

Wheel 
Bearings 

Fro~49 

To44.9DEach 

Or Starters 

Fro~' 
To IJ9.99EachExch. 

award after demonstrating an out­
standing rate of compliance with the 
Joint Commission's national stan­
dards for quality care. 

Pidure the Seven 
Dwarfs without 

a forest. 
( nltl Vcu Can Pr.,Pnl fcresl f.r-.. 

~ • 

Charger 
6-AHP6112 Volt 

1,99 
Each 
Mfg.# SE-86 
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Treet 
¢ 

12 oz. 
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YON 

CARAVEL 

Porcelain China 
4~~= $399 WlthEach 
Setting* $10.00 Purchase 

*Consists of Dinner Plate, Cup, Saucer 
and Salad Plate. Cereal/Soup Bowl 

Sold Separately 

Pepsi · 
and 

Pepsi Products 

2 Liter 

Food lyon 

Bread 
¢ 

4 Roll Pkg. 
New Crop U.S. #1 

,oe"0 Potatoes 20 oz. Loaf 

$ 49 
101b.Bag 

Thursday, Friday, Saturday, October 15-17 

You'll go hog wild over our prices! 
Whole Pork Loin .. 

$ 29 SLICED 

I FREE b. 

Look for r---------------, r---------------, r---------------, 
many more Buy One 18 oz. Buy One Regular Roll Buy One 1 0 use 

Jif Peanut Butter Bounty Towels Ultra Rinso 
great specials at Regular Price at Regular Price Laundry Detergent 

at Regular Price 

and buy-one, Get 3 lb. Get Regular Roll 
Get 1 Gallon Regular 

Crisco Shortening Bounty Towels get-one-free Clorox Bleach 

~~y$149 For 39¢ For 59¢ offers in 
the store! 

Only Only 

L Limit 1 with Coupon .J L Limit 1 with Coupon .J L umit 1 with aoupon .J --------------- --------------- ---------------
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