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School Board Action Is Sought 
Against Employees Using Drugs 

A petition calling for firm school 
board action against any teachers or 
other school employees involved in il­
legal drug use was presented to the 
Floyd County Board of Education at its 
regular monthly meeting last Wednes­
day. 

-We were reasonably safe and 
perhaps half sane on the Fourth . We 
worked. Didn't make the Eagle scream 
but, at that, did as much as if we had 
been free to whoop it up. 

TROUBLE 

Hospital Union 
Strike Is Over 

The petition, bearing 1258 
signatures, asked of the board 
"immediate action to set up a definite 
policy against any teacher or employee 
in our school system who publicly ad­
vocates the use of any illegal 
substance, such as marijuana." 

"We want to be assured that these 
persons not be allowed to continue 
leaching or influencing our children," 
said the petitioners, identified as 
"concerned parents of Floyd county." 

Vietta Jones, of Banner, who 

If this newspaper puts in a belated 
appearance this week, you are hereby 
invited to join us in blaming, in varying 
styles of expression and degrees of in­
tensity ranging from hot to hotter, that 
computer of ours that went on the 
blink, refused to compute and insisted 
on turning plain words into **xx ! ! or 
something to that effect. 

In a word, we've had our headaches, 
with not a pain-killer in sight. 

CONFESSION 
The first week of July is well along, 

as they say, and I am yet to set fool in a 
boat on Dewey Lake this year. 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 
Robert Dale Carpenter, 21, and Patty 

Sue Slone, 16, both of Prestonsburg ; 
Clark Johnson, 19, of Dema, and Deb­
bie Lynn Vanderpool, 16, both of 
Wayland. 

SUITS FILED 

t., presented the request to the board, em­
phasized that the signers were con­
cerned about the public advocacy 
rather than the private use of illegal 
drugs by school employees. The peti­
tion urged, however, that even the use 
of drugs, marijuana specifically, be 
considered grounds for dismissal 
under a state law permitting dismissal 
of teachers for "immoral conduct 
unbecoming a teacher." 

Fisheries personnel shown during a recent electro-fishing season. 

I miss the Jake, just as I do baseball, 
but I find that neither is an absolute 
necessity. It would appear that we all 
are creatures of habit. Time was when, 
if I missed fishing at least one time a 
week, that week was a dead loss, might 
as well never have been , and I 
wandered around in sort of daze. 

Jerry A. Patton vs. Pamela Jo Pat­
ton ; Teresa Stumbo Hall vs. Terry 
Dean Hall ; Kenneth Hatfield vs. Gay 
Hatfield ; Terry Douglas Hayes vs . 
Cheryl Ann H. Hayes; Doreen Monroe 
vs . Jerry Wayne Monroe ; Alma Jean 
Paige vs. Anna Sue Fatten et al; 
Yellonda Edmonds Akers \!>'>. Tony 
Akers; Irene Jewel Stevenson vs . 
Karen Perkins Stevenson ; Jacqueline 
E. Cotton vs. Edward Leon Cotton; 
Richard Lyons vs. Campbell Motors , 
Inc.; Elkane Sexton vs . Com­
monwealth Fire and Casualty et a) ; 
Sandra Kay Collins vs. Randell Lee 
Collins; Firsll':ational Bank vs. Leroy 
Meredith Jr.; Sarah B. Cross vs . 
William Cross ; Brenda Johnson vs . 
Billy Johnson; Diana Lynn Cline vs. 
David Evert Cline ; Linda Baldridge 
May vs. Gary Alan May; Floyd County 
vs . Willie Hall ; Linda A. Innis vs . · 
l':athan Innis ; Betsy Lee Lafferty vs. 
Kenneth Ray Lafferty. 

Fish Given Shock Treatment 
Now, the weeks slide by, I don't go 

fishing, and still I manage to survive. 
The truth is-and I am almost asham­
ed to tell it-I'm out of the habit. 

Board members responded warily to 
the petition, Superintendent E. P. 
Grigsby, Jr. noting that the board 
could not adopt a policy that would 
"superseda" state law. 

Pressed as to whether the advocacy 
or use of marijuana by teachers might 
be actionable under the Jaw, Grigsby 
said he would refer the question to the 
board's attorney, Woodrow Burchett. 

(In April, Sandy Boyd, then head 
teacher at Prater Creek grade school, 
publicly defended his use of mari­
juana. The teacher was earlier charg­
ed in district court here with supplying 
a Betsy Layne high school junior with 
marijuana, with instructions to sell it. 
A pre-trial hearing in the case has been 
set for August 6. Boyd resigned from 
the school system.) 

Tht boRrd CJ!so heard questions at 
Wedi1e5day's meeting concerning a 
drug education program proposed for 
the coming school year. While Supt. 
Grigsby indicated that a program 
would be adopted at the next board 
meeting for implementation during the 
school year, Asst. Supt. Ron Hager ad­
vised the board that training teachers 
for the program could cost more than 
$200,000. 

Grigsby told the board that, since 
federal cuts in the school system's Ti­
tle I (remedial reading) program had 
been less than anticipated, some school 
board personnel would be restored to 
the program. Title I funds, which were 
expected to be cut by 25 percent, were 
in fact cut by 10 percent. Meeting in ex­
ecutive session, the board decided that 
five of the eight teachers and three of 
seven social workers transferred from 
the program would be restored to it. 

The board hired Josten's, a Clarks­
ville, Tenn. firm, to prepare the school 
annual for a second year, without in­
crease in cost. In response to a ques­
tion from the audience, Grigsby said 
the firm had agreed to provide 

' stronger binding for the annual this 
year. 

Hoffmann and Burchett, Martin ar­
chitects, were retained to prepare 

(See Story No. 4, Page 4) 

The uniformed men launch their 
specially-equipped boat by night. Once 
on the water, a powerful gasoline­
powered generator is started and flood 
lights glare on the surface as the craft 
slips along the edge of the shoreline. 

It's not a group of commandos carry­
ing out some special mission, but state 
Division of Fisheries personnel con­
ducting electro-fishing studies on 

Holiday Marred 
As Two Wounded 
In Martin Fray 

A July Fourth gunfight at close 
range marred the holiday celebration 
at Martin late Saturday night and sent 
tv. men 1.& hospitals, ooth reported 
seriusly wounded. 

Joe David Stumbo, 29, of McDowell, 
was shot in the back and right side and 
is in a Huntington hospital. The shots 
which struck him are believed to have 
been fired from a .38-calibre revolver. 

His adversary, Joe Howard, 32, a C. 
& 0. locomotive engineer, is in Good 
Samaritan Hospital, Lexington, with 
two bullets in his face and a third in his 
side. The weapon from which these 
shots were fired was said to be of 
. 22-calibre. The two bullets to 
Howard's face struck him near either 
eye, according to State Police Detec­
tive Keith· Scott, who is investigating 
the shoot-out. 

The shooting took place around 11 
p.m., in an area occupied by July 4 
booths, and apparently in the presence 
of several persons. Detective Scott told 
Commonwealth's Attorney James R. 
Allen that he has not had an opportuni­
ty to talk to either of the wounded men. 

"There was a lot full of people, and , 
nobody saw anything," he commented. 

"There was some sort of argument 
between Stumbo and Howard, and both 
apparently had been drinking," he 
said. 

Powder burns on one, or both, of the 
two men attested to the report that 
they fired at close range. 

David Group Joins 
Mineral Rights Suit 

The David Community Development 
Corporation has recently joined two 
other citizen groups in seeking to file a 
"friend of the court" brief in an In­
diana land case to be decided by the 
U.S. Supreme Court. 

At issue in the case is the constitu­
tionality of an Indiana statute which 
provides that, where mineral rights 
have been severed from surface rights 
by the so-called "broad-form" deed, 
the mineral rights pass to the surface 
owner if the mineral owner fails to use 
the property over a period of 20 years. 

Under the law, the mineral owner is 
considered to be "using" the property 
as long as he is paying taxes on it. 

By conservative estimate, according 
to the brief, title to the minerals 
underlying 90 percent of the land in this 
county is severed from the surface title 
by broad-form deeds. 

Under existing Kentucky law, it is 
argued, it is impracticable and 
sometimes impossible for surface 
owners to secure title to abandoned 
mineral interests underlying their pro­
perty. The effect is that "once (the 
mineral estate) is severed, that 
severance is perpetual whether or not 
mining activity takes place on the pro­
perly or taxes are paid." 

"This creates a perpetual cloud on 
the title of the surface owner even 
when the minerals have already been 

mined out," the brief contends. 
l':oting that only mineral owners who 

do not pay taxes are affected by the In­
diana statute, the citizen groups argue 
that non-payment of taxes and a 
restricted tax base in eastern Ken­
tucky "(have) meant that essential 
public services are below average." 

Moreover, the existence of abandon­
ed mineral estates hinders develop­
ment of the surface, since lenders are 
reluctant to invest-in housing pro­
jects, for example-on property from 
which the mineral rights have been 
severed. 

The David citizens' group purchased 
800 surface acres in David in 1975, in an 
area that has previously been mined. 
An attempt by the group last year to 
constr1,1ct a 48-unit apartment complex 
there was thwarted, it is claimed, 
because of the group's inability to 
secure waivers from the 27 unknown 
owners of the mineral rights. 

The Concerned Citizens of Martin 
County and Save Our Cumberland 
Mountains, a Tennessee-based 
citizens' group, are also seeking to join 
the suit. Motion to · file the brief was 
prepared by John Rosenberg and 
David Rubinstein, of the Appalachian 
Research and Defense Fund, a 
Prestonsburg-based legal services 
agency, and Candy A. Culin, represen­
ting Save Our Cumberland Mountains. 

Dewey Lake. 
Under the supervtston of District 

Fisheries Biologist Kerry Prather, the 
electro-fishing studies are performed 
at Dewey and numerous other im­
poundments throughout the 
southeastern section of Kentucky as 
one means of determining degrees of 
success of various stocking programs 

(See Story No. 2, Page 4) 

That is not to say that I couldn't 
become addicted again. You might say 
l'm a lake-aholic. One visi t back to 
well-remembered shore lines , to the 
sense of isolation you get there at 
times, and the magic of day's end on 
the water-one sip of that, and I'm 
hooked more solidly than any of the 
fish. 

16 of 91 Candidates 
File Primary Reports 

If anything is to be learned from the 
financial reports which are supposed to 
be filed with the county clerk by can­
didates in the Mav primarv \• is t'1:> 
comparatively few appear to take t)1e 
reporting law seriously. 

Of the 91 candidates who vied for of­
fice in this county, only 16-generally 
candidates for countywide office-filed 
the required three reports with the 
county clerk. The reporting deadline 
was June 25. 

Candidates are required by law to 
list all campaign income and ex­
penses; those contributing more than 
$100 are supposed to be listed in­
dividually. 

Of the reports on file here, some fail 
to Jist total campaign expenses and 
others appear to rei>ort them er-

roneously. Only eight candidates Jist 
major contributors individually and, of 
those, few .provide all the information 

uired by law 
According to the information on file 

here, Jerry Lafferty, Jr., Democratic 
nominee for county judge-executive, 
ran th costliest race by far, spending 
$19,770.17. Lafferty listed $2500 in con­
tributions from Minnie coal operator 
Paul Little, among other receipts. His 
nearest opponent, Dick Leslie, 
reported $7656 in expenses, and listed 
among contributions $3000 in loans 
from Dr. Larry Leslie. 

Henry C. Hale, Democratic nominee 
for sheriff, reported $5062.91 in ex­
penses, listing $1200 in contributions 
from Betsy Layne coal operator 

(See Story No. 1, Page 4) 

Frankie Gibson 
Pleads Guilty, 
Draws 4 Terms 

Frankie Gibson, the Garrett man 
whose trial for the slaying last Thanks­
giving Day of his brother, Grover, was 
scheduled to begin Monday entered a 
plea of guilty in circuit court here last 
Thursday and was sentenced to pen 
terms . 

On the manslaughter charge he was 
sentenced to 15 years. Five-year terms 
were imposed on each of three counts 
of wanton endangerment involving a 
threat to the safety of other members 
of the victim's family When he fired in­
to the Grover Gibson home. These 
terms are to run concurrently. 

Richard Burmeister , assistant 
public defender, has filed a motion for 
a continuance beyond the August 3 trial 

(See Story No. 3, Page 4) 

Magoffin Flood Damage Heavy 
Floyd county escaped a second flood 

in a period of weeks during the week­
end, but its Emergency & Rescue 
Squad did not escape flood duty as 
neighboring Salyersville and Magoffin 
areas along the Licking River and 
tributaries suffered heavy damage. 

Squad members were called to 
Salyersville Monday morning to assist 
with the evacuation of families from 
homes that had been flooded or were 
threatened by fast-rising water. 

Between three and four inches of 
rain fell during Sunday night in that 
area, extending on into Morgan and 
Menifee counties. 

Although Salyersville was the center 
of rescue activjties, farmlands , roads , 
bridges and crops along smaller 
streams which empty into the Licking 
suffered heavier damage. 

In Salyersville water rose about 
three feet in the business district, and 
perhaps 75 homes were flooded. Many 
others were evacuated as the water 
rose till Monday afternoon. 

Salyersville Mayor Tim Bostic 
declared a state of emergency, early 
Monday, and state troopers joined !':a­
tiona! Guardsmen in maintaining. a 
curfew. 

Tobacco crops were among those 

destroyed. State Adj. Gen. Billy S. 
Wellman, who was in Salyersville an 
hour after Bostic had called on Gover­
nor Brown for help, was quoted as say­
ing at least 30 homes in Magoffin coun­
ty were swept from their foundations. 
He had made no estimate of the overall 
damage, Monday afternoon. 

Congressman Carl D. Perkins early 
Monday called on President Reagan 
and Governor Brown to declare the 
flooded counties a disaster area . A 
similar plea after the flooding of parts 
of this county last month was fruitless , 
except for the offer of loans by the 
Small Business Administration. 

(Photo bv Ken Peters ) 
ONE OF MANY impromptu dramas resulting from this week's flood in Magoffin county. Bob 
Reed and sons fight to save the bridge which led across Cow Creek to their home. They had rid­
den the span a mile downstream when photo was made. 

Rehiring of Two 
At Med Center 
Was at Issue 

Highlands Hospital workers voted at 
a courthouse meeting last (Tuesday ) 
night to accept a contract worked out 
in a bargaining session last week, en­
ding their 105-day strike against the 
hospital. 

The contract, which was approved 
by 140 votes to 43, provides wage-and­
benefit increases of 50 percent over 
three years, more liberal vacation 
leave, and time-and-a-half for 
holidays , among other benefits . 

Only five days ago, the hospital 
workers ' union voted by a similar 
margin to reject the contract. A major 
sticking point at that time was the 
hospital's refusal to rehire two 
workers-Geneva Skeans and her 
sister, Gwen Calhoun-who were fired 
May 7. Skeans, a nurse's aide, and 
Calhoun, a ward clerk, were indicted 
by a grand jury for allegedly beating 
Helen Smith, a personnel assistant at 
the hospital, May 1. 

Skeans had earlier been convicted of 
violating a circuit court injunction 
limiting the activities of pickets. 
Calhoun was also accused of striking a 
hospital security guard with a baseball 
bat. 

Asked to rehire the women, the 
hospital agreed to submit their cases to 
arbitration, a compromise rejected 
last week by the union membership, 
which insisted that the two be rehired 
outright. 

Last night's meeting voted to accept 
that arrangement, however, it was a 
decision that provoked angry outbursts 
from the two women and some of their 
supporters 

' ·The union has throwed us to the 
dogs. The union is busted," Calhoun 
said after the meeting. 

Tom Woodruff, district president of 
the umon, termeo tne new contract ·•a 
tremendous improvement. " "We've 
moved from the Dark Ages at least to 

(See Story No. G. Page 4) 

U.S. Indictment 
Names Knott Co . 
Deputy Sheriff 

Corruption within the Knott 
County Sheriff's Department was 
alleged Monday as a four-count in­
dictment was filed in U.S. District 
Court at Pikeville charging Henry D 
Hall, Knott county chief deputy , with 
violations of the Hobbes Act and accep­
ting bootlegging payoffs. 

A series of alleged violations were 
outlined in the indictment, dating from 
January, 1978, through April 30 of this 
year. During that period, according to 
the indictment, Hall conspired with 
Cleo Anderson and others, "known and 
unknown to the grand jury," to receive 
various sums of money from illegal 
sales of alcoholic beverages to conduct 
bootlegging operations in Knott coun­
ty. 

The indictment charged that Hall 
and other members of the Knott Coun­
ty Sheriff 's Department selectively en­
forced bootlegging laws beginning in 
1979. As an example, the indictment 
read that Hall allegedly directed a 
worker in the sheriff's department, on 
an unknown date, to warn Odis 
Clemons of an impending bootlegging 
raid on Buckingham Mountain. 

<See Story No.5, Page 4) 

Bonds of Honakers 
Reduced; Regain 
Custody of Children 

The pressures of early last week on 
Otto Honaker , of Tram. and h1s wife, 
Barbara , have cased. 

At firs t held in jail here in default of 
$30,000 bond each, their bonds were 
reduced later in the week after a 
district court hearing to $5,000 each, 
and they were soon at liberty. 

And, following a juvenile hearing 
Tuesday morning, the Honakers' three 
chi ldren were returned to their 
custody, subject to Child Welfare 
Department supervision. 

Mr . and Mrs. Honaker were arrested 
on warrants alleging abandonment of 
their six-year-old daughter who had 
been reported locked in a deserted 
house near thPir home. The child and 
two other children of the family had 
been placed m foster homes by the 
Department for Human Resources 
after their parents' arrest. 
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THURSDAY, FRIDAY, 
SATURDAY, JULY 9, 10, 11 

OPEN 8:00 TILL 6:00 

FORMERLY RAY HOWARD'S 
FURNITURE BARN 

CLAYTON-MARCUS 
THESE SUITES FEATURE S-WAY HAND-TIED COIL SPRINGS, DOUBLE· 
DOWELLED, STEEL WEB BASE, PERMANENT BUILT-IN LEGS, AND 
GLUED AND SCREW-IN CORNER BLOCKS. 

ANTRON 
2-PIECE SUITE 
SOFA AND 
LOVESEAT 

$ ::i990 $7 2 5 

CONTEMPORARY STYLE 
LOOSE CUSHION 2-PC. SUITE 

SOFA AND 
LOVESEAT 

Reg. 
$1,899 $CJ99 

EARLY AMERICAN "TRADITIONAL" 
QUILTED 3-PC. SUITE 2-PC. SUITE 

SOFA CHAIR SOFA AND 
& LOVESEAT LOVESEAT 

$~~:97 $CJ99 $~~:l9 $999 
OTHER LIVING ROOM SUITES 

JACKSON-OF-DANVILLE LANK-OF-LEXINGTON 
3-PC. SUITE "TUXEDO" STYLE 

SOFA, LOVES EAT I GRADE NO. 24 VELVET 

CONTRASTING CHAIR SOFA AND LOVESEAT 

$~~92 $CJ99 $~~i2a $799 
NORTH GEORGIA 

"TRANSITIONAL"-4-PC. SUITE 
3-Year Naughahyde 

CHAIR, OTTOMAN 
SOFA, LOVESEAT 

$1~::960 $1 ,095 
STARCREST 3-PC. SUITE 
ANTRON • ALL COIL SPRING 

PILLOW ARMS 

SOFA, CHAIR 
AND LOVESEAT 

$:,~~-9 $77 5 
STARCREST 2-PC. SUITE 

I 

ANTRON • "KNIFE" CUSHIONS 

SOFA AND 
CHAIR 

$R;:9 $425 
SHAMROCK 

WELCHANCE 
"CONTEMPORARY"-3-PC. SUITE 

CHENILLE AND WALNUT TRIM 

SOFA, CHAIR 
AND LOVESEAT 

$1~~;8 $799 
WELCHANCE 

3-PC. SUPER SPECIAL 
ANTRON • DELUXE TUFTED BACK 

SOFA, CHAIR 
AND LOVESEAT 

$~~1g9a $69 5 
COOKE 2-PC. SUITE 
HERCULON CHENILLE 

PILLOW ARMS 

SOFA AND 
CHAIR 

$::~~5 $437 
POLISHED COTTON • SCOTCHGUARD 

ST ARCREST 2-PC. SUITE 
ANTRON • COIL SPRINGS 

SCOTCHGUARD • PINE TRIM 
SOFA AND 
LOVESEAT 

SOFA AND 
CHAIR 

$:;;~ $695 $R;:9 $699 
ONE-OF-A-KIND CLOSEOUTS 

QUEEN SIZE PURE BRASS BED (Forest} ............... .. .... 5288°0 

"TESTER" HEAD BOARD (ETHAN ALLEN} ........ .. .. .... ..... -... $7 5 °0 

STATIONARY CHAIR (Ken campbell} .... __ ._ ..... ____ ._ ..... .... . $99oo 

INCLINE RECLINER (Burris} .. .......... ....... .. ..... .. ... .... S99°0 

STEREO CABINET(cAsARD) .... .. . 1 .......•....... . : ......... 
5125°0 

HARVEST TABLE and DECON'S BENCH (Ethan Allen} .......... $330°0 

BUFFET & HUTCH-Dark Maple, (Keller) ................... .... $395°0 

3 POSITION RECLINER (Bolt FlexHBurris} ... .... ............ . 5258°0 

ODD BED-standard Size (Harts) ... .......... ....... ... .... ... .... $60°0 

VELVET WALL-A-WAY RECLINER (Burris) ....... ...... ....... 5261°0 

5 DRAWER LINGERIE CHEST (Harts) ..... ........... .......... 55995 

PAUL BUN YON SUPER PINE HEADBOARD (Vaughan) ........ . $22QOO 

CURIO CABINET (Glass Side and Front) (Casard) .. _ ... .. _ .......... 517790 

30" DELUX ELECTRIC RANGE (Orbon) ................. .. ... . 5337°0 

The Floyd County Times 

e THE ALL NEW e 

* DOOR BUSTERS * . 
5-PC. METAL $ 
DINETTE SETS (In Factory Crate) . . . . . . . . . . . . 11 0 
ONE GROUP $15 
TABLE LAMPS (The Crystal Look) .......... EA. 

OLD FASHIONED STYLE · $2995 
CORNER CURIO .STANDS .......... . 

.ONE BRASS-PLATED HEADBOARD .... _$5 
6x91SECONDSI $395 LINOLEUM RUGS ..... ................... . 
WALNUT FINISH s499 5 
4-DRAWER CHEST ............ ...... . 

ONE COFFEE TABLE (~amaged) ........... ~ . $1 0 
ONLY ONE TO SELL: $9995 ROLL-TOP DESK ..................... . 
TRIPLE-PLATED !SLIGHT FLAW I $17 5 
QUEEN-SIZE BRASS BED .... ... · .... . 
BATTERY WORKS BY ELGIN ' · sso 
FLOOR CLOCK ........ .... ................ . 
DAMAGED 6-DRAWER s55 
DRESSER BASE ....... ................... . 
7-PC. METAL $170 

· DINETTE SET (In Factor)l .-ate) ............. . 

·--------~------------~ I 9-PC LIVING ROOM SUITE I 
I 1 I 1 1 Y2" THICK SOLID PINE • ANTRON I 
1
1 EXTRA 1

1 SOFA, ROCKER, CHAIR, 

I OTTOMAN, DELUXE COCKTAIL HEAVY I 
: TABLE, 2 LAMPS, 2 END TABLES : 

I ALL 9 PIECES ONLY $89 5 I 
I I 1 (A LIVING ROOM FULL OF QUALITY FOR UNDER $1000!) I 

AMERICAN DREW 
9-PC. SUITE • DARK FINISH 

NORTHERN PINE 
BUFFET, HUTCH 

TABLE, 6 CHAIRS 

s:;~goo $1 360 
S-K • MAPLE • 9-PC. SUITE 

BUFFET, HUTCH, 
TRESTLE TABLE, 

6 CAPTAIN'S CHAIRS 

s:.:~s·o $1 , 09 5 
DAMAGE 

AMERICAN DREW 
9-PC. SUITE • DARK OAK 

..LENNOX COURT" 
BUFFET, HUTCH 

TABLE, 6 CHAIRS 

$~189 $1,595 . 

UNIVERSAL • AUTUMN CHESTNUT 
9-PC. SUITE 

BUFFET, HUTCH, 
TABLE, 6 CHAIRS 

$~149 $1,175 
THOMASVILLE CABINET 

9-PC. SUITE • OAK 
EXTRA HEAVY 

BUFFET, HUTCH, 
TABLE, 6 CHAIRS 

s~~1g98 s995· 
THOMASVILLE CABINET 

9-PC. SUITE • DARK MAPLE 
BUFFET, HUTCH, 

TABLE, 6 CHAIRS 

Reg. 
$1,079 $895 

THIS MARKS OUR 50TH YEAR OF BUSINESS IN PRESTONS­
BURG AND FLOYD COUNTY. IN APPRECIATION OF OUR 
MANY FRIENDS AND CUSTOMERS, WE WILL BE GIVING 
AWAY FREE SEVERAL NICE :DOOR PRIZES WHEN THIS SALE 
IS OVER. NOTHING TO BUY! JUST REGISTER! 

• TELL CITY ROCKER • CLAYTON MARCUS CHAIR • STYLE­
CREST HIDE·A·BED • WELCHANCE SOFA AND CHAIR 
• CHATHAM OCCASIONAL TABLE • ENGLEWOOD RECLINER 
• AND MUCH MORE! 

LOW RATE BANK FINANCING • NO RETURNS • 

I 

Section One, Page Two 

THURSDAY, FRIDAY, 
SATURDAY, JULY 9, 10, 11 

OPEN 8:00 TILL 6:00 

ALWAYS QUALITY AND NAME 
BRAND FURNITURE FOR LESS! 

# 
AMERICAN-DREW 

3-PC. SUITE • OAK 4-PC. SUITE • LIGHT OAK 
DRESSER MIRROR, DRESSER MIRROR, 

CHEST, BED 
CHEST AND BED NIGHT STAND 

Reg. $89995 Reg. $1 195 
$1,379 $1,949 ' 

RAILS INCLUDED RAILS INCLUDED 

t-----::=:::::O~T~H::=-:ER==:=-:BE=D;..:.:Rw=-00=-=M:.:.:...=.SU=-=I~TE:.:S~-~ (' 
EXTRA LARGE PINE VAUGHN CHERRY 

4-PC. SUITE • RAILS INCLUDED 3-PC. SUITE • QUEEN SIZE 

DRESSER MIRROR, DRESSER TWIN MIRRORS, 
CHEST, BED CHEST, HEADBOARD 

NIGHT STAND Reg. $775 
Reg. $799 $1,089 

51,239 RAILS INCLUDED 

MEMPHIS • MAPLE 
3-PC. SUITE • Q_UEEN SIZE 

DRESSER MIRROR, 
CHEST, BED, 

Reg. $550 
$899.95 

RAILS INCLUDED 

VAUGHN • MAPLE 
4-PC. SUITE • QUEEN SIZE 

DRESSER HUTCH MIRROR, 
CHEST, BED, NIGHTSTAND 

Reg. $895 
$1,109.80 

RAILS INCLUDED 

VAUGHN-BASSEn • PINE 
4-PC. SUITE • EXTRA LARGE 

DRESSER MIRROR, BED, 
CHEST, NIGHT STAND 

Reg. $1 375 
$1,949 ' 

RAILS INCLUDED 

EXTRA LARGE • SUPER HEAVY 
4-PC. SUITE • Oak • By Webb 

DRESSER HUTCH MIRROR 
CHEST, BED,NIGHTSTAND 

Reg. $1 170 
$1,899 ' 

RAILS INCLUDED 

VAUGHN BASSET 
3-PC. SUITE • PECAN 

DRESSER TWIN MIRRORS, 
CHEST, HEADBOARD 

Reg. $795 Frame 
51,395 Incl. 

MEMPHIS • OAK 
3-PC. SUITE • QUEEN SIZE 

DRESSER HUTCH MIRROR, 
CHEST AND BED 
Reg. $799 

$1,249 
RAILS INCLUDED 

VAUGHN CHERRY 
4-PC. SUITE • KING-SIZE 

DRESSER MIRROR, 
CHEST, NIGHTSTAND, 

HEADBOARD 
Reg. $1 275 Frames 

51_,818 ' Incl. 

THE 1980 BEST-SELLER! 
VAUGHN • PINE ' 

3-PC. SUITE 

DRESSER HUTCH MIRROR, 
CHEST AND BED 

$~~~9 $995 
RAILS INCLUDED 

WHILE THEY -LAST! 
GENUINE LEATHER 

"WALL-AWAY" RECLINER 
EXTRA LARGE 

A LIFE-TIME CHAIR 
MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED 

RETAIL PRICE $1,050 

NOW s595 

GENUINE LEATHER 
"ROCKING" RECLINER 

EXTRA LARGE 
A LIFE-TIME CHAIR 

MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED 
· RETAIL PRICE S999 · 

NOW s575 

MORE SPECIALS ON QUALITY 
' 

5 PIECE DINffiE (Glass Top Table) "Chromcraft" ......... .. ...... 5495°0 

5 PIECE DINffiE (The Blacksmith) "StoneviDe" .................. $450°0 

SWIVEL ROCKER$-IN TOP VELVETS "Hickory Chair House" ... S195°0 

ORIENTAL CONSOLE CABINETS "Streetman" Hand Painted ...... $286°0 

SOLID CHERRY TABLES (Set of Three) "Martinsville" ............. 5391°0 

7 PIECE GLASS TOP DINETTE SET "Chromcratt" ............. $697°0 

5 PIECE GAME TABLE SET (Pecan) "Universal" ......... .. ...... 5463°0 

QUEEN SIZE HIDE-A-BED (Innerspring Mattress) "Ken Campbell" .... $488°0 

5 PIECE WOOD DINETTE SET (Contemporary) "Uberty Chair" ..... $397°0 

MAPLE CORNER HUTCH (Glass Doors) "Thomasville cabinet" ....... $293°0 

7 PIECE DINETTE-Oak-Herculon Seats, "American Drew" ......... $666 °0 

LARGE EARLY AMERICAN RECLINER (100% Nylon} "Englewood"$212°0 

30" CUSTOM GAS RANGE "VESTA" ..... ..... ....... ..... $299°0 

HOTPOINT REFRIGERATOR No. ~TF17AB-Custom .............. $660°0 

# 

• 
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Tackett-McKinney Vows Said 

The marriage of Miss Denise During the ceremony, the bride was 
Maureen Tackett to Mr. Shannon Ray presented a white Bible by her parents. 
McKinney was solemnized in a double- Miss Tracey McKinney, sister of the 
ring ceremony at l p.m. Saturday, May groom, of Craynor, was maid of honor. 
23, at the Vogel-Day Methodist Church She wore a gown of white nylon 
at Harold. The officiating minister polyester with inlay of colors. The 
was Bill Tackett, of East McDowell. bridesmaids, Miss Yulema Deevon 

Roses were placed on either side of Tackett, Miss Althea Tackett, Miss 
• the altar and the arch was entwined E lona Gean Hamilton, of Craynor, all 

with greenery secured by white satin cousins of the bride, and Miss Linette 
bows. Flowers were also placed on the Michele Tackett, sister of the bride, 
organ at which Miss Lora Hardwick, of also of Craynor, wore similarly styled 
Betsy Layne, played nuptial music, in- gowns of polyester organza over 
eluding the selections, "We've Only acetate. Each carried a long-stemmed 
Just Begun," "Three Times A Lady," rose with ribbons matching their 
and "You Decorated My Life." gowns. 

The bride, escorted to the altar by Gerry Lucas, of Prestonsburg, 
her father and given in marriage by brother-in-law of the groom , was best 
her parents, wore a gown of Chantilly man, and ushers were Gilford Osborne, 
lace and sheer chiffon, fashioned with of Grethel, Timmy Tackett, of Harold, 
a low V neckline with layers of ruffled J arrell Scott Hamilton, of Craynor, 
chiffon and sheer puffed sleeves, and Linlee Todd Tackett, of Craynor, 
gathered at the wrists and draping the cousin of the bride. 
hands with a layer of Chantilly lace. A Emmit Bradley McKinney, son of 
layered bouffant skirt extended into a Mr. and Mrs. Frank McKinney, of 
chapel-length train in back. Her head- Craynor, carried the bride's train, and 
piece was a Chanti,ll.Y. lace band to f the ringbearer was Rodney Chad Hall, 
which was attached a chapel-length • son of Mr. and Mrs. Tex Leon flail, of 
veil of two t ers edged in matching Craynor. Both are cousins of the bride. 
lace. She carried a colonial bouquet of The flower girl was Miss Tina Yvette 
white roses, daisies, and baby's breath Tackett, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
accented by long white satin ribbons. Namon Tackett, of Craynor, also a 

CLERK'S NOTICE OF FILING 
FIDUCIARYS' 

FINAL SETTLEMENT 
Commonwealth of Kentucky 
Court of Justice 
Floyd District Courl 

In Re : The Estate of Amos Dotson, 
deceased, and the Estate of Dolly Dot­
son, deceased. 

Case Nos. : 77-P-103 and 77-P-106. 

Ten (10) days notice, pursuant to 
Chapter 424, Kentucky Revised 
Statutes is hereby given that: 

Greeley Dotson and Everett Dotson, 
as Co-Executors of the Estate of Amos 
Dotson, deceased, and the Estate of 
Dolly Dotson , deceased, late of 
Prestonsburg, Floyd County, Ken­
tucky, have filed their first and Final 
Settlement as said Fiduciaries ; that a 
hearing thereon will be held July 22, 
1981 , at the hour of 9:00 a.m. , in the 
courtroom of the District Court of 
Floyd County, First Floor, County 
Courthouse, Third Avenue, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky. 

Any interested person desiring to file 
exceptions thereto MUST file the same 
before that date with the Circuit Court 
Clerk. 

Of all of which all interested persons 
will hereby take due notice. 

FRANK DEROSSETT 
Circuit Court Clerk 

Floyd County, Kentucky 
By Priscilla Sammons, D.C. 

lt. 

cousin of the bride, who wore a floor­
length dress of white nylon acetate 
with inlays of colors matching those of 
the bridesmaids gowns. She carried a 
basket filled with pink rose petals and 
accented with pink ribbons. 

For her daughter's wedding, Mrs. 
Tackett chose a full-length gown of 
rose silk with matching accessories. 
Mrs. McKinney, mother of the groom, 
chose a street-length dress of white 
with matching print jacket. Both wore 
orchid corsages. 

Following the ceremony, a reception 
was held at the home of the bride's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bennie Tackett, 
at Craynor. Hostesses were Mrs. 
J eromia Dean Tackett and Mrs. Irene 
Tackett. 

Mr. and Mrs. McKinney are residing 
at Craynor. Mr. McKinney is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Palmer McKinney, also 
of Craynor. 

TO HONOR ELDERLY 
Following services at the Irene Cole 

Memorial (First) Baptist Church, Sun­
day, J uly 12, a covered-dish dinner will 
be held at the church annex, honoring 
members who are 80 or more years of 
age. The church will furnish the meat, 
bread and drinks. All members are in­
vited to attend. 

HEKE FROM DAYTON 
Clarence E. Shepherd, of Dayton, 

Ohio, was in Floyd county last week, 
s eek ing infor m ation about t he 
geneology of area families . 

FOR SALE 

Log home nestled in the edge of a woods for today's young pioneer who likes his 
privacy. Lovely exterior with two decks, 2-car garage; great room with wood­
burning fireplace, equipped kitchen with laundry area, three bedrooms, two baths, 
under the eaves storage. Energy efficiency and low maintenance are built in. Call 
for details. Bond money available. 

RATLIFF & LENOX REAL ESTATE 
PRESTONSBURG 886-6138 
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Election Battle 
Moves To Court 

FEDERATED STORE 
f 

MARTIN, KY 

SUMMER CLEARANCE SALE 

(From The Salyersville Independent J 
The heated battle between Kay Mar­

tin Doyle and Marcus Mann for the 
democratic nomination for county at­
torney will move into the courtroom 
later Lhis month as both· sides try to 
pr·ove the other guilty of il legal cam­
paign tactics. 

A full jury tria l is set for Monday, Ju­
ly 13, in Magoffin County Ciurcuit 
Court. Judge John Chris Cornett has 
disqualified himself from the case 
since Doyle is his niece. The case will 
·be heard by special judge Calvin Manis 
of the Perry County Circuit Court. 

To have the court rule in Mann's 
favor, he must not only prove that 
Doyle is guilty of the alleged act but 
also that he is innocent of any wrongdo­
ing in attempt to secure votes. 

Doyle has filed a courtersuit to 
Mann's claims alleging that Mann did 
in fact violate the law in obtaining 
votes . Her suit charges that Mann 
"flagrantly violated all the provisions 
of·the Corrupt Practice Act by actually 
giving his money to people for their 
support in the campaign namely in 
each and every precinct in Magoffin 
County, and that on numerous occa­
sions he displayed $20 bills stating 
"that was the way to get votes." 

GROUP OF AIGNER, BASS, CON-
IE, MUSHROOM AND CANDIES 

33'/J & 50% OFF 

BOBBIE BROOKS 

SPORTSWEAR 
1/2 PRICE 

MEN'S BLAZER 
TENNIS SHOES 
Reg. $43$29.98 

RACKS OF 

LADIES' SPORTSWEAR 

1/3 OFF 

1 GROUP MEN'S 
LEVI DUNGAREES 

$16.88 
IJ CHILDREN'S 

NIKE SHOES 
$14.98 

MEN'S 
SPORT COATS 

!l 1/2 PRICE 

OVERSTOCKED ON 
LADIES' LEVI JEANS 
NOW ON SALE! Mann, who lost his bid for another 

term as county attorney to Doyle in the 
May primary, initiated the legal action 
in attempt to overturn the election 
results and have himself declared the 
winner. He charges Doyle with illegal­
ly securing votes through fraud and 
misrepresentation, particularly in the 
Bloomington, Ward II, and Lakeville 
precincts. 

le. Save 30°/o to 50°/o •• 
Mann requests that the court rule 

that the vote in Ward II and Lakeville, 
which Doyle won by a total of 95 votes, 
be thrown out. However, he asks that a 
new vote be held in the Bloomington 
precinct, which Mann won by 98 votes, 
since 40-75 persons were standing in 
line and not allowed to vote when the 
polls closed. 

Mann claims that most of those 
unable to vote were his supporters. 
However, it is doubtful that had all 
these persons voted that Mann could 
have picked up enough votes to change 
the outcome. A partial survey by the 
Independent indicated that at least 25 
percent of the persons known to have 
not voted are Republicans and could 
not have voted in the Doyle-Mann race. 

Doyle won the contest by 61 votes. 

HERE FROM KANSAS CITY 
Mr. and Mrs. George Archer, III, of 

Kansas City, are spending some time 
at May Lodge while they visit with 
relatives and friends here. They enter­
tained their aunt, Mrs. Elizabeth Gar­
riott, to }unch Sunday at May Lodge. 

IN LEXINGTON HOSPITAL 
Mrs. Kenneth Allen, of the Highland 

Terrace Apartments , entered Central 
Baptist Hospital, Lexington, Friday. 
She was accompanied there by Mrs. H. 
A. Casey. Mr. Allen and their son, Ken­
neth Franklin Allen, visited her at the 
hospital, Sunday. 

••• on a big selection of 
men's, women's and children's styles. 
Here' s j ust a sample ... 

$ 
Women's elastic band slide. 
Cushioned insole. Assorted colors. 

U .S. 23 North 
Near Sears Prestonsburg 

Sale prices good thru Sul)day. MasterCard or VIsa. bpen evenings and Sunday 1·6 pm. 

RON'S BARGAIN BARN 
6 Mi. West on Mtn. Parkway Prestonsburg, Ky. 

. . . • Bar~ain $166 * 19" B/W TV (Um1ted quantity) ............. . ... .. - .. . .. .. .. ... .. . .. . .. · Pr1ce ~ 
Reg. Bargain$49995 * 13 000 B.T.U. GIBSON AIR CONDITIONER. sss9.9s .... Price 

' Bargain $6995 * CONSOLE 8/W TV (Trade-in) ... . . . . .. ... . . ....... . . . .. . . .. .. ... .. · Price 
Bargain $9995 * CHEST FREEZER (Trade-in). . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Price 

. . Reg. Bargain $59995 * 2-PIEC£ LIVING ROOM .......... ....... .. ..... $995.00 . . . . . Price 
Reg. Bargain $4499 5 * 15 CU. FT. WESTINGHOUSE FREEZER ..... ... $549.95 . Price 

Reg. Bargain $59995 * 3-PIECE LIVING ROOM (Brady) .......... ...... $799.95. .. Price 

AI ost All Furniture · 25% off 
. .y> ..... ~ 
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]· 10,000 I 

FREE QUALITY 
STAMPS 

4 DAYS ONLY:. 

,-W 

THURSDAY, FRIDAY, 

SATURDAY, SUNDAY 

GET J 000 FREE 
QUALITY STAMPS 
WITH PURCHASE 

OF ANY FREEZER! 

• FREE STAMPS WITH 
. PURCHASES! 

• FREE DELIVERY! 
• UP TO 36 MO. TO PAY! 
• OPEN FRIDAY TILL 7 P.M. 
• OPEN SUNDAY 12-5 

1: 

.................... ~ ......................... ----~----~--------~--------------------........................................ --~·-~·-------
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Published Every Wednesday by 

Prestonsburg Publishing Company 

NORMAN ALLEN Editor 

Subscription Rates Per Year: 
In Floyd County, $8.00 
Elsewhere in KentuckJ. $10.00 
Outside Kentucky. $12.50 

Entered as second class matter June 18, 
1927, at the postoffice at Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky, under the act of March 3, 1879. 

No Conflict of Interest? 
How can it be argued tha,t there is no conflict of interest 

when W. T. Young serves the state of Kentucky as vice­
chairman of the governor's cabinet and as deputy secretary 
of commerce, and yet retains his position as the largest 
stockholder in Humana, Inc., which recently won a tug-of­
war with other hospital interests? 

Humana, admittedly, is a leader in the field of hospital ser­
vices. It may be needed in parts of Kentucky where it has not 
yet shown an interest (in Floyd county, for instance). But this 
does not justify the string ·of events (or coincidences, as some 
describe what has happened) that has resulted, at least in 
part, from the support thrown to Humana by. this high­
ranking member of Governor Brown's cabinet. 

Humana sought state approval of its proposal to build a 
170-bed hospital in Lexington. Despite the opposition of other 
hospitals there, which argue that the enlargement of their 
facilities would meet the needs of the public, and despite the 
opposition of the Department for Human Resources, 
Humana won. 

Mr. Young was one of those who lobbied for Hum ana. The 
State Certificate of Need and Licensure Board barely ap­
proved the new hospital, by a 7-6 vote. 

That was followed last week by Governor Brown's 
moratorium on hospital expansion in Lexington and Louis­
ville. His expressed interest in hospital facilities for smaller 
cities and parts of Kentucky that have been neglected is en­
couraging, but his expansion "freeze" till December, 1983 in­
cidentally killed off the plans of hospitals such as St. Joseph 
and Good Samaritan in Lexington to build on more space for 
needed acute care beds. 

Perhaps the Humana victory and the freeze on competing 
hospitals were coincidental, as Dr. Grady Stumbo has said, 
but it would have been more so to the ordinary citizen, had 
not Humana 's heaviest stockholder been so prominent in 
state government and so active in the effort behind the big 
winners in the struggle. 

--- 1 ---
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Theodore Martin and a $900 donation in 
kind from Martin trucker Edmon 
Barnett, among others. 

Expenses reported by other can­
didates for sheriff: Roger Webb, 
$4014.45; Holland B. Hurrey, Jr., 
$3135.06; James McKinney, $1415.59; 
and Joe Wheeler Lewis, runner-up in 
the race, $950. Ed Meade reported 
$1749.55 in expenses as of mid-May, but 
filed no final report here. 

In the coroner 's race, James J . 
Carter, who lost to Roger Nelson, 
reported spending $5522.60. Nelson 
reported $2950.88 in expenses. 

County Attorney Arnold Turner, Jr . 
reported spending $2477.90 on his suc­
cessful campaign; his opponent, Bur­
nis Martin, reported expenditures of 
only $295. 

Jailer Lawrence Hale reported 
$536.25 in campaign expenses; Sid 
Triplett, his nearest rival, filed a single 
report, listing nothing but his name 
and address. 

Property Valuation Administrator 
Love! Hall gave $2840.91 as his ex­
penses ; his opponent, Harry Gordon 
AJ!en , reported spending $1239.15 as of 
May 11, but filed no final report here. 

County Surveyor Elmer Rice 
reported spending $130 on his cam­
paign; Merle M. May said he spent 
$808 on the race; Bill "Crush" Dingus 
reported no receipts or expenditures. 

--- 3 ---
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date set for Denver Patrick, one of 
three men arrested in the Wayland in­
surance murder plot in which James 
Neimi was the victim. Attorneys for 
both the defense and the Com­
monwealth will meet today 
<Wednesday) in Danville with Judge 
Henry Pennington, regular judge of the 
50th judicial district who was 
designated special judge to preside in 
the trial of Patrick. Pennington was 
named special judge after Circuit 
Judge Hollie Conley had disqualified 
for the trial. No reason was given for 
Judge Conley's disqualification. 

Before disqualifying, Judge Conley 
granted a defense request that Patrick 
be taken to the forensic section of Cen­
tral State Hospital, Louisville, for 
psychological examination. The order 
was entered June 26, and this examina­
tion provided the basis for the motion 
for a continuance of the trial. 

It was pointed out by the defense that 
Central State has a waiting list of 48 
and that the average stay there for an 
examination such as Patrick will 
undergo is 28 days and, consequently, 
cannot be completed in time for the 
August 3 trial. 

CARD OF THA!\KS 

--- 2 ---
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which have been initiated in the 
district. 

This spring's electro-fishing studies 
have been conducted at Dewey to give 
Fisheries personnel an idea of such 
things as growth rates and feeding pat­
terns of the tiger musky, a northern 
pike-muskellunge hybrid first stocked 
in Dewey in 1975. 

As Prather explained, "Electro 
fishing is more of a qualitative sampl­
ing rather than quantitative, since only 
random fish are affected. This type of 
study allows us to look at the size of the 
fish, and tag the musky in order to 
make future comparisons." 

Utilizing power provided by the 
generator, a constant charge of elec­
tricity is transmitted from two long 
conductive arms mounted on the front 
of the boat and affects an area which 
extends about 15 feet to either side of 
the arms and about 15 feet deep. Fish 
are merely stunned by the shock and 
must be quickly netted by two spotters 
who stand along a bow-mounted rail· 
ing. 

Tiger musky are particularly resis­
tant to the shock and must be picked up 
immediately as they swiftly recover 
and escape, according to Prather. 

Shocking is done as close to shore as 
possible as fish of most varieties feed 
along shoreline cover at night and a 
ride with the crew, which has consisted 
in recent weeks of Chris Shepherd, of 
Middle Creek, and David Spradlin, of 
Betsy Layne, as well as Prather, soon 
reveals that there is a lot of aquatic ac­
tivity along the banks. Gizzard shad, 
which, incidentally , are the tiger 
musky's favorite prey, appear over the 
length of the shoreline, with bluegill 
and small bass appearing frequently 
as well. 

Musky, when netted, are measured 
and tagged and soon returned to the 
water. Prather explained that 
fishermen who catch tagged fish and 
contact the Division of Fisheries are 
depended on as the primary source for 
future information on growth rates. 
"When a fisherman contacts us and 
gives us information concerning the 
size of the tagged fish, then we are able 
to make important comparisons which 
give us a pretty good idea of how well 
the fish are adapting to a lake," 
Prather pointed out. 

Prather said repeated releases of 
musky at Dewey, which have ranged in 
size from fingerlings to six-inch fish, 
has been successful with the result that 
fishermen at the oft-maligned im­
poundment now have a relatively new 
sport fish to go after. 

"With an excess of bait fish and 
rough fish for forage, the tiger muskies 
have grown up to our expecta lions," 
Prather commented. "We're well 
pleased." 

<A state record tiger musky was 
taken from Dewey Lake in May , this 
year, by James Mullett , of Auxier. 
Mullett caught the 38-inch specimen 
while bass fishing near Dewey Dam.> 

The Floyd County Times 

Our Yesterdays 
(Items taken from The Floyd County 
Times, 10, 20, 30 and 40 years ago) 

Ten Years A.Qo 
<JulyS, 1971) 

More than 400 workers were employed for the operation of the Floyd 
county school system at Saturday's meeting of the Floyd County Board of 
Education, on recommendation of Supt. Charles Clark ... If ARC funds are 
made available for road and sewer construction within the area to be 
developed, work on a central campground to accommodate at least 100 
camps at Dewey Lake will be begun this summer, Floyd countians were 
told last Thursday at Frankfort ... The identity ot three men who kidnap­
ped Harold Davis, 26, former Dwale man, at his service station near Ft. 
Mitchell , Ky., last Wednesday and later killed him and left his. body in an 
Ohio ditchline was being sought this week by federal and state 
authorities .. . There died: Airman Sanford <Sandy) Newsome, 20, of 
Harold, in an auto accident near Ft. Bragg, N.C.; Joe K. Stumbo, 76, of 
Drift, at McDowell Appalachian Regional Hospital; Mrs. Nannie 
Johnson, 35, of Martin, at Mountain Manor Nursing Home; George 
Washington Belcher, 73, of Allen, at Preston& burg General Hospital; Bet­
ty Jean Bryant, 12, formerly of Prestonsburg, by drowning near Colum­
bul;, 0.; Mrs. Elsie Little King, 49, of Bypro, at the University Hospital in 
Birmingham, Ala.; Tony Craft, 56, of Lackey, at McDowell Appalachian 
Regional Hospital; Mrs. Gertrude Hurd Benedict, 75, wife of the Rev. L. 
W. Benedict, a former pastor of Irene Cole Memorial Baptist Church, in 
an Ashland hospital; Ulysses Grant Lewis, 48, of Martin, at McDowell Ap­
palachian Regional Hospital; Mrs. Tona Elliott, 74, at her home at 
Printer. 

Twenty .Years Ago 
(July 6, 1961) 

The Floyd County Board of Education at its meetings Friday and Satur­
day , had as guest observer Samuel Alexander, assistant state superinten­
dent of schools, Frankfort, who, after seeing· the Board, as he said, 
"fumbling and monkeying around," assumed the role of "Dutch Un­
cle." ... Defendants in the court action filed here after work was halted on 
the Auxier bridge because of alleged interference were enjoined last 
Thursday by Circuit Judge Edward P. Hill from "blocking, hindering, 
harrassing or interfering with the employees of the Mattingly Bridge 
Company" ... The new elementary school building to serve the Big Mud 
Creek area will contain 31,000 square feet, with 18 classrooms, making it 
the second largest school structure in the county ... The pilot Food Stamp 
Program inaugurated in this county June 1 had by month's end resulted 
in the issuance of $58,000 worth of stamps and improvement of trade with 
local food retailers to that extent. .. There died: Tom Carr, 72, of Banner, 
last Thursday at the Paintsville Hospital ; Arthur D. Carpenter, 79, Tues­
day at his home at Stanville; William Sherman Sanders, 64, of Betsy 
Layne, Friday at the Paintsville Hospital; Ronald Ray Johnson, 17, 
formerly of Halo, Saturday at Eaton Rapids , Mich. ; Russell Crisp, 52, 
formerly of Martin, Friday in Los Angeles, Calif. ; Mrs. Minnie Conley, 
66, of Van Lear , June 26; William Vance, Sr., 44, of East McDowell, last 
Tuesday in Ohio ; Haden Crager, 44, Friday at his home at Garrett; Mrs. 
Mary Prater, 70, formerly of Middle Creek, last Monday in Ohio; Jack 
Green, 65, of Wheelwright, last Wednesday at Harlan. 

Thirty Years Ago 
(July 5, 1951) 

Second contingent of preinductees to be sent by Draft Board 25 to Ports­
mouth , 0 . for examination this month will leave Tuesday, July 17, it was 
announced this week. In this group 43 registrants are listed ... A trailer of 
the Motor Transport Company, Pontiac, Mich. , loaded with two 
automobiles, crashed into the home of Mrs. Thursa Music, a short 
distance from the north end of the Cliff bridge, near here, Tuesday morn­
ing, jostling the building from its foundation and injuring Mrs. Music ... Of 
Floyd county's 53,500 persons, 1,725 filed state income tax returns for 1950 
and paid into the state treasury a total of $69,396.75 or an average of $40.23 
per taxpayer .•. The Magoffin county fiscal court has refused to adopt its 
1951 property tax assessment, and the State Revenue Department plans 
to take steps if necessary to force use of the assessment...The Permele 
Airport, Inc., which will opera(e an airport at Permele, near David, has 
been granted a charter by the Secretary of State of West Virginia, it was 
announced in Charleston this week ... Body of Billy Franklin Ousley, who 
was killed in Korea, Sept. 12, last year, at the age of 17, was recently 
returned to this county for burial in the Cornett cemetery near 
Cliff .. . There died: Rev. J. N. Herald, 79, native of Cow Creek, June 25 in 
Florida; Elizabeth Meade, 72, June 27 at Langley; Pvt. Lee Hall, Jr., of 
Auxier, Wednesday in an auto crash near Ft. Knox, Kentucky. 

Forty Years Ago 
(July 3, 1941) 

The science of ballistics was being depended upon this week as an aid to 
the solution of the mystery-assassination at Garrett on the night of June 
15 of Policeman Jerry Lee .. A total of 280 Floyd countians who had attain­
ed the age of 21 years since the national registration last October were 
registered for selective military service Tuesday by draft board of­
ficials ... United Mine Workers of America throughout this section went on 
vacation Thursday morning in the face of work signs posted by 
operators ... One hundred eighty candidates had registered at the County 
Clerk's office here for positions on the August primary ballot. .. The Floyd 
fiscal court's first session of the new fiscal year began Tuesday and con­
tinued into Wednesday as the court was faced with the task of considering 
a long list of claims, some of which were months old ... There died: Robert 
Green Branham, 78, Wednesday at the home of a son at Martin; Mrs. 
Sidney Watson, 36, of Honaker, at a Martin hospital, Saturday. 

--·----·------
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plans for the reconstruct.ion of 
classrooms at McDowell High School. 
Money to repair the classrooms, 
damaged by flooding last year, was 
recently authorized by the state School 
Building Authority. 

Jack Music, representing the Auxier 
Community Development Club, asked 
for school board assistance with a club 
project proposed for the Auxier grade 
school. Music said the club plans to 
build change and restroom facilities 
for the ballfield, using Job Corps labor. 

"If we can help, we will," board 
member Dr. J.D. Adams told Music. 
Bids on school supplies for the coming 

year were discussed but a final deci­
sion on awarding contracts was 
postponed until the board could hear 
recommendations from Volney Allen, 
the schools' maintenance supervisor, 
and Ned Bush, health coordinator. 

As anticipated, the board hired Jack 
Stanford, former Breathitt High School 
coach, as head basketball coach and 
assistant principal at Prestonsburg 
High. Other teachers hired were: 
Janet Kidd Akers, chemistry teacher 
at Betsy Layne High School, to replace 
Joe H. Cooley, who resigned, and 
Janice W. Mitchell, elementa ry 
teacher at John lVI. Stumbo school. 

Also hired were Ina J . Hensley, 
Brenda Sue Johnson and Marguerite 
Fannin, special education teacher 
aides; Gary Branham and Rita Dye, 
regular bus drivers; and Linda Porter 
and Pauline Woods, part·timc summer 
cooks. 

--- 5 ---
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Deputy Hall allegedly refused to en­
force or failed to enforce alcoholic 
beverage laws as they pertain to dry 
and local option territories in 1979-1981, 
according to the indictment which also 
charged that Hall and Anderson visited 
the home of Douglas McArthur Conley 
on Rockfork to discuss the matter. 

The indictment read that on six to 
eight dates Hall received from $125 to 
$200 from bootleggers in return for pro­
tection and the privilege to continue to 
sell illegal beverages in the county, 
and charged that on 20 different dates 
between January 1979 and December 
1980, he received sums of money from 
Haskell "Gib" Hall, of Mousie. 

The indictment further alleged that 
on January 12, 1980, Hall had a conver­
sation with Nero Patton and Harry 
Wicker, a former sheriff's deputy. 
discussing the possibility of 
establishing a bootlegging operation. 
Wicker was acting at the request of 
federal agents, it was said. 

To Discuss Day Care Plans 
In W'wright-Weeksbury Area 

Those who are interested in the 
establishment of a Day Care Center in 
the Wheelwright-Weeksbury area are 
asked to attend the regular meeting 
scheduled at 7 p.m., July 9, at the 

. Weeksbury Community Center. 

CARD OF THANKS 

The family of Henry Shepherd 
wishes to thank all who helped in any 
way upon the passing of their loved 
one. We deeply appreciate the flowers, 
food and words of kindness . Thanks to 
the ministers for their comforting 
words , to all who helped in preparing 
the grave and the Hall Funeral Home 
for its kind and efficient service. TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

We wish to express our thanks and 
deepest appreciation to all our friends 
and neighbors who helped us so much 
during our time of sorrow. Also a 
special thank you to Hall Funeral 
Home who treated us so nicely. 

WIFE, NORA SHEPHERD 
Al'\D FAMILY 

THE FAMILY OF 
HAZEL BAILEY HANDSHOE 

Section One, Page Four 

DUNNO W'!; CHier 
- I HAVt:N'1' ReAD 
-f'H~ NeWSI'APE:R! 

~'81 

Letters to the Editor 
The views expressed here are those of the writers, and not 

necessarily those of this newspaper . No unsigned contributions 
will be published. 

A Warning To Others 
I am writing this hoping it will help 

someone .else not to be fooled and 
cheated. 

Recently a man came to my trailer 
just as I arrived home from a morning 
of vacation Bible School. He said he 
would like to paint my trailer roof. He 
said he had paint left over from 
another job and it needed to be used. 
The labor would be free. I would only 
need to pay for the paint. When he was 
up on the roof he said it would take two 
coats. I asked him not to put two coats 
on it as I couldn't afford it. He was 
finished in 25 minutes. Then he told me 
it took 12 gallons of paint. My roof is on­
ly 12 X 53. I knew it didn't take 12 
gallons, as I had it painted before. I 
told him so. Then he said I had to put 
two coats on it. I reminded him I told 
him not to put two coats on it. He said, I 
made a mistake. The end result was, I 
paid him $105. He wanted $175. I still 
paid him too much. Three gallons of 
paint covers my roof. He charged me 
for seven. A neighbor let him paint his 
roof. His roof is smaller than mine. He 
charged him $180. The name he gave 
me is Jim Sherlock. He drives a tan 
pickup truck. He uses a sprayer. So 
beware. 

SARAH HELMANTOLER 
R. 1, Martin, Ky. 

Thank You 
The Auxier Area Community 

Development Club wishes to thank 
each and every person or firm who, 
through their contribution, made it 
possible to obtain air-conditioners for 
the Auxier Grade School. We hope we 
have not omitted anyone's name from 
the list of contributors that follows. 

Dr. James Adams, UMWA District, 
James R. Allen, Gary Wright, Elliott 
Supply Co. , Gregory Stumbo, Dr. 
Larry Leslie, Styl-Rite Beauty Shop, 
Floyd Funeral Home, Maloney's, Bays 
Trucking Co., Big Sandy TV Cable, 
Ratliff Farm Supply, Halber t' s 
Machine Shop, Boyd Holbrook, Mar­
shall Davidson, Howard Ferguson, 
Lloyd's Hardware, Stop . . Shop, Aux­
ier Road Gas Co., Cooley Apothecary, 
Martin County Coal, Hall . . Clark In­
surance Co., Prestonsburg Dairy 
Cheer, Clem Stambaugh, Mabel Wells, 
Freddie Goble, Okie Shell, Love! Hall, 
Aster Hicks, Donna Lafferty, Barb 
Wells, Petty Thompson, Dale Wilson, 
Frank Derossett, Dickie Leslie, W.Va. 
Solid Energy, Jerry Lafferty, Amma 
Vaughan, Austin Powder, Gary Lilly, 
Hobert's Pizzaria, Madge Doran, Mor­
ris Isaac, Piggly Wiggly, Prestonsburg 
Dairy Queen. 

PAUL CONNORS 
Publicity Chairman 

CAPT. CONLEY DECORATED 
Capt. Terry G. Conley, son of Mrs. 

Boyd Conley, of Lackey, has been 
decorated with the meritorious service 
medal at RAF Lakenheath, England. 

The medal is awarded for outstan­
ding non-combat meritorious achieve­
ment or service to the United States. 

Conley is an executive support of­
ficer with the 48th Security Police 
Squadron. 

His wife, Cathy, is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Kesnneth Omsted, Sr., of 
Montgomery, Alabama. 
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the Middle Ages," he said. "Hopefully, 
next time we'll move into the modern 
era." 

Hospital workers will now earn a 
minimum of $3.80 an hour and all pre­
sent employees will be earning at least 
$4.18 by next July, Woodruff said. 

Workers will receive two percent 
longevity increases after two, five and 
eight years' service and three percent 
increases after 11 and 14 years. 

The 50 percent wage-and-benefit in­
crease won in Tuesday's contract 
represents a compromise between the 
40 percent originally offered by the 
hospital and the 70 percent sought by 
the union. 

About 280 members of Local 1199 of 
the National Union of Hospital and 
Health 8are Employees went on strike 
March 25. The workers, about 80 per­
cent of whom are women, cited a lack 
of retirement benefits and a seniority 
system and also claimed that 75 per­
cent of them earned only the national 
minimum wage of $3.35 an hour. 

The 137-bed hospital has remained 
open, operated by about a third of its 
normal staff, but daily occupancy has 
been down to about 20 to 30 patients 
throughout the strike. 

Assails Buckley Petition 
Recently I received a petition from 

John S. Buckley, Public Advocate, 
Washington, D. C., asking me to sign 
and return it along with a contribution 
to help abolish the Department of 
Education. I was aghast at the un­
truths concerning our public schools 
that this man is sending across the na­
tion to unsuspecting citizens. I was also 
angered, knowing that I have a son and 
daughter-in-law who are both 
dedicated teache.rs in the public school ' 
system as well as faithful workers in 
the church. I was also angered because 
I had spent all the years my children 
were growing up being in the P. T. A. 
and helping in whatever way I could to 
improve the public school system, not 
abolish it. In fact, to put it mildly, when 
I received the above-mentioned Peti­
tion I was "steaming". So, in order to 
keep from "blowing a gasket," so to 
speak, I thought it better to write a few 
letters and send them where hopefully 
they might do some good and thus let a 
little steam off gradually. 

I, for one, do not believe that our 
schools are teaching that homosexuali­
ty is normal and "free love" permissi­
ble, nor that our schools are planning 
to have Lesbian Clubs, as this sup­
posedly "public advocate" is sug­
gesting they are doing. It is possible 
that in some large school districts 
there may have crept in " ultra 
liberals" who would try to institute 
such teachings, but I certainly have 
heard nothing of this nature in our own 
area or in the State of Kentucky for 
that matter. 

Instead of blaming the public school 
system, we should become acquainted 
with the problems confronting the 
school officials and let our school board 
members and our superintendent know 
how we feel on the various issues and 
try to work with them, not against 
them, for the betterment of the schools. 
We as parents and interested citizens 
are welcome to visit the schools and 
observe what is being taught and how it 
is being presented. I did so many times 
when my children were growing up and 
so noted the needs of the schools and 
the problems with which the teachers 
were confronted, and in so doing I not 
only answered my own questions about 
my child's education but it proved to 
the teacher and to my child that I 
cared. Then I went to work through the 
P.T.A. to help in whatever way I could. 

We all realize that our schools have 
problems, oftentimes financial and 
many times disciplinary, the latter 
usually caused by lack of parental 
guidance in the home. When children 
are brought up to respect their parents 
and the rights of others and taught that 
school is the place to learn and not a 
place to "goof off," then teachers and 
school officials will have fewer pro­
blems and our young people will grow 
into mature, responsible adults. 
Remember that even before our public 
school teachers become acquainted 
with our children, we have already had 
the little ones approximately six years 
in the home, which, according to 
psychology, is the most important 
training period in a child's life. So, 
please don't blame our schools for 
what we as parents have failed to do. 
We can't expect miracles from a 
teacher with a room full of our 
mistakes. 

If our public school system is 
abolished, what do we have as an alter­
n.ative? I can think of absolutely no ad­
vantage a private school might have 
over public education except possibly 
smaller classes and more individual 
attention. Our public schools might 
also have that advantage, in fact it was 
asked for by our State Superintendent 
during the last Legislature, if we would 
be willing to set aside more of our tax 
money for education, knowing that our 
children are our hope for tomorrow. 

Now you can readily see how Mr. 
Buckley's Petition "set me off". I 
would hope that if anyone reading this 
letter has received such a Petition, he 
or she would please toss it into the gar­
bage can where it rightfully belongs. 

MRS. OTTO MARTIN 
P. 0. Box 204 

Wayland, Kentucky 41666 

VISIT RELATIVES HERE 
Major (Ret.) and Mrs. Bernard 

Williams, of Miami, are here for a visit 
with her sister, Mrs. Florence 
Reynolds, her brother and sister-in­
law, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Hereford, 
and other relatives and friends . Major 
and Mrs. Williams will go from here to 
Wisconsin for a visit with his mother. 
After returning home, they will move 
to Orlando, Florida. 
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In Medical School 

Suzanna Park, daugh te r of Dr. and 
M•·s. Donald S. Park, of Hager Hill, 
recently entered the University of Ken­
tucky Medical School. She graduated 
from Transylvania University in May. 

MAYTOWN NEWS . 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter J. Suike, of 

Commac, N.Y., announce the birth of 
their second child, a son, on July 2. The 
maternal grandparents are Frank and 
Minnie Allen Izarry, of Brentwood, 
N.Y., and the great-grandmother is 
Mrs. Dallas Reynolds, of Langley. 

Tommy Moore is recuperating at his 
home after spending more than a week 

• at Our Lady of the Way Hospital. 
Visiting him over the weekend were 
Mr. and Mrs. Willie Moore and son, 
Tad, Mrs. Daniel Moore, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy BeeBee, Mr. and Mrs. Kenny 
Bryan and Mr. and Mrs. Bud Bryan, all 
of Swanton, Ohio; on Saturday, Ellen 
Clemmons, of Garrett, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ted Gibson, and on Sunday, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bold Hall, of Knott county, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tivis Reynolds, on 
Monday. 

• Mrs. Jimmy BeeBee, of Swanton, 
Ohio, is spending another week here 
with her grandfather, Tommy Moore. 

Mrs. Ruth Dowdy, of Elizabeth, W. 
Va., spent last weekend here visiting 
her father, Tommy Moore. 

Guests of Mrs . Dee Burchett are her 
sister, Irene Clark, of Lexington, and 
her grandson, Phillip Perkins, of Col­
umbia, Tenn. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Webb and sons, of 
Springfield, Ohio, are the guests of 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Claude 
Webb and Mr. and Mrs. Ray Prater. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Hayes and 
Heather, of Winchester, were weekend 
guests of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Earmest Hayes, and of Mr. and Mrs. 
W. B. Day. 

Church services for Tommy Moore 
were held last Wednesday evening at 
his home. Those attending were Rev. 
and Mrs. Jim Reed, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dallas Kilgore, Effie Howard, Mr. and 
Mrs. Milford Case, Rev. and Mrs. Ed 
Alley and singers, Joan Rudder, 
Clotine Shepherd and Charlene, also 
Mrs. Howard, Mrs. Case and Mrs. 
Alley. Others attending were Ernest 
Moore and Ed Moore, of Martin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Webb and Katina, 
of Springfield, Ohio, have been the 
guests of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Webb, of Langley, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Alex Howard, of P,restonsburg. 

E lder and Mrs. Troy Beverly,' of 
Fairborn, Ohio, were the weekend 
guests of his sister, Mrs. Ray Prater, 
and Mr. Prater and other relatives in 
the county. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Gibson and 
children, of New Richmond, Ohio, have 
been the guests of his mother, Mrs. 
Bertha Gibson. 

Charles Bradley, Jr. and two friends, 
of Louisville, are here visiting his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Hicks. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hagans and Mrs. 
Mae Hagans were in Louisville over 
the weekend visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Smith Bradley and other family 
members. 

Kenneth CBoBo) Collins is a patient 
at Our Lady of the Way Hospital. 

Mrs. Gertrude Webb, Ken Webb, 
Dean Webb and Pamela Prater are 
vacationing at Myr tle Beach, S. C. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Brown, of Ft. 
Lauderdale, Fla., were Friday dinner 
guests of Mrs. Agnes Van Hoose and 
Mrs. Sarah Allen. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl E. Webb and sons 
spent the wflekend in F lemingsburg 
visiting relatives. 

Ray Amburgey, of Texas, has com­
pleted officer's t r aining in In­
dianapolis, Ind., and stopped here to 
visit his grandmother, Mrs. Sarah 
Allen, on his way home. His daughter, 
Michele, who had been visiting Mrs . 
Allen for the past five weeks, returned 
home with him. 

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Flanery and 
chi ldren, of Boldman, were the 
weekend guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
P rater here and Mr. and Mrs. Ike 
F lanery at Martin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Goins and 
Delbert Milton were the weekend 
guests of his parents' in Richmod, In­
diana. 

P UBLIC NOTICE 
The City of Prestonsburg is offering 

.to sell to the highest bidder one ( 1) 1975 
Ford LTD. This vehicle was used as a 
police car for the City. The vehicle in 
question is in operating condition and 
can be seen at the city garage at Ar­
cher park . Mail bids to the City Ad­
ministrator, P. 0. Box 31, Prestons­
burg, Ky. 41653. Deadline for bids is Ju­
ly 9, 1981, at 3:00 p .m . 

DAVID EVANS 
City Administrator 

7-1-2t. 

• PRICES EFFECTIVE 
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FRESH 

GROUND 
CHUCK 
59 

• WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO LIMIT QUANTITIES. 

• WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR PRINTER'S ERRORS . 

OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK 
8 A.M. TO J J P.M. 

VALLEYDALE 12-0Z. 

7 9 
C 

HOT DOGS ....... . 
WHOLE 

CHICKEN LEGS 

Lb. 

BALLARD'S 

BISCUITS 6-Pak 

ST A-PUF 64-0Z. 

FABRIC 
SOFTENER 

$179 

QUARTER 

PORK 
LOINS 

$ 29 

38-0z. 
Bt l. 

Lb. 

PRE-SLICED AND 
PACKAGED FREE 

~ 

FLAV-0-RICH 

VALLEYDALE 

LARD ~~· .. .... . $269 
FISCHER'S 
REG. DR BEEF $149. 
BOLOGNA........ ~~:: 
FISCHER'S 
MELLWOOD 

BACON $11! 
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · Pkg. 

U.S. CHOICE 

:~~L:~~ ............... $21~ 
CHARMIN 4-ROLL 

BATHROOM 
TISSUE 

c 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

STANTCOFFE 
$339 10-0z. 

Jar 

COTTAGE ·CHEESE KO.OL-AID 
t 

BANANAS ..... 4 Lbs. $1 
YELLOW 
ONIONS 

3-Lb. Bag , 

ggc 

$119 24-0z. 
Ctn. 

POST 

CORN FLAKES 
age 18-0z. 

Box 

%-Oz. 
Size 8/Sl 

PRESWEETENED 

KOOL-AID 
sgc 6.7-0z. 

Size 
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Floyd Humane Soc. 
Advises Added Pet 
Care During Summer 

With summer being the traditional 
time for vacations and a variety of 
other outdoor activities, pet owners 
should take extra care that their 
animals are being properly watched 
and cared for during this time, advises 
the Floyd County Humane Society. 

"This is the time many of us go 
places- boating, swimming, the an­
nual vacation- and pets are often left 
in basements or similar places," a 
spokesman for the Society pointed out. 
"We want to urge everyone to be sure · 
that someone looks out for the pet while 
the owner or family is away." 

The Society also stressed the 
dangers of leaving pets in cars for ex­
tended periods of time during hot 
weather and urged owners to provid~ 
for some ventilation when leaving the 
vehicle. 

Our Error 
The name of Tolva C. Lykins, who 

died recently, was incorrectly printed 
in his obiturary last week as Polva C. 
Lykins. We regret the error. 

BUDGET ORDINANCE 
ORDINANCE adopting the annual 

budget of the City of Wayland, Ken­
tucky for the Fiscal Year, July 1, 1981 
through June 30, 1982 by estimating 
revenues and resources and ap­
propriating funds for the operation of 
city government. 

WHERAS, an annual budget pro­
posal and message has been prepared 

: and delivered to the City Council; and 
: WHEREAS, the City Council has re­
viewed such budget proposal and made 
necessary modifications, now, there­
fore, be it ordained by the City of Way­
land : 
SECTION I. 

That the annual budget for the fiscal 
year beginning July 1, 1981 and ending 
June 30, 1982 is hereby adopted as 
follows : 
GENERAL FUND 
RESOURCES AVAILABLE: 

Fund balance 
carried forward ... . .. .. . .. $ 1,000.00 

ESTIMATED REVENUES: 
401-property tax .. ........ . $ 4,000.00 
402-Auto Sticker . . .. . .... $ 1,600.00 
403-Business License . .. . . . $ 245.00 
404-Rebates . . ...... . ...... $ 918.45 
405-Unloading License .. . . . $ 645.00 
406-Road Fund ....... . .. .. $ 2,000.00 
407-Base Court. .... . . . .. . . $ 2,527.40 

Total $12,935.85 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

lt. 

501-City Clerk Salary . .. . .. $ 1,800.00 
502-Attorney Fee ...... . . . . $ 0 
503-0ffice Supplies ...... .. $ 200.00 
504-Telephone ........... . . $ 276.00 
505-Power Supply . . .. $ 96.00 
506-Water Supply .. ........ $ 96.00 
507-Heat . .. ........ . .. . ... $ 200.00 
508-Street Lights ........ . . $ 2,800.00 
509-Miscl. Expense ..... . . . $ 300.00 
510-Bonds.... . . . $ 40.00 
511-Unemployment Ins .... $ 318.60 
512-Social Security . .. . .... $ 1,356.60 
513-Publishing .. . . .. . .. .. . $ 20.00 
600-Police Department: 
601-GasandOil. ... . ..... $ 1,100.00 
602-Cruiser Ins ...... . .. . . . $ 200.00 
603-Marshal's Salary ..... . $ 1,200.00 
604-Retirement . ..... ... . .. $ 945.48 
605-Purchases ... . .... .. .. . $ 167.80 

700-Fire Department: 
701-Gas and Oil. . . ... ...... $ 400.00 
702-Supplies ... . . . .. .... ... $ 0 

Total $11,516.48 

REVENUE SHARING 
BOO-Police Department: 
Fund balance 
carried forward ..... .. . .. . $ 600.00 
Estimated revenue: 
Revenue Sharing . ..... . . .. $ 6,260.00 

Total $ 6,860.00 

DISBURSEMENT 
801-Marshal 's Salary .. .. . . $ 6, 708.00 

Bal. $ 152.00 

MARY BRADLEY 
City Clerk 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 
Floyd County Fiscal Court, Floyd 

County Courthouse Annex, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. 
Separate sealed bids for the purchase 

of approximately 3,000 tons of gravel, 
2,000 tons of No. 2 gravel, 1,000 tons of 
No. 57 gravel Csand stone gravel> will 
be received by the Floyd County Fiscal 
Court at the office of County Judge/Ex­
ecutive until 9:00a.m. Oocal time> Ju­
ly 8, 1981 and then publicly opened and 
read aloud in the Conference Room of 
the Floyd County Courthouse Annex. 

Information may be obtained at the 
County Judge/ Executive office Court­
house Annex. 

BIDDERS must comply with the 
President executive order Nos. 11246 
and 11375, which prohibit discrimina· 
tion in employment regarding race, 
creed, color, sex, 'or national orgin. 
BIDDERS must comply with title VI of 
civil rights act 1964, the anti-kickback 
act and the contract maintain or pro­
vide for their employees any facility 
that are segregated on a Basis of race, 
color, creed, or national origin. The 
Floyd County Court reserves the right 
lo reject any and all bids and waiver in­
formalities. 

Bid price will include delivery and 
spreading of gravel to the Floyd Coun­
ty landfill site at Garth Hollow. Ken­
tucky. 

FLOYD COUNTY 
FISCAL COURT 
By BILL WELLS 

County Judge/Executive 
Attest: C. "Ollie" Robinson 7-1·2t. 
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''llappy Hollow'' School, 1923 

1. Hazel Green, daughter of Perry and Zelia Greene; 2. 
Mabel Hall, daughter of Bill and Grace Hall; 3. Anabelle 
Greene, daughter of Perry and Zelia Green; 4. Ana belle 
Hyden, daughter of C. L. and Clara Hyden; 5. Carlos Hale, 
daughter of Charlie and Reta Hale; 6. Clarabelle <Tootsie) 
Allen, daughter of Roland and Georgia Allen; 7. Ethel Mae 
Horn, daughter of Guy and Elizabeth Horn; 8. Thelma Clay, 
daughter of Mollie Clay; 9. Virginia Hall, daughter of Bill and 
Grace Hall; 10. Billie Bolling, daughter of Walter and 
Frances Bolling; 11. Maurine Hereford and 12. Dorothy Here­
ford, daughters of Thomas and Mollie Hereford; 13. Minnie 
Horn, daughter of Tom and Annie Horn;· 14. Emma Young, 
daughter of Henry and Jenny Young; 15. Romaine Price, son 
of Sadie Price; 16. ?, 17. ?, 18. Susan Allen, daughter of 
Roland and Georgia Allen; 19. Perry Greene, Jr., son of 
Perry and Zelia Green; 20. ? , 21. ? , 22. ? , 23. Allen, 
son of Roland and Georgia Allen; 24. ? , 25. John Harmon, son 
of Tom and Ellen Harmon ; 26. Thomas Hereford, son of 

(Photo, courtesy of Clarence E. Shepard) 
Thomas and Mollie Hereford; 27. Theodora Click Skeens, 
daughter of Lindsey and Anna Click, wife of Tom Skeens; 28. 
Henry Clay Green, son of Perry and Zelia Green; 29. Jay W. 
Skeens, son of Tom and Theodora Skeens; 30. ? , 31. Zelia 
Skeens Green, daughter of Tom and Theodora Skeens, wife of 
Perry Green; 32. ? , 33. Edgar Herald, son of Henry J. and 
Osia Herald; 34. ? , 35. ? , 36. Grace Hall, daughter of Bill and 
Grace Hall; 37. Hazie Freeman, son of George and Lizzie 
Freeman; 38. ? , 39. ? , 40. Minerva Skeens, daughter of Tom 

· and Theodora · Skeens; 41. Gladys Hyden, daughter of 
Chauncey Hyden; 42. ? , 43. Patsy Click, daughter of Dock 
and Lizzie Click; 44 . ? , 45. Willia Skeens, daughter of Tom 
and Theodora Skeens; 46. ? , 47. Katie Mae Snyder, daughter 
of Jim and Mollie Snyder; 48. ? , 49. ? , 50. Chester Miller, son 
of Joe and Rebecca Miller; 51. Eletha Snyder, daughter of 
Jim and Mollie Snyder; 52. ? , 53. Cecil Conley, son of Liz Con­
ley; 54. Helen Price, daughter of Sadie Price; 55. Agnes Har­
ris, daughter of Henry and Jane Harris. 

To Wed August 8th 

The marriage of Miss Jennifer Anita 
Miller, of Fayetteville, N. C., to Lt. 
Theodore Charles Nicholas, also of 
Fayetteville, N.C., will be solemnized 
on Saturday, August 8, at the Hay­
mount United Methodist Church in 
Fayetteville. 

Miss Miller is the daughter of Mrs. 
Juanita Bingham Miller, and Dr. 
William Carey Miller, Jr., both of 
Fayetteville, N.C., and Lt. Nicholas is 
the son of Dr. and Mrs. Theodore 
Charles Nicholas, of Prestonsburg. 

Miss Miller has attended East 
Carolina University in Greenville, N. 
C., for two years, where she is a dance 
major in the School of Fine Arts. Lt. 
Nicholas, a graduate of Western Ken­
tucky University in Bowling Green, is 
stationed with the 82nd Airborne Divi­
sion at Fort Bragg, N.C., where he is in 
military intelligence. 

I Our Fragile Earth I 
By DR. JERRY HOWELL 

Department of Biological and 
Environmental Sciences 

Morehead State University 

(This installment is a reprint of an 
article that originally appeared during 
the week of January 30, 1978. It is being 
reprinted because of its timeliness.) 

The last article discussed some com­
ments made by William K. Reilly, 
President of the Conservation Founda· 
tion, in an October, 1977 presentation to 
the Appalachian Regional Commis· 
sion's Conference on Balanced Growth 
and Economic Development. Although 
generally optimistic, Mr. Reilly cau­
tioned the audience to be wary and 
learn from past mistakes. He advised 
against absentee landowners and in­
vestment companies, presently an Ap­
palachian reality. 

Environmentally, Mr. Reilly said 
that the predicted increase in coal pro· 
duction will cause a substantial in­
crease in Appalachian air pollution. He 
advised against lowering regional air 
quality standards because this would 
tend to make the impact greater. He 
said emphasis should be placed on 

· desulfurizing coal before and during 
the burning process. 

grams geared to the private land­
owner. He advocates an increase in 
cost sharing programs, tax breaks for 
forest improvements, and allowing the 
price of timber to rise to its real 
market value. The latter recommenda­
tion hinges on the willingness of public 
forest managers, primarily the U.S. 
Forest Service, to stop harvesting high 
percentages of mature sound trees, 
thus saving some for future years. This 
would increase the cost of quality 
Jumber, but the resultant increase in 
economic potential would provide an 
incentive for small landowners to pro­
perly practice forest management. Of 
course, the issue is more complicated 
than Mr. Reilly discloses, primarily 
because of the method's inefficiency 
and the possible loss from timber 
decaying on the stump, but his sugges­
tion does deserve discussion. 

ou·R PLEDGE · 

!1. AFFORDABLE I PRICES 

2. ONE-DAY SERVICE 
ON DENTURE REP AIRS 
AND RELINES 

ACTION ~~~~~~!!~S CORP. /k l7n/ltJ;.~u· 
OF~~z 

886-3804 
[B An 1nternat1onal Network of Independent Real Estate Br'okers ™ 
.... .,.. ~ Gallery of Homes. Inc - 1981 

3·18-tf. 

Shrimp, Fish 
~Chicken 

Special$ 2.99 
ThruAug. 1 

~---.g-:--...._,_ .. :4. ~ / 

Dig into a delicious dinner. We give you two tasty shrimp, 
our crispy fish fillet, and a boneless whitemeat Chicken Plank~ 

plus fresh cole slaw, crunchy hushpuppies and golden fryes. 
It's a great meal at a special price! 

& 1981 LJS 

CWng<joliri Silver~® 
SEAFOOD SHOPPES 

U.S. Highway 23 North 

a smile can be affordable 
retyonthe 

PROFESSIONAL DENTIST 
members of 

3. AVAILABILITY 
Fillings 
Extractions 

4. NO SURPRISES 
Treatment and cost are discussed 
first; you determine the amount 
or service . 

5. PERSONAL ATTENTION 
Old rashioned courtesy and 
concern are assured in the office 
of a DAD member dentist. 

6. HIGH 
STANDARDS 

New Arrivals ... 
OUR LADY OF THE WAY 

He observed that Appalachian 
timber resources could eventually be 
as important as coal and that because 
60 percent of Appalachian land is 
forested, proper timber management 
practices must be put into effect now to 
meet the increased demand for wood 
products in the future. Timber, pulp­
wood and veneer stock trees are now 
lagging behind their potential simply 
because of the land ownership pattern. 
Two thirds of Appalachian forested 
land is in privately owned parcels of 
less than 50 acres. Because of this 
checkerboard pattern and the existing 
marginal economic potential for .wood 
products, little interest in forest im­
provement practices can be generated 
among small landowners, especially 
when the final crop may not be 
harvested for thirty or forty years. 

r----D EN J u RE s ____ l_u_r_Nr_u_R_E_R-EP_A_IR_s_._R_n_I_NE_s_A_L_s_o._A_vA_I_LA_B_L--,E.I 

Births recorded at Our Lady of the 
Way Hospital at Martin from June 26 
through July 2 included the following: 

A son, Paul Aaron, on June 26 to 
~anice Ruth Evelyn and Paul Triplett, 
of Wayland; a son, Adam Brock, on 
June 27 to Deborah Sue and Dean Ed­
ward Craft, of Hindman; a son, 
Jonathan Layne, on June 27 to Sharon 
Kaye and Larry Julius Mullins, of 
Wheelwright; a son, William Steven, 
on June 29 to Tammy Fugate, of Em­
malena; a son, Joshua Adam, on June 
30 to Rita Fay and Stanley Ray Stum­
bo, of Topmost; a daughter, Nina 
Leigh-Ann, on July 2 to Katie Doris and 
Lanny Hall , of Emma. 

TUTTLE FAMILY REUNION 
Members of the Tuttle family who 

live in Kentucky and surrounding 
states will meet in reunion at the Scioto 
Trail State Park on U. S. 23 north of 
Waverly, 0., on Saturday, July 11. 

All members of the Tuttle family are 
invited to bring a basket lunch and at­
tend. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We, the family of Armina Hall, wish 

to express our thanks to everyone for 
all the food, flowers and words of com· 
fort during our time of bereavement. A 
special thanks to the Merion Funeral 
Chapel and the Little Nancy Church. 
All your efforts were appreciated so 
much. 

Reilly's thesis is that small woodlots 
should take over most of the region's 
timber production, leaving national 
forests the freedom to provide other 
services, such as recreation and wild­
life conservation. One way to ac­
complish this objective is to increase 
the number and quality of forestry pro-

STANOARO 
DENTURES 

DR. R. I. GOODMAN 
D.M.O. 

·----- -·----

$129 PER UPPER 
AND LOWER 

CHA~ACTERIZED $169 PER UPPER 
DENTURES AND LOWER 

-

ALLEN DENTAL CENTER DR. W. FU 
D. M.D. PHONE 606/874-2020 ALLEN, KY. 

A Sure Winner 
For The 
Summer 

Polynesian Pools 
and 

SUN POOL 
~ PRODUCTS 

FENCE&POOL 
CONTRACTORS 

Rt. 23, South Paintsville 

789-1322 

1-27-tl 

MEM&ER 

NATIONAL 
SWIMMING POOL 
INSTITUTE 

6-24 tf. Sun-FMC Trademark 
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FOR SALE 
Brand new bi-level home located in High Life Estates at Harold, Ky. This home 

is sitting on a 2/3 acre wooded lot with many beautiful trees. This home has 
2600 sq. ft. under roof wi th 3 bedrooms, 3 full baths, family room with wood burn­
ing fireplace, l4'x 28' dining room and living room combination and loads of 
closets. Master bedroom has private deck. Outside of home is finished in real 
poplar wood siding and coronada stone. This hoRie is now ready for cabinets and 
carpet, waiting on its owners to choose. Come see this beautiful home anytime as 
builder will leave open for inspection 7 days a week. 

This home qualifies for Floyd County Bond Mortgage for 8.8%. You may never 
again have interest this low. This money will be gone very shortly, so if you are in 
the market for a home, come see this one. 

For more information, phone Meade Construction Co. at 478-5565. 

ACTION PROPERTIES CORP. 
Bill Cibson, Broker 

886-3804 
rtl An International Network of Independent Real Estate Brokers TM 
W. ©Gallery of Homes, Inc. -1981 

3·18-tf. 

4-28-lf. 

Conservation Essay 
Poster Contests Set 

"Fish and Wildlife Management in 
my Community" will be the subject of 
the 1981 Conservation Essay Contest 
and the 1981 Jim Claypool Conserva· 
tion Poster Contest sponsored by The 
Courier-Journal and The Louisville 
Times. 

The annual competitions, open to all 
Kentucky elementary and high school 
students, ma y be the largest 
conservation-oriented contests for 
school children in the United Sta tes. In 
1980 over 45,000 essays were written on· 
"Trees and My Community. " More 
than 52,000 posters were made on the 
subject. 

The essay contest is in its 38th year, 
and over 1.5 million essays have been 
written by students on various conser· 
vation subjects since its inception. This 
will be the ninth year for the poster 
contest which is open to students in 
grades one through six. In it, students 
are asked to make original posters 
with the subject of the competition as 
the theme of the posters. Awards of 
$175 in U.S. Savings Bonds will be 
awarded to three state winners by the 
two Louisville daily newspapers. Win­
ners in 121 Conservation Districts will 
receive plaques. 

In the essay contest, students in 
grades seven through twelve are asked 
to write essays of no more than 1,000 
words. The top award winners-121 
district winners and three state win· 
ners- will receive $6,850 in savings 
bonds from the Louisville newspapers. 

Co-sponsors of the contests, along 
with The Courier-Journal and The 
Louisville Times, are the Kentucky 
Association of Conservation Districts 
and the Kentucky Department of 
Education . The 1981 competition will 
begin in September. Detailed informa­
tion and reference material for the two 
contests will be sent to principals of all 
schools in Kentucky at that time. 

Local Farm Coop Sets 
Annual Meet, Friday 

Election of advisory board and farm 
home advisory committee members, 
as well as operations reports, will 
highlight the Southern St ate s 

. nt operative's annua l membership 
meeting at the Prestonsburg Farm and 
Home Store, July 10. The meeting will 
begin at 7:30p.m. and the business ses· 
sion will be preceded by a supper. 

Arnold Lowe, of Eastern, will serve 
as chairman; Jesse Whitehouse , of 
Barbourville, a member of Southern 
States Cooperative's regional staff, 
will report on the over-all Southern 
States operations ; local operations and 
services rendered to agriculture in the 
community will be discussed by 
manager Kenneth Meade. 

CHECKING ACCOUNTS 

$300°0 MINIMUM 
AND 

5 ~ % INTEREST 

UNITED FEDERAL 
Savings & Loan 

G Association G 
19 South Lake Dr. 
Prestonsburg 
816-2382 

Main St. 
Hindman 

785-5095 
i·H-t l 

11 0 Caroline Ave. 
Pikeville 

432-2565 

11 OZ. SIZE 
"NEW" 

PERT 

TWIN BUILT-IN 
MOLDED HAND GRt PS 

SALE PRICE! ggc. 

4-DAYS ONLY! 
FRI. THRU MOll.! 

20 INCH 
CABINET DESIGN 
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COMFORT 

FAN 

4-DAYS ONLY ! FRI. THRU MON.! 
BOX OF 24 DAYTIME 

JOHNSON'S 

DISPOSABLE 
DIAPERS 

SALE PRICE 

JUilY 
·SUPER 
SAVERS! 

LI MIT 
I 

WISK 
HEAVY DUTY 

LAUNDRY 
DETERGENT 

SAlE PRICE 

4-DAYS ON LY! FRI. THRU MON.! 
II OZ. R£G. OR LIME 

COLGATE 
INSTANT SHAVE 

$1.3! 69 LIM IT Mfl; c 1 
SUGGESTED 

NATIONAl BRAN D EQU IVAlENT 
MR Wlll'l 1 01 SIZE 

HYDRO COR TISONE 

CREAM 
SALE PRICE! 

liMir 
1 

ONLY! 

$1088 
WITH 
THIS 

COUPOII ! 
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Stumbo Says Hospital Freeze, 
Humana Approval Coincidence 

DRIVE - IN THEATRE 

Adults-$3.00; Childten Free 
For the Best Shows in the World! 

Ticket Office Opens at 7:45 
First Show Starts at 9:15. 

Wed., Thurs., Fri., 

"Spaced Out" 
-Plus-

"The Girl From 
Starship Venus" 

Color-Rated R 

WEDNESDAY NIGHT-Wear 
your Prestonsburg Drive-ln­
WPRT-Shirt and Get in Free! 
THURSDAY NIGHT - $6 a 
Carload 
FRIDAY NIGHT - Jackpot 
Drawing for $175! Plus Grand 
Slam Giveaway-Win a Moped, 
$100, T-Shirts and Passes. 

Saturday 

Pajama Party 
Plus Three Big Movies! 

'Teenage Hitchhiker' 
-Plus-

"Teenage Models" 
-Plus-

"Spaced Out" 
WET NIGHTGOWN CONTEST! 
- $175 First Prize! Everybody 
wear pajamas. 

Sun., Mon., Tues. 

''The Howling" 
Rated R 

MONDAY NIGHT- Harold's Club Gambl­
ing Night! All proceeds will go to Jerry 
Lewis's Fund Drive to fight muscular 
dystrophy. 

TUESDAY NIGHT- DOLLAR NIGHT. 
Everybody gets in for a dollar! 

FRANKFORT, July 1- Human 
Resources Secretary Grady Stumbo 
said yesterday it was "purely coin­
cidental" that a moratorium on 
hospital expansion in Louisville and 
Lexington was imposed a few weeks 
after Humana Inc. received state ap­
proval for a 170-bed facility in Lex­
ington. 

Officials of the for-profit hospital 
firm, based in Louisville, have close 
ties with the administration of Gov. 
John Y. Brown Jr. 

W.T. Young, vice chairman of the 
governor's cabinet and deputy com­
merce secretary, is the single largest 
Hum ana shareholder. 

Humana received approval for the 
Lexington hospital May 20 from the 
State Certificate of Need and Licen­
sure Board. 

The 7-6 vote of approval came 
despite the opposition of other Lex­
ington· hospital officials, who said it 
would be cheaper to expand existing 
facilities. 

The new hospital also was opposed 
by the Department for Human 
Resources, Stumbo said. 

Under state regulations, opponents 

ALMAH 
ALLEN, KENTUCKY 
(606) 886-2201 

Wednesday, Thursday, Friday, 
July 8-9-10 
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DRAW TILL YOU WIN $100 
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July 12-13-14 
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fome ~ 

A COLUMBIA PICTURES RELEASE 
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TUESDAY BUCK NITE 
ALL TICKETS $1.00 

STRAN.D TWIN 
PRESTONSBURG, KV. • 606-886-2696 

STRAND I I STRAND II 
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Burt Reynolds • Roger Moore 
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but you'H never guess who wins 
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' THE ADVENTURE 
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Open at 6:45 p.m. 
Showtimes 7:30 and 9:40 p.m. 

Sunday matinee opens 1:00. Starts 1:30. Over 3:30p.m. 
Prices $1.50 and $3.00 

Phone 606-886-2696 

of a project receiving approval from 
the Certificate of Need and Licensure 
Board may ask for a reconsideration 
hearing within 30 days after the ap­
proval is granted . 

The deadline for such a request on 
the Humana facility was June 19. 

Brown imposed the moratorium 
June 22 in a letter to the chairman of 
the Statewide Health Coordinating 
Council. The council has written Ken­
tucky's first health plan for submission 
to the federal Department of Health 
and Human Services. 

The governor was unaware of the 
moratorium plans until Stumbo 
presented the letter to him June 22, 
said Frank .ey, Brown's press 
secretary. 

" Humana had filed the application 
more than a year ago, and it takes nine 
months to go through the process," 
Ashley said, adding that only one of the 
seven board members voting to ap­
prove the hospital was a Brown ap­
pointee. 

In the letter, Brown said he was im­
posing the moratorium on acute care 
beds until December 1983 to encourage 
regionalization of health services. 

Louisville and Lex ington 
" historically have served as the 
centers of hospital development within 
the Commonwealth ; however, if 
regionalization is to be successful, that 
pattern must be halted ," the letter 
said. 

Stumbo echoed that sentiment 
yesterday, saying the expanded 
capacity of hospitals in the urban areas 
has led to " less than optimal occupan­
cy" and increased health-care costs . 

Of the 107 acute-care hospitals in 
Kentucky, 31 percent are not ac­
credited, Stumbo said. Many of those 
are in more rural areas of the state, 
have fewer than 100 beds and also lack 
modern equipment. 

And there are more than 1,000 
surplus beds in the s tate, he added. 

The department hopes that blocking 
expansion in Louisville and Lexington 
will encourage hospita l corporations to 
look elsewhere in the state for develop­
ment sites, Stumbo said. 

Although Brown did not receive the 
coordinating council 's approval of the 
moratorium, Stumbo said it was the 
department's position that the gover­
nor "has the legal right" to modify the 
plan. 

"That's how he establishes policy for 
the state," he said. 

Stumbo said he and the governor had 
discussed since January the problem 
of surplus hospital beds. The specific 
language of the letter to the council 
was not drafted until after a public 
hearing June 15 on the health plan, he 
said. 

Stumbo said that in order to en­
courage the development of regional 
hospital centers, the state may begin 
"reallocating hospital beds." 

Stumbo later said that he did not 
mean that the state might actually 
decertify some hospital beds in Lex­
ington- a step that would leave the city 
with fewer beds than it now has. 

SPECIAL PROGRAM PRESENTED 
A special program of patriotic music 

was presented at the First United 
Methodist Church during morning ser­
vices, Sunday. Young people of the 
church participating in the program 
were members of the Chancel Choir, 
augmented by the voices Of vacation­
ing college students, with Mike Walls 
playing a trumpet solo , and David 
Leslie as pianist. The Rev . Ted 
Nicholas, the pastor, was assisted by 
Charlie Neeley, summer youth direc­
tor, in the opening services. The ser- · 
vices concluded with Miss Rebecca 
Haywood and the congregation sign­
ing, "God, Bless America." 

GO TO SHELBYVILLE 
Miss Elizabeth Lynn Frazier and her 

niece, little Miss Lynon Frazier, were 
in Shelbyville last week for a visit with 
Mr. a nd Mrs. Steve Wilborn and son, 
Christopher. 

=-------------- - ----------------···------·- ------ -···---- ·--- ·-

....................................................... 
Announcing i 

4TH ANNUAL 1 

SUMMER COLLEGE CAMP 
FOR YOUTH 

SESSION II-JULY 13-31, 1981 
Prestonsburg Community College Community Services 

Registration In The Admissions Office 

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, lULY 6-10, 8 a.m.-4:30 p.m. 
A daytime program of social, educational and recreational activities for young people between ages 6-13, 
at Archer Park, July 13-31. 

Fee $70 per child (discounts are available for families with more than one child participating.) Small addi· 
tional charge for late pickup. 

Activities will include choices of the following: Dance, Swimming, Roller Skating, Tennis, Gymnastics, Pain­
ting & Drawing, Macrame, General Crafts, Spanish, Sewing, Sign Language, Imagination Workshop, and 
Baton Twirling. · • 

For more information write: Office of Community Service, Prestonsburg Community College, Prestonsburg, 
KY 41653 or call 886-3863, ext. 215. 

J 

l 
' 
' ,. 

' . 

I' 

Honored On Birthday 

A dinner honoring Mrs. Ellen Smith, 
of Garrett, on her 85th birthday was 
held recently at the home of her grand­
daughter, Mrs . Brenda Holman . 

Those attending were Mr . and Mrs. 
Howard Bentley, Sherri and Michelle, 
of Yorktown, Va. ; Mr. and Mrs . Paul 
Branham, of prestonsburg; Miss 
Evelyn.Burchfield, of Garrett, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ed Holman, Sonya and 
Jonathan, of Allen. 

HOSTESS TO CHURCH GROUP 
Mrs. George D. Brown was hostess 

at her home on Third Avenue Monday 
evening to the women of the First 
United Methodist Church. The presi­
dent, Mrs. Elizabeth Ramey presided, 
a nd the meeting was opened with 
prayer by Miss Myrtle Pugsley. After 
the business session, Mrs. Robert Bur­
chett gave a patriotic program," 
Altars of Freedom," was the topic of 
devotions . Mrs. Burchett read scrip­
tures from Exodus and 2nd Chronicles. 
The hostess served refreshments to 
Myrtle Pugsley, Katherine Stephens, 
Elizabeth Ramey, Rose Glynn, Julia 
Stephens, Roslyn . Burchett, Ellen 
Messer, Mary Jane Brown. The next 
meeting will be Aug. 3. 

VISITORS HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Garrett and 

children, Betty and Scooter, of Yp­
silanti, Mich. , spent several days 
recently with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Denzil Whi tten , and other 
relatives here. During that time they 
attended the wedding of their cousin, 
Miss Tina Hamilton, to Mr. Tom 
Blackburn at Emma. On their way 
home, they spent some time vacation­
ing in the Smokies .' 

KET Authority To Meet 
At U. of L. , July 13 

The Kentucky Authority For Educa­
tional Television will hold its quarterly 
meeting Monday, July 13, at 10 a.m. 
<ETl on the campus of the University 
of Louisville. The Authority will meet 
in Conference Room One of the univer­
sity's Administration Building. 

The meeting is open to the public and 
all interested parties are invited to at­
tend. 

Make It Easy 

On Yourself 

On 

Your Vacation ... 

• Visa 

THE ALL-NEW 1981 
CLAYTON-WELLINGTON! 

3 bedrooms, 2 full baths, wood­
burning fireplace! All furnished 
& carpeted! $21 ,900:00! On Sale 
$18,900.00! While they last! 

rmutan.. 
.§DIIUI@IIL,Zi 

U.S. 23, Harold, Ky. - 478-9246 

• Master Charge 

• Traveler's Checks 

We've Got Them All ..... 

THE FIRST GUARANTY BANK 
PHONE 285-9281 MARTIN 

MEMBER FDIC 

FPIE 

THANKS EVERYBODY! 
FOR A GREAT JUNE! 

WE MET OUR GOAL, SO WE'RE 

SELL·A·BRATING THIS MONTH! 
YES! YOU CAN SAVE BIG ON NEW TOYOTA PICKUPS AND GMC TRUCKS! 
AND WE'RE SO EXCITED ABOUT BEING ON CH. 57 HAZARD TV THAT WE'RE 
GIVING AWAY TVs SO YOU CAN SEE US! 

SAVE UP TO 10%! 

UP TO 38 MPG! 4X4'S IN STOCK! 

************************* 
: FREE BLACK & WHITE TV : 
* • lt WITH EVERY NEW CAR OR TRUCK · • 
* PURCHASED, NOW THRU JULY 31st. ~ 
* . ~ 
************************* 

STOP IN AND SEE HOW YOU CAN GET 
A NEW TV • USED CARS REDUCED, ALSO! 

SEE ABE OR RANDY 

• 

• 

• 
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Three Keys Ta Successful Aging 
Three factors - perceived good 
health economic security, and a 
spous~ of perceived equal physical 
capability- predict more t~an 
anything else feelings of well-bemg 
and optimism after age 60. 

The well-being of the over-60 
population depends more on per­
ceived physical and financial health 
and a spouse of perceived equal 
physical capability than on age, 
contact with other family and 
friends, organized recreation or 
government handouts. 

The findings, from a study 
sponsored by the Americana Health­
care Corporation, show that a 
majority of those 60 years of age and 
older have annual household in­
comes of $8,000 or more. Almost 
three-quarters of them, however, say 
that spiraling inflation is making 
their money worthless and life 
difficult. 

Money Squeeze 
Nearly all of the people in the 

study say they are suffering from 
increasing financial pressures due to 
today's inflationary economy; only 
eight percent claim to be completely 
unaffected by inflationary 
pressures. 

Such pressures (along with lack of 
a spouse of perceived equal physical 
capability), are second only to health 
as a determinant of overall feelings 
of well-being among the aged. 

·wALLPAPER· 
CUSTOM INTERIORS, Inc. 

Malon~y's Shoppin1 Center 
Pre!>tonsburg • 8A6-ll47 

Subscription 
Rates Per Year 
In Floyd County, $8.00 
Elsewhere In Kentucky, $10 
Outside Kentucky, $12.50 

Please note expiration date 
opposite your name on wrap· 
per or on your copy of The 
Times. Because of increased 
mailing costs, notices of sub­
scription expiration are no 
longer: mailed to subscribers. 

EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY 
FOR REGISTERED NURSES 

We offer Register~d Nurses the oppor· 
tunity to practice in a modern, in­
novative environment with the personal 
touch that a smaller hospital affords. 
We offer: 
Higher starting salaries; increased con. 
sideration for experience; excellent 
fringe benefits; three (3] weeks paid 
vacation annually, nine (9) paid 
holidays, sick leave/temporary disabili· 
ty, medical insurance, retir~ment plan, 
discounts-prescription medication, 
40%, and hospital services, 25%. 
Other types of leave. 

For additional information contact: 
Ms. Amelia Salyers, Director Nursing 
Service, McDowell Appalachian 
Regional Hospital, McDowell, Kentucky 
41647. Phone 606·377-2411. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 
2-4-tf. 

Almost all senior citizens are 
feeling an economic crunch; more 
than two-thirds tend to see a bleak 
financial future. For every person 
reporting an improved financial 
status last year, more than four say 
that their personal financial situa­
tion worsened. 

Although economic pressures are 
putting the squeeze on the vast 
majority of senior citizens, they are 
not cutting back on medical or 
dental care or good nutrition. But 
they are looking for lower prices and 
lesser quality in the supermarkets. 

Strong Self-reliance 
Regardless of their personal 

financial condition, most of those 60 
years of age and older ignore many 
available ways to stretch their 
incomes through federal and local 
government assistance, professional 
counseling and reinvestment of 
assets. 

Only one of every l 0 older persons 
questioned says he or she applied for 
food stamps, disability or other 
government funds last year. The 
reason, the study suggests, may be 
the strong sense of self-reliance 
expressed by most of the elderly 
surveyed. 

Most senior citizens imply that 
they feel self-sufficient, independent 
and reluctant to turn to government 
or community programs not only for 
financial aid, but even for compan-

"Mountain Tales" 
In New Recording 

Roadside Theater and June Appal 
Recordings have produced a record of 
Appalachian stories and music called 
"Mountain Tales." The stories are 
especially for children- and anyone 
else who enjoys hearing tales of giants, 
narrow escapes, fantastic journeys, 
and rousing adventures. The tales on 
the record were collected in eastern 
Kentucky and southwest Virginia and 
some of them came directly from the 
families of Roadside Theater 
members. Roadside Theater tells the 
tales in its unique storytelling style. 
Some of the tales on the album are: 
"Fat or Lean," "Jim Wolfe," "Fat 
Man " and "Cat and Rat." There is 
also 'riddle and banjo music between 
the stories, and featured on jaw harp is 
Jack Wright with a rendition of 
"Thousand Legged Worm." 

"Mountain Tales" has received air 
play on the radio everywhere from 
Knoxville to Detroit, to Santa Cruz. 
The record and an interview with 
Angelyn DeBord, a Roadside Theater 
storyteller, was recently featw-ed on 
National Public Radio's "All Things 
Considered." The record with an inter­
view will soon be featured on N.P.R.'s 
other popular show, "Morning Edi­
tion." 
( The tales are next scheduled for 
performance in Prestonsburg, July 9.) 

Roadside Theater and June Appal 
Recordings are both .a part of the arts 
and educational organization, Ap­
palshop, Inc. in Whitesburg, Kentucky 
and Norton, Virginia. Roadside 
Theater is partially funded by the Na­
tional Endowment for the Arts, the 
Virginia Commission for the Arts, the 
Kentucky Arts Commission, and the 
Lyndhurst Foundation. 

FOR SALE BY OWNER 

READY FOR IMMEDIATE OCCUPANCY 
Country living-city conveniences. 1800 sq. ft. plu.s p~rtially 
finished basement. 3-bedroom, 1112 baths, bmlt-m k1tchen, 
lots of closet space. All carpet on hardwood floors. Central 
air-central heat <very reasonable natural gas rate), ex­
cellent TV cable, city water. New utility building, large 
concrete patio and a heated & filtered 20x40 concrete & 
marblelitt- pool. 5 minutes out of Prestonsburg on beau~iful 
Littl£> Paint. Priced vf."ry reasonably <below appraised 
\'alu(>). St-rious inquirit-s only, please. For appointment, 
call 88H-27:U bt•twt>en 9 & 5. 

7·1·tf 

ionship and recreation. 
These feelings, the study says, 

appear to reflect a broad lack of 
confidence m government. Three­
quarters of the Sf<nior citizens 
participating in the study say that 
the federal government wastes a lot 
of tax dollars and is run by a few 
big interests who look out only fbr 
themselves. ' 

Of those worried about their 
finances, two-thirds say that the 
government is doing a poor job in 
attending to the needs of the 
elderly. 

Sixty-two percent of those con­
tacted doubt that the people running 
the government know what they are 
doing. And more than half do not 
think that government can even be 
trusted to do what is right. 

Other Key Findings 
• Chronological age Js not a 

factor in determining a sense of 
well-being and optimism. 

• Widows as a group have the 
most difficulty coping. 

four-fifths direct their creative 
energies to such pastimes. 

• Those with more education tend 
to report much better health and 
economic security. 

Overall, the study finds that one 
out of every five noninstitutionalized 
senior citizens are "casualties" of the 
complexities of daily living and the 
particular difficulties that accom­
pany aging. More than half are 
"survivors." And nearly three out of 
I 0 are "enjoyers" of their old 
age. 

But senior citizen women, the 
study reveals, are doing far less well 
than the men. Although they 
outnumber men in their age group 
nearly three to two, they make up 
three out of four of the "casualties," 
61 percent of the "survivors;" and 
only 46 percent of the "enjoyers." 

Women, according to the study, 
are more likely to be widowed and 
generally report lower financial 
assets and much lower income than 
men in their age group; both these 
factors work severely against feel­
ings ·of well-being. 

We offer a personalized program, work­
ing in three phases: 
• Weight loss • Re·education of muscles • Firming and toning 

COMPUTE LINE OF EXERCISE EQUIPMENT .... 
• Belt Vibrators • Treadmill • Massage Rolle~ • Jungle Pulley 
with Weights • Bicycles • Electronic Waist Trimmer • Swiss 
Facial Contouring Machine • Hip and Thigh Trimmer • Vertical 
Abdominal Knee Raise • Sit-Up Boards • Sw~dish Abdominal 
Twister • Upper Body Twister • Side Bend Waist Exerciser 
• Leg and Thigh Curl • Exercise Benches with Weights • Incline 
Bust Bench • Inner-Outer Thigh Machine 

NATURAL BEAUTY WEH AEROBICS .•.. 
The aerobics method ses sustained movement to stimulate cir­
culation, organs, and uscles to a l~vel where dramatic benefits 
occur. Dedicated followers experience new vitality, a more 
youthful app~aranee, and a trimm~r more shapely body. Best of 
all, aerobics exercise beautifies the body in a totally natural way, 
without artificial gimmicks. The result is a body shaped in har· 
mony with nature - a body you will find more beautiful, vibrant 
and alive than ever before. 

SHAPE UP 
OW FOR SUMMER 
SLIM-WAY 

• Senior citizens watch no more 
television than people in general; the 
majority watches three hours a day 
or less. 

• Nearly three-quarters report 
not participating in any organized 
groups or social organizations. 

The "casualties" of aging, 20 
percent of all senior citizens, are 
those hardest hit by the difficulties 
of old age, according to the study. 
They are undergoing the aging 
process without any of the positive 
supports required for high morale. 

EXERCISE & HEALTH CLUB, Inc. 

• Senior citizen enthusiasm is 
high, however, for individual special 
interests and hobbies. More than 

~ .. f..,_&~ 9ot l~ K! HYDE PARK ............ ... ,.,._.. 

FRESH 
LEAN 

LB. 

SLICED BACON 

~~:z·$159 
~~ ' ~r ARMOUR VERIBEST FAM PAK MIXtll 

· ~ "*··· PORK $ 2 9 

3 LIS. OR 
MORE 

CHOPS ...... LB 1 
CENTER $159 
PORK CHOPS LB. 
U S D A CHOICE BNLS 

~~~~-=~ .~~~B $219 
HYDE PARK BNLS 

CANNED $649 
HAM .... ... ~~BN 
FROZEN OCEAN 

PERCH 
FILLET ....... LB 

Meat prices in effect 7/9·12. All other prices in $179 
effect 7/8·12. -....... ~~ 

DIIITY MOORE 

606-87 4-2800 
NORTH OF ALLEN, KY., ON RT. 1428 

PHONE TODAY FOR A COMPLIMENTARY TOUR 
OWNERS: NANCY MARCUM & BETTY KEATHLEY 

ROUND 
WHITE 

""". ,, 
...~! -
f I 

CALIFORN IA FRESH 

GREEN 3 $1 
ONIONS...... BU 

LODI 

COOKING 3 99* 
APPLES .. LB BAG 

All. MILLS 

BEEF 
STEW 

4001$219 
-SHELF SPECIALS!· 

CHEER lOS 
CEREAL 

~~=1$139 
(All 

(REAMER 

COFFEE 
MATE 

HUNT'S 

TOMATO 
SAUCE .. .. ~~~z 49* 

BISQUICK 

BISCUIT 
MIX ...... 

otD VIRGINA DotE 

40 oz 
PKG 

APPLE 99 ~ PINEAPPLE 
BUTTER .. J!~z JUICE ...... ~~~z 
ASSORTED BOTTLED BLUE BARN 

35' OFF LABEL 

$149 ~~1~~ .... ~~LOl$ 32 9 
GLAD 

$119 ~~~~H .. ... ~~~T $1 S 
13' OFF LABEL 

PALMOLIVE 
LIQUID 

1101$119 KRAFT $129 DOG 2stB$ J89 
DRESSINGS ~~Loz FOOD ...... BAG 

~le Prices Effective While 
Quantities Last. We Reservt 
the Right to Umit 2201.$109 

JAR 

SHOP 
A liD 
SAYff 

$,14 :-..... 

BES M.:=,._A_Y_IS....--T~H:-::::::-E -., 
'BEST-WAY' TO 

SHOP! Fol~'l6illu1 

BTL. 

MINUTE MAID '----------' ::.~r.~-~ .. ~~~ 49 c 
ORE IDA 

DINNER FRIES 

2401.,,~ 
PK,. 

COUNTRY STYLE OR BUTTERMILK 

PILLSBURY $139 
BISCUITS . 6 PAK 

SEAL TEST LIGH T N LIVELY 

COTTAGE 79* CHEESE .. ~~~;ON 
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t HAVE WE GOT : 
! A CAR FOR YOU : 
.• AT * 

THE CARNIVAL WAS IN TOWN through the July Fourth holiday, complete with spinning 
rides, games you knew you couldn't win but played anyway, "spook" houses you knew wouldn't 
be at all scary but blew half a dollar on, and a staggering variety of junk food you knew you 
shouldn't eat but just couldn't pass up. All of it, combined with the mingled smells of sawdust 
and cotton candy, was enough to evoke childhood memories in the most "grown up" of adults. 

I Sears I 

BIG SAVINGS-4 DAYS ONLY! 
Thursday through Monday-July 

9-13 ' 

Kenmore• large­
capacity washer 

Large-capacity 
Fabric Master dryer 

SAVE S65 
Reg. 522495 SAVE $75 

Reg. S29495 
$369.95 

S289.95 . 

SAVE $60 
Power Spray 

Carpet Cleaner 
Reg. s11495 $174.95 

SAVE $80 
19-ln. Color T.V. 

~:~9.95 537900 

SAVE $130 
Microwave Oven 

Reg. $38995 
$519.95 

SAVE $110 
Powermate Vac 
Reg. '18995 $299.95 

11/-61911 

19' Ref. with 
Automatic 
Ice-maker 

W-11235 

SAVE $60 
23.1 ft. Chest 

Freezer 

Reg. s43995 
$499.95 

Each of these advertised items Is readily 
available for sale as advertised. 

• Shlppln& and Installation extra • Prices are catalog prices 
• Ask about Sears credit plans 

SGtlafoclion Guarantefli or Your Mone11 Back 

Phone Prestonsburg 
I I J'liorth Lake Drive 

886-8135 Sears 9:5:3o. Mon.-sat. 

RANI, JIODtJCK AND 00. 

Arrests Listed 
There follows a listing of those book­

ed at the county jail during the week, 
charges against them, and arresting 
officers: 1 

Tommy Dean Bray, 24, fugitive, by 
Det. D. Weedman and State Trooper H. 
J. West; Kenneth Caudill, forgery 
<warrant) , by State Trooper P. 
1'\ickels; Jack L. 1'\oland, 22, driving 
under the influence of drugs, reckless 
driving, no operator's license, by 
Prestonsburg policeman G. Hall ; 
Chester Cobb, 30, burglary, by Det. 
Tackett; Larry Couch, 25, disorderly 
conduct, by deputy jailer; Michael 
Kidd, 22, criminal mischief, by Const. 
P. Stilton; Steven Meadows, 18, failure 
to disperse, by Prestonsburg 
policemen G. Hall and D. Caudill; Guy 
Ellis, 35, drunk driving (DUI), by Allen 
policemen R. Crum, V. Conn and E. 
Rickman; James Keith Harris, 19, 
DUI, reckless driving, no operator's 
license, by Allen policemen R. Crum 
and E . Rickman; Paul Joseph, 19, 
DUI, reckless driving, attempt to elude 
police, carrying concealed weapon, by 
Prestonsburg policemen G. Hall and I). 
Caudill; David Benton, 23, and Bobby 
Hall, 22, DUI, by Prestonsburg 
policemen W. Lafferty and B. Potter ; 
Lee Griffith Jr., 35, DUI, by Allen 
policemen R. Crum and V. Conn; Glen­
da Jones, 37, DUI, by State Trooper J. 
Rederick; Oli Shepherd, 56, terroristic 
threatening, by State Trooper H. J. 
West; Tom Bentley, 19, terroristic 
threatening, assault, by Martin 
policeman H, Lester; Jerry Allen Mor­
ris , criminal possession of forged in­
strument, by order of district court: 
Guy Brown, 33, DUI, carrying conceal ­
ed weapon, by Prestonsburg policemen 
Ferrell and Clark. 

Ky. Lake Pow-Wow 
Slated July 11-12 

Ylith war hoops and war paint, the 
third annual Kentucky Lake Indian 
Pow-Wow will take place July 11 and 12 
at the Two Warriors Arena, on 
Highway US-641, 2112 miles south of 
Kentucky Dam in western Kentucky. 

More than 40 Indians from the 
Apache, Comanche and Kiowa tribes of 
western Oklahoma are expected to per­
form during the Pow-Wow. "The par­
ticipants will be in full ceremonial 
dress as they do traditional songs and 
tribal dances such as the Blackfoot, 
war, friendship, harvest and more," 
said Nita Ewing, executive secretary 
of Kentucky 's Western Waterland, 
which, with the Two Warriors Gift 
Shop, is sponsoring the event. 

Ewing added that Wi-Chi-Wa-Ja­
Teki, world champion Indian war 
dancer for the past seven years, will be 
featured during each of the four two­
hour presentations. 

Performances on both Saturday and 
Sunday begin at 2 and 8 p.m. Pre­
school children are admitted free of 
charge. 

More information may be obtained 
by writing Kentucky 's Western 
Waterland , Route 1, Grand Rivers, KY 

. 42045 or calling (502) 362·4282. 

State Beekeepers 
Will Meet At EKU 

The Kentucky State Beekeepers 
Association will have their annual 
summer conference at Eastern Ken­
tucky University, Richmond , July 
17-18. Dr. Larry Connor, Bee~eeping 
Education Service, Cheshire, Connec­
ticut will be the featured speaker and 
workshop leader. 

On Friday, Dr. Connor will conduct a 
special four-hour short course, in­
cluding such topics as activities of the 
honey bee colony, how to produce 
queens, using queens in your manage­
ment system, and possible im­
prove!11ents in your beekeeping opera­
tion. 

There will be numerous other ac­
tivities as well, such as visiting a bee 
yard, a discussion of bee diseases, 
pollination, and pesticides. 

t OL' DON JACOBS : 
• * • ~,?~~!ri~~~'~'~'~'"~~:?..,~~~~~M~~· ~~:~::;.':'" :•:f. • • • • $11,450 * 
• !.!.~~.,,! !!~.~~~.~~.!~.!~&~~.~. ;.,;.~.: . . . . . . . . . $7,842 * 
• 1980 PINTO. AM-FM cassette, air-conditioning, auto, p.s., p.b., more •• • •• $6,780 * 
• 1980 COURIER PICKUP.,.,,....,,~,.,, • .,.... . S6,880 * 
__.., ONLY 2 REMAINING: NEW 1981 COURTESY CARS! ~ 
~ WITH 14 TO 4, 700 MILES. TWO-DOORS WITH _.,--
__.., 6-CYL., P.S., P.B., A/C, AUTO., AM-FM TAPE OR$8 262 ~ 
~ CASSETTE PLAYERS, MOLDINGS • • • • • • • • ' _.,--

• * 
• 1980 FORD THUNDERBIRD. Fully equipped ...•.• Only $8,480 * 
• 1979 THUNDERBIRD-tow mileage, full power, extra sharp • • • • • $5,880 * 
~ 1979 COUGAR XR 7 Power s~eering, power. brakes, air-conditioning, $6 200 ~ 
~ - • automatic, stereo, cru1se-control, rally wheels • ' ...,--

~ 1979 MERCURY COUGAR. •• .. ~ ..... "'""'· s,ooo m"" •• $6,980 * 
~ 1979 MUSTANG HAT~HBACK. :;::~:,o;~~F:e:;!~!~p.ow:r. $5,980 
~ 1979 PINTO ES' S Air-conditioning, power steering, $5 980 ~ • power brakes, good gas mileage • • • . . • . . • , 
~ 1978 DODGE MAGNUM Cruise-control, tilt wheel, power steering, $4 700 * 
~ • power brakes, stereo S-track, extra cl.ean car ' 

• 1978 FORD LTD WAGON. Low mileage, loaded .••..•.. $3,980 * -
• 1977 f~RD MUSTANGoneowner,PS,PB.VerySharpCar ....... $4,480 * 
• 1977 MONTE CARLO .................. $3,880 * 
• !!?~ .. ~~~.~ .. ~.~~!~~-2 !H.I~ ....•........ $4,280 * 

1976 MALIBU CLASSIC 4-DOOR. Full power •••. Only $3,480 
• 1976 HO.NDA CIVIC HATCHBACK. Gas saver, 4-speed •• $2,580 * 
• 1975 MERCURY GRAND MARQUIS, 4-Dn•, IH"d • • $2,780 * 
ic !.!!.!.~ .. ~.~~!~~~ ... ~-~~~.~~~~~~. ' .............. $3,680 * 
• 1973 MERCURY MONTEGO MX. ~,~·:.~-:.';~·:· .... $2,300 * 
• 1980 TOYOTA %-TON PICKUP. With tool bed. Clean Truck. * 
• 1980 JEEP CJ7 HARDTOP. ::::r~:!e:iil:!~::w:r~ra~es~ . $7,980 * 
~ 1978 FORD F -150 • .,,..,;.,, •• ., .... ~. 1ow ...... • • • • • • $4,980 * 
--r' 1978 FORD ECONOLINE VAN 6-cylinder, automatic, power $4 980 • steering, power brakes, custo~ized J 

• 191 8· FORD F-1 00 • Toppo•, "tomotl<, ''"" •Jmlog, P'"" b"'" . . . $4, 7 80 * 
• 1977 CUSTOM ECONOLINE VAN •.•..•..•. $4,580 * Passenger van, automatic, power steering, power brakes, a/c 

• 1977 FORD f100. One Owner .•..• • . • . . . • . $3,680 * 
~ 1977 CHEVROLET C10.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . $2,880 * 
~ POWER COMPANY TRADE-INS: 

• 9 VEHICLES-TRUCKS, 4x4's, BRONCOS * 
• 0~ DON JACOBS * 
• FORD-LINCOLN-MERCURY-HONDA : 
• Lancer-Water Gap Road-Prestonsburg, Ky. • 874-2133 • 

•************* 
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INVITATION FOR BIDS Gas Company Honors Two For Service ''KNOW YOUR BIBLE'' Bids will be accepted until July 15, 
1981 by the City of Wheelwright for a 
1978 4-door Malibu Chevrolet The City 
of Wheelwright reserves the right tore­
iect any or all bids. Anyone wishing to 
view the vehicle for inspection may 
contact the City Clerk from 8 a .m. until 
12 noon, Mon.-Fri. 

TOMMY ENGLE 
Chairman of the Board 

6-23-3t. 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC SALE 

IS THERE ANYTHING IN A NAME? 

Continued from last week . 
Last week we learned, when one studies the Bible and obeys the 

Gospel, he becomes a christian . 
There is a three-fold purpose in the names God has given us to 

wear: (1) In them Christ and God are honored. " But if a m an suffer 
as a Christian, let him not be ashamed; but let him glorify God in 
this name. " (I P eter 4:15) Human names honor men and organiza. 
tions, while the name Christian ·honors the Lord. (2) In Bible names 
there is unity. A trail of division and discord has come with the use of denominational 
names. But no follower of Christ objects to the name Christian , so why not wear it alone? 
~t would not be possible to unite all men under the name of any man, whether it is found 
m or out of the Bible, but under the name of Christ we can all be one! (3 ) The name 
Christian is an honorable name. (James 2:7). this is why Paul pursuaded men to be 
~~ristians . (Acts 26:28). The church is the bride of Christ. (Eph. 5: 26-27). The bride re­
JOices to honor the name of her husband by wearing his name alone ! 

A PUBLIC SALE will be held by The 
Bank Josephine on the 17th day of July, 
1981 at Lawson's Mobile Homes on the 
Lancer-Watergap Road. Time of sale 
10:00 a .m. Sale is for the purpose of 
disposing of a 1967 Active-Homecraft 
Mobile Home, Serial No. 3987 12x50 to 
satisfy a Retail Installment Contract 
dated the 4th day of September, 1980 

The Bank Josephine reserves the 
right to bid. 
Terms of Sale: CASH 7-I-3t. 

G. W. Spencer , Jr. <Ieftl, of Martin, and Carlos J. Dawson, of Hi Hat, were 
honored this month for their 25 years' service with Columbia Gas Trans­
mission Corp. Spencer is an operations supervisor at the company's Beaver 
Creek compressor station ; Dawson is a well tender in the Martin and 
Prestonsburg areas. 

For comments, write: Bennie Blankenship, Evan,g. , Prestonsburg Church of Christ, 
P .0. Box 547, Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION TO MINE 

Within 100 Feet 
of a Stream 

Pursuant to 405 KAR 1:050 The Depart­
ment for Natural Resources and En­
vironmental Protection may conduct a 
public hearing to review the applica­
tion of L & H Mining, (application 
number 036-5086) who proposed to con­
struct a stockpile within 100 feet of a 
stream, Little Mud Creek at near Blue 

• Moon in Floyd County location . Any in­
terested person may request that the 
hearing be held by written request to 
that effect, sent to Ralph Waddle, Divi­
sion of Permits , Department for 
Natural Resources and Environmental 
Protection, Sixth Floor, Capital Plaza 
Tower, Frankfort, Kentucky 40601 and 
received by him within 20 days of the 
date of this notice. It. 

• NOTICE OF 
INTENTION TO MINE 

1. In accordance with the provisions 
of KRS 350.055, notice is hereby given 
that : Newsome Coal Company, Box 3, 
Grethel, Kentucky 41631 intends to file 
an application for the surface distur­
bance mining of approximately 5.0 
acres located south of Grethel in Floyd 
County. The proposed operation is ap­
proximately 41 2 miles southeast of 
State Route 979's junction with 
Branham Creek Road and located west 
of Branham, latitude 37• 28' 25", 
longitude 82° 38' 25''. The surface of the 
area to be mined is owned by : Fostor 
Mitchell . A brief description of the kind 
of mining activity proposed is : Surface 
Disturbance of Underground Mining 
(Amendment to Permit No. 036-5034) 
The application will be filed at the 
Bureau of Surface Mining Reclamation 
and Enforcement, Prestonsburg Area 
Office, North Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. 

Persons wishing to file written objec­
tions and/or request a formal ad­
ministrative hearing in regard to the 
above described surface mine should 
notify the Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental Protec­
tion within 30 days of the date of this 
notice. A copy of the newspaper clip­
ping must be attached to the written 
objection. The objection or request for 
a hearing will reference application 
number 036-5034 (Amend) . Such objec­
tion or request must be in accordance 
with KRS 224.081 (2), and must be for­
warded to the Director of Permits, 
Bureau of Surface Mining Reclamation 
and Enforcement, Capital Plaza 
Tower, Frankfort, Kentucky 40601. 

2. Notice is hereby provided pur­
suant to 30 CFR 715.13 (d) (10) and 
KRS: 350 that the proposed postmining 

•
land use does not constitute a change 
from the pre-mining land use. Public 
comment regarding a proposed change 
in land use may be submitted to the ad­
dress listed above. lt . 

Scott-Taylor Re-Union 
The fifth anniversary of the Scott­

Taylor reunion was observed at The 
Pine's Recreation Center, Jenny Wiley 
State Park, under the supervision and 
planning of Mrs. Billie Jean Blackburn 
Osborne, Saturday, June 27. Approx­
imately 100 descendants of the unions 
of Angeline Lowe and Garfield Scott, 
Angeline Lowe Scott Taylor and 
Wallace Taylor, Wallace Taylor and 
Mary Burchett honored th ier 
ancestors, with Charles E. Spears, 
Master of ceremonies and comments 
from the Scott side of the family given 
by Fon Scott. 

A questionaire, prepared by Cheryl 
Blackburn Meade, revealed the names 
of the children of the three unions as 
follows: 

Children of Angeline and Garfield 
Scott were Mrs. R. L. (Dixie) Taylor, 
Mrs. Arthur <Byrd) Hale, Thomas E. 
Scott, Orrison Scott, Sr., Ben Scott and 
Walker Scott, all deceased. 

Children of Angeline Scott Taylor 
and Wallace Taylor: England Clinton, 
Mont, Burley and E lmon Taylor (all 
deceased), Mrs. Woody <Eliza) 
Blackburn, Mrs. Andr ew (Elizabeth) 
Spears, Mrs. Bertha Cornette and John 
Taylor. 

The one child of the union of Wallace 
Taylor and Mary Burchett Taylor is 
Mrs. Tom (May Taylor) Thompson. 

Five members of the Taylors are liv­
ing and four were present at the reu­
nion: EliZa and Elizabeth (twins) ; 
Bertha and May <John was not able to 
attend) . The widows of Clinton <Jettie) 
and Burley Taylor (Louisa) were pre­
sent. 

Thanks to God for everything that 
was offered by Clarence by Clarence 
Scott. A picnic dinner was enjoyed by 
all present. 

A moment of silent prayer was 
observed for Keither Blackburn <son of 
Octavia), who had two days previously 
undergone heart surgery and he and 
his family were absent for the first 
time of the five years tha t the Reunion 
had been held. 
5 Prayer and thanksgiving were of­
fered for family blessings and enjoy­
ment and visiting. Visiting, catching 
up on family, and eating comprised the 
remainder of the day. 

A collection was taken to lake care of 
the fee for the use of the Pine's Recrea­
tion Center <formerly the Girl Scout 
Camp Chatterawa). and the majority 
voted to ask for the reservation of the 
Recreation Center for the fourth Satur­
day in June, 1982, further plans to be 
announced by Mrs. Billie J ean 
Osborne. 

Newman Family Reunion 
Set At Hi Hat, J uly 18 

The Newman family reunion will be 
held at the Little Nancy Regular Bap­
tist Church at Hi Hat, Saturday, July 
18. All members of the Newman fami ly 
and friends are invited to attend. 

~GRAVELY 

gtJk 

• 

SUMMER 
SPECTACULAR 

BUY ANY RIDING 
TRACTOR AND GET 

• 10-19 HP Models SALE ENDS 
• All Gear Drive JULY 31 
• 8 Speed Transmission '--.::...=...::..::__::....=...__J 

• Instant Forward-Reverse 

~GRAVELY. 
"We Still Make Things That Last' 

If ,·ou want to g Pt a real run for 
yottr t ilon(· ~-. buy a Gra\'ely. 

E\ t•n· tractor and mower 
ts bLtil t to last a long, 
long tllllt'. \Vith features 
like sturdy steel 

construction, all-gear 
t l'illlSilliSSIOn S, ancJ 
clt' JH'ndabil• Bnggs & 
Stratton or Kohler 

t•ngines. No wonder 
~ome Gravely tractors are 

still going strong even after 25 
years of hard labor. 

Corne test drive one soon. 

PRICE'S TRACTOR SALES 
' ~;, Y "KENTUCKY'S LARGEST GRAVELY TRACTOR DEALER" 

PHONE (606) 886-6285 SO. LAKE DRIVE PRESTONSBURG 
I 21 

• PRICES IN EFFECT JULY 9 THRU JULY 12 
• WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES. 

SWIFT'S $ 
SIZZLE AN 

BACON 
SELECTO 
8-LB. PAIL 

LARD 

HY-TOP 

$ 

BREAD . t.~~~;~ -
VAN CAMP'S 3/$1 ::::s'. .. ... . 
HUNT'S 

I8t~:~~- ...... -~~~-z: ~~~-. 89c 
GRAVY TRAIN 40-Lb. $999 
DOG FOOD .... .. . ~~--
ZIPLOC 40-CT. 

:l~~~~~- .. ...... ... .... $277 
ZIPLOC 

~~~~~~~ ...... ..... . ~!;~ . $1 3 5 

ARGO 303 CANS 3/$119 
PEAS .............. . 
25-SQ. FT. 

:,~~NP~~-~~~ ........ 2/99c 
BUSH'S GOLDEN OR WHITE 3/$1 
HOMINY .. .. ......... . 
KRAFT 9-0Z. 39 C 
MUSTARD ............ . 
HY-TOP 32-0Z. 99C 
CATSUP .... .-..... .... .. 

U.S. CHOICE 

CUBE 
STEAK 
$2~b~ 

LAY'S 

PICNICS 
89~. 

32-0z. Btl. 

IVORY LIQUID 
$159 

Wisk Gallon $58 9 
DETERGENT ....... . 
Gold Dollar . $14 9 
VINEGAR ....... ~~~~~~ 
Hy-Top 

~g~t~~· - ·········4/99c 

.----LAY'S---.. 
12-0Z. PKG. 

3-PIG $109 
WIENERS .. ... ... 
12-0Z. PKG. $1l9 
BACON ........ . 
12-0Z. PKG. $1 0 9 
BOLOGNA ... 

r----- ll!•iil:Z•]~i----- • 
I I 
I I 
1 VELVEETA 2-Lb. $289 I 
: CHEESE .. .. . ~~~ . .. : 
1 Limit 1 w/coupon & $10 order. I 
1 V.tlid at Superior Market I 
1 Thurs., July 9 thru Sun., July 12. I 

L--------~--------~ 

LETTUCE 

NESTEA 3.6 Oz. Bonus Pak 

~~~~~~~--- · ······ · ·· ··$239 
Robin Hood 
Plain or Self-Rising $469 
FLOUR .. .... ....... . . 
Trailblazer 
Chunk Style $429 
DOG FOOD ... ~~~~~- . ~ag 
Hy-Top 
3-Lb. Can 

SHORTENING sou Ply 69C 
PAPER TOWELS . . . Hy-Top Gallon 69C 
Just-Rite 10~-oz. BLEACH ......... _J~~-. 
HOT DOG 2/7 9 C Meadow Gold Half $16 9 
CHILl . . . . . . . . . . . . . . SHERBERT .. .. . ~~~:. 
HY-TOP WHOLE KERNEL 

OR CREAM STYLE 2/8 9 C 
GOLDEN CORN ..... ... . 

Fox 11-0z. 
Deluxe 89C 
PIZZA .............. .. 

Hy-Top 7-0z. 

MACARONI & 3/99C 
CHEESE DINNERS ..... 

Hy· Top 8-0z. 
Reg. or Buttermilk 6/$119 
BISCUITS ... .. . 

m. Mon.-Sat.; 10 a.m.-7 p.m. Sun. 
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WHY BE RIPPED-OFF PAYING 
RIDICULOUS RETAIL: PRICES? 

COME TO MIGHTY MUFFLER FOR CONSUMER PRICES FOR 
EVERYONE. CHECK ANYBODY'S PRICES-THEN CHECK OURS AND 

JW Theatre Director Shea Finds 
Work Hectic, But a Challenge 

RALPH'S 
TIRE SERVICE 

SAVE. 

Ui~Sl ALLA'TIOH fREE 
• 

LifETIME GUARAH'TEE 

EXHAUST SYSTEMS 
FOR MOST lMPORTS 

CALL: 

M~GHTY MUFFLER DON HOUSTON 
OR 

GARY WILLIAMS 
7·1-lf 

NORTH LAK£ DRIVE 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

--------------------------------------------------· 

YES .. 
YOU 
CAN. 

Central air 
condition your 
home without 

wasting energy.LENNO~ 
ELLIOTT 

CONTRACTING 
COMPANY 
Phone 886-2781 

South Lake Drive Prestonsburg 

---------- --------

·~ VtNYL-IS FINYL WiTH J S VINYL 

VINYL SIDING 
This space age material 

Gpodbye to 
House Painting * INSULATES -* ENDS PAINTING Save On 
Fuel Costs * SAVES MONEY 

40 Year 
Transferrable 

Fa~;tory Warranty , .. MAL ~-n D 1t 

T·w· .... u ... u 
.. 1 .. 14\lAIIOII 

Guaranteed Not To- Dent, Chip, 
Crack, Peer, Rust, Mildew, 
Blister or Fade. 
Like Aluminum, Wood Or Asbestos S(ding', Thicker Than 
Metal Sldlng...-40 Times Thicker Than Paint. THERE IS NO 
BETTER INSULATION MONi:'( CAN BUY I 

REPLACEMENT 
WINDOWS 

• VINYL 
il=-'i~~RTHERMAL 

FRAMES 

FREE 
STORM DOOR 

With Purchase Of S Or More Replace· 
ment Windows Or Vinyl Siding 

Offer Good 5 Days ONlY 

let us explain our 

INSULATORS 
at NO obligation 

Coli or Write Today 

JS VINYL CO. INC. 
"VInyl Sp.clolf•t• •In~• l"r' 

2130 Wincheattr1 Ashland, KY. 

606-325·4438 

As the curtain went up for the 1981 
Summer Season at the Jenny Wiley 
Summer Music Theatre ·wednesday 
evening, Artistic Director Maureen 
Shea finally got time to breathe. 

She no longer has to contend with the 
problems of casting the theatre's 22 ac­
tors in the show's 60 roles, or with the 
difficulties of trying to deal with the 
show's complicated staging. She is free 
from the problems of trying to work out 
the strict rehearsal schedules that are 
necessary to do such a show. 

But, Maureen has begun it all over 
again with rehearsa.Is for the Jenny 
Wiley production of OKLAHOMA! 

Although some might think that this 
type of work schedule is a gruesome 
form of punishment, Maureen does not 
see it that way at all. Instead, it 
represents a challenge for her to over­
come. 

For example, when she was asked 
how she wa;; able to handle the pro­
blem of having one-third of the number 
of actors needed to fill all the roles in 
GEORGE M!, she said that the solu­
tion was simple: "quadruple casting." 
That is, she assigns some lucky actor 
with the rather tough assignment of 
playing up to four roles throughout one 
perfqrmance. 

"That's a little crazy," Maureen 
said. " It 's a matter of trying to 
remember who has a costume change, 
when they have the change, and when 
they appear as a major character so 
that they can come on later and not be 
recognized as the previous character." 

Thus far , she said, her staging of the 
show using this "quadruple role" 
system has gone fairly well, with only 
"one or two actors" finding that they 
have been staged into two places at one 
time. 

The other major challenge she has 
faced with GEORGE M! is that it was 
really written to be perfomed on a 
regular indoor stage, with conven­
tional backdrops, movable scenery and 
a curtain. Because the Jenny Wiley 
Summer Music Theatre is an outdoor 
theatre, those conveniences are not 
available. 

"What we have had to do is actually 
rewrite some of the scenes so that we 
don 't need the drops and curtain," she 
said. "We have had to try to move 
some things around to make the show 
work better outdoors." 

Maureen's background makes her 
well suited to take on the challenges 
that are offered by this summer's pro­
ductions. A native of Boston, she is cur­
rently a professor in the Theatre 
department at the Virginia Poly­
technic Institute at Blacksburg, 
Virginia. She obtained her doctorate in 
Theatre from Ohio State University. 

Throughout her career, whe has 
directed production of DRACULA, 
PICNIC, A VIEW FROM TH E 
BRIDGE, and many more'. 

Her most impressive credits, 
however, come from the Eugene 
O'Neill Theatre Center in Waterford, 
Conn. , where, each year, the National 
Playwright's Conference is held . 
Maureen 's work in directing there has 
received glowing comments from 
critics from The Detroit Free Press, 
The Philadelphia Bulletin and The New 
York Post. 

An example of Maureen 's work at its 
best came at last year's conference 
with her staging of Sybille Pearson's 
new play A LITTLE GOING AWAY 
PARTY. Pearson, the author of SAL­
LY . AND MARSHA, a new show 
scheduled to open on Broadway some-­
time this fall, was quite impressed with 
Shea's work. 

She was so impressed that when the 
chance came to negotiate for the pro­
duction of A LITTLE GOING AWAY 
PARTY in New York, either on Broad­
way or Off Broadway, Pearson would 
only enter into negotiations on the con­
dition that Maureen Shea be permitted 
to direct the production. 

Maureen's co-workers are equally 
lavish with their praise for her work, 
Tony Distler, who is directing the Jen­
ny Wiley production of GODSPELL 
and THE ROAR OF THE GREASE­
PAINT-THE SMELL OF THE 
CROWD , calls her · "extremely 
talented." 

--- ----·-

Maple Wood Village 

6·17·41 

QUALITY HOMES BY 

CENTENNIAL DEVELOPMENT CO. 
Looking for a new home ... check out these stan­
dard features: • prewired telephone • prewired 
cable television • asphalt street and driveway 
• professional landscaping • large patios • out­
side security lighting • ·freezeproof outside 
faucets • outside weather proof electrical outlets 
• wall to wall carpeting • full under cabinet vinyl 
floor covering • convenient/compact laundry 
areas • certified electrical inspection • storm 
windows and insulated glass • insulated floors 
with moisture barrier • garbage disposals, dish~ 
washers, doublebowl sinks-

OUT OF FLOOD PLAIN 

FLOYD COUNTY BOND FINANCING AVAILABLE 
For more information call: 437-9676-0ffice 

Jack-432-1517 Monie--349-5840 

BUILDING HOMES FOR PEOPLE 

"She is really getting to be well 
known as a director", he said. 
"Playwrights have now begun to seek 
her out for their show." 

Maureen is equally. complimentary. 
She has nothing but the highest praise 
for this season's cast at Jenny Wiley. 
She said she is amazed at their ability 
to hold up uilder the sometimes 
awesome rehearsal schedule that is re­
quired this summer. 

Schedules in summer theatre are no 
bed of roses. After staging GEORGE 
M! and OKLAHOMA! for Jenny Wiley, 
she will travel to Waterford for this 
year's National Playwright's Con­
ference. After the conference, she will 
return to Prestonsburg for the re­
mainder of the season with the Jenny 
Wiley Summer Music Theatre. 

Despite the long hours and tight re­
hearsal schedules, she enjoys the 
shows as much as the audiences who 
come to see them. For example, she 
described GEORGE M! as "big music, 
fun music and fun choreography." The 
end result, according to Maureen 
should be quite simply, "a great 
show." 

Tickets are available by writing the 
Box Office, Jenny Wiley Summer 
Music Theatre, Box 22, Prestonsburg, 
Ky., 41653 or calling (606) 886-9274. 

Music Theatre Group 
To Give Blood, July 14; 
Bank Week Is Scheduled 

The Jenny Wiley Summer Music 
Theatre production crew will be 
donating blood at the Municipal 
building here, Tuesday, July 14. The 
public is invited to come and watch 
them entertain. They are performing 
free . 

July 13 through July 18 will be First 
Commonwealth Bank Week. This 
group has been a regular and faithful 
supporter of the local donor station. 

You can give a pint of blood on 
Thursdays and Saturdays at the 
Municipal building. 

The Blood Center points out : 
Summer often finds blood in short 

supply due to fewer donation:;: and 
more accidents requiring blood. With 
vacations, picnics and camping trips, 
many regular ,donors get caught up in 
these activities and forget to donate. 

The need for blood is ever-present. 
Warm weather holidays are especially 
rough. The blood supply reaches 
critically low levels , with industries 
and schools closed and vacations keep­
ing regular donors from giving. 

U.S. 23 No., Prestonsburg • 886-8806 

• Computer Wheel Balancing 

• New Radial Tires (Steel & 
Glass) with FULL Road & 
Hazard Warranty 

• Heavy Duty Shocks-$17 .95 Installed 

• DISC BRAKE JOB $29.95 
(MOST CARS) 

7-l-2l. 

• ARE YOU PAYING TOO MUCH FOR 
YOUR INSURANCE COVERAGE? 

• ARE YOU SATISFIED WITH YOUR 
PRESENT AGENT'S SERVICE? 

• .COMPARE WITH US ON ALL YOUR 
INSURANCE COVERAGES. 

HALL&: LARK 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
INC. 

11 S. Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 

Phone 606/886-2318 

REPRESENTING: ALLSTATE, CONTINENTAL IN­
SURANCE CO., C.N.A., ST. PAUL, GENERAL ACCIDENT, 
U.S.F.&G., AND OTHER FINE COMPANIES. 

They're here to stay. 
NOW accounts. And 
we've got'en1. 

Open yours with us. 
When you do, you'll en­
joy the quality service 
we pride ourselves in. 

NOW accounts earn . 
51/4% interest, even as 
you write checks 
against it. A $5.00 fee is 
required if your 
balance drQps below 
$1,500.00 during a state­
ment cycle. 

For more details, call 
886-2321, ext. 258. 

First Commonwealth Bank 

' • " ' ' '" •• •' I' 

f_DI, 

PRESTONSBURG, KY. 
BURL WELLS SPURLOCK 

PRESIDENT 

MAIN OFFICE 
3 NO. LAKE DR., PRESTONSBURG 

NORTH LAKE DRIVE BRANCH 
·PRESTONSBURG 

G:r 
EOOAL HOOSIIIl 
LENDER 

BETSYLAYNEBRANCH TWINBRIDGEBRANCH 
BETSY LAYNE 

PHONE 
886-2321 

TIME & TEMPERATURE 
886-9311 

MARTIN 
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2 pr.l$1 
Rubber Gloves 
S,M,L 

14%" Weber · Orlll 
Porcelain finish 
w ith foldtng legs 

8.88 
24x68" Chaise Pad 
Tufted . cush­
ioned cover 

llack and White Portable 
Solid-state circuitry with 
1nstant-on picture and sound. 

The Floyd County Times 

DAILY 9-9 SUNDAY 11-6 

E SAVING PLACE 

$1 0 YourChoice 
· OurReg. 

12.97-14 97 
•Watches For Men And Women 
Accurate hand-w1nd watches 
Men's with calendar Save now 

4.23 ~ci'n 
No·Stlek Cookware 

Griddle 
or 

Saucepan 

StlverStane-ltned mint fry pan sauce pan or 
griddle 

5 • 9 7our Reg . 8.97 
50'x5/a" Garden Hose 
Lightweight , nylon rein­
forced With metal f tttings. 

Limit 2 Pkgs. 

Knlfe/Fork1Spoon Set 1 
Wh1te. plastiC flatware. 
set of 8 each, total 24 

# 

44c 
24-pc. Pk 
Our Reg. ~ac 

Save 
5.09 

Our Reg. 21.97 

16.88 
W8200PK Dual Heat 

Soldering Gun Kit · 
All -purpose 100/ 
140W kit by Weller·. 
complete with acces­
sories tn p lasttc case 

WELLER 

45 Pleee China 
Dinnerware Set 

8 place sett1ngs plus 
servtng pieces in elegant 
ftnechtna 

59.97 

}~) 

1.87 
30 Maxi® leltless 

pads 
30 Mini® Pads, 

2.3a~~~~ 
9 Trac II " Cartridges 
Mtcrosmooth · v tw1n 
blades f rom G tllette • 

With Two 40W Bulb!> 

11.96 
All-purpose 4' Fluorescent Utility Light 
Inc ludes cha ins hooks for hangtng 

Section One, Page Thirteen 

K mart~ ADVERTISED 
MERCHANDISE POLICY 

Our finn lntonllon t. to h"" ... '1' 
advortlood Item In stock on our tholfta. 
If on lldvortlaad Item to not ovoltoblo tor 
purcheM due to any unrot......., 
rouon, K marl will laaue a Roln Check 
on r~uet1 for the m.rchar\<UM to be 
purchoood at tho oolo pr1c:o ,.,_ .. , 
ovoltoblo or will aall you o comporoblo 
quollly 11om ot a comporobto reduction 
In pr1co. Our policy to to give our 
eu•tom•,. .... ttefac:Uon etweyt." 

1 57 Each 
• Quart 

Henri's"' Salad Dressing 
1-qt C reamy Garlic. 1000 
Island, French. Cucumber and 
Onion. 

9~£z' Bag ·~ur1 .27 
Licorice candy Bites 
Chewy favortte' Bag of 
block or red 'bites'' 

7.77 

Urethane Insulation 

our Choice - Our 14 48 

8.99Ea 
Insulated Coolers 
12-qt double 6 packer 
o r 11-qt SunPocker ·· 
Piosttc Save now 

c:::..-..... Big Sandy Village U.S. 23 North Pikeville 
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RETUR!'I; HOME 
Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Moore, have 

returned from Evansville, Ind., where 
they visited their daughter, Mrs . Fred 
Seiver, and Mr. Seiver. The Seivers ac­
companied them home and spent 
several days here. 

Old Normal School Group 

\'ISITS PARENTS 
Miss Gretchen Heinze, of Radford, 

Va., is spending a few days here with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. John G. 
Heinze. 

ATTEND CONVENTION 
Attending the Kiwanis convention in 

New Orleans from Prestonsburg last 
week were Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Grant, Mr. and Mrs. H. C. <Huck) 
Francis and Ed Kegley. Mr. Grant is 
past president, and Mr. Kegley is the 
new president of the Prestonsburg 
Kiwanis Club. Mr. Francis is the 
former governor of the Kentucky­
Tennessee district. 

CONCLUDES VISIT 
Mrs. Thomas LeMaster has returned 

home following a visit with her 
daughter, Mrs. Ed Wingham, Mr. 
Wingham and children, Amy Elizabeth 
and Matthew Thomas, in Tipp City, 
Ohio. 

ltts and hers 
"(Photo, courtesy of Anna Williams) HIGHLANDS PLAZA 

IS HAVING 
A SALE! 

Photograph made in 1929 in front of old Prestonsburg High School building (now the administration building for the 

Floyd County Board of Education) shows students at a six-week Normal School in preparation for teaching. Only a few 
are identified. Among these are John Stephens, then superintendent of schools (front, left). In second row, left, is Min­
nie Blevins, (teacher), and at right Sylvia Wallen. At left rea1·, in front of window , Anna Martin , Virgie Collins and Nora 
Stephens; men at rear, Claybourne Stephens and Virgil Warrix. 

1 RACK OF MEN'S 

SPORT COATS 
1/2 PRICE 

MEN'S SUMMER SPORTSWEAR & TEN­
NIS WEAR. SUCH NAME BRANDS AS 
CAMPUSANDCATAUNA 

1/3 OFF 

MEN'S SHOES 
SUCH NAME BRANDS 
AS BASS AND RAND 

20% OFF 

LADIES' 

SUMMER DRESSES 

1/3 OFF 

LADIES' 
SUMMER SPORTSWEAR 

1/3 OFF 

ONE RACK 
BOBBIE BROOKS 

1/2 OFF 

LADIES' SUMMER 
SANDALS, SUCH NAME 

BRANDS AS BASS, 
CONNIE AND CANDI 

1/3 OFF 

OPEN 10 TO 8, DAILY; 
BUT NEYER ON SUNDAY 

Bluegrass Fest 
To Start Friday 

Archer Park here is the setting for 
the fifth annual Goins Brothers 
Bluegrass Festival which is set to 
begin Friday and run through Satur­
day, midnight. 

Appearing Friday at the fest will be 
The Country Gentlemen, Inter­
nationally-known Bluegrass group 
noted for their unique blend of tradi­
tional and modern styles. 

Fans of traditional Bluegrass will 
have the opportunity during the 
festival to hear Larry Sparks and the 
Lonesome Ramblers and Jimmy Mar­
tin and the Sunny Mountain Boys as 
well as the popular Goins Brothers 
group. Also on hand will be The Out­
door Plumbing Company, The Goins 
Brothers Second Edition, South 
Salyers and the Brown Mountain Boys, 
The Copley Brothers and R. W. Skeens, 
Claude Moore and the Rippling Strings 
and others. · 

The festival offers plenty of parking, 
camping, clean restrooms and conces­
sions, with adequate security nearby at 
all· times . In the event of rain, shelter is 
available so that the schedule of groups 
can play, regardless of the weather. 

For additional information contact 
Melvin Goins, Rt. 1, Box 325, Prestons­
burg, Ky. , Phone 886-6438. 

Collins Attended Meeting 
Of Regional Education Board 

Lt. Gov. Martha Layne Collins at­
tended the annual meeting of the 
Southern Regional Education Board at 
Boca Raton, Fla. , Sunday through 
Wednesday. 

ad1ethae 
406 NO. LAKE DR., PRESTONSBURG 

VACATION 
SALE 

IT'S TIME TO TRAVEL AGAIN. AND WHAT BETTER 
ROADWAY COMPANION THAN A NEW CITIZENS' BAND 
RADIO FROM RADIO SHACK? WE'RE LOCATED IN THE 
MONTGOMERY WARD BVILDING. COME IN AND SEE 
THESE TRAVELING VALUES: 

.. COBRA 25 GTL, 40-CHANNEL AM 

MOBILE ........ $14995 

•coBRA 29 GTL, 40-CHANNEL AM MOBILE. 
COBRA'S BEST. THIS UNIT ONLY $199.95 
PLUS YOU GET A $24.95 MAGNETIC ANTEN~A 
FREE. 

.. REALISTIC 40-CHANNEL. CAN BE USED AS A 
BASE OR MOBILE. SAVE $50! REG. $179.95 
NOW $129.95! 

.. MOTOROLA 40-CHANNEL, REG. $129.9.5, YOU 
CAN HAVE IT FOR $99! 

WE HAVE EXPERT INSTALLATION AVAILABLE. 
CALL US AT 886-6900. WE'RE THE TRADING 
PEOPLE. 

HERE FOR VISIT 
Mr. and Mrs . Bill Hill, of Chat­

tanooga, Tenn., were here last week 
for a visit with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harry Hill . 

RETURNS TO LEXINGTON 
Mrs. Rebecca Rasnick, who had 

spent the past several weeks with her 
daughter, Mrs. Don Harris, Mr. Har­
ris, and children in Lexington, return­
ed there Sunday after a visit with her 
sister, Mrs. Bill Pettrey, and Mrs. Pet­
trey, here. Mrs. Rasnick's daughter, 
Mrs. Harris, and daughter, Miss San­
dra Harris, visited with her and the 
Pettreys here for a few days last week. 

VISITS IN NASHVILLE 
Mrs. Maman Leslie spent several 

days recently in Nashville, where she 
went to be with her daughter, Mrs. 
Byron Shelton, Mr. Shelton, their new 
baby daughter, Hailey Suzanne, and 
another daughter, Marla. 

IN LEXINGTON RECENTLY 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Worland were in 

Lexington recently for a visit with their 
daughter, Mrs. Rose Caudill, and their 
grandson, Morris Caudill. 

GUEST IN NASHVILLE 
Following the Kiwanis convention in 

New Orleans last week, Mrs. Leonard 
Grant flew to Nashville, Tenn., where 
she is the guest of her daughter and 
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Henry, 
and baby daughter, Jennifer, and Mr. 
Grant flew to Dallas to attend a gift 
show. 

ENTERTAIN TO LUNCHEON 
Mr. and Mrs. Gale Music and son 

Jim had as their luncheon guests, July 
4, Mr. Music's sister, Mrs. Russell 
Laven, and Mr. Laven, of Allen. 

HONOR DR. WOOD 
The Rev. Ted Nicholas, pastor of the 

First United Methodist Church here, 
Mrs. Nicholas, and members of the 
church hosted a reception last Thurs­
day evening, honoring Dr. Robert 
Wood, superintendent of the Ashland 
District Methodist churches, Mrs. 
Wood and their family. Many represen­
tatives from throughout the Big Sandy 
area were in attendance. Prior to the 
reception, services were held in the 
church sanctuary. Participating in the 
program were the Rev. Nicholas and 
Chalmer Frazier, of the local church, 
and the Rev. James Stratton, pastor of 
the First Methodist Church of 
Pikeville. 

VISIT AT HOSPITAL 
Mrs. Joyce Allen, Mrs. Rebecca 

Rasnick, Mrs. Katy Derossett and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Pettrey were in Pikeville 
Friday to visit Mrs. Clara Warrix, who 
is a patient at the Methodist Hospital 
here . Mrs. Warrix's sister, Miss 
Burieta Gearhart, has been there with 
her. 

VISIT NIECE 
Mrs. Eva Hyden and her brother, 

Doug Fitzpatrick, visited their niece, 
Mrs. Billie Napier, in Hazard last 
week. Other relatives visiting Mrs. 
Napier were Mr. and Mrs. Marcus Gib­
son and daughter, Becky, of Louisville, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Howard Gibson and 
children, of Marion, Ohio. 

ENTERTAIN FAMILY GROUP 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Haywood enter­

tained members of their family with a 
4th of July picnic at their home. Pre­
sent for the occasion were Mr. and 
Mrs . Phillip Haywood and daughters 
Melissa and Jacquelyn, and Mrs. 
Harry B. Ranier, all of Prestonsburg, 
Miss Toni K. Ranier, of Lexington, 
Miss Rebecca Haywood, of Falmouth, 
and the host and hostess. 

VISI'Jl AT PIKEVILLE 
Mrs. Eva Hyden and daughter, Mrs. 

Willis Sparks, and her brother, 
Douglas Fitzpatrick, spent Saturday in 
Pikeville, where they visited relatives, 
Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Sloan. 

To Wed August 1 

Mr. and Mrs. Everett Akers, Jr ., of 
Allen , Ky., and Mr. Bill R. Collins, of 
Prestonsburg, are announcing the 
forthcoming marriage of their 
daughter, Miss Lisa Ann Collins, to Mr. 
Ronald Lee Robinette. 

Miss Collins is a 1979 graduate of 
Prestonsburg High School and is 
presently employed by GAB Service, of 
Pikeville, Ky. 

Mr. Robinette, a 1971 graduate of 
Johns Creek High School, is presently 
employed with United Parcel Service. 
He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Robinette, of Meta, Ky. 

Vows will be exchanged August 1, at 
the United Methodist Church at Allen , 
Ky., and the gracious custom of open 
church will be observed. 

ANNOUNCE BIRTH 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Merritt, of Clin­

ton, Mich., announce the birth of their 
first child, a daughter, Mollie Sue, on 
June 17 at Joseph Mercy Hospital, An~ 
Arbor , Michigan . Maternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. Milton \ 
Baisch, of Saline, Mich. The paternal 1 

grandparents are Mr. and Mrs . Billy \ 
Merritt, of the Abbott road. · 

HAS HOLIDAY GUESTS 
Mrs. Nora Decker had as guests at 

her home in Green Acres during the 
holidays her son and daughter-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. F . Rose, of Columbus, 
Ohio. While here, they and Mrs. 
Decker spent some time shopping in 
Paintsville. 

SPENT WEEK-END HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Greene and 

daughter, Patty, of New Carisle, Ohio, 
spent the weekend here with his 
parents , Mr. and Mrs . Perry Greene. 
They also spent some time while here 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Holbrook, and daughter and son-in­
law, Mr. and Mrs. Mark Boatwright. 

MR. DA VIDSOI\' HONORED , 
Flowers were placed on the altar of 

the First Methodist Church Sunday, by 
Mrs . Marshall Davidson, com­
memorating the birthday of Mr. David­
son. 

J!'l; NASHVILLE 
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Watts and 

children and Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Gar­
rett and children, of Ypsilanti, Mich., 
formerly of Prestonsburg, spent a few 
days recently in Nashville, Tenn., 
where they visited the Grand Ole 
Opera , Opera Land and other in­
teresting points . 

McMILLENS VISIT HERE 
The Rev. and Mrs . Ira McMillen .. of 

Florence, and their daughter, Debbie, 
of Boston, Mass., were here for a visit, 
Wednesday of last week. The Rev. 
McMillen, former pastor of Irene Cole 
Memorial Baptist Church, is presently 
pastor of the First Baptist Church in 
Florence. 

Four Receive Scottish 
Rite Degrees, Recently 

Four local men received the Scottish 
Rite degrees at the 129th Anniversary 
Reunion class held June 27 at Scottish 
Rite Temple, Louisville. They were: 

John R. Blair, Tommy R. Hicks and 
Ralph G. Hager, all of the East Point 
Lodge, and Holland B. Hurley, of the 
Wayland Lodge. 

SUHPIUSE VISITORS 
Elizabeth H. Patton and Melvin Har­

ris, of the Cliffside Apartments , had a 
surprise visit by two nephews, Mr. 
David Harris and Mr. Bruce Harris , 
and their families, from Warsaw , Ind., 
last Saturday and Sunday. 
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VISITS FROM CHICAGO 
Mrs. Henry C. Bryan, of West 

Chicago, Ill., has returned home after 
a week's visit with her mother, Mrs. 
Elizabeth H. Patton , and her uncle, 
Melvin Harris, of the Cliffside Apart­
menlc;;. While here, she visited her 
aunt, Mrs. J eff Vaughan, and other 
relatives. 

KIWANIANNE OFFICER 
The name of Mrs. Vera Ford was in­

advertently omitted from the list of 
recently elected officers of the 
Prestonsburg Kiwaniannes published 
in last week 's Times. Mrs. Ford was 
elected secretary-treasurer of the 
organization. 

Shirt Tales 
NOW SELLING CONVERSE SHOES! LOWEST 
PRICES IN TOWN! • KENTUCKY T-SHIRTS 
• KENTUCKY HORSE PARK SHIRTS $3.50 

109 CENTRAL AVE. 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

886-2462 
886-1532 

HOURS: 12-6, MON.-SAT. 

DONNA COLLINS, OWNER; LINDA HAGER, MGR. 

m NU~D~!!!m~~~~LTY 
REALTOR® CALL: 886-6464 

REDUCED! 
SIZEMORE BRANCH-Rustic ranch, 3 bedrm., 2 bath, liv . & fam. 
rm., blt.-in kitchen & appliances, carpet, central heat & air, att. 
26'x 36' gar. (inc. office, workshop, ¥.! bath ) on 1-acre lot in sub-div. 
Owner financing (below mkt. rate ) for qualified buyers. $69,500. 

SUGAR LOAF-Commerciall~t & 3 bedrm. home front. Ky.l428. Liv. 
rm. with fireplace, hardwood floors , central gas heat & ail" (low gas 
rate) on 2-acre wood. tract. K.H.C. low-interest loan available. $52,500. 

DA VID-7-room frame home on large corner lot. New blt.-in kitchen 
has oak cabinets, dishwasher, dispos., stove & refrig. Thermo win­
dows, window a.c., 8'x8' storage bldg. Owner moving out of state. Low 
interest K.H.C. loan available. Sacrifice at $19,900. 

PRESTONSBURG-split-foyer brick-fr. home on approx. 3 acres 
overlook. city but with complete privacy. 3 bedrms, 2 baths, liv. & din. 
rms., fam. rm. with fireplace, blt.-in kitchen & appliances, 2-car 
garage & utility, carpeted with central heat and air. · 

BETSY LAYNE-2-bedrm. ranch, 2 baths, lg.liv. rm. , blt.-in kitchen, 
carpet. High and dry lot with concrete drive & patio. Below market 
financing avail. to qualified buyer. $30's. 

EAST POINT-JENNY'S CR.-3 bedrm. ranch on lg. lot with garden. 
Carpeted & blt.-in kitchen. Below market financing avail. to qualified 
buyer. Owner relocated . Low interest K.H.C. loan available. $30's. 

BULL CREEK-Brick ranch <new condition ) 3 bedrm., 1' 2 bath, liv. & 

fam. rm., blt.-in kitchen & applian. & utility rm., carpet, central heat 
& air <low gas rate ) on IOO'x 200' lot. Neat U.S. 23 & New Ky. 80 in­
tersection. Below market financing avail. to qualified buyer. $70's. 

PRESTONSBURG-Unique brick home on lg. landscaped lot. Over 
4,000-s.f. living area. 20'x 40' swim pool & access. Very private lo­
cation (within walk. distance of downtown). Serious inquiries by 
qualified buyers-please. 

VAN LEAR-Powell add.-Brick ranch (1,325-s.f.), 3 bedrms., !g. 
ceramic bath, blt.-in kitchen, att. l-ear (finished) garage. City water 
and gas on lg. landscaped lot. Low interest K.H.C. loans avail. $49,500. 

RESIDENTIAL LOTS 
BETSY LAYNE-Entrance Pike-Floyd Hollow-High & dry 7 acres 

, (ready to build on). Gas & Water available. $13,500. 

CLIFFSIDE-2 residential lots and 1 acre bottomland. 

WOODLAND HEIGHTS-Nice residential lot (city water ) in 
restricted subdivision. Additional lots-Bull Creek and Tram . 

FARM 
EDGAR DOTSON FARM on Lick Fork of Jenny's Creek. 187 acres 
(approx. 25 ac. high, dry levelland), 2 water wells, barn and mobile 
home. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 
MARTIN-collins Bldg. on Main St. Mid $30's. "MAKE AN OFFER." 
U.S. 23 near Prestonsburg-ZOO front foot comme•·ciallot (I.l8 ac .) 

CALL 886-6464 OFF ICE 
DIXON NUNNERY, Broker 

886-2189, Nights or Week-ends 

EMMA LOU MARTIN, Broker-Sales 
874-2955, Nights or Week-ends 
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-NOW IN P OGRESS-

SEMI-ANNUAL C EARANCE SALE 
SUMMER 

MERCHANDISE 
REDUCED 

%-%-% 
RETURNS TO FALMOUTH 

Miss Rebecca Haywood, who has 
.,. spent the past two weeks with her 

parents, Mr. and Mrs . Arthur 
Haywood, has returned to her home at 
Falmouth, Kentucky. 

ENTERTAINS GUESTS 
The Rev. and Mrs. Leven Burchett 

entertained with a cookout at their 
home, Wednesday evening, June 26, 
having as their guests Dr. and Mrs. 
Roger Jurich and children. 

Ja BIRTH ANNOUNCED 
WJ Mr. and Mrs. Byron Shelton, of 

Nashville, Tenn., are the parents of a 
daughter, Hailey Suzanne. The 
Sheltons have one other daughter, 
Marla. Mrs. Shelton is the former Mar­
tha Leslie, daughter of Mrs. Maman 
Leslie, of Prestonsburg, and the late 
Gerald Leslie. 

OlAMON 0 CLUSTER 

SPECIAL 

VISITORS FROM LEXINGTON 
Dr. and Mrs. Porter Mayo and son, 

Lionel, of Lexington, spent last week at 
May Lodge, and visited with relatives 
and friends here. 

OBSERVES BIRTHDAY 
Mrs. James Carter, II, celebrated 

her birthday at her home, Monday 
evening, June 22, when members of her 
family joined her for a family dinner. 
Enjoying the occasion were the guest 
of honor, Mr. Carter and their children, 
Jim, III, Susan Raye and Rebecca, her 
mother, Mrs. Josephine Howard; her 
husband's parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
James J. Carter, and her aunt, Mrs. 
Martha Spradlin. Visiting with her 
later in the evening was one of her 
close friends, Mrs. Martha Sue Hicks. 
Following the dinner, decorated birth­
day cake and other refreshments were 
served, and gifts were opened. 

IN PIKEVILLE HOSPITAL 
Mrs. Clara Warrix entered the 

Methodist Hospital, Pikeville, last 
week and for a time was in inten­
sive care. Her condition remains 
critical. 

IN HUNTINGTON 
Mr. and Mrs. Willis Sparks were in 

Huntington a few days during the early 
part of the week. 

RETURNS FROM NASHVILLE 
Mrs. Homer Salisbury spent two 

months recently in Nashville, Tenn., 
(: l Y 0 ~' B L R C H Ell where she visited with her daughter 

wrtdm and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. W. T. 
Hall. On her return, she was met in 

PHONE 
886 2734 Lexington by her sister, Miss Maurine PRESTONSBURG 

~~~~~~===~~~==~Mayo, who accompanied her home. 
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COURT ST. PRESTONSBURG 
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STORE-SHOE STORE-DENIMLAND 

PRESTONSBURG 

DOCIA B. WOODS, SOCIETY EDITOR 

RETURNS FROM VISIT 
Mrs. Ann Scutchfield recently 

returned from San Diego, California, 
where she spent a month visiting her 
son, Dr. F. Douglas Scutchfield, and 
family. 

RETURN FROM VISIT 
Mrs. John Rodebaugh returned last 

week from a visit with her daughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Franklin 
Setser and children, in Germantown, 
Ohio. She was accompanied home by 
her grandson, Greg Setser, and by 
Mrs. Billie Ruth Ward and son, Estill . 
Mr. and Mrs. Setser were here over the 
weekend, and a cookout was held 
Saturday at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
David Robinson honoring Mr. and Mrs. 
Setser and Mrs. Johnny Rodebaugh, of 
Langley, on their birthdays. 

PLAN RUMMAGE SALE 
The Free Will Baptist Women's Club, 

of the Gable-Roberts Addition, will con­
duct a rwnmage sale, July 6, 7 and 8, at 
the new church club kitchen. 

VISITORS FROM LOUISVILLE 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Hobson and 

children, of Louisville, were here dur­
ing the weekend for a visit with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. H. D. Fitz­
patrick. Mr. and Mrs. Fitzpatrick 
entertained them to lunch Sunday at 
May Lodge. 

HERE FROM LEXINGTON 
Miss Toni K. Ranier, of Lexington, 

has been here for a visit with her 
grandmother, Mrs. Harry B. Ranier, 
and other relatives. 

LUNCHEON GUESTS 
Mrs. Joe Burke, Miss Ethel Burke 

and Mrs. Wayne Brown and daughter, 
Jilleyn Lee Brown, were guests at a 
luncheon given by Mr. and Mrs. Phil 
Smith and Mr. and Mrs. Hill Smith, at 
Jackson, Tuesday of last week. Among 
the other guests were Mr. and Mrs . Bill 
Turpin, of DeLand, Florida. 

HONORED BY SHOWER 
Miss Nora Hicks was honored with a 

miscellaneous shower recently at the 
home of Mrs. Scott Collins. The serving 
table was covered with an em­
broidered white cloth, trimmed with 
lace. Crystal and gold-colored china 
and silverware were used in the serv­
ing of the refreshments . Multi-colored 
arrangements of summer flowers and 
gold-colored candles furnished the 
decorations. Co-hostesses with Mrs. 
Collins were Mesdames Dot Marshall, 
Patty Collins, Anna Mae Goble, Meg 
Mitchell, Dana Caudill, Debbie 
Billiter, Janie Hicks, Mae Martin, 
Mildred Binnix, Norsie Burchett, Eva 
Collins, Eileen Sheets and Beverly Go­
ble. Miss Hicks moved recently to an 
apartment on the Auxier road. 

VISIT IN OHIO 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Herald spent 

several days last week in Carey, Ohio 
with his aunt and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. M. Puckett, and family. Mrs. 
Puckett is the former Hettie Herald. 
She and her husband formerly resided 
in West Prestonsburg. 

CONDUCT SERVICES 
In the absence of the pastor, the Rev. 

Taylor Biggs, lay church member 
Steve Wilson conducted services at the 
Community United Methodist Church 
last Sunday morning. Sunday night, 
Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Robinson, youth 
directors of the church, were in cbarge 
of the services. 

FATHER'S DAY HOSTS 
Rev. and Mrs. Leven Burchett enter­

tained on Father's Day his daughter, 
Mrs . Darvin Lafferty, his grand­
children, Mr. and Mrs. Larry Lafferty, 
and children, Marsha, Sherry and Deb­
by Sue, and Mr. and Mrs . John Laffer­
ty . 

HERE FOR 4th 
Miss Crystal Collins and Tom Mat­

tingly, II, both of Lexington, were here 
during the 4th of July holidays for a 
visit with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Scott Collins. While here, Miss Collins 
served as maid of honor at the 
Burchett-Ciifton wedding at the First 
United Methodist Church. 

VISIT IN ASHLAND 
Miss Ethel Burke and Mr. and Mrs. 

Delmas Saunders were in Ashland dur· 
ing the weekend, guests with Miss 
Burke's and Mrs. Saunders· sister, 
Mrs. Clarence Logan, and Mr. Logan. 

TO WED, JULY 11 
The wedding of Mrs. Viola May 

Cooley and the Rev. Jack Derossett 
will be solomonized Saturday, July 11, 
at 6 p.m., at the Community United 
Methodist Church here, with the Rev. 
Taylor Biggs performing the 
ceremony. The gracious custom of 
open wedding will be observed. A 
reception will follow at the church. 

RETURNS AFTER VISIT 
Mrs. Anne Ford returned home Mon­

day after having spent several days 
visiting her niece in Virginia Beach, 
Virginia. 

HERE FOR WEEK-END 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fridley, of 

Gahanna, Ohio, were here during the 
weekend for a visit with her mother, 
Mrs. Peg Hewlett. They also spent 
some time with her sister and brother­
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Franklin Salis­
bury, at Martin. 

DINNER GUESTS 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred James has as 

their dinner guests on Independence 
Day, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Childers, of 
Wheelwright, Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Brewer and son, of Flemingsburg, and 
Mr. and Mrs. David Turner and 
children, of Drift. 

HONORED ON BIRTHDAY 
Mrs. Barkley Sturgill entertained 

with a dinner last week, honoring her 
husband on his birthday. Joining them 
for this event were their daughter, 
Sarah, their son, B. J., and Mr. 
Sturgill's mother, Mrs. Dorothy 
Sturgill. Decorated birthday cake and 
other refreshments were served 
following the dinner. 

VISITS PARENTS 
Miss Carol Joy Nicholas, of Lex­

ington, was here during the weekend 
for a visit with her parents, the Rev. 
and Mrs. Ted Nicholas, at the par­
sonage of the First Methodist Church. 
Miss Nicholas is employed as a 
librarian at the Lexington City 
Library. ----

PLAN PICNIC 
The Sunday School of the Community 

United Methodist Church will hold a 
picnic at the Dewey Dam recreation 
area Sunday, July 12, at 3 p.m. Vesper 
services will be held at 5 p.m. 

VACATIONING IN ITALY 
Mrs . Della Herald received a 

telephone call Sunday from her son, 
Ballard Herald, who was vacationing 
in Rome, Italy. He said he had spent 
the past week in Morocco, and would 
continue from there to Sicily before 
returning to his home in Cleveland, 
next Saturday. 

DINNER HONOR MR. COLLINS 
Mrs. Gorman Collins, Sr. entertained 

with a birthday dinner, honoring her 
husband, last Wednesday evening at 
their home on First Avenue. Those en­
joying this occasion were Mr. Collins, 
the hostess, Mrs. Collins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gorman Collins, Jr., Mr. and Mrs. 
Scott Collins and Mr. and Mrs. Brady 
Collins. Cake and ice cream were serv­
ed following the dinner. 

VISIT IN TENNESSEE 
The Rev. and Mrs. Leven Burchett 

visited their son and daughter-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Miller, and 
daughter, Robin, in Chattanooga, 
Tenn., last weekend. While there, they 
all spent some time at Rock City and 
other places of interest. 

FREE 
EAR PIERCING* 

with purchase of eanings 

A sterile, medirally approved procedure 
performed by trained pPt·sonnel 

Quick • Sufl' • Pc1i11les~ 

CLYDE BURCHETT 
Jeweler 

Phone 886-273~ Prestonsburg 

CLOSED SATURDAY 
JULY 4TH 

OPEN FRIDAY NIGHTS 
TILL 8 P.M. 

FULL LINE OF MODELS IN STOCK AT: 

Siln~!.~~~~ay ~~:are ~~Jl.l 
HOURS: MON.-FRI. · SAT. 7:30-3 

SERVICE DEPT. TO BACK UP WHAT WE SELL 

SUMMER SUMMER SALE 
1/3 OFF 

SA LE 
SU Mffi 
S E 
SU ER 
S E SPRING & SUMMER 

MERCHANDISE 
SU ER 
S E 
SUM MER ~.~1e4~sM{t SAL ~ALE ......... 
SUMMER 1!: SUMMER "Home or Nationally-Advertised Merchandise" 

COURT ST., PRESTONSBURG 
886-2791 SALE SU MER SALE 

SUMMER SALE SUMMER SALE SUMMER 
SALE SUMMER SALE SUMMER SALE 

(I 
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U.S.D.A. CHOICE 
BONELESS 

Summer 
Sweepstakes 

WIN A 1981 JEEP 
SCRAMBLER OR A S2QO ENTER TODAY AND 

. SHOPPING SPREE I ENTEROFTENI 
.. _ ..... Of THE AREA PIC-PAC 

UPERMARKETS WILL AWARD A $200 
SHOPPING SPREE! GRAND PRIZE 

WINNER WILL BE DRAWN FROM ALL 
ENTRIES. 

lOYAL IEIAIL s17 
VAlUE OF All 

'IllES OYER . . ' 0 
AUUAL PK-PA( &RAND PRill IS WNITI WITH ILUI DIIIIM TOP A.D SEATS. OPTIOtU SHOW• 
1• PKTUII MAY IIOT IIIII<LIDID 1• A(TUAL PillE. ALL APPLI(AILI TAXES LIUIIIISIS A•D 
I.SIIAIKI TO II PAID 1Y WI.MII . ' 

. SMOKED 
PICNICS ...... ....... ....... . 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE 

ROUND STEAK 
$ 88 

. Lb. 

CHASE 
NECESSARY 

PRICES 
EFFECTIVE 

UNTIL 
SUN., JULY 12. 

STORE HOURS: 
MON.-SAT. 

8 A.M.-9 P.M. 
SUNDAY 

10 A.M.-9 P.M. 

DOUBLE 
STAMPS 

EACH 
TUESDAY 

AT 
PIC-PAC 

* PLAY 
QUALITY 

STAR · 

:g~:T ....... .. $2 2Lb~ SiRtOi'N TIP $ 
STEAK ... ..... ... . . 

38 
Lb. 

COVER . 
CARD 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE $19 8 
CUBE STEAK... Lb. GROuND BEEF $ 

28 
Lb. 

HORMEL 

POTTED MEAT 
~~~~ 4/88c 

HYDE PARK 

· FRESH BREAD 
16-0z. 3/98 C Loaves 

TONY'S PIZZAS 

sse 14-0z. 
Size 

FREE 
300 

EXTRA 
QUALITY 
STAMPS 
ASK US FOR 

DETAILS! 

* 
• DOUBLE SAVING'S 

/ AT PIC-PAC. LOW, 
LOW PRICES AND 
QUALITY STAMPS 

• EVERY TUESDAY IS 
DOUBLE STAMP 
DAY 

• MANY UNADVERTISED 
SPECIALS THROUGHOUT 
THE STORE 

MORTON BEEF, 3/$1 
P'OT TPiEs .. 

ARGO 17-0Z. 3/$1 
SWEET PEAS .... .. .... 

15-0Z. CAN 

DINTY MOORE 88 C 
BEEF STEW ........ .. 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 The Floyd County Times Section Two, Page One 

Engagement Announced NOTICE Blood, it doesn't grow .on trees. 
Two Future Doctors 
Three Lawyers Among 
Floyd UK Graduates 

Upon and after publication of this 
notice 1, Bert Conn , will not be respon­
sible for any debts incurred by any per­
son other than myself. 

Help fill the need by donating blood. 1) 

Among the 16 Floyd county students 
who received degrees from the Univer­
sity of Kentucky recently arc two 
future physicians and three attorneys. 

Receiving M.D. degrees were Miles 
Kenton Gibson, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Miles Gibson, Jr., Langley, and Reva 
Duff Tackett, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
James A. Duff, of Hueysville. 

Those graduating with juris doctor 
(law) degrees were Larry Dean 
Brown, son of Mr. and Mrs. George C. 
Brown, Prestonsburg; Edward Lyn 
Cooley, son of Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Arnold Cooley, Wayland; John Delmar 
Hughes, son of Lt. Col. and Mrs J . D. 
Hughes, of Woodbridge, Va., formerly 
of Prestonsburg. 

Others receiving degrees and their 
majors follow: 

Kelly J. Dingus, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jam~ 0. Dingus, R. 2, Martin, B. A., 
English; Martin L. Osborne, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. M. L. Osborne, Prestonsburg, 
B. A., Political Science; Patricia L. 
Sturgill, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Barkley J . Sturgill, Prestonsburg, B. 
A., Elementary Education; Betty J. 
Grey, daughter of Frank G. Grey, 
Allen, B. A., Social Work; James 
Byron Hamilton, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Hamilton, Jr., Allen, B. G. S., 
Accounting; Glenda Jean Stanley, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Stanley, Prestonsburg, B. H. S., Com­
munity Health; Timothy Rand Collins, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Scott Collins, 
Prestonsburg, B. S., Biology; Randy 
Conn, son of Mr. and Mrs. Crit Conn, 
Dana, B. S. Biology; Phillip David 
Elliott, son of Mrs. Norcie Elliott 
Miller, Prestonsburg, B. S. in Accoun­
ting; David Frederick Reed, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. David M. Reed, Lexington, 
formerly of Langley, B. S. in Mining 
Engineering. 

It took the Colorado River two 
million years to carve the 
Grand Canyon. 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION TO MINE 

Pursuant to Application Number 
098-0168. 

In accordance with the provisions of 
KRS 350.055, notice is hereby given 
that: Hawkeye Coal Company, 1200 
First Security Plaza, Lexington, Ky., 
intends to file an application for the 
surface disturbance mining of approx­
imately 207 acres located southeast of 
Endicott in Floyd county. The propos­
ed operation is approximately 5 miles 
southeast of State Route !94's junction 
with Buffalo Creek Rd. , and located 
northeast of Johns Creek, latitude 37° 
39' 30'; longitude 82° 36' 06." The sur­
face of the area to be .1ined is 
owned by: Wanda Spears , Sel­
lard heirs , Hawkeye Coal 
Co., Roscoe Blackburn, Ray 
Taylor, Freddie James, George 
Spears. A brief description of the kind 
of mining activity proposed is: Moun­
tain top removal and contour cuts with 
associated hollow fills. The application 
will be filed at the Bureau of Surface 
Mining Reclamation and Enforce­
ment, Pikeville Area Office, Rt. No. 6, 
Box 178, Pikeville, Ky. 41501. 

Persons wishing to file written objec­
tion and/or request a formal ad­
ministrative hearing in regard to the 
above described surface mine should 
notify the Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental Protec­
tion within 30 days of the date of this 
notice. A copy of the newspaper clip­
ping must be attached to the written 
objection. The objection or request for 
a hearing will reference application 
number 098-0168. Such objection or re­
quest must be in accordance with KRS 
224.081 (2), and must be forwarded to 
the Director of Permits, Bureau of Sur­
face Mining Reclamation and Enforce-

tnent Capital Plaza Tower, Frankfort, 
Kentucky 40601. 2. Notice is hereby 
provided pursuant to 30 CFR 715.13 (d) 
00) and KRS 350 that the proposed 
postmining land use of Forest Land 
does not constitute a change from the 
Forest Land pre-mining land use. In­
terested citizens and local, state, and 
Federal Agencies are invited to review 
and comment to the address listed 
above on the proposed land use. It. 

-L-

The engagement of Miss Carolyn Belinda Salisbury to Mr. Mickey Morris 
Martin is being announced by her mother, Mrs. Esther Salisbury, of 
McDowell. The prospective bridegroom is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Martin, of Drift. 

Friends and relatives are invited to attend the open churcfi ceremony that 
will take place Saturday, August 1 at 7:30p.m. in the First Baptist Church of 
Allen. 

The bride-elect is a graduate of McDowell High School, has attended 
Pikeville College and is presently attending Prestonsburg Community Col­
lege. She is employed at the college library and with the Summer Youth Day 
Camp. 

The prospective bridegroom is a graduate of McDowell High School and 
operates Triple M. Mining Company at Drift. 

Sheriff-Preacher's First Revival 
Under Way at Horne Br. Mission 

There was a time when this peace of­
ficer was deeply interested in getting 
confe ·~ions from the &uilly. He is rq.or.e 
mterested than ever in guilty pleas but 
for another reason. 

For Doug Lewis, sheriff of Floyd 
county, is perhaps the only sheriff in 
the United States who is a preacher. 

His conversion took place after he 
had taken office, succeeding his father, 
Joe Wheeler Lewis, as sheriff. Since 
that date he has become more and 
more deeply involved in the work of his 
church, Benedict Baptist Chapel on 
Cow Creek, and by invitation has 
preached at other Baptist churches in 
the county. 

Monday evening, this week, Sheriff 
Lewis began his first revival. He is the 
preacher at Home Branch of Buffalo 
where a revival will continue this week 
through Friday. 

The revival and the vacation Bible 
school, which began Monday morning, 
are sponsored by Fitzpatrick Baptist 
Church, of the Middle Creek road, near 
here. That church assumed respon­
sibility for Sunday School and worship 
services at Home Branch, a year ago. 

GO TO LOUISVILLE 
Mrs. Eva Collins and her grand­

daughter, Miss Savannah Wills, ac­
companied Mrs. Collins' sister, Mrs. G. 
W. Merritt, and Mrs . Merritt's grand­
daughter, Miss Susan Frances Heston, 
of Louisa, to Louisville last week when 
Miss Heston represented Lawrence 
county in the Miss Kentucky pageant. 
She was sponsored by the Louisa Ju­
nior Women's Club. 

Dr. Roger Jurich, of the Fitzpatrick 
congregation, heads the work 
and when no mini tcrr i! available lead, 
the church worship. "I act simply as a 
speaker, since I am not a preacher." 
Dr. Jurich explains. 

The vacation Bible school at Home 
Branch is particularly well-staffed this 
week, since 22 members of Lyndon 
Baptist Church, Louisville, are there to 
help. 

Risner Reunion 
The annual Risner reunion will be 

held Sunday, July 19 at the Salyer 
Elmentary School on Route 7, 
Royalton. There will be a covered dish 
luncheon and special activities for 
children. Anyone related to the Risners 
is welcome to attend. For more infor­
mation contact either Paul Risner 
(606-254-6060), or Mrs. Denver Risner 
( 606-358-4560) . 

BERT CONN 
Dana, Ky. ll-pd . 

Central Kentucky Blood Center 
Prestonsburg Station/Te l. (606) 886-1557 

SAVE 
50°0

TO 75°0 

ON ALL REFRIGERATORS,.. 
AND FREEZERS u 

DELIVERED FREE~~~~ 

Deepfreeze made only by ,.,., •• 
FOOD FREEZER 

The Finest Name in Chest Freezers 
. with the quality and dependability you expect from Amana. 

The Counterbalanced, Self-Aligning 
Lid - once raised, it stays up and out 
of the way until you are ready to c lose 
it. And the lid re-aligns itself everytime 
you close it. That means there are no 
costly air leaks that cause tem­
peratures to fl uctuate and result tn longer 
pressor runntng t tme. 

com-

Zero Degree Storage Temperature - the best for 
storing frozen food , according to the U.S. Depart­
ment of Agnculture. Freezing coils wrap back and 
forth and completely around the food storage ltner 
(even the liner bottom) to insure food is on or near a 
prime freezing surface 

Textured Steel Exterior - on lid and 
cabinet adds the e legant look of leather. 
Also helps hide fingerprints and minor 
scratches. It's a softer, warmer look that 
lets your Amana freezer blend with any 
decor. 

Efficient Foam Insulation - Amana surrounds the 
food storage area with eff1ctent urethane foam wall 
insulation mstead of fiberglass. Urethane foam has 
greater msulat:ng properties than an equal thickness 
of fiberglass. Leaves more space for food storage. 

The Kitchen Freezer -There can be b1g advantages 
to hav 1ng your freezer "ftnger-t tp c lose when you 

~,..• ~ are preparing food Amana 

' 

Deepfreeze chest freezers , Available in Capacities to 
Fit Your Needs - Avatlable 
are SIX fully featured Amana 
Deepfreeze chest freezers 
with capactties from 7 .2 
cubic feet to a giant 28.0 
cubi'c feet All models reflect 
careful attention to detail and 
quality craftsmanship that 
are hallmarks of Amana 
products. 

w1th their standard coun-
-":'<~"'"~->"'(•liH!I- I tertop heigh.t, textured .stee l 
•.;r:~mN exterior and beautiful 

'll~q~ij:::=~=: Amana-acrylic enamel ftnish, 
::; can put extra frozen food 

storage space in your 
kitchen, and add beauty p lus 
valuable Clj>unterspace. The 
Amana Oeepfree ze chest 
freezer . . . an ideal kttchen 
compan1on. 

RONALD FRASURE'S 
FURNITURE AND APPLIANCE 

PRESTONSBURG, KY. • PHONE 886-6900 
' 

A.Q.H.A. STALLION 

Music-Carter-Hughes Chevrolet-Buick would like to thank all 
those who came in and registered for the "Cavalier Give­
away" drawing. We are. very appreciative of your great re­
sponse to this event. 

Scoo 

Dam: 

SCOOPER PARR-410871 
Three .Bars 
sading Gra d­

uternal sire 

Luc!cy V 

SCOOPER PARR is a beautiful chestnut stallion with conformation plus. He is a pro­
ven halter and race winner. And a proven R.O.M. producer as well. He has one of 
the finest pedigrees in the quarter horse world. 

Interested in performance? Speed? Halter? Conformation? Disposition? Don't 
miss this opportunity to bred to the stallion with them all! 

FEE: $300.00 (Coggins Test Required) 

Owner: Jack Heston 

Harmon Station C/0 Roger Jurich, RR 1, Box 25, East Point, Ky. 
41216. Phone: 606-886-2280 or 606-886-2390 after 5 p.m. 

ti 17 41 

First place winner at our dealership was Kathleen Gibson, of 
East Point. As ·one of the five finalists, she will attend a lun­
cheon at May Lodge, Saturday, and following that, the draw­
ing for the new Chevrolet Cavalier. The four runners-up will 
each receive a GE color TV. 
Our second place winner was Dallas Jude, of Inez, who re­
ceived a GE Tape Player-Radio, and third place, a GE Clock­
Radio, was won by Edward Hall, of Bevinsville. 

MUSIC-CARTER-HUGHES 
CHEVROLET-BUICK 
Phone 886-9181 So. Lake Drive Prestonsburg 

c 
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FOR SALE FIELDS 
CARPET SERVICE BASS BOAT, TRAILER 

AND TOW CAR Expert Service and Installation. 

Boat is 15-ft McKee. doublt-hull, fiberglm. Has 
driver and passenger seats and upholstered 
fishing chai~. 1974 50-h.p. EYinrude engine with 
spare prop and 1975 9-speed foot-control Evin· 
rude trolling motor witli spm prop. batteries ill­
eluded. Thorobred tro~iler witll 12" wheels, good 
t1res witll spare wheel and tire. winch and tongue 
jack. Tow car is 1972 Bu1ck LeSabre 4-Door 
Sedan. 455-cu. in engine. hctory air, C.B. ro~dio, 
runs good, good tires witli good studded snow 
tires mounted on extra wheels . Body condition is 
better than umge. Car and fishing motors One 
owner ud well mo~intained. Total price $2000. 

FREE ESTIMATES. 

874-2958 6·17·41 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
NEW ALLEN, KY.-Red brick ranch· 

Moly be seen o~t 238 Trimble Branch in 
Prestonsburg or Cilll Fred Meece at 886-6196 for 
ilppointment. Serious inquiries only, please. 6 24 3l 

style, S·room home, 2100 square feet. 
Above flood water. Two wood or coal 
fireplaces, electric and gas heat and 
air·conditioning. Large lot, 130·ft. 
front. Quiet neighborhood close to 
bank, postoffice, school, and food 
stores. 

CALL, DAY-874-2166 
NIGHT-874-2829 6-24-lr. 

M&M MAKE MONEY 
MEET PEOPLE HOUSE MOVING BE YOUR OWN BOSS 

NOW IN THIS, AREA MOVING, 
RAISING HOUSES. MODERN 
HYDRAULIC EQUIPMENT. EX· 
PERT SERVICE IN BLOCKS, 
BRICKS AND FRAME HOUSES. 
CHIMNEYS MOVED AND RAIS· 
ED. 

Sell Avon's world·famous quality pro­
ducts. You'll set your own hours; and 
the harder you work, the more you'll 
earn. Call now: 

886·2838 478-5140 
886-2082 874-2246 
452·2320 432·5442 
377-6442 358-4063 

SERIOUS INQUIII£S ONLY 478·5888 

606-248-417 4 6-17·41. 

EMPLOYMENT 
OPPORTUNITY 

Pizza Hut of Pikeville is now 
accepting applications for the 
positions of cook and waitress. 
Both day and night shifts are 
available. If interested, apply in 
person at the Pizza Hut. No 
phone calls please. 

DAN DULEMBA 
BUILDERS 

7-R-21 

HOMES • CARPENTRY 
MASONRY • LOG HOMES 

POlE BARNS & BUilDINGS 

Phone 478-2228 
Betsy Layne, Ky. 

F.E.E., INC. 
PRESTONSBURG, KY • 606-886-8852 

SPECIALIZING IN METAL BUILDINGS, STEEL ERECTIONS, AND FOUNDATIONS. WE 
LOOK AT EVERY JOB FROM AN ENGINEER'S POINT OF VIEW. 

7-1-2! 

GENE PRATER- Owner and Engineer 
1·29-tf 

EXECUTIVE HOUSEKEEPER NEEDED 
Must have previous experience in this position with manage­

ment background. At least 2 yrs. experience required. Needed to 
organize and supervise housekeeping department. Salary com· 
mensurate to experience. Contact: Personnel Director, Our Lady 
of the Way Hospital, Box 910, Martin, Ky. 41649 

Ph. (606) 285-3251, ext. 66. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 

NURSING OPPORTUNITIES 
Full or Part Time (RN or LPN) 

Medical 
Surgical 
ICU/CCU 
OB 
ER 

EXCEPTIONAL BENEFITS 
Attractive salaries-tuition reimbursement-sick pay conversion 
bonus-time and a half holfday pay-12 sick days-life and health 
insurance-retirement benefits-thrift plan-adoption assistance 
program-opportunity to transfer and/or advance nationwide in 
any of the 90 HUMANA owned hospitals without loss of benefits. 

Louisa Community Hospital is a modern 90·bed, acute care, 
general hospital located in Southeastern Ky. 

LOUISA COMMUNITY HOSPITAL 
P.O. Box 769 Highway 644 

Lousia, Ky. 41230 

606- 638-9451 Ext. 280 

7·1·21. 

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER 6·2Hf 

EXCEPTIONAL OPPORTUNITIES 
FOR 

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNICIANS 
AND 

BODY SHOP TECHNICIANS 
" Wt• han the immediate need for additional Automotive and Bod) 

Shop Technicians in our Service Department. \.\'e are looking for peo­
ple \\ho are care<'r mind<'d, and \\illing to tak<' advantag<' of great op­
portunities. 

WE OFFER 

• Job SN:urity 
*Paid \'acations and Holidays 
*lnsuranc'!' Hl'll!'fits 
*GrO\\ th and Ad\ anct>mt>nt 

QUALIFICATIO.\'S 
*lntegrit) 
*Desirt> 
*Good ('haractt>r 
*Good Rt>ft>rencl's 
*Age IR or Over 

Inteniews will be conducted between the hours of 9:00a.m. and 
5:00p.m. If the above hours are not com<'ni<'nt. pleas<' c·all non Osch­
wald at RH·2t;~a for an appointmt>nl 

I: DO JACOBS 
FORD-LINCOLN-MERCURY-HONDA 

Lancer-Water Gap Road-Prestonsburg, Ky. • 874-2133 

The Floyd County Times 

FOR SALE-By Owner-Nice home on 
corner Jot in city . House is white stuc­
co, with black shutters, 2 br., l.r., tv 
room , kitchen and dr. Two out­
buildings, one metal w/concrete floor. 
Some drapes stay, new cham link 
fence. Located 119 Half St. Owner 
transferred out of state. Serious in­
quires only. Price reduced. Call 
886-8101. 7-8-2t-pd. 

TRAILER FOR RENT 
3-bedroom with bath and half. 
Near Prestonsburg. Married cou­
ple only with maybe ont> small 
child . No pets. $200. 

886-96 72. It pd 

JOE D. WEDDINGTON 
WE NEED HOUSES TO SELL -
WILL SELL FOR YOU OR WILL 
BUY FROM YOU. 

REAL ESTATE 

REWARD FOR 1 Bluetick and 1 
Walker coonhounds lost on Mining 
Branch of Bull Creek. Call 874-2707. 
Roy Ousley. 7-8-2t-pd. Phone 886-9411 

lf. 

WANTED-Auto mechanics instructor 
for the David School. Degree required, 
experience preferred. Contact: David 
School, David, Ky . 41616, Ph. 886-8374. 

7-8-2t. 

WOULD LIKE TO BUY, DC welder, 
gasoline or diesel-powered. Phone 
447-2830, before 7 a .m or after 7 p.m. 
Gregory Hall. 7-8-2t. 

FOR SALE-1 practically new Ward's 
automatic washer. Reasonable. Call 
886-6127. 7-8-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-1973 Century Buick, 
$1,300.00. In great condition. Sharon 
Watkins, 886-8687. 7-8-2t. 

WANTED GENERAL CLEANER 
needed to work local area, part-time, 
evenings . Call collect 606-253-1304. 
Equal Opportunity Employer, Lex­
ington Janitor Service. 7-8-2t. 

RAISE, LEVEL OR 
MOVE HOUSES 
OR TRAILERS 

Also, pour concrete and lay 
blocks. If you need any of this 
work done, contact: Johnny 
Slone at Dema, Kentucky. 

Phone 447-2240. 
If no- answer, call 447-2920. 

7-l-6t. t. 

ENVIRONMENTAl MONITORING 
SERVICE, INC. 

SAMPLING AND ANALYSIS OF 
WATER AND WASTE WATER _ 

• Bacteriological Analys1s of Domestic & Well 
Water Supplies • Completion of Quarterly 
N.P.D.E.S. Forms As Required By State & EPA 
• Environmental Impact Statements & 

Assessments 
Member of AST M & The National Environment 
Health Association. LABORATORY MEETS All 
STATE OSM & EPA REGULATIONS. 

DOUBLE WIDE TRAILER FOR 
SALE - 24x55, 2 full baths, three 
bedrooms, complete kitchen, large 
utility room, living room and dining 
room, shingled roof, porch and under· 
pinning included, air conditioned. Call 
478-5420 or 478-9141. David Conn. 7-8-2t. 

PHONE 789·3258 s-6-

BURGUNDY 74 Yamaha, TX 500, $600, 
cash or trade for jeep. Muncy 4-speed 
Chevy transmission with shifter, $200 
cash. Call478-56l7, Tavis Boyd. 7-8-2t. 

FRESH GREEN BEANS, sweet corn, 
potatoes, green apples-Farmers 
Market, Archer Park Fair Sheds each 
Yriday, 4:00p.m. 7-8-2t. 

24-HOUR SERVICE on electricity, 
plumbing, and pressure pumps. Also 
interior and exterior painting, installa­
tion of ceilings and tile. Call 478-2231. 

7-8-2t-pd. 

BAND FOR HIRE-Call 377-6606. 
7-8-2t-pd. 

MID-SUMMER 
SPECIAL! 

uS 23 So . ~•••ls,llt ' If 

JOB OPENING 
FOR PILOTS 

Paintsville-Prestonsburg 
Airport 

Apply in person, 9 a.m.-5 p.m. 
weekdays only with resume. 
Must have two years college, 
12,000 t.t., C.F.I., C.F.I.I., 
S.E.L.D., M.E.L.D. 

7-1·3t 

SHEPHERD'S 
COUNTER TOPS 

Rt 1, Lake Road, Prestonsburg 

r-SPECIALIZING IN---. 
LCABINETS & VANITIES.J 

CALL, ANY TIME: ~ 
NEW MflAL BUILDING 
30·ft. X SO·ft. X 14-ft 886-6445 

, 
7-1-lf I 

With rvstic brown colored walls, winter 
white roof and trim. 26-Ga. steel. 1 r2" 
vinyl back insulation-walls and roof. 
One 12·ft. x 12·ft. steel roll·up door, 
one 3070 walk door. 

Will be delivered to your job site July 

14. ss soooo 
Sale Price ' 

J & R Construction 

WANTED 
NIGHT WAITRESSES 

AND 
NIGHT CARHOPS 

Minimum wage, plus uniforms, 
meal, Blue Cross. Blue Shield. Ap· 
ply in person only, 2:30p.m. to 4 
p.m . No phone calls, please. 

JERRY'S RESTAURANT 
886-6031 7-8-2t 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 7-8-41 

COLLINS SECURITY SERVICE 
• LICENSED • BONDED • INSURED 

• 15 YEARS SECURITY EXPERIENCE • 
• 24-HOUR GUARD SERVICE • 

(606) 886-9867 OR 886-3665 
JESSIE COLLINS, Owner 

ATTE TION 
LANDLORDS 

The Floyd County Housing Authority has received 
funds to administer a Moderate Rehabilitation Program 
within Floyd County. The purpose of the program is to 
provide assistance which will enable an owner of rental 
housing to remodel the unit to meet HUD quality stan­
dards. A minimum of $1,000 per unit for repairs is re­
quired. 

Advantages to the landlord are: 

(1) Guaranteed timely monthly payments; 
(2) A 15-year contract with HUD for rental as· 

sistance; 
(3) Guaranteed tenant occupancy; 
(4) Payment for rent and repair of any tenant 

damages if tenant breaks lease; and 
(5) Repayment of remodeling costs by HUD through 

guaranteed rents. 

If you are interE' ·~d in helping yourself and your 
community please a. ~nd a public meeting to be held at 
the Floyd County Courthouse Annex, Monday, July 13, 
1981, at 7:30p.m. For further information, you may con­
tact Ms. Julia M. May at (606) 886-2717. 

7-8-41 

It 

BOB WHITE 
CONSTRUCTION 
Box 282, Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Dozers • Backhoes 
• Dump Trucks 

FREE ESTIMATES 

Call886-3544 +UI 

GENE MEADE 
CONCRETE 

CONTRACTORS, INC. 
Call Collect Anytime 
·Phone 789-6787 

!COLORED CONCRETE! 

We specialiie in floors, driveways, 
porches, patios and retaining walls. 
Also stucco. New or repair, cracked 
walls and foundations, anything con­
crete or room additions, garages, red· 
wood patios, decks or balconies. 

27 years' experience. 
" If we please you, tell others 

If not, tell us." 

BACKHOE 
FOR HIRE 

and trucks. Sand, gravel, 
fill dirt. 

Phone 377-2825 
7-I·St. 

Hitchcock 
Repair Service 

Installation & Repair 

Refrigeration 
and Air-Conditioning 

Emergency 
24-Hour Service 

874-2484 or 
886-6900 
Bill Hitchcock ;I-IIII 

BEAUTIFUL BUILDING STONE 
Sandy Valley Monument 

and 

Building Stone Co. 
(Inc.) 

MANY VARIETIES OF BEAUTIFUL 
BUILDING STONE FOR THE HOME 

• LIMESTONE VENEERING 
• MARBLE LANDSCAPE CHIPS 
• PORTABLE CONCRETE STEPS 
• VERMONT SLATE 

Located On Old U.S. 23 
In New Allen 

6·3-lf 

Section Two, Page Two 

WILLIE CRASE 
BUILDER 

OF NEW HOMES 
• REMODELING 

• ROOFING 
CALL NOW.358-9485 

OFFICE SPACE 
FOR RENT 
DOWNTOWN 

PRESTONSBURG 
886-2412 or 886-2734 

DIXON NUNNERY 
REALTOR 

PHONE 886-2189 4!Hf 

Water Well 
Drilling 

:\lost "-t"lls drilled in half a 
day by Rotary :\lachine. 

Kinzer Drilling Co. 
Allen, Ky. 

POLE BARNS 
COMPLETE 

Materials and labor. 
Contact 

F .E.E., INC. 
Prestonsburg 

886-8852 
4·211-tf 

DO YOU LIKE 
THE BANNER AREA? 

Are you seriously looking for a 
quality home'? If you have a 
good income and can provide 
$4,000, we can put you there. 
New homes, 3 and 4-bedroom. 

Call 437-9676 
t-28-lf 

OUSLEY 
CONCRETE 

CONSTRUCTION 
COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL 

Bldg. Floors • Sidewalks 
Footers • Driveways 

Patios • Basements 

Exposed Pea Gravel 

• Free Estimates • 

JAMES OUSLEY 
Phone 886-8373 

TROY'S 
CABINET 
CENTER 
US 23, lvel, Ky. 

6-3-tf 

Stock or Custom·Built Cabinets 

Kitchen Cabinets, Vanities 
Tappan Appliances 

on Display 

Free Estimates Discount Prices 

Call 478-5344 
1-14 If. 

HENRY LAFFERTY ROOFING 
Roofing Jotis of all types, large or small. 

886-3597. 

Bile Into o,a,aer,lli,, 
High earnings plus College Tuition Program 

Cash prizes for students 
A company respected nationwide 

Summer Jobs 
May • June • JuiJ • August 
High earnings plus College 

Tuition Program 
Cash pnzes for students. 

CALL: 
874-9041 

A company respected natiomnde 
No experience necessary 

Part time · Full time 
Flexible hours - Car helpful 

EEO M/F 
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SElL IT RIST.I 
BUY IT RlfiNT.I 

FOR RENT- Completely remodeled 
two bedroom apts., dishwasher , 
disposal, ref., range, washer and dryer 
connections, wall-towall carpet, walk­
in closets, heat and a.c., playground, 
private balconies beautifully land­
scaped. Call 789-6072. Quail Hollow 
Apts . 6-17-tf. 

INSTRUCTOR OF NURSING V ACAN­
CY. Clinical experience and B.S.N. re-

. quired, Master's degree preferred. 
Ten-month position. Apply by Monday, 
July 6, 3 p.m. contact FRANCES 
JOHNSON, Prestonsburg Community 
College, at (606) 886-3863. An Equal Op­
portunity Employer. 6-24-4t. 

MOBILE HOME FOR RENT-Two 
bedroom. Behind Ron's Bargain Barn, 
6 miles west on Mt. Parkway, phone 
886-1551. 6-24-tf. 

COMMERCIAL OR RETAIL PRO­
PERTY, OFFICE SPACES for rent 
or lease. On N. Lake Drive, close to 
downtown Prestonsburg, Ky. Parking. 
up to 10,000-sq. ft. available im­
mediately. Phone 606-886-6900, Ronald 
Frasure. 6-24-tf. 

MONTGOMERY WARD CATALOG 
AGENCY FOR SALE in Prestonsburg. 
Perfect for family operation. Small in­
vestment-established business. Be 
your own boss. Opportunity to earn a 
good living. Serious inquiries only, in 
person. 406 North Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg. 6-24-tf. 

FOR SALE- Used furniture, Maytag 
wringer washers , refrigerators , 
ranges, automatic washers and dryers. 
All appliances guaranteed. Eastern 
Trading Post, phone 358-9617 . 

6·17·81. -pd. 

HEY, LOOK! We repair Maytag 
wringer washers, refrigerators, 
ranges, and dryers. Free pickup and 
delivery. Call358-9617. 6·17-Bt. ·pd. 

MOVING? Let us move you. Clean, ef­
ficient, careful service. Call 358-9617. 

6·17-St. ·-pd. 

FOR SALE-2-horse, horse trailer, 
tandem axle. Call285-3874. 7-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE-SPINET-CONSOLE 
PIANO. Bargain. Wanted:Responsible 
party to take over low monthly 
payments on spinet piano. Can be seen 
locally. Write credit manager: P . 0. 
Box 537, Shelbyville, Ind . 46176. 

7-1-3t-pd. 

APPALOOSAS FOR SALE- Phone. 
606-928-9941. 7-1-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE- 3-bedroom ho,me with ex­
tra lot and income property at 
McDowell. Call before 11 a.m. or after 
8 p.m . Also 4-piece living room suite, 
two years old, $350. Call 377-6881. 

7-1-4t-pd. 

CARPENTER WORK, plumbing , 
painting. Free estimates. Reasonable 
price. ~all285-3594 anytime. 7-1-4t-pd. 

TRAILER LOT for rent in West Gar­
rett. With city water, gas and electric. 
Call Linda Chaffins, 358-4045. 7-l-4t. 

• MANUFACTURER'S 1st QUALITY 
ALL STEEL BUILDING. 
52X125X25/20X14 Door $15 ,995 -
36X72X18/12X14 Door $6,995 Limited 
offer . 1-800-821-7700 Ext. 803 or 
417-736-2183. 7-l-4t. 

MASONRY WORK- Specializing in 
fireplaces. Also, brick or stone work. 
All work guaranteed. Phone 297-6228. 

7-1-7t-pd. 

HOUSE FOR RENT- Located at 
Hueysville. Call 358-9760. Larry· 

·Dudleson. 6-10-tf. 

FOR RENT- unfurnished apt. located 
minutes from Prestonsburg or Paints­
ville at Van Lear, fully panelled and 
carpeted, all kitchen applianc~s, thr_ee 
rooms, all utilities but electnc pa1d, 
call after 5:30, 789-7771. Kretzer Apts. 

7-1-tf. 
FOR SALE- Baby clothes, birth to size 
4. Call874-9749. Shena Shell. 7-1-2t. 

LEXINGTON APARTMENT FOR 
LEASE- Duplex, 2 bedroom, ' Jiving 
room, equipped kitchen, laundry, very 
nice. Ca11886-2944. 2l-pd. 

FOR SALE- Pontoon boat, with 1975 
Chrysler motor. Call after 6, phone 
886-3072. CLYDE MEADOWS, R 1, 
Box 89, Prestonsburg. 7 1·2L 

ANTIQUE FURNITURE- Approx. 35 
pieces. Phone 377-6270, McDowell. 

7-1-2t-pd. 

LOTS- CABIN for sale on Cave Run 
Lake. Phone 289-5994 or 289-7498. Les 
Coatney . 6-lO-tf. 

FOR SALE- 1977 28' Landau Pontoon 
with 75 h.p. motor, upper sundeck ac­
cessible by aluminum ladder for sun­
bathing. Completely equipped with 
four couches and table. Docked at Jen­
ny Wiley main boat dock. Jim Ham-
mond, 886-2376. 6-10-tf. 

FOR SALE- 27' Driftcrui ser 
Houseboat. Sleeps six. Completely 
equipped with inboard 14? h.p. V-8 
engine. Blue and white. Trailer mclud­
ed. Jim Hammond, 886-2376. 6-10-tf. 

FOR SALE- Great Buy! ! 18' cabin 
cruiser , complete with motor and 
trailer . Jim Hammond, 886-2376. 

6-17-lf 

NOTICE TO 
ADVERTISERS 

All classified ads scheduled 
for only one week, must be 
paid In advance. All classl· 
fled ads with only telephone 
numbers must be paid In ad· 
vance. 

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES 

lOc Per word, If paid In advance 
15c Per word on charge account 

($2.00 minimum) 
Display classified advertising 
$3.00 per column Inch. 
Deadline for ads: 4 p.m. Monday. 

ARE YOU PLANNING to buy or sell 
real estate? Can Emma Lou Martin for 
all your real estate needs. Nunnery 
Realty, 886-6464 or 874-2955. 6-17-tf. 

LOT FOR SALE at Stanville. Corner 
lot between Old U.S. 23 and new Betsy 
Layne High School road. Call 478-9411. 

6-17-5t-pd. 

CEMENT MIXERS FOR RENT­
Lloyd's Hardware S & T, · p~ne 
886-2298. 4-15-tf. 

LAWN .ROLLER FOR RENT- Lloyd's 
Hardware S & T, phone 886-2298. 4-15-tf. 

LAWN SEED AND FERTILIZER 
SPREADER FOR RENT-Lloyd 's 
Hardware S & T, phone 886-2298. 4-15-tf. 

100% TAX DEDUCTIBLE SENTRY 
SAFES- Lloyd's Hardware S & T, 
phone 886-2298. 4-15-tf. 

COURIER JOURNAL PAPER route 
open in Prestonsburg. Gro~s profit $~30 
week. Cash bond reqwred. If m­
terested call1-800-292-6568. 6-24-31. 

FOR SALE- 3-year-old, 2-bedroom 
house in West Van Lear, Kentucky. 
Nice neighborhood. If interested, call 
606-789-6183, weekdays , 6-11 p.m. 

6-3-6t-pd. 

LOTS FOR SALE- Cave Run Lake, 
one-half, three-fourths, or acres. Call 
289-5994, 289-7498 or 289-5128, Les 
Coatney. 3-11-tf. 

FOR SALE-Cottage Style House, 2 
bedroom, new furnace, water heater, 
wiring, storm windows, 2 car gara~e, 
down town Prestonsburg . Pnce 
$39,500. Days 886-6822, nights 886-6486. 

. 6-17-4t-pd. 

FOR SALE- Used furniture and ap­
pliances, Silversto~e cookware, also 
other items. 2 miles up Arkansas 
Creek. Phone 285-3549. Mrs. Way!le 
Salisbury, Rt. No. 2, Box 37, Martm, 
Ky. 41649. . 5-13-tf. 

ANYONE INTERESTED in use of 
New Allen Park facilities, please con­
tact Ralph Little, 886-6490. 4-15-tf. 

MAy I ASSIST YOU in finding that cer­
tain house lot farm or commercial 

' ' k. f ? F property you've been loo mg or. or 
all your real estate needs, call EMMA 
LOU MARTIN , Nunnery Realty, 
886-6464 or 874-2955. 6-17-tf. 

FOR SALE- 14-room split-level; 
carpet; low-cos t gas heat and 
fireplace; located at Topmost. Call 
447-2933. 7-1-2t. 

FOR SALE- '78 Toyota Celica, 42,000 
miles, new tires, air, 5-speed, black 
and silver, $3,700. Call days 285-3243, 
nights 285-3184. George Barnette. 

7-l -2t. 

OFFICE SPACE FOR 
RENT- Located upstairs, 404 S. Lak_e 
Drive. Call874-9098, after 6p.m. Harns 
Rentals. 7-1-3t. 
APARTMENTS FOR RENT- Two 
one-bedroom apartments, $175 p~r 
month plus utilities. Security deposit 
required . Call 874-909ts, after 6 p.m. 
Harris Rentals. 7-1-3t. 

FOR RENT-Executiv~ apartme~ts, 
New Allen 2-br., upstairs apt.; fire­
place, dishwasher, laundry facilities, 
central heat and air, cable TV ; conve­
nient to schools, shopping facilities, 
and Stumbo Park ; located on 4-lane 
U.S. 23, midway between Pikeville and 
Prestonsburg ; suitable for one or two 
persons; no pets. Jim Hammond, 
886-2376. 7 -8-tf. 

FOR SALE- Service station equip­
ment and supplies. Call886-2818 after 5 
p.m. John Wallen: 3-25-tf. 

FOR RENT OR LEASE- Office space : 
'3600 s q . ft. , locat ed down~own 
Prestonsburg, on ground lloor . Glenn 
Allen, phone886-3852. 3-l!l-tf. 

FOH SALE- Over 30 models or Log 
Home Kits . Dia l 832-4702 or "'rite 
Rustic Log Homes, Hox 21:! Jrnkins. 
Ky. 4I:i3"i . 2-25·11. 

PROFESSIONAL INTERIOR AND 
EXTERIOR PAINTING-, ROOFING. 
Free estimates. Reasonable rates. 
References on request. Call Estill 
Newsome, 377-6628. 4-l 5-tf. 

MOBILE HOME AND HJ:<~ AVY 

EQUIPMJ:<:NT MOV l NG - ~ ick 
Shepard. phone 35H-4147. 7-17-t f. 

NOW OPEN-Peggy's Attic, Rich­
mond P laza, Prestonsburg. Clothes for 
children, juniors and misses. Savmgs 
up to 50%. Open on Saturdays only, 
10-4. 4-15-tf . 
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OWENS MUSIC CENTER-High 
quality-low prices. Excellent service. 
Phone886-8337. 1-16-tf. 

NEED A GIFT for the girl who has 
everything? Give her a gift certificate 
from Slim-Way Exercise & Health 
Club, Inc. Phone874-2800. 9-17-tf. 

LIGHT FIXTURES 112 price at GOBLE 
LUMBER CO., Phone 874-9281. 4-11-tf. 

Interior and exterior Porter paint. 
1 ooo colors to choose from. BEN 
FRANKLIN STORE, phone 886-2169, 
Prestonsburg. 5-16-tf. 

TREATED utility poles, 18 ft. , 20 ft. 
and 25 ft. lengths. Also fence posts at 
GOBLE LUMBER CO., Phone 
874-9281. 4-11-tf. 

CHAIN LINK FENCE- Residential 
and commercial. Prestonsburg Fenc­
ing Company. Call Henry Setser, phone 
886-2073 or 886-8020. 4-30-tf. 

WATCH REPAIR-If you want the 
best job, bring watch repairs and 
jewelry repairs to WRIGHT BROS. 
JEWELERS. 11-12-tf. 

MOVING SERVICE - Anywhere 
within 300-mile radius. Phone 377-6935. 
Harliss Hall. 2-11-tf. 

PERMA-SHIELD Anderson windows. 
All styles. 20 percent off regular price 
at GOBLE LUMBER CO., phone 
874-9281. 4-11-tf. 

CUSTOM-MAD~ drapes and matching 
bedspreads by R: W. Norman and Mc­
Canless . Measured to fit. BEN 
FRANKLIN STORE, phone 886-2169, or 
Sally Goebel, phone 886-2657. 5-16-tf. 

PRESTONSBURG DRIVE-IN Now 
looking for females for cook and 
counter help. Call 886-9914, ask for 
Nora. ' 4-29-tf. 

HOUSE FOR SALE- Three-bedroom, 
bath, living and dining room, kitchen, 
enclosed back porch, sun 'room, front 
porch. West Prestonsburg, call886-1004 
or 886-6136. 6-24-4t-pd. 

EXPERIENCED CARPENTER . 
Reasonable rates on panelling, win­
dows, doors, etc. BERT RATLIFF, 
Ivel, Ky., phone 478-2230. 12-10-tf. 

FOR SALE-1979 Ford Fiesta. Clean, 
low mileage. $3,250. Lisa Parker, 
886-1967 between 5:30 p.m. -7 p.m. 

4-1-U. 

LOTS FOR SALE- Ready for building. 
Gas and city water available. Call 
886-2818 after 5 p.m. John Wallen. 

8-20-tf. 
FOR SALE- Used air conditioners, 
freezers. Trade ins, reposessed, all 
guaranteed. Ron's Bargain Barn. Open 
Sun. 12-5, Phone886-1551. 6-17-tf. 

FOR SALE-14' x 70 ' mobile home, 
three bedrooms, one and a half baths, 
all electric, central heating, partially 
furnished. Please call 886-1204 after 
•five p.m . . 7-1-3t-pd.o 

ARE YOU PLANNING to buy or sell 
real estate"~ Call Emma Lou Martin for 
all your real estate needs . Nunnery 
Realty 886-6464 or 874-2955. 6-17-tf. 

TREE TRIMMING and CUT­
TING-Call day or night, 874-958l, 
Troy Jarrell. 6-3-tf. 

FOR SALE- Church house on large lot 
located between Paintsville and 
Prestonsburg. Call 789-3904 or 886-3904. 
Bob Music. 6-3-tf. 

FOR SALE- 27-inch Sears double wall 
oven . In excellent condition. Call 
874-9528. 7-l -2t-pd. 

FOR SALE- 1972 12x60 Lexington 
Mobile Home, 2 bedrooms with large 
bath and kitchen-dining room. $6500. 
Call886-1978 after 5:00p.m. 7-1-3t-pd. 

CANOE FOR SALE- $325, call 
377-6606. 7-8-2t-pd.' 

FOR SALE-furniture, television, 
clothes, and assorted household items. 
886-6294. 7-8-2t-pd. 

WANTED TO TAKE OVER payments 
on trailer, furnished, two or three 
bedrooms. Ronnie Mullins. 377-2810. 

7-8-2t. 

FOR SALE- 1972 Bi.Jick LeSabre 
4-door Sedan, 455-cu. in. engine, fac­
tory air, C.B. radio, runs good, g_ood 
tires with good studded snow t!r~s 
mounted on extra wheels, body condi­
tion better than average. One owner 
and well maintained. Price $600.00. 
Fred Meece, 238 Trimble Branch, 
Prestonsburg. Phone 886 -6196. 

7-8-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE- 1979 TOYOTA COROLLA 
$3800. Might trade for older model 
truck, 886-8002. 7-8-2t-pd. 

TRIMMING and spraying shrubbery. 
14 years' experience. Call 886-8974. 

7-8-2t. 

FOR SALE- trailer, 14 x 65, and two 
lots, 200 foot front. 4 miles above Mar­
tin. Phone 285-9150. 7-8-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE- 1975 15-foot runabout with 
1976 75-horsepower Johnson Sting~r. 
Has walk-through windshield, hfe 
jackets and covers to completely 
enclose. Price, $1995. Phone 886·6967 
after 5 p.m . 7-8-31-pd. 

FOH. SALE- 1979 Crimson trail~~ · 
14x70 three bedrooms, 1 11~ baths, utJh­
ty shed front porch, 12x12 deck. 
$17,000. Call 886-9803, David Paulson. 

7-1-2t. 

TRAILER FOR RENT- 1977 model , 
three bedroom, excellent condition, on 
private Jot. Billy D. Wallen, 874-8061. 

7-1-2t. 

POP-UP 'CAMPER for sale- ref. , 
stove, sink, sleeps six, $700, 358-9581, 
Terry Slone. 7-l-2t. 

WORK NEEDED - A dependable 
teenager will do yard work, odd jobs 
for you. 886-9281. 7-I-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-12 case pop cooler, ex· 
cellent condition, used very little, new, 
cost over $800. Will sell $400. 285-3656 or 
886-6328. 7-1-2t-pd. 

ONE YEAR OLD American Drew din­
ing room table with leaves. Solid Oa~ . 
Six upholstered chairs, excellen~ condi­
tion. Must sell, ~950. Mary P1ckrell, 
886-1969. 7-1-2t. 

FOR SALE- Ten clothes washers and 
ten dryers, used coin-operated com­
mercial laundromat type. Call 
478-9401, or write P. 0. Box 38, Harold, 
Ky., 41635. 7-1-2t. 

TRAILER LOT for rent at Stanville, 
Ky.· Nice shade trees and storage 
house. Call478-5297. 7-1-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-New 11-h.p. Briggs & 
Stratton motor. Vertical shaft, electric 
starter. Also Western saddle, double 
girth. Excellent condition. Phone 
358-3553. 7-l -2t-pd. 

FOR RENT - Trailer space in 
Stephens Trailer Park . DAVE 
STEPHENS. Phone 886-6191. 7-1-2t-pd. 

FOR LEASE- Old WPRT radio station 
building. DAVE STEPHENS. Phone 
886-6191. 7-1-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE- Matched sets, 3 woods, 9 
irons of Wilson Top-Flight Golf Clubs 
with cart. 3 piece white bed room suite. 
Phone 886-3632. lt-pd. 

FOR RENT-two bedroom trailer at 
Cliff, partly furnished, air conditi~ned, 
deposit and references reqUired. 
Couples only. Call Lynn Garrett at 
886-8704. 7-1-2t. 

LAND FOR SALE-12 acres or more 
on Mink. Branch. 32x42 footer, 12 inches 
wide X 18 inches deep. 12 x 12 block 
pump house with 4-inch concrete floor 
and 40-ft. drilled well. 300 X 150 level 
land. $25,000. 478-5874 or 587-2278. 
Duane L. Hall. 7-1-2t. 

FOR SALE-18-ft. Starcraft cabin 
crufser. 115 h.p. Johnson outboard 
motor. Includes trailer and ski equip­
me"t. $2,500, firm. Call 886-6201. 

\ 7-l-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE- Jeep CJ-5. $2,800. For 
more information call 886-6201. 

7-1-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-School bus converted to 
motor home. Rebuilt motor, sleeps six. 
Very good condition. Asking $3,000. 
Phone 478-9792. 7-l-2t-pd. 

PAY CASH and save up to 40% on 
household furniture. Pick it out 
yourself at large wholes~le war_eh?use. 
You haul it or we dehver withm 50 
miles of Paintsville. Interested? Call 
Quentin Terry collect. 789-5832 for par­
ticulars. 6-24-31. 

GERMAN SHEPHERD PUPPIES for 
sale. Male. See Garnis or Phyllis Mar­
tin, phone 358-9178, Garrett. 6-24-3t-pd. 

FOR ~ALE-Trailer and 6 acres land 
on Rt. 1210 between Martin and David. 
If interested, call285-3866. 6-24-4t-pd. 

HOUSE FOR SALE- Full size base­
ment, five rooms and bath, 285-3809, 
Mack Hagans. 6-24-4t. 

FOR RENT- trailer lot near R & S 
Body shop, approximately one mile 
north of Allen. Couple only, no pets. 
ElizabethL. Turner, 874-2587. 6-24-tf. 

FOUR BUILDING LOTS FOR 
SALE- Commercial or-residential, out 
of flood, city water, TV cable, and gas, 
on Parkway, five. miles west of 
Prestonsburg on 114. Lowell Sammons. 
874-2181 or after 8, call874-2656. 6-24-5t. 

THREE ACRES for lease at Stanville, 
500 feet off US 23 on Mare Creek Road. 
Call 478-5700. Scalf Engineering Co. 

6-24-tf. 

WILL CARE for children in my home 
in Auxier. Call Nell Valentine at 
886-8112. 6-24-tf. 

OPEN YOUR OWN retail app~rel 
shop. Offer the latest in je~ns, dem'!ls 
and sportswear. $14,850.00 mcludes m­
ventory, fixtures, etc. Complete Store! 
Open in as little as 2 weeks anyw?ere m 
u. s. A. (Also infants and ch!ldrens 
shop). Call SUE, TO_LL FREE 
1-800-874-4780. lt-pd. 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Two miles from Prestonsburg. Good 
road, out of flood area. One year old, 
good water, 1 Y, acres, 1, 700 feet of 
floor space, three large bedrooms, two 
baths, kitchen, dining room, washroom, 
walk-in closet, foyer, sliding patio 
doors to deck 16 ft. x 33 ft. , living 
room, air-conditioner, dishwasher, 
electric heat, built-in oven and range. 
Only $54,800. 886-9233 after 6 p.m. 

7· 1·61 ·pd . 

HOUSE .FOR RENT- 1 child ac­
cepted; no pets; must be employed. 
References required. 285-3069. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE-water filter and maple 
desk. Gayle Burchett, 874-9087 after 5. 

7-8-2t. 

FOR RENT, trailer lot, 112 acre, three 
miles from Prestonsburg city limits, 
city water, TV cable, Gayle Burchett, 
874-9087 after 5. 7-8·2t. 

FOR SALE - 530 Case backhoe 
gasoline engine, good condition, $5,900; 
and 65 Chevy 60 series, eight ft. dump, 
$1,595. 886-9285. 7-8-2t-pd. 

THREE- FAMILY YARD SALE-at 
Maytown, end of bridge, clothes, 
dishes, furniture, tapes, records and 
lots of items. Begins Monday, July 13 
and will run two weeks, Monday thru 
Friday. Opal Hall, 285-3954. 7-8-2t. 

WANT TO BUY used alto saxophone. 
Contact Don or Viola Fraley, Hi Hat. 

7-8-2t. 

FOR SALE- 1979 Kawasaki KX 250, 
excellent condition. Under 200 miles. 
$600 or best offer . Contact 447-2762 or 
874-2579. 7-8-2tpd. 

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY 
AVAILABLE for low-priced reinforced 
concrete or corrugated metal, coated 
or uncoated drainage pipe. In most in­
stances our driver can unload pipe 
from ~ trailer equipped with an 
automatic unloader. We also have in 
stock plastic pipe in sizes 4" thru 12" at 
a very reasonable price. Plant is open 
5lf.! days each week. Call Highway 
Drainage Pipe, Inc., at A/C 
606-498·3658, Monday thru Fr~day, or 
visit the plant on Hwy. 11, 1h mile south 
of Mt. Sterling, Ky. 7-8-4t-pd. 

BUILDING LOTS FOR SALE at 
Woodland Heights, three miles from 
Prestonsburg near East Point. City 
Water, call 502-223-1844 after 6 p .m. 
Jean Blackburn. 7-8-4t. 

THREE BEDROOM furnished house 
for rent at Hueysville, with gas, elec­
tricity , and water furnished. $300 
month, security deposit required . Call 
Feely Prater at 358-4572 or 251-3855. 

7-8-2t. 

APART.MENT FOR RENT-All 
utilities paid. $300 per month. Call 
886-6568 or 886-1368 after 5. lt. 

BUILDING LOTS FOR SALE-close to 
Prestonsburg. City water, instant 
financing,· small down payments, no 
waiting for credit approval. 886-6900 
day, 886-6791 nights. Also 1600 sq. _ft. 
house with carport. Finance on low m­
terest county bond money. lt. 
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TWO PlWFESSIONAL-SIZE POOL 
TABLES FOR SALE-Class A-1 condi­
tion. $625 each. Playhouse Poolroom. 
Call886-1744. 7-8-3t. 

OTTIS SLONE DOES backhoe work, 
installs septic tanks, does dozer work, 
and hauls fill dirt. Call886-8910. 7-8-4t. 

FOR RENT-Two-bedroom furnished 
trailer on Middle Creek Road. Phone 
874-9558. Don Holbrook. 7-8-tf. 

FOR RENT-Two-bedroom trailer, 
chalet and one-bedroom apartment. 
All air-conditioned. No pets. Security 
deposit and lease required. CARLOS 
E. NEELEY, Phone 886-3565. 7-8-tf. 

LAND FOR SALE-Three acres plus 
on Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek. 
Also, bake cakes for special occasions. 
Phone 886-8222. lt-pd. 

GENERAL CLEANER NEEDED to 
work local area, part-time, evenings. 
Call, collect, (606) 253-1304. Equal Op­
portunity employer. lt-pd. 

SURPLUS JEEPS, CARS and 
TRUCKS available. Many sell under 
$200! Call 312-742-1143, Ext. 2536 for in­
formation on how to purchase. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE-House on river bank lot at 
Gable-Roberts . Call 886-6792 for ap­
pointment. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE-1980 Pontiac Phoenix, 
five door, A.C., cruise control, front 
wheel drive, tape player, luggage rack. 
$6,100.00, 358-4007 after 6. lt-pd. 

THREE FAMILY YARD 
SALE-Saturday, Sunday, July 11-12,9 
till 4. Glassware, distes, ceramics, 
lamps, clothing, many household 
items. Cross Banner bridge and turn 
left to Pauline's Beauty Shop. 1t. 

FOR SALE- 600 Ford Farm Tractor, 
in excellent running condition, good 
tires, mechanically sound. Must see to 
appreciate. After 5:00 p.m . Call 
886-6626. lt-pd. 

FOR RENT- Furnished apartment in 
Prestonsburg. One bedroom. No pets. 
Security deposit, $100. Call 886-6320. 

DOZER 
FOR HIRE 

lt-pd. 

NEW MACHINE-WILL WORK 
7 DAYS PER WEEK 

REASONABLE RATES. 
PHONE 886-9551 
Call between 6:00-10:00 p.m. 

7-8-2\.·pd 

. REDUCED! CHO' ... t'\LOCATION REDUCED! 
Yours as owner of this ren ~~\.V.,-room home with fireplace. Only two 
bloc}l.s from downtown Pres ... nsburg. $38,800. 

READY TO BUILD 
Still time to qualify for Floyd County bond loan when you build on this 
large lot near Clark School. 

CUSTOM BUlL T-NEW , 
Bi-level, four-bedroom home with over 3,600-sq. 'ft. of living area. Built-in 
kitchen , stereo intercom and central vacuum system. Large family room 
with fireplace. Two-car finished garage with work area. Situated on 
large lot in May's Branch. 

MORE TIME THAN MONEY? 
With a little work this 5-room concrete block house in Dwale can t>e yours 
for $10,500. City water and gas available on this 50'x 100' lot. 

ACTION 
PROPERT-IES 

Bill Gibson, Broker 886-3804 
rTJ An Interna tional Network o f Independent Rea l Estate Brokers ™ 
~.,c: Gallery o f Homes. Inc - 1981 · 
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WANTED-good home for three kit­
tens two pure white, one calico and 
mother pure white. All are beautiful. 

· Will work for their keep, kittens about 
two months old. Will give separately or 
together to good home. Call 886-3137. 

lt-pd. 

Penalties Imposed 
On Mine Violations 

A NOTE OF THANKS 
The family of George W. Fraley 

wishes to thank our neighbors and 
friends who helped in any way upon the 
death of our father. We deeply ap­
preciate the flowers, food and help. We 
thank the ministers of the Salisbury 
Regular Baptist Church, and Don 
Fraley, Jr. for their words of comfort, 
and a special thanks to Hall Funeral 
Home for its friendly and efficient ser­
vice. 

HIGHLAND TERRACE APARTMENTS . . 

APARTMENT LIVING FOR 
THE ELDERLY AND THE HANDICAPPED. 

SOME APARTMENTS 
STILL AVAILABLE 

HOUSE FOR SALE-in Prestonsburg. 
Five rooms, 112 baths. $28,000. Call 
886-9460. Lon Jarrell. 7-8-2t. 

FOR SALE-19'n Corvette. White with 
brown interior , automatic. Call 
886-1296 or 789-4265 after 6 p.m. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE-1974 Gremlin, six 
cylinder, $500. Call , after 6 p.m. , 
886-8356. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE OR RENT-14 x 70 trailer, 
two bedrooms, two baths, 16 x 20 living 
room , front porch, large private lot. 
Also a 1979, 750 K Honda motorcycle, 
low mileage, excellent condition. Also, 
avocado, 30-inch range top. Phone 
377-6981. lt-pd. 

HELP WANTED- Male or female . 
The Lexington Herald needs carrier in 
Prestonsburg. Profit is aproximately 
$500 monthly, plus $150 transportation 
allowance. Call886-3552. It. 

FOR SALE-One pair custom made 
off-white antique satin drapes , 168x90 
with pinch pleated valance. Call 
886-3405. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE- One pair white pinch 
pleated sheers 140 x 69. Call 886-3405. 

lt-pd. 

HOUSE FOR RENT- Downtown 
Prestonsburg . Two-bedroom. 
Reference and security deposit re­
quired. $250 a month plus utilities. 
Phone 886-2959, days; 886-3487 or 
886-2918, nights . lt-~d. _______ .. ,_ .. ___ _ 

FRANK BLACKBURN 
& SON 

MARTIN, KY. 

• .BLOCK • BRICK 
• FOUND A -:-IONS 

• CONCRETE. • WALKS 
• FOOTERS • FLOORS 

• ALL TYPES OF 
MASONRY WORk 

285-3403 

ARCHER PARK 
THANKS 

MERCHANTS 

~-K- If 

Archer Park would like to ex­
press its gratitude to the 
following merchants, who do­
nated prizes for the Annual 4 of 
July Fun Day: Piggly Wiggly, 
Rose Drug, Pizza Hut, Pic-Pac, 
Herrin-Johnson, Sundry Store, 
Dairy Cheer, Ray Howard Fur­
niture, WPRT, Earl Castle's 
Jewelry, Cox's, Clyde Burchett 
Jeweler, Korner Drug, Thomas 
Hereford Co., Francis Stores, 
Bath and Linen Closet, Hobbs. 

I I_ 

Civil penalties levied in May and 
June by the state Department for 
Natural Resources and Environmental 
Protection for violations of state sur­
face mining and reclamation re­
quirements totaled $1.1 million. 

Penalties were levied against four 
coal companies and three individuals. 

In orders filed with the department's 
Office of General Counsel, the largest 
penalty, $399,000, was assessed against 
Geary Brothers Coal Co., of Owens­
boro. The company's $26,250 bond on 
the Butler county site was also ordered 
forfeited . 

The company was fined for failure to 
backfill and grade the site, improper 
topsoil handling, failure to properly 
construct a haul road and for con­
tamination of topsoil with toxic 
materials . 

Big Delta Minerals, Inc ., of Hart­
ford , was assessed a $100,000 penalty 
for violations on its 148-acre mining 
site in Ohio county. The company was 
fined for failure to backfill and grade 
the site, removal of reclamation equip­
ment prior to completion of reclama­
tion, and violation of surface-mining 
regulations and statutes. 

The mining company and its owner, 
Jerry Driskell, were a lso barred from 
engaging in further mining activities in 
Kentucky. 

A civil penalty of $100,000 was levied 
against Rope Coal Corp. of Williams­
burg, for surface mining violations on 
its 12-acre site in Ohio county. The cor­
poration was fined for failure to 
backfill and grade , removal of 
reclamation equipment prior to com­
pletion of reclamation and seeding and 
mulching activities. 

Rope Coal's performance bond of 
$16,500 was also ordered revoked and 
applied to site reclamation costs. 

Mideastern Construction and Coal 
Corp., of Corbin, was assessed a $15,000 
penalty for alleged failure to complete 
reclamation of its 50-acre Laurel coun­
ty mining site. The corporation's 
$25,000 bond was also ordered revoked 
and applied to site reclamation costs. 

Pike Resurfacing Job 
Awarded at $101,712 

The state Department of Trans­
portation has awarded eight contracts 
totaling $472,000 for resurfacing pro­
jects in the state. 

Adams Cons truction Corp., of 
Pikeville, received a $101,712 contract 
for patching 5.4 miles of U.S. 23 and U. 
S. 119, the Pikeville-Jenkins Road. 

The department awarded a $15,031 
contract for resurfacing four-tenths of 
a mile of French Avenue in Win­
chester_ 

The remaining six contracts were for 
resurfacing rural secondary roads in 
Knox, Laurel , Christian, Butler and 
Allen counties. 

Receives B. A. Degree 
Christine M. Ross, of Pres tonsburg, 

received a B.A. degree in environmen­
tal conservation at recent commence­
ment exercises a t Berea College, 
Berea, Ky. 

The d~mghter of Mrs. B. F. Dunn, she 
is a graduate of Oak Ridge High 
School, Oak Ridge, Tennessee. In the 
Berea College labor program, in which 
all s tudents work 10 hours weekly, she 
was employed by the Settlement In­
stitutions of Appalachia , Inc. 

ABOVE-GROUND POOLS! 
(SEVERAL SIZES IN STOCK) 

16x32-FT. POOL !WITH EXPANDABLE BOTTOM) 

• WE ALSO SPECIALIZE 
IN IN-GROUND SWIMMING 
POOLS BY SPARTAN 

• SEE US FOR BIO-GUARD 
CHEMICALS 

• COMPLETE LINE OF LAWN FURNI­
T~RE & POOL SUPPLIES 

Open 9-5, Monday thru Saturday 
• PHONE 358-9142 BOX 97 EASTERN 

locfled Six Minutes from Martin and Two 

A civil penalty of $203,000 was levied 
against Felon Coleman and C & R Min­
ing Co., of Pikeville. The penalty was 
assessed for violations on the 2.2 acre 
site in P ike county mined by C & R_ 

The company was fined for failure to 
post signs and markers at the mining 
site, failure to backfill and grade the 
site, failure to provide sediment con­
trol measures, improper topsoil handl­
ing and revegetation, and diverting 
material drainage patterns in violation 
of state statutes. 

Billy Lewis, of Neon, was assessed a 
$10,000 civil penalty for violation of sur­
face mining regulations. Lewis was fin­
ed for mining without a permit. 

A $162,000 civil penalty was levied 
against B. F. Holbrook, of Salyersville, 
for 15 alleged violations of Kentucky 
surface mining regulations. Holbrook 
was fined for failure to backfill, grade, 
seed and mulch four sites which he 
mined. Four cash bonds, totaling 
$22,400 were ordered forfeited as well. 

Troy Stidham Coal Co., Inc. of 
Ashland, was fined $25,000 for failure to 
complete reclamation in a timely man­
ner and leaving the mining sites in fur­
ther need of regrading, seeding and 
mulching. Surety and performance 
bonds posted by the company were 
ordered forfeited by the department. 

Civil penalties levied by the depart­
ment are ordered paid within 30 days of 
the signing of the order. Department 
officials, however, report that all 
penalties are not successfully col­
lected. 

CONTACT: JUliA M. MAY 
886-2717 

-------------·------------·-------·-·-----

Mine Service Company, Inc. a well established and growing industrial 
distributor serving the mining industry throughout the East Kentucky Coal 
Field for 63 years is now accepting written resumes for the following em­
ployment opportunities: 

1. Salesmen- Three to five years experience in selling to coal com­
panies and related b11sinesses. 

2. Branch Managers-Three to five years experience in branch 
management within the mining industry including pertinent 
educational background. 

3. Warehouse Supervisors-Three to five years experience in 
supervision of warehouse personnel associated directly with 
mine supplies and truck deliveries. 

4. Accountant-Degree in accounting. Initial job in auditing with 
future advancement. 

All wages and salaries are commensurate with ability and experience. 
Send written resume to Personnel Manager, Mine Service Company, Inc. 
Box 5005 Hazard, Kentucky 41701. No phone calls please. 

7-8-3l. 

------------------
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FLOYD CIRCUIT COURT 
SOL HUBBARD, Ext>cutor of tht> 
Estate of Malcolm Hubbard, Deceas­
ed, SOL HUBBARD, Committt>e for 
GEORGIA <BUB> HUBBARD. SOL 
HUBBARD, Individually. 

PLAINTWFS 
\'S. NOTICE OF SALE CR 4,958 

RICHARD HARMOND HUBBARD, 
JOE HUBBARD, JAMES BRUCE 
HUBBARD, AVONELL JOHNSON. 
TOM JOHNSON. her husband, 
GEORGIA <BUB> HUBBARD, 
GRACE BRANHAM, and FRANCES 
BRANHAM. 

DEFENDANTS 

By virtue of judgment and order of 
sale of the Floyd Circuit Court 
rendered at the Aprilll , term , 1980, in 
the above styled cause, I shall proceed 
to offer for sale at the Courthouse door 
in Prestonsburg, Kentucky , to the 
highest and best bidder, at public ac­
tion, on the 17th day of July, 1981, at 
10:00 o'clock, A.M., same being a day 
of the regular term of the Floyd Circuit 
Court, for cash or upon a credit of six 
(6) months, the following described 
property to-wit: 

The seven (7) following adjacent 
tracts of land located on the waters of 
the Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek, in 
Floyd County, Kentucky , embracing 
approximately two hundred and 
ninety-six (296) acres, as conveyed the 
late Malcolm Hubbard, by divers gran­
tors on divers dates, recorded in the 
Floyd County Clerk 's Office as shown 
and described below, viz: 

(1 ) 

That tract of unknown acreage con­
veyed on May 14, 1929, by John 
Calhoun, et ux, Minnie, in Deed Book 
82, page 291 , described as follows: 

"Beginning at a cliff on the right 
hand of Spurlock Creek thence running 
up the point and with the center of 
same to the top of the hill to H. H. Fitz­
patrick line ; thence with the top of the 
hill with said line to Lee Whitakers' 
line; thence with the top of the hill and 
said line to Malcolm Hubbard's line; 
thence down the point with the top of 
the hill to an old fence; thence on down 
the point with the same to the foot of 
the hill to the creek; thence across the 
creek and up the hill; to the county 
road ; thence with the county road 
down the creek to the sycamores; 
thence down and with the creek to the 
beginning. " 

It is understood that all mineral and 
mineral substances have heretofore 
been sold and is not meant to be con­
veyed by this deed." 

(2) 
That tract of unknown acreage con­

veyed on, November , 22, 1923, by John 
Calhoun, et ux, Minnie, in Deed Book 
71, page 203, described as follows : 

"Beginning at the county road on the 
line between Malcolm Hubbard and 
parties of the first part on the left hand 
side as you go up the creek ; thence a 
straight from the county road to a 
marked beech; thence to a black oak 
on the point a straight line from said 
beech ; thence up the point from said 
black oak to the top of the point to the 
line of James Stephens; thence down 
the ridge between the said Calhouns 
land and James Stephens land with his 
line to a poplar; thence a straight line 
to a county road opposite a small 
sycamore at the bank of the creek; 
thence with the county road back to the 
place of beginning. The mineral, coal, 
oil and gas is hereby reserved the same 
having heretofore been conveyed by 
parties not known to grantors." 

(3 ) 
That tract of unknown acreage con­

veyed by Commissioners Deed on 
September 30, 1915, in Deed Book 95, 
page 217, in lands of Wall Haywood, 
part of Lot 2 in the Lewis Haywood 
land, described as follows : 

"Beginning in the center of Spurlock 
Creek on Alex Stephens' line, known as 
the Hay's line; thence up the hill with 
said Stephens line to the George 
Haywood line, near Malcolm Hub­
bard's line on the west side of Spurlock 
Creek thence down the hill in an 
Easterly course with the George 
Haywood and the Malcolm Hubbard 
line to a branch of bushes in a drain 
where there stands a bunch of locust 
trees; thence a Northern course with 
Malcolm Hubbard's line to the first 
small drain to some rocks ; thence an 
Easterly course a straight line to the 
center of Spurlock Creek; thence a 
Southern course with the meanders of 
Spurlock Creek to the place of the 
beginning ." 

(4) 
That tract of one and one-half (1 12) 

acres conveyed on December 7, 1914, 
from Grover C. Miller, et ux , Dorcus, 
in Deed Book 44, page 21, excluding 
mineral ; described as follows : 

"Beginning at a stake on west side of 
Spurlock Creek; thence running west 
with the hill with the same line that 
was between George Haywood and W. 
H. Haywood deceased; to lower edge of 
first flat to a stake; thence north 
around the hill with lower edge of said 
flat to first small drain; thence down 
the hill with the said drain to a rock 
marked (Xl ; thence east to the creek 
to a stake ; thence up the creek and 
with the creek, as it now runs to the 
beginmng-containing one and one half 
acres -more or less ," Minerals ex­
cepted, as previously sold " 

(5) 
That tract of unhnown acreage con­

veyed on November 1, 1906, 
acknowledged January 15, 1910, by 
Commissioner's Deed in Deed Book 25, < 

page 296, Lot No. 3, in the lands of 
Lewis Haywood, described as follows : 

"Beginning at a hickory and black 
oak on top of the ridge at the back line, 
a corner of Lot No. 2, thence along the 
ridge S47' 35' E5 poles 14 links to a 
pine; S17' 15' E 9 poles S 78' 45' E 16 
poles to two chestnut oaks ; S 53' 30 E 10 
poles to a cross on a rock; S39' .15' E 9 
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poles and 8 links to a stake by a double 
chestnut oak; S 77' 50' W 16 poles to a 
black oak in gap; S 74' 30' E13 poles to a 
stake at a lower end of a large rock; S 
80' 30' E 7 poles to a hickory pine, spot­
ted oak and chestnut oak ; thence leav· 
ing the back line and running down the 
hill; S 44' 30' W 16 poles S66' 30' w 13 
poles and 14 links to a stake about two 
poles below a large rock in a drain; 
S47' 30' W 14 poles to a stake in drain 
S65' 45 ' W 6 poles and 61inks to a sugar 
at the upper forks of the branch; 
thence down the branch, S 87' W8 poles 
and 14links to a stake in said branch, N 
74' 15' W 26 poles to a beech on the Bank 
of the branch N 51 • 10 W 12 poles to 
stake; S72' 30' W 13 poles to a stake at 
the mouth of a drain corner of Lot No. 
2, thence up said drain with the lines of 
said lot. N 25' 30' 16 poles and 121inks to 
a stake 9 links South East from an ap­
ple tree on the bank of the drain N 13 E 
18 poles and 20 Jinks to a stake in the 
drain; N 26' 15' E 13 poles and Slinks to 
a stake in the drain N 52' 15' E 13 poles 
and 5 links to a stake in the drain N 52' 
10' ~ 33 1 2 poles to the beginnin~ . " 

(6) 
That tract of unknown acreage con­

veyed on November 1, 1906, 
acknowledged January 15, 1910, by 
Commissioner's Deed in Deed Book 25, 
page 293, lot No. 5 in the lands of Lewis 
Haywood, described as follows: 

"Beginning at a stake in the Creek at 
the mouth of a branch on the West side 
of said Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek, 
corner of Lot No. I, thence up the hill 
on the East side of the Creek with the 
lines of said lot; N48' E 33' poles to a 
white oak on the hill said; same course 
44 1 2 poles to an oak stump on top of the 
ridge at the back line; thence leaving 
the line of Lot No. 1 and running down 
the ridge S75' 30' W 9 poles and I9links 
to a black oak in a gap, N 75' W 13 ' 
poles and 8 links to a black oak near a 
rock; on a knob; thence down the hill 
S36' 40' W 23 1,2 poles to a white oak 
stump on a point, S 64' 30' W 48 poles 
crossing the creek to a stake in a drain; 
S 85' 35' W 25 poles to a stake on a point, 
N 81 • 30' W 21 poles to a small spotted 
oak on a point, S74' 50 W 22 poles and 8 
links to a stake by a chestnut oak, S 55' 
45' W 10 poles and 15links to a cross on 
a rock; S 31 • W 10 poles to a stake near 
a chestnut oak, S 48' W 251~ poles to a 
stake near a chestnut oak and black 
oak; S 3' 45' W 12 poles; S 9' E 8 poles to 
a rock on a high knob at the line of R. A. 
Harmon, thence down the ridge with 
said Harmon's line S 43' 45' E 12 poles 
to two small hickories and chestnut 
oak, S 58' E 12 poles and 16 links to a 
cross on a flat rock. S 65' E 26 poles to a 
stake in a low gap. S56' 30' E 9 poles 
and 7 links to a stake on small knob ; 
S74' 15' E 161'2 poles to a spotted oak on 
top of a point, corner between Mark 
Osborn and R. A. Harmon N 63' 20' E 4 
poles and 20 links to a lynn ; N 55' 30' E 
12 poles and 20 links to a cross on the 
upper end of a rock N 42' 15' E 7 poles 
and 19links to a black oak and beech, N 
31' 10' E 11 poles and 111inks in the line 
of Dock Meadows ; thence with said 
line N 26 E 9 poles and 20 links to a 
chestnut oak on a point ; E 5 poles and 
21 links to a white oak stump on a 
point; S 76' 15' E 14 poles to a hickory 
and large white oak stump by a fence; 
N 87' 20' E 18 1 2 poles to a stake in the 
creek; N 1 • 30' W 3 poles and 9 links to 
the beginning ." 

(7) 
That tract of unknown acreage con­

veyed on September 25, 1919, by Dock 
Meadows, et ux, Biddie, in Deed Book 
55, page 240, Lot No. I in the lands of 
Lewis Haywood described as follows: 

"Beginning at a stake in the center of 
the creek and up the mouth of the 
branch on the west side of Spurlock 
Creek thence up the hill on the east side 
of the creek with the line of Malcolm 
Hubbard to the top of hill to rock with 
CX) to line of heirs of H. W. Haywood 
dec thence down the hill with the said 
line to the creek thence down the creek 
to the beginning." 

The above contiguous tracts are 
described generally in this combined 
description: 

"Beginning at a point on the waters 
of Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek in 
Floyd County, Kentucky, a corner be­
tween Henry Ousley property the Ken­
tucky State Road No. 122 The Haymond 
Highway, and the Malcolm Hubbard 
property just above the mouth of the 
Jim Potter Branch, and thence in a 
southerly direction with the Henry 
Ousley line up the point to a knob on the 
ridge and with the ridge in a 
southeasterly direction with the Henry 
Ousley line to a corner of the Earl 
Ousley property and thence with the 
Earl Ousley property line along the 
ridge in a southeasterly direction to the 
Jack and Emma Sue Reynolds proper­
ty line and thence in a southeasterly by 
south direction with the Reynolds line 
along the ridge to a knob, the corner of 
the Frances Branham property as con­
veyed her by Commissioner's deed in 
this action of June 18, 1980 and with the 
westerly boundary of the property so 
conveyed to the original property line 
of Frances Branham and thence with 
the Frances Branham property line in 
a southwesterly by west direction to 
the waters of Spurlock Fork and thence 
in an upstream direction with the 
waters of Spurlock Fork to a corner of 
the Henry Meadors <Meadows> proper· 
ty and crossing the creek and with the 
Meadors line in a southwesterly direc­
tion up the point to a high knob, a cor· 
ner with Meadors, Hubbard and Miles 
A. Whitaker, and thence with the 
Whitaker line in a northwesterly direc· 
tion along the dividing ridge of 
Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek and the 
Left Fork of Middle Creek to a corner 
with Donald Tussey and with the 
Tussey line along the ridge in a north, 
by northwesterly direction to a corner 
with Clifford and Sally Jo Brown and 
thence with the Brown line along the 
ridge and thence in a north by nor· 

theasterly direction to the corner of the 
property line of H. D. Fitzpatrick, Jr. 
and Sally G. Clark, and thence in a nor­
theasterly direction with the line of 
Fitzpatrick and Clark and the ridg<' 
line in a meandering direction to a cor­
ner with James R. and Okie Miller at a 
small knob and thence in an easterly 
direction down the point to the corner 
of Henry Ousley and thence in a 
southerly direction with the Henry 
Ousley line to the point of beginning, 
embracing approximately 296 acres." 

There is excepted from this sale that 
certain tract or parcel of land known as 
the Darv Pitts place, lying and being 
on the waters of Spurlock Fork of Mid­
dle Creek , Floyd County, KY, and be­
ing the same land conveyed Malcolm 
Hubbard by Darvis Pitts and Frances 
Pitts, his wife, on March 11, 1935, as 
recorded in Deed Book 101, page 601, 
embracing 10 acres, more or less, and 
being the same land that was conveyed 
by Commissioner's Deed of June 18, 
1980 to Frances Branham, as recorded 
in Deed Book 248, page 376, on June 25, 
1980 in the Floyd County Clerk's Office, 
and described more particularly as 
follows, viz: 

Beginning at the branch near the 
residence of John Patton; thence runn­
ing northward with the line of Malcolm 
Hubbard, which is now witnessed by a 
paling and wire fence to the top of the 
hill; thence east with top of hill with 
land known as Oscar and Ella Miller 
Farm (which is now owned by Allen 
and Martha Ousley ) to the land of 
Malcolm Hubbard; and thence down 
the hill with the line of Malcolm Hub­
bard to the branch ; thence down the 
branch to the beginning. 

There is further excepted from this 
sale a parcel of one acre located on the 
waters of Spurlock Fork of Middle 
Creek in Floyd county, Kentucky and 
located between two drains across 
from the Malcolm Hubbard house and 
lying immediately between and bound­
ed by the road and creek, as marked 
off, which is to be kept as the Hubbard 
family cemetery and the use of which 
all of the children of Malcolm Hubbard 
have equal rights pursuant to the pro­
visions of the will of the late Malcolm 
Hubbard, as executed April 23, 1955 
and recorded in Will Book B, page 372, 
on March 21, 1962 in the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office. 

This property is being sold to settle 
the Estate of the late Malcolm Hub­
bard and to satisfy the costs of this ac­
tion, including costs of advertising of 
this sale and the fees and commissions 
for conducting this sale. 

There is to be included in this sale all 
of the mineral interests in this surface, 
belonging to the parties in this action. 

This property is sold subject to the 
usual easements, reservations, and 
restrictions of record. 

For the purchase price, the pur­
chaser must execute bond with approv­
ed surety or sureties, bearing legal in­
terest from the day of sale until paid 
and having the force and effect of a 
judgment with a lien retained upon 
said property as a further security. 
Bidders will be prepared to comply 
with these terms. 

Given under my hand, this 25th day 
of June, 1981. 

MARSHALL DAVIDSON 
Master Commissioner 

Floyd Circuit Court 

NOTICE 

7-1-3t. 

Sealed bids will be received at the of­
fice of the Floyd County Board of 
Education Prestonsburg, Kentucky un­
til 10:00 a.m . July 15, 1981 for fur­
nishing lunchroom food and supply 
items. Bid conditions and specifica­
tions may be obtained from Blanche E. 
Dingus. The board reserves the right to 
rejecf any or all bids. 

BLANCHE E. DINGUS 
Director 

Food Sevice 
Floyd County Schools 

7-1-2t. 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
CSuperseping "Notice to .Bidder~" 

published elsewhere m th1s 
newspaper. l 

The !<'loyd County Fiscal Court will 
accept sealed bids on the following : 

(1) Grader 
.Motorgrader with 12-ft. hydraulic 

shiftable mold board; operating weight 
approximately 29,000 lbs.; power shift, 
four-speed transmission; diesel engine 
approximately 150 h.p., four-wheel 
brakes, 24-volt starting system. 

The Bid will be less trade-in of one 
Galion Grader Model No. TSOOL, Serial 
No. IC-04847. Grader may be seen at 
the Floyd County Garage at Allen, Ky . 

Bids will be filed with the County 
Judge-Executive until July 8, 1981 at 
the hour of 9 a.m . The Floyd County 
Fiscal Court reserves the right to re· 
ject any and all bids filed. 

ADDEJ"•mUM TO ABOVE 
BID NOTICE 

(1 ) The Grader should be brand new 
curreilt production model Grader. 

(2) All controls and gauges should be 
in front of operator. 

(3) Lighting package- flashing 
amber light on top of cab, front 
headlights, turn signals/ stop and tail 
lights, slow speed vehicle signs on front 
and rear. 

(4) Full power steering hydraulic. 
(5) The four-speed power-shift trans­

mission should be with torque conver­
tor. 

(6l Fully enclosed deluxe ROPS cab 
with heater, defroster and wiper . 

(7) Specify delivery date on new 
grader. 

BILL WELLS 
County Judge-Executive 

7-l -2t. 
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.KENTUCKY 
AFIELD 

By JOHN WILSON 
The persistent rains of the la:,t cou­

ple of months disrupted spring fishing 
all over the state, but those storm 
clouds do have a silver lining, accor­
ding to Pete Pfeiffer, acting director of 
fisheries for the Kentucky Department 
of Fish and Wildlife Resources . 

"Generally, a wet spring means bet­
ter than average spawning success and 
survival," Pfeiffer says. "So while 
anglers may be experiencing poor 
fishing conditions right now because of 
high and muddy waters, we can very 
likely look forward to some good 
fishing a couple of years down the 
road , when this year's crop of fish 
reaches harvestable size." 

During wet years, Pfeiffer explains, 
more nutrients are washed into our 
watersheds than during dry periods. 
These nutrients help increase the fer­
tility of lakes and streams, which 
benefits all creatures up the food 
chain . 

A lot of rain also means higher lake 
levels and more shoreline cover 
available for fry to hide in. This 
decreases predation on the just­
hatched fish, meaning that more can 
survive to grow to catching size. 

So while these rains may be playing 
havoc with your current angling plans, 
they are also very likely bringing bet­
ter fishing in the future. 

And hunters who peek behind the 
rain clouds can see a silver lining of 
their own, too. The more days of rain 
we have, the more quail are produced, 
according to Jim Durell, an assistant 
director in t~ fish and wildlife depart­
ment's wildlife division. 

"High humidity seems to stimulate 
quail egg production and helps the eggs 
hatch," Durell says. 

Another feature of a wet year that 
helps both quail and rabbit production 
is that weather forces delays in hay 
cutting . "Every day farmers are forc­
ed to put off haying means more and 
more young quail and rabbits are able 
to leave the nest and get out of harm's 
way when mowing does start. " 

" Generally speaking," Durell says, 
"what farmers call an excess of rain is 
about the right amount for just about 
all wildlife. ' ' 

There is such a thing, however, as 
too much rain for wildlife . Heavy 
downpours or flooding will drown both 
young rabbits and quail chicks, so we 
might have lost production in some 
parts of the state from too much rain. 
Quail will nest again if their first brood 
is destroyed and rabbits keep 
reproducing all summer Crain or 
shine), so there's still a lot of potential 
breeding season left for both species . 

It might seem a little early to start 
thinking about deer hunting, but the 
deadlines for applying to certain con­
trolled hunts aren't that far away. 

Land Between the Lakes (Trigg and 
Lyon counties) has the earliest 
deadline-July 29. Applications for 
gun-hunting, the special youth hunt 
(for youngsters between 10 and 16) and 
for certain bow-hunts are due on this 
date. 

Applications must be on a special 
computer card. To obtain one of these 
cards, instructions for applying and 
complete hunting dates , write Land 
Between the Lakes, Golden Pond, Ky. 
42231. 

Advance appliations are required for 
gun-hunts and for weekend bow-hunts 
at Ft. Knox (Hardin, Bullitt and Meade 
counties). Bow-hunting applications 
will be accepted only between July 25 
and Aug. 8, while gun hunters may app­
ly only between Aug. 22 and Sept. 5. 

Bow hunting dates at Ft. Knox are 
from Oct. 3 through Nov. 8. Gun-hunts 
will be held Nov. 28-29, Dec. 12-13 and 
Dec. 19-20. For complete application 
details, write Hunt Control Head­
quarters, Building 1060, Ft. Knox, Ky. 
40121 or call (502) 624-7311 (no collect 
calls, please). 

The application period for gun-and 
bow-hunts on the Bluegrass Army 
Depot (Madison County) is between 
Aug. 10 and Sept. 10 only. Gun-hunting 
dates are Dec. 5, 12 and 19 while bow­
hunts are set for Oct. 10, 17 and 24. 
Write Deer Hunt, Building S-14, Lex­
ington Blue Grass Army Depot Activi­
ty, Lexington, Ky. 40511 for full details 
on application procedures. 

Ft. Campbell (Christian and Trigg 
counties) generally has drawings dur­
ing the week for gun-hunting on the 
following weekend. Contact Ft. Camp­
bell for season dates, application pro­
cedures and other special area regula­
tions. The address is Outdoor Recrea­
tion Branch, Hunting and Fishing Unit, 
Ft. Campbell , Ky. 42223, or call (502) 
798-2175 (no collect calls, please). 

Application procedures for gun­
hunting on five areas have been stan· 
dardized this year. Applications must 
be on a standard form and must be 
received by August 31. 

These areas are Beaver Creek 
(McCreary and Pulaski ), Kleber 
<Owen), Redbird (Leslie and Clay ), 
West Kentucky (McCracken ) and 
Yellowband <Breckinridge l. 

Gun-hunts will be held Dec. 5-6 on 
Beaver Creek, Kleber and Redbird . A 
muzzleloader-only hunt is scheduled 
for Dec . 12-13 on the Redbird area. 
Gun-hunting dates on the West Ken­
tucky area are Nov. 7, 11 and 14, while 
Yellowbank's gun hunts are set for 
Dec. 5-6 and Dec. 13-14. 

To get application forms for these 
hunts , write the Division of Wildlife , 
Dept. of Fish and Wildlife Resources , 
No.1 Game Farm Rd., Frankfort , Ky. 
40601. Please include a self-addressed 
stamped envelope with your request 
for application forms . 

Pharmacy 
Footnotes 

by HAROLD COOLEY 

Growth in their child 's height and weight are high 
on the priority list of parental inter ests. Mothers and 
fathers write and speak with great pride about the birth 
length and weight of their babies. The average newborn 
baby measures about 21 inches and weighs about 7 
pounds. Throughout the period of infancy, growth is 
very rapid. During the first year, the average male 
child tends to grow nearly ten inches in height and 
triples his birth weight. Bear in mind , however, that de­
partures from the average are not in any way abnormal. 

Here at COOLEY APOTHECARY, INC. , we don 't 
play doctor but we do render assistance , offer al­
ternatives to a problem, and advise when first aid is ap­
propriate . We offer the most complete and professional 
prescription and non-prescription medication service in 
the area. Have your family doctor call us with your next 
prescription and we will have it ready for you to pick it 
up; no waiting involved. See us at 2 Town Center Bldg ., 
Mon.-Fri. 9-5:30; Sat. 9-5. 886-8106. 

HANDY HINT: 
Pack sleepwear and toiletries for the entire family 

in one suitcase . That way, only one bag needs to be 
removed from the car on an over-night stop. 

BRU.NCY 
ENTERPRISES 

INC. 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
---Builder and Developer of Uniq ue--... 
-----Residential Communities----"' 

RESIDENTIAL LISTINGS: 

CREEKSIDE COMMUNITY 
A new residential community with a peaceful 

setting and all city conveniences 

Three-bedroom ranch with 2 baths, complPtely built-in kitchen with GE 
appliances, utility area , eye-catching entry foyer, living room with fire­
place and dining room . Covered back porch and gar·agt> attached . Ex­
terior of brick and siding. Very appealing to the con temporar.Y eye. 
UNDER CONSTRUCTION. · 

Three-bedroom hom<' with l 1 2 baths , living room with fireplace, dining 
room, kitchen completely built-in with GE appliances. UNDER CON­
STRUCTION. 

Enchanting L-shaped home with authentic redwood siding com­
plimented by its interesting roof lines. 4 bedrooms, 21 2 baths, Jiving 
room, dining room, family room with fi•·eplace, completely built-in 
kitchen with GE appliances, utility room, 2-car garage. Located on ex­
tremely large corner lot. UNDER CONSTRUCTION. 

Two-story 4-bedroom home, 21 2 baths, living room with fireplace, din­
ing room, family room, completely built-in kitchen with GE ap­
pliances, utili ty area , 2-car garage. Exterior of brick and poplar 
siding. UNDER CONSTRUCION. 

LEE-WAL MANOR 
A unique residential community in 
exclusive Mays Branch-Now developing! 

Two-story contemporary home with rustic styling. 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, living room with fireplace open to second story, dining area, 
family room, completely built-in kitchen with GE appliances , utilit)• 
area, loft studio or 4th bedroom, 2 large decks with scenic view. 
UNDER CONSTRUCTION. 

MIMOSA SQUARE 
Exclusive New Section of Mays Branch 

Hi-level Colonial adaptation having 3 bedrooms, 3 baths, living room, 
dining room, kitchen completely built-in with appliances and breakfast 
nook, family room with fireplace, utility room with work and storage 
areas, study or 4th bedroom, ;!-car garagP. Equipped with Nutone stereo 
intercom, central vacuum system and many extras . READY FOR l:vi­
MEDIATE OCCUPANCY! 

Spacious building lot in presently developing Woodland Hills Subdivi­
sion on Middle Creek Road approximately 4 miles from downtown 
Prestonsburg. 

Building Lots-Readily available! Vadous sizes-all with city water. 
Located 3 miles up Abbott Road in Creekside Communit,y. 

ALL BRUNCY HOMES QUALIFY FOR 
FLOYD COUNTY HOUSING BOND 

MORTGAGE MONEY AT 8.8 PERCENT 
INTEREST RATE FOR QUALIFIED 

BUYERS 

MAKE YOUR NEW LIVING PLACE 
A BRUNCY COMMUNITY 

I 

\I 
I 
I 
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All In The Day's Work 

BEREA KY-Unlike those who haughtily reply, "Sorry, I don't do win­
dows " M~cel Hamilton set about the task with a cheery smile. The daughter 
of Mr's. Pauline Hamilton, of Route 2, Beaver, Miss Hamilton is a sophon:ore 
at Berea College where she is employed this summer by the college physical 
plant. One of her jobs has been to clean the windows of the different ca.mp~:~s 
buildings . A graduate of McDowell High School, she plans to maJor m 
psychology at Berea. 

OAKLAWN ESTATES 
PAINTSVILLE, KY. 

Executive custom-built log home on secluded 3 
acres. Amenities too numerous to mention-here are 
but a few: 4 bdrms., 3 baths, huge family room, stone 
fireplace in living room, deck, patio. Separate barbeque 
area. 3-car garage. $175,000.00. 

Aaro Realty Corp., Lexington, Ky. 
Call Don H. Valentine, 606-255-0049 

ATTENTION VIDEO 
RECORDER OWNERS 

NOW TAKING MEMBERSHIP APPLICATIONS 
FOR THE NEW 

C&C VIDEO REPLAY TAPE CLUB 
MARTIN, KY. 

• TOP MOVIES • OLD CLASSICS • CLASSICAL WESTERNS 
• FAMILY TAPES • CLEANING KITS • TAPE HEAD CLEANERS 
• DUST PROOF TAPE COVERS 

OWNED AND o·PERATED BY CHARLES AND CASSIE JUSTICE NEXT 
TO CITY HALL, BEHIND '76 STATION. 

Burglars hate 
Operation 
Identification 
Ask any 
police officer why 
What is Operation 
Identification? 

Operation 1.0. is a state-wide program designed to 
discourage burglary and theft of valuables from your 
home and other locations and provide a way for you to 
easily identify stolen property. 

How do you join 
operation Identification? 
To join Operation Identification call the telepho~e 

nu mber below that is closest to your home or locat1on . 

RIGHT BEAVER CREEK 
ALLEN CENTRAL HIGH SCHOOL 
358-9543 
J.D. DING US, Principal 

PRESTONSBURG HIGH SCHOOL 
886-2252 
BOBBY W. WELLS, Principal 

BETSY LANE HIGH SCHOOL 
478-9138 
RUSSELL FRAZIER, Principal 

WHEELWRIGHT HIGH SCHOOL 
452-2110 
WILBUR JAMERSON, Principal 

What number do you use? 
Home and Apartment Residents : 

KY and your Social Security Number. 
Businesses : 

KY and your Kentucky Sales Tax Number. 
Institutions and Non· Profit Agencies : 

KY and your Purchase Exempt Number. 

CRIME PREVENTION ••. 
IS UP TO YOU! 

Call your police department 
for further information. 

7·8-2(. 

lt·pd 
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TUESDAY WAS MOVING DAY for the Big Sandy Area Development 
District offices. Most of the ADD staff-formerly working out of the red 
brick landmark on the city's north side and less prominent offices on the 
south side-will now be housed on the second floor of the Prestonsburg 
Municipal Building. . . . . 

Some ADD staffers will remain at the red bnck offices, which will also 
serve the Water Resources Assistance Corporation and the Farmers Home 
Administration representative here. 

Health Fair Slated, July 13-17 
The Health Fair coming to Floyd 

county the week of July 13-17 will con­
clude the week's screening at the 
Wayland school, from 10 to 4 on Friday, 
July 17. 

Other locations are: 
Monday, at Weeksbury Community 

Center from 1-7 p.m.; Tuesday, at the 
Spruce Pine school, 1-7 p.m.; Wednes­
day, at the McDowell school from 9 till 
2; Thursday, in the morning at the 
Drift Presbyterian Church, and from 
1-7 p.m. at the Garth Vocational 
School. 

Each day local community and 
church women will provide meals for 
the visiting team, which provides the 
services of a physician, dentist, and 
health counselors, free of charge. On 

Thursday, the Christian Independent 
Woman's Club of Martin will serve at 
the Garth location. 

Local agencies which will par­
ticipate in the Fair include the Mud 
Creek Clinic, Mountain Comprehen­
sive Care Center, the Floyd County 
Health Department, and the Regional 
Medical Clinic. 

The Presbyterian Church sponsors 
health fairs each summer in Kentucky, 
Ohio, and Michigan under the Synod of 
the Covenant. Local church members 
from Faith Bible Church of Martin, 
Wayland Methodist, First Baptist of 
McDowell and Drift Presbyterian 
have served on the Health Fair com­
mittee, along with representatives of 
local health agencies. 

Ky. Has 30 Earthquakes a Year! 
Did you know Kentucky has approx­

imately 30 earthquakes per year? Did 
you know this state had one of the most 
violent earthquakes in recorded 
history? Do you know what to do in the 
event of an earthquake? 

These questions will be answered at 
a seminar on earthquakes at Kentucky 
Dam Village Park Civic Center, Fri­
day, July 10, beginning at 9 a.m. The 
seminar is sponsored by the Kentucky 
League of Women Voters in coopera­
tion with the state division of disaster 
and emergency services. 

Kentuckians have been very aware 
of floods and tornadoes because of 
their frequency in the past years, but 
last July 's earthquake centered near 
Maysville caused $.5 million damage 
and was only moderate in intensity. 

The most seismically active region 
in Nort)l America is the New Madrid 
zone, of which Western Kentucky is a 
part. 

Several earthquake experts are 
scheduled to participate in the 
seminar. State officials from the 
disaster and emergency services divi­
sion will talk about preparedness for 
tremors, recovery and the problems an 
earthquake presents to local com­
munities and counties. 

Kentucky does have a number of 
tremors each year. The major series of 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION TO MINE 

1. In accordance with the provisions 
of KRS 350.055, notice is hereby given 
that: Triple Elkhorn Mining Co., Inc. 
P. 0. Box 140, Ivel, Kentucky 41642 in­
tends to file an application for the sur­
face disturbance mining of approx­
imately 137.0 acres located south of 
Banner in Floyd County. The proposed 
operation is approximately one mile 
south of State Route 1426's junction 
with U. S. 23, and located west of 
Prater Creek, latitude 37° 34' 11", 
longitude 82° 42' 49". The surface of the 
area to be mined is owned by: Tom 
Hamilton, B. F . Reed, H. L. Bryant, 
Burton Conn, Vernan Elliott, Gertrude 
Sammons, Mexico Spears, Minnie 
Prater, Scottie Crumb, Evert Crisp, 
Tandy Sammons, Tom Conn, Norman 
Martin, Mousie Dingus. A brief 
description of the kind of mining activi­
ty proposed is: Mountain top removal, 
area stripping, contour stripping with 
hollow fills The application will be fil­
ed at the Bureau of Surface Mining 
Reclamation and Enforcement, 
Prestonsburg Area Office, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. 

Persons wishing to file written objec­
tions and/or request a formal ad­
ministrative hearing in regard to the 
above described surface mine should 
notify the Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental Protec­
tion within 30 days of the date of this 
notice. A copy of the newspaper clip­
ping must be attached to the written 
objection The objection or requ.est ~or 
a hearing will reference application 
number 036-0068. Such objection or re­
quest must be in accordance wilh KRS 
224.081 (2), and must be forwarded to 
the Director of Permits, Bureau of Sur­
face Mining Reclamation and Enforce­
ment, Capital Plaza Tower, Frankfort. 
Kentucky 40601. 

2. Notice is hereby provided pur­
suant to 30 CFR 715.13 !dl DOl and 
KRS:350 that the proposed post mining 
land use does not constitute a change in 
land use. Public comnwnt regarding a 
proposed change in land use may b<' 
submitted to the address l1sted above. 

It. 

earthquakes that struck the Mississip­
pi Valley in the winter of 1811 and 1812 
sent 1,874 separate tremors strong 
enough to be felt in the Louisville area 
and created the 23,000-acre Reelfoot 
Lake in Northwestern Tennessee. 

Knowing what to do in the event of an 
earthquake should be handled in two 
phases, the shaking and after the shak­
ing. During the shaking: don't panic. 
The motion is frightening, but unless it 
shakes something down on top of you, it 
is harmless. If it catches you indoors, 
stay indoors and take cover under a 
desk, table or in doorways and against 
inside walls. Stay away from glass. 

If a quake catches you outside, move 
away from buildings and utility wires. 
If you are in a car, stop and stay in the 
vehicle until the shaking stops. 

After the shaking: check your 
utilities, but do not turn them on 
because the water, gas or electrical 
conduits may be cracked. If you smell 
gas, open windows and shut off the 
main valve, then leave the building and 
do not re-enter it until a utility official 
says it is safe. 

Turn on your radio to get the latest 
emergency bulletins. Don't go 
sightseeing, and stay off the telephone 
except for emergency messages. Stay 
out of damaged buildings because 
aftershocks can shake them down. 

Aside from structural damage and 
collapse, earthquakes are know~ to 
cause compound disasters such as fires 
from broken gas Jines or floods due to 
broken dams. These problems will be 
addressed in the seminar. 

Any interested citizen is invited to at­
tend the seminar and to participate in 
the open forum in the afternoon. 

FARMERS MARKET 
This Friday, July 10, at the Farmers 

Market consumers will be able to buy 
fresh green beans, sweet corn, new 
potatoes, and green apples directly 
from the growers' gardens. 

Anyone who raises home grown 
vegetables can sell vegetables thro~gh 
the Farmers Market. For an applica­
tion to sell, call the County Extension 
Office (886-2668). There is no stall fee 
for selling vegetables. 

The Farmers Market will be opened 
through the summer each Friday 
starting at 4 p.m. at Arcer Park 
in the fair pavilions 

Medco Center Nursing Home 
Will Close On Aug. I 

The Medco Center, a nursing home 
on U. S. 127 west of Frankfort, will 
close Aug. 1. . 

Administrator Ron Hoffman said the 
facility has been unable to retain a pro­
fessional staff. 

The nursing home has operated for 
eight years. Hoffman said that it now 
employs three reg1stered nurses but 
that six are necessary for proper 
operation. . . . . 

Hoffman said the fac1hty IS helpmg 
relocate its 68 residents in other nurs­
ing homes. 

The English walnut tn' l' 
originated in Southeasttrn 
Europe and China. 

VANITIES 
MARBLE TOPS 

CUSTOM INTERIORS, Inc. 
M1loney's Shoppinc Center 

Prestonsburc 886-1147 :1·11 ·11 

Section Two, Page Seven 

He Deals in 'Top Secret' Matters 
In a world dependent on telephones, 

t v 's, instant replays and satellite 
broadcasts, the role of sophisticated 
communications technology is perhaps 
nowhere as vital as in matters of the 
military and national security. Ter· 
ranee Turner IS one Floyd county 
native who knows of the complexities 
of the field, firsthand. 

With 19 years in the communications 
field with both the Air Force and Ar­
my, the 40-year-old Turner, son of Nor­
ma Turner, of Drift, and the late Lin· 
ville <Bub) Turner, is now officer-in­
charge of the USACC-Ft. Gordon 
Telecommunications Center CTCCJ at 
Martinez, Georgia . 

As Turner explains, he and his staff 
are charged with relaying messages 
that could be termed "top secret." 
"We deal with highly classified infor­
mation," he said, "therefore we must 
be secure." · 

"All messages that leave this com­
munication center are encrypted. So, if 
our lines are tapped, the only thing that 
can be picked up is garbage," he ex­
plained. 

Turner is on call 24 hours a day in 
case a message arises that is par­
ticularly important, and he said "we 
can have a one-page message out of the 
station in five minutes and received 
within minutes ." 

in his community, coaching Little 
League baseball, refereeing basketball 
and organizing games on the base. He 
also is pursuing a BA in business. and 
occasionally serves as a substitute 
teacher in the Martinez school system. 

.· 

His present position carries a great 
deal of responsibility but Turner IS us­
ed to pressure. "As an Airman, I was 
assigned to the Communication Center 
in Washington, D. C. at the White 
House Communications Agency," he 
explained. "I was there under the Nix­
on Administration, and we were con­
stantly dealing with the White House 
staff and other dignitaries, providing 
them with record communications. We 
had to be ready to travel at any time, 
and we did." 

As part of his duties during those 
years, Turner travelled to the Soviet 
Union with Nixon, and through the 
Vietnam War served as a diplomatic 
courier, flying regularly to Texas to 
relay messages from Nixon to former 
President Lyndon B. Johnson concern­
ing the progress of the military opera­
tions in Southeast Asia. 

Turner is glad that his present posi­
tion is of a more stationary nature. . , 
"The constant traveling was quite an ,• 
experience, but I'm glad to be settled 
now so that I can enjoy my family. It •: 
was very nervewracking at the White • 
House, and my family had to come se- ;• 
con d." 

Turner and his wife have four 
children. 

In addition to his already busy and 
oftentimes exciting role as com­
munications officer at the Georgia in­
stallation, Turner plays an active role 

Railroad Restores Service 
After Train Derailment 

LANDOVER, Md.-One of three 
damaged train tracks was repa1red, 
restoring partial rail service between 
Baltimore and Washington following 
the derailment of 23 Conrail freight 
cars, authorities said, recently. 

Officials said an lll-car Conrail 
freight with three locomotives was 
southbound from Bethlehem, Pa., 
headed for the Potomac rail yard in 
Alexandria Va on one of Amtrak's 
three track~. wh~n the cars derailed. 

'ROCKFORD' STARS 
TOGETHER AGAIN 

Stuart Margolin will co-star with 
James Garner in NBC's "Bret 
Maverick" series in the fall. 

Margolin won an Emmy as best sup­
porting actor for his portrayal of Angel 
in Garner's last series, "The Rockford 
Files." 

In "Bert Maverick," Margolin will 
play Standing Bear, who claims to be 
an Indian Scout. He is always ready to 
serve Maverick for a price. 

SPECIAL!! 
New 1981 Clayton 12-wide, all new 
decor, 2 bedrooms, all carpeted! 
$9,250.00! Delivery & set-up at No 
Extra Charge! 

rtaqlb,._ 
,sgnucn'S'' 

U.S. 23, Harold, Ky.- 478-9246 

Subscription 
Rates Per Year 
In Floyd County, $8.00 
Elsewhere In Kentucky, $10 
Outside Kentucky, $12.50 

Please note expiration date 
opposite your name on wrap­
per or on your copy of The 
Times. Because of increased 
mailing costs, notices of sub· 
scription expiration are no 
longer mailed to subscribers. 

PUBLIC UTILITY SALE 
MT. STERLING, KENTUCKY 

VANS, Y2-TON TRUCKS, 1 ¥2-TON 
TRUCKS, 4X4 TRUCKS, BUCKET 
TRUCKS 

SALE TIME:.ll A.M. SHARP 
WED., JULY 22 

MT. STERLING AUTO AUCTION 
U.S. 60 WEST, MT. STERLING, KY. 
FOR INFO: 606-498-1414, From 8 to 5 

---------~-- ·------- ----------------- -

HEARING TESTS SET 
For Prestonsburg, KY 

ELECTRONIC 
BEARING TESTS 

Will Be Given By 
MR. H. W. MATIINGLY 

7-8·21 

BELTONE Consultant Who Will Be At: 
ARCHER MEMORIAL CLINIC-WEDNESDAY, July 15-9 a.m. to 3 p.m. 

Anyone who has trouble hearing is wel.com.e t9 have !" hearing. test using 
modern electronic equipment to determ1ne 1f h1s loss 1s ~ne wh1ch .may be 
helped. Some of the causes of hearing loss will be explained and d1agrams 
of how the ear works will be shown. 

We Also Service and Repair All Makes of Hearing Aids. 
Batteries And Supplies For All Makes For Sale. 

IF YOU CANNOT COME IN-
CALL FOR A HOME APPOINTMENT. 

PHONE COLLECT-A/C 304-525-7221 

.· 

.· 

'• 
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Lula BoJen Gibson 

Mrs. Lula Bolen Gibson, 85, died at 
her home at Garrett, Tuesday, June 30. 
Born September 7, 1895, she was a 
daughter of the late Whitley and 
Frances Bolen and was a member of 
the Old Regular Baptist Church for 60 
years. Her husband, Taylor Gibson, 
preceded her in death. 

Surviving are four daughters, Mrs. 
Liza Lawson and Mrs. Rosie Lawson, 
both in Michigan, Mrs. Julie Taylor. of 
St. Mary's, 0., and Mrs. Mae Martin, 
of Garrett; one son, Fred Gibson, of 
Garrett; 17 grandchildren and 22 
great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted at 
10 a.m. Friday at the Stone Coal 
Regular Baptist Church at Garrett 
with ministers of the church of­
ficiating. Burial was made in the Gib­
son cemetery under direction of the 
Merion Funeral Chapel. 

Pauline P. Burchett 
Mrs. Pauline Parsons Burchett, 49, 

of Allen, succumbed Saturday at UK 
Medical Center in Lexington, to in­
juries sustained in a head-on collision 
of her car and a pickup truck on KY 80 
near Martin, June 24. 

Born February 6, 1932, she was a 
daughter of Mrs. Bessie Wilcox Par­
sons, of Allen, and the late Grant Par­
sons, and was employed as a cook at 
the Allen Elementary School. 

In addition to her mother, she is sur­
vived by her husband, George Ernest 
Burchett; two sons, Kenneth and Dar­
rell Douglas Burchett, and one 
daughter, Mrs. Tina Hall, all of Allen; 
seven brothers, Raymond, Delmar, 
Elmer, and Lowell Douglas Parsons, 
all of Allen, Willie Parsons, of Toledo, 
0., Randall Parsons, of Lima, 0., and 
Edd Parsons, of Stanville; three 
sisters, Mrs. Violet McGuire, of Allen, 

Obituaries 
Hibbert Meade 

Funeral rites will be conducted at ll 
a.m. today (Wednesday) at the Little 
Salem Regular Baptist Church at Dana 
for Hibbert Meade, 77, of Columbus, 
0., formerly of this county, who died 
last Saturday at the University 
Hospital in Columbus following a long 
illness. 

Born February 14, 1904 in Magoffin 
county, he was a son of the late Bill and 
Martha Layne Meade and was a 
retired miner. He was a member of the 
Little Salem Regular Baptist Church at 
Dana. 

Surviving him are his widow, Mrs. 
Emogene Smith Meade; six sons, 
James and Ray Meade, both of Colum­
bus, 0., Denver and Danny Joe Meade, 
both of Lucasville, 0., Robert Meade, 
of Louisa, and Gordon Lee Meade, of 
Lebanon, 0.; eight daughters, Del via 
Slone, of Huntington, W. Va., Sylvia 
Akers. of Louisa , Montana Callahan 
Linda Wood, Dorothy Watson, Reesi~ 
Case, Wanda and Brenda Meade, all of 
Columbus, 0.; one sister, Mrs. Dora 
Mulkey, of Banner; 70 grandchildren 
and 59 great-grandchildren. 

Ministers of the Regular Baptist 
Church will officiate at the funeral ser­
vices and burial will be made in the 
Layne cemetery at Harold under direc­
tion of the Hall Funeral Home. 

George Thompson 
George Thompson, 75, of Topmost, 

died last Friday at the McDowell 
Appalachian Regional Hospital. 

Born May 31, 1906 on Bull Creek, he 
was a son of Mrs. Fannie Hilton 
Thompson, and the late Ike Isaac 
Thompson. He was a retired miner. 

' Mrs. Mary Foote, of New York, N.Y., 
and Miss Phyllis Ann Parsons, in 

' Oregon, and two grandchildren. 

In addition to his mother, he is sur­
vived by his wife, Mrs. Oma Hall 
Thompson; three sons, Fred Thomp­
son, of Peebles, 0., Ted Thompson, of 
Stanville, Tommy Thompson, of Kite; 
one daughter, Mrs. Loretta Martin, of 
Wayland; four brothers, Bennie 
Thompson, of Melvin, Russell Thomp­
son, of Wellston, 0., Junior Thompson, 
of Beaver, 0., and Willard Thompson, 
of Columbus, 0.; six sisters, Mrs. Ruth 
Wallen and Mrs. Mollie Wallen, both of 
Prestonsburg, Mrs. Lula Tackett, of 
Melvin, Mrs. Janet Mullins and Mrs. 
Elsie Kincheloe, both of Louisville, and 
Mrs. Marietta Anderson, of Mt. Sterl­
ing. 

Funeral services will be conducted 
at 11 p.m. today (Wednesday) in the 
chapel of the Floyd Funeral Home by 
the Revs. Earl Waugh and Henry 
Crider. Burial will be made in David­
son Memorial Gardens at Ivel. 

Pallbearers will be David Caudill, 
William Osborne, Lincoln Brown, 
Frank Carr, Tommy Reynolds , and 
Bobby Rowe. 

AT FAMILY REllNIOJ'\ 
Mrs. Larue Robinson's name was 

omitted form the listing of family 
members who attended a family re­
union held recently at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Baldridge. 

SANDY VALLEY 
MONUMENT 

& BUILDING STONE CO., Inc. 

87 4-2273 • ALLEN, KY 
"THE AREA 'S OLDEST ESTABLISHED 

BEST QUALITY MEMORIALS 
QUICK, EFFICENT SERVICE 

AND INSTALLATION 

SEE OUR LARGE DISPLAY OF 
COLORED & GRAY GRANITES 

LOCATED ON OLD U.S. 23 
IN NEW ALLEN 

6-3-tf. 

Funeral services were conducted at 
the Methodist Church in Wayland at 11 
a.m. Monday with ministers of the 
church officiating. Burial was made in 
the Dry Creek cemetery at Topmost 
under direction of the Merion Funeral 
Chapel. 

Lucille Bowe Ratliff 
Mrs. Lucille Bowe Ratliff, 60, died 

Monday at Zion Deliverance Church of 
Wayland where she had been cared for 
during the two weeks preceding her 
death. One of its oldest members in 
years of membership, Mrs. Ratliff had 
requested that she be taken to the 
church. 

Born December 6, 1920 in Prestons­
burg, she was a daughter of the late L. 
F , and Hattie Wallace Bowe. 

She is survived by her husband, 
Willard Ratliff; three sons, Willard 
Ratliff, Jr., of Marion, Va , Wallace 
Vernon Ratliff, of Prestonsburg, and 
Daniel Bowe Ratliff, of Paintsville; a 
brother, Elmer Bowe, of Martin, and 
six grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be conducted 
at 10 a .m . tomorrow <Thursday) at the 
church where she died, and burial will 
be made in the Bowe cemetery at 
Louisa under direction of the Hall 
Funeral Home. 

CARTER· FUNERAL HOME 
4 7 SOUTH LAKE DRIVE • PRESTONSBURG 

Phone 886-277 4 ~ II II 

HALL FUNERAL HOME 

Near the junction of KY 80 and KY 122, at Martin, Ky. 
JOHN C. HALL, Owner and Manager 

Phones 285-9261 or 285-9262 

Florida Car Victim, 6, 

Was Native of P'burg 
Six-year-old John Brady Henderson 

was killed Monday, June 29, when he 
was struck by a city bus in Mayport, 
Florida where he was riding a bicycle 
near his home. 

The son of Ray and Jeanette Slone 
Henderson, he was born February I, 
1975 in Prestonsburg. In addition to the 
parents, he is survived by a brother, 
Michael, at home; the grandparents, 
Brady and Pearl Henderson, of 
Nashville, 0., and Alex and Roberta 
Slone, of Carlisle, Ky.; the paternal 
great-grandfather, Irvin Collins, of 
McDowell, and the maternal great­
grandmother, Mrs. Flora Shepherd, of 
Mansfield, Ohio. 

Funeral services were conducted in 
the chapel of the Hall Funeral Home at 
noon Friday by the Rev. Harry Moore, 
and burial was made in ~he Greenbury 
Hall cemetery at East McDowell. 

Pallbearers were Berchell Hender­
son, Robert Hall, Bill Schlick, Claude 
Blevins, Billy Henderson, and Tim 
Milam. 

Don Bush 
Don Bush, 75, retired Ashland Oil . 

Refining Co. employee and well-known 
Harold man, died at 10 p.m., June 26, at 
the Pikeville Methodist Hospital. 

Son of the late 'Melvin T. and Cora 
Sword Bush, he was a native of this 
county and was a member of the Vogel­

. Day Methodist Church. 
Survivors inclu~e his widow, Fanny 

Gearheart Bush, ;or Harold; one son, 
Ned Bush, Harold, and two daughters, 
Mrs. Peggy Hagahs and Mrs. Barbara 
Hagans, both of Louisville; three 
brothers and two sisters, J.ohn B. and 
Oscar Bush, both of Harold, Cecil 
Bush, Sarasota, E'la., Mrs. Lida May, 
of Allen, and Mrs. Ollie Layne, Pro­
spect, Ohio. He also leaves five grand­
children. 

Funeral service;; were conducted at 1 
p.m. June 29 from the Vogel-Day 
Methodist Church 1by the Revs. Charles 
Elswick and Ray ;Reese. Burial in the 
Bush-Hagans cemetery at Harold was 
directed by the J . W. Call . . Son 
Funeral Home. 

PSC Seeks Changes 
In Gas Regulations 

The chairman of the state Public Ser­
vice Commission :said the commission 
plans to meet with representatives 
from natural gas companies and con­
sumer groups later this summer as the 
first step in changing some ways the 
commission regulates gas utilities. 

In remarks prepared for delivery to 
the Kentucky Gas Association's annual 
convention at Lake Barkley Resort 
Lodge, PSC Chairman Marlin M. Volz 
said , the procedural changes are 
necessary to n!duce costs to the 
utilities and constlmers. 

Volz quoted a 1General Accounting 
Office study on electric utilities that 
stated, "Electric power projects and 
operations have been more costly as a 
result of changing regulatory require­
ment and delays and uncertainties 
associated with the regulatory pro-
cess." , 

''It is the goal o( the Kentucky Public 
Service Commission·," Volz said, "that 
such a finding not be applicable to it. " 
He invited the association members to 
select a committee to meet with the 
commission and representatives of ap­
propriate consumer groups to recom­
mend changes in l>rocedures in at least 
seven areas. 

Those areas are : 
-Reducing to as short a time as 

feasible the length of time required to 
process the various applications. 

-Reducing the cost of notices to 
customers of prowosed rate changes. 

-Exploring the situations where in­
formal hearings may be substituted for 
formal hearings t"ithout offending due 
process. ' 

- Determining whether additional 
matters can be decided on the basis of 
written submissions without a hearing. 

-Reducing duplicative requests for 
information by intervenors. 

-Reducing the burden of submitting 
reports and other information to the 
commission. 

-Reviewing the regulations of the 
commission and the state statutes. 

While the changes could make some 
difference in costs, Bolz reminded the 
association that state commissions 
have limited authority over gas 
utilities and tha't most natural gas 
prices are underl federal jurisdiction. 
State commissions, he said, are largely 
limited "to an examination of distribu­
tion costs and what level of service is 
considered to be adequate." 

Agriculture H1esearch Grants 
Awarded To }five Universities 

The state Agrliculture Department 
has awarded research grants totaling 
$50,000 to five state universities .. 

Receiv ing $10,000 each w1ll be 
Eastern Kentucky University, Western 
Kentucky University, Murray State 
University, Kentucky State University 
and the University of Louisville, Com­
missioner Alben Barkley II sa id 
yesterday. , . . 

Barkley said JV):urray wtll study s01l· 
erosion, Western will conduct ex­
periments with nprsery facilit~es, Ken­
tucky Slate will experiment w1th apple 
production, Louisville will experi~~nt 
with urban gardening, and compos1t10n 
of wheat, soybeans and other crops. 

--,---
j 

During the Ice Age, the 
Sahara Desert was a rich 
grassland and hunting ground 
for prehistoric men. 

I 
I 
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Oil-Shale Mining 
Regulations Filed 

The state Department for 1'\atural 
Resources and Environmental Protec­
tion has filed draft regulations with the 
Legislative Research Commission for 
oil-shale mining in Kentucky. 

The regulations are designed to 
establish guidelines for protection of 
the environment from an~ harmful ef­
fects of oil-shale mining and process­
ing, said special projects director Rich 
Shogren. 

"These draft regulations are pat­
terned on regulations which were 
developed for the mining of coal ," 
Shogren said. "The regulatory pro­
cedures for oil-shale mining will be 
similar to those for coal mining. " 

Shogren said the proposed regula­
tions will require the submission of ex­
tensive data on current site conditions 
by mining permit applicants. 
Operators will also be required to pro­
vide periodic reports of environmental 
effects. 

'·we feel this monitoring is 
necessary because of the relatively 
unknown effects of oil-shale mining 
and the variety of mining and process­
ing techniques which may be 
employed," he added. 

Under the draft regulations, any oil­
shale mining operations which will pro­
duce more than 1,000 barrels of oil a 
day or disturb more than 25 acres of 
land per year will be required to 
demonstrate the probable environmen­
tal impact of their operation before an 
operating permit will be issued. 
Operations which involve less than 

1,000 barrels or 25 acres will be re­
quired to meet performance standards 
and procedural requirements set by 
the draft regulation. 

The regulations propose that all per­
mits be valid for two years or five 
years from the date of issuance, depen­
ding on the size of the operation. 

Department officials said the draft 
regulations are expected to be publish­
ed in the August issue of the Kentucky 
Administrative Register . After 
publication of the draft regulations , the 
1'\atural Resources Department will 
hold public hearings to receive com­
ments on the regulations. The hearings 
are expected to be held in early fall. 
Dates, locations and times for the hear­
ings will be printed in the Ad­
ministrative Register. 

While oil-shale outcroppings underlie 
most of Kentucky, the area gnerally 
thought to be of the greatest interest 
for commercial mining is that wbich 
surrounds the Bluegrass region. The 
area extends in a semicircle from 
Mason and Lewis counties in 1'\or­
theastern Kentucky southwest to 
Madison and Lincoln counties and nor­
thwest to 1'\elson and Bullitt counties. 

DELUXE 
14-WIDE HOME! 

Large front kitchen, 3 bedrooms, 
l'h baths, dishwasher, frost-free 
refrigerator, much, much, more ! 
Only one at this low-low price 
$18,500.00! See Us Today !! 

Cl..a.UD:IIL 
~snniiiirizv• 

U.S. 23. Harold. Ky. - 471-q246 

FEDERATED 
FURNITURE STORE 

MARTIN, KY. 

HAS JUST RECEIVED A NEW SHIPMENT OF KEL­
VINATOR AIR CONDITIONERS! ALL PUT ON 
SALE! ALSO SPECIAL PRICES ON FURNITURE 
AND APPLIANCES! 

EXCEPTIONAL OPPORTUNITIES 
FOR 

PARTS COUNTER PEOPLE 
We have the immediate need for additional counter people in our 

Parts Department. We are looking for people who are career minded, 
and willing to take advantage of great opportunities. 

WE OFFER 
*Excellent Income 
*Job Security 
*Paid Vacations and Holidays 
*Insurance Benefits 
*Growth and Advancement 

QUALWICATIONS 
*Integrity 
*Desire 
' 'Good Character 
*Good References 
*Age 18 or Over 

lntei'Views will be conducted between the hours of 9:00a.m. and 
5:00p.m. H the above hours are not convenient, please call Don Osch­
wald at 874-2133 for an appointment. 

01: DON JACOBS 
FORD-LINCOLN-MERCURY-HONDA 

Lancer-Water Gap Road-Prestonsburg, Ky. • 874-2133 

YES, WE HAVE 
THEM! 

YOUR FULL LINE SOURCE 

Sandy Valley Hardware i~i,TJ 
Phone 874-9218 Allen, Ky. '--- - -

HOURS: MON.-FRI. 7:30-5; SAT. 7:30-3 

POWER COMPANY TRADE-INS 
Save On These: 

1978 GMC-1978 CHEVROLET -1977 GMC 
1977 CHEVROLET-1977 GMC 

1977 GMC 4x4-1977 SUBURBAN 

01: DON JACOBS 
FORD • LINCOLN • MERCURY • HONDA 
LANCER· WATER GAP ROAD • PRESTONSBURG • 874·21J3 
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*Cancer 
Hope line 

Q-1 have lots of moles on my body. 
Should I have them removed to prevent 
cancer. 

A-Only about one mole in a million 
will ever turn cancerous. Most people 
have an average of 20-40 moles during 
their lifetime, so removing them all 
could be nearly impossible, certainly 
impractical. In addition, the removal 
of all moles is no guarantee against 
melanoma, the skin cancer which most 
often appears at the sight of a mole. 
The reason is that melanoma is just as 
likely to develop from clear skin as 
from moles. 

Q-1 have several fairly light-colored 
moles and two which are very dark. 
Will the dark ones become cancerous .. 

A-Many people believe that light­
colored moles are harmless and that 
dark ones are or can become 
cancerous. This is not true. 

Harmless moles can vary in color 
from skin color through tan and brown 
to nearly black. The mole that may be 

• malignant (cancerous> is one which 
changes color from what it has always 
been. 

The best way to guard yourself 
against skin cancers is to be aware of 
how your skin normally looks, where 
the moles are located, and what size 
and color they are. Any change from 
what is usual should be reported to a 
physician immediately. 

To learn more about skin cancers, 
call the Cancer Hopeline at 

• 1-800-432-9321 from 9-9 Monday-Thu>s­
day and 9-5 Friday. You may also write 
the Hopeline at 915 South Limestone 
Street, Lexington, KY 40563. 

Q-I saw your recent column about 
the possible danger from using a sun 
lamp. My skin is fair, but I would like 
to get a tan in natural sunlight. What do 
you recommend .. 

A-The sun's rays provide us with 
light, warmth, and vitamin D, but they 

.. also can cause skin damage and skin 
cancer.. Therefore, skin exposed to the 
sun needs extra care. 

Burning ultra-violet rays of the sun 
travel through the outer layer of skin 
and damage delicate tissue. The 
resulting redness is sunburn. When the 
damage causes brownness, we call it 
suntan. Tanning occurs because the 
body sends colored pigment into the 
skin to help block the sun's rays and 
protect the inner tissues. 

Most skin cancers occur on parts of 
the body exposed to the sun. Because of 
the natural dark pigment in their skins, 
people who have dark complexions are 
better protected against the burning 
rays of the sun than you are with fair 
skin. 

However, anyone, even a person wfth 
a dark complexion, can suffer skin 
damage from the sun. Unfortunately, 
the harm caused by the sun builds up 
throughout a person's lifetime. Thus, 
the skin "remembers" the damage, 
and suntans or sunburns as a teenager 
can result in rough, wrinkled skin+or 
even skin cancer a t middle age. 

Everyone can prevent skin damage 
and still enjoy the sun. Here's how: 

-Go out into the sun, but dress for it. 
Clothes are protection against the bur­
ning rays. And don't forget a broad­
brimmed hat to protect the tender tops 
of your ears, your nose, and your neck. 

-If you want a tan, sun screen and 
sun block lotions, creams, and gels are 
available without a prescription. Use 
the sun screen products which contain 
PABA or bensophenone. They stop 
most of the burning rays. Sun blocks 
stop them all. Before using any skin 
care lotion, be sure to read and follow 
the directions. Some sun screen must 
be put on an hour before going outside, 
and some must be reapplied after 
swimming. Wear sun screens on 
cloudy days, too ; clouds don't stop bur­
ning rays. 

For more information about sun tan­
ning and adult skin cancers, call the 
Cancer Hopeline at 1-800-432-9321 from 
9-9 Monday-Thursday and 9-5 Friday. 
You also may write the Hopeline at 915 
South Limestone Street, Lexington, KY 
40536. 

FLOYD COUNTY 
HEALTH NOTES 

By JANE BOND 
Cancer of the uterus can be one of the 

most curable of all cancers, yet ap­
proximately 11,000 women in this coun­
try die each year from this type 
cancer. The terrible tragedy of these 
11,000 deaths is that most of them are 
needless. If the cancers had been 
detected early enough, and treatment 
begun, most of these 11,000 would have 
lived. 

\ The test for cancer of the uterus is a 
simple procedure called the Pap lest. 
Il doesn't hurl, and it doesn't take 
much time. -The Pap test can detect 
cancer and it can also reveal changes 
that could mean cancer will develop. 
Thus, the Pap test can warn of cancer 
before it even starts. The Pap test is 
not something a woman can have once 
and forget about+a Pap test once each 
year is the way to help protect women 
from cancer of the uterus. 

The Floyd County Health Depart­
ment is offering a Pap clinic on July 10 
and July 24 from 9 a.m. till 2 p.m. 

--- · These clinics are a free service of the 
Floyd County Health Department, and 
any woman who has not had a Pap test 
in the past year is urged to take advan­
tage of this service. 

A nurse from the Health Department 
will be in Wayland at the Methodist 
Church, Monday July 13, from 10 a.m. 

1?-llll"m~·u::...n_ .. til 2 p.m., offering T. B. skin tests, 
~'-.. ._..)nunizations, blood pressures, and 

• .., urinalyses. The public is welcome to 
take advantage of this free service. 

The Floyd County Times 

Observe Golden Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. L. H. Higgins observed their Golden wedding anniversary 
Sa~urday, June 20, at their home at Minnie with their daughter, grand· 
children and great-grandchildren. Also attending were friends and 
neighbors, Mr. and Mrs. Ted Collins. 

Ida Stewart and Linzie High Higgins were married June 20, 1931 by the late 
Elder Thomas Mosley at the home of her parents, the late John C. and 
Caroline Martin Stewart. 

JOB OPPORTUNITY 'Powerline' To Be Heard 
Locally On Sundays The Floyd County Health Depart­

ment has a vacancy for Communitv 
Health Nurse I. Minimum require­
ments for this position are as follows: 

Graduation from a diploma or 
associate degree nursing program that 
is state approved. Current license to 
practice as a registered nurse in Ken­
tucky, work experience is not required. 

"Power line," the "top-40" radio pro­
gram for teenagers and young adults, 
may now be heard on WPRT-AM each 
Sunday at 8 a.m. 

Beginning salary is $5.29 per hour. 
Persons interested in this position can 
obtain further details and an applica­
tion from the Floyd County Health 
Department. 

The program, produced by the 
Southern Baptist Radio and Television 
Commission, combines hit songs from 
the "top-40" record charts with 
positive comments and discussion on 
the Christian way of life. 

Applications must be received by the 
Merit System Office, 275 East Main 
Street, Frankfort, Kentucky 40621 on or 
before midnight July 15, 1981. 

Listeners may write for copie.c; of the 
comments and for answers to personal 
problems. Problems are handled by a 
staff of trained counselors at the Radio 
and Television Commission. 

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER 
6-2431 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

MEMORIAL SERVICE 
At the 

GOODLOE CHURCH OF GOD 
SUNDAY, JULY 19 

Johnny Patton will conduct services at 10:30 a.m. 
Following services, dinner will be held. on ttie grounds. 

EVERYONE WELCOME 

Also Revival Will Begin July 19, 7 p.m. 
With Johnny Patton Preaching. 

Pastor, Sanford Baldridge 

GOSPEL SINGING 
at 

MARTIN FREE WILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

JULY 11-7 P.M. 
EVERYONE CORDIALLY INVITED TO ATTEND 

PAUL JOSEPH, PASTOR 

REVIVAL 
BETSY LAYNE 

CHURCH OF GOD 
JULY 12-JUL Y 26 

7 P.M. NIGHTLY 
REV. DOWELL WILLIAMS, EVANGELIST 

FROM PRINCETON, W.VA. 
REV. DARRELL JONES, PASTOR 

SPECIAL SINGING BY THE REDEMPTIONS 
• EVERYONE WELCOME • 

• LOOKING FOR SOMETHING DIFFERENT? 
Attend Services At The 

FIRST CHURCH OF GOD 
(Little Paint) 1/2 mile off Route 1428 

Between Prestonsburg & East Point, Where 

7-8-21. 

7 l 21. 

7 8·21 

"THE DIFFERENCE IS WORTH THE DISTANCE" 

Sl1:\'HA \'SCHOOL. ... .IU:OU a 111 

~IOH'\1'\(; WORSIIIP .. . II:OO a.m. 
YOL"TII SEH\ I('E ... . .. . 7:1111 p.m. 
HE\"1\" \1 . IIOUL . . ... .. 7::tit p 111. 

HIBLE STUDY OH~D. l . . i :00 p.m. 

<:\"l"RSEHY PHO\ JI)EJ>l 

Phone 886-3319 
WDOC-FM, 8-8:15 a.m., Mon.-Fri. 

HOY L. TI:\"('IIEH. Pastor 
).1111 

To Wed At Allen Church 

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Rice, of Allen. 
announce the engagement and forth­
coming marriage of their daughter, 
Charolette Ann, to Mr. Jeffery Jerome 
Kinzer, son of Mr. and Mrs. Jerome 
Kinzer, of Allen. 

The wedding will be solemnized at 
the Allen Vnited Methodist Church at 7 
p.m. July 18. The gracious custom of 
open church will be observed. 
Refreshments will be served in recep­
tion hall following the wedding. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Mcl>o\H'll, Ky. 

Sunday School . . ... 10 a .m. 
Morning Worship .. . . ll a.m. 
Wednesday 
Prayer Meeting 7 }1.m. 

PAUL GHAIMiEB. Pastor 

Evt:>ryont:> Wt:>h:om<' 
6·6·tr 

FIRST ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD 

West Prestonsburg, Ky. 
W \I>E 1\lt\HTI:\ IIU.IIES 

Pastor 
Sunday School . . . . 9:45a.m. 
Morning Worship. . .. 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship . : . . . 7p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Study . 7 p.m. 

FIRST 
UNITED 

METHODIST 
CHURCH 

60 So. Arnold Ave., Prestonsburg 

DR. TED NICHOLAS, Minister 
Sunday School. .9:45 
Morning Worship . . . . . . . 10:55 
Rhythmic Choir . . . . . .. . 3:15 
Junior & Senior UMYF . . 4:00 
Wesley Bell Choir . . . ... 5:30 
Evening Service . . . . . . . . . . 7:30 

A CHRISTIAN WELCOME 
AWAITS YOU 

SUN., WPRT FM-10:55 h-.!U-1( 

FIRST 
CHRISTIAN 

CHURCH 
1 Cor. 15:1-10 429 N. ARNOLD AYE. 

SL'I':DA Y SERVICES 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Ages 2-Adult 
Worship-11 :00 a .m. 

Nursery Provided 
Children's Sermon Time 

Grade 1·4 
Evening Worship-7:00p.m . 

\\'EDNESDA Y 
Bible Study 7:00p.m. 

Acts 2:41, 42 4 29-tf. 

Tom Moore Memorial 
FREE WILL 

BAPTIST. CHURCH 
CLIFF RD. 

Dewey Conley, Pastor 
Sunday: 
Sunday School 
Morning Worship. 
Choir Practice 
Bible Study . . . 
\Vednt:>sday: 
Youth Group .. 
Ladies Auxiliary- -

.10:00 a .m. 
11 :00 a.m. 

... 5:30p.m. 

.. 6:00p.m. 

. . 7.00p.m. 

2nd Thurs Monthly .. 7:00 p.m. 

For Transportation 
Call 886-8108 or 886-!J5t.J 

Everyone Welcorne 
5·27-lf. 

ARE YOU LOOKING FOR A CHURCH 
WHERE THE OLD-FASHIONED GOSPEL 
MAKES MEN AND WOMEN, BOYS AND 
GIRLS, NEW CREATURES IN CHRIST 
JESUS? 

This is your personal invitation to visit 
or attend ... 

THE EMMANUEL 
BIBLE CHURCH 

\11 IIHit•tH·JHit·lll . 1'1 t ' · \IJllt·IIHIIll 

J'uncl.tnu·nl.d ( lnll'dl 

Phone 8i.t-201t Dwal(•, K.v. 
We in\ ih• .\IIIII" fu1·t1wr itHJIIi•·it·~ 

and \H' 11 ill hi' happ~ to an ... \H'r 

thl'm, prompt!.\. 

Sunda) School 10 a m . 
1\lorning Wor:-.htp II <\.m . 
Sunday l':vening Sen·1eP 7 p 111. 
W<•dnt•sda) E\l•ning Hihll' 
Study & Pray('!" J\.l<•<•ti11g 7 p 111 . 

Sat. l<~vl'ning S<'n tt"l' . . 7 p.m 
I ~K II. 

SUNDAY 
WORSHIP SERVICE 

9:30A.M. 
~EV. TIMOTHY 0 JESSEN. P~sl~• 

Highland Avenue 
Freewill Baptist 

Church 
Sl":\ ll.\ Y 
Sundi'l) School 
Worship S<•n tet' 

Evrmng Servtr<' 
WED:\1-.SU \\ 

10 am 
II a m . 
6 p.m. 

Pra)W MPrting 7 p.m. 
('LJFFOIW II. ,\USTI:\, Pa!>tm· 

FITZPATRICK 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

West Prestonsburg, Ky. 
\trt_.,.., Fro111 ( ' t.nk Sc:hool 

Services 10:45 
Youth Church (5-12) . . 10:45 
Sunday School . 9:45 
Evening Service . . . .. . . ... . . 7:00 

•1'\URSEHY • 
Listen to our broadcast on 
WPRT, Sunday , 11 a .m 

REV. JOHN WOODS, Pastor 
3-5·11 

You have a Special Invitation 
To Worship With Us at the 

BONANZA FREE WILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Abbott Roadl 

Sunday School. . .. . .. 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship . . 11:00 p.m. 
Prayer and Bible Study 7:00p.m. 

(each Wed.) 

BILL CAMPBELL, Pastor 

••wORSHIP GOD 

WITH US." 

PRESTONSBURG 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
(Vocal Music Only) 
South Lake Drive 

BENNIE BLANKENSHIP, Evangelist 

Sun. 10 a.m.-7 p.m. 
Wed. 7 p.m. 

Phone 886-6223 or 886-3379 
RADIO 

Watergap 
Freewill Baptist 

Church 
Watergap Road 

BROTHEH 1),\N:\"V CURRY 
Pastor 

SU:'IIDAY 
Sunday School .. 
Morning 
Worship Service . . 
Evening Service 
WEDNESDA \' 
Evening 

.10:00 a.m. 

11:00 a.m. 
.6:00p.m. 

Prayer Meetmg 7:00p.m. 
TUESDAY 
Youth Meeting 6:30p.m . 

Everyone Welcome 
IU· I tr 
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You Are Invited 
To the 

First Presbyterian Church 
1\:orth Lake Drive 

Prestonsburg 

Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Moraing Worship 11:15 a.m. 

REV. TIMOTHY D. JESSEN, 
Pastor 

TRIMBLE CHAPEL 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Lancer-Water Gap 

Sunday School. .......... 10 a.m. 
Worship Service ... . .... 11 a.m. 
Evening Service . .. . . . .6 p.m. 
Wednesday 

Choir Practice . . . . . . . . 7 p.m. 

Special Singing 
Ist Sat. each month 

REV. GREEN BOYD 
5-13-lf 

ZION 
DELIVERANCE 
TABERNACLE 
WAYLAND, ~ENTUCKY 
Sunday School 11 a.m. 

Evcmng Worship 7 p.m. 
Wednesday Youth Worship 7 p.m. 
Saturda) Evemng Worship 7 p.m. 

Sisl!•r Ada Mo!>lr}, Pastm· 
EH'I) (IIJ(' WdCOIII{'. 

\II TIH· 1-:nrth Shall \\or-.hil' TinT . 

' 

COMMUNITY UNITED · 
METHODIST CHURCH 

REV. TAYLOR l. BIGGS. Pastor 

Sunday­
Sunday School ... . 
Morning Worship .>t 

Evl'ning Worship 

.10 a.m. 
11 a.m. 

7p.m. 
\\"t:'dnl·sda \­

E\ min g. \\'orship . . 7 p.111. 

E\"El{\"0:\E \\EL('O:\IE 

IU· IK II 

The First Church of God 
University Dr., Prestonsburg, Ky. 

GARLAND LACY. Pastor 

SLNDAY: 
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Service 
TUESDAY: 

9:45p.m. 
10:45 a.m. 
.6:00p.m. 

Prayer Encounter 
WEI>, ESIH\" · 

.7:00am. 

Prayer Service 7:00p.m 

E\'EHYO:\'E WJ<;LCOl\JE. 

\V 
COME 

WORSHIP 

WITH US 
AT 

CHURCH 

fit.$~~ 
!EPISCOPAL) 

PRESTONSBURG. KENTUCKY 41653 
SUNDAYS 

(_A. ~ 1 I & Ill, 11 a.~.-Holy 
'?t_oS1 ~ Commumon 

0 I
ll & IV, 8:30 a.m.-Holy 

Communion 

1_ . .J II & IV, l1 a.m. Mornin& 
-...........--- Prayer 
10 a.m.-Church School and Bible Class 

7:30 p.m.-Bible Study 
Tues. 10 a.m.-Bible Study 

Wed. 7:30 p.m.-PraY,er Group· 
Ottler services as scheduled 

8:45 a.m. Sundays, Radio Station WPRT· 
"The Vicar's Van" 

THE R(V MO\JLTRI( H. MCINTOSH, VICAR 

Rl81.t: STL'O\ 9 45 
\lOR'il'iG 1\0RSHIP 
F\E'il'i(, 1\UKSIIIP ;.:IU I'll 
11111·1\EEK PIH\"ER SER\'ICE 

6 ~5 P\1 
-----

FIRST AVENUE, DOWNTOWN PRESTONSBURG 
NURSERY PROVIDED AND PLENTY OF PARKING 

Morning 
sen-ict' broadcast 

lh•. II 15. 1\"00(" FM !15.5 

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Lorie \"annueci, Pastor 

Phone 285-3051 
1\tlartin, Ky. 

Sunda~ Sl"lll••>l 
1\hHilllt~· \\ urship 
'I<Hit h \\Ill"'> Ill ]J 
EYangl'li-.t H Sl'n H"t' 

\\ edn<•scl<t~· I p 111 

10 am 
II am 

6 p.lll 
I p Ill 

Fan11l~ i':tgltt 

\'aration Biblt> Schooll\londa-v, Junr 
1 thn1 Friday, June 5-!1·12. Classt•s 
fo•· all a~t·s. 

For Transportation call 285-:1051 or 285-9114. 
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Fastest Growin; Wl'l'kl~­
, •. ,,~ "f>;'l'f'l' ' " FIAOYD co NTY TIMES Floyd County's Home 

Newspaper. First Class 
Job Plant in Connection 

YOLL\IE 1 

STATE HALTS 
MAYO TRAIL 

WORK HERE 
Change In Route Thru 

Prestonsburg Is Con­
sidered 

.\ Progres~in' Paper for Progressin~ People 

$1.5f} Per Year 

One Case of Infantile 
Pa!·~lysis at Van Lear 

FESS \YHITAKER. 
'JAILED J AlLER,' 
KILLED IN \\'RECK 

Courthouse and Schools 
Discussed by Speakers 

ROSCOE VANOVER, 
FORMER JURIST, 

DIES SATURDAY
1 

I ENROLLMENT IN 
P'BURG SCHOOLS 
IS NEARING 600 

'Though this week ., :·eport of t!':e The c:>U:·thouse was portrayed as a I 
count'· health •m!t included no disco\·- 1 1·no of J·ustl·ce b" common"·ealth's R . v --6-6- e old ex 

J Fess Whi:ake:-. famous "jailed jailer" s.1r ~ J "' oscoe anover, Y ars • - . 
ery of inf:111tile paraiysis cases in Floyd of Letcher county. met death late Sun- Attorney C. P. Stephens, _and Prestons- I judge of the Pike-Letcher judicial dis- ; 
county, a county health nurse from day when his neck was broken in an burg's schools, as the moulds in which trict, died- at his home in Pikeville : 
Johnson county said here this week auton~obile crash near Whitesburg. the lives of boys and girls are shaped, ' Saturday morning after an illness of It 
that one case had developed at Van j d ' d b • Prof T J Currey ' 1 d · warrant charging murder has been were lscusse ). · · · ' , seven~ ays. t 
Lear, Johnson county. issued against Cicero seco, who is said both of whom del.i.vered able ad~.resses i Judge Vanover was well-known : School to .Be Represen -
~pproximately 60 per~ns were ex- to have been the drive:- of the car I as a part of the Public Affairs pro- I throughout Eastern Kentucky, and be- I ed on Gridiron, Currey 

ammed at the tuberculosis clime held h. h . t Wh't k , h' I gram of the Kiwanis Club Friday even-
1 
came noted during his term of omce as • w 1c ran m o 1.a er s mac me, A 

here, Tuesday and Wednesday, by Drs. f . .t ~o f t b km t l ing i circu'lt judge for his fight against the llllOUnCeS . orcmg 1 over a " - oo em an en ·I · 
Loch and Turner, of Louisv1le. ' M S t d M Mr stephens paid tribute to the ll'quor tra"'c in Pike and Letcher coun-' onroe ex on, a passenger, an rs. , · ...... . 

Two nurses are en route here from h ' S t d . f th to . · courthouse as the symbol of the Law in ties TO INCREASE FACULTY.._ ROAD WORK PROGRESSES c l'f . h th' sop 1a ex on, nver o e au m , . . . , • 
a I omla, and are expected ere . lS . which Mr. Whitaker was riding, were I this country, and, in domg so, defined ·l He was b:>rn on Elkhorn Creek. Pike .. 

Grade work on the Mayo Trail has 
been completed from the Tom May 
property below here to the corporate 
limits of Prestonsburg, where work has 
been halted by the state with a view to 

week to begin work m connection With ' . . 1 the obligations of the county officials county and taught 1n the rural schoolS I ---' . InJured. I · : • 
the county health un_It, Mrs. Pearl · Fess Whitaker was one of the most as the servants of that law. He stated , of that county for a number of years. Prestonsburg schoo,ls opened Moxiday 
the county health umt. Mrs. Pearl , colorful figures of the mountains. Sev- ; that the Floyd county bar had a dis- :For the ;:m;;t 35 years he ha:l been a morning upon what promises to be the 
Whitehead . state health nurse from 1 h • . th tinguished history, and said that the: lawyer a profession in which he was most successful school term yet con-L i ·u 1 ft Th r d 0 ning for e:a years ago e was g1ven e 1 , 

ou svi e. ~ u s ay m r pseudonym of the "jailed jailer" as the: present bar was one of the strongest in ve~y sJccessf~<!. ducted here. . 
Webster county after assistmg Dr. . . . Kentucky. I U - the c.e~th of Ci4cu'" Judge . Up till Tuesday of this week with . . I result of hiS bemg incarcerated m his • pc.. - · '" • ' changing the route from Third a,· nue Martm tn the work here until the ar- ; . . . I Reviewing the work of the past year J hn F :sut'er e'ght years ago Mr the enrollment steadily growing 102 · 1 f th t . h ill b •own jaiL While a pnsoner, he an- : o . • • • ., • , 

through town to Second a\·enue. enter- nv11, o e ~0 nUises w 0 w. . e reg- ' nounced himself a candidate for coun- · in the schoolS here, Professor . Currey 
1 
vanov<!:· was appointed to _fill out his _had enrolled in high school, 155 in the 

ing near the transfo:·ming station of ularly emplo)ed With the umt m this t j d d t ears a"'O he was I expressed the hope that th1s year , unexp'~ect term The strenuous fight 1 primary departments and approxl.m~te-county ' v u ge, an wo Y "' I ' ' .• . I tat the power company. · . a-gain elected j:~iler, which office he 

1 

w~uld see much more ~ccomplished. , which he sub~equ~ntly _led aga.inst ly 300 in the other grades-;-a to en-
Work on the Big Mud Creek road has _ _ I held at the th~1e of his deat):l. H1s outlook upon the situation here 

1 
whisk:: resulted m his sendmg to pnson I rollment of _more than 550 pupils. 

progressed to a point near Toler"s GET HALF l\IILLIO::\ Cl1BIC 't k d f t d 1 and else-where in Floyd county where his Ol''::l sen' "If I smell whisky on I School opening here was marked bY· 
FEET GAS I'' S 'I T S , ,.D · Mr. Whl a e:- was e ea e severa . . . . . .• •. _ _ Creek. Though no dressing has been. ' • ·" . .-,. • ·"-·" i b J h W L 1 f C I he has vlslted, was very optimiStic. any man·s breath " declared Judge I no special program, and the Immediate 1 vears ago y o .n . ang ey or on- I ' 

done on the route. the road is passable . . · . • He ,,·as a veteran of many pol- 1 Commenting upon the work of Super- Vanover, "he will tell where he got it or attention of the faculty was given to 
to traffic from Toler's Creek dO\\'ll. A gas well producmg a nJiu:ne of gies~- · 1 intendent John Stephens and the Floyd to · ·1" the actual work ahead. - · f t . . · d · IItiCa: c::.m~Ja :;ns. · g::> Jal . . . Shoveling on the Middle Creek r?ad .)00;000 ~ublc ee "as d!Ille . 1~ M~n- . ; County Board of Education, Prof. Cur- j Judge Vanover was a me~ber of t[\e Announcement by Superintendent T. 
has reached a point near Katy Friend da) mommg on the w. H. F~t~p_at~Ick 1 • rey said that they m conJunctwn had 

1
c:1ristian Church, of which he had J. Currey that Prestonsburg High 

Branch. No dressing has been done to lease by the Inland Gas CoipoiatiOn. l Three Stills Found And effectec. a wonderful work in the past , bee:J :m elde= for the last quarter or a School would· be represented th1s yea.r 
that point, but this road is also pass- Gas. was . struck. m the salt sand. , Alleged 'Shiners' Taken year by erecting four modern brick ' century. on the gridiron was received by tb~ 
able. Ditching work is expected to ChaiJes Williams >A as contractmg dnll- I school buildings in this county. His I He is survived by his widow and ll student body. Practice will be begun ·~t 
start next week. er on the well. -. --. . speech was enthusiastically received by ·children. once, ,and every effort will be bent to. 

Reasons given for not dressihg these Preparations were made to shoot the ~hree 1: 10_onshme -~till: and_ ~~~ men the club. I ward whipping intO shape a wlhning 
routes are that the roads are to be ac- ' Holbrook well No. 4, on Middle Creek, wele cap.ured ThLu,da} ~Oinm,, last Joe P. Tackett, who provided the . team. . 
cepted by the fiscal court as a whole, Wednesday morning. in the shale for- '\':eek._ on Cow. Creek by ~ner11I T. Y. program, one of the J:J.ost interesting to DEATH CLAIMS A greater variety of athletics will be 
and if this work were done now the en- : mation, but results had not been learn- I Martin. Deputy Sher,ffs W · D. _Martm, · be given here this year by the club, 1 ' engaged in here this school year than 
tire route on each contract would have . ed here Wednesday. Grover Allen and Rufus Martm, who made brief and appropriate comment . TOBY u·EREFO' RD ever before, with a fizle baske~baU ftoor 
to be dressed again before being ac- : destroyed about 400 gallo:JS of mash at 1 upon the subjects discussed by Prof. ! available and a competent coach in the 
ceptable. , ONE KILLED IN the two stills. A few gallons of whisky I Currey and Mr. Stephens. . person of Professor Allisqn, and an 

Construction of the bridge at Auxier ! were found. . . I Miss Edith Fitzpatrick regaled the abundance of ma,terial !or this game, . 
ia ""ell under way, and It 1s held possi- ! ! Two of the stills were found on the I club with her singing, playing her own track, and other sports. 
ble that the -span wll1 be opened to I KNOTT COUNTY I Mary Burchett Branch, and two alleg- accompaniment. The last number, Prominent Citizen of Another high school teacher is being' 
tramc within the next 40 days. The : 

1
1 e~ operators were arrested; Another \"Lindy Lou," a Southern ne·gro melody, Cli•ff Found Dead In brought here this week, and will serve 

bridge at East Point will also be opened 1 still was captured on the J.m Tussey was rendered with. inimitable charm, to distribute more evenly the teaching 
in a short time, it 1s said, and the I --- farm, but the owners escaped. to the delight of her hearers. Home burden and to facilitate work iD the 
Mayo TraU bridge across Abbott may Townsel Martin Slain By 

1 

The men arrested were brought here. I Rev. F. R. McAllister l;ead an enter- high school. 
be Opened in the next 20 days~ 1 Co Sin s nda where they gave bond for their appear-~ taining. paper, which embraced' both .;_----'---

An encour&elng report was made , U N• hU Y ance in court. the philosophical and the humorous. Toby Hereford, 56 years old, promin· SIX (lJDICTED 
this . week ~ •tt was said here that : Ig t I I ' . . ent .Floyd county man. ~ounf de~ . - m 
:::.~ ~:t ~~ :",';':.~: A>hland , Wo.d «rel"d !com Glo "" that • 

1 ASKS CITIZENS I HALL DIES UNDER :::a~t hm homo a CWf P>lday . . FOR MURDER 
To BUILD ANNEX i ~;~t~~~~u~~~~f:·~~;~:.:~·.Fi~~ ! TO ATTEND FAIR 1 MASS OF SLATE! ~:eg~~:e::~~~~i: ::~~~~::;~~e:; 

' 
anc! the serious wounding of another. i 1 ' I · morning. He had been a sufferer fror;~ , d J Ad • 

FOR VALLEY INN Townser Martin, 22 years old, was rheumatism for years, and for the last Gran ury JOUrns 
3not and kllled by Irvin Meade, it is re- 'C t A t A · . oun y gen .'-l.nnoun- .H . Sl t H ld six years had been obliged to use 1i1 Saturday· 76 True 
pc .. rted. Martin's horse was also killed I . ' anging a e 0 s wheel chair in all of his lim_ited trav- B.'l R' t d 

W. B Westbrook Con­
tractor on Hotel Ad­

dition 

by ~ bullet. It is said. Ben Layne is ·, ces Part of Prog~am i' Back lVIen As Victim els. I! s e urne 
the wounded· man. For County Fmr 

Meade. a cousin of the slain man and ; Asks Help Thot1gh handicapped thus, Mr. Here-
brother-in-law of Layne, fled from the ; ! ford, by foresight and sheer industry, seventy-six inc1ictments were return-

. scene of the shooting, and has not With the ~.pproach of October 3, the : I had been successful in truck farming . ed by the g:-:md jury, which adjourned 
been apprehended · rt is believed that ; date upon which the Floyd County : Will Hall, who was known by many :He was a worthy citizen and was a here Saturday. S ix of these indict­
he is in hiding in the Letcher county 1 Fair opens here, County Agent Fred : Floyd county c!tizens, was crushed to member of a prominent family of this ments were for wilful murder. 
hills. 1 L::o·::.::"n issued a statement to the peo- ' death Friday in the mines of the Con- county. Murder indictments were made Contract !or . the construction of a t 

Martin was a son of Tilton Martin p!<! ci t:·~ c:u:·: y, requestina the at- solidation Coal Company a Van Lear Mr. Hereford was never married. He against the following men: 24-room annex to the Valley Inn was ' . . . 1 " b " · f 1 t f 11 I· · · was married and leaves three or four te::::.~nce of C!L:ens of the county, that Y a .. enes o s a e- a s. . IS surv1ved by his mother, Mrs. Flor- Caspar Osborn for the killing of Har-awarded this week to W . B . West- . . . . . H 11 · 1 . · tt . ' . 
1 t . children. His alleged slayer was a son th:' ~an· :nay...,.) made a real· success. , a. was an emp oye m • .e power ence Hereford, of Cliff, and four broth- ~ g1s Nelson; Jeff Hall for kllllng Rich-

brook, loca con ractor, by Mrs. Maggie of John Meade. 1 While the complete program for the 1 plant. and was killed whi!e in the ers, Sarpuel and George P. Hereford, of ard Hall, his brother: Carl Atkins for 
Sellards, owner of the hoteL : ' event has not been worked out, Mr. mine connecting electrical equipment. ' Pikeville, and T. M. and B. P. Hereford, the fatal shooting of Bee Burchett; 

The annex, which will be three stor- NAMED AS T.-::ACHER Lawson announces· in the following ' The first shower of slate pinned Rail of Prestonsburg. John Dyer for slayfng Bill aad Oscar 
1es high bailt of brick wlll provide a . . . 1 t th fi f th · b t t f · · ' ' , Mrs. Clara Wanx has been selected statement mterestmg phases already . o e oor o e mme, u was no c Funeral services were conducted sat- Blizzard, brothers; Craig Hamilton for 
model!n addition to Mrs. Sellards ho- by the county board of education to fill , decided upon: sufficient weight to kill him. Pinr:.~ :! urday afternoon by the Rev. J. D. Bell, killing Tucker Hall; Ervin Clark and 
~1• and will be used entirely for room- ' the vacancy caused in the Garrett "The success of this, our second an- beneath the slate, he called to fellovr of the Prestonsburg M. E. Church, George Spears, alleged Ners of Bud 
m~r .Purposes. Eight rooms will be lo- . school by the resignation of Alex De- 1 nual county fair , depends upon the· workmen for help, bu~ hanging slate south, at th,e Hereford home, and bur- Adkins; Warnle Cline for the slaying 
catecl on the first tloor, 16 on the sec- rossett. ! people of Floyd county. Your attend- ' which threatened to drop held them ial was made in the family cemetery of Jake Collins. 
~ and a roomJ b6sement wlll be Superintendent John Stephens and ' ance is of prime importance. and I , back. A second fall of ·slate came a. under the direction of E. p, ~ld, "Crime u on the increase,"· says tbe 
provided. The addition will be sepa- Alex Spradlin after visiting a number trust that you will be present and thus 1 few minutes later, but still the imprls- undertaker. grand jury report, excerpts of wb1ch 
rated from the main hotel building by of schools in the county, said Monday help to place Floyd county on a status 1 oned man begged for help. A few sec- 1 follow: 
a court. TUe baths and modern con- I d 1 te th thi d d 1 t f 11 1 that they had never before seen the at- : with surrounding counties in the mat- on s a r e r an as a "There' is an abundance or crime be-
yenlences will form the many improve- tendance so strong. : ter of offering a real fair. :crushed hi~ ~ deat~. _ I FUGITIVE FROM 1ng committed in our count):. Moon-
JDeDte,. , : "At this fair prizes will be awarded I The victim 1s survived by his w1dow · shine stills are being run in almost ev-
. Work will bet'ln Mo~day on the con- WELL YIELDS I !or the best pens of seven cl:ilckens, i and two children. He was a member , ery section of Flo1d county. Pistols 
tr"ct, and LA expected ~ be completed ! ducks, geese and turkeys. 1 of the Masonic order, and Masons con- ! JUSTICE TAKEN are being carried and murder commit-
by March 1. Several ot_her contractors . "The Junior Agricultural Clubs will ' ducted rites at his funeral. I ~- False swea.ring has become so 
submitted bids on the JOb. GAS AND OIL 1 h"ave exhibits of all their products, and 1 common that It Is dtmcult to get sum-

Prestonsburg's building program is ' prizes will be awarded to first and sec- I Th H t Wh B j cient information to either indict or 
moving smoothly, .and a number of ree ur en us i t th i in Is t •his t ond choice in each group. 1 • . Frank Fitch, fugitive so_ught by the conv c e cr m a o ~ coun y,. buildings will soon be com-pleted. The W k N L 

"Prizes will also be award_ed on far_ m , rec s ear OUISa federal government, was captured last I and som_ e a_ction., should be taken to handsome brick residence of J . M. Me-
Drillers for the Louisville Gas and and garden products. all kmds of l!ve _. _ week by Deputy Sheriff Ep Laferty at 

1 
stop this cnme. . 

rell is ready for finishing work, and will srock. fancy ne<'dle work. cooking. can- Tram and lod.,.
0
ed in jail here until •'-e ' The report states that publlc•bwld-Eiectric Company, wor:-ing on the Rob- - s t 17 o "'' 

soon be ready for ·occupancy. The of n ing and dairy products. Louisa. Ky., ep · - ne man was arrival Saturday of a federal agent, · ings examined are in gCJO!i condition, 
'Bwghes building is ready for the roof, ert Ousley well on Spurlock fork "Prizes will be awarded for school oc- probably hurt and two others seriously who took h:m to the prison at Atlanta, \' and the methods of the circuit judge 
.... d the courthouse annex ;r also nea1· Middle Creek. struck oil and gas Wed- • · · d at dawn Saturday when a b"s · .... "' - th·it!es. including grade and high InJure • ~ Georgia. and the commonwealth's attorney in lng th•- stage of progress The first nesda:: mornmg at a depth of 1380 of t l1e Big Sandy Bus Lirtes Companv. d th "' · school work. Special invitation is ex- Fitch was first convicted for break-

1 
handling crime are approve by e story of the Layne building was up this feet. missed the road in a dense fog two 

tended to public schools to enter the inrr into a box car, it is said here, and Jury. week, and work will be pushed rapidly Conditions exist!ng bf.'cause of gas mi!es s;Juth of here and \i'ent over a b 

1 t and oil being struck simultaneously contests. f r f b , t escaped from the penitentiary. A re- ~ toward its comp e ion. .. f t' fair Will be gil'en i.ty- oo~ em nn.tmcn . 
made a fair estimate of tl~l' \'alue or the '·Full detailS 0 !1e Tl~e bus driver. ~: r.:im named Jones. ward of $50 had been offered for his Mrs. Nancy Dials Dies 

bl F I d m the catalogue. \\ hich will be distrib- apprehension. WOM:\N JAILED HERE. HELD well impossi e. 1r~t e.'l1mates Pace 1 w;-:o !·ecently ca!!'le here from Oklaho- Th d t A f 82 l:leci !~.tel. and these detail.> wil be urs ay a ge 0 .-\S ACCO::\IPLICE IX KILLIXG the \'Olumc of the P~ n: 1.50J.OOO cu- ma, suffered concussion of the brain, Deputy She~iff L2.ferty came upon 
• 0 ;ntblished in next weel:·~ issue of our h f ·t· h d ' . 

Susie Cook, about 25 years old. was 
brought here Tuesday morning from 
Jack 's Creek and lodged in the Floyd 
county jail as an alleged accomplicl' m 
the killing last week of Richard Hall 
by his brother, J eff :H:all, at Bates· 
store on that cree:<. 

b:c f£'~t and the oil yil'ld at ;:. barrels. a crushed chest and a broken thi~h. t e ug1 1ve, w o was 1sgu1sed in I . 
bu t it !s be!ie1·ed that t£'st~ will cut thi5 l:Jcal pape:·s. Jay Short. of this county, and John woma:1's clothes and was picking a • Mrs. Nancy Dials, 82 years old, died --c-et readY. I:;r:n:; you:· familie!; and 1 

coc!wan, Fallsburg, employes of the banjo. Recognizing him from photo- · at her home at Lancer Thursday, Sep-
t 1_1e mN·~ yo<u· fn~nds. He!;> make these h h 1 

Sta~e Highwa.y Derpnment. were seri- grnphs yvhic e had seen, he placed tember . 15, after a lingering Illness. tl1• ('? days the big days in Floyd coun- , 

I'St ! r.~n~e in half. or probo.bJ~· more. 
A nc1ghbo:·ing \\'ell drilled by 

Piney 011 and Gas Compan~· is report­
ed to yield oi!. 

Jeff Hall is still i:1 jail here. l~aYing 
fahled to furnish b: nd. 

HOSTESS TO DI:-;:'\ER 
!\I~.·s . E. P. Ar:1o!d c:1tcrtained to din-

nt'r Fr!day l\lr~. S!epiH' Il P:cra:t. c:,f ·I'-lt. 
Ster ling. Ky. : !\Irs. C'. L. Hutsmp1ller. 

ED P. HILL AD::'IIITTED TO B:\R of Ashland: i\li·s. Jo!1n Hensley. of 
Edward P. Hill, son of Judge and HenC:erson. Texa~ and ::>Irs. N. M . 

Mrs.· Ed Hill, was one of the number White. Jr .. of Pre:, t~nsot:rg. 

of a'pplicants to pass the stae bar ex- I - - --- - -
amination, reports given out this week E . G. Jesse. of Ve1sarlles. arri,·ed 
state. here Thursday morning. and mo.y be-

ously hurt. Fitch under arrest. l The deceased was one of. the oldest 
Shcrt. take:-~ to an Ashland hospita 1 ! women in this county. She was a de-

t:.·. 

~~.·,th Jones. su!Tered a broken leg and DELIVERS SERMOS i vout member of the Christian Church, 
cuts nbo~t the heart Cochran is in a . and highly respected by all who knew 

Fune!·al S"n·icC' for the infant L C.!l.'>::l hospital with a crushed chest : her. 
cn·1g!1ter of I\lr. and M~s. Bert Ham- and broken ~ h::> ~tider ben!'. Morton R ei'. K G. Griswold, veteran Meth- . Surviving her are one son, A. D. 
mot;d were conducted Saturday after- S!:orl. a son of the injured Short, es- odist mi:1ister of Fullerton, Ky., con- ' Dials, and a brother, Edward Dials, of 
n ::on by Re·;. Ge::>!'ge Rose and ReY. J. c._:e~: t:nh<::·~. dt1cted SH\'l::es at the Pilgr-im_ Holiness 

1 
Pond Creek, Ky. 

L. Bo>A·Iing. of the Holiness Ci1:nch. Church here Tuesday mght. . Funeral services were conducted Fii-
and burial was made m the Wedding- R e·;erend Griswold is a native of this ! day afternoon, and burial was made in 
ton cemetery unde:· :i1e cilrl'Ci ion of E. ORGASIZE BASKET CLl"B . county, being born on Abbott, and at- j the family cemetery, G . D. Ryan, of the 
P . Arnold. undertaker. I tended school hera forty years ago Prestonsburg Undertaking Company, 

Bl.'Rl:\L ~:\Tl'RDAY 

Mr. Hill completed a law course from ! come a member of the faculty of Pres- T. L. Martin, of Centernlle. Ind .. ar-
the College of Law In Louisville this ll tons burg High SchooL Mr. Jesse is a rived Monday for a visit with Mr. and 
year, and is a very promising young graduate of the Umvers1ty of Ken- : Mrs. W. R. Goble. Mr. Martm, who Is 

Mr. Victoria Spradlin has organized · when Professor Hampton taught here. directing. 
a basket clul:t in her room of the school! ~e also taught in this county for some 
here. Pupils in each room will take I time. 

man. tucky. I a native of this county. motored here. 
part in some sort o! club worlc during G. D. Ryan spent the day Tuesday In 
the year, it ' is announced. PaintavWe. 

C. D. McHone purchased of Waid 
Cross this week Mr. cross· property em 
Second 11tteet. 
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Stumbo Majorettes Are Winners 

John M. Stumbo majorettes in top picture are, in front row, 
from right to left, Jennie McKinney, Selina Hall, Reneee 
·Tackett, Karrie Newsome, Anitra Stumbo. In back, from left, 
are Devina Hall, Marsha Adkins, Tammy Hall, and Tina 
Tackett . 

Majorettes in the bottom picture are, in front row from left 
to right, Patricia Lawson, Tammy Johnson, Vanessa hall, 
and Tina Adkins. In back Row, from left to right, are Carrie 
Adkins, Lisa Mitchell, Lavonda Ratliff, Leanne Hall, Dessi 
Hamilton, Sheila Newsome, and Michelle Tackett. 

• 
RADIALS 

L~W s29 155SRI2 AS Blockwoll 

A78-13 

SAVE '59" TO '111" ON A SET OF 4 SAVE '47" TO '83" 
ONASfTOF4 

GLASS BELTED WHITEWAll 

All 13" SIZES $35.00 TO $31.00 

All 14 • SIZES $41.00 
Al l IS" SIZES $39.00 TO 553.00 

STEEL BELTED WHITEWAll 

"ALL SEASONS" 01 REGULAR TREAD 
All 13" SIZES $36.00 TO $42.00 
All 14" SIZES $52.00 
All 15" SIZES $51.00 

All 13" SIZES $21.00 TO $32.00 
All 14 • SIZES $31.00 
All IS" SIZES $42.00 

• POLYESTER CORD 
. AS LOW AS 

RAISED OURINED WHITE LETTERS 4FoR596 
AS LOW AS SERIES 60 SERIES 70 A78-13 Blockwoll 

SAVE '47" TO '87" $33 All 13" SIZES $37.00 All 13" SIZES $33.00 

~~i :~: ~:~~~ ~:: ~~~ :;: ~:~~~ ~:: • 
SERIES 60 RADIAL 

ONA SETOF4 

All 13" WHITEWAll SIZES $27.00 
All 14" WHITEWAll SIZES $36.00 
All 15" WHITEWAll SIZES $39.00 

A70-13 GR60-1 4 AND GR60-15 ONLY $56.00 
DlockwaH available In Jome slus 

at S3.00 less 

Most U S. Cars 

, Road Contender 
Shocks offer 6 
stage valvmg. 
1 3/ 16" pisl on & 
tnple weld lower 
mount 
Pluo Installation 

ELECTRONIC 
IGNITION 

ENGINE TU~E-UP 

2488 ~:~; 
4 Cyl 

TOUGH TRUCK TIRES 

$55LAR TREAD AS ~~i:w~~ RAISED OUTLINED 
H78 IS $58.00 WHITE LEITERS 

l78-15 $62.00 31 -10.50-15 $64.00. 

Slackwall 31 -11.50-1 S 67.00 
G78 -15 WhHewoll 
8.00-16.5 Block well 

8.75-16.5 $61.00 
9.50·16.5 $64.00 

33-12.50·15 a3.00 

Most u. S. Cars 

• Adjust caster. camber & toe • El~clro~call~ spin balance 
front wheels • Includes air conditione car 

ALIGNMENT AND 4 WHEEL BALAN CE $29.88 
TofSion Bar Adjustment Extra. If Needed 

HEAVY DUTY MUFFLER 

L.JIIIIIIII~~r~ 

• Inst all new spark plugs • Adlust carburetor • Set t iming 
• Comp lete electncal system check 

6 
Cyl. 

529
_88 8 Cyl. $34.88 s tandard Ignition $10 More 

HERCULON 
SEAT COVER 

1297 

Weddington Pla:&a - Pikeville 

Appletree Pla:&a - Palnhvllle JUITIAY 

"CHARGE IT" 

The Floyd County Times Section Two, Page Eleven· 

Is Pinehurst Tourney Winner Catfish Catch Attends MSU Camp 

Paul Howa1·d, son of Ml'. and Mrs. 

Tony Branham pictured following Pinehurst tournament win. 
Willis Howard, Jr., of Hippo, caught 
this string of catfish at Royalton pay 
lake June 29. Tony Branham, son of Paul and Pluma Branham, of Allen, returned a win­

ner from weekend golt tournament competition at the prestigious Pinehurst 
N. C. golf resort. ' 

Championship Wrestling .Rep:esenting Kentucky Carpet, of Allen, the 22-year-old Branham, along 
w1th h1s uncle, Bob Branham, entered the tourney, which was sponsored by 
Woody's Floor Covering, with 66 other golfers from various parts of 
the Southeast. When the tournament concluded Saturday, young Branham 
was awarded the trophy for overall champion based on low net score of 72 on 
the par 72 course. 

James Dwayne Hall, senior a t Betsy 
Layne High School, has just completed 
a week of basketball camp at 
Morehead State University. Hall, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Carl C. Hall, of Betsy 
Layne, was sponsored at the camp by 
Robert Coleman and Ronnie Justice, 
managers of Velocity Market a t Betsy 
Layne. 

Branham also won four dozen golf balls for two closest to pins and two 
longest drives . Branham and his uncle both served as team captains during 
the competition which featured a total of 17 teams. 

Tony has been an avid golfer since age 12 and regularly plays courses in 
West Virginia and Ashland area as well as Paintsville. 

Kentucky 
Fishing 
Report 

Frankfort, Ky., July 6- Night fishing 
continues to be the best bet at most 
Kentucky lakes but some white bass 
and bluegill are also being taken dur­
ing the daylight hours. The lake-by­
lake rundown, according to the Depart­
ment of Fish and Wildlife Resources: 

KENTUCKY-Sauger good trolling 
and on minnows; white bass excellent 
(and large sized) on spoons; bluegill 
good on willow flies; in tailwaters, cat­
fish and white bass good; clear, stable 
at summer pool and 78'. 

BARKLEY- White bass fair in the 
jumps ; bluegill good; in tail waters, 
catfish excellent; white bass and 
bluegill slow; clear, stable at summer 
pool and 79'. 

BARREN- Black bass fair on spin­
ner baits and artificial nightcrawlers ; 
whit~ ba_ss fa1r t':olling and in !he 
jumps in early morning and late after­
noon ; clear, falling at 10 feet above 
summer pool and 80°. 

NOLIN- Black bass slow at night on 
deep runners ; white bass good on sur­
face baits; crappie and bluegill slow; 
clear, stable at one foot above summer 
pool and 84'. 

ROUGH RIVER- Crappie slow at 
night ; bluegill slow; murky, falling at 
four feet above summer pool and 86'. . 

HERRINGTON- Black bass fair at 
night on artificial nightcrawlers along 
deep banks; bluegill fair along deep 
banks ; clear to murky, stable at sum­
mer pool and 84" . 

GREEN- Black bass fair at night on 
artificial nightcrawlers; bluegill good 
on worms and crickets ; clear to 
murky, stable at summer pool and so•. 

CUMBERLAND- Black bass slow at 
night on artificial nightcrawlers ; white 
bass and crappie fair to good at night 
under lights about 30 feet deep off 
points in the main lake ; walle~e good 
trolling over mud banks and points in 
main lake with deep runners ; in 
tailwaters, trout excellent (some 
limits); clear, stable at 7 feet below the 
timberline and 84'. 

DALE HOLLOW- White bass good 
at night off deep banks and points ; 
crappie fair over submerged cover ; 
walleye fair trolling across points with 
deep runners; clear, stable at one foot 
above normal pool and 84'. 

LAUREL- Trout good at night ; 
bluegill fair in the shallows; clear, fa ll­
ing slowly at 4 feet below power pool 
a nd81'. 

CAVE RlJN- Black bass fair at night 
and early morning on spinner ba its and 
artificial nightcrawlers off deep 
banks; bluegill fair on worms; clear, 
stable at summer pool and 80' . 

BUCKHORN- White bass and crap­
pie fair at night over stickups; bluegill 
good on crickets; clear to murky, fall ­
ing slowly at summer pool and 84°. 

GRAYSON- Crappie slow over 
submerged cover; bluegill fair ; clear 
to murky, stable atone foot above sum­
mer pool and 81". 

DEWEY- Crappie and bluegill slow 
over s tickups and treetops; murky, 
stable at summer pool and 79'­

FISHTRAP- Crappie and bluegill 
slow; clear to murky, stable at sum­
mer pool and so•. 

Subscription 
Rates Per Year 
In Floyd County, $8.00 
Elsewhere in Kentucky, $10 
Outside Kentucky, $12.50 

Please note expi..-ation d ate 
oppos ite your name on wrap­
per or on your c opy of The 
Times. Because of increased 
mailing costs, notices of sub­
scription expiration are no 
longer mailed to subscribers. 

Catches Big Hybird 
Benefits under the Black Lung 

Benefits Reform Act of 1977 are ad­
ministered by the U.S. Department of 
Labor's Office of Workers' Compensa­
tion Programs. 

D&JTROPHY 
& GIFT SHOP 
At Dinwood (Between the Twin Bridges) 

LEAPING LANNY MARTIN, KY. 
• International championship wrestl­

ing is coming to Prestonsburg Friday 
night when four matches will be staged 
at the Prestonsburg High School gym­
nasium, beginning at 8:30. 

The events are being sponsored by 
the Athletic Department of the high 
school. 

WE OFFER TRO­
PHIES IN ALL SIZES 
AND PRICE RANGES. 

• 
FREE ENGRAVING 

• 
285-9335 
285-3122 

7·1·2t. 

In the main event the 7-foot , 
500-pound Crusher Broomfield will 
clash with the exciting Leaping Lanny. 
Ch~if Tapu will tangle with Pistol Pez 
Whatley. The Miser, from parts 
unknown, will match up with tough 
Rick Winters, and Dan Burdick will 
take on the highly skilled and con­
troversial wrestler, The Samoan. THIS WEEK'S RATE: 

This 27-lb., 39-inch hybrid bass 
(white ba<;s-rockfish c•·oss) was caught 
by Bobby McGuire, of Price, last 
Wednesday while fishing on Norris 
Lake, Tennessee. McGuiJ·e was fishing 
with buddies, Goble Tackett, of Price, 
and Sammie E. Wells, of Prestons­
burg. 

Tennis Tourney Slated 
The Kenny Huffman Memorial 

Scholarship Tennis Tournament will be 
held July 29 - Aug. 8 at the Pikeville 
College tennis courts. Events will in­
clude men's and women's singles, 
men's and women's doubles, and mix­
ed doubles. Entry deadline is 6 p.m. 
Sunday, July 26. Applications may be 
picked up at Dawahare's, J .. M Fur­
niture, Whiz Auto. For further infor­
mation call Sa ndra Branham at 
432-9241 or Jeanne Ratliff at 432-8834. 

Athletic Department representatives 
expeot a big crowd, and for that reason 
advise fans to come early for both 
ringside and general admission seats. 

Horse Show Date 
Changed To Saturday 

The D. & R. Horse Show which was 
scheduled for June· 'n at Robbie 
Johnson 's at Myra, Ky., will be held in­
stead this coming Saturday at the 
same location. 

Trophies, ribbons and prize money 
totaling $2,000 will be given away to 
class winners during the two shows 
which are set for 3 p.m. and 7 p.m. 

Under the Bank Land Benefits 
Reform Act of 1977, miners disabled 
from pneumoconiosis (black lung) are 
eligible to receive monthly payments 
and medical treatment, and survivors 
can also qualify for benefits, according 
to the publication "U.S. Department of 
Labor." 

14.30% 
JULY 7-JULY 14 

26 WEEKS/182 DAYS 
MONEY MARKET 
CERTIFICATES 

Subsbntial Penalty for Early Withdrawal 

FIRST 
COMMONWEALTH 

BANK 
886-2321 

PRESTONSBURG 
MARTIN 

BETSY lAYNE 

-----·--- - ·- -----·--- ----- -

@ JUI.;ecltRN.VAL 
OF AUTOMOTIVE VALUES 
Summertime Savings thru July 18 

CO-OP PD 
POLY TIRES 

plus $1 .58 FET 
A78·13.4·ply 
Polyester cord 
wh itewalls 

Size 

$3595 

Value 
Pr1ce 

FET 

8 78·1 3 $37.95 $1 .7 1 
C78·13 38.95 1.84 
C78·14 38.95 1 87 
0 78 ·1 4 39.95 1.93 
E78· 14 39 .95 2.04 
F78· 14 42 .95 2.14 
G78·14 44.95 2.2 8 
H78·14 47 .95 2 .52 
F78-15 43.95 2.20 
G78· 15 44 .95 2 .36 
H78-15 47.95 2.57 
J78-15 50 .95 2 .79 
L78· 15 51.95 284 

Outstanding mileage. durability. road control . Free 
mounting. No blems or seconds. First quality Federal 
Govt. quality graded Treadwear 100, Tract1on B. Tem· 
perature C. 

EXTRA 
HEAVY DUTY 

"48" 
BATTERIES 

AS LOW AS 

.. 

$ 3 8 95
12-voll No EHD·2~F 

6-voltNo. EHD-1 ... . . .. . ... $41 95 

12-volt No. EHD-24 or EHD-24F. $4295 

12-volt No. EHD-74ST . . . $4595 

. . $5395 12-volt No. EHD-27 . . . 
(All prices plus your old battery) 

These durable batteries have extra plates for extra 
pep and dependability We can fit just about any model 
auto. 

1~1 V!f:~~r.-~. t ARM & HOME STORE 
Phone 886-8596 Prestonsburg Use these betnk cardS where accep1ee1 

or llSk aboul COS lnsta~menl Terms 



California 
Red or White Thompson Seedless 

Grapes 

99~ 
11We Gladly 

Accept 
USDA Government 
FOOD STAMPS': 

California Nectarines or 69C 
Red Plums ... Lb. 

at 
PIGGLY 
WIGGLY 

AT THIS CONVENIENT LOCATION: 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
PIGGLY WIGGLY 

FRESH MEAT! 

USDA Choice $15 9 
Ground Chuck ...... Lb. 

USDA Choice Boneless $16 9 
Chuck Steaks ...... Lb. 

USDA Choice Boneless $18 9 
Shoulder Steaks .. Lb. 

Quarter Frying 7 9 C 
Chicken Breast ..... Lb. 

Quarter Frying 6 9 C 
Chicken Legs ........ Lb. 

Piggly Wiggly 12 99C 
Sliced Bacon ...... :kzg. 

Piggly Wiggly 12 99 C 
Franks .............. Pokzg. 

(;;;;~ocabbage 19~. uCsDUAbCehoicSe Btoenealekss$$Lb. 219 Mom&Pop $149 Country Bacon ..... Lb. 

New Crop of • L~. 69C 
SLICING IS ALWAYS FREE!· te Omonsaag 

GR\OCERIVI VALUES\ 

Si~;wberry Preserves ~~~~'·$1 29 
Mt.onve 69C 
Hamburger Dill Chips . 2~~~z. Coffee 

1 
Great For Cooking $119 

• 32-0z. Rea lemon Ju1ce ........... Jar . 

Del Monte Chunky 6 7 C 
M• d F •t 16-0z IXe rul .............. ..... Can. 

99 
• Reg. • ADC 
• Drip 
• Elect. Perk 

Del Monte ' 6 7 C 
Fruit Cocktail .......... ..... 1~~~z. 

DAIRY 
For Your Dishes 99 C 
Palmolive Liquid .. ...... .. 2~-~-z. 

Halves or Slices 6 7 C 
Del Monte Pears .......... ~~~~z. 

Flav-0-Rich 89 C f • • Gal ru It D rl n k . ' . ' ..... ' . ' ... ' ... ' . Cont. 

vietti 39c 10Y2·0z. Hot Dog Sauce . . . . . . . . . . . . can 

Golden Best Boxed 99C 
Laundry Detergent ...... 4~!z. 

Flav-0-Rich · 99 C 
Light Milk ..................... ~~~~~· 

. . 

Kraft $159 
Velveeta Cheese .... ..... 1:k~~· 

Colgate (Regular, Menthol, Lime or Medicated) 7 9 C 
I t t Sh 11-0z. ns an a Y .. .. .. . .. .. .. Can 

Flav-0-Rich $14 9 
Ice Cream....... .. .... .... ~~~~~- . 

Coffee Creamer $13 9 
C a 16-0z. remor ............. .......... Jar 

Tony Beef, Liver, Chicken 5 $1 
15-0z. For . Dog Food ... .... .... .. ..... can 
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• 
ADVERTISED ITEM POLICY 

E.ach of these Cldverlased ttems IS r9Qulfed tO De 
raadoly avaolable for sale on sach Krogeo Store 
~nol.edW"11tlosild 

e•cept as 
rt - 00 run out ol an aovertl-' 

n~~m . we Mil oHe< you your chooce of a com par able otem. 
....t1en ava•lable. ref1ecto~ the same savongs or a raoncheck 
...tloch w•ll ent1tle you to pUrchase the adver11sed tern at the 
advt!rt1sed pnce 1Mthon 30 davs 

TOTAL SATISFACTION GUARANTEE 
Everylhong you buy at Kroger •S guarani~ for you1 total 
satosiactoon regardless of manufac turer If you are not s.at1s 
fled Krooe< woll replace your otem w 1th the same brana 01 a 
comparable brand 0< refund vour purchase proce 

COPYRIGHT Jq8t THE KROGER CO ITEMS AND PRICES 
GOOD SUNDAY JUlY 5 THRIJ SATURD·\l' JUlY II Jq811N 
PIKEVILLE STORE. 
•'IE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO liMIT QUANTITIES NOI\'E 
SOlD TO D£Al ERS · 

FROZEN 

Banquet 
Fried Chicken 

2$ 39 
-lb. 
Pkg. 

WHOLE FllESH 

UMIJ 2 PLEASE 

Boston Butt $12-9 
SLICED INTO 

Pork Steaks ..... lb. 

6't.C11t ·~ • 
· ._....,~ · · FRESH DRESSED $2 69 

- ~·-_)'f-) Cat 1sh .......... lb. 

·7~/- i FRESH FLOUNDER _ $199 
• rJW11t ·~ • 

"- ~-----'.P F1lle-ts .............. lb . 

• 

-~ ..... ,.-' FRESH • $2 99 
·-- ~(,~ Trout F1llets ... lb. 

Kroger 0.5% 
Lowfat Milk 

~.$ 79 
Plastic 
Ctn. 

TABLETS 

Alka 
Seltzer .... 

36·CI. $139 
Box 

73c FROZEN 

Morton Dinner 1~k~~· 
NO · NONSEN~E "EASY TO 

BE ME " $139 
Pantyhose .......... Pair 

RUBBERMAID 99 C 
Ice Cube Tray .. ~kc~: 

The Floyd County Times 

Full Cut 
Round Steak 

$ 99 

U.S. GO\/ 'T. GRADED CHOICE 

Boneless Bottom $239 
Round Roast .... lb. 

U.S. GO\/ 'T GRADED CHOICE . BEEF 
CHUCK ARM BONELESS $2 29 
Boston Roll Roast .. lb. 

S-7·LB. A\/G. WHOLE 7 9 c 
Smoked Picnics....... lb . 

I 

GWALTNEY HOT OR MILD $119 
P k 5 l-Ib. or au sage .. . .. Roll 

a~n;;;;.iik s 2 9 
Bread ........ 3 2~;~~ · 1 
FROZEN KROGER (12·0Z. CANS) $2 69 
0 J • 3·Ct. range u1ce .. .. .. .. Pak 

BlUE BONNET QUARTERS 

M • 16-az argar1ne .... ... ....... Pk;.' 
SPECIAL FORMULA 

Kroger Bread .... 16·oz. 
loaf 

PINT RETURNABLE BOTTLES , 
MOUNTAIN DEW , 

Diet Pepsi 
or Pepsi Cola 

8$ 69 
PLUS DEPOSIT 

OR 
QUARTER·S 

Red Ripe 15C 
Watermelon . lb. 
CALIFORNIA 59 C 
Nectarines ........ lb . 
EXTRA LARGE , CALIFORNIA 

RED OR ggc 
Blue Plums ...... lb. 

FRESH 99 C 
Blueberries .. ... . Pint 

RED 4 gge 
Rome Apples B~~ · 
FRESH 2 $1 
Peaches ......... ... lbs. 

GREEN 99c 
Leaf Lettuce ..... lb. 

Any Size Pkg. 
Ground Beef 

$ 39 

HOLLY FARMS . U.S.D .A. INSPECTED 

ixed sgc 
Fryer Parts . . . . . . lb. 

HOLLY FARMS . U.S .D.A. INSPECTED 

CfRADE A FRYING lb. $139 
icken Breast .. _ ... 

OLE CAROLINA 9 9 C 
51• d B t-lb 1ce aeon .. ....... Pkg: 

'"'-~S~~~ 
FROZEN FRES·SHORE FISH 'N' BATTER ~ 
Cod ggc ~ 

• 8-oz. ~ St1cks ......... Pkg. ·"" 

FROZEN FRES-SHORE $16 9 ~ 
Ocean Perch : 
F.,, l·lb. :1. 1 ets........ Pkg. I 1 

FRO ZEN FRES-SHORE , HEADLESS , 
IN· THE-SHELL 

~~~: $599 Larpe 
Shr1mp ...... . 
FROZEN FRES·SHORE 

STORE·PACKAGED $15 9 
~n:::.c~... . .. lb. 

Section Three, Page One 

SUN GOLD 
SANDWICH OR 

Hot Dog 
B I·Ct . uns .... .... .. Pkv . 

Avondale S -Ib . 

Flour .. ..... 6a9 

JIFFY 

~king 40·oz . 89 C 
MIX ......... .. Pkg. 

AVONDAlE 

. _Pork 'N' 1s .s -ol . 2 9 C 
•eans ....... con 

Country ov,~OI 6 9 c 
Pretzels _ .. rkg: 

KELLOGG'S 

Specia
1
1 K lS·o• . $139 

Cerea . . . . eo. 

M~~;h~ST l -Ib. 59 c 
mallows ... aag 

p~~~DALE l· ·OI 49 c 
Halves .... can 

DAYTIME 

~f:;~~:' .. ~k~' - $4 .~9 
KROGER 

Worcestershire 
Sa 

16·01 . 
uce ..... . •"-

KROGEII 

Steak 
10·01 

Sauce ....... a•l 

l:t.;EN $109 
41-Ct 

Cups ........ Pkg . 

AVONDALE 

Aluminum 3 8 C 
• 25·Sq. Foil ... .... ... Ft . lloll 

EMBASSY 

~:s .. .... ~~~·i' $149 
• 1000 ISLAND FIIENCH 011 

IT AllAN LIQUID 

Koroge~ 16·01- 95c 
ress1ng . . . .,~, 

CLOVER VAllEY 

Margarine 
1-lb . Quarters .. Pkg. 

COUNTRY OVEN 

Angel Food 
k 16·01 Ca e ...... Pkg 

U -oz 
Pkg. 

GOLD CREST 

Marshmallow 
C ll-01 . reme ..... Jar 

HillCREST 

Maraschino 
Ch . 1 · 01 . errlll ... Jar 

AVONDALE 

Mandarin 
0 ll·oz. rangeS ... Con 

KIIOGEII 

Vienna 
Sa 5·01 . USage ... Can 

KROGER 

lima 
16·01. Beans ..... con 

~YDl~W~ 

IIG VALUE 59 c 
Vanilla 

f 12·01 Wa ers ... . aav 
KltOGlll 

Tomato •·o• . ? 2 ( 
Paste .. .. .. Con .. 

O&C 59c 
Onion Rings 3c~~-

uoGE• FIIOHN 

Whipped 59c 
Topping .. ~;~~: 
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by Barry McWilliams NEW WAY 
TRANSPORTATION 

SYSTEM 
•New, modern, unified jacking system, 

modern dollies and new equipment. 

Junkyard Provides Setting 
For Summer Theatre Musical 

Scout Recruiting 
Drive Set Here 

School Night For Scouting, a special 
program to enroll new cubs, scouts, 
and their parents, will be conducted 
throughout the central and eastern 
Kentucky area in late August and 
September. The School Nights are 
sponsored by the Blue Grass Council, 
Boy Scouts of America and will occur 
in every elementary school on 
designated evenings during this time 
period. Almost 400 schools in 50 coun­
ties will open their doors to allow new 
cubs and scouts to join. This is the 
fourth year for this coordinated effort 
and 3,500 youth joined last year. 3,800 
new members are expected to join 
scouting this year during school night 
programs according to scout officials. 

• Movers of block, brick and frame 
homes. Can also raise your 
home out of flood level or 
flood range. 

Streetkids sing and dance on wreck­
ed sportscars in a British junkyard, 
while two roving tramps play a 
"game" that is amusingly weighted in 
favor of one and against the other. This 
is THE ROAR OF THE GREASE­
PAINT ... THE SMELL OF THE 
CROWD, the third of(ering of Summer 
Season '81 at the Jenny Wiley Summer 
Music Theatre. The show opened July 1 
at the Jenny Wiley State Park Am­
phitheatre. 

This charming musical, written by 
Leslie Bricusse and Anthony Newley, 
joins GEORGE M!, the musical 
biography of George M. Cohan, and 
GODSPELL, the joyous, coloful adap­
tation of the Book of Matthew, both of 
which opened last week to enthusiastic 
audiences. Rodgers and Hammer­
stein's OKLAHOMA! opens Wednes­
day, July 8. 

THE ROAR OF THE GREASE-
. PAINT ... THE SMELL OF THE 
CROWD is new to Jenny Wiley au­
diences, and is not produced very 
often, so this is an opportunity to see a 
fresh, new approach to a show whose 
hit songs include "On A Wonderful Day 
Like Today," "Feelin' Good," and 
Newley's very successful ''Who Can I 
Turn To? " 

The unique staging for GREASE­
r- INT involves old cars and parts 

.1 1•enged from real junkyards, old 
~affolding, and a 30-foot crane. The 

:ast sings and dances across this con-

Kentucky Power In 
New Expansion Bid 

Kentucky Power Company recently 
asked the Public Service Commission 
for approval to acquire additional 
generating capacity to serve the future 
needs of its 140,000 customers in 
eastern Kentucky. 

The Ashland-based utility filed an 
application with the PSC for a cer­
tificate of public convenience and 
necessity which would allow the com­
pany to acquire a 15 percent interest in 
a 2.6-million kilowatt coal-fired 
generating plant being constructed by 
an affiliate utility at Rockport, Indiana 
at an estimated total cost of more than 
$2 billion. Kentucky Power's cor­
responding share of the plant's genera­
tion would be 390,000 kilowatts and 
would cost an estimated $311 million . 

The Rockport plant is being built by 
Indiana & Michigan Electric Com­
pany, another subsidiary of the 
American Electric Power System. The 
first of the two 1.3-million kw units is 
scheduled to be operational in 1984 and 
the second unit in 1986. The plant is ex­
pected to burn a substantial amount of 
Kentucky coal. 

Robert E. Matthews, president of 
Kentucky Power, said, "Today's high 
power plant construction costs make 
joint ownership especially desirable 
for a small company like ours because 
that's the way we can share in the 
economics of scale. It's one of the ad­
vantages of being part of a system like 
AEP in that costs can .be shared with 
an affiliated company." He added that 
multiple ownership of a power plant is 
not a new concept among AEP com­
panies. Matthews pointed out that 
multiple ownership will be an increas­
ingly accepted way for electric utilities 
in the future . 

In explaining the need for additional 
generation, the company's filing points 
out that the demand for electricity by 
its customers had increased by more 
than 10 percent per year over the past 
five years. The company forecasts the 
growth in demand for electricity will 
continue, although perhaps at a slower 
pace. 

Kentucky Power Company . can 
presentiy generate a total of 1,060,000 
kilowatts at its Big Sandy plant near 
Louisa. The company predicts its load 
will exceed that amount, possibly as 
early as next winter. Last February 
the company's peak demand reached 
984,000-kw. 

Although the company previously 
sought and was denied ownership par­
ticipation in the Rockport plant by the 
former Energy Regulatory Commis­
sion, today's filing states that cir­
cumstances have changed materially 
and warrant Kentucky Power Com­
pany's participation in the project. 

glomeration as if it were a polished 
dance floor. Director Tony Distler and 
choreographer Steve Johnson have 
staged some truly memorable musical 
numbers. Johnson also appears as the 
forlorn but hopeful Cocky, recreating 
the role which won him a nomination 
for the Irene Ryan Acting Award 
earlier this year. 

The 1981 season runs through August 
23 with shows nightly Wednesday 
through Sunday, at 8:30 p.m. In the 
event of rain, GODSPELL will be per­
formed at the Prestonsburg Elemen­
tary School auditorium. Those holding 
tickets will have the option of attending 
GODSPELL or using their ticket as a 
raincheck good for any performance 
during the season at the same ticket 
price. 

Tickets may be reserved by calling 
606-886-9274 or by writing: Box Office, 
Jenny Wiley Summer Music Theatre, 
P.O. Box 22, Prestonsburg, KY 41653, 
10 a.m.-8:30 p.m. Wed.-Sun., and 10 
a .m .-5 p.m ., Mon.-Tuesday. 

During each School Night program 
volunteer leaders will explain the cub 
and scout programs and enroll new 
members. Parents are asked to attend 
with their son in order to be informed 
concerning their son's scouting ac­
tivities. Boys 8, 9, or 10 years old or in 
the third, fourth, or fifth grades may 
join cub scouting and those 11 years old 
or older or in the sixth grade may join 
scouting. 

NEW WAY TRANSPORTATION RECENTLY MOVED THE 
HOME OF JAMES K. HALL AT STANVILLE (BESIDE DAN-DEE 
SUPERMARKET). 

•OVER 30 YEARS' EXPERIENCE• 
eALL WORK GUARANTEED• 

New Way Transportation System 
CALEB ASHER, Manager 

PHONE 248-5600 MIDDLESBORO, KY. 

Pick up good thi,ng. 
umnumcans. 

When you or your group 
starts collecting used alumi­
num cans, you'll collect 
some handsome profits, too. 

On top of that, you'll get 

the pride and satisfaction 
of helping your community 
win the fight against litter. 

Recycling aluminum cans 

saves 95 percent of the 
energy it takes to make mol­
ten metal from ore-while it 
conserves aluminum, too, a 
valuable natural resource. 

Raise extra cash for yourself or your organization. 
Get 3~ a pountt for aluminum beverage cans at: 

Mountain Metal Co. 
' . 

Railroad Ave., West Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

Hours: Monday through Friday, 8 a.m. to 4 p.m.; Saturday, 8 a.m. to noon 
For more information call: 886-2102 

"' Alcoa in Cooperation with aluminum can recycling centers coast to coast. 

7-1-2\. 
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IONEER 
'81 CLOSEOUT 

ON ALL PIONEERS IN STOCK 

JUL 6 
TO 

sx 3900 $54595 
120 WATTS JULY 11 
SX3700 $29995 
45 WATTS 

BLACK MAX 
ROCK MONITOR 

$29995 PR. , 

CASSETTE 
DECKS 

FINANCING 
AVAILABLE 

I 
• 

CTF-550 

CTF-650 

CTF-750 · 

AUTO 
REVERSE 

Section Three, Page Three 

·NIKKO 
CLOSEOUT 

NR 1219 $49995 100 WATTS 
PER CHANNEL . 

~~ JA~ts9 $4499 5 
PER CHANNEL 

I ~. 

PIONEER 
KP-5500 

PIONEER 
TS-X6 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 The Floyd County Times 

CAPTAIN D's 
OF PRESTONSBURG 

Is now seeking management training candi­
dates. 

Interviews by appointment only. 

CALL 437-4512 
Between 8 and l 0 a.m. 

6-17-lf. 

AN ORDINANCE 

'As You Like It' 
To Air on KET 

William Shakespeare's delightful 
comedy, "As You Like It," encores on 
KET Monday, July 13 at 9 p.m. 

Videotaped entirely on location in 
and around Glamis Castle, Scotland, 
this fairy tale about love and longing in 
the enchanted Forest of Arden contains 
some of Shakespeare's best-known 
poetry, including the famous "All the 
world's a stage" speech. 

"As You Like It" is part of the series, 
"The Shakespeare Plays," a six-year 
project which will present new produc­
tions of all 37 of Shakespeare's 
dramatic works. 

The series, presented on KET by 
WNET, New York, is a co-production 
of BBC-TV and Time-Life Television. 

Relating to the Annual Budget and Appropriations. 
WHEREAS, a proposed use hearing was held on the 22ndday of 

May , 19Jg__~ and 

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on the proposed budget 

showing receipts of $ 2,334,128 and expenditures of $2,334,128 

on the 29th day of May , 1981~ and 

WHEREAS, the property assessment has been certified as: 

Real Estate $ ____________ __ 
Tangible Personal Property $ ____________ __ 
Public Service Companies $ ____________ __ 
Bank Shares $ ______________ _ 
Other $ ______________ _ 

and 

WHEREAS, the proposed budget was tentatively approved by the 

Fiscal Court on the ~hday of ~' 1981 and approved as to form and 

classification by the State Local Finance Officer on the ~ day of ~J~un~e __ __ 

1981. 

NOW THEREFORE IT IS ORDAINED BY THE FISCAL COURT OF 

COUNTY, KENTUCKY: 

FLOYD 

SECTION ONE. There is levied for the year 1982 the general ad valorem 

tax rate per $100 assessed valuation on all taxable property within the jurisdiction 

for the General Fund and such additional tax rate for each Special District or other 

fund as indicated: 

(a) 
(b) 

(c) 

Fund 

General 

Rate Estimated REceipts 

____ cents $ ______ _ 

SECTION TW. The following budget is adopted for the year 81-82 and the 

amounts stated are appropriated for the purposes indicated. 

(1) General Fund 

General Government 
Protection to Persons and Property 
Health and Sanitation 

$ 360,022 
$ 14,400 
$ 4,6~6 

{a) 
{b) 

{c) 
(d) 

(e) 

(f) 

(g) 

Hospitals, Charities and Corrections 
Libraries and Other Educational Activities 
Debt Service, General Fund 

$ 638 
$ 500 - ......... --....,.------
$ 16,500 
--......,.........::...,......~---

$ 111,920 Misc., General Fund 

{2) Road Fund 

{3) Revenue Sharing Fund 

(a) Public Safety 
(b) Environmental Protection 
{c) Public Transporation 
{d) Health 
{e) Recreation 
(f) Libraries 

Total 

__ .:...__ _____ _ 
$ 508,600 

$ 410,920 ______ .:,..__ ________ __ 

$ _____ 7~5-·~2-0"4 _______ ___ 
$--~M4M6~~~6~2~6 ________ __ 
$ ____ 1~1~1_,~3~5~0 ________ __ 
$ ____ ~1nlr'~5~o~o ________ __ 
$ ____ 1_4_,~9r2_5 ________ ___ 

$----~--~---------

Section Three, Paae Four 

Wins Coll)petition 

Carla Sue Tussey, daughter of Mr_. 
and Mrs. Car I Tussey, of South 
Williamson, was recently awarded the 
first place trophy and medal for ad­
vanced twirling in her class during the 
Billion Dollar Beauties recital and 
competition held at the Williamson 
High School Little Theater. She also 
received a certificate· for outstanding 
accomplishment for the past year. 
Carla also participated in the 1981 
Matewan Mini-Majorette Festival and 
was awarded a certificate of participa­
tion. She is the _granddaughter of the 
late William Tussey and Eliza Tussey, 
of South Williamson. They are former 
residents of Water Gap. 

She attends South Williamson Grade 
School where she will be a third grade 
student this fall. She is also a Midget 
League cheerleader for the South 
Williamson Midget League basketball 
team. 

Ky. Receives Grant 
For Mine Program 

Kentucky last week received final 
approval for a $4.2 million operational 
grant from the U.S. Department of the 
Interior to continue enforcement of the 
state's present surface-mining 
reclamation program through 
December 1981. 

The grant, which became effective 
with the signing of an agreement bet­
ween Office of Surface Mining officials 
and Natural Resources Secretary 
Jackie Swigart, will help Kentucky 
meet the additional cost of enforcing 
the 1977 Federal Surface Mining Con­
trol and Reclamation Act. 

Kentucky is currently operating 
I under an interim program while 
developing a state plan to attain 
primacy- the authority to operate its 
own surface-mining enforcement pro­
gram. 

State officials plan to submit a final 
draft primacy package for federal ap­
proval this fall . 

The grant to be received by Ken­
tucky will cover operational expenses 
from April16, 1981, to Dec. 31, 1981. It is 
the fourth interim grant to be awarded 
Kentucky since passage of the federal 
act in 1977. 

Federal grants to states for interim 
period expenses include funds for 
salary reimbursement, · equipment, 
supplies and contractural services. 

When Kentucky is granted primary 
responsibility for surface-mining en­
forcement, it will be eligible to receive 
reclamation funds levied on current 
coal production. Kentucky's share of 
that fund now exceeds $55 million. 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

FORESTDALE STABLES 
IRONTON, 0. 

Complete boarding facilities, 
grooming, and other services availab~e. 

Call Ernie Gentry or Herb Mullins at 
(614} 532-6785 

Absolute Auction 

7.J.2t. 

FARM of RAY and BETTY CLAIR I• 
Sat., July 11, 1981-1:30 p.m. 

Located on East side of Highway #205, 1% miles South of the Ml Partway, Lee 
City exit and Y. mile North o~ Lee City, Ky. 
Option is reserved to offer this farm in 3 tracts as follows: 

1. 50 acres more or less with about 25 acres of bottom land improved wi .. a 
2·story house, 10 rooms, has bath and water in house, (older part of house is log 
and was built before Ky. was a State), bam in fair condition, tobacco base. Tobac­
co crop is reserved for 1981. 

2. A tract fronting on Allison road and being timber land containing 65 acres more 
or less. 

3. A tract fronting East side of Allison road and being all woodland and containing 
67 acres more or less. 

Each tract has good accessability. Any and all mineral rights owned will be co• 
weyed. The owner has indicated there is a seam of coal about 30" ttlick, tests as 
follows: Moisture 4.51, Ash 6.58, B.T.U. 13,026 to 14,650, Sulphur 3.82 to 4.00. 

We invite your inspection and come prepared to bid and buy. 
Owners: Mr. & Mrs. Ray Clair 

Terms: 20% deposit, balance on passing of deed. 

This auction conducted by the 

KY. LAND AUCTION CO. 
J. 0. Briggs Ben Johnson Bill Patrick Joe Dunn 

• 

I• 

Auctioneer App. Auctioneer App. Auctioneer Salesman I• 
Ph: 606-663-2519, P.O. Box 395, Stanton, Ky. 40380 

1-1·2t. 

CRASE AUCTION 
Sat.,. July 11, 1981-11 a.m. 

A Going 'usiness, Fully·Equipped Shell Service and Garage, Grocery Store, Carry- 1
1
• 

out Restaurant. Located 1 mile South of Lee City, Ky., on Hwy. #205. 

We have been instructed by the owners to sell this business and real estate 110re 

fully described. A 3-acre tract improwed with a building of block alld fra•e eot­

struction, 30'x 58', service station, shop and garage 30'x 30', store, sandwich 
bar and storage rooms 28'x 30', there is a parts room 12'x 20', lltility room 
10'x16', 2 restrooms 6'x 8' with electric heal upstairs livin& quarters is 
32'x 30' housing 2 bedrooms, kitchen with built-in cabinets and dining area, liYilg 
room with fireplace and bathroom. Apartment has outside entrance. Store aid 
eanyout restaurant is equipped as follows: electric forced air flmace, llleat .• , 
slicer, Hobart scales, milkshake mixer, hot fudge wanner, 2 upright daily product 
coolers, soft drink cooler, slush machine soft ice cream machine, grill aad deep 
fryer, hot dog warmer, cash register, adding machine, ice cream cooler, R. C. pop 
cooler, air conditioner, exhaust fan. SERVICE STATION and GARAGE EQUIPMENT: 
tire changer, air compressor, air grease gun, tire balancer, battery cllarger, pipe 
expander and shop welder. This business with fiving quarters is a fine opporfllllity 
for the person or family wanting their own business. This is operating and ready 
to go, look it orer, be at the auction. Immediate possession of business. 

Owners: Lee and Jean Crase 

Terms: 20% deposit, balance on passing of deed. 

This auction conducted by the 

KY. LAND AUCTION CO. 
J. 0. Briggs 
Auctioneer-Realtor 

Joe Dunn 
Salesman 

Ben Johnson 
App. Auctioneer 

Bill Patrick 
App. Auctioneer 

Ph: 606-663-2519, P.O. Box 395, Stanton, Ky. 40380 7+2t. 

(g) Social Services forthe Poor & Aged 
{h) Financial Administration 

$ 1,700 
----~~~----------L--------~----------------------------------------------------------------------

$ 48,669 

(i) Capital Construction, Maintenance ·or 
Equipment 

Total 

(4) Local Government Economic Assistance Fund 

(a) 

(b) 

(c) 

(d) 

(e) 

(f) 

(g) 

(h) 

(i) 
( j) 
(k) 

Public Safety 
Enviromental Protection 
Public Transporation 
Health 
Recreation 
Libraries and Educa~onal Facilities 
Social Services for the Poor, Aged and 
Handicapped 
Financial Administration and Governmental 
Management 
Industrial and Economic Development 
Vocational Education 
Repayment of Long-Term Bond Issues 

Total 

(5) Other Fund(s) 

(a) 
(b) 

------~----------
$ _____________ __ 

$ 309,974 
----~----------

$ 29,900 
----~~~--------$ 25,183 
------~~--------$ 448,077 
----~~---------

$ __ ~~-~0~-~-------
$ 2g,sso 
--~---------

$ ____ ~-0~---------

$ 21,500 ------------------
$ _ _::..5_2 ;..' o_o_o _____ _ 
$ ______ -0~-----------
$ _____ -~o_-________ _ 
$ ____ -~0~-----------

$ ____ ~6~0~6~·~5~10 ________ _ 

$ ____ 4~9_8~,_1_24 ________ _ 
$ _____________ __ 

SECTION THREE. This ordiance shall be published in the Floyd County newspaper 
by title and summary within 'thirty {30) days after adoption. 

SECTION FOUR. This ordinance become s effective immediately upon passage and 
publication. 

adopted this 18th day of June, 1981, by ~ayes and JL__nays. 

Chief Executive 

Summary Analysis of Appropriations 1"~1 

II Pto1e<:1ion to P..non ...d Pr~ 

Ill Hulth and $.ni1a1ion 

\I Lob<a<i .. ...d ot"'-< Edvcatio.-al Anivitin 

AClu-' 

E~ituros 

v .. 

329,868 

30 , 296 

9, 797 

179 

EnUn.t-.d 
Exp.ndi._.... 

Cun.nt 
y 

380 ,420 

46' 630 

2,800 

538 

360,949 

14,400 

638 

500 500 500 
--------------------------------+-----------+-----------+------------

VI Drt>t s..v;a. G--' Fund 25 ,023 16,600 16,500 

VII M..ullaneout, G..-entl Fund \ 159, 596 193 ,972 110,891 

Total<. Gen..nl Fund 

---------------------------------------+----555 . 259 64] 46 

705 ,594 VIII io•d Fund 560 , 527 410,920 

I)( Ro8d and Bridge Bond Drl>t S""''~ 

)( Olhe• Fundi !Total from P"9" 17) 346,9 76 764 ,586 498,124 

X I Rr~nut S""rong Fund 228 , ] 85 181 ,845 309) 974 
- ----- ------ -----------------------4-----------+-----------4------------

fll Loe&l Cove,.,_nt Ec ooo'lllic A.sa1s t a.c c e !'und 606,510 
_______ ....... __ ___ -·--------:o-·-- - -------~---------~--------

G•end Totals 1 , 690 ,9 47 2 , 293 ,485 2,334,128 
--------------· ---- -------~-----------1-----------+---------

lrts Pt~nc •pal ot T f: rnporarv Lo ans 

---------+-----------
Ntt £ x~ndotutn 1 , 690 , 947 2 , 293, 485 2,334,128 

---- - -- - --- -- - -· -- -

The summary and a copy of the enUre budget shall be avai1 able for public 
inspection a t t he Count y J udge Executi ve ' s offi ce in the Annex between the hours 
of 8:30A.M. and 4: 00P .M. 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 

• 

ACTION PROPERTIES CORP. 
Bill Gibson, Broker 

886-3804 
r1l An International Network of Independent Real Estate Brokers TM 
W. © Gallery of Homes, Inc - 1981 

3-18-tf. 

P~laRmacY PLUS 

Keep your eyes open! While taking special steps to care 
for your skin this summer, don 't close your eyes on eye 
care. Talk to your Pharmacy Plus Pharmacist about 
optimum optical aids. The summer sun and wind, along 
with the dust and dirt , can create a lot of discomfort. 
Don't let the elements eliminate good vision. See how 
the Pharmacy Plus people can prepare"you . 

Mmm! WHAT A TAN! 
Lotion 6 oz 
Oi6oz 
4.71 Value 

2.69 
-CI>oic:e 

DRAMAMINE 
Mot•on S•ckness Tablets 
12·s 
2 13\'alue 

-1.29 
OS-CAL500 
Galctum Supp'ement 

~~~vatue 4.36 

DIUREX 176 SUNDOWN FLINTSTONES 
walerP>Its 42s SUNSCREEN VITAMINS 
3 

JOva!ue • Ex SPF64oz 'S CHEWABLES 
~ 95 va:ue 

DIUREX II 2 7 9 ~·~a~:~~··2· 2o.Freeo 9 ~WI:t'~,W/

1
1ron 42s

9 6 • MaX>m: SPF8 ---

PERSONAL 
nlUCHRAZOR 

PHISODERM 
Soz 
2 42 Value 

1.39 

CURAD BANDAGES 
Ptastc or Sheer 
60's ¥•" 
20' on La bet 
1 59V.Iuo 

77c 

MURIN£ 
~~ o&"~'us 119 
s.oz 2 09 Valut • 

Your Choice 

* Service Mark 

4 01 
5 40Vatue .., ...,. 

2.99: 

BAUSCH & LOMB 
SALINE SOLUTION 
1201 199 350Value • 

SINUTABS 
30's 
3 44 Value 
1.99 

CAMPHO­
PHENIOUE 
loz 
I 59V.Iue 

ABSORBINE JR. 
2 Ol 
1 89Vatue 

1.16 

EXCEDRIN 
TABLETS 

l%'vatue 2 • 59 

Excedrin 
iliilii!tiilll'd'llfii!i!!ijjl 

l 'W,J It;. • 

KOTEX LIGHTDAYS 
Panty lmer 30-s 
~tfg ~~~:odorant 

1.79 

MENNEN 
SPEED STICK 
~~ 

0
,
2 
lime Herbal Spice 

2 22 Value 

1. 2 9YourCholce 

DCOthJP• I'rlt 

CLOSE-UP 
Toothpaste and Mouthwash 
8 2oz Re<J 
24· on Lab~ 
2 79Value 

HERRIN· JOHNSON 
PHARMACY 

HIGHLANDS PLAZA 
PHONE 886-3884 PRESTONSBURG "'~. 

1 wE GIVE ToP vALUE sTAMPs. ,e 
• PLENTY OF FREE PARKING • 

The Floyd County Times Section Three, Page Five . 

In UK Program 

Miss Kimberly Ann Hamilton, 
daughter of Wanda Hamilton, of Lex­
ington, and a 1981 graduate of 
Prestonsburg High School has been 
selected as one of .25 students in the 
state to participate. in the Professional . 
Education Preparation Program at the 
University of Kentucky beginning July 
8 and. continuing through August 5. 

This is an intensive four-week pro­
gram designed to assist students who 
intend to pursue a career as physician 
or dentist. The program is sponsored 
by the Kentucky Council of Higher 
Education, in conjunction with Ken­
tucky's Institution of Higher Education 
and is funded by the Commonwealth of 
Kentucky. · 

Miss Hamilton plans to attend Tran­
sylvania University as a pre-med stu­
dent this fall. 

*NATURE 
TRAILS 

Nature's Remedies 
By RUFUS M. REED 

PENNYROYAL.- I'd like for my 
readers to get better acquainted 'with 
that dainty little mint, pennyroyal, or , 
as the oldtimers called it, "pennyrile. ". 
It is one of the most useful plants found 
in nature and is one of the best insect 
repellants known. Fleas will hop ten 
feet high to escape the hot scent of 
pennyroyal. You can put oil of penny­
royal on your dogs and cats and the 
fleas will flee from them! You can wet 
a string with it, tie it around the neck of 
your pets and the fleas won't get on 
them. 

A fresh-cut pennyroyal plant tied 
around the bedpost will repel bedbugs 
and mosquitoes . Oldtimers used to 
gather pennyroyal in the fall , tie it up , 
in bunches and hang it up to keep for 
winter use. The tea made from it is a 
warm stimulant and a big help in 
sweating out a bad cold. In "Flora of 
W.Va. ," Dr. Core says : "Pennyroyal 
is used as a stimulant and as an aid to 
digestion." You'll find patches of this 
plant growing in dry soils of old clear­
ings and abandoned fields. It prefers 
thin acid soils and is a small, much­
branching plant with small, ovate 
leaves borne in pairs. The blooms are 
bluish-purple and appear in mid­
summer. 

Pennyroyal was a highly favored 
plant of the Indians. They used the tea 
for colic and indigestion. It was re­
garded as a reliable remedy for colic in 
babies .. Pennyroyal and wild honey 
were mixed to make a tea for head 
colds. Indians also snuffed the strong 
scent to clear the nasal passages. In­
dian women used pennyroyal tea to 
relieve cases of painful menstruation. 

Pennyroyal rubbed on the hands and 
face will repel chiggers and mos­
quitoes. The English of Queen Eliza­
beth's day used penyroyal tea to cure 
the gout. 

A CURE FOR DYSENTERY. 
Dysentery, or "bloody flux ," was once 
a dreaded disease . Oldtimers cured it 
by steeping the leaves of a creek willow 
to make a tea . They claimed this cured 
dysentery " nine times out of ten. " 

"RABBIT TOBACCO." Also called 
"life everlasting." This is a fine 
medicinal plant with aromatic odor. It 
is a good remedy for colds. A tea for 
colds is made of pine twigs mixed with 
the dded leaves of rabbit tobacco .. 
This small plant is dainty and hand­
some, with white-felted leaves that are 
cottony underneath. After the first 
frost, the leaves dry up on the stalk and 
may be gathered then to keep for 
winter use. One of my most delightful 
larks as a boy was to smoke the cured 
leaves of rabbit tobacco with my bud­
dies. We had many a smoke-fest out 
behind the old, gray barn. We also 
chewed the fragrant leaves and 
squirted mouthfuls of the rich , dark 
brown "ambeer." Back then I didn't 
know of the medical value of this plant, 
how it was useful in treating sore 
throat or irritation of the mucous mem­
branes. The plant is known to botanists 
as "cud weed, " or "old field balsam." 
Indians often smoked the leaves of cud­
weed for their pleasant fragrance . 

OLDTIME REMEDIES FOR 
CROUP. This was once a dread disease 
of children and killed many before the 
days of antibiotics. But our foreparents 
had their remedies from nature and 
thus saved the lives of many children . 
A quick remedy for croup then was 
to roast a large-size nnion C!nrl squeeze 
out the juice. The croupy child was re­
quired to drink this, aiiCI it tll!'n gave 
relief. Another oldllmr rcmPdy that 
got good results was the us<' of a 
poultice on the chest, both front and 
back . The poultice was madt' of mutton 
tallow and beeswax and one was plac­
ed hot on the back , right between the 
shoulder blades . 

PRICES IN EFFECT WHILE QUANTITIES LAST 

SPRING & SUMMER 
CLOTHING SALE 

ALL SPRING & 
SUMMER CLOTHING 
(PINK TAGS ONLY) 

FOR THE 
ENTIRE FAMILY 

SAVE ON 
CLOTHING 

FOR 
MOM & DAD 

AND THE 
CHILDREN! 

USE OUR CONVENIENT LAY-AWAY 
A 10% Deposit ·Plus a $1.00 Service 
Charge Opens Your Lay-Away Account 

• $2.00 Minimum 



NOT RESPONSIBlE fOR 
TYPOGRAPHICAl ERRORS 

Wf R£SEAVE THE RIGHT 
l !l liMIT QUANTITIES 

Scranton 
16' Aluminum 

Extension Ladder 

Reg. $54.99 

Full. non-marring plastic end caps. Free-swinging rubber 
safety shoes. Large corrugated full 1 %" flat "D" Rungs 
lor comfort and safety. Double swa~ged for ado'ed 
strength and safety. Heavy duty spnnglocks 

HARDWARE DEPT. 

Step Ladder 

$12~~ .. 
Household type stepladder. 
great for amsll jobs around the 
house. Meets or exceeds OSHA 
and ANSI standards. 

HARDWARE DEPT. 

Step Ladder 

$24!! .. 
Alummum stepladder with 2'h" treads 
and s1de rails Second tr~ad and top 
tread tested to hold 

WED. THRU SA 

12010 

Murray 
3Vz H.P. 22 Inch 

$CJ9.!!7. 
MURRAY 

REAR BAGGING MOWER 21"- 3.5H.P. 

$1 4 9 66 
Reg. SJ84U 

Wallace 

30"x60" Porta-Lite Table 

$2466 Centerfold I" aluminum 
straight leg. Ectra wide 
decorator extrusion. 

Reg. $35.99 

HARDWARE DEPT. 

RAID SOLID 

INSECT 
STRIP 

$186 

Village alaiCK!;maltn 
Electric 

13" Hedge Trimmer . 
$ 2 2 8 8 ~~~;i~~~~~e;;i~~e~~r~nb~;i~~s 

Reg. $29.99 

HARDWARE DEPT. 

[sTANLEY) 

Mitre Box 
WITH SAW 

5 14~~4~ 
HARDWARE DEPT. 

Ashflash 
Indoor-Outdoor 

,.c=::=:f:::l::=~ Portable Light 

12 Oz. 
Black Flag 

House & 
Garden 
Spray 

$199 
Reg. $2.99 

HARDWARE DEPT. 

Marshallen 

52!!. 
Features: Walnut grain case of 
high 1mpact polyethylene. 
Chrome plated steel ring for 
cariying or hanging Uses one 
6-volt battery (not included). 

SPORTS DEPT. 

16 Oz. 
Raid 

Yard 
Guard 

Reg. 3.59 
HARDWARE DEPT. 

Aladdin 

19" Patio Table Pump-A-Drink 

Marsha lien 
Plastic And Steel Mesh 

Patio Table 

$3~?. .. 
Reg. $4.29 

HOUSEWARE DEPT. 

'h Gal. . 

58!g~13.73 
1 Gal. 

510!~17.42 
Aladdrn's Pump-A-Onnk JUQ 
drspenses hot or cold 
beverages The jug holds 
Y, Gallon or 1 gallon of 
your favorite beverage 

HOUSEWARE DEPT. 

Coleman 

413 

.• . 
~· 

.. . 
2 Burner Stove • 

( This deluxe two-burner Colem 

$ 3 8 8 
stove is the most popular ca~ 
stove going I Burners spaced ! 
11" centers. Fuel capacity 3! 
pts .. 14.600 BTU output, 4 Reg. $40.99 ·approximate burning time 2 
hours with both burners-

Coleman 

Easy Lite 
Lantern 

52l~!. 
Here's the latest word in outdoor 
lightmg. with comtemporary good 
looks and new dusk brown cofer. 
Easy-lite valve lets you see and 
feel the right positions. cleans the 
generator tip automatically for 
maintenance free operation. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

oleman 

56 Qt. Cooler 

$3 8 8 8 Case IS welded steel. z1nc 
coated to prevent rust. Bake 
enamel finish resists chips a 
scratches. liner is stain and 
ordor resistant. easy to clea 
Leak proof drain. rugged cam 

Reg. $46.99 action safety latch. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

18 Oz. 
Raid 

Wasp & 
Hornet 
Killer 

Reg. $3.77 
HARDWARE DEPT. 

Picnic Basket 

$629 



I 

~ 
--·~ USE YOUR 

VISA OR 
lAST" CARD ffi 
• @ 

PRICES IN EFFECT 
WED. THRU SAT. 
JULY 8,9,10,& 11 

WHILE QUANTITIES LAST! 

Beta 
·Swim Mask 
and Snorkle 

53~.~ 
VVeek-Ender Pack 

Blue Ice 

905 

5 Piece 

Nylon Bath Set 
S6!~ .. 

Solid color. accented by a coordinating 
butterfly design. 5 Piece set includes 
lid cover. tank top cover. tank cover. 
18 "~30" rug and 18" x 17" contour 
rug all made of durable nylon. 

DOMESTIC DEPT. 

American Cup 

Water Ski 
Vest 

51599 
Reg. $25.99 

Good design and fit for water 
sports. Available in assorted 
colors. In a large variety of 
sizes. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

H·16M 
H-10 

H-30 

H-21 

Cannon 
"Santa Cruz" 

Bath Ensemble 
Bath Towel Reg $3.99 ....... . 52.99 
Hand Towel Reg. $279 ..... . . 51.99 
Wash Cloth Reg. $1.79 . .. . . . .... 99C 

Make your selection now from these 
co-ordinated towels in assorted colors. 
You'll love this popular Cannon 
jacquard. Bath towel. hand towel an~ 
wash cloth can mixed or matched. 

Heck's 

Fishing Rods 
By Bei1dey 

CHOICE 

59t~ 
Reg. $17.99 EACH 

• 6' Spin Cast Rod 
• 6'6" Spinning Rod 
• Ultra Light Spinning Rod 

SPORTS DEPT. 

4 Lb. Sleeping Bag 
525!.! .. "Hoss" Spin· Cast Reel 

512!! .. Reg. $2.26 

SPORTS DEPT . . 

One Gal. 

Hardside · 
Jug 

$499 
Rt g. •&.49 

SPORTS DEPT. 

8113 

Bonded contruction for added warmth. Double weatherstripped 
oull separating alummum zrpper. Two bags can zip together to 
form a double sleeper. Two tie strings for bundling. Machine 
washable. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

Forster 
6 Player 

Croquet Set 

51599 
Rtg. $25.77 

6 player set 3" balls of 
compressed hard maple. with epoxy 
finish. white stripes. Mallets. 
handles. stakes and wickets. Rack 
included. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

Direct drive for heavy fishing. Precision. self-lubricating 
gears. Hardened steel center-shaft and crankshaft. 

Crown 

Volleyball Set 

sloss SET 

Re1- $15.99 Stt 
Official size volley ball. 20'x2 ' all 
weather net. Heavy weight 1 Y4' 
diameter painted steel poles with 
ground sleeves. 

SPORTS DEPT. 

1 Gallon 

3 Piece 

Kitchen Sets 

$349 S£T 

Reg. $4.59 SET 
No kitchen is complete without these 
durable helpers. Set includes one 
kitchen towel. one sidh cloth. and one 
pot holder. ~sorted prints or solids. 

Empire 

Pedal Toys 
CHOICE 

51099 
EACH 

Reg. $12.99 EACH 
• Tot-A-Bout Pedal Trike 
• Mickey Mouse Mini-Hot Cycle 
• Powder Puff Mini-Hot Cycle 
• Chips Motor Cycle 

TOY DEPT. 

Diversified 

Volleyball­
Badminton Set 

5165~ 

f) 
Reg. *20.68 Stt 

4 stee l shaft badmonton rackels. 
offocoal soze inltatable volteybalt, 
20' ~ 2 • weatherproof polyelhelene 
ne~ 2 shuttlecocks. heavy duty 1 W' 
diameter American made self· 
supporting steel posts. ground 
sleeves 1nd rules 

Can of 3 
Penn 

72" X 30" Camp Fuel Tennis 
Balls ~eavy Vinyl Air Mattress 

' 
$299 

·-

Reg. $4.89 
SPORTS DEPT. 

1" Gourmet Pan 

Reg. $7.99 
HOUSEWARE DEPT. 

ntercraft 
16"x20" Metal Frame 

Lazer 
Art Pictures 

$6~~,:: .. 

Camp Stool 

Sl!!. 
SPORTS DEPT. 

S299w. 
Re1. t3.49 Gil. 

SPORTS DEPT 

Set of 4 Maxi Knit 
Golf Club 

Head Covers 521.~ $699 SET Reg. $2.99 CAN 

~ .............. · .... R.~g •. • ·9 •. 99·S·E·T ......... S.P.OR .. TSDEP~T· .... ~!!!!~ 

Electric Fry Pan 
5 18!~,~ 

10Yr" ff"lpan with attractive buffer styling. 
. Removable heat control with ff"l guide makes pan 

completely immersible for easy cfeanong. Pedestal 
legs. polished exterior with high quality sunray 
interior finish. 

General Electric 

Styling Brush 

$1299 
Reg. S16.96 

Two curling brushes in one. Provides flexible 
styling. get the soft. wavy look usong the ¥. " 
banel. and the toght, curly look with the Mino Yr'' 
bane!. Ready dot 

Steam Spray Iron 

5 19~!. .. 
Safety heel rest. 36 venls lor all o'.ler sleam 
coverage Swilches to dry iron onstantly 
Swilchabfe cord lor roght or fell handed use 

JEWELRY DEPT. 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 

Is State Finalist 

Miss Deborah Ann Reed , 17, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs . James L. 
Reed, of Drift, has been selected to be a 
state finalist in the 1981 Miss United 
Teenager Pageant to be held at the Ex­
ecutive West in Louisville at 7:30p.m., 
July 30. 

Contestants from over the state will 
be competing for the title. All con­
testants are between the ages of 14 and 
18 and must have at lea$t a "B" 
average in school. They are requested 
to participate in the volunteer com­
munity service program of the pageant 
by contributing at least eight hours of 
time to some worthwhile charity or 
civic work of their choice. 

The winner of the state finals of the 
Miss United Teenager Pageant will 
receive an all-expense paid trip to com­
pete in the national finals, a three 
phase pageant in Hollywood, Califor­
nia; Waikiki Beach, Hawaii and 
Washington, D.C., where she will com­
pete for $15,000 in cash scholarships, a 
new automobile. for her reigning year, · 
$5,000 appearance contract, $2,000 in 
wardrobe and other awards. 

Contestants will be judged on 
scholastic, civic achievements, beau­
ty, poise and personality, and no swim­
suit competition is required. Each con­
testant will write and recite on stage a 
100-word essay on the subject, "My 
Country.'' 

Miss Reed is sponsored by Turner 
Elkhorn Mining Company. 

She is a student at Millersburg 
Military Institute, and her hobbies in­
clude dancing, swimming, tennis, soc­
cer, and piano. 

Cecil Rhodes Is 
Profiled On KET 

Cecil John Rhodes, founder of 
Rhodesia, namesake of the Rhodes 
Scholarships, mine owner, politician 
and empire-builder, is the subject of a 
90-minute documentary airing on KET 
Wednesday, July 15 at 9 p.m. 

"A Touch Of Churchill, A Touch Of 
Hiller: The Life of Cecil Rhodes" is the 
story of a complex leader and the em ­
pire he built during the last quarter of 
the 19th century. New York Times col­
umnist Anthony Lewis, an expert in 
African politics, brings history up to 
date with the recent metamorphosis of 
Rhodesia into Zimbabwe in his in­
troduction and final commentary. 

Narrating the documentary is Ken­
neth Griffith, who wrote the story 
which begins with Rhodes' birth tin 
England in 1853 and concludes with his 
death in South Africa in 1902. Griffith 
becomes an active participant in the 
story as he strides through Oxford 
University or the dry brush of what 
was once Matabeliland and 
Mashonaland . 

At Oxford, Griffith recalls the lec­
ture Rhodes heard by John Ruskin on 
the need to advance the power of 
England, the speech which inspired 
Rhodes to build an empire on the glory 
of his mother country and, in the pro­
cess, his own power and wealth . He ac ­
complished his mission in a style that 
few leaders have dared. 

"A Touch Of Churchill, A Touch Of 
Hitler : The L.ife Of Cecil Rhodes" is a 
BBC production presented on KET by 
WGBH, Boston . 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION TO MINE 

Within 100 Feet of a Public Road 

Pursuant to 405 KAR 1:050 The 
Department for Natural Resources 
and Environmental Protection may 
conduct a public hearing to review the 
application of L & M Mining, Inc. 
<app li cation number 036-5018 
<Amendment) ) who proposed to con­
duct mining operations within 100 feet 
of public highway KY 2030 Little Mud 
Creek Road near Blue Moon loca tion . 
Any interested person may request 
that the hearing be held by written re­
quest to that effect sent to Ralph Wad­
dle, Division of Permits, Department 
for Natural Resources and En ­
vironmental Protection, Sixth F loor, 
Capitol P laza Tower, Frankfort, Ken­
tucky 40601 and received by him within 
20 days of the date of notice. 
It. 

Subscription 
Rates Per Year 
In F loyd County, $8.00 
Elsewhere in K e ntuc ky, $ 10 
Outsid e Kentucky, $ 1 2.50 

Ph·<~~<' n o t e ex pi ration d ette 
oppo~itt• your narnc on wrap ­
p el" or on you r copy of The 
Times. Because of inc reased 
mailing cost~. notices o f s ub­
scription expiration a r e no 
longer maile d !o s ubscribers. 

Potted Meat 

4 FOR 51°0 

The Floyd County Times 

18 Oz. 

Peanut Butter 
$ 89 

Oz. Heinz 

Ketchup Barbecue Sauce 
4 Flavors 

99C sac 
FOOD DEPT. 

6Vz Oz. Star Kist 

Tuna 
Oil or Spring Water 78~.~ 

32 Oz. Heinz 

Pickles 
In Assorted Varieties 93p~ 

Delmonte 4 Pack 

Pudding or 
Fruit Cups 

12 Oz. Armour 

Treet 

$119 

16 Oz. Cottee Mate 

Non-Dairy Creamer 

$122 

HERFORD 

CORN 
BEEF 
$ 39 

'Mustard 

5 Oz. Armour 

Vienna Sausage 

2 FOR87C 

28 Oz. LUCKY LEAF 

16 Oz. 
French's 

Mustard 
In Squeeze Bottle 

59C 
PPLE BUTTER 

89c 
10 Ot. Mix 

Kooi-Aid 

Drink Mix 
Assorted Flavors 

$257 

8 Oz. V~ _~amp's 

Beanee weenee 

2 FOR83c 

fWIN PACK 

TOM 'S 

DIP CHIPS 
6% Oz. 



FJ 

Wednesday, 
July8-

Tuesday, 
July 14, 1981 

«wednesday)) 
WEDNESDAY 
JULYS, 1981 

EVENING 

6:oo mornmooomm 
NEWS 
® fB BY-WORDS 
CD fB NEWS (CONTIN­
UES FROM DAYTIME) 
@@E) STUDIO SEE · 

6:05 Cfj FATHER KNOWS 
BEST 

6:3o m o rn m NBc 
NEWS 
C!J m ABC NEWS 
® fB LISTEN TO KEN· 
TUCKY AN ORAL 
HISTORY 
(]) CD 0 fB CBS 
NEWS 
@ @E) WILD WILD 
WORLD OF ANIMALS 

6:35 0 THAT GIRL 
7:00 Cl) liD KENTUCKY 

AFIELD 
ornCDm 
MAGAZINE 

PM 

(!) m NEWLYWED 
GAME 
®@ fB @E) MACNEIL· 
LEHRER REPORT 
000 TICTACDOUGH 

7:05 Cfj ALL IN THE FAMILY 
7:30 Cl) liD CAR CARE CEN· 

TRAL 'Do It Yourself' car 
care series. 
0 CJ:l BULLSEYE 
(!) m FACE THE 
MUSIC 
®fB 
JOURNAL 

KENTUCKY 

000 JOKER'SWILD 
CD fB M.A.S.H. 
@@E) DICK CAVETT 
SHOW 

7:35 Cfj BASEBALL Atlanta 
Braves vs Cincinnati Reds 
(In the event of a pl11yers' 
strike, alternate program­
min!l_will be aired.) 

8:00 (}) U CJ:l liD REAL PEO· 
PLE 
(!) G) CHARLIE'S AN· 
GELS The angels play 
with fire when they set up a 
con man who believes he 
has found a larcenous 
lover in Kris, but the beau· 
tiful angel joins the unholy 
alliance as the bait to trap 
the clever but deadly 
crook at his own game . 
(Re~at; 60 mins.) 
®~ ALLCREATURES 
GREAT AND SMALL 
(§)CD 0 fB CBS WED· 
NESDA Y NIGHT MOVIE 
'The Pirate' 1978 Stars : 
Franco Nero, Anne 
Archer. 

@@E) NATIONAL GEO· 
GRAPHIC 'Etosha: Place 
of Dry Water' Extraordin· 
ary animal behavior, in 
some cases unknown 
even to zoologists and 
ethologists, is observed 
in this film which records 
the wildlife in Etosha, a 
preserve surrounding a 
huge , dry lake bed in the 
southwest African 
country of Namibia. (60 
mins.) 

9:00 Cl)0CJ:lliD DIFF'RENT 
STROKES 
(!) m ABC SUMMER 
MOVIE 'White Line Fever' 
1975 Stars: Jan-Michael 
Vincent, Kay Lenz. An ex· 
citing drama of one man's 
struggle against the cor­
ruption and brutality of the 
Arizona trucking industry. 
(2 hrs.) 
® fB NATIONAL GEO· 
GRAPHIC 'Etosha: Place 
of Dry_ Water' 
@ @E) BILL MOYERS' 
JOURNAL 'A Visit With 
Dame Rebecca West' 
Dame Rebecca West is 
oneofthemostsuccessful 
British writers of this cen· 
tury. She is known for her 
essays, novels, reporting, 
and criticism and has writ· 
ten on literary, social and 
political subjects. (60 
mins.) 

9:30 Cl)0CJ:lllfj THE FACTS 
OF LIFE 

c-

Qr4r lttlny~ <trnuuty Qrimrs 
10:00 CV ·o (U liD QUINCY 

Quincy and his ace lab 
technician, Sam, go to 
Mexico to assist in deter­
mining whether bones 
found in a cave where a 
young woman is reported· 
ly performing miracles 
with the sick are actually 
those of a priest who died 
in the 17th century. 
(Re~at; 60 mins.) 
® ~ MEN WHO MADE 
THE MOVIES: ALFRED 
HITCHCOCK This special 
profiles the great Holly· 
wood director and his 
work. 
@ @E) MASTERPIECE 
THEATRE 'Duchess of 
Duke Street : For Love of 
Money' 

10:05 Cfj NASL SOCCER 
Atlanta Chiefs vs Califor­
nia Surf 

11:oo mornmooCDom 
fBllfj NEWS 
@@E) DAVE ALLEN AT 
LARGE 

11:30 ffi 0 CJ:l liD THE TON· 
IGHT SHOW 'The Best Of 
Carson ' Guests: Liber­
ace, Andrea McArdle, 
Dick Van Patten. (Repeat; 
60 mins.) 
C!lm ABC NEWS NIGHT· 
LINE Anchored by Ted 
Kop~l. 
(]) l1J 0 fB CBS LATE 
MOVIE 'The Spiral Stair­
case' 1975 Stars: Jac­
queline Bisset, Chris­
topher Plummer. 

@@E) ABC CAPTIONED 
NEWS 

12:00 (!) m LOVE BOAT 
Captain Stubing is reunit­
edwith his lovechild, Vick­
i; and a man and a woman 
who hated each other on 
jury duty take their hilar­
ious battle to the open 
sea. (Repeat; 70 mins.) 

12:05 Cfj TBS EVENING 
NEWS 

12:30 Cl) 0 (U liD TOMOR· 
ROW COAST· 
TO-COAST 'Vietnam 
Timebomb,' Part Ill. Guest: 
Garner Ted Armstrong. 
(90 mins.) 

12:35 Cfj MOVIE 
·(ADVENTURE) ••• "Li· 
sa" 1962 Stephen Boyd, 
Dolores Hart . The story of 
a Jewish girl who is smug­
gled out of W.W.II Europe 
into Israel. (2 hrs., 15 
mins.) 

1:10 C!Jm ADAM 12 
1:40 (!) m GREEN ACRES 
2:50 Cfj ATLANTA BRAVES 

BASEBALL REPLAY 
Atlanta Braves vs Cincin­
nati Reds (In the event of a 
players' strike, alternate 
programming will be 
aired.) 

5:20 Cfj RAT PATROL 

((thursday» 
JULY9, 1981 

EVENING 

6:oo mornmooomm 
NEWS 
® fB BY-WORDS 
CZ) fB NEWS (CONTIN· 
UES FROM DAYTIME) 
@@E) STUDIO SEE 

6:05 Cfj FATHER KNOWS 
BEST 

6:3o rn o rn m NBc 
NEWS 
C!Jm ABC NEWS 
®89 G.E.D. 
00 CD 0 fB CBS 
NEWS 
@ @E) WILD WILD 
WORLD OF ANIMALS 

6:35 Cfj THAT GIRL 
7:00 Cl) liD THAT GOOD OLE 

NASHVILLE MUSIC 
ornmm 
MAGAZINE 

PM 

(!) m NEWLYWED 
GAME 
®@ @9 @E) MACNEIL· 
LEHRER REPORT 
000 TICTACDOUGH 

1:05 Cfj ALL IN THE FAMILY 
7:30 (}) f!D APPALACHIAN 

ENCOUNTERS 

0 CJ:l BULLSEYE 
(!) m FACE THE 
MUSIC 
® fB KENTUCKY 
JOURNAL 
000 JOKER'S WILD 
CD fB M.A.S.H. 
@@E) DICK CAVETT 
SHOW 

7:35 Cfj BASEBALL Atlanta 
Braves vsCincinnati Reds 
(In the event of a players' 
strike, alternate program· 
ming will be aired.) 

a:oo rn o rn m NBc 
MAGAZINE WITH DAVID 
BRINKLEY 
C!:Jm MORK AND MINDY 
When Mindy eats one of 
Mork's gourmet delights 
sh.e turns into a wacky 
Orkan herself, sending 
her family reunion into a 
rollicking tizzy. (Repeat) 
®fB WORLD OF CHAR· 
LIE COMPANY CBS news 
correspondent John Law­
rence, who won an Emmy 
for his reporting from Viet­
nam,covers thedaytoday 
life of U.S. combat sol­
diers in Vietnam and Cam­
bodia, in this film which 
originally aired on CBS in 
1970. An update has been 
included. (60 mins.) 
®CDOfB THEWAL· 
TONSCindyisgriefstrick­
en over the sudden death 
of her father, and shocked 
after discovering she was 
adopted by him. (Repeat; 
60 mins.) 
@@E) OMEGA FACTOR 
'Illusions' Dr. Karl 
Bruckner, an expert on 
mind control, has defect­
ed from East Germany and 
is brought to Britain by 
Rossiter. (60 mins.) 

8:30 C!Jm BOSOM BUDDIES 
Kip and Henry's friendship 
teeters on the brink when 
Kip insists that the beau­
tiful, sexy Sonny live with 
them after her roommate, 
Amy, in a fit of anger. 
throws herout oft he apart­
ment they share. 
(Re_E!lat) 

9:00 ffiUCJ:lliD THURSDAY 
NIGHT AT THE MOVIES 
'The Adventures Of Huck­
leberry Finn' 1981 Stars: 
Forrest Tucker. Larry 
Storch. 
(!) m BARNEY MILLER 
Like it or not, Captain 
Miller throws the book at a 
librarian who uses a gun to 
make her point when pa­
trons refuse to obey the 
'silence' rule. (Repeat) 
(Closed-Captioned) 
®@ fB @E) SNEAK 
PREVIEWS Film critics 
Gene Siskel and Roger 
Ebert review the new 
movies in town, and show 
scenes from: 'For Your 
Eyes Only,' 'The Great 
Muppet Caper,' and 
'Dra...a.onsla~r·. 
(]) l1J 0 W MAGNUM, 

ROOTS: THE NEXT 
GENERATIONS 

Marion Branda stars as American 
Nazi leader George Lincoln Rockwell, 
who is interviewed by Alex Haley in the 
concluding episode of "Roots: The 
Next Generations," which will be re- · 
broadcast on ABC-TV SUNDAY, JULY 
12. 

The last episode begins in 1960 
when Alex Haley (James Earl Jones) 
retires from the Coast Guard and 
begins pursuing his career as a 
freelance wr.iter. After intervtewing 
Malcolm X for Readers Digest, he is 
asked by Playboy magazine to do an 
in-depth interview with the black 
leader- an interview that leads to 
Haley's co-authorship of "The Auto­
biography of Malcolm X. " 

A visit to Henning retgnites the 
writer's interest in the African , Kunta 
Kinte. 

CH'EcK LISTINGS FOR EXACT TIME 
TV COMPULO~ SERVICES. INC 

P .I. Five little school girls, 
their missing teacher and 
a priceless painting cause 
Christmas holiday com­
plications. (Repeat; 60 
mins.) 

9:30 (!)G) TAXI Lecherous 
Louie has the dubious 
honor of being selected by 
his employer's revenge· 
seeking wife to be her 
lover, but panic grips the 
love lair when the boss 
unexpectedly shows up. 
(Repeat) (Closed­
Captioned; U.S.A.) 
® fB VIC BRADEN'S 
TENNIS FOR THE FU· 
TURE 
CID m GooD 
NEIGHBORS 

10:00 C!Jm 2Q-20HughDowns 
anchors this weekly 
magazine profiling no­
teworthy events in news, 
science and entertain· 
ment. (60 mins.) 
®fB SPOLETO '81 'The 
Maestro' 

00 CD 0 fB KNOTS 
LANDING 
@ . @E) COMSTOCK 
LOAD 

10:05 Cfj TBS EVENING 
NEWS 

10:30 ® fB SOUTHBOUND 
'Spend It All' 
@@E) UP POMPEII! 

11:oo mornmooCDom 
fBllfj NEWS 
@@E) DAVE ALLEN AT 
LARGE 

11:05 Cfj NIGHT GALLERY 
11:30 Cl) 0 CJ:l liD THE TON­

IGHT SHOW 'The Best Of 
Carson' Guests: James 
Garner, Larry Gatlin, Les­
ley Ann Warren, Buster 
Crabbe. (Repeat; 
C!Jm ABC NEWS NIGHT· 
LINE Anchored by Ted 
Kop~l. 
(§) l1J (:) fB CBS LATE 
MOVIE 
@@E) ABC CAPTIONED 
NEWS 

11:35 Cfj MOVIE ·(COMEDY) 
•• 'h "Day Tbe Fish 
Came Out" 1967 
Candice Bergen, Tom 
Courtenay. 

12:00 (!) m CHARLIE'S AN· 
GELS Kelly is shot by a 
child mishandling a fir­
earm and ishospitalizedin 
critical condition. 

12:30 ffi 9 (U liD TOMOR· 
ROW COAST-
TO-COAST 'Vietnam 
Timebomb.' Part IV. 
Guests: The Association. 

1:1o mm ADAM 12 
1:40 C!Jm GREENACRES 
1:45 Cfj ATLANTA BRAVES 

BASEBALL REPLAY 
Atlanta Braves vs Cincin­
nati Reds (In the event of a 
players' strike, alternate 
programming will be 
aired.) 

4:15 0 RATPATROL 
4:45 Cfj MISSION 

IMPOSSIBLE 

·((friday» 
JULY 10, 1981 

EVENING 

6:oo mornmooCDom 
fBllfj NEWS 
®fB BY-WORDS 
@@E) STUDIO SEE 

6:05 Cfj FATHER KNOWS 
BEST 

6:3o m o rn m NBc 
NEWS 
ffimABCNEWS 
® fB NEW SHAPES: 
EDUCATION 
® CD 0 fB CBS 
NEWS 
@ @E)- WILD WILD 
WORLD OF ANIMALS 

6:35 Cfj THAT GIRL 
7:00 Cl) liD G-OINS 

BROTHERS 
o rn m m PM 
MAGAZINE 
(!) m NEWLYWED 
GAME 
®@ fB @E) MACNEIL· 
LEHRER REPORT 
000 TICTACDOUGH 

7:05 Cfj ALL IN THE FAMILY 
7:30 Cl) liD HILLS 'N 

HOLLOWS 
0 CJ:l BULLSEYE 
(!) m FACE THE 
MUSIC 
(§) fB COMMENT ON 
KENTUCKY 
(§) 0 JOKER'S WILD 
CD fB M.A.S.H. 
@ @E) DICK CAVETT 
SHOW 

7:35 Cfj GET SMART 
8:00 ffi 0 CJ:l liD HARPER 

VALLEY p,T.A. When 
Flora Simpson Reilly 
orders the bulldozing of 
the park to make way for a 
parking lot. Stella chains 
herself to the beloved 
Harper Valley tree in pro­
test and calls out a televi­
sion news crew. 
(Repeat) 
(!) m BENSON Chaos 
blasts Benson when the 
governor assigns him to 
do charitable work by 
being a substitute father 
to a mischievous ten year­
old boy who is then arrest­
ed along with Katie· for 
sho.eJ.ifting. (Repeat) 
®illJfB@E) WASHING· 
TON WEEK IN REVIEW 
00 CZ) 0 fB THE IN· 
CREDIBLE HULK David 
Banner is the unwilling 
recipient of a mail order 
bride, the forerunner of a 
plot which plunges him 
into the middle of a China­
town intrigue. (Repeat; 60 
mins.) 

. 8:05 0 UP CLOSE 
8:30 ffi 0 CJ:l liD SANFORD 

Alter Fred turns a juvenile 
housebreaker into the 
police,ajudgeassignsthe 
youth to his care. 
(!) m I'M A BIG GIRL 
NOW 

TV 
SCHEDULE 

®@ @9 t1t WALL 
$TREET WEEK 'The 
Medical Technology 
Boom' The revolution in 
medicine and science 
offers a rare investment 
opportunity. Guest: John 
Cannon, President, 
Medical Technology 
Fund, Inc. Host: louis 
Rukeyser. 

8:35 Cfj BASEBALL Atlanta 
Braves vs Houston Astros 
(In the event of a players' 
strike, alternate program­
ming will be aired.) 

9:00 Cl) 0 CJ:l m FRIDAY 
NIGHT AT THE MOVIES 
'Mrs. R's Daughter' 1979 
Stars: Cloris Leachman, 
Season Hubley. An emo­
tionally charged drama 
based on a true story of a 
mother's traumatic and 
frustrating battle to bring 
her daughter's rapist to 
trial. (2 hrs.) 
(!) ID FRIDAY NIGHT 

. MOVIE 'Robin And Mar· 
ian'1976Stars:SeanCon­
nery, Audrey Hepburn. 
Middle-aged Robin Hood 
returns to Sherwood For­
est alter years in exile, re­
kindles his romance with 
Marian and faces a final 
challenge against the 
Sheriff of Nottingham. 
(Repeat; 2 hrs.) 
® fB MEETING OF 
MINDS 
OOCDOfB THE DUKES 
OF HAZZARD Bo and 
Luke heroically put out a 
fire in an armored truck 
and get accused of steal· 
ing a million dollars for 
their trouble. (Repeat; 60 
mins.) 

. @ 0) NEXT QUESTION 
9:30 @@E) POWER GAME 

10:00 ®fB FORSYTESAGA 
00 CD 0 fB DALLAS 
J.R.'s attraction to Lucy's 
future sister-in-law is al­
most enough to divert his 
intention of getting 
Bobby's job as head of 
Ewing Oil, butheisquickto 
capitalize on his brother's 
rash actions. (Repeat; 60 
mins.) 
@ @E) FLIGHT: THE 
SKY'S THE LIMIT This 
program explores the his­
tory of flight as four young 
men, each with a passion 
to fly, visitSilverHiii,Mary­
land, which houses a 
wealth of memories from 
the past...priceless ar­
tifacts of the nation's 
history. 

11:oo mornmoomom 
fBllfj NEWS 
@@E) DAVE ALLEN AT 
LARGE 

11:05 Cfj TBS EVENING 
NEWS 

11:30 Cl) (I) KEEPERS 
SERIES 
0 (J) THE TONIGHT 
SHOW 'The Best Of Car· 
son Guests: Robert 
Blake, Carol Neblett, 
Sharon Gless, The Mighty 
Carson Art Players. 
(Re~at; 60 mins.) 
C!JW ABCNEWSNIGHT· 
LINE Anchored by Ted 
Kop.£_el. 
000 CBS LATE MOVIE 
'THE NIGHT STALKER: 
CDfB SOLID GOLD Host: 
Dionne Warwick. Gold 
record winners perform 
their hit songs. 
@ @E) MOVIE 
-(MYSTERY) •• "Crim· 
son Canary" 1945 Noah 
Beery Jr., Lois Collier. 
Nightclub musicians are 
the suspects in a series of 
brutal murders. (2 hrs.) 

12:00 (!) m FRIDAYS Guests: 
The Split Enz. (Repeat; 70 
mins.) 

12:05 lflMOVIE·(HORROR)*'h 
"Curse Of The Mummy" 
1971 Isabel Black, Pa· 
trick Mower. 

12:30 0 (U SCTV NETWORK 
90 
C1J fB AMERICA'S TOP 
10 

1:00 CZ) fB BLUE JEAN 



( 
NETWORK PRES~TS 
'Charlie Daniels Band and 
CharliePride' Thekingfish 
of southern rock, Charlie 
Daniels, and the 'pride' of 
cou ntry music, Charlie 
Pride, perform in-concert. 
(90mins.) 

1:1 0 G) ID PENTECOST 
TODAY 

1:30 ffi ffi HURRICANE 
1:40 0D ID ADAM 12 
2:00 O m NEWS 
2:10 0D ID GREENACRES 
2:20 Cfj ATLANTA BRAVES 

BASEBALL REPLAY 
Atlanta Braves vs Houston 
Astros (In the event of a 
pla ye rs' strike, alternate 
programming will be 
aired.) 

3:50 m RAT PATROL 
4:20 m MOVIE -(MYSTERY) 

**lh " Sherlock Holmes 
and the Voice of Terror" 
1942 Ba si l Rat hbone , 
Nigel Bruce. Sherlock 
Holmes fights saboteurs 
who carry outtheirthreats 
via radio. (75 mins .) 

5 :35 m LOVE AMERICAN 
STYLE 

«saturday)) 
JULY11,1981 

MORNING 

6 :05 m IT'S YOUR 
BUSINESS 

6:30 0 m SATURDAY 
REPORT 

6:35 m ROMPER ROOM 
6 :48 GJ ID FARM DIGEST 
6 :55 G) ID NEWS 
7:00 (V ffi HUMAN 

DIMENSIONS 
0 m BIG BLUE 
MAf!BLE 
C!JID KIDS ARE PEOPLE 
TOO 
® 0 PORKY PIG 
CD ffi MOVIE 
-(WESTERN) **'h " Yel­
low RoseofTexas" 1944 
Roy Rogers. Cowboy 
finds another love be­
sides his horse . (60 
mins.) 
@ m MARKET TO 
MARKET 

7:05 m VEGETABLE SOUP 
7:30 (2) ffi HOT FUDGE 

0 m GREAT SPACE 
COASTER 
(§) 0 GIGGLESNORT 
HOTEL 
(fj) m VICTORY 
GARDEN 

7 :35 m BASEBALL BUNCH 
8:00 CIJ 0 m ffi FLINT­

STONE COMEDY SHOW 
(4) ID SUPERFRIENDS 
HOUR 
®CD 0 ffi TOM AND 
JERRY COMEDY SHOW 
Ci!lmMOVIE -(COMEDY) 
**'h " Cat's Paw" 1934 
Harold Lloyd, Una Merkel. 

8:05 m PARTRIDGE FAMILY 
8:26 (6) (f) 0 ffi IN THE 

NEWS 
8:30 ® CD 0 ffi BUGS 

BUNNY-ROAD RUNNER 
SHOW 

8 :35 m MOVIE 
. -(ADVENTURE) * Vz 
" Last Train From Born" 
bay " 1952 Jon Hall, 
Christine La rson. 

8 :55 0tJ ID SCHOOLHOUSE 
ROCK 

8:56 @ CD 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

9 :00 (]) 0 m ffi GODZILLA 
@) ID FONZ AND THE 
HAPPY DAYS GANG 

9 :26 ® Cl) 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

9:30 ClJ 0 m ffi BATMAN 
AND THE SUPER SEVEN 
(4) ID RICHIE RICH­
SCOOBY AND SCRAPPY 
DOOSHOW 
(film CHARLIE CHAPLIN 
COMEDY THEATRE 

10:00 ®CD 0 ffi ALL-NEW 
POPEYE HOUR 
W)m FALL AND RISE OF 
REGINALD PERRIN 

10:05 m . MOVIE 
-(DOCUMENTARY)** Vz 
" Chariots Of The 
Gods? " 1971 

10:25 @ ID SCHOOLHOUSE 
ROCK 

10:26 ® Cl) 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

10:30 (2) 0 m ffi DAFFY 
(!) ID THUNDARR 
@ m MORECAMBE 
AND WISE 

10:55 G) 6) SCHOOLH!uSE 
ROCK 

10:56 ® CD 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

11:00 (]) 0 m ffi J.ETSONS 
G)ID HEATHCLIFF AND 
DINGBAT 
® ([) 0 ffi TARZAN­
LONE RANGER ADVEN­
TURE HOUR 
@ m WODEHOUSE 
PLAYHOUSE 

11:26 ® ([) 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

11:30 ffiO m iDHONGKONG 
PHOOEY 
G) ID PLASTICMAN­
BABY PLAS SUPER 
COMEDY SHOW 
@ m GOOD 
NEIGHBORS 

11 :55 G) ID DEAR ALEX AND 
ANNIE 

AFTERNOON 

12:00 Cl) ffi WRESTLING 
0 m Jonny Quest 
G) ID ABC WEEKEND 
SPECIAL 'Soup For Pre­
si dent ' 
®ffi0ffiFATALBERT 
SHOW 
® m WASHINGTON 
WEEK IN REVIEW 

12:05 m MOVIE 
-(ADVENTURE)* "Piran­
ha, Piranha" 1972 Peter 
Brown , William Smith . A 
trio on photographic jour­
ney down the Amazon 
River encounter hunter 
who plans on turnjng them 
into his prey . (2 hrs.) 

12:26 ® ([) 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

12:30 0 m FLINTSTONE 
COMEDY SHOW 
ffi iD AMERICAN BAND­
STAND Host : Dick Clark. 
(60mins.) 
® ([) 0 ffi DRAK 
PACK 
@ m WALL $TREET 
WEEK 'TheMedicai Tech­
nology Boom ' 

12:56 ® ([) 0 ffi IN THE 
NEWS 

1:00 ffi ffi SOUL TRAIN 
0 m BASEBALL 
BUNCH 
® 0 JASON OF STAR 
COMMAND 
([) ffi JASON OF SAR 
COMMAND 
@ m SPORTS 
AMERICA 

1:30 0 m THIS WEEK IN 
BASEBALL 
@) ID TOWN CRIER 
oo m o m 3o 
MINUTES 

2:00 (]) 0 m ffi MAJOR 
LEAGUE BASEBALL: AN 
INSIDELOOKHostBryant 
Gumbel. (If the Major 
League Baseball players ' 
st rikecontinues ,Baseball 
Today : A Strike Update 
will air.) 
(4) ID ANDY GRIFFITH 
SHOW 
@ 0 RAZZMATAZZ 
CD ffi KIDSWORLD 
® mMOVIE -(COMEDY) 
• ** " Wrong Arm Of The 
Law" 1963 Peter Sellers, 
Lionel Jeffries. 

2:05 m MOVIE -(MYSTERY) 
*** " Borgia Stick" 1967 
Don Murray . Inger 
Stevens. 

2:15 (]) 0 m ffi MAJOR 
LEAGUE BASEBALL 
GAME-OF-THE-WEEK 
California Angels at Kan­
sas City Royals ; or Texas 
Rangers a t Boston Red 
Sox. (Region will deter­
mine game to be televised 
in you r ar.ea.) (It the Major 
League Baseball players ' 
strike co ntinues , NBC 
Sports' Summer Season 
with host Bruce Jennerwill 
air.) (2 hrs., 45 mins .) 

2:30 ffi iD BACKSTAGE AT 
THE GRAND OLE OPRY 
® 0 HOGAN'S 
HEROES 
CD ffi TOBACCO TALK 

3:00 (4) ID DANIEL BOONE 
0D 0 BEVERLY 
HILLBILLIES 
C'l) ffi TONY BROWN'S 
JOURNAL 

3:30 ® 0 BOB NEWHART 
SHOW 
CD ffi WILD KINGDOM 
'Last Home of the 
Elephant' 
@ m THIS OLD 
HOUSE 

4:00 G) ID BIONIC WOMAN 
® fE G.E.D. 
® 0 ADAMS FAMILY 
([) ffi NASHVILLE ON 
THEROAD • 
® m HORRIBLE HON­
CHOS The adventures of a 
group of kids who os­
tracize a newcomer to the 
neighborhood before be­
friending him. 

4:05 m MISSION 
IMPOSSIBLE 

4:30 ® fE G.E.D. 
® 0 CBS SPORTS SA­
TURDAY 1) Women's In­
ter-national Diving Meet 
from Florida . 2) World ' s 
Greatest Pool Players 
from Lake Tahoe. (90 
mins .) 
([) ffi BACKSTAGE AT 
THE GRAD 0'-E OPRY 

5:00 ffi ffi JIM BAKKER 
0 m BEWITCHED 
G) ID WIDE WORLD OF 
SPORTS -

® fE M~RKET TO 
MARKET 
CD ffi MCLAIN FAMILY 
BAND 
® m ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC 'The Swish of 
th e Curtain' 

5:05 m PUTT PUTT GOLF 
5:30 O m THATGOODOLE 

NASHVILLE MUSIC 
® fE LAWMAKERS 
([) ffi POP GOES THE 
COUNTRY 
@ m DOCTOR WHO 

5:35 m CHAMPIONSHIP 
WRESTLING 

EVENING 

6 :00 (]) ffi JOHN 
FLANNERY 
o m®CD Offi 
NEWS 
® fE COOK IN ' CAJUN 
@ m ALL CREATURES 
'GREAT AND SMALL 

6:3o m o m m NBc 
NEWS 
ffi iD HANDS ON 
® fE JULIA CHILD AND 
COMPANY 
® 0 CONCERN 
CD ffi CBS NEWS 

7:00 ffi ffi JAMBOREE 
0 m DANCE FEVER 
ffi iD SOLIDGOLDHost : 
Dionne Warwi ck. Gold 
re co rd winners perform 
their hit songs . 
® fE DICK CAVETT 
SHOW 
®CD Offi HEEHAW 
CfD m MUPPET SHOW 

7:30 0 Cfl INSIDE LOOK 
® fE DICK CAVETT 
ill) m CLASSIC 
COUNTRY 

7:35 m THIS WEEK IN 
BASEBALL 

8:00 (]) 0 m ffi BARBARA 
MANDRELL AND · THE 
MANDRELL SISTERS 
Guests : Glen Campbell, 
the Alabama group, and 
the Krofft Puppets. 
(Re~at; 60 mins.) 
G)ID EIGHT IS ENOUGH 

® fE EVENING AT 
POPS 
®CDOffiCBSSATUR­
DA Y NIGHT MOVIE 'Th e 
Four Musketeers ' 1975 
Stars: Oliver Reed , Mi· 
chaeiYork. · 

( 

THE LAST CONVERTIBLE 

Perry King stars as a former Harvard 
. student whose life is changed when 
World War II breaks out and he spends 
several years on duty in the navy, in 
Part Four of "The Last ·Convertible," 
MONDAY, JULY 13 on NBC-TV. "The 
Last Convertible" is the television 
adaptation of Anton Myrer's best seller 
about the lives and loves of a group of 
Harvard men and Radcliffe women 
from their graduation to the 25th class 
reunion. 

In Part Four, Russ (King) has a reu­
nion at his family's estate when the war 
is over. The atmosphere is tense, 
though, as his surviving college friends 
find it difficult to adjust to the dramatic 
changes in their lives and the fact that 
their carefree days are over forever. 

Bruce Boxleitner, De9orah Raffin, 
Edward Albert, John Shea and Michael 
Nouri also star. 

CHECK LISTINGS FOR EXACT TIME. 
TV COMPUlOG SERVICES , INC 

8:05 m RATPATROL 
8:30 ® m KENTUCKY BLUE­

GRASS: MCLAIN FAMILY 
FESTIVAL 

8:35 m BASEBALL Atlanta 
Braves vs Houston Astros 
(In the event of a players ' 
strike, alternate program­
ming will be aired.) 

9:00 ffiOmffi BJANDTHE 
BEAR 
GJID THE LOVE BOAT 

® .fE ALL CREATURES 
GREAT AND SMALL 
® m MOVIE 
-(MYSTERY) *** "Ad­
ventures Of Sherlock 
Holmes" 1933 Basil 
Rathbone, Nigel Bruce. 

10:00 (]) I) m ffi GAMES 
PEOPLE PLAY 
@ CE) FANTASY ISLAND 
® fE MA~TERPIECE 
THEATRE ' Duchess of 
Duke Street: For Love of 
Money' 

® CD 0 ffi CBS 
REPORTS 'WhatShaiiWe 
Do About MotherO' 

10:30 @ m FOXFIRE 
BLUEGRASS 

11:00 (]) ffi IT'S YOUR 
BUSINESS 
o mm®momm 
NEWS 
® m MASTERPIECE 
THEATRE 'Duchess of 
Duke Street: For Love of 
Money' 

11:05 m TBS WEEKEND 
NEWS 

11:15 G) ID SATURDAY 
SCENE TONIGHT 

11 :30 ffi O m ffi SATURDAY 
NIGHT LIVE Host : Gary 
Busey. Guests: Eubie 
Blake , Gregory Hines. 
(Repeat; 90 mins.) 
G) ID 1981 MAY-
FLOWER LPGA 
CLASSIC 
® 0 MOVIE 
-(WESTERN) ** Vz " Cot­
ter " 1972 Don Murray, 
Ca.rol Lynley . 
CDffiMOVIE-(COMEDY) 
••• " Big Hand For The 
Little Lady" 1966 Henry 
Fonda, Joanne Wood­
ward. The wife of a com­
pulsive gambler sashays 
into the back room of aLar­
edo Hote l in 1896 and 
recoups their life savings. 

12:00 ® m AUSTIN CITY 
LIMITS ' Leon Red bone' 
takes the troubadour 
tradition of folk singing 
an d gives it a new twist . 

12:05 m TUSH! 
1:00 0 m MOVIE 

-(WESTERN) * Vz "Gun 
Fury" 1953 Rock Hud ­
son, Donna Reed . A cow­
boy goes gunning for the 
kidnappers of his fiancee. 

1:05 m ATLANTA BRAVES 
BASEBALL REPLAY 
AtlantaBraves vsHouston 
Astros (In the event of a 
players' strike, alternate 
programming will be 
aored.) 

1 :30 ffi ID ROCK CONCERT 
2:30 O m NEWS 
3:35 m RATPATROL 
4:05 m MISSION 

IMPOSSIBLE 
5:05 m LOVE AMERICAN 

STYLE 

«sunday)) 
JULY 12, 1981 

MORNING 

5:35 m CATHOLIC MASS 
6:00 ffi ffi TOBACCO TALK 
6:05 m BETWEEN THE 

LINES 
6:30 0 m . CHRISTOPHER 

CLOSEUP 
® 0 ABETTERWAY 
([) ffi CISCO KID 

6:55 G) ID NEWS 
7:00 (]) ffi TIME · FOR 

REFRESHING 
0 m THIS IS THE LIFE 
G) ID PROGRAM 
UNANNOUNCED 
® 0 OLD TIME GO­
SPEL HOUR 
ffi ffi KENNETH 
COPELAND 

7:05 m JAMES ROBISON 
7:30 0 m UNITED CHRIS­

TIAN INTERNATIONAL 
G) ID JAMES ROBISON 

7:35 m IT IS WRITTEN 
8:00 (]) ffi OLD FASHIONED 

GOSPEL HOUR 
0 m MUSIC AND THE 
SPOKEN WORD 
G) ID OLD TIME GO­
SPEL HOUR 
® 0 DAY OF 
DISCOVERY 
ffi ffi ORAL ROBERTS 
® m SESAME 
STREET 

8:05 m THREE STOOGES 
AND FRIENDS 

8 :30 (]) ffi ' R.A. WEST 
REVIVAL 
0 m ORAL ROBERTS 
® 0 REV. LEONARD 
REPASS 
([) ffi REX HUM BARD 

9:00 (]) ffi SUNDAY 
SCHOOL 
O m GOSPEL SINGING 
JUBILEE 
G) ID WHAT DOES THE 
BIBLE PLAINLY SAY? 
® 0 NEW LIFE TEAM 
([) ffi CBS SUNDAY 
MORNING 
@ m STUDIO SEE 

9:05 m LOST IN SPACE 

9:30 (]) ffi REV. LEONARD 
REPASS -
G) ® 0 ID ROBERT 
SCHULLER 
(CAPTIONE_D) 
@ m BIG BLUE 
MARBLE 

10:00 (]) ffi BIG CREEK BAP­
TIST CHURCH SERVICE 
0 m REX HUMBARD 
ffi iD REV. R.A. WEST 
® m SESAME 
STREET 

10:05 m HAZEL 
10:30 0 m UNITED METH­

ODIST CENTER 
ffi ID JIMMY 
SWAGGART , 
® 0 ERNEST ANGLEY 
HOUR 
([) ffi DAY OF 
DISCOVERY 

10:35 m MOVIE 
, -(ROMANCE-DRAMA) 
•••• "Wuthering 
Heights" 1939 Merle 
Oberon, Laurence Olivier. 
The story of a strange love 
affair in pre-Victorian Eng­
land. (2 hrs .. 30 mins.) 

11:00 I)) ffi JA .JOREE PRE­
SENTS GOSPEL TIME 
0 m HUMAN 
DIMENSIONS 
([) ffi IT IS WRITTEN 
® m ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC 'The Swish of 
the Curtain' 

11:30 (]) ffi R.A. WEST 
REVIVAL 
O m TV CHAPEL 
G) ID REX HUM BARD 
® ([) 0 ffi FACE THE 
NATION 
® m CHARLIE CHAPLIN 
COMEDY THEATRE 

AFTERNOON 

12:00 (]) ffi OLD TIME GO­
SPEL HOUR 
O m AT ISSUE 
G) ID WORLD 
TOMORROW 
® 0 VIEWPOINT 
([) ffi DIRECTIONS 
® m MOVIE 
-(WESTERN(* "Doomed 
At Sundown" 1937 Tala 
Birelli , Luis Trenker . A 
WWI mountain guide must 
choose between personal 
safety and loyalty to his 
doomed battalion. (60 
mins.) 

12:30 0 m MEET THE 
PRESS 
G) ID VIRGIL Q_ 
WACKS 
® 0 WORLD OF 
PEOPLE 
ffi ffi NEWSMAKER 
'81 

1:00 CV ffi JOURNEY TO 
ADVENTURE 
0 m TONY BROWN'S 
JOURNAL 
G) ID ISSUES AND 
ANSWERS 
® 0 MOVIE 
-(BIOGRAPHICAL) •• 
"Deadman's Curve" 
1978 Richard Hatch, 
Bruce Davison. · 
([) ffi IT'S YOUR 
BUSINESS 
@ m MOVIE -(DRAMA) 
•• Vz "Our Little Girl" 
1935 Shirley Temple , 
Joel McCrea. A troubled 
'only child' tries to patch 
up parental differences by 
running away. (90 mins.) 

1:05 CD . MOVIE 
·(ADVENTURE) •• "P.T. 
109" 1963 Cliff Robert ­
son, Robert Gulp . W.W.II: 
The exploits of L,t . John F. 
Kennedy and his P. T. crew 
when they are stranded on 
a Pacific Island. (3 hrs .) 

1:30 (]) ffi CHALLENGE 
MATCH FISHING 
OmFIVEMINUTESTO 
LIVE 
GJ ID BIBLICAL 
VIEWPOINTS 
([) ffi EMERGENCY 
ONE 

2:00 (V ffi CHAMPIONSHIP 
FISHING 
0 m MOviE 
-(COMEDY-DRAMA)*** 
"The Comic" 1969 Dick 
Van Dyke, Mic hele Lee . 
G) ID DANIEL BOONE 

2:30 (]) ffi TRUTH ABOUT 
COUNTRY MUSIC 
([) ffi 11th ANNUAL 
SENIOR OLYMPICS 
®@lSNEAKPREVIEWS 

3:oo mm FAsT coMPANY 
G) ID ANDY GRIFFITH 
SHOW 
® 0 MOVIE 
-(MYSTERY-COMEDY) 
•• Vz "Runaway Bus" 
1955 Margaret Ruther­
ford, Frankie Howard. Air­
port bus , lost in London 
fog, with a pair of crooks 
on board with a fortune in 
stolen bullion in the trunk. 
(90 mins.) 
® mMOVIE-(MUSICAL) 
•• v. "My Lucky Star" 
1938 Sonja Henie , Ri ­
chard Greene. A blonde in 
a department store 
becomes involved with 
the owner's son . (90 
mins .) 

3:30 G)ID GREEN ACRES 
4:00 (V 0 m ffi SPORTS­

WORLD 

•G) ID 1981 MAY-
FLOWER LPGA 
CLASSIC 
(J) fE LAP OUIL TING 

4:05 m MOVIE -(COMEDY) 
•• 'h "Stop! Look! and 
Laugh!" 1960 Three 
Stooges, Paul Winchell. 



(. ,;30 ®fEOVEREASYGuest: 
Singer Geraldine Fitzger­
ald. Host: Hugh Downs. 
(Closed-Captioned; -
U.S.A.) 
®CD 0 m CBS 
SPORTS SUNDAY WBC 
World Bantamweight 
Championship Lupe Pin­
tor will defend his title 
against challenger Jovito 
Rengifor in a 15-round 
bout from Las Vegas . (90 
mins.) 
'GJ) @) VIC BRADEN'S 
TENNIS FOR THE FU­
TURE In this final episode, 
Vic Braden answers 
viewers' questions and 
reviews key points on 
strokes, strategy, condi­
tioning and the winning 
power of laughter . 
(Closed-Captioned ; 
U.S.A.) 

5:00 ® f» OVER EASY 
'Lifelong Marriage' Hosts: 
Hugh Downs and Frank 
Blair. (Closed-Captioned; 
U.S.A.) 
®@>NOVA 

5:30 (1) fiD PROGRAM 
UNANNOUNCED 
Om SUPER FANS 
® f» THIS OLD 
HOUSE 

5:35 If) CHAMPIONSHIP 
WRESTLING 

EVENING 

6:00 (1) fiD BILL FRANCIS 
FLOWERS AND 
GARDENING 
Om®O NEWS 
C!liD ABC NEWS 
®f» CROCKETT'S VIC­
TORY GARDEN 
CD m BAXTERS 
®@) FIRING LINE 'EI 
Salvador, Christianity and 
Marxism' 

6:30 (1) 0 m fiD NBC 
NEWS 

· @ID SHA NA NA 
® f» COOKING 
MEXICAN 
®0 CBSNEWS 
(1) m WILD KINGDOM 
·Sea Snakes of the 
Swains' 

6:35 If) NICE PEOPLE 
7:00 (1) 0 m fiD DISNEY'S 

WONDERFUL WORLD 
' Now You See Him, Now 
You Don 't' 1972 Stars: 
Kurt Russell, Michael 
McGreevey. 
C!JID ROOTS: THE NEXT 
GENERATIONS 
® f» NEWVOICE 
oom om 6o 
MINUTES 
@@)WORLD OF CHAR· 
LIE COMPANY CBS news 
correspondent John Law­
rence, who won an Emmy 
for his reporting from Viet ­
nam, coversthedaytoday 
life of U.S. combat sol­
diers in Vietnam and Cam­
bodia, in this film which 
originally aired on CBS in 
1970.Anupdatehasbeen 
included. (60 mins.) 

7:05 If) UP CLOSE WITH 
HOWARD JARVIS 

7:30 ® f» UP AND COMING 
7:35 If) ATLANTIC CITY 

ALIVE 
8:00 ffi 0 m fiD CHiPs 

® f» SEARCH FOR 
ALEXANDER THE 
GREAT 
® (1) 0 m ARCHIE 
BUNKER'S PLACE 
@@>EVENINGATPOPS 
'George Benson ' Guitarist 
George Benson and the 
Boston Pops Orchestra 
perform light classical 
and popular music . (60 
mins .) 

8:30 ®CDOmONEDAYAT 
A TIME 

8:35 If) BASEBALL Atlanta_ 
Braves vs Houston Astros 
(If players' strike contin­
ues, alternate program­
ming will be aired . 

9:00 (1) 0 m fiD THE SUN· 
DAY BIG EVENT 'Charlie 
And The Great Balloon 
Race' 1981 Stars: Jack 
Albertson, MoosieDrier. 

C!J ID SUNDAY NIGHT 
MOVIE 'Nickelodeon ' 
1976 Stars: Burt Rey­
nolds, Ryan O'Neal. 

® ® f» @) MASTER· 
PIECE THEATRE 'Cousin 
Bette : Family Angel' 

®mom ALICEine 
change for free rent, Alice 
takes on a second job 
managing her apartment 
building and is quickly 
reminded that everything 
has a price. (Repeat) 

9 :3o ® m o m THE JEF· 
FERSONS 

10:00 ® f» EVENING AT 
SYMPHONY Guest con­
ductor Colin Davis leads 
the Boston Symphony in 
Dvorak 's 'Symphonic Var­
iations' and the 'Fantasia 
on Scottish Folk 
Melodies ' for violin . (60 
mins.) 
® (1) 0 m TRAPPER 
JOHN, M.D. 
@ @)DAVID SUSSKIND 
SHOW 

11:00 Cl)(ifj COMMUNIQUE 
omoomom 
NEWS 
® @) SO YOU WANNA 
BE A STAR 

11:05 If) TBS WEEKEND 
NEWS 

11:15 CDm CBS NEWS 
11:30 (1) fiD NBC LATE NIGHT 

MOVIE 'Side Show' 1981 
Stars: Lance Kerwin , Con­
nie Stevens. 
0 m MOVIE 
·(ADVENTURE)*'h "Bat· 
tie Stations" 1956 John 
Lund, Keefe Brasselle. 
C!JID ABC NEWS 
®0MOVIE·(DRAMA)* 
" Color Him Dead" 197 4 
Gayle Hunnicut , Stephen 
Rea. A Husband and wife 
private eye team are in hot 
pursiut of a killer before he 
murders their wealthy 
client. (2 hrs.) 
ffi m CBS LATE MOVIE 
'THE NIGHT STALKER: 
Bad Medicine ' 

11:45 rn m FoRuM 19 
12:00 C!J ID PENTECOST 

TODAY 
12:05 If) OPEN UP 
12:30 C!J ID JIM BAKKER 
1:05 If) MOVIE ·(DRAMA)** 

"Johnny Banco" 1967 
Sylva Koscina, Horst 
Buchholz. 

3:05 If) ATLANTft BRAVES 
BASEBALL REPLAY 
Atlanta BravesvsHouston · 
Astros )If players' strike 
continues, alternate pro-

5:35 
Q£_amming will be aired.) 
W RAT PATROL 

JULY 13, 1981 

EVENING 

6:oo m o mmooomm 
NEWS 
® f» VIKINGS! 'Hammer 
of the North ' 

(1) m NEWS (CONTIN· 
UES FROM DAYTIME) 
Cfil @) STUDIO SEE 

6 :05 If) FATHER KNOWS 
BEST 

6:30 (1) 0 m fiD NBC 
NEWS 
ffi iD ABCNEWS 
® f» THE ORIGINALS: 
THE WRITER IN AMER· 
ICA ' Wright Morris' 
®CD 0 m CBS 
NEWS 
® @) WILD WILD 
WORLD OF ANIMALS 

6:35 If) THAT GIRL 
7:00 (1) fiD BIBLICAL 

VIEWPOINT 
o mm m PM 
MAGAZINE 
C!J ID NEWLYWED 
GAME 
®@ f»@) MACNEIL· 
LEHRER REPORT • 
(6) 0 TICTACDOUGH 

7:05 If) ALL IN THE FAMILY 
7:30 CIJ fiD WILD KINGDOM 

Om BULLSEYE 
Gl ID FACE THE 
MUSIC 
® f» KENTUCKY 
JOURNAL 
® 0 JOKER'S WILD 
CU m M.A.S.H. 
@ @) DICK CAVETT 
SHOW . 

7:35 If) GET SMART 
8:00 (1) 0 m fiD LITTLE 

HOUSE ON THE PRAIRIE 

(!) ID THE BEST OF 
TIMES 
([) f» FIRING LINE 'EI 
Salvador, Christianity and 
Marxism' 

8:05 

8:30 

9:00 

®CDOm WKRP 
CINCINNATI Her!J's real 
intentions turn out to be 
less than charitable when 
he purchases a painting 
from Arthur Carlson's 
church auction and tries to 
conLes into paying for half 
of it. (Repeat) 
@ @) SHAKESPEARE 
PLAYS 'As You Like It' 
If) MOVIE 
·(BIOGRAPHY) ** 'h 
" Amazing Howard 
Hughes" Part I. 1977 
Tommy Lee Jones, Ed 
Flanders . A fascinating 
account of the mysterious 
Mr. Hughes. 
(2 hrs.) 
®(1)0 m THE TIM 
CONWAY SHOW Tim· 
Conway picks members of 
thestudioaudiencetoper­
formwithhim in 'Murder on 
the Accidental Express.' 
(Re~at) . 
ffiDmfiD FLAMINGO 
ROAD 

C!J ID ABC MONDAY 
NIGHT MOVIE 'The Death 
OfOceanViewPark' 1979 
Stars: Mike Connors, 
Diana Canova. 
® f» SHAKESPEARE 
PLAYS 'As You Like It' 
This play was taped on 
location at Glamis Castle 
where the real Macbeth 
lived. 
®CD 0 m - M.A.S.H. 
Hawkeyebeginssneezing 
and can't stop, causing 
Colonel Potter to turn the 
4077fh upside down to 
find the cause. (Repeat) 

9:30 ® (1) 0 m HOUSE 
CALLS 

10:00 (1) EJ m fiD THE LAST 
CONVERTIBLE 

®CD Om LOU GRANT 
10:05 If) TBS EVENING 

NEWS 
10:30 ® @) SYMBOLS OF 

LIVES PAST: THE RAM· 
BOVA COLLECTION 

11:oo mommoomom 
mm NEWS 
@@) DAVE" ALLF~~ AT 
LARGE 

11:05 If) NIGHTGALLERY 
11:30 ffiOmfiD THE TON· 

IGHT SHOW 'The Best Of 
Carson' 
C!JID ABC NEWS NIGHT· 
LINE Anchored by Ted 
Kop~l. 
®WOm CBSLATE 
MOVIE 'QUINCY, M.E. : 
Semper Fidelis' 
® @) ABC CAPTIONED 
NEWS -

11:35 If) MOVIE 
·(ADVENTURE) ** 'h 
" Jayhawkers" 1959 
Jeff Chandler, Fess 
Parker. 

12:00 C!JID FANTASY ISLAND 

12:30 0 m TOMORROW 
COAST· TO-COAST 
Guests: Mark Hamill , 
Santana. (90 mins.) 

1:10 C!J ID ADAM 12. 
1:40 (4) ID GREENACRES 

If) MOVIE 
·(ADVENTURE) ••• 
"Across The Pacific" 
1942 Humphrey Bogart 
Sydney Greenstreet. 

3:40 If) MOVIE -(DRAMA) ••• 
"Battling Bellhop" 1936 
Bette Davis , Edward G. 
Robinson . 

«tuesday)) 
JULY 14, 1981 

EVENING 

6:oo m omrnooomm 
NEWS 
® f» BY-WORDS m m NEws ccoNTIN· 
UES FROM DAYTIME) 
{TI)@) STUDIO SEE 

6:05 If) FATHER KNOWS 
BEST 

6:30 (1) 0 m fiD NBC 
NEWS 
ffi iD ABC NEWS 
®f» G.E.D. 
®CD 0 m CBS 
NEWS 
@ @) WILD WILD 
WORLD OF ANIMALS 

6:35 If) THAT GIRL . 
7:00 ffi fiD BARGAIN BARN 

ommm PM 
MAGAZINE 

~------------~( ~-----------r 

l THE TWO WORLDS 
OF JENNIE LOGAN 

Lindsay Wagner stars 1n the title role 
of "The Two Worlds of Jenn1e Logan," 
a gothic tale of a woman who must go 
back m t1me m a desperate attempt to 
change the course of fate and save the 
life of her true love, to be rebroadcast 
:m "The CBS Tuesday Night Mov1es," 
TUESDAY, JULY 14. Alan Fe1nstem 
stars as her husband, Michael. 

With the hope that a new sett1ng will 
g1ve the1r troubled marnage a fresh 
resolve, Jenn1e and M1chael Logan 
purchase a lovely V1ctonan house 
w1thm commutmg d1stance of New 
York, but away from the hassles of the 
city and the pamful memory of 
Michael's recent Infidelity. As Jennie 
throws herself 1nto restonng the old 
house to 1ts orig1nal style, she fil1ds 
she's drawn to the world of 1ts earlier 
mhabitants. 

CHECK U.ST!NGS FOR EXACT TIME 

C!J ID NEWLYWED 
GAME 
® ® f»@) MACNEIL· 
LEHRER REPORT 
® 0 TIC TAC DOUGH 

7:05 If) ALL IN THE FAMILY 
7:30 Cl)(ifj HEADWATERS 

Om BULLSEYE 
C!J ID FACE THE 
MUSIC 
® f» KENTUCKY 
JOURNAL 
®0 JOKER'S WILD 
ffim M.A.S.H. 
® @) DICK CAVETT 
SHOW 

7:35 If) GET SMART 
8:00 ffiOmfiD BASEBALL 

PRE-GAME SHOW Host : 
Bryant Gumbel. (If the 
players' strike continues, 
alternate programming 
will air.) 
C!J ID HAPPY DAYS 
Joan i.e buys a car behind 
Howard's back to keep 
boyfriend Chachi on the 
road to romance, but the 
secret purchase back-

T'V COMPULOG SERVICES. INC 

fires, putting Jeanie on a 
collision course with her 
father and the Fonz. 
(Repeat) 
® f» BILL MOYERS' 
JOURNAL 
®CDOm WALTER 
CRONKITE'S UNIVERSE 
@@)NOVA 'Anatomy of 
a Volcano ' Nova ac­
companiesan internation· 
a Iteam of geologists as 
they study Mt. St. Helens in 
an effort to discover clues 
that might enable them to 
more accurately predict 
future volcanic eruptions. 
(Closed -Captioned; U. ­
S.A.) (60 mins.) 

8:05 If) MOVIE ·(COMEDY) 
••• " G.I. Blues" 1960 
Elvis Presley, Juliet 
Prowse. Three G.l.'s form 
a CQ.mbo group while sta· 
tioned in Germany. (2 hrs., 
15mins.) 

8:20 (1) 0 m fiD MAJOR 
LEAGUE BASEBALL 
ALL-STAR GAME NBC 

A happy day for Ron Howard 
when star is unveiled 

Ron Howard will be honored by the Hollywood 
Chamber of Commerce August 19, when his star is add­

-ed to the city's famous "Walk of Fame." 
Howard, under contract to NBC as an actor, writer, 

producer and director, will accept the honor on the 25th 
anniversary of his entrance into show business-at the 
age of 2. 

The Hollywood Historic Council, a division of the 
chamber of commerce, occasiona lly selects a member 
of the show business community to join the ranks of 
those who have a gold star imbedded in the sidewalks of 
the Hollywood business district-the area's version of 
the "Hall of Fame." Howard's star, which will be unveil­
ed at ceremonies at noon on the 19th, will be in front of 
the Paramount Theatre, where his first motion picture, 
" Music Man," premiered when he was 6. 

Attending the ceremonies will be a representative of 
the mayor's office, who will present the talented young 
star with a City Council proclamation declaring "Ron 
Howard Day" in. Los Angeles. 

Howard, who rose to national fame during his long 
television run on "The Andy Griffith Show," joined NBC 
fresh from his equally long run in ABC's "Happy Days" 
series. He has since been active in several NBC World 
Premiere movies, including "Skyward," which he 
directed, and "Bitter Harvest," rn which he starred. 

TV COMPU~OC SERVICES. INC 

Sports provides cover· 
age of this diamond clas· 
sic pitting the National 
League stars against the 
American League stars; 
from Municipal Stadium in 
Cleveland . (If the players' 
strike continues, Lobo , 
Hill Street Blues and Nero 
Wolfe will air.) (3 hrs., 30 
mins.) 

8:30 (!) ID LAVERNE AND 
SHIRLEY Laverne and 
Shirley and their sleazy 
fnends, Lenny and 
Squiggy, give their own 
separate versions ex­
plaining the night they 
spent as husbands and 
wives 1n a motel room that 
ended up totally 
demolished while they 
were ontheirtrek from Mil­
waukee to Los Angeles. 
(Repeat) (Closed­
Captioned; U.S. A.) 
®(f) 0 m FLO Earl 
breaks a leg and Flo can't 
understand why he's so 
cpset at m1ssmg a reun1on 
with B .J., his old bronc 
bustmg buddy. (Repeat) 

9:00 GJ ID THREE'S COM· 
PANY Jack plays Cup1dto 
his girlfriend's widowed 
father, but his arrow hilar­
IOusly misf~res when the 
older man makesJanethis 
target. (Repeat) (Closed­
Captioned; U.S. A.) 
(S)f» NOVA 'Anatomy of 
a Volcano' Nova ac­
companies an internation­
al team of geologists as 
theystudy)-11. St.Helensm 
an effort to discover clues 
that might enable them to 
more accurately pred1ct 
future volcamc erupt1ons. 
(Closed-Captioned ; U.· 
S.A.) (60 mms.) 
®CD Om CBS TUES­
DAY NIGHT MOVIE 'The 
Two Worlds Of Jennie 
Logaro' 1979 Stars: Lmd­
say Wagner, Marc Singer. 
A gothiC tale of a woman 
whomustgoback mtime1n 
a desperate attempt to 
change the course of fate 
and savethelifeofhertrue 
love. (2 hrs .) 
(11) @) MYSTERY! 
'Rebecca' Ep1sode Ill . The 
de W1nters dec1de to 
rev1ve the trad1t1onal Man­
derley costume ball and 
the second Mrs . de 
W1nters secretly cop1es a 
dress from a portra1t 10 the 
Mar.derley gallery. 
(Closed-Captioned ; U.· 
S.A.) (60 mins .) 

9:30 (4) ID TOO CLOSE FOR 
COMFORT Henry ge_ts 
into a frenzy when he finds 
blfth control pills 10 Sara's 
room while she's away for 
the weekend , and then 
learns that Jack1e has In­
vited a sailor to spend the 
~ht. (Repeat) 

10:00 ( ~_) ID HART TO HART 
Jonathan poses as a 
swinging bachelor trying 
topickupanavailableJen­
nifer at a singles bar as 
they tangle w1th danger· 
ous members of a gam­
bling ring who use the 



nightclub as the front for 
their crooked dealings. 
(Repeat; 60 mins.) 
(Closed-Captioned; 
U.S.A.) 
® foB MYSTERY! 
·Rebecca' Episode Ill. The 
de Winters decide to 
revive the traditional Man­
derley costume ball and 
the second Mrs . de 
Winters secretly copies a 
dress from a portrait in the 
Manderley gallery. 
(Closed-Captioned; U.­
S.A.) (60 mins.) 
ern @) SHERLOCK 
HOLMES AND DR. 
WATSON 

10:20 m TBS EVENING 
NEWS 

10:30 (W@) U.S. CHRONICLE II 
'Lower Lancaster Street' 
Gentrification is the urban 
trend of the 80's, but it in­
volves displacement of 
the poor, which breeds re­
sentment and neighbor­
hood tension. 

11:oo m oo CD o m m 
NEWS 
ern @) DAVE ALLEN AT 
LARGE 

11:20 m NIGHTGALLERY 
11:30 !2)0 (~)(if) NEWS 

mm ABC NEWS NIGHT· 
LINE Anchored by Ted 
Kop~l. 
®WOfB CBSLATE 
MOVIE 'COLUMBO: Dag­
ger Of The Mind ' When 
Columbo goes to England 
to learn something from 
the detectives at Scot­
landYard, he finds himself 
assisting in a murder in­
ves~ation. (Repeat) 
ern W ABC CAPTIONED 
NEWS 

11:50 m MOVIE ·{DRAMA) 
••• ~'2 "Requiem for a 
Heavyweight" 1962 
Anthony Quinn, Jackie 
Gleason . The story of a 
fighter whose ring career 
is over, forcing him into de­
gradation and corruption. 
(2 hrs., 5 mins.) 

12:00 (2) 0 m €D THE TON­
IGHT SHOW 'The Best Of 
Carson' Guests: Charlton 
Heston, Arlene Golonka, 
Merie Earle. (Repeat; 60 
mins.) 
C4J m TUESDAY MOVIE 
OF THE WEEK ' Intimate 
Strangers· 1977 Stars: 
Dennis Weaver, Sally 
Struthers. A couple find 
that their deep love for 
each other cannot over­
come the explosive emo­
tions which threaten to 
destr2.}' their marriage. 

1:00 0 l 3J TOMORROW 
COAST-TO-COAST 
Guests: Sister Sledge. 
(90 mins.) 

1 :55 .. m MOVIE ·{MYSTERY) 
•• 'h "All Through The 
Night" 1942 Humphrey 
Bogart, Conrad Veidt. 
American crook and his 
gang track down Nazi 
spies in WW II New York 
C1ty. (2 hrs ., 10 mins.) 

2:12 C4Jm ADAM 12 
2:42 0fi m GREEN ACRES 
4:05 m MOVIE 

·(ADVENTURE) *** 
" Fighter Squadron" 
1948 Edmond O'Brien . 
Robert Stack . A former 
flying tiger pilot faces 
combat mission after 
combat mission. (2 hrs.) 

((daytirne» 
WED THRU TUES 

MORNING 

5:39 ( 4 ) m WORDS OF 
TRUTH 

5:40 ffim NEWS 
5:45 (4) m ASSEMBLY 

ECHOES 
m WORLD AT LARGE 
(FRI.) 

5:50 m WORLD AT LARGE 
(THUR., TUE.) 

6:00 (6)0 700CLUB 
(7J m TOWN AND 
COUNTRY 

6:05 m HOLLYWOOD 
REPORT 

6:15 <TIJ@) LILIAS, YOGA AND 
YOU 

6:45 0 rn MORNING 
REPORT 
m m ASSEMBLY 
ECHOES 

ill)@) A.M. WEATHER 
7:00 ffiOmm TODAY 

ffi m GOOD MORNING' 
AMERICA 
®CDO fB MORNING 
<TIJ @) VARIOUS 
PROGRAMMING 

7:05 m FUN TIME 
8:00 ®CD 0 fB CAPTAIN 

KANGAROO 
ern@) SESAME STREET 
(EXC. MON.) 

8:05 m LASSIE 
8:30 ern@lBIGBLUEMARBLE 

(MON.) 
8:35 m MY THREE SONS 
9:00 (J) €D 700 CLUB 

0 m BOB BRAUN 
SHOW 
ffi m JIM BAKKER 
® 0 RICHARD SIM· 
MONS SHOW 
CD m HouR 
MAGAZINE 
® @) MORNING MOVIE 
'Our Very Own' (WED.), 
'The Castle' (THUR .), 'The 
Informer' (FRI.), 'My 
Lucky Star' (MON.), 
'Loser Take All' (TUE.) 

9:05 m FAMILY AFFAIR 
9:30 (]) 0 GOMER PYLE 
9:35 m I DREAM OF 

JEANNIE 
10:00 (J) €D MORNING 

STRETCH 
Om LAS VEGAS GAM· 
BIT JEXC. TUE.) 
ffi m 700CLUB 
oo CD o m 
JEFFERSONS 

10:05 m MOVIE 'Road to Rio' 
(WED.), 'Underworld, U.· 
S.A.' (THUR.), 'Mozam­
bique' (FRI.), 'Gold Dig­
gers of 1933' (MON .), 
'Dames' (TUE.) 

10:30 (J)€D BLOCKBUSTERS 
(EXC. MON., TUE.) New 
Zoo Revue (MON., TUE.) 
0 m BLOCKBUSTERS 
(PJION., TUE.) 
®CDOfBALICE 
<TIJ@) LIFE AROUND US 

11:00 (J)0@€D WHEEL OF 
FORTUNE 
G) m THREE'S 
COMPANY 
(§) ffi 0 fB PRICE IS 
RIGHT 
@ @) MAGIC METHOD 
OF OIL PAINTING 

11:30 (J) €D PASSWORD 
PLUS 
Om NEWS 
@ @) ELECTRIC 
COMPANY 

11:57 oo m o m 
NEWSBREAK 

AFTERNOON 
12:00 (J) €D HEALTH FIELD 

ffi m FAMILY FEUD 
® 0 NEWS 
CD fB MATCH GAME 
ern @) SESAME 
STREET 

12:05 m FREEMAN 
REPORTS 

12:30 momm DOCTORS ffi m RYAN'SHOPE 
C6JCD0fB YOUNG AND 
THE RESTLESS 

12:58 ffim FYI 
1:00 (2) 0 •@ €D DAYS OF 

OUR LIVES 
ffi m ALL MY 
CHILDREN 
G1) @) VARIOUS 
PROGRAMMING . 

1:05 m MOVIE 'Top Secret Af· 
fair' (WED.) , 'Ride Beyond 
Vengeance' (THUR.), '24 
Hours to Kill' (FRI.), 
' Wives and Lovers' 
(MON.). 'Ten Million Dollar 
Grab' (TUE.) 

1:30 (]) CD 0 fB AS THE 
WORLD TURNS 

2:00 (J) 0@ €D ANOTHER 
WORLD 
(!) m ONE LIFE TO 
LIVE 

2:30 (]) ffi 0 fB SEARCH 
FOR TOMORROW 

2:58 ffim FYI 
3:00 (2) 0 m €D TEXAS 

Q0 m GENERAL 
HOSPITAL 
(6) ffi 0 fB GUIDING 
LIGHT 
(ij) @) VARIOUS 
PROGRAMMING 

3:05 m FUN TIME 
3:30 ern@) OVER EASY 
3:35 m FLINTSTONES 
3:57 m m o m 

NEWSBREAK 
3:58 ffim FYI 
4:00 (])€D MIKE DOUGLAS 

0 m MR. CARTOON 
ffim SIX MILLION DOL· 
LARMAN 

4:05 
4:35 
5:00 

5:05 

5:30 

5:35 

® ern foB @) SESAME 
STREET 
Cil 0 HOUR 
MAGAZINE 
CDfB JOHN DAVIDSON 
SHOW 
m ADDAMS FAMILY m HAZEL 
(J) €D JIM BAKKER 
0 m CAROL BURNETT 
AND FRIENDS 
ffi m JOKER'S WILD 
®foB MISTER ROGERS 
® 0 JOHN DAVIDSON 
SHOW 
CDfB M.A.S.H. 
@@) MISTER ROGERS 
(EXC. THUR.) Television 
Library Club (THUR.) 
m OZZIE AND 
HARRIET 
0@ M:A.S.H. m m $5o,ooo 
PYRAMID 
® foB ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY (EXC. FRI.) Once 
~on a Classic (FRI.) 
W fB NEWS 
@ @) EPISODE 
ACTION m BEVERLY 
HILLBILLIES 

• 

·-
.. .. 

• 

• 

.· 

THE OTHER SIDE 
OF THE MOUNTAIN 

Marilyn Hassett stars in "The Other 
Side of the Mountain," a fact-based 
drama about Jill Kinmont, the Olympic 
skiing hopeful who became paralyzed 
following an accident. The . 1975 
Universal Pictures release, also star­
ring Beau Bridges, will be presented 
on "NBC Thursday Night at tt)e 
Movies," THURSDAY, JULY 16. The 
story continues in "The Other Side of 
the Mountain-Part 2," to be telecast 
July 17. 

As a member of the Bishop High 
School Ski Team, Kinmont competes 
against a two-time gold medal winner 
in the Snow Cup Race in Utah, but falls 
victim in a catastrophic accident. Suf­
fering from a broken neck and severed 
spinal cord, she undergoes a series of 
operations, but is paralyzed from the 
neck down. 

CHECK LISTINGS FOR EXACT TIME 

... 
Heard 'round the universe 

Two or more can play. Without reading the story, one player asks the 
other(s) to write the requested words. in order, on a separate sheet of 
paper. For a good laugh, plug in the answers and read the story back. 

Slap me ____ ! I just won the national mud-::----:--:-
a number 'ing' verb 

contest. The Grand Prize is a(n) -,----,-.,---filled with mud 
large object 

and a two-day tour of --...,....--- with as 
a place famous person 

my guide. 

!"' • •••• .. 

. .. 

MOON SCAN 

1. Jive talk 

2. Rip-off 

3. Punk 

4. Gig 

5. Jam 

6. Goober 

7. Turkey 

8. Beat 

9. Book 

10. Shrink 

11. 

A I Z 8 P Q Y X R 8 E A T D 
8 K S U A G E R Q G F T N F 
G 0 N A N A K N I R H S G L 
L K 0 G I G R Y P U E U R R 
W 8 V N C I U X M H D E 0 E 
I U F 0 0 F T 0 0 I 8 R D S 
T H F M F 0 I W J 0 T K N 8 
S I 0 0 X N G U 0 A A E 0 E 
0 A P ·T G 0 P G N J MY 0 K 
J I I E 0 Z N T L K C A 8 0 
H X R E T K L A T E V I J 0 

Science Fact 
The average educated person 
has a vocabulary of 3,000 to 
5,000 words, but a person can 
manage quite well with only a few 
hundred. Shakespeare used 
about 15,000. All told, the 
English lancuage has well over 
300,000 words. 

7MB4NI0 
JOSEPBIIE 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 
Member 

ALLEN • GARRETT • HAROLD • WHEELWRIGHT F.D.I.C. 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 

Inexpensive 
Cover-Up 
For Design 
Problems 

Take a good look at today's 
wallcoverings before you embark on 
a hefty bank loan to raise the roof, 
knock down walls, add or subtract 

' windows, or whatever else you feel 
is needed to achieve ideal room 
proportions and shapes. 

The right wallcovering design and 
color, used properly, can alter the 
shape and size of a room, camou­
flage architectural flaws, and add 
interest to bland, look-alike rooms. 

Of course, it's all a matter of 
optical illusion, but what's wrong 
with that? Making things look as 
attractive as possible- which often 
means making the eye see things as 
they really aren't-is, after all, 
completely acceptable in other areas. 
We do it when we were slimming 
clothes, use make-up to create 
fashionable faces, or serve ham­
burger disguised as Beef Stroganoff 
or Beef Wellington. 

Here, four decorating experts 

•
offer four suggestions for solving 
common design problems with 
wallcoverings. 

More Room, Please 
"Move a wall or two to change thee 

shape of a room," advises Mary 
Taxiarchis, chief designer for Style­
Tex. "You can advance it with a 
strong-colored wallcovering in a 
splashy design. To 'push' it back, use 
subdued patterns and pale colors. 
Bold design and color on the short 
walls of a long, narrow room will 
have a widening effect." 

"A calico design in pastels or a 
mini floral on white background 
would be perfect for small rooms of 
the American persuasion," says 
Jerry Pappia of the Thomas Strahan 
Company. Any small-scaled pattern 
in light colors will give a larger feel 
to a tiny room. 

Robert Spaeth of Christopher 
Prints, on the other hand, suggests 
a metallic wallcovering that will act 
almost as a mirror, or certain 
large-scaled motifs, such as trellis 
designs that will lead the eye beyond 
the walls, creating an illusion. of 
space. 

Ed Edwards of Environmental 
Graphics also advocates illusion. 
•'Certain scenics, such as an alley of 
trees depicted in perspective, will 
lead the eye way beyond the wall," 
he says. Edwards also comments 
that clear blue, because of its 
association with the sky and open 
space, is one of the very best room 
enlargers. 

Grand Canyon 
If, on the other hand, you've got 

the rare problem of a room of ball 
4l;ark proportions, choose dominant 

colors and design to make the walls 
"close in." Suggestions by the four 
experts include the use of a dark 
brown art nouveau design for an 
eclectic room; a floral on a dark 
blue, burgundy or deep green 
background for a traditional setting; 
and a rousing plaid in the warmest 

-.?f colors if your lifestyle is 
.~nformal. 

Cnoose a wallcovering pattern 
which leads the eye upward if your 
problem is low ceilings. This could 
be a vertical stripe, or a foilage 
pattern, where the leaves seem to be 
stretching upwards towards the 
sun. 

Lowering the Ceiling 
Too high ceilings are a problem in 

.any older homes that can be solved 
in several ways. Choose a dark color 
for the ceiling, for example. Don't 
make it too dark, however, or the 
room will become not only low but 
downright gloomy. Stopping the 
wallcovering short at the top and 
extending the ceiling down to the 
pattern is Taxiarchis' suggestion. 

• 
Breaking height by adding a dado 

about halfway up ·the wall is 
Pappia's suggestion. S tart the wall-
covering above the dado. 

Spaeth advocates a wall design 
which leads the eye along a 
horizontal plane- rectangular 
blocks and horizontal stripes, for 
exemple, to draw the attention from 
the ceiling line. 

Hiding Eyesores 
Almost everyone has at least one 

room with some architectural oddity. 
It might be too deeply set windows 
or an awkwardly jutting wall. Here, 
wallcoverings are at their glory.Any 
over-all design, from colorful checks 
to fanciful florals, will do a lot to 
cover up the broken-up appearance 
of the room. 

Another trick is to use a bold­
as-brass wallcovering design that 
will steal the limelight so completely 
that no one notices the 
irregularities. 
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CUSTOM INTERIORS 

ALL VANITIES AND MARBLE TOPS 

SAVE UP 
TO 25% 

~~----SALE SPECIAL!---......... """~ 
SAVE OVER 

~:::-~T~~1:cTUB $200 OFF 
TUB SURROUNDS. . . . . on complete set 

"-
MALONEY'S SHOPPING CENTER • PH. 886·1347 

CUSTOM INTERIORS 
&-24·tf 

Wickes 
Lumber 

14.13%1nterest 
No matter what the project 
is, Wickes has everything 
you'll need for it - including 
money! If your purchases 
amount to $1,500 or more, 
you can take advantage of 
our 90-day deferred pay­
ment plan. Wickes gives 
you enough time to enjoy 
what you've built, before 
the first payment! 

e&No 
~mentsFor 
Day:s I* PRIC£5 GOOD THRU 

• JULY 23 

*With Purchase of $1,500 Or More; Subject To Credit Approval; 
No Down Payment Required. 

Deluxe 

Garages 
"Our Best" single-car garages with 
easy-to-follow instructions! Wickes 
has many more models to choose 
from at a savings price! 

16'x24' Stick Built 
Basic Garage Frame .. .... 1236.50 

Garage Window ........... 68.50 Yt p 416 2 * 
Access Door ............. 130.00 OU ay 
Garage Door Opener ....... 179.00, Only. . . . 
Total Garage Package . 1614.00 A Month 
• FINANCE CHARGE is $677.70 based on 60 months with the first payment not duo lor 90 days. Repayment terms: 57 payments at $41 .62 per 
month. ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RAT£: 14.13%. Total deferred price is 51694.70 +FINANCE CHARGE OF $677.70. equals $2,372.40. NOTE: 
Local sales taxes may alter these licures slichtly. 

24'x24' Stick Built 
Basic Garage Frame ...... 1799.00 S612* Garage Window ... .. ...... 68.50 You Pay 
Access Door .. .... ....... 130.00 Only 
Garage Door Opener ....... 179.00 • • • 

Total Garage Package ... 2176.50 A Month 
• FINANCE CHARGE is $913.51 based on 60 months with tho first payment not due for 90 days. Repayment ttrms: 57 payments at $56.12 per 
month. ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RAT£: 14.13%. Total deferred price S2,285.33+FINANCE CHARGE OF S913.51equals $3,198.84. NOTE: Local 
sales alter theso 

Bath 
Turn that bathroom into a reflection of your 
stylish tastes with accessories from W ickes! 
Everything you need at one low price! 

Total Bath Package ... 

13262 
Top quality products and 
the best in service! 

DESCRIPTION 
Glastec Fiberglass Bath Cove ... 
Tub Cove Cap 
Better Syphon-Jet Toilet 
Gold Mirror Tub Door .. . 
Solid Oak Tri-View .... ..... ....... .. 
Matching Oak Light Bar 
·2-Handle Antique Brass Lavatory Faucet 
3-Handle Antique Brass Tub/Shower Faucet 
Antique Brass Pop-Up Bath/Tub Drain 
Solid Oak Seville Vanity W/Matching Door 
22x37 Marble Top 
Model #587 Soft Seat 
Bathroom Swag Light 
Water-Saver Shower Head . 
Shower Light ... .. ........ .. 
Solid Oak Storage Cabinet W /Matching Door . 
Model #659 Bath Vent . ....... . 
9 Sq. Yds. Sundial Solarian Flooring 

Regular Sale 
$259.95 $229.95 

89.95 69.95 
84.95 74.95 

119.95 99.95 
129.95 109.95 

54.95 44.95 
49.95 39.95 
79.95 69.95 
59.95 49.95 

187.20 156.00 
89.95 79.95 
13.99 10.99 
34.99 29.99 
12.99 9.99 
15.99 12.99 
88.80 65.94 
99.95 89.95 

9.99 Yd . 8.99 Yd. 

Outdoor Projects 
Build the backyard of your dreams with help 
from Wickes! We have a complete line of pro· 
ject materials that will enhance the exterior 
of your home. at one low price! 

10x20 Treated Patio Deck . . ....... 403.50 
25 Decorative Landscape Timbers .... 49.75 
6' Stockade Fencing ..... . . 128 Lin. Ft. 499.50 
8'x12' Wood Yard Barn ..... 475.00 
Galaxie Bug Killer ... Gl14so uL 3oso 99.95 
Total Backyard Package ... 1577.70 

r.?! ~~~!!,?/y • • ·40A6M
8 

h* 
an exceptional value! ont 

• FINANCE CHARGE IS $662.41 bosed on 60 months with the first paymentnot due lor 90 doys. Repayment terms: 57 payments at $40.68 per 
month. ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE: 14.13%. Total deferred price is S1 ,656.59+FINANCE CHARGE OF $662.41 equals 52,319.00. NOT£: 
Local sales tJIXeS alter these 

Kitchens 
This beautiful " Seville" 
cabinet package is just one 
sample from our complete --­
selection of cabinet styles ... ~~;TC;;::'I 
a ll at a savings! Stop in today 
& let us help you with the41 kitchen of your choice. 

You Pay Only .. 
· FINANCE CHARGE is $677.97 based on 60 months with the first paymont not due lor 90 days. Ropayment terms: 57 paymonts at $41.64 per 
month. ANNUAL PERCENTAGE RATE: 14.13~o. Total ~elerrod price Is S1,695.63+FINANCE CHARGE OF $677.97 oquals $2,373.60. NOTE: 
Local sales taxes may alter these ligures slightly. 

DESCRIPTION Regular Sale 
B-27 Base Cabinet . . . . . . . . . . . . . ' ... .............. $186 .60 $155.50 
RFP-30 Range Front Panel .. ...... 19.80 16.50 
RCB-36 Revolving Corner Base 223.80 186.50 
SPB-36 Sink Base 175.20 146.00 
BEDB-18 Drawer Base .. . . .... .... 223.80 186.50 
W-2730 Wall Cabinet ....... .... ... ' 140.40 117.00 
W-3017 Wall Cabinet . .. .. ... .. .... .... ... 117.60 98.00 
W-1230 Wall Cabinet . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . ~· 

8 7.60 73.30 
RCW-24 Corner Wall . . . . ······ ........ .. 189.60 158.00 
W-1230 Wall Cabinet 8 7.60 73.00 
V-4 Valance ... . . ····· ·· ............. 13.80 11.50 
W-4230 Wall Cabinet ........ ... ...... 172.20 143.50 
8' Countertop With Mitre. . . ......... .. 48.31 44.31 
1 0' Countertop With Mitre ... .. .... . 59.29 54.29 
End Cap Kit . . ....... 7.49 6.49 
33x22 Stainless Steel Sink 51.95 44.95 
Model #265 Spartan Dueled Range Hood 39.95 34.95 
Faucet With Spray 39.9 5 29.95 
Model #400 Sinkmaster Disposer ·39.95 34.95 

Total Kitchen Package ..... SAVE $310.00 1 ,614.89 

STORE HOURS 
Mon.-Friday 
7:30-5:30 

Phone 
874-9602 
432-3241 

Do~tforg~WickesCha~eCa~!~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
No Payments 'Til Septembet1 

W WICkes With a minimum purchase of S200.* l2~~~::l~:~~:::!~:~:~!~~!~~=~:~~~~~!i!!!!;~~~ woe•" • ou11oen , w1c••• Offer good June 1 through 
Fuonituoo EmpO<ium l umbe< July 31 , 1981. 

"Subject To Wickes' Revolving Charge credit 
'-----"" approval. Does not apply to special orders. 



Wednesday, July 8, 1981 

Prices effective through 
Sunday. July 72, 7981. 

Fresh Whole 

Platter 
Bacon 

Miracle Whip 

Salad 
Dressing 

~, 

Old Style or Buttermilk 

IGA Biscuits 

6 pack 
10 ct. cans 

« 

Dairy Fresh . 

Cottage Cheese . 
24~z.' tub W2g 

, . .. , .. ... "' 

.... .. , 

" ... . 
,. . , .. ... .. 

.. 

, . ... 
" •· 

The Floyd County Times 

Table Rite USDA Choice 

Boneless 
Chuck Roast 

TableRite 

Boneless 
Stew Beef 

$1~~ 
TableRite 

Wieners 

99¢ 

lb. 

USDA Choice 

Boneless 
Chuck Steaks 

$179 
lb. 

TableRite 

Ham Patties 

$199 
12-oz. pkg. 1-lb . can 

Fischer's Lard 

2g 
81b. pa il 

Sl1ced Turkey, Salisbury Steak. 
Turkey Croquettes, Meat Loaf, 

Char Broi led Patty, M'ansize Patty, 
Spaghetti and Meatballs, Breaded Beef, 

Breaded Pork. Breaded Chicken 

Freezer Queen 
Entrees 

5 
32 oz. box 

Section Three, Page Twelve 

MEANS 
SAVINGS 

We reserve the righ t to limit quantities 
and correct prin ting errors. --

IGA 

White 
Bread 

White 
Potatoes 

TableFresh 9 9 C 
~~:po:s \\lh.~t~.. .. lb. 

TableFresh $149 
· Mushrooms !~1?: pkg. 

TableFresh 7 9 C 
Nectarines . . . . . . . I b. 

,,. ' .. . .. .. -. t•• .. .., .. , " I '" ..,,. PLAY OUR SPRING COVERALL GAME! 
... . . .. . . 
'" .. "JI• GET 1500 BONUS TOP VALUE STAMPS! 

' . ' 
... " " 

: .. ,., .. .. . .. 
"' .. .. , .. .. .... 

.. 
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• Martin • Wheelwright THOMPSON'S IGA FOODLINERS • Prestonsburg 
' 
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