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Collins, Stumbo will square off this fall 

Gorman Collins John M. Stumbo 

by Scott Perry 
Times Editor 

Incumbent Floyd Cowtty Judge­
Executive John M. Stumbo turned 
back a spirited challenge Tuesday 
from one well-known radio person­
ality to earn a chance against another 
this fall. · 

Surprisingly close as early returns 
filtered in Tuesday, Stumbo's mar­
gin over Republican-turned-Demo­
crat Dale McKinney widened as the 
night drew on. McKinney, owner­
operator of Martin radio station 
WMDJ ,made an issue ofthecounty's 
solid waste problems during his cam­
paign and that issue obviously helped 

Sheriff keeps badge; 
Webb is new jailer 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

at least 1 ,400 more than any other 
candidate on the May 25 ballot 

McKinney carry 12 of the county's 
41 precincts. Unofficial totals gave 
Stumbo the win, however, with a 
8,994 vote total to McKinney's 7,011 
votes. 

Stumbo will now face Republican 
nominee Gorman Collins Sr. in the 
Novemberelection.Collins, who was 
unopposed in the primary, is also a 
radio personality as the owner of 
Prestonsburg station WQHY and is 
currently a member of the Prestons­
burg City Cowtcil. 

At least 25 percent of the county's 
fiScal court will be new come No­
vember as incumbent District Three 
Magistrate Betty Caudill was bounced 
from the court Tuesday by challenger 

Tommy Neal Adams. Adams drew 
an unofficial total of 1,815 votes in 
the eight-candidate Democrat pri­
mary, with Caudill finishing second 
with 1,328 votes. Others, in order of 
frnish, included Eddie Meade, 239; 
Glennis Caudill, 221; Danny Bates, 
198; Jack Akers, 178; Hie Samons, 
124; and Darlene Hall, 92. 

InMagisterialDistrictOne, incum­
bent Gerald DeRossett turned away 
four challengers to win renomination 
and a bid to face the younger half of 
the GOP Collins tandem this fall. 
GormanCollinsJr. was unopposed in 
the Republican primary for the Dis­
trict One seat Unofficial totals for 
the Democrat vote in District One 

went as follows: DeRossett, 2, 173; 
Jack Rice, 1,399; Roger Rowe, 914; 
O.Sam Blankenship, 304; and Ernie 
R. Lafferty, 179. 

In Magisterial District Two, in­
cumbent Jackie Edford Owens won 
handily in the five-candidate field. 
Owens got 1,978 votes, followed by 
Kenntb Roberts, 978; Earsel L. 
Frazier, 545; Calvin Howell, 350; 
and Mike Layne, 144. 

In District Four, incumbentErmal 
Tackett topped all challengers with 
2,307 votes. That field was rounded 
out by Lennix Cola Ray Akers, 796; 
and Carter King, 495. 

Official precinct totals wll be pub­
lished in the Friday, May 28 edition. 

Problems 
at polls 

• cunous, 
clerk says 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

• Incumbent Floyd County Sheriff 
Paul Hunt Thompson came cleanly · 
away from what was easily the mud­
diest campaign of the primary season 
to lead all vote-getters Tuesday. 

Unofficial totals credit Thomp­
son wilh earning 10,625 votes of the 
17,464 cast in the race to Blackburn's 
6,428. Challenger Larry Shortridge 
fmished a distant third, garnering 411 
votes. 

Allhough the Floyd Cowtty jailer's 
race was less muddied than the 
sheriffs contest, its outcome seemed 
less clear, wilh 14 candidates vying 
for position throughout. 

Problems at the polls plagued lhe 
political process in Floyd County 
Tuesday, preventing some early 
morning pollsters from casting their 
ballots and giving the state Board of 
Elections pause for lhoughL 

• 

Allhough former deputy sheriff 
John K. Blackburn had been expected 
by some to run neck and neck with 
Thompson, the incumbent pulled 
away to cross the finish line with over 
4,000 votes more lhan the second­
place Blackburn. 

Paul Hunt Thompson 

Challengers Blackburn and 
Shortridge made anumberofaccusa­
tions and insinuations against Th­
ompsonduringthecourseoflhecam­
paign, but apparently those tactics 
failed to sway voters away from Th­
ompson, whose popularity remained 
intact. 

Thompson's 10,625 vote total was 

Roger Webb 

Eula Hall is lauded 
for "caring kindness" 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

Eula Hall, founder of the Mud 
Creek Clinic, received yet another 
honor Sunday afternoon when she 
was awarded an honorary Ph.D. by 
the president of Hartford, Con­
necticut's prestigious Trinity College. 

According to Trinity College 
President Tom Gerety's speech, Hall 
was awarded lhe degree of Doctor of 
Humane Letters Sunday for her " .. . 
countless acts of caring kindness ... , 
selfless toil..., and (her) message of 
hope for the people of Appalachia .... " 

Hall said Tuesday that she had 
been nominated for the award by a 
New York Times reporter who had 
earlier written about her ground­
breaking work at the Mud Creek 
Clinic. 

Also awarded honorary doctor­
ates at Trinity Sunday were AIDS 
activist Mary D. Fisher, Emory Uni­
versity professor James W. Flannery; 
jazz bassist Milton John Hinton; Hart­
ford Seminary professor Thomas 
LanierHoyt,Jr.;HartfordStageCom­
pany director Mark Lamas; and au­
thor Ann Petry. 

Early returns posted jailer candi­
date Junior Joseph as the favorite, but 
unofficial totals at evening's end 
showed thatJoseph, with 2,656 votes, 
fmislied second behind winner Roger 
Webb. 

Webb received 3,531 votes, de­
feating Joseph by 875 votes. 

Edgel "Bide" Click, finished a 
strong lhird, earning 2,183 votes. 

Rounding out the category in the 
order they appeared on lhe ballot, 
Clifford Hamilton received 1,090 
votes; Ernest Graham Burchett, 
1,110; Ollie Jay Leslie, 281; Herman 
Conn, 825; Homer Johnson, 817; 
Oscar E. "0" Rice, 899; Joseph Jody 
Mullins, 1 ,836; RobertA. DeRossett, 
620; Onda L. Hunt, 274; and Carol 
Jean Neeley, 1,001. 

Webb will take over at the jail in 
January for current Jailer Lawrence 
Hale, who did not seek re-election. 

All winners of 1993 county elec­
tions will serve a five-year term in 
accordance with a constitutional 
amendment passed by state voters 
last November . 

Only County Judge/Executive 
John M. Stumbo, District One Mag­
istrate Gerald DeRossett and Floyd 
County Clerk Carla "Robinson" Boyd 
will face Republican challengers in 
November. 

Non-partisan city races, wilh the 
exception of the city of Martin, will 
also appear on lhe ballot in Novem­
ber. 

Is this thing on? 
Poll machine malfunctions, Including locked doors, Incorrect ballots 
and burned-out motors, delayed voting In several precincts Tuesday · 
and forced registered voters to cast paper ballots In the Maytown, 
Wheelwright and Cliff #12 precincts. (photo by Geoff Belcher) 

City gives tentative 
okay to airport idea 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

The Prestonsburg City Council is 
proceeding with caution on plans to 
offer a portion of the Bert T . Combs 
Airport property as a potential site 
for a new Veteran's Administration 
nursing home. 

The plan was first announced last 
week when Floyd County Develop­
ment Authority Executive Director 
Darrell Gilliam told members of lhat 
agency that an informal consortium 
including members of the govern­
mental bodies of Prestonsburg and 
Paintsville and Floyd, Martin and 
Lawrence counties had suggested 

submitting an application to lhe fed­
eral government offering property 
adjacent to the airport for lhe facility. 
In order to meet criteria for consider­
ation, the application must be sub­
mitted by June 1. One problem wilh 
the plan, Big Sandy Area Develop­
ment Distric t direc tor Roger 
Recktenwald told me mbers of the 
board last week, is that lhe VA nurs­
ing home facility might not be com­
patible wilh the airport strip. 

However, Gilliam said, the nurs­
ing home is expected to create an 
estimated 350 jobs with a $4 million 
annual payroll . 

(See Airport, page six) 

The problems started early, Floyd 
County Clerk Carla "Robinson" Boyd 
said, when worlcers transporting the 
voting machines to lhe election pre­
cincts inadvertently switched the 
machines designated for Auxier and 
Abbott Creek. 

Then,Boydsaid.~chinesatlhe 
Auxier, Abbott, Porter, and Garrett 
precincts would not open to allow 
voters inside. A technician from Harp 
Enterprises, lhe company contracted 
to service the machines. was called in 
to remove and replace lhedoors. Olh­
ers reported that Floyd County 
sheriffs deputies were also busy 
Tuesday morning opening lhe locked 
machines. 

Worst of all, Boyd said, the ma­
chine placed at the Maytown pke­
cincts failed to work at all Tuesda\ 
morning because the ballot was in 
correct, forcing pollsters to cast their 
votes on paper sample ballots for 
much of the day. Later in the day, 
Wheelwright voters were also report­
edly forced to cast paper ballots. 

Alllhe voting machines were lhor­
oughly inspected last week and 
seemed to be in perfect working or­
der, Boyd said. 

She suspects foul play. 
"You know. if it was just one 

machine, you might say 'Well it was 
j ust a freak ~ccident,"' Boyd said. 

Despite the numerous poll prob­
lems, Boyd said, there is no indica­
tion that the ballots have been 
"stuffed" or tampered with because . 
the official seals on all the machines 
are still unbroken. 

As a precaution, however, Boyd 
has requested lhat the state Board of 
Elections send an investigator to de­
termine what, or perhaps who, went 
wrong, she said. 

"I'vebeenherealongtime,"Boyd 
said, "and Ibis has never happened 
before." 

Boyd wins handily; Hunt ousts Patton 

Carla Boyd John Ea~l Hunt 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

Floyd County voters unseated in­
cumbent Commonwealth's Attorney 
Jerry Patton Tuesday, electing dark 
horse challenger I ohn Earl Hunt by a 
slender margin in what may have 
been lhe primary's greatest upset. 

In unofficial totals of lhe 17,030 
ballots cast in Tuesday's election, 
representing over 56 percent of regis­
tered voters in l.he county, Hunt de­
feated Patton by a 539-vote margin, 
receiving 8,383 votes to. Patton's 
7,894. 

That margin remained in question 
late Tuesday. The results in three 
precincts where malfunctioning vot-

ing machines were replaced with 
hand-written ballots and could be 
challenged. Paper ballots were cast 
in lhe Maytown, Jacks Creek and 
Cliff Number Two precincts Tues­
day after ballot machines there failed. 

Although Patton was dethroned, 
incumbent Floyd County Clerk Carla 
"Robinson" Boyd retained her crown, 
defeating her opponent, Willis Hall, 
by nearly 3,000 votes, earning 9,291 
votes to Hall's 6,525. 

In olher e lection action, county 
surveyor candidate Larry E. Greer 
defeated opponent Reed Stamper Jr. 
by a considerable margin, ending the 
race with 6,061 votes to Stamper's 
3,661. 

Morgan Joseph, incumbent con-

stable for District One, once again 
defeated all opposition, out-distanc­
ing Floyd County Detective Gary 
Wolfe by 1,467 to 1,063. Third-high­
est vote-getter in the race, William 
"Neal" Clevenger,received833 votes 
and John WaUen received 822. 

Distr ic t Two Constable Bob 
Hackworth retained his seat, receiv­
ing 1,556 of the 3,556 ballots cast in 
the district. Runner-up in that race 
was Carmel R. "Chier Conley, who 
received 657 votes. Rounding out the 
race are Amos Gibson, who received 
283 votes; Randy Holbrook, 380; 
Robert L. Duncan, 406; and Sue 
"Robinson" Gearheart, the sole fe­
male candidate in any constable's race 
this year, who received 274 votes. 

The hotly-contested District 
Three constable's race unseated in­
cumbentcandidateBallardJ. Mosely, 
who received only 30 l votes to 25-
year-old challenger Tandy B. 
Hamilton's 1,016. Rounding out that 
race, Charles Harmon received 598 
votes; Sam Hall received 87 ; 
Raymond Hall, 155; Cleveland 
Tackett,600; Danny"Peanut" Ander­
son, 178; David Hall, 342; Preston 
Collins, 440; Willie C. Moore, 53; 
and Jimmy Hall received 285. 

Finally, Paul Stilton bOunced the 
competition in the District Four 
Constable's race, earning 2,015 votes 
to runner-up Arnold Bob McKinney's 
908.GreenWakelandandEmestHall 
earned 119 and 268, respectively. 

\ 
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Career Day at Betsy Layne High School 
Betsy Layne High School students had the opportunity Tuuday to ask area business professionals the ups 
and downs of their jobs during a Career Day .... 1on ~naored the New Horizons Youth Service Center. Over 
a dozen professionals attended to answer questions about their professions. (photo by Susan Allen) 

Hale's extradition is · delayed 
by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

It will be June 15 before a Laurel 
County judge decides ifAoydCounty 
native Harry Hale will be extradited 
to Carroll County, Georgia where he 
is wanted on theft and bail jumping 
charges. 

Hale had asked to be returned to 
Floyd County during a hearing last 
week, but a judge denied his request, 
a Laurel County district clerk said 
Monday. 

An arrest warrant for Hale was 
issued by Floyd County sheriff's 
deputy Homer Neeley in February 
for possession of stolen property af­
ter officers discovered several items 
inHale'sGarthhomewhichappeared 
to belong to Chris Zahn, a Swiss 
traveler who disappeared in Georgia 
on May 21, 1992. 

Hale is wanted on a forgery charge 
and for questioning in Zahn's disap­
pearance by investigators in Cobb 
County, Georgia. 

Floyd County officials want to 
question Hale about the March 1990 
disappearance of Mitchell Manns of 
Martin. Manns was last seen in the 
Martin area on March 16, 1990 at 
around 3 p.m. He hasn't been seen 
since. 

FBI and Prestonsburg Police also 
want to question Hale abOut the Sep­
tember 1992 murder of a Carl D. 
Perkins Job Corps student. The body 
of 21-year-old Walter Cropper was 
found lying in a wooded field just off 
Interstate 75 in Adairsville, Georgia. 

Lanny Cox, an investigator with 
the Georgia Bureau of Investigation 
(GBI), said Tuesday that officials are 
waiting for Hale's return to Carroll 
County, Georgia, but he declined to 
say ifGBI officials will question Hale 
abou<Zahn' sdisappearance. Cox said 
there have been no new develop­
ments in the Zahn case. 

A search of Hale's Garth home in 
1 

On April 21, Kentucky officially re­
corded lts1 ,Oooth diagnosed ce .. 
of AIDS. To date, 663 Kentuckians, 
or two-thirds of those diagnosed, 
have died from complications re­
lated to Acquired Immune Defl· 
c lency Syndrome. 

* BAD CREDIT * 
NO CREDIT 

Auto Dealer will arrange low-cost 
financing, even if you have been turned 
down elsewhere.loansforbankrupt, bad 
cred~ or no credit. No cosigners neces­
sary. Phone applications accepted. CAll 
ANNE · local789-4066, toll free HI00-34&-
4066 or 1-800-CAR·LOAN. 

1992 to conflffil the tour. He has not 
been heard from again. 

Hale was arrested in Miami, 
Florida in February and extradited to 
Carroll County, Georgia, but he was 
released before investigators could 
question him. Hale allegedly jumped 
bail and was arrested by Kentucky 
State Police investigator Frank Pierce 
on May 14 at LeviJ ackson State Park 
near London, Kentucky. 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 4 78·24 77 

KMA grants Highlands 
Highlands Regional Medical Cen­

ter has been approved for accredita-. 
tion by the Kentucky Medical Asso­
ciation to provide Continuing Medi­
cal Education (CME) for physicians. 
Highlands is the flrst institution in 
Eastern Kentucky to gain accredita­
tion as aCME provider. 

The Kentucky Medical Associa­
tion grants provider accreditation only 
after an evaluation of the instirution 
indicates compliance with the stan­
dards of KMA and the sponsoring 
organization has demonstrated abil­
ity to plan and implement CME ac­
tivities in accordance with the essen­
tial guidelines. Strictly documented 
CME policies and procedures insure 
attainment ofleaming objectives and 
provides physicians the knowledge 
to enable them to improve medical 
care. 

Physicians are required to attain a 
certain number of Continuing Medi­
cal Education credits each year, in 
order to stay up to date on the latest 
procedures and treatments options 
for various diseases. 

Highlands has for many years pro­
vided CME programs in conjunction 
with the University of Kentucky. 

CME accreditation 
Now, as an accredited CME pro­
vider, programs presented on a local 
level will enable area physicians the 
means to achieve a certain amount of 
their required CME credits without 
the need to travel long distances. 

This year Highlands has hosted 
CME programs on Diabetes and 
Trauma and plans to hold presenta­
tions on topics including skin cancer, 
allergy and pediatrics. 

Highlands bas long been a health 
education resource for the commu­
nity and now through its CME ac­
creditation will be a medical educa­
tion resource for physicians. 

3-BEDROOM 
DOUBLEWIDE 

Payments 

as low as $250 
Price includes Heat Pump, 

Rock Skirting, 
Footers and Setup 

HYLTON HOMES 
oflvel 

Call 1·800·264·4835 
for details. 

EMT CERTIFICATION CLASS TO BEGIN ATPCC 
Continuing Education/Community Services of Prestonsburg 
Community College will offer an EMT (Emergency Medical 
Techinian) certification class during June through September on 
the PCC Campus. The class will feature 130 hours of instruction 
to prepare students to pass the state-mandated written and 
"practicals" and become state-certified EMTs. The class will 
meet on Tuesdays and Thursdays from 10:30 a.m.-1 :30 p.m. 
Registration can be completed by calling 886-3863 and asking 
forCFJCS. 

fllaDifYsu 
TO ALL OF MY MANY SUPPORTERS: 
• For Those Who Campaigned For Me Daily 
• For Those Who Put Up Posters & Signs 
• For Those Who Believed In Me 
• For All My Employees (You Are The Greatest!) 
• For All My Friends 
• For My MOM & DAD, Kenneth & Scotty 
• And, Especially .... STEVEN, PATRICK, DARNELLA and GREG 
You have given me the support I needed during this stressful time. 

Thank You Aliff/ c.C~ 
Paid by Carla R. Boyd, Treasurer, HC 80 Box 90, Eastern, KY 416522 

~~~~ftft~~~~ 
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The Floyd County Times 

Local counties to 
get federal snow 
removal payments 

City and county governments from 
10 Eastern Kentucky counties are 
scheduled to be presented checks to­
talling $228,514 on Monday, May 
24, to help in reimbursing their juris­
dictions for the costs of emergency 
snow removal following the blizzard 
of March 13 which blanketed some 
counties with more than two feet of 
snow. 

Floyd County will receive a total 
of$34,815. 

Wednesday, May 26, 1993 A3 

lAWN &GARDEN 
E I NISAIE 

~~=-~~NEW~·~ TROY-liLT' 1RACTORS 
~LOW AS12,099 

• Kohler OHV Command engine. 
• Push-button Power Take-Off. 
• Durable heavy-gauge steel frame 
• Models from 12.5HP to 14HP. 

Snow removal reimbursements 
The presentations by the State 

Division of Disaster and Emergency 
Services arc scheduled to take place 
at 2 p.m. at the Prestonsburg National 
Guard Annory. County judge-execu­
tives and mayors of lbe various city 
governments wHI accept the reim­
bursements for their jurisdictions. 

• J Year Ltmited Warranty! 

Floyd County and local city officials received Federal Emergency Management Assistance (FEMA) funds 
Monday to reimburse costs of snow removal during the Blizzard of 1993. Floyd County officials received 
$31 ,549; the City of Allen, $936; the City of Martin, $662; and the City of Prestonsburg, $1,668. (photo by Susan 

• Allen) TROY-liLT® 
.LCHING MOWERS 

Towler denies allegations: 

McGuire says job posting is a sham 
The Floyd County government 

will receive an allocation of$31 ,549. 
The cities of Allen, Martin and Pre­
stonsburg will receive $936, $662 
and $1,668, respectively. 

LOWAS1299 
• Eliminates hard work of rakmg, baggmg. 
• Solves yard waste disposal problem. 
• Works on fall leaves, too! 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

Floyd County superintendent 
Steve Towler has denied a charge by 
a local attorney that he has promised 

~ jobs to individuals before the posi­
tions have been posted. 

E. Mickey McGuire, who repre­
sents Pete Grigsby Jr., Tommy Th­
ompson and Wayne Ratliff, whose 
jobs were eliminated under a reorga­
nization plan, said Monday that due 
process hearings for his clients were 
canceled because he was going to 
introduce testimony that several key 
jobs had been promised before the 
reorganization. 

"Apparently there was a real con­
cern, I think, of what our witnesses 
were going to say at that hearing," 
McGuire said. "I think (the school 
board) either found out or suspected 
or somehow learned that we were 
going to ask for open hearings. We 
had twostoriestotell,ifwe would've 
been allowed to put on our evidence. 

"First of all we had considerable 
evidence that (posting jobs) was all a 
sham,'' McGuire continued. "That 
there is no job posting. That there is 
no openness and non-politics in hir­
ing. Some people had been promised 
new jobs even before the reorganiza­
tion. That jobs that are being posted 
are promised before they are even 
being posted ... This job posting is a 
big show. I think we could have 
proven that the majority of new jobs 
since the date of the reorganization .. 
.had been promised prior to posting. 
The other side of our testimony would 
have been that our people never re­
ceived anything except favorable job 
ratings." 

Towler denied that he promised 

anybody a job, but said that he told 
school employees they would be 
strongly considered for positions. 

"That's not the case," Towler said 
Tuesday in response to McGuire's 
allegations. "I have talked with a 
number of people and we've adver­
tised all the positions. That might be 
someone's opinion. Whoever goes 
into those spots there will be some 
commentary that those decisions have 
already been made. 

"There was no intention that ev­
erybody that was in a spot would not 
be given a spot somewhere else, but 
that doesn't mean that everyone will 
get a spot somewhere else," Towler 
added. "I think anyone can express 

an opinion that jobs have been prom­
ised or whatever. Since I'm the one 
that names the people only I can say 
if that's true or false. I doubt that I 
would say that it's true because I 
don't think that would be the way 
thingsaregoing.I'vetoldsomepeople 
that if they would apply for those jobs 
they would be given strong consider­
ation." 

McGuire declined to identify his 
witnesses, but he said testimony 
would have come from "people that 
just talked too much and then wished 
they hadn't." 

Due process hearings for four ad­
ministratorsaffectedbythereorgani­
zation were set for May 17. The hear­
ings were canceled that morning upon 
the advice of Cliff Latta, the board's 
attorney. It was Latta· s opinion that 
the answers flied by the administra­
tors were not adequate and therefore 
the administrators did not meet the 
legal requirements to be entitled to a 
hearing. 

Whether or not the three ad minis-

WYMT-TV supports theatre 
WYMT·TV continues its support of Jenny Wiley Theatre this year with a 
corporate donation of $8,000 to sponsor the show, Foxflre, a story about 
family values and love of land in Appalachia. Pictured are, from right to 
left, Jim Boggs, WYMT-TV sales manager, and Jenny Wiley Theatre 
president, Bill Francis. · 

trators represented by McGuire and a 
fourth employee, Sharon Newsome, 
were entitled to a due process hearing 
will most likely be decided in court. 

"They haven't left us any choice 
(but to go to court)," McGuire said. 
They wouldn't even give us the cour­
tesy of showing up and hearing us. I 
can take these people to court and 
have them answer lhere. I'm not go­
ing to go down there and play silly 
games. This is silly. The school board 
should at least have shown up and 
heard Mr. Latta's recommendation 
and decided on their own whether 
they were going to (have the hearing) 
or not. Somebody had to make the 
decision not to come. It was their 
decision. By abdicating that decision 
they've become personaUy liable to 
my clients. I find it disgusting that 
any verdict we would win would come 
out of school money because it should 
come out of their individual pockets 
instead of wasting school funds." 

McGuire said the three adminis­
trators' answers to notification that 
their jobs were being eliminated was 
consistent with other answers ftled 
by previous administrators who had 
been notified of a demotion. 

. Coors Light 
51250 AIIIJKes . 

Cans case PJid 

~~---- r J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne .• 478-2477 

'93 TEMPOS 

$8,850.00* 

Other counties receiving alloca­
tions will be Boyd, Carter, Elliott, 
Greenup, Johnson, Lawrence, Ma­
goffin, Martin and Pike. 

Pike County will receive the larg­
est allocation- $48,325. 

President Clinton approved Gov. 
Brereton Jones· request for federal 
disaster funding on March 18. Under 
the declaration, 75 percent of the 
money will come from the Federal 
Emergency Management Agency, 12 
percent from Kentucky state govern­
mcntand 13 percent from local gov­
ernments. 

1993 3-8/R 
Mobile Home 

Reduced to 

$11,995°0 

Pay only $126.45 
per month with small down 

payment. 
Call Larry Keene or Homer Edmonds 

(606) 432-0026 
. Call P~ or David Keene 

or Rick Bowling 

(606) 437-97 47 

• 4 Models .. . Electric Start available 
• 3 Year Limited Warranty! 

Ask about 
NO-MONEY-DOWN 

Fifiii11Ci11g! 

TROY-BILr nUIRS 
LOWAS1499 
• Rear-tine tilling at a fror.t·tine tiller price! 
• Prepare fine seedbeds in spring cultivate 

and weed all Slimmer long, power· 
compost garden leftovers in fall. 

• Models from 3HP to l!HP. 
• Electric Start available. 
• Full No Time Limit Warranty. 

TH 

"We Service What We Sell" 

COMPARE 

1993 RANGER 4x4! 

$12,199. OO* 
BUILT IN KENTUCKY! 

'93 FESTIVAS '93 TAURUS 

'93 PROBE "SE" 
$13,977. oo• 

~ $6,399. oo• $3,000 OFF 

~ '93 LINCOLN TOWN CARS IN STOCK! 
1990 1991 1988 1992 1986 1989 

MUSTANG F-150 CROWN VIC RANGER CHEVY LINCOLN 
GT SUPERCAB MINT CONDITION 4x4 CAPRICE CONTINENTAL 

JUST A FEW OF OUR HUGE SELECTION! 
•Price excludes tax and license. All rebates including Young Buyer assigned to dealer . 
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Fame usually comes to those who are 
thinking about something else. 

-oliver Wendell Homes 
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Liberty of thought is the life of the soul-Voltaire 

It ain't over 
'til it's over ' 

by Scott Perry 

Floyd County Representatives 
Greg Stumbo and Russell 
Bentley have done the right thing 
in proposing a bill to dissolve 
and replace the state's current 
racing commission. 

The current panel, dominated 
by thoroughbred interests, has 
all but dispatched local hope for 
the development in Floyd 
County of a harness racing fa­
cility. 

The Stumbo-Bentley bill 
would scrap the racing panel 
and replace it with a Kentucky 
Council on Parimutuel wager­
ing, which would prohibit its 
membership from having any 
interest in racing or breeding. 

The bill would also reestab­
lish the Kentucky Harness Rac­
ing Commission and the State 
Racing Commission as advisory 
panels only to the new council. 

The proposed statute would 
also repeal statutory authoriza-
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A sportsman's life. 
With our six-year-old son as company, we 

headed off Sunday to the banks of an area 
lake to wet a line and to fulfill those basic 
human needs shared by all of us of the male 
persuasion ... 

Catch it. 
Kill it. 
Cook it. 
Eat it. 
After feeding most of our bait to a school of 

microscopic bluegill, our bored son turned 
his attention to other areas which, in this 
case, included a small but boisterous flock of 
geese. 

For some reason or another, this particular 
group of waterfowl became particularly un­
appreciative of the small pebbles our son 
was hurling in their direction, responding with 
a full frontal attack that sent us into an un­
planned retreat. 

Regrouping and repairing our wounded 
male egos, we moved on to another hunting 
ground, where an unsuspecting bag of marsh­
mallows was captured, impaled on sticks 

tion for the establishment of si­
mulcast facilities and scrap back­
up funding for the state's Breed­
ers Award Fund. 

It's hard to say what chance 
the bill might have at survival, 
but it is absolutely an appropri­
ate response to the current rac­
ing commission's high-handed 
treatment of our area's effon to 
get into the racing business. 
If we can't have our track, then 

they can't have their off-track 
betting parlors or the bonus 
money they will provide to state 
horse breeders. 

Some may say that attitude is 
nothing shon of childish retri­
bution. 

We say, however, that turn­
about is fair play. 

We're tired of finishing out of 
the money and if that means 
stooping to their level to get our 
fair share of the purse, then let's 
load up the starting gate and get 
it on. 

We may cash a winning ticket, 
yet. 
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Coffee 
and burned beyond recognition. 

Our bloodlust satisfied for the moment, we 
await our next adventure in man's unending 
battle to put nature in its place. 

Perhaps we'll peg a few more geese then 
trap a bag of potatoes and cut out all their 
eyes. 

It's a man's world, after all. 

The election is over. 
The winners are rejoicing and the losers 

are licking their wounds. 
We have a request for both groups. 
Leave our countrysides a little bit better 

than you found them by removing the cam­
paign signs, posters and stickers from the 
poles, road signs and whatever so conspicu­
ously decorated for the past several months 
or, in some of the cases we've noted,' for the 
past several years. 

We Average Joes in the voting public ought 
to make a pact to vote against anyone who 
won't clean up the mess they've made. That 
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Religious liberty at risk 

Editor: 
We are shocked and saddened by 

the recent events in Waco. We grieve 
with the families on both sides who 
lost loved ones. 

The federal government is con­
ducting investigations to fmd out what 
happened at the Branch Davidian 
compound in Waco to prevent simi­
lar occurrences in the future. While 
we think such an investigation is ap­
propriate, we oppose any attempt to 
define what is a valid religion or set 
the parameters of a proper church. 

Under the religious liberty provi­
sions of the First Amendment. gov­
ernment has no business declaring 
what is orthodox or heretical, or what 
is a true or false religion. It should 
steer clear of inflammatory and mis­
leading labels. History teaches that 
today's "cults" may become 
tomorrow's mainstream religions. 

The United States is a religiously 
diverse country. We treasure its reli­
gious pluralism. Such diversity is a 
natural and expected resu1t of our 
constitutionally protected religious 
Iibert y and is a source of strength, not 
weakness. These religious contours 
add to the American landscape; they 
do not detract from it. In the midst of 
our national mourning, we must fend 
off any inclination to shrink from our 
commitment to religious pluralism 
or to seek security at the expense of 
liberty. 

This heady freedom is not abso­
lute. It should be exercised responsi­
bly. Religion is no excuse for violent 
or criminal conduct that harms other 
people or threatens public safety or 
welfare. Absent some compelling 
justification, however, government 
should not restrict religious exercise. 
And force -- if ever appropriate -­
must be employed as an absolute last 
resort. . 

Public discourse shou1d be con­
ducted with integrity. The nation's 
leaders ought to measure their words 
carefully and temper their passion 
with reason. Government must resist 
any temptation to retreat from our 
"first freedom." To deny religious 
liberty to any is to diminish religious 
liberty for all. 

Signed: 
American Baptist Churches in the 

U.S.A. 
American Civil Liberties Union, 

Washington Office 
American Conference on Reli­

gious Movements 
Americans United for Separation 

of Church and State 
Association of Christian Schoo1s 
International Baptist Joint Com­

mittee on Public Affairs 
Church of Scientology Interna­

tional 
Chmches'CenterforTheology and 

Public Policy 
Episcopal Church 
First Liberty Institute 

General Conference of Seventh­
Day Adventists 

Greater Grace World Outreach 
National Association of 

Evangelicals 
National Council of Churches of 

Christ 
Presbyterian Church (U.S.A.) 

Washington Office 
Union of American Hebrew Con­

gregations 

Circle of Justice 

Editor: 
It is good to know that we have an 

organization that wil1 monitor the 
corruption in our governmental sys­
tem, especial1y when those "highly 
influential" leaders within our sys­
tem are convicted and punished for 
their deceit. I often wonder how far 
their "influence" spreads and how 
much corruption is covered by it? 

The recent articles in the Lexing­
ton Herald and Floyd County Times 
are perfect examp1es of what is hap­
pening in the USA today. U.S. Citi­
zens eJected Mr. Lemaster in good 
faith and he was unopposed in 1988 
and 1992. He was also credited with 
being the second lawyer in Kentucky 
to successfully use the Battered 
Women Syndrome as an excuse for 
murder. In that particu1ar case, the 
defendant had never called a Spouse 
AbuseCenter,had vacationedinCali-

(Continued on page five) 

Break by Scott Pet"ry 

should cover their actions in office as well as 
their methods for getting there. 

Just as we were beginning to decipher the 
complex issues surrounding health care re­
form, the General Assembly comes in and 
performs euthanasia. 

The special session will end without mean­
ingful changes in our system of health care 
but with a promise to revisit the problem later. 

Meanwhile, those who have no insurance 
will continue to suffer while those of us who 
do will continue to pay outrageous costs for 
health care whether we use it or not. 

Health care reform may very well be one of 
those damned-if-you-do, damned-if-you-don't 
issues from both political and financial view­
points, but we're damned if we can wait much 
longer for some workable solution. 

Let's not let too much time pass between 
visits. 

For an example of why health care reform 
is important to our fiscal future as well as our 
own physical future, we'll give you an inside 
glance at our own situation. 

Our company will spend about $70,000 
this year to provide health insurance to our 
employees. That's more than twice what we 
paid three years ago. 

That amount equals our net receipts for 
every newspaper we sell in a period of six 
months. 

For what we've spent on health insurance, 
we could have put five more people to work. 
Instead, we've had to reduce staffing and 
delay necessary improvements. 

By most standards, ours is a small busi­
ness. But ,regardless of size, we are a per­
fect example of why new jobs are hard to 
come by. We can't afford to hire more people, 
even if we need them. 

Health care reform means much more than 
providing access to it for people who don't 
have it. 

It means providing access to jobs, too. 



• 
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fornia without her husband and she 
shot him while he slept, according to 
the prosecution. Yet the jury, com­
posed of citizens that elected her law­
yer, found her guilty of firing the 
murder weapon. 

As an American, I value my rights 
to freedom of speech, etc. and I am 
very thankful that we have an organi­
zation like the FBI to protect those 
right and, oddly enough, it seems that 
the FBI's investigation adds strength 
to the popular saying "What goes 
around, comes around." 

Carol Woods 
Allen 

Time for remembering 

Editor: 
Memorial Day is the summer's 

farst holiday. For most of us it's a 
time to enjoy a long weekend with 
family or friends. It's also a time to 
remember the treasured memories of 
those who are no longer with us. 

In years past, many of us have 
paid a special tribute to a friend or 
relative who has lost a battle with 
cancer. Memorial Gifts to the Ameri­
can Caocer Society provided com­
fort to the family while helping the 
American Cancer Society in its effort 
to eliminate cancer. 

Continuing support from our 
friends is needed to expand the 
Society's programs of research, edu­
cation, and patient services. You can 
help by remembering a loved one, 
friend. co-worker with a contribution 
to the American Cancer Society. 

Call your local American Cancer 
Society office or 1-800-ACS-2345. 
What better time than Memorial Day 
to send a Memorial Gift? 

Bev Schissler 
Memorial Chair 
Floyd County Unit 

Reader says Times 
keeps improving 

Editor: 
As a subscriber to the Floyd 

County Times before and after leav­
ing Kentucky over 30 years. I want to 
commend you and your staff. 

The paper has shown improve­
ment in many, many ways since you 
became editor. 

The articles in the May 5, 1993, 
issue on Exploring the unsung his­
tory of Women in War by Mary 
Combs was outstanding. Many of my 
women friends who served in wars 
have read the article and would ap­
preciate receiving a copy. 

Thanks so much. From a Ken­
tuckian wholivesfarawaybutwhose 
heart has never left the beautiful hills 
of Eastern Kentucky. 

Pauline Hereford Williams 
Orlando. Florida 

Louse brings reader's 
education to a halt 

Editor: 
I received a letter of termination 

from the Adult Learning Center. I 
have attended the Adult Learning 
Program since September 10, 1992. 

This program was to teach us how 
to become better citizens and to build 
our self-esteem to go out and be able 
to work in the community. One day 
wewereplayingagameatschooland 
we were told how we should feel 
better about ourselves for attending 
school and trying to improve our lives. 
I was beginning to have these feel­
ings about myself and then I went to 
school one day and was handed a 
letter of termination. 

This letter stated reasons for my 
termination, to me these were petty 
grievances. Now for the real reason 
in my mind that I was terminated. 

I was in the rest room standing in 
front of a mirror and a louse jumped 
on my shoulder. I wrapped the louse 
in a paper towel and took the louse in 
to the instructor. 

This was an embarrassing thing 
for me to have to do. I contacted the 
health department and was transferred 
on to the environmental control de­
partment I know that another student 
also reported this incident, the only 
difference was that I gave them my 
name and the other student was smart 
and refused to give her name. 

Obviously no one at this school 
except me had ever encountered a 
louse before or at least it was such a 
disgrace that they would not admit it. 
If the rest room is not fumigated I am 
sure that they will recognize the next 
louse. 

I took the test for my GED exam 
on April 10, 1993. I passed but with 
not enough points to obtain the de­
gree. I am scheduled for the exam on 
June 12 and my self-esteem has been 
destroyed along with my will to get 
myGED. 

My only hope is that the next 
student who speaks out against the 
establishment will not be persecuted 
with a letter of termination from a 
program that should build self-es­
teem. 

Now to answer the changes 
brought against me. ( 1) Breaktime 
was abused by a lot of students at the 
center. This happened numerous 
times as it does in every school situ­
ation. I was late coming back in on 
May 11- there was no way that I 
would use the rest room at the center 
after my experience with the louse. I 
went out to find a clean facility and 
was not by myself in being late to 
return. 

(2) I made a 39 percent on my 
math test years ago and I do not need 
to retake this part of the exam. I put 
my time into other subjects that I did 
need help in. 

(3) I have voiced my opinions 
about the program but have never 
been critical of the staff and the pro­
gram. As to the incident of my report­
ing the bug problem. I am guilty. 

After reading the charge against 
me for the use of one derogatory 
word that got a student so extremely 
upset I feel that you could be right I 
never knew that I have the knowl­
edge of word power to cause termi­
nation from a program that started 
out to be the beginning of my new 
life. I will face this person with an 
attorney to answer this charge. 

Billie Jo May 
Allen 

Walkway to success 

Editor: 
You are invited to enjoy the River 

Walk! This trail is a visible symbol of 
PCC' s commitment to our communi­
ties and to building partnerships that 
promote and enhance the quality of 
life in the Big Sandy Valley. The trail 
is open Monday-Saturday, 7 a.m.-10 
p.m., and Sunday noon-10 p.m. 

This River Walk is a true success 
story. Over a year ago when we be­
gan the planning, the College had no 
money to develop the land (but we 
did have valuable resource, flatland). 
Together, however, we creatively 
worked with the City, the County, 
businesses, and interested citizens to 
tap the resources and talent necessary 
to develop Phase One of this project. 

This is an important step toward a 
larger dream of weaving our college 
into the fabric of the communities we 
served. I fmnl y believe that by devel­
oping our vision and plans, working 
our plans together, relying on our 
talents and strengths, maintaining a 
positive "can do" attitude, and stay­
ing focused toward our goals ... we 
can make our dreams come true. 
United we can "make a difference." 

After more than one year of plan­
ning and hard work, we are finally 
able to officially open Phase One of 
the River Walk trail which is a one 
kilometer, 10 foot wide, paved and 
lighted walking trail on our Prestons­
burg Campus. As you walk your way 
to better health, please be a good 
citizen and help us keep the trail 
clean and safe. And, please note that 
the trail is designed for walkers only, 
so no bikes are allowed. 

To the contributors of cash, ser­
vices, labor and materials (listed on a 
sign at the trail)-thank you! To those 
who want to help, please contact us­
opportunities are still available for 
you to be a part of this dream. We 
plan to develop the u·ail into a beau­
tifully landscaped path that will also 
have educational utilization. 

I want to especially thank Judge 
Executive John M. Stumbo and 
Mayor Ann Latta for their support 
and leadership with this project. And, 
my appreciation also extends to the 
other members of the River Walk 
Planning Committee: Danny 
Hamilton, Jim Hopson, Dean John 
l Jerald, D. B. Kazee, Dixon Nunnery 
and Cliff Latta. Assisting the Com­
mittee were Bill Pieratt, Director of 
Campus Recreation and Tim 
Dunnagan, Director ofWellness with 
the University of Kentucky Fimess/ 
Wellness Program; GlennisLittle and 
Diann Bartley, co-chairs of PCC's 
Fitness Committee; and Shirley Tho­
mas, faculty education chair. Leonard 
Lawson's generous donation of the 
blacktop paved the road for the open· 
ing of Phase One of this dream. And, 
thanks to Sheriff Paul Hunt Thomp­
.son for agreeing to assist with secu­
rity to help keep the trail open on 
Saturdays and· Sunday. From the bot­
tom of my heart. thank you all! 

Lace up your walking shoes and 
enjoy the beauty of your community 
college. 

Deborah L. Floyd 
President, PCC 

British woman wants 
Kentucky pen pal 

Editor: 
I am writing to enquire if any of 

your female newspaper readers would 
be interested in corresponding with 
me, as I should very much like to 
have a pen friend from your pan of 
Kentucky. 

My name is Mavis Ellis and I am 
a housewife. My husband and I have 
one daughter and we live in a pleas­
ant rural part of Nouinghamshire, 
close to the famous Robin Hood coun­
try. 

Also close to where we live is 
historic 12th century Newstead Ab­
bey, the former home of the poet. 
Lord Byron. 

My hobbies include reading, his­
tory, music, country walking and for­
eign travel. 

I am particularly interested in 
learning about Kentucky. 

Mavis Ellis 
69 Mansfield Road 
Papplewick, 
Nottingham NG15 8FJ 
Great Britain 

Information sought 
on ancesters 

Editor: 
My name is Paul Edward Bradley 

Jr. I'm loolcing for any family mem­
ber related to the following people: 

Great-grandfather Green Bradley 
(unknown); great-grandmotherCaro­
lyn Hale (1880-1952); great-grand­
father Henry William Bradley (un­
known); great-grandmother Dela 
Abden (unknown); grandfather Ri­
chard Miller Bradley (1907-1991); 
grandrriother Eliza Bradley or Mar­
garetAnn Bradley (1913-1982);great 
aunt Betsie Castle (unknown); and 
great uncle Virgil Castle (unknown). 

Anyone with information. please 
contact Paul Edward Bradley Jr, 
28110 Hanover, Westland, Michi-
gan 48185. . 

Thank you for your cooperation. 
May God bless you. 

Paul Edward Bradley Jr. 
Westland, Michigan 

America's libraries 
The nation's 122,000 libraries 
are faced with both higher 
demand for service and 
shrinking budgets. A profile: 

W?mmrwtr-trw-rN., .. ·**'«~~'"'IJJ illPl>Ar~lt .. ~ · .. .. .. ,. 
Total: 122,420 

Academic 3,438 
Special*11 ,275 

Public 
169 

• More than 122 million people 
used a public library in 1990 

• 14.2 million students, faculty 
and others used a college or 
university library each week 

• 42.4 million elementary and 
high school students visited 
public school library media 
centers each week 
• 37% of public library users 
are 14 years old or under 

Doesn·t 
total 100% 
due to 
rounding 

rm'llfir~J.!liJJ,jfi~l!l 
Percent of patrons who: 
1975 _j 1990 Ill 
Took out a book 

175% 
~~91% 
Used reference materials 

151 
mp~mtmJR~-lmJ777TC'n 
Read newspapers, magazines 

urarru~ :~ 
Took out records, tapes, films 

~30 
Heard a speaker, saw a movie 
___ J.j8 
~24 

Took a class 

.12 
"Includes goverment. military. corporate, 
mediCal. etc. 

SOURCE: American Library Association 
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May Next Estimated Jackpot $5 million 
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WEATHER WATCH 
Wednesday (today) 

Sunny. High in the mid 70s. 
Mostly clear Wednesday night with 
the low around 50. 

Tbursdav 
Sunny. High in the lower 80s. 

Thursday night, low in the upper 
50s. 

Friday 
Partly cloudy with high in the 

lower 80s. 
Information provided by the 

Jackson Weather Service. 

Regional Ne,vs Briefs 

Mother arrested for 
giving alcohol to children 

A Regina woman. Rita Rose Muncy, was 
arrested Friday after she allegedly gave her minor 
children alcoholic beverages, a situation that led 
to bet daughter being taken to Pikeville Method­
ist Hospital. 

The 36-year-old Muncy is being held in the 
Pike County Detention Center following an ar­
raignment just hours after the incident 

The Pikeville City Police citation alleges that 
Muncy gave her 17-year-old daughter pure grain 
alcohol while they were at Marlow's Country 
Palace. 

While at the establishment, the girl was alleg· 
edly assaulted by Muncy's 15-year-old son. who 
allegedly became violent after Muncy gave him 
12 cans of beer. 

Muncy entered a not guilty plea. - The Appa­
lachian News-Express 

Radium found in Eastern 
Kentucky gas wells 

Radiation has been found in dozens of oil and 
gas wells' waste pits in Eastern Kentucky. The 

~. 

~ Portrait of China 

CHINA 

Violence against women 
• Slave trade: 18,692 cases 
investigated in 1991 ; police freed 
50;000 women in 1991-92 • 
• Rape: 3.7 per 100,000 (1986) 

• Area: 3.695 million square miles 

• Population: 1.135 billion 

• Population growth rate: 1.4% 
(1990} ' 

•Illiteracy rate: 34.5% (male 
10.8%; female 48.9%) 

pits, in the Martha oil field in Johnson and 
Lawrence counties, are tainted with radium, a 
long-lived radioactive element found in the rock 
formation known as Devonian black shale that 
contains most of the oil and gas produced in 
Kentucky. 

This raises the possibility that wells elsewhere 
in Eastern Kentucky are contaminated with radia­
tion, but no widespread testing has been done. 

Radiation readings at some pits in Johnson 
County are as high as 600 times the level the 
federal Environmental Protection Agency deems 
acceptable for waste produced by processing ura­
nium ore. 

Neither the EPA nor the state has rules about 
how the oil-field waste should be handled or 
cleaned up. As a result, many pits are allowed to 
exist, unfenced and without warning signs, in 
areas where people live, work, and play, accord­
ing to Tom FitzGerald of the Kentucky Resources 
Council, an environmental group. 

FitzGerald has written Gov. Jones, asking for 
action to identify the extent of the problem, to 
prevent contamination of water, and to protect 
humans and wildlife from exposure to the radio­
active waste. 

The radium is produced by the decay of ura­
nium and thorium, alsoradioactiveelementsfound 
in the black shale. Unlike uranium and thorium, 
radium dissolves readily in water and brine. both 
of which are brought to the surface when oil and 
gas are drilled. -Louisville Courier-Journlll 

Letcher attorney, 
secretary face 206 counts 

State police say they will ask the special Letcher 
County grand jury to consider more charges against 
Commonwealth Attorney James Wiley Craft 

Craft, 47, of Whitesburg is already facing 103 
felony charges. He and one of his secretaries, 25-
year-old Patsy Stallard of Craft's Colley, are 
named in a206-countindicmentretumed in Fmnk­
fortMay20. 

The charges involve the use of state funds to 
pay Stallard's salary and health benefits when she 
was allegedly working only on matters involving 
Craft's private law practice. 

A Franklin County grand jury found that there 
was enough evidence to charge Craft with paying 
Stallard up to $35,000 in state money for work she 
did as his private secretary. 

Craft, who is seeking re-election, will no longer 
be able to prosecute cases until the criminal 
charges against him are resolved. He is still eli­
gible to receive his salary. - The Mountain Eagle 

• Religjon: Confucianism, 
Buddhism and Taoism; small 
Muslim and Christian minorities 

.. Annual per capita inoome: $315 
(1991) 

• Maternal mortality: 227 per 
1 00,000 births (1986) 

•Infant. mortality; 27 ~r 1,000 live 
births 

• Ufe expectancy: Female 72.6 
years. male 69.2 years 

•NOTE: lnclependent.[esearchers say the figures may underestimate the problem. 
SOURCES: Kaleidoscope: Current World Data 1990; S1atlstical Af)CC)rd of Women W<>ildwkfe; 
China's Public Security Bureau; Interpol 



A6 Wednesday, May 26,1993 The Floyd County Times 

Costain landfill battle unsettled 
despite state permit approval 

. ~-~:ou~~;t-;~(M,, . ··-~ 
I'll . (' \ this day go by · .. . 

by Geoff Belcher 
Staff Writer 

Although the state last week is­
sued a draft permit allowing the op­
eration of a controversial new coal­
ash depository on the banks of the 
Big Sandy, at least one opponent of 
the facility said this week that the 
fight isn't over yet. 

The Kentucky Cabinet for Natu­
ral Resources Division of Waste 
Management on Friday approved a 
permit application submitted by 
Pikeville-based Costain Coal to op­
erate a coal ash landfill at I vel. 

The 65-acre landfill is to contain 
the pelletized remnants of coal burned 
at Jacksonville, Aorida's Cedar Bay 
Generating Company as part of a 20-
yearcontract, under which Cedar Bay 
would purchase one million tons of 
coal per year from Costain. 

A group of concerned citizens or­
ganized last September to form the 
I vel and Big Sandy Citizens Against 
Waste, which protested the landfi II at 
several public hearings. The I vel and 
Big Sandy Citizens said that the fa­
cility would be too close to the Levisa 
Fork of the Big Sandy River and that 
hazardous elements in the coal ash, 
such as lead and arsenic, could easily 

contaminate the en tire region's water 
supply. 

RcprcscntativcsofCostainandi.T. 
Corporation, which designed the fa­
cility, maintained that hazardous ele­
ments existed in the coal ash in mini­
mal amounts and th2.t the facility• 
would be completely safe. 

"As we said all along," Costain 
engineer Tom Mattox said Tuesday, 
"it doesn't present any kind of hazard 
at all." 

In fact, Mattox said, "This is not 
an adverse thing for Eastern Ken­
tucky. It's going to generate jobs and 
it's going to generate revenues. It's 

·good for business." 
Mattox said that Steve Fields, per­

mit review supervisor for the Divi­
sion of Waste Management. had re­
marked that Costain' s permit appli­
cation was one of the best designed 
and detailed applications he had ever 
received. 

The only major change in the 
facility's plan that the state requested 
was to move the landflll's wastewa­
ter collection ponds out of the 100-
year flood plain, Mattox said. 

"We've tried to address 
everybody's concerns ... ," Mattox 
said, "and we feel that we have done 

that and expect that everything will 
proceed according to plan." 

Still, I vel and Big Sandy Citizens 
legal counsel Michael DeBourbon 
said Tuesday, the issue has not been 
settled. 

De Bourbon, a Pikeville attorney, 
said that although he had not yet 
received official word from the citi­
zens group, he eltpected that efforts 
to fight the landfi II' s operation would 
continue. 

"I just think it's ill-conceived that 
you would place a garbage dump 
next to somebody's water supply ... ," 
DeBourbon said. "It doesn't seem 
like we're so limited in space that 
we'd have to locate such an impound­
ment in such close proximity to a 
source of drinking water .... If there's 
anything you want to protect in this 
world, it's the rivers." 

DeBourbon said that the citizens 
group will probably begin holding 
town meetings similar to those con­
ducted last year to protest Costain's 
proposal. 

Fields said Monday that it may be 
several months before the Division 
ofWaste Management issues Costain 
a construction permit for the landfill. 
In the meantime, Fields said, citizens 
can request a public hearing. 

Barring further delays, Mattox 
said, Costain plans to begin construct­
ing the landfill by the end of 1993. · 

"Looking good" 
The band uniforms for South Floyd 
High School have been ordered. 
they are military-styled uniforms 
in the school colors of black and 
silver, creamed In white. They In· 
clude two pairs of pants, one white 
and one black. There Is also a mill· 
tary style cap with a plume. They 
are of quality workmanship and 
material and Include a 1 0-year guar­
antee. Seventy uniforms were or­
dered at a cost of approximately 
$20,000. 

I without saying, 

~afllul 
~~ 

Betty Louise 
Ousley 

Your friends 
Jenny, LaDonna & Tammy 

f)U_~. 

.:.:.::··; 

. zJify0u believe there ifte:i}Vo viCtims in 

Airpo rt----------------(Continued from page one) 

''every abortion, ¢t:>thef:tflndwchild. If 

Development Authority board 
members voted to endorse the appli­
cation, to be prepared by 
Recktenwald, so that the site could at 
least qualify for consideration. 

Controversy flrst surrounded the 
airport site early last year, when 
Prestonsburg Mayor Ann Latta and 
Paintsville Mayor John David Preston 
suggested closing the airport and de­
veloping the property for industrial 
use. Members of the Aoyd/Johnson 
County Pilot's Association and 
AmericanS tandard officials protested 
that proposal, however, arguing that 
the airport was far too vital to the 
region's economy and that there were 
too many other sites suitable for in­
dustrial development to shut down 
the airport. The issue is still under 
review by the Paintsville­
Prestonsburg Airport Authority. 

Councilman Jerry Fannin,aPilot's 
Association member, told members 
ofthecitycouncil at Monday's meet­
ing that the nursing home proposal 
might interfere with a tentative plan 
by American Automation & Manu­
facturing Corporation, Incorporated, 
to locate at the site. American Auto­
mation, an auto parts manufacturer 

which would initially employ be­
tween 100-125 people, has stipulated 
that the airport must remain open in 
order for their relocation to be suc­
cessful, Fannin said. 

The council adjourned from 
lengthy closed session Monday 
evening to authorize a resolution to 
proceed with the nursing home appli­
cation, Councilman George Archer 
said, with the provision that the 
Paintsville City Council and Ameri­
can Automation President Ronald 
Ward also approve the plan. 

"Basically," Latta said Tuesday, 
"this is just an application. It does not 
commit us irrevocably to anything .... 
I'm interested in seeing us get any 
kind of facility that will bring 300 
jobs into the area, and I think we'd be 

Summer term 
begins at MSU 
Big Sandy Campus 

Morehead State University will 
offer several daytime classes, both 
undergraduate and graduate, at the 
MSU-Big Sandy Extended Campus 
Center during the fl.rst summer term. 

Registration will be conducted on 
Monday, June 7, from 10 a.m. to 6 
p.m. at the center. First term classes 
begin Tuesday, June 8, and continue 
through Friday, July 2. 

short-sighted not to at least submit an 
application." 

Latta added that Recktenwald told 
her Tuesday that the nursing home 
and American Automation should be 
compatible at the airport site. 

However, Archer said, Fannin read 
into the minutes of Monday's meet­
ing a memorandum from Paintsville 
attorney C.K. Belhasen concerning a 
plan by the pilot's association to buy 
the site itself. 

According to the memorandum, 
American Standard officials had 
granted Johnson County Judge/Ex­
ecutive Gail Gillem and BSADD of­
ficial Bob Meyer's request to make 
18 acres of prime industrial property 
adjacent to the American Standard 
plant available for a prospective 
industiral plant 

Under Bell~asen's plan, American 
Standard would deed the property to 
the industrial authority, which would 
pay for the site on a deferred basis 
with approximately $250,000 in coal 
severance funds, with the provision 
that sewage services be extended to 
the American Standard site. Since 
the coal severance monies would be 
delayed, Belhasen said, the Pilot's 
Association would offer to buy and 
extend the airport property. The 
$250,000 would then be paid to 
American Standard, then deeded to 
the industrial development authority. 
The Pilot's Association would then 
develop three six -acre tracts, sell one 
to American Automation and then 
develop the remaining tracts for ad­
ditional industrial sites. The Pilot's 
Association would assume responsi­
bility for the airport, including main­
tenance and liability, ensuring that 
the airport would remain open. 

"Not only will the area get to have 
its cake and eat it too," Belhasen said, 

"but it will get to have its cake and eat 
it twice ... " because the treasuries of 
both Prestonsburg and Paintsville 
would net $100,000 each; the new 
industrial prospect would have 18 
acres upon which to develop; the 
airport would continue to operate; 
and American Automation would 
have a site on the airport, enabling it 
to create 125 industrial jobs. 

The council briefly discussed the 
proposal Monday, but took no action. 

In other council action Monday: 
• Council adopted a resolution 

authorizing the Prestonsburg Police 
Department to participate in a two­
city /six -county interlocal cooperation 
agreement to form a regional drug 
task force. Prestonsburg Police Chief 
Greg Hall said the task force would 
focus its efforts on eradicating street-

June 4: 

Spring Carnival 5-9 p.m. 
Sponsored by the Extra-Curricular Committee, 

PTA, and the Family Resource Center 
Clark Elementary School 

level drug use. 
• Council approved two new city 

ordinances that would annex prop­
erty on Route 3 at a resident's re­
quest. 

• Council adopted a resolution to 
continue as a member of the Ken­
tucky League of Cities Worker's 
Compensation Trust. 

• Council adopted a new statewide 
policy concerning police response to 
domestic violence reports. 

• At Fannin's request, the council 
dedicated Monday's meeting to 
former city employee, the late Lenna 
"Lenny" Moore. 

Council members Danny 
Hamilton, Lida Howard and Charles 
Hale were absent from Monday's 
meeting. 

The Prestonsburg City Council 
convenes on the second and fourth 
Mondays of each month. The public 
is welcome. 

Coors Light 
$1250 All~~~es 

Cans case P . 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 

Just Arrived!!! 
1993 Model 

I 

2-bedroom, all-electric, 
mobile home. Reduced to 

$9,99500 

Pay only $117.00 per month 
with small down payment 

Call Larry Keene or Homer Edmond• 

(606) 432-0026 
Call Pal or Oavid KHnt 

or Rick BowUng 

(606) 437-9747 

, mo er:, an ·t; 1 ,:.': .... :~~ YOl!l:k~· ou e 
:,:,Jl~!: gf~ltemati y~,~ .. ,~· .. . · 

·:····:·::\;:·:;.;.. ::·:·'{\::: :·:· 

:ii{, · \Ye,>are ~:a :non-prof~~·.'-~lp:istian ~~is try 
,.tf< tfi'at :furhi'sh·eis",. t1nafrcitili~l:and' eriioti onal 

~P.PI?Ort to women in c~isis pregnan­
~1~8, 'tohelp therti,fiild a·morally ac-

. .· .. ·,..ceRtaole alternati~e tQ);:,q.bortion.· :. 
· ·· = : · =:.. .::-· ·=: :::::# ·.. ··· =· ::: ·• ::~~:j~i:~r~~:~:~: ::::- =·=:· =· •· =::~~;If~~~;~~;i:~~~;~(:;· ~ t~.. :::: · · 

::_ You can help "NdW' .. ! by participating 
·····, in: our ~rd ABnual·Walk, for --~~·~·LIFE" on 
"8at1Jrd3.y, Jlille 5 at'iO:OO ;.in. at the 

·· \i>reSionsbutg .· C~furhuhity · ·College 
·:: . •. ·=·=:~:. 

track. 
.. :; 

·, For further infotniatibn contact 
·:,,:,{'::::~:'·.-Pam Halt,.~· 886A202§ .. ,:, 
. ··=:·=~:=·· . . . ~:··:: :-.-~~:: ;.;.·<··=··· •·• ' 

90 DAYS SAME AS· CASH* DURING DEERE SEASON 
Cut$200 
AS LOW AS 
$83 
Per Month* 

Cut$300 
AS LOW AS 
$103 
Per Month* 

Cut$400 
AS LOW AS 
$166 
Per Month* 

Get on-the-spot financing** 
• M_onthly po&ym~nl.!t ba=.eU un John Ot-t!rt! C:reW1 R~..·volvtng Plan 10% down paymc:nt rt'yuuccJ. Aller pwmoiJondl pl"flt.Xi. fioomc..~ chiuge wdl t-t-g10 10 a;c:crut al UIC\. APR 
A SO 50 p:r mon1b m1n1mum tm .. m;c charKc- may be.: aP?u:U lo unp.ud bal;mcc:.5. Fur aoo--commc:u.ldl w.t' ooly OUn gouU unul May 3 1, 1993. • •su~rct to appoved cr~dit 

Hurry! Sale Ends May 31st! 

We Service What We Sell! 

o I 

.. 
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DISTRICT COURT 
Editor's Note: All first offense 

DUI's are allowed to perfonn two 
days of public service in lieu of $200 
of the total court costs and fmes. All 
individuals involved in alcohol or 
drug cases are referred to alcohol and 
drug counseling. 

Arthur D. Martin, 35; A.I. (3rd or 
more), disorderly conduct, resisting 
arrest and terroristic threatening; fined 
$72.50. 

Steve D. Gunnell, 36; A.I. (3rd or 
more); fined $82.50. 

Jon C. Chaney, 20; A.I. (lst or 
2nd) and disorderly conduct; fined 
$107.50. 

Brian A. McDonald, 23; A.I. (1st 
or 2nd) and disorderly conduct; fined 
$107.50. 

Terrence R. Griffin, 24; A.I. (1st 
or 2nd) and disorderly conduct; fined 
$107.50. 

Mark E. Jones, 22; A.l. (1st or 
2nd) and disorderly conduct; fined 
$107.50. 

Steven L. Crum, 35; DUI (1st-­
B.A .. 199); fmed $417.50, 2 days 

public service and lose license for 90 
days. 

David D. Griffith, 22; Expired or 
no registration plates and no insur­
ance; fined $57.50. 

Paula A. Minix, 35; Speeding 15 
mph over, DUI (2nd within 5 yrs. -­
B.A .. 248) and drugs not in proper 
container; fined $557.50 and lose li­
cense for 1 year. 

Richard Allen Naylor, 25; A.I. 
(1st or 2nd) and unsworn falsifica­
tion to authorities; fined $107.50. 

Brice P. Chaput, 20; DUI (B.A. 
. 118)andnotaillamps; fined$417.50 
and 2 days public service. 

PROPERTY TRANSFERS 
Rachel Clark to Audrey Parsons, 

land at Harold; Carl and Geneva 
Whitaker to Tony and Lisa Whitaker, 
land location not listed; Wetzel 
Marion and Faye Denise Queen to 
Marlene Hammond, land at Allen; 
The First Commonwealth Bank of 
Prestonsburg Inc. to Ethel Harvey, 
land at Parsons Branch; 

James Eugene and Patricia Rister, 
Sonny Daryl Rister, Gary Dean and 

Twelfth year as corporate sponsor 
Martin County coal Corporation continues Ita generous support of the 
performing arts In Eastern Kentucky again this year with Ita corporate 
contribution to sponsor the show, Cinderella, at Jenny Wiley Theatre. 
Pictured Is Larry Jones, president of Martin County Coal Corportlon 
presenting a $10,000 donation to Jenny Wiley Theatre president Bill 
Francis. The corporation was recognized for Its long-standing support 
oft he arts In Eastern Kentucky by Governor Brereton Jones at the state 
arts conference In Owensboro In February when Larry Jones accepted 
the Governor's Awards In the Arts for a Business from Governor Jones. 

The 

Malessia Rister, Cheryl and George 
Lawson, Jackie Gayland and Lisa 
Rister, Tammy Rister, Kathy and 
Jackie Hall,Jeffrey Bryant Rister and 
Paul David and Linda Rister to Fred 
Lyons and Sherry Lynn Rister Ly­
ons, land location not listed; 

Sherrell and Jalenda Shepherd to 
Fred and Sherry Lynn Rister Lyons, 
land at Scott Fork; Penny Ann 
McKenzie and Lloyd Johnson toRi­
chard Heath and Justin Claude Heath 
Tackett, land location not listed; 

Virgil Boyd to Virgil Boyd Jr., 
land location not listed; Adrian and 
Wanda Lafferty, Ronald and Dixie 
Frasure toJamesJoseph Whited, land 
atSheepfield Branch of Abbott Creek; 
Lona Charles to 1 ames B. and Paula 
Fulks, land in Prestonsburg; 

Ethel Stumbo, Bill Stumbo, Teresa 
Prater, Loran Jr. Stumbo, Penny and 
LloydJohnson,GaryandSallyWolfe, 
Dena and Randy Patton, Diann and 
Michael Prater, Milton Ray Stumbo, 
Toby Stumbo, Edith Stumbo, Ran­
dolph and Juanita Burchett, Bob and 
Sandra Haines, Gail and Keith 
Carden, Stephenia Stumbo and Nola 
Stumbo to Clyde Clark, land location 
not listed; 

Tessie Campbell to Darrell and 
Rose Chaffins, land at Stone Coal; 
Virgil Boyd to J.B. Boyd, land loca­
tion not listed; Glenna Thacker to 
Bobby G. Thacker, land at Rolling 
Acres Estates; 

Rocky and Pamela K. Morrow to 
Justin Wayne Morrow and Misty 
Nichole Morrow. land at Branhams 
Creek; Ralph and Reva Caudill to 
Greg and Michelle Couch, land at 
Otter Creek; Hazel Arnett and Char­
lotte L. Harris to Floyd Skeans, land 
at Abbott Creek; 

The First Commonwealth Bank 
of Prestonsburg Inc. to Darvin and 
Ginny Spencer, land at Creekside 
Development; James R. Allen to 
Alvin and Debbie Jarrel11 Master 
Commissioner's Deed, land location 
not listed; 

Prestonsburg Clinic Associates to 
Highlands Dialysis Facility Inc., land 
at Highlands Plaza; 

Dell Rowe to Hayen Burke, land 
at Left Beaver; Kenneth C. Poore to 
the Farmers Home Administration, 
(2 tracts) land location not listed; 
Harry Leonard and Annette McCoy 
to Sam and Carol Sue Shepherd. land 

MITSUB·ISHI 
Event 

CS-20RX1 
20" color television with remote 

CK-35MX2 
35" high-performance stereo digital 
monitor/receiver with integrated remote 

VS-50VA2 
50" slim stereo 
digital Big Screen •· 
with learning 
remote 

CS-26EX1 
26" stereo monitor/receiver with 
integrated remote 

The Big Event Sweepstakes! 
1st Prize: Hawaiian Vacation 

Win 5 sunny days and 4 exotic nights in Maui, 
Hawaii. Includes round-trip airfare, hotel, rental car 
and $2000 spending cash! 

2nd Prize: $2500 in U.S. Savings Bonds 

3rd Prize: $1000 U.S. Savings Bond 
Entries must be received by July 5, 1993. No Purchase 
Necessary. Must be 21 years of age or older to enter. See 
dealer lor details. 

I 90 Days Same As Cash • Free Delivery I 

MIKE'S B&W T.V. AND APPLIANCES 
HOURS: Mon.-Sat., 9:00 to 5:00 

North Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. • 886-9682 

at Middle Creek; 
Fannie Mae McKinney to James 

Donald McKinney, land location not 
listed; PauiR. and Lucretia A. Sturgill 
to Charles R. and Myrna StUrgill, 
land location not listed; Ruby Napier 
Richter, Delcie Napier and Fletcher 
Gayheart and Clarence Edward and 
Martha Adams Napier to Roger and 
Patsy Hall Rose, land at Garrett; 

Larry Lyons to Larry and Melinda 
Lyons, land at Meadow View Es­
tates; Rex and Christy Williams to 
James R. and Pamela Gullett, land at 
Cliff Heights; James and Maxine 
Paige to Karen L. and Oliver Wendell 

STRAND I 

Hall, land location not listed; 
Charles E. and Michelle Branham 

to John E. and Kathy J. Ousley, land 
at Holly Bush; Nonna H. and Gene 
D. Davis to Anthony Craig and 
Gwendolyn A. Davis, land at Prater 
Creek; William and Vicki Wells to 
Kenneth and Bonnie McKinney, land 
at Auxier; 

We take 
CARS, 

TRUCKS, 
BOATS, and 
CAMPERS, 

trade-in. 

HYLTON HOMES 
of lvel 

Call1-800-264-4835 
for details . 

STRAND II 

Starts Friday, May 28 Starts Friday, May 28 

~EV1ERICA 
At the sperm-bank. 

she asked for 
a tall. intelligent, black man. 

This 

Ain't 

No 

Game. S U P E R 

MARIO BROS. One out of three ain't bad. 

IPG·13IP. ·---:.~~~· 
SHOWTIMES: 7:00 & 9:15 SHOWTIMES: 7:00 & 9:15 

SUNDAY MATINEE-All Seats $3.00-0pen 1:00, start 1:30, over 3:20 

just add water ... 

S"LJ..r1sati<:>r1al 
• 

wtmwear 
Savings 
Flattering, sun and fun 
swimwear for every member of the 
family - at prices that leave 
you money to spare! 

misses ... 
1.4.99-19.99 

reg. 19.99-2.4.99 

One and two piece styles from favorite famous 
brand names. 

juniors ... 

19.99--
2 9 • 99 :m:s~.~ 
Ocean Pacific, Hobie and Catalina Juniors one and 
two piece styles. 

childrens ... 

25% .off 
Styles for splashing and sunning for toddlers, girls' 4-14 
and boys' 4-7. 

mens .. 

15.99 reg.17.99-l9.99 
Colorful nylon trunks from Pierre Cardin, Sea Island 
and Ocean Pacific. 

ladies' sandals and summer shoes ..• 

9.99-12.99 compare at 12.99-17.99 
Large selection of popular styles. 

-
PikevUle-Weddington Plaza 

Paintsville-Mayo Plaza 
S. Williamson-South Side Mall 

.!ill Use Watson's convenient layaway plus 4 great ways to charge. 
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Sonjia Sue Meade 
Sonjia Sue Meade, 50, of Harold, 

died Thursday, May 20, at the St. 
Joseph Hospital, Lexington, follow­
ing a short illness. 

Born April 15, 1943 in Wyan­
dotte, Michigan, she was the daugh­
ter of Tennis Samuel Salisbury of 
Harold and the late Phoebie Jane 
Miller Salisbury. She was an Avon 
sales representative for 29 years and 
one of the top ten in the U.S. in sales. 
She was a member of the Tram Church 
of Christ and the President's Club for 
Avon Products. 

In addition to her father, she is 
survived by her husband, Duard 
Meade; four sons, Duard Avery 
Meade, Sidney LeeMeadeandLonie 
Joe Meade, all of Harold, and Eliot 
Randall Meade of Olustee, Florida; 
one daughter, Melody Sue Meade of 
Harold; two brothers, Kenneth S. 
Salisbury of South Gate, Michigan, 
and Dennis W. Salisbury of Harold; 
one sister, Patricia Lou Kendrick of 
Pikeville; and two grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Sunday, 
May 23 at 1 p.m. at the Hall Funeral 
Home chapel with the Evangelists 
Wendell Meade and Doyle Meade 
officiating. 

Burial was in the Meade Cem­
etery at Harold under the direction of 
Hall Funeral Home. 

Melvin Floyd Conn 
Melvin Floyd Conn, 82, of Harold, 

died Saturday, May 22, at Highlands 
Regional Medical Center following a 
long illness. 

Born May 9, 1911 at Harold, be 
was the son of the late Preston and 
Ella Conn. He was a retired coal 
miner, formerly employed by Inland 
Steel and Island Creek Coal Com­
pany. He was a member of the Lower 
Toler Church of Christ and the 
U.M.W.A., Local Union No. 5899 at 
Wheelwright. 

Survivors include his wife, Opal 
Bush Conn; one daughter, Peggy 
Conn Tackett of Harold; four grand-

children, five great-grandchildren and 
one great-great-grandchild. 

Funeral services were Tuesday, 
May 25 at I p.m. at the Lower Toler 
Church of Christ at Harold with the 
EvangelistDoylt> Meade and Wendell 
Meade officiating. 

Burial was in the Bobby Joe Conn 
Cemetery of Harold under the direc­
tion of Hall Funeral Home. 

Attend Your 
Place of Worship ·:.= 
. .This Week .,,, 

Virgil H andshoe 
Virgil Handshoe, 75, of Gunlock, 

died Saturday, May 22 at his resi­
dence. 

Born December 21, 1917 at Gun­
lock, he was the son of the late Alex 
and Dora Handshoe. He was a custo­
dian at the John T. Arnett Elementary 
School and a member of the Head of 
Licking River Living Word Pente­
costal Church. 

Survivors include bis wife, Martha 
Howard Handshoe; two sons, Haskell 
Hand shoe and Virgil Douglas 
Handshoe, both of Gunlock; nine 
daughters, Joyce Gibson, Charlene 
Osborne, Annis Shepherd and 
Bernadine Gearheart, all of Gunlock, 
Lois Wireman and Dora Jean 
Wireman, both of Albion, Michigan, 
Gracie Evelyn Shepherd of 
Hueysville, Janice Carol Hale of 
Royalton and Rose Maggard of 
Hollybush; one brother, Fred 
Handshoe of Vest; three sisters, 
Rebecca Sawyers of Indiana, Sally 
Owsley of Lima, Ohio, and Gracie 
Shepherd of Mt Sterling; one half­
sister, Frankie Prater of Gunlock; 21 
grandchildren and eight great-grand­
children. 

Funeral services were Monday, 
May 24 at 2 p.m. at the Head of 
Licking River Living Word Pente­
costal Church with the Clergyman 
Carlos Beverly officiating. 

Burial was in the Handshoe Cem­
etery of Gunlock under the direction 
of Hall Funeral Home. 

Serving as pallbearers were Carl 
Shepherd, Tim Bailey, Kevin Hughes, 
Harold Wireman, Willard Shepherd 
and Ricky Gearheart. 

Dollie K. Mitchell 
Dollie K. Mitchell, 82, of Harold, , 

iied Saturday, May 22, at Highlands : 
Regional Medical Center following : 
an extended illness. 

Born April19, 1911 in Amba, she : 
was the daughter of the late Francis : 
and Cassie Kidd Keathley. She was a l 
member of the Church of Christ on 1 

Toler Creek. 
Survivors include one son, Isaac : 

Riley Jr. of Harold; one stepson, , 
Bobby Mitchell of Cow Creek; one 
sister, Fannie McKinney of Harold; 
eight grandchildren and five great­
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Tuesday, 
May 25 at 11 a.m. at the Nelson­
Frazier Funeral Home chapel with 
theRev.DoyleMeadeandothermin­
isters of the Church of Christ officiat­
in g. 

Burial was in the Roberts Cem­
etery at Harold under the direction of 
Nelson-Frazier Funeral Home. 

Card OfThanks 
The family of Earnest Hensley wishes to gratefully ac­

knowledge the thoughtfulness shown by friends, rela tives, 
and neighbors in the loss of our loved one. 

Thanks to all who sent flowers, food, spoke prayers and 
comforting words. A special thanks to Dr. Mary Hall, and 
the McDowell ARH staff and Respiratory Therapy. We 
deeply appreciate you all. 

We are especially grateful to the Joppa Old Regular 
Baptist ministers and members for their comforting words, 
and the Sheriff's Department for their assistance in traffic 
control. 

Special thanks to the Nelson-Frazier Fnneral Home for 
their kind and professional service. 

May God's blessing be on each one of you. 

THE FAMILY 

Card Of Thanks 
The family ofMargret G. Slone wishes to grate­

fully acknowledge the thoughtfulness and kind­
ness of friends and relatives in the loss of our loved 
one. Thanks to all who sent food, flowers, prayers 
or spoke kind words. We are especially grateful to 
the Rev. Ted Shannon and singers of the Drift 
Pentecostal Church for their comforting words; 
the sheriffs department for their assistance in 
tr affic control and the Floyd Funeral Home for 
their kind and professional service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
MARGRET G. SLONE 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 
(606) S74-n21 · 

Larry '13ur(!, :MCUUltJer 
rrraci '13ur(!, :fururaf 'Director . 'Em6almu 

'l<f-asOTUJ!Jfe, 'l<f-[ia!Jfe, aruf Courtwus Service since 1952 
... c ~ , Pre-ne.,eA.,.butial ins.ur:.ance . .a~ailable. 
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Dennis Gene Johnson 
Dennis Gene Johnson, 46, of 

Wyandotte, Michigan, died Monday, 
May 24, at the University of Michi­
gan Hospital, Ann Arbor, Michigan, 
following a brief illness. 

Born September 14, 1946 in 
Muskegen, Michigan, he was the son 
of the late Shelley and Louise Peterson 
Johnson. He was a machine operator 
for26 years for McCord Casket Com­
pany in Wyandotte, Michigan. He 
was a graduate of Wheelwright High 
School and a Vietnam veteran. 

Survivors include two brothers, 
Willis Johnson and Percy Dean 
Johnson, both of Melvin; two sisters, 
Jewell Green Park, Michigan, and 
Edith Paga of Brooklyn Park, Minne­
sota; two half -sisters, Laurel 
Hendricks of Muskegen, Michigan, 
and Mary W oodrean of Houston, 
Texas. 

Funeral services will be Thurs­
day, May 27 at 11 a.m. at the Nelson­
Frazier Funeral Home with the min­
ister Orville Burke officiating. 

Burial will be in the Johnson Cem­
etery at Melvin rutder the direction of 
Nelson-Frazier Funeral Home. 

Juanita ]. Cook 
)uanita J. Cook, 70, of Urbana, 

Ohio, died Monday, May 24. 
Born June 12, 1922, she was the 

daughter of Wayne D. Click of Mar­
tin and Myrtle C. Runyon of Point 
Pleasant, West Virginia. 

Survivors include two daughters, 
Priscilla Layne Sammons of Pres­
tonsburg and Lola Layne Watters of 
Urbana, Ohio; one sister, Ethel Ma<;h 
of Kenton, Ohio; one brother, Ellis 
Click ofPhoenix, Arizona; five grand­
sons and two great-granddaughters. 

Funeral services will be Wednes­
day, May 26, at 9 p.m. at the Walter­
Schoedinger Funeral Home in 
Urbano, Ohio. 

Eulah Stephens May 
Eulah Stephens May, 85, of Or­

ange City, Floritla, formerly of Lan­
gley, died May 22 at her home fol­
lowing an extended illness. 

Born August 1, 1908 in Pike 
County, she was the daughter of the 
late Malcolm and Rebecca Maggard 
Stephens. She was preceded in death 
by her husband, Willard May. 

Survivors include one son, Tho­
mas Edward May of California; two 
granddaughters, five great-grandchil­
dren and two great-great-grandchil­
dren. 

Graveside services and burial were 
May 24 at Deltona Memorial Gar­
dens, Deltona, Florida, under tbe di­
rection of BauldauffFuneral Home. 

Norcie Gibson Hunt 
Norcie Gibson Hunt, 89, of 

Hueysville, died Friday, May 21 at 
the Knott County Nursing Home, 
Hindman, following a long illness. 

Born August 17, 1903atMousie, 
she was the daughter of the late John 
and Minnie Huff Gibson. She was a 
member of the Stone Coal Regular 
Baptist Church at Garrett. She was 
preceded in the death by her husband, 

Johnny Hunt 
Survivors include two sons, Virgil 

Hunt and Linzie Hunt, both of Mon­
roe, Michigan; one daughter, Dottie 
Hayes of Hueysville; eight grand­
children and 12 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Monday, 
May 24 at 1 p.m. at the Hall Funeral 
Home chapel with the Regular Bap­
tist Church ministers officiating. 

Burial was in the Tom Martin 
Cemetery at Garrett under the direc­
tion of Hall Funeral Home. 

Serving as pallbearers were Gor­
don Hayes, Joe Lewis, Jamie Smith. 
Ken Lewis and Brett Walcutt 

Card OfThanks 
The family ofHawley Scott wishes to thank all of 

those who were so kind and considerate during our 
time of grief. We want to thank those who sent 
flowers, food, or spoke comforting words, a special 
thanks to the Regular Baptist ministers for their 
comforting words, the Stone Coal Regular Baptist 
Church, the ladies who prepared the food, the 
Sheriffs Department for their assistance in traffic 
control and the Hall Funeral Home for their kind 
and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY OF HAWLEY SCOTT 

Card OfThanks 
The family of Fay H. Hall wishes to gratefully 

acknowledge the thoughtfulness and kindness of 
friends, relatives, and neighbors in the loss of our 
loved one. Thanks to all who sent food, flowers, 
prayers or spoke comforting words. We are 
especially grateful to the Clergyman Hubert 
Harmon for his comforting words, the Sheriff's 
Department for their assistance in traffic control 
and the Hall Funeral Home for their kind and 
professional service. 

THE FAMILY OF FAY H. HALL 

"The Last Full Measure 
Perhaps Abraham Lincoln said it 

best: "These honored dead gave the 
last full measure of devotion." 

On this Memorial Day, we pay 
tribute to th•~ brave men and women 
who have given their lives in the wars 
our nation has fought to defend 
ourselves and others from oppression. 

As we pause to remember on 
this special day. we pray that God's 
comforting hand will touch those who 
have died for our country. And we say 

· a special p;·aycr for the families who 
are still umure of the fates of their 
loved oncs, .. those Americans missing 
in ac tion 111 VietNam . 

Of 
Devotion" 

CARTER 
FUNERAL 

HOME 
47 South Lake Drive, 

Prestonsburg 
Phone: 886-2774 

Card Of Thanks 
The family of Harold Isaac would like to extend 

their appreciation to all those friends, neighbors 
and loved ones who helped comfort them during 
their time of sorrow. Thanks to all who sent food, 
flowers, prayers or spoke comforting words. A 
special thanks to the Freewill Baptist ministers 
for their comforting words, the Sheriff's 
Department for their assistance in traffic control 
and the Hall Funeral Home for their kind and 
professional service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
HAROLD ISAAC 

Card Of Thanks 
The family of Clinton "Charlie" Ray wishes to 

thank all those friends, neighbors, and family who 
helped them in any way upon the passing of their 
loved one. Thanks to those who sent food, flowers, 
prayers and words of comfort expressed. A special 
thanks to the Regular Baptist ministers for their 
comforting words, the Sheriff's Department for 
their assistance in traffic control, and the Hall 
Funeral Home for their kind and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY OF 
CLINTON "CHARLIE" RAY 

Merion Bros. 
Monument 

Co. 
• Granite • Bronze 

• Mausoleums • Vases 
• Custom Designs 

Located 2 miles from 
Martin on Rt. 122 

Martin-McDowell Highway 
Phone: 285-9961 

Outside Floyd County 
1-800-675-9961 

One of the area's most selected 
Discover, Visa and MasterCard accepted. 

NELSON-FRAZIER FUNERAL HOME 
Phone: 285-5155 

Owned and Operated By: 
Roger Nelson and Glenn Frazier 

A proud tradition 
pre-arrange a funeral now. The plan 
offers an inflation-proof feature that lets 
you save money by freezing the cost of a 
funeral at today's prices. And it provides 
special tax-saving advantages. 

Our funeral home has been responding 
to the needs of the community for many 
years. To continue this proud tradition of 
helping families in their time of need, we 
now offer the Sunset SecuritySM Plan. 

Sunset Security""' offered by us as a 
member of the Kentucky Funeral 
Directors Burial Association, is a plan 
that lets you reduce the stress your loved 
ones will experience at the time of a 

We'd like to give you a "Personal Record 
Guide" and tell you about the Sunset 
SecuritySM Plan. Just complete the 
coupon below and send it to us. 

funeral. 
1hrough Sunset Sec:urity'l"', you can 

HALL FUNERAL HOME 
Martin, KY 

PHONE: 285-9261 or 285-9262 
"The Home Tlwt Service Built" 

Hall Funeral Home now offers 24-Hour Obituary Line. Just diai28S-3333 
and receive a recorded message of the days funeral announcements. 

SUNSET SECURJTYSM 
I PI~ -;;o;;d'e ;;::.,..jjb .7.p.;:nillt;;d Guide" ud lnf~t~ on I he Sun;t"S-;;-ur:r 

ity"" Plan. j 

Name 

Addr<s:~ 

I 
I 
I 
I I City St.te Zip I 

I < > I 
L L"~~·----------------- _j 

• 
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Floyd students among WSAZ's 
Best of the Class of 1993 salute 

Allen Central High School sru­
dent Heather Carreen Watson; Pre­
stonsburg High School student Ra­
leigh Nelson; Wheelwright High 
School student Rodney Shane Dutton; 
McDowell High School srudent Lisa 
Deneen Hobson; and Betsy Layne 
High School student Melinda 
Spradlin are five of over one hundred 
top ranked high school seniors being 
honored in the WSAZ television 3 
and its "The More You Know" part­
ners, Bank One of West Virginia, 
Cabell Huntington Hospital, and the 
West Virginia Education Fund salute 
to the "Best of the Oass 1993". 

Wednesday, May 26, 1993 A9 

on 
Top scholars from the WSAZ tele­

vision 3 viewing area are being fea­
tured in public service announce­
ments that were videotaped during a 
luncheon held at the Huntington 
Museum of Art on May lOth. 

USED CARS AND TRUCKS 

The announcements will air on 
WSAZ during May and June. 

Rodney Shane Dutton 

Heather Carreen Watson 

Lisa Deneen Hobson 

Raleigh Nelson 

Melinda Spradlin 

KHC announces program for special populations 
The Kentucky Housing Corpora­

tion recently announced that it will 
make made available $10 million for 
a program to address housing needs 
for special population groups. The 
KHC Assisted Living Pilot Program 
will award low-rate financing to ap­
plicants for the purpose of develop­
ment, construction/renovation and 
day-to-day operation of an assisted 
livinJ?; facility. - . 

These facilities will serve popula-
tions such as the elderly, those with 
physical and mental disabilities, 
single-parent heads ofhousehold and 
other similar low-income groups who 
have special housing and service 
needs. 

"It is the philosophy of this project 
that a person's need for care be bal­
anced against choice, dignity, belong­
ing and individuality," stated KHC 's 
Director of Assisted Living Sue 
Tuttle. "Our goal is to assist low­
income special needs individuals with 
their housing options, so that they 
can become productive members of 

society and lead normal, happy lives 
while having access to safe, afford-

able housing." 
Individuals or agencies interested 

in submitting a proposal are encour­
aged to attend one of the Request for 
Proposal training sessions. Dates and 
locations of the sessions are as fol-

lows: Owensboro Executive Inn,May 
26; Louisville Hurstbourne Inn, June 
4; and Lexington Marriott Griffm 
Inn, May 24. To make reservations 
for either session, contact Paula 
Johnson at (502) 564-4753. (800) 
63 3-8896 or (800) 24 7-25 10 (for the 
hearing impaired only). 

County Clerk to serve on 
state legislative committee 

Floyd County Clerk Carla Boyd 1983, has attended meetings and 
was recently selected to serve on the seminars on how to improve the em­
Kentucky County Clerks' Associa- ciency of the county clerk's office. 
lion Legislative Committee. Mem- The Kentucky County Clerks' Asso­
bership on the committee is based on ciation Legislative Committee is re­
knowledge of the laws and regula- sponsible for setting the goals and 
lions governing the office of county objectives of the Kentucky County 
cleric, and individual leadership skills. Clerks' Association and working with 

Boyd, whohasbeenFioydCounty state officials concerning all aspects 
Clerk since the ftrst being elected in of the county clerk's office. 

TO 

Look in upcoming issues 
of 

the Floyd County Times 
for more ways to win 

money. 
Come Join the Game! 

1993 
CUTLASS 

Bright red. SL. 
5.000 miles. 

$16,900 
1990 

S-10 BLAZER 
Tahoe, 

automatic, air. 

$13,500 
1991 

CHEVY 4X4 
Heavy duty, 

automatic, air. 

$12,900 
1992 

NISSAN 4X4 
1-owner. 

Bright red. 

$12,900 
1990 

BONNEVILLE 
LE, new tires, 

loaded. 

$10,900 
1992 

CAVALIER 
RS, 17,000 miles. 

Red. 

$9,900 
1990 BUICK 
SKYLARK 

Auto., air, 
26,000 miles. 

$8,500 
1991 GEO 

METRO 
2-door, silver. 

auto., air. 

$5,900 
1988 DODGE 

D-50 4x4 
Automatic, 

49,000 miles. 

$5,900 
1988 PONTIAC 

SUN BIRD 
Automatic, 

air. 

$4,900 

1992 
TOYOTA4X4 
Sharpest truck ever. 

1-owner. 

$15,900 
1993 

S-10 PICKUP 
Fancy wheels, automatic. 

air. 1 ,600 miles 

$12,900 
1991 

COUGAR 
Bright red, sharp. 

38,000 miles. 

$12,900 
1991 

GRAND PRIX 
SE, 4-door, 
red, loaded. 

$1 '1 ,900 
1990 

CUTLASS 
SL. maui blue. 
37,000 miles. 

$10,900 
1987 

S-10 4x4 
Auto., air, 42,000 miles. 

Sport Package. 

$8,900 
1988 FORD 

CROWN VICTORIA 
LX, 

Loaded. 

$7,900 
1991 GEO 

METRO 
4-door, white, 

auto .. air. 

$5,900 
1986 

CIMARRON 
Automatic, air. 

Good car. 

$4,900 
1987 PLYMOUTH 

HORIZON 
Automatic , 

air. 

$3,900 

1991 
GMC 

Stepside, custom paint. 
32,000 miles. 

$13,900 
1992 

FORD PICKUP 
New tires, 

chrome wheels. 

$12,900 
1991 PONTIAC 

FIREBIRD 
Formula, V-8, 
T-tops, red . 

$12,900 
1991 

CAMRY 
Deluxe, 1-owner. 

White. 

$11,900 
1993 PLYMOUTH 

SUNDANCE 
7,000 miles. 

air bag. 

$10,900 
1990TOYOTA 

PICKUP 
Auto., air, 36,000 miles. 

1-owner. 

$8,900 
1989 FORD 

TAURUS WAGON 
New tires. 

· 1-owner. 

$7,900 
1987 OLDS 

CALAIS 
2-door, blue, 

automatic, air. 

$5,900 
1988 

CORSICA 
1-owner, 

automatic, air. 

$4,900 

1981 CHEVY 
4x4 

Good work truck. 

$2,900 

South Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

Phone: 896·9191 
800-844-9181 

HOURS: 

HES 
Sal•: M·W, 8-7; 

Thora. 8-8: Fri., 8-7; 
Sat., 8·5 

Service: M-F, 8·5; 
Thurs., 8·S: 

Parta: M-F, 7;30·5:30; 
sat., 9·1 



AIO Wednesday, May 26, 1993 

Editor's Note: As a service to the 
many clubs and co"unittees that meet 
in our community, the Floyd County 
Times' Community CaleTUJarwiJ/ post 
meeting arui public service anrwunce­
ments. Articles for the Community 
Calendar must be submitted in writ­
ing to the Times no later than 5 p.m. 
Moruiay for Wednesday's publica­
tionor5p.rn. WednesdayforFriday's 
publication. These cannot be taken 
over the telephone. 

Pikeville Methodist 
talellt show 

Pikeville Methodist Hospital's tal­
ent show, "Stars Come Out in May" 
will be presented on Thursday, May 
27 at Faitll Chapel on the campus of 
Pikeville College. The event will in­
clude different acts of comedy, mu­
sic, dance and magic presented by 
hospital employees. In addition, there 
will be an arts and crafts show. 

Keith Casebolt will emcee the tal­
ent show which begins at 7 p.m. Ev­
eryone is invited to attend. 

Heritage on the Hill Day 
"Heritage on the Hill Day" will be 

held May 27 from 10 a.m.-noon at 
Betsy Layne High School. 

The day will be dedicated to fun 
learning for both the students and 
senior citizens in areas of quilting, 
cooking, line dancing, music, gene­
alogy, computers, science, ceramics 
and much more! 

Sponsored by the Community 
Service Center of Betsy Layne High 
School with Lisa Roberts, coordina­
tor. 

For more information, contact Usa 
Roberts at 478-2025 or 478-3389. 

P.H.S. reunion 
committee w meet 

The reunion committee of the Pre­
stonsburg High School classes of 
1918 through 1933 is making plans 
for the "grand" reunion scheduled for 
Saturday, June 5, at May Lodge in 
Jenny Wiley State Park. 

Former Prestonsburg High School 
students who graduated in 1918 
through 1933 and who are interested 
in attending this reunion should con­
tact James B. Goble, HC 66 Box 
1490, Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653, 
or call (606) 874-2325. 

AUen Family Resource 
Center's upcoming events 
•G.E.D. day classes Tuesdays, 9 

a.m.-2 p.m.; and night classes Tues­
days and Thursdays, 6-9 p.m. 

• After school child-care program 
now available from 2:30-5:30 p.m., 
MondaythroughFriday.Callthenew 
number at 874-0621. 

For more information, call the 
Allen Family Resource Center at874-
2165. 

Betsy Layne Resource 
Center's upcoming events 
• May 27: "Quit-smoking wiUl the 

Patch" from 6-7 p.m. A three week 
series 

•G.E.D.dayclasseseach Wednes­
day, 9 a.m.-2 p.m. 

•Quilt classes each Monday, 6-8 
p.m. 

• Exercise program each Tuesday, 
6-8 p.m. 

• Need after-school care for chil­
dren? For more information, call the 
center at 478-5550, or 452-4650. 

The Floyd County Times 

Clark Family Resource 
Center's upcoming events 
• May26: Advisory Council meet­

ing at3 p.m. 
•June4: Spring Carnival, 5-9p.m. 

Sponsored by the extra-curricular 
committee, PTA and the resource 
center 

• June 7, 14, 21: Introduction to 
ComputerClassfor Adultsfrorri6:30-
7:30 p.m. Class-size limited. Must 
plan to attend all three classes. Call 
FRC at886-0815 to register. 

•June28: Summer camp being for 
ages 6-12. Call for details and to 
register. Scholarships available. 

•GED classes from 8:30-11:30 
a.m. each Monday. 

For more information, call there­
source center at 886-0815. 

McDoweU Family Resource 
Center's upcoming events 
• Day and night G .E.D. classes are 

available. Day classes will meet ev­
ery Thursday from 9-11 a.m.; night 
classes every Tuesday and Thursday, 
8-9 p.m. Tutoring is also available 
for those who have their high school 
diplomas or G.E.D.'s and just need 
refresher courses before going on to 
higher education or technical school. 

•After-school care is available for 
school-age children. The hours are 
from 3-6 p.m. for working parents or 
parents attending school. There wilt 
be a $1 charge per hour for each child 
staying in the center. There is no 
charge for any child staying less Ulan 
one hour. 

For more information about these 
activities, call thecenterat377-2678. 

hold monthly Breastfeeding Suppon 
Group meetings. The group will meet 
Friday, May 29, from 10-11 a.m. in 
the third floor conference room at 
Seton Complex. There is no cost and 
everyone is welcome-· even the kids! 
For more information, contact the 
Community Health Education De­
partment at Our Lady of the Way 
Hospital at285-5181, Ext 301. 

Diabetes class 
The Living Well with Diabetes 

class will be held on Thursday, May 
27. The class will be touring Pre­
stonsburg Food City. Everyone is to 
meet in the parking lot at Food City at 
6p.m. 

Bingo 
The Floyd County Fish and Game 

Club on Johns Branch at Maytown 
will be playing Bingo every Sunday 
at2 p.m. Bring the kids. No drinking 
allowed. 

Henry Moore Reunion 
The annual family reunion of de­

scendants of Henry and Nannie 
Hunter Moore will be held at the 
Allen Convention Center on May 29 
and 30. 

Parents' meeting 
Parents of children with disabili­

ties are invited to the Floyd County 
LibraryMay26from tO a.m.-noon to 
ask questions, receive infoiiDation 
on resources, I.E.P.'s, parents rights, 
education, etc. For more informa­
tion, call Joyce, Ky-Spin at439-0312. 

Election of parent 
members w council 

Service officer to assist 
veterans and families 

Eugene Akers, a state service of­
fice for the Department of Kentucky, 
Disabled American Veterans, will be 
upstairs in the Prestonsburg Court­
house from 9 a.m.-1 p.m. Saturday, 
May 29 to assist veterans and Uleir 
dependents with claims due as a re· 
suit of military service. 

4-H Camp Daniel Newsome reunion 

The scheduled date of the election 
forparentsite-based members for the 
up-coming year is May 26at 6 p.m. in 
the school library. Only members of 
the Parent Teacher Association will 
be permitted to cast a vote. 

Spend the the week of July 19-23 The descendants of Daniel New-
at 4-H Camp. Many activities have some of Teaberry will meet for their 
been planned to make this the best second family reunion May 30 at 
campmg year ever. Floyd County Jenny Wiley State Park by the dam's 
will be camping with Boyd and spillway. 
Johnso~ counties at £!te J.M. Feltner Familymembersareaskedtobring 
Me~onal4-H Camp m London (near a covered dish, dessen and beverage. 

Hytkn-DeLong reunion 
The Hyden-Delong reunion will 

beheldMay30,beginningat lOa.m., 
in the Pines building, Jenny Wiley 
State Park. 

Lev1 Jackson State Park). Table service will be furnished. 
Kiwaniallnes luncheon Only 75 applications will be ac- Come early and stay late. A Ha-

Members of the Prestonsburg 
Kiwaniannes are reminded of the 
regular luncheon/meeting to be held 
at May Lodge, Thursday, May 28 at 
12:30. 

cepted, so you need to get your appli- waiian Luau is planned. 
cation and a $58 camp fee in early to Fiscal Court 

daUchanges 

A wards ceremony 
The Young Authors' Awards cer­

emony for 1993 will be held May 27 
at the Wilkinson Stumbo Convention 
Center at Jenny Wiley State Park. A 
reception will be held at 6:30 and all 
young author books will be on dis­
play. Author Michelle Green will be 
the guest speaker at the awards cer · 
emony. 

Parents and the public are invited. 

McDoweU reunion 
A reunion of the McDowell High 

Scl)ool class of 1978 is planned for 
June 18, 19 and 20. If you have not 
been contacted, call Janie Case Tack­
ett at 377-2968 or Hazel Hall 
Boatwright at 874-9378. 

A. C. T.S. fellowship 
Adult Christians Together in 

Singleness (ACfS) willmeetfordin­
ner and fellowship at Peking Chinese 
Restaurant in Pikeville May 29 at 7 
p.m. 

For more information on this and 
other upcoming ACfS activities, call 
874-9844. 

reserve your place. 
Your fee should accompany your 

application. Checks or money orders 
should be made payable to Floyd 
County 4-H Council and mailed to 
the Floyd County Extension Service, 
431 South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, 
Ky. 41653-1365. 

Conf111llation letters will be sent 
out the second week in June. These 
will include such information as 
where and when to meet the bus and 
what to bring to camp. 

Make sure to return your applica­
tion and fee as soon as possible. Call 
886-2668 for more information. 

Maytown Family Resource 
Center's upcoming events 
• Walking Qub meets every Tues­

day and Thursday at the Martin 
ballfield at 6:30p.m. 

•Country and western line dance 
lessons every Monday and Wednes­
day from 3-4 p.m. at the school. In­
structor is Larry Johnson. The les­
sons are free. 

•GED classes are finished and will 
get started back in the fall. Call the 
center to register for fall classes. 

For more information, call 285-
0321. 

Supports children's matinees 
Big Sandy Mining Institute sponsored Jenny Wiley Theatre's Children's 
Matinee performances of Cinderella and Foxfirefor area .chool children. 
The mining institute's sponsorship demonstrates the support and com­
mitment of the mining industry to the arts education of regional youth. 
Pictured are, from right, Burl Scott, President, Big Sandy Mining lnttltute 
presenting a $1,500 donation to Raymond Bradbury, a member of the 
Jenny Wiley Theatre Corporate Blue Ribbon Committee, and Jenny 
Wiley Theatre General Manager and Producer Tedl Vaughan. If your 
school is interested in having a group attend one of these per1ormances, 
call606-886-9274. 

Memorial Day Celebrations 
Buckhorn Lake, General Butler 

and Jenny Wiley State Reson Park. 
Special activities for the ftrst official 
weekend of summer. For more infor­
mation, call toll-free 1-800-255-
PARK. 

OL WH's breastfeeding 
support group continues 

In collaboration with the Big 
Sandy Family and Childbirth Educa­
tion Association, Our Lady of the 
Way Hospital in Martin continues to 

The Floyd County Fiscal court 
meeting date has been changed. Fis­
cal court members will meet Friday, 
May28. 

Bike-A-Thon 
at Allen Park 

A Wheels For Life Bike-A-Thon 
will be held June 6 at the Allen Park 
Walking Track. The event, coordi­
nated by Monica Akers, begins at 4 
and concludes at 7 p.m. Proceeds 
beneftt the St. Jude Children's Hospi­
tal. I fit rains on June 6, the event will 
be rescheduled for June 18. 

June is proclaimed Rivers Month 
Kentuckians aaoss the state are 

being asked to join in a variety of 
activities during June, which has been 
proclaimed Rivers Month by Gov. 
Brereton C. Jones. 

Events are planned to take place 
on and along rivers across the state 
throughout the month. Activities in­
clude: Rockcastle River Day, with a 
six-mile canoe trip, picnic, live mu­
sic, games, tour of environmental 
demonstrations,andotherfunonJune 
12; the Four Rivers Folk Festival in 
Trigg County at TV A's Land Be­
tween the Lakes recreation area in 
western Kentucky on June 12 and 13, 
with traditional folk and bluegrass 
music featuring performers Bill Mon­
roe and Tom.Chapin, as well as dem­
onstrations and workshops; and a 
wide variety of canoe trips and floats, 
hikes, and river bank cleanups, in­
cluding the Ohio River Sweep on 
June 19 and the Kentucky River 
sweep on June 26. 

Both the Ohio River Sweep and 
the Kentucky River Sweep are an­
nual events that draw thousands of 

volunteers to clean up tons of trash 
and debris from the banks of the 
entire lengths of both rivers. Trash 
picked up bas included Ule usual ar­
ray of plastic milk jugs and soft drink 
cans but has also yielded old appli­
ances, car bodies, and even an entire 
telephone booth. 

The month-long recognition of the 
many aspects of rivers Ulat have 
served the people of the Common­
wealth is intended to give Kentuck­
ians a chance to appreciate their riv­
ers and streams. Attention will be 
focused on bow much Ule state's riv­
ers and streams add to the overall 
quality of life. Community efforts 
will be directed toward protecting the 
scenic, environmental. recreational 
and cultural values of the SL:1te's river 
resources. 

Acalendarofeventsand informa­
tion on organizing a river event in 
your own community are available 
from Morgan Jones, Kentucky Divi­
sion ofWater, 14 Reilly Road, Frank­
fort, Ky. 40601, telephone (502) 564-
3410. 

Card OfThanks 
The family of Willis Sexton wishes to gratefully 

acknowledge the thoughtfulness and kindness of 
friend's, relatives, and neighbors in the loss of our 
loved one. Thanks to all who sent food, flowers, 
prayers or spoke words of comfort. We are especially 
grateful to the clergymen Rondal Hayes and Jeff 
Prater; to the Hueysville Church singers; the 
Sheriff's Department for their assistance in traffic 
control; and the Hall Funeral Home for their kind 
and professional service. 

THE FAMILY OF WILLIS SEXTON 

Resort ministry to 
start atJ enny Wiley 
State Park 

hy Polly Ward 
Times Feature Writer 

This Sunday will mark the begin­
ning of an 11-weekJennyWileyState 
Parkreson ministry sponsored by Ule 
FLrst Baptist Church at Allen. 

The ministry will consist of morn­
ing worship services led by pastor 
French I Iarmon at the Josie Harkins 
school building near the park camp­
ground. The services will be held 
from 8:30 to 9:30 each Sunday from 
May 30 until August 8, and will fea­
ture special music. 

Coffee, juice and pastries will be 
served before the services with Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Watts, members of 
First Baptist, acting as hosts. Al­
though the ministry is geared prima­
rily for guests at the park', everyone is 
invited. Dress is informal. 

Correction 
A recent obituary listing of Roy 

Earney contained several errors. The 
name of his sisters, Aida Coury and 
Aleda Bengal weremisspelled. Also 
his brother Raymond lives at Kane, 
not at Kene. The names of two pall­
bearers, Dave Klinedinst and Mike 
Nunemaker were also misspelled. 

Information on the obituary was 
printed as it was received. 

FLOYD COUNTY 
CATHOLICS 
WELCOME YOU 

ST. MARTHA CHURCH 
Water Gap 

Masses: 7 p.m., Sat.; 11 a.m. Sunday 
Religious Education Classes: 

Sunday, 9:45-10:45 a.m. 
Inquiry Class, Mon., 7 p.m. 

Pastor: Father Joseph Muench 
Phone 874-9526 

ZION 
DELIVERANCE 

CHURCH 
WAYLAND, KENTUCKY 

Sunday School 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

Wednesday Prayer Service 7 p.m. 
Saturday Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

ADA MOSLEY 
PASTOR 

THE SMITH DELIVERANCE 
from Lima, Ohio 

,-------will be at------, 

DANIELS CREEK 
BAPTIST FELLOWSHIP 

CHURCH OF GOD 
May 29th at 7:00 p.m. 

REV. EARNEST SMITII WILL BE PREACHING 

Everyone Welcome! 
DAVID SHEPHERD, Pastor 

REVIVAL 
Lackey 

Freewill Baptist Church 
Lackey, Ky. 

Starting May 28 
7:00 p.m. nightly 

( CLARANCE COMBS, Speaker ) 

Everyone Welcome! 

Rev. Garfield Potter 
and The United 

Methodist Church of 
Martin, Ky. invite 

you to a Bell Tower 
dedication, Sunday, 

June6, 1993beginning 
at 11:00 a.m. 

There will be a candlelight service for the 
deceased church members. Refreshments 
will follow. Please bring your family and 

honor us with your presence. 
Martin United Methodist Church 

NEW CREATION 
FAMILY BOOKSTORE 
~ri~€~~ 

• Pastor's Discount 
• Bibles 
• Books 
• Soundtracks 
• Cassettes 
• Discs 
• Rental Videos 
• Greeting Cards 
• Sunday School & VBS, material, etc. 

Hours: M·F., 10 a.m.-5 p.m.; Saturday, 10 a.m.-2 p.m. 
886-3499 

Formerly the Shield of Faith 
in Prestonsburg, under new management 



• 

Seventh grade student to be 
honored in TIP ceremony 

The Duke University Talent Iden­
tification Program (TIP) is sponsor­
ing a Grand Recognition Ceremony 
to honor some of the brightest sev­
enth graders in the United States. On 
June 7, atthe Duke University Chapel 
in Durham, North Carolina. Neil 

Smith crowned 
queen 

Leigh Ann Smith, daughter of Rus­
sell and Sue Smith of Dana, was 
crowned as this year's Pikeville 
College Spring Formal Queen. 
Leigh Ann Is a junior at Pikeville 
College and Is majoring In English. 

Moore Jr., who attends McDowell 
Junior High, will be recognized for 
his outstanding academic achieve­
ment 

Moore is the 12-year-old son of 
Neil and Sharon MooreofMcDowell. 
He has won numerous academic 
awards including various Governor's 
Cup math, science and quick recall 
awards. 

Dr. Ronald Hoffman, winner of 
the 1981 Nobel Prize in Chemistry, 
will be the keynote speaker. Hoffman, 
a native of Zloczow, Poland, sur.: 
vived the Nazi occupation of his coun­
try and arrived in the United States in 
1949. Hoffman has received nwner­
ous academic honors and has written 
both popular and scholarly articles 
on science and other subjects. 

Students invited to the ceremony 
earned scores on the Scholastic Apti­
tude Test (SAl) or the American 
College Testing Assessment (AC1) 
higher than 65 percent of college­
bound seniors as part of TIP's annual 
Talent Search. Of the almost 62,000 
students who were identified in the 
1992-93 Talent Search, only 2,173 
qualified for the honor. 

Moore will also be honoredJ une 3 
at Western Kentucky University at a 
TIP recognition for the 661 Ken­
tucky students identified by the an­
nual search . 

Memorial Day blood drive 
gets underway at blood center 

The Kiwanis and Rotary Clubs of 
Floyd County invite the public to 
help save lives this Memorial Day. 
The annual Civic Club Challenge will 
be held May 25-27 at the Prestons­
burg Donor Center. 

Memorial Day is a time of na­
tional blood shortage. The blood cen­
ter needs 200 donors every day to 
maintain a safe and adequate blood 
supply.Evenmoredonorsareneeded 
on holidays because the number of 
automobile accidents increase but 
fewer people donate. 

IRS cuts back 
office hours 

Now that the filing season is over, 
the Internal Revene Service is cutting 
back the office hours for walk-in tax­
payer service in some ofits Kentucky 

Statistics show that the majority 
of Americans will need blood some­
time during their lives. It could be 
someone close to you who will need 
blood this weekend. _, 

Do your part and donate! Donors 
will receive a free T-sbirt and be 
eligible to win prizes provided by 
local businesses and the civic clubs. 
The donor center is located in the 
Municipal Building on North Lake 
Drive. ThehoursareTuesday, 11-7, 
Wednesday and Thursday, 10-6. 

The Floyd County Times 

Fortunate winner 
Lottery winner Hayden Burke (left) plans to buy his dreamhouse. Dale 
Compton (right) received $1000 for selling the winning ticket. Also 
pictured is Lottery president Brian Potter. 

Floyd man, local store owner 
cash in with lottery win 

A Weeksbury man is one hundred 
thousand dollars richer after recently 
winning theKenlUcky Lottery's Cash 
5 game. Hayden Burke, correctly 
matched all five numbers for the April 
13th drawing. 

The lucky numbers were 13-16-
27-28-32. Bwke spent five dollars at 
Compton's Quik Stop and let the 
computer quick pick the winning 
ticket for him. 

"My wife Sharon and I are going 
to use our winnings to buy that dream 
housewehavealwayswanted,"forty­
year-old Hayden Burke told Lottery 
officials. "I can't believe this has 
happened to me!" 

The Burke's are regular lottery 
players who only spend about $10 a 
week playing the Lottery's entertain­
ing games. The Burke's were pre­
sented with a check for $68,000 (af­
ter taxes) by Kentucky Lottery Presi­
dent Brian Potter. 

Potter, a native of Elkhorn City, 
Kentucky was especially pleased by 
the Floyd County good fortune. "I 
love to see folks from the mountains 
of my native eastern Kentucky win," 
said Potter. 

In a year and a half, the Cash 5 _ 
game bas handed out $100,000 cash 

to more than a hundred people. The 
game's theme is "Win a small for­
tune when you play Cash 5!" 

In addition to the nonnal sales 
commission be receives, Floyd 
County businessman Dale Compton 
received a check for $1000 for sell­
ing the lucky ticket. Kentucky Lot­
tery retailers receive a 1 percent bo­
nus of whatever the value is of a 
winning grand prize ticket when they 
sell it 

Compton joined Hayden Burke 
on the drive to Louisville. 

1988 
Thunderbird 

Turbo 
Black, sunroof, Loaded 

Only 
f!1 offices. 

PLAYTEX® 
SUMMER 
SALE 

$7,995 

• 

The Pikeville office will have no 
assistance available until next filing 
season. 

Shortened office hours are effec­
tive immediately and continue 
through December 31. 

IN OBSERVANCE 
OF - -

MEMORIAL DAY 

The 
Floyd County 
Times Office 

WILL BE 
CLOSED 

Monday, May 31 

DEADLI~E 
CHANGES 

FOR THE 

JUNE 2 EDITION 
ARE AS FOLLOWS: 

LIFESTYLES, 
FARM AND FAMILY 

Noon Thursday, 
May 27th. 

ARTICLES 
WITH PHOTOS 
Noon Thursday, 

May 27th. 

DEADLINES FOR 
ADVERTISING, 

CLASSIFIED WORD 
AND DISPLAY 

Thursday, May 27th 
at 5 p.m. 

Buy one, get the second* at 

1/2PRICE 
*Of equal or lesser value. Wise Buys not included. 

Today through june 30 save on all your 
favorite Playtex® styles (except Wise Buys). 

For a flattering fit and comfort you 
can count on- it's Playtex®. 

Try on any 
Eighteen Hour® Bra 

Receive a phone card for 
5 minutes of long distance calling.* 

• 
Buy any 

Eighteen Hour® Bra 
Receive a phone card for 

18 minutes of long distance calling.* 
*Limited time only. 5 minute phone cards available while supplies last; 

one per customer. Valid for calls within the continental U.S .. 

Pikeville-Weddington Plaza • Paintsville-Mayo Plaza 
S. Williamson-South Side Mall 

IIIZ•fil 
Use Watson 's convenient layaway plus 4 great ways to charge. 

1989 Toyota 
Corolla SR-5 

2-Dr., Loaded- auto, 
power sunroof, 

The best in town 
Local-one owner 

1987 Cavalier 
Z-24 

Low milage, 5-spd. 
Priced low at 

$4,995 

Bike-A-Thon 
June 11 at Allen to 
benefit St. Judes 

St.JudeChildrcn'sResearch Hos­
pital has announced Lhat Monica 
Akers hall agreed to be the coordina­
tor of the St. Jude Children's Re­
search Hospital Bike-A-Thon in Allen 
on June I I. 

St.JudcChildrcn 'sRcsearch Hos­
pital was founded by entertainer, 
Danny Thomas. The institution 
opened its doors to the public i n 1962 
to com bat catastrophic diseases which 
afflict children. St. Jude Hospital is 
non-secretarian, non-discriminatory 
and covers all costs of care beyond 
Lhosc reimbursed by insurance. 

InKY, 362children and their fami­
lies have gone to St. Jude Hospital 
and received total medical care for a 
catastrophic illness. 

Wednesday, May 26,1993 All 

Until now, breast cancer clairMCI 
more lives among women. Now 
because more women smoke, lung 
cancer has the top spot for taking 
llves-50,000 every year. Progreu 
llkethlshasgottostop.1-800-ACS 

New 14• wide 
Pay only 

$750down 
$178 per month 

HYLTON HOMES 
of lvel 

Call1-800-264-4835 
for details. 

9~~~e~ 
All our friends are invited to a 90th 
birthday celebration for our mother 

MOLLIE A. PRATER 
When-Sunday, May 30th, 2 p.m. 
Where-Home of Mary K. Music 

318 North Central Avenue 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

Given by her children 
Robert, Wesley, Derral, Scott Prater, Mary K. Music 

and Ruth Prater, daughter-in-law 

1988 Chevy 
Sprint 

Auto, AJC, 40 M.P.G. 
Very Low Miles 

$3,995 

1985 Nissan 
Maxima Wagon 

Great car- all power, 
A HARD TO FIND 

AUTO 

ss,995 
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" THE SAVINGS ARE EASY'{O SEEI THE PINGS ARE HARD TO FIND. • . 
SiKe ow Hll s.le Jt""etl ,_If STOCK# STOCK# STOCK# 

DIM CAPita SOUl OLDS DB.TA SOl: I" FUU SIZEIUZEI 31043 

w::s_ ~ of th """'"' 
DIM CAPita SOlD IXDSDELTA 3DB.107 

• • s .We beo 1olfl. ltd OI.DSDilTA 308.101 FULL SIZE llUCI SOlD 
,,, ... JtiJ ... lth , OIMCOISICA SOlD OLDSDELTA 308.109 FUU SIZE JIUCI 3T915 

OIMCOISICA SOlD FUU SIZE Jill« 31104 ,.,,.,.,.,.. OIMCOISICA SOli wwo ~SOl: If FULL SIZE llUCI SOI:Jt 

Fletcher & SJO(trl OIMCOISICA S018 FUU SIZE Jill« 31'061 EASY LUMINA SEDAN 3SOJ;O OlD$91 139131 FULL SIZE llUCI SOI:D 

Super LUMINA SEDAN 3SOJ;O OIEVY CAVAUEI 3CAV237 FUU SIZE Jill« 3T976 
THE-LOT LUMINA SEDAN 3SOJ;O OIMCAYAUEl 'I OlD 510 PICKUP SO tit FULL SIZE llU(I SOt)) 

LUMINA SEDAN 3SOI;O OIMCAYAUEl lOUt 510 PICKUP SO lit FUU SIZE Jill« 31752 

~ LUMINA SEDAN 3S010 510PICIUP S01:8 FUU SIZE Jill« 31820 
LUMINA SEDAN 3S010 OlDS AOIIEVA 3AOt07 510PICKUP SOt It FULL SIZE llUCI SOli) 
LUMINA SEDAN 3S010 OI.DS AOIIEVA 3AOt12 510 PICKUP SOli" FULL SIZE llUCI SOI:O 

OLDS ACHIEVA SOI:D 510PICKUP SOt It FULL SIZE liUCI SOI:JJ 

Hunt I.MIIIA EliiO SEJAII 3WM167 OLDS ACHIEVA SOlD S10 PICKUP SOlD FULL SIZE llUCI SOJ:Jj 
WMIO 8110 SEDAN 3SOJ;O FULL SIZE llUCI SOI:O 

ony C11stle WMIO 8110 SEDAN 3SOI;O BUI(IsmAU SOtJj Sl04X4 3T963 FUU SIZE Jill« 31176 
LUMINA 8110 SEIWt 3SOI;O lOla smAll 3511.47 Sl04X4 3T966 CARS Mattingly LUMINA 8110 SEIWt 3SOJ;O JUICismAJI 3511.49 SID4X4 3T961 BRAY ADA SOlD 
LUMINA BIIO SEDAN 3SOI;O 510414 so to' 

TRUCKS D11nny Robinson LUMINA BIIO SEDAN 3S010 BUICIIEGAL SOlD 510414 SOlD' GEOliACKEI SOt)) 
LUMIO BJIO SEIWt 3S010 SID4X4 3T93t GEDI'IIZII 3PZM21 

Bobby Hurt JUICI CEIIRIIJ 3<EN66 SID4X4 3T942 GEOSTOIM 3STM62 ARRIVING LUMINA BIIO COUPE 3SOI;O IUICI CENTURY S01:8 510414 SOlD' GEDSTOIM 35TM63 

L11rry Fields LUMINA BJIO COUPE 3SOI;O BUICK CENTURY SOI:d 510414 SOid tifOSTOIM 3STM6S DAILY ,_IIA ElMO COfll'f 3LUM139 510414 SOJ]O~ GEDSTOIM 35TM66 

Terry_ Smith LUMINA BIIO COUPE 3SOJ;O IUICII.ESAIIE SOlD GEDSTOIM 3STM67 
• LUMINA BIIO COUPE 3SOJ;O IUICllSAIIE Stlld 510BLAZEI SOl] It 

Will R11tclilf ,_IIA EUIO COUI'f 3LUM131 IUICI USAIIE 3L574 510BLAZEI SOiO' 
UUAIIIA EUIO COfll'f 3LUM1S6 IUICllSAIIE SiJtJj SIDilAZEI 31935 TRADE-INS Bobby Burchett LUMINA BIIO COUPE 3SOtO 510BLAZEI SOl] If Come ••• for BUICK PAll AVENUE SOlD 510BWEI sot~ 

WELCOME LUMINAZ-34 3S010 510 BLAZEI SOld 
yourselll Hurryl LUMINAZ-34 3S010 OLDSCUTWS SOld 510BIAZB SOI;O' 

SJDIUZII 31042 
Z-24 CAVAUEl :so to CUTWSOEIA '80tli 510BIAZEI SOl] If Tlley're mo11ing ' 
Z-24 CAVAUEI SOI:O CUTWSOEIA 'SOld S10BIAZB SOl] • . 

QfTlASSOEIA JOtD 510BIAZB SOio' 
lOAD MASTEl SOI:O CUTWSOEIA SOld ouf fasfl Saltptbs..W. 

llllllliDrill'ws,.., 
lrwfcgMe.Ta& 
biie ,., lllchletL 



Patton,Robinson, 
Stuntbo will represent 
Rebels at state track nteet 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

It has been a season of hard work 
for the Allen Central men's track and 
field team. But all the hard work has 
paid off for three individuals and two 
relay teams as the state track and field 
meet is just around the comer. 

Kevin Patton, Shawn Robinson 
and Kevin Stumbo will represent 
Allen Central at state competition 
this Friday at UK's Shively Field. 

Also making the trip will be the 
400-meter and 1600-meter relay 
teams of Coach Dewey Jamerson. 

tra1 coach. "It was certainly a pleas­
ant surprise for the boys." 

Fairview took the top spot in the 
regional meet with 130 points. After 
that, the next three teams were ex­
tremely close. 

PikevilJe placed second with 89 
points and Cordia took third, two 
points ahead of Allen Central, with 
83 points. The Rebels finished with 
81 points. 

In the preliminary round held on 
Friday, Allen Central placed two in 
every final. The showing was good 

fill for fourth place overall in the re­
gional meet. 

Allen Central lost points when 
Josh Patton missed running the two­
mile because of sickness. The Rebels 
scored in every event with the excep­
tion of high jump and shot put. 

Patton will represent Allen Cen­
tral in two events at the state meet. He 
took first place by setting a new school 
record in the men's triple jump. Pat­
ton was measured at 39' 1" which is a 
personal best for the strong running 
back for the football team. 

• 

• 

AllenCentral'smen'sprogram has 
been in a rebuilding stage after losing 
a lot of talent from last year. But 
Coach Jamerson's squad has worked 
hard and shown a great deal of im­
provement in the last four weeks. 

"Going to Boyd County, Coach 
(Forrest) Hughes and I were talking 
about who could go to the state meet 
for us," explained Jamerson. "We 
figured Kevin (Patton) and Shawn 
(Robinson). ThatwasiLButitshows 
you how much I know." 

While Jamerson and Hughes may 
have misfigured those that will travel 
to Lexington this Friday, the mistake 
is a good one and a happy one. 

"We fmished as a team at about 
where we figured we would but we 
did not figure we would fmish as 
close as we did." said the Allen Ceo-

Patton also established a new 
school record in the men's long jump 
with a distance of 19' 11 ", good for 
second place. 

Gary Webb placed ftfth overall in 
teh triple jump with a leap of 33' 5". 
Webb had a leap of 5 feet in the high 
jump event 

Shawn Robinson's toss of 117' 9" 
was good for first place and 10 points 
in the discus. Levi Wells placed fifth 
for the Rebels. Robinson will move 
on to the state meet at Lexington. 

Kevin Stumbo, according to his 
coach, was the big surprise for the 
Rebels distance runners. Stumbo 
placed second in the men's 800-meter 

(See Rebels, B 2) 

Oden captures four first 
place finishes in regionals 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

What a season for the Wheelwright 
track and field team! 

The Trojans continued making 
noise in the regional track and field 
meet at Bell County last weekend. 

DONNIE DANIELS 
Wheelwright Coach 

Speedster Muntu Oden continues 
to wow 'em with his performance and 
he showed why he was deserving of 
being named Most Valuable Player 
in the EKMC track and field confer­
ence. Oden placed frrst in four events 
and will represent Wheelwright High 
School in the state meet this coming 
Friday and Saturday at UK's Shively 
Field. 

Also traveling to Lexington this 
weekend will be Greg Johnson and 
Ricky Little. Johnson placed second 
in the high jump and Little was sec­
ond in the 1600-meter run. 

Oden took fli'St place in the 100-
meterrun with a time of 11.21. Team­
mateRyanJohnsonrana 12.71 in the 
race. 

Oden then got in the starting blocks 
for the 200-meter run and his 23.05 
was good enough for first place. 
Johnson posted his personal best time 
with a 24.94, good for fifth place. 

InOden'sspeciality,herana 15.78 
forfrrstplaceinthemen's 110hurdles. 
John Hall took ftfth place at 20.11. 

In the men's 300 hurdles it was a 
fourth first place finish for Oden with 
a time of 42.29. 

Qualifying for the four events in 
the state meet seems to have created 
a problem for Wheelwright coach 
Donnie Daniels. 

"We don't know what to do with 
him," said Daniels. "We don't know 
whether to scratch him in one of the 
four and let him go to win the other 
three." 

Because the four events are close 
together time-wise, Daniels feels that 
it is to much for Oden. 

"Muntu has done great for us this 
year," said Daniels. All these kids 
have done a great job. They are a 
great bunch of kids." 

Wheelwright placed third in the 
meet with Bath County taking first 

(See Oden, B8) 

Reed headed for state meet 
afterplacingfirstinregionals 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

She is just a sophomore at Betsy 
Layne High School but she has al­
ready made her mark in track eve~ts. 

Betsy Layne's Nikki Reed Im­
proved her finish last year in regional 
competition--taking h~me f~st_place 
and a regional champ1onsh1p m the 
women's 400-meter run at Breathitt 
County last Friday. 

"I'm just glad I won," said R~ of 
her victory. "It is just from pracucmg 
a lot." 

The hard work for the sprinter 
paid off after working everyday to 
about 4:30p.m. Reed, like most sprint­
ers, are successful because they are 

(See Reed, B 2) 

JOHN DEROSSETT 

Betsy Layne coach 

;:·.· 

Ryan Ortega Is greeted by teammates after he clubbed a second Inning grand slam last Saturday to help lead 
the Prestonsburg Blackcatsto a 8-6wln over the Betsy layne Bobcats and the 58th Dlstrlcttltle. The two teams 
met at the Don Daniels Athletic Complex at Allen Central (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Prestonsburg District Champs 
Ortega's blast powers Blackcats to district title 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The Prestonsburg Blackcats had 
several heroes as they captured the 
58th District High School Baseball 
Tournament last Saturday at the Don 
Daniels Athletic Complex at Allen 
Central. 

The Blackcats of coach RusseJl 
Shepherd edged a good Betsy Layne 
Bobcat team 8-6 in taking the title 
game. 

Hero number one could have been 
Ryan Ortega for his rare display of 
home run power. Ortega hammered a 
towering drive over the left field fence 
in the second inning that staked the 
Blackcats to a 4-3 lead. 

Hero number two may have been 
Seth Hyden, whose timely double in 
the third drove in three runs as Pre­
stonsburg opened up a 8-3 lead. 

But the real hero had to be fresh­
man Jason Hackworth, who was the 
winning pitcher for the Blackcats with 
seven very impressive innings. The 
kid has done that all year for Pre­
stonsburg. In fact, he owned a previ­
ous victory over Betsy Layne during 
the regular season. 

After Betsy Layne scored their 
fourth run of the game in the sixth 
inning with runners at second and no 
one out, Hackworth did his best pitch­
ing. 

Showing a lot of maturity for a 
player not long out of Little League, 
Hackworth got Chris Potter on a fly 
ball to left, Brandon Castle on an out 
to right field and enticed Shawn New­
some to bounce out to short to end the 
inning. 

The inning proved to be big for 
Hackworth and the Blackcats because 
Betsy Layne struck for two runs in 
the bottom of the seventh that would 
have tied the game had they been able 

to score the runners in the sixth. 
Hackworth fanned five batters in 

going the distance. He allowed six 
runs on four hits and three walks. 
Hackworth was called on one balk 
(his fourth of the year) and he hit one 
batter. 

Shannon Newsome went to the 
hill for the Bobcats at the start and 
lasted the first two an<l a third inning 
in suffering the loss. Newsome, one 
of the Betsy Layne's ace hurlers, had 
problems finding the plate and was 
constantly wild high and outside. 

Derrick Newsome came on to get 
the fmal two outs of the third inning 
and was tough on the Blackcats as 
they could only manage one hit over 
the fmal four and two-thirds innings. 
Newsome retired the final 10 men he 
faced in the Prestonsburg lineup. 

Betsy Layne jumped all over 
Hackworth in the first inning after 
the Blackcats went down in the fli'St 
inning despite Sean Damron's fli'St 
inning single. 

Barry Collins reached on an error 
at shortstop to start the frrst for Betsy 
Layne. Derrick Newsome laid down 
a sacrifice bunt to move Collins into 
scoring position. 

Collins scored on Scott Ousley's 
base hit Catcher Bud Kidd beat out 
an infield hit that Damron made a 
great stop on going to his left at 
shortstop. Ousley moved to third on 
the play and Kidd stole second to put 
runners at second and third. 

Barry Clark drilled a liner to cen­
ter, scoring Ousley and Kidd for a 3-
0 Betsy Layne lead. Hackworth got 
Shannon Newsome and Potter on 
strikes to end the inning. 

It was a prosperous second for 
Prestonsburg as Thomas Ratti fflined 
a double to right center. Robbie 
Risner, the dcs~natcd hitter, was hit 
byapitchan<fbOth runners moved up 

on a sacrifice bunt by Jason Crisp. 
Newsome walked Cory Reitz to load 
thebases,bringingOrtegatotheplate. 
OrtegacaughtNewsome's fastball and 
deposited the ball over the left field 
fence for a 4-3 Prestonsburg lead. 

Hackworth retired the Bobcats in 
order in the second but Prestonsburg 
struck for four more in the third for a 
8-3 game. A one-out walk to Risner, 
Crisp's base hit and an RBI single by 
Reitz made it a 5-3 game. Newsome 
walked Ortega to load the bases for 
Seth Hyden who cleared the bags 
with a long double over the 
centerfielder's head. 

Derrick Newsome then replaced 
Shannon Newsome on the mound 
and Prestosnburg was held in check 
the rest of the way. 

Betsy Layne made it 8-4 with a 
run in the sixth on a leadoff walk to 
Kidd and a hit batsman. Kidd scored 
on Shannon Newsome's base hit with 
Clark moving to third. The ball was 
overthrown at third base and Clark, 
fearing that he had missed the bag, 
returned to retag and was not able to 
score on the overthrow. Hackworth 
worked out of the jam with only one 
run scored against him. 

The Bobcats made it interesting in 
the bottom of the sixth after Prestons­
burgwentoutin order in thetopofthe 
inning. 

A one out ground rule double off 
the bat ofDerrickN ewsome to center 
started the inning. With two out, Kidd 
blasted his two-run home run for a 8-
6 game. Hackworth got Clark on a 
pop fly to the catcher for the final out. 

For Coach Shepherd, what he saw 
from his ball club was pleasing. 

"We hit the ball welJ," he said, 
"the best we have all year. We had a 
good defensive game as well as hit-

(See Prestonsburg, B 5) 

McDowell 
self destructs 
in sixth falling 
to East Carter 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The McDowell Lady Daredevils 
softball team was holding their own 
against East Carter in the fli'St round 
of the girls' softball regional tourna­
ment. 

Holding their own, that is, until 
the sixth inning when they could not 
catch a fly ball or stop a grounder. 
The result was a 10-run sixth for East 
Carter and a 18-9 whipping of the 
Lady Daredevils. 

Fourteen batters paraded to the 
plate for the Lady Raiders as they 
saw fly ball after fly ball land safely. 

Tara Bush started the East Carter 
sixth with a base hit but was forced at 
second on Angie Shemi's ground ball 
to pitcher Lisa Hobson. Lisa Church 
was safe at frrst on a fielder's choice 
and Misty Deerfield rocketed a shot 
for a three-run home run to make it a 
11-6 game. After Jodi Pennington 
forced Amber Pennington, who had 
singled, at second, she came around 
to score on Jessica Hall's triple. Angie 
Sparks doubled and Tracy Roseberry 
singled home Sparks and she scored 
on Heather Marshall's liner to right 
field. 

The inning continued as Bush 
made her second appearance of the 
inning and promptly delivered an RBI 
single. Shemi reached on an error at 
shan field and Lisa Church did the 
same. Kristy Mullins caught 
Deerfield's fly ball to end the wild 
sixth inning. 

McDowell mounted a mild come­
back in the top of the seventh inning 
but fell short. Rachel Howell singled 
to start the rally and Crissy Tackett 
walked on four pitches as Bush had 
problems getting the ball down 
enough. 

Lisa Hobson, who had tripled three 
times, Jined a base hit to right, scor­
ing Howell and Tackett. Hobson went 
all the way to third on a two-base 
error in the outfield. Hobson scored 
on Lisa Brown's RBI single. Susan 
Stephens had a one-out single but 
was left stranded. 

(See McDowell, B 8) 

Tackett, Miller 
qualify for state; 
Wheelwright first 

KEITH SMALLWOOD 
Wheelwright coach 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

It was a Wheelwright High School 
frrst 

Lori Tackett and Carrie Miller will 
represent Wheelwright High School 
as the fli'St women's track and field 
participants in the state meet in Lex­
ington this coming Friday at the Uni­
versity of Kentucky's Shively Field . 

Tackett qualifed for the state meet 
by placing second in the Bell County 
regional meet this past Saturday af­
ternoon. Miller took second place in 
the women's long jump. 

Tackett was measured at 79' 10" 
in the discus while Miller measured 
in at 14' 6" in the long jump. 

Wheel wright also took third place 
in the women's discus with Tiffany 
Compton's throw of 77 feet. Tonya 
Floyd was a sixth place finisher in the 
long jump with a leap of 12' 10". 
Compton placed third in the shot put 
with a toss of 26' 4". 

The overall finish of the Wheel­
wright women's team brought a smile 
to the face of coach Keith Small wood . 

"I am pleased as punch," said the 

(See Wheelwright, B 3) 
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Allen Central sends trio to state meet at UK meet 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

Wade, Wiley and Floyd. 
Sounds like a law fmn. 
This threesome of the Allen Cen­

tral Runnin' Rebels women's track 
and field team will represent their 
school in the court of the state track 
and field meet in Lexington this week­
end. 

Jessica Wade, Jenny Wiley and 
Crystal Floyd have been the experi­
enced runners for coaches Dewey 
Jamerson and Forrest Hughes all sea­
son. All three won first or second 
places in regional events at Boyd 
County this past weekend. 

Also making the trip will be two 
flrst place relay teams. 

Wade took first place in three 
events and is a strong contender for a 
state title. She won first place in the 
women's 800-metcr run with a time 
of 2:51.27. Teammate Floyd placed 
fourth in the race with her time of 
2:55.55. 

F1oyd,afterrunningthe400-meter 
run, ran the 800 and her coach said 

that it affected hcrperfonnance in the 
800. 

"She was killed after running the 
400," he said. "She was just tired 
out." 

Wade came pack and JX>Sted a 
time of 6:09.58 in the 1600-meter 
run, which was good enough for a 
frrst place finish. In the 3200-meter 
run (two-mile), Wade took first place, 
finishing with a time of 14:22.17. 
Mary Baldridge placed fourth in the 
two-mile run, clocked at 16:29.10. 

"The way Mary ran in the 3200 
was good for us," said Jamerson. 
"The 3200 was an imJX>rtant race for 
us and finishing frrstand fourth helped 
us. Winning the race and placing 
fourth helped us to break even with 
Fairview." 

Wiley and Floyd finished one­
two in the women's 400-meter dash. 
Wiley set a new school record with a 
time of 1:03.03 for first place. Floyd 
recorded a time of 1:05.04 for second 
place. Both will advance to the state 
meet. 

Wiley established yet another 
school record in the 200-mcter dash. 

Rebels--------- (Continued from B 1) 

run. He had a time of 2:11.32, which 
was six seconds faster than his previ­
ous time. 

"Kevin knew that he had to beat 
the kid from Cordia in order to place," 
said Jamerson. "In the last tum and in 
thestraightaway,heran like he never 
ran before.lt was good race for Kevin. 
It's the frrst time he's done that" 

The men's 400-meter relay team 
placed second after finishing third 
originally. Fairview, who placed sec­
ond in the race, was disqualified (for 
unknown reasons) and Allen Central 
was elevated to the second place spot. 

"Someone came over to me and 
told me that Fairview had been 
disqualifed in the race and that we 
were the second place team," said 
Jamerson. "I don't know why, but 
who cares. We're going to the state. 

"Our kids ran a real strong race. 
The frrst handoff was terrible. Kevin 
Patton is the frrst runner and he has to 
hand off to Kevin Allen. Kevin started 
early and had to stop and wait for the 
stick, but still ran a strong race." 

The real shocker for the Allen 
Central coach came when his 1600-
meter relay team took the number 
one spot with a time of 3:52.8, a new 
school record. 

"It was a shocker," said Jamerson. 
"Their best before was at four min­
utes. This time they run it under four 
minutes and that is the shocking 
thing." 

What motivated them? 
"They wanted Kenny (Scarberry), 

who is the only senior of the four, to 
go to the state meet. They won be­
cause they were a group of kids that 
was thinking of others. 

"You should have seen the look 
on their faces when they won," stated 
Jamerson. "They were hugging each 
other. It almost made me cry. 

"If someone had came to me and 
told me that my 1600-meter relay 
team was going to place flrst in the 
region I would have laughed in their 
face and probably would have hit 
them for lying to me." 

The team consisted of Chris 
Halbert, Kenny Scarberry, Dan 
Stumbo and Estill Stumbo. 

The 3200-meter relay team just 
missed qualifying for the state meet 
by 15 meters. The Allen Central team 
placed third overall with a time of 
9:17.3. The foursome consisted of 
Todd Howard, Kenny Scarberry, 
Kevin Stumbo and Dan Stumbo. 

Jason Samons took fourth place in 
the men's 100-meterrun. Samons had 
a time of 11.98. Kevin Allen ran the 
race and finished with a time of 12.23. 

Samons placed sixth overall in the 
men's 200-meter run. He JX>Sted a 
time of 24.59. Kevin Patton did not 
place in the run but had a time of 
24.92. 

Curtis Webb ran the men's BOO­
meters and had a time of 2:35.40. 

Josh Patton and Howard finished 
five and six in the men's 1600-meter 
run. Patton took fifth place with a 
time of 5:14.55 and Howard JX>Sted a 
time of 5:20.20. 

In the grueling 3200-meter run, 
Howard turned in a time of 12:02.29 
for fifth place. 

Nick Halbert won the sixth place 
award for his time of 19.11 in the 110 
hurdles. Steven Akers ran inatl9.67. 

In the 300 hurdles, Estill Stumbo 
took fourth place with a time of 4 7 .15. 
Halbert was clocked at47.50. 

In the field events, Dave Gilliam 
had a toss of 34' 11" in the shot put. 
Ronnie Samons recorded a throw of 
36'7". 

Jamerson is looking already to 
next year's squad and figures to be 
even stronger next season. 

Squeeze the ball! 
Betsy Layne's Chris Potter takes an Infield pop up In the championship 
game of the boys' 58th District baa.ball tournament at Allen Central 
Saturday. The Bobcats fell to the Prestonsburg Blackcata 8-6 In the title 
game. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

She came in at 28.32, good for third 
place. 

"This race was a big surprise," 
said Jamerson. "JennyJX>Sted the fifth 
best time in the finals." 

The 1600-meter relay team took 
top honors as they were clocked at 
4:42.7 in winning frrst place. The 
team consisted ofFloyd, Lisa Stumbo, 
Dreama Isaac and Wiley. 

"It was our typical race," said 
Jamerson. "We would be behind, 
Crystal would bring us back and Jenny 
would win it for us." 

In the women's 3200-meter re­
lays, Floyd, Wiley, Wade and Anne 
Harvey had linle trouble in blowing 
out to a big lead and sustaining it for 
frrst place. 

"Jenny ran the first leg and it was 
over at the start," said the Allen Cen­
tral coach. The foursome JX>Sted a 
time of 11:36.3 in taking first place. 

Allen Central's 400-meter relay 
team placed sixth with a time of 
1:03.7. The foursome included Lisa 
Stumbo, Greta Halbert, Dreama 
Isaacs and Renee Burke. 

In the women's 800-meterrelays, 
Halbert, Isaac, Jennifer Patton and 
Renee Burke placed sixth with a time 
of2:14.67. 

Nikki Queen set a new school 
record in the women's 100-meter 
dash. Queen, a strong contender, 
placed fifth overall with a time of 
14.10. 

Queen established yet a second 
school record when she was mea­
sured at 14' 3" in the women's long 
jump. The distance was good for third 
place. 

Lisa Stumbo took her tum as new 
school records when she placed third 
in the women's 300 hurdles. She was 
clockedat55.52. Stumbo ran the 100 

Reed--
(Continued from B 1) 

willing to work out on their oWn as 
well as with a group. 

"Every day after school, I usually 
run until about 4:30p.m." 

Reed is in only her third year of 
track at Betsy Layne and is looking 
forward to her appearance at the state 
meet next week in Lexington. 

"I do know there will be a lot of 
competition there at the state meet," 
she said. However, the sophomore 
runner feels it a challenge, a chal­
lenge that she is up to. 

"Coach (John) Derossett wilt be 
pracitice with me all this week," she 
said. "We plan on going up to the Bob 
Amos Park in Pikeville to practice." 

Reed said that it is the end of the 
race that is a problem for her because 
she tires at the end. 

"The 400-meter is much harder 
than, say, the200-meter," the regional 
champion stated. "It wears you out. I 
have a problem at the finish of a race 
.more than any other pan." 

While Reed runs both the 200 and 
400 she prefers the 400 because "I do 
better in it" 

She plans to enter the 800 meters 
next season but may drop one of the 
other events that she takes part in, 
like the 200 meters. 

"I haven'tdecided yet if I will drop 
any of them," she said. "Itdependson 
how I do in the 800." 

Reed just missed going to the state 
meet in the 200 meters also, just 
missing second place. She placed third 
in the region in the 200 meters. 

"I would have like to gone in both 
races, but it is easier on me if I just go 
in one," she explained. 

Reed qualified for the state meet 
by placing first in the preliminaries 
of the 400-meter run and then took 
second place in the 200 meters. 

In other events, Brandon "Bubba" 
Combs just missed going to the state 
meet in discus with his toss of 105 
feet Combs placed fourth overall. 
Tim Hunt also participated in the 
evenl 

In the shot put, Combs had a throw 
of 33' 2" and Jason Hamilton was 
measured at 34' 5". 

Jackie Bush ran the men's 400 
meters in a time of l :09. Bryan Combs 
also took part in the race. 

In the 100 meters, Rocky 
Hamiliton ran in at 13.1 and came in 
at 26.5 in the 200 meters. 

Eric Cecil, an seventh grader, ran 
in the men's 800-meter run as did 
Matt Rose. 

Rocky Hamilton was measured at 
16' 4" in the long jump and the relay 
team of Cecil, Bush, Rose and 
Hamilton competed in the 1600 re­
lays. 

hurdles but did not place with her 
time of 20.13. 

"Lisa was running the same time 
as the other runners, but she fell on 
the last two hurdles. It was probably 
the inspirational run of the day. The 
look of detennination --you could see 
it on her face." 

In thefieldevents,MelissaMullins 
was a surprise third place fmisher in 
the discus with a toss of73' 1". Jenni­
fer Patton did not place with a throw 
of 57' 6". 

Megan Manns made the 4 foot 
mark in the high jump and placed 
fifth overall. Mullins placed sixth in 
the women's shot put 

Allen Central placed second over­
all in the regional meet and got some 
satisfaction from the finish after last 
season. 

"Last year we had second taken 
away from us," said CoachJ amerson. 
"We had the second place trophy in 
our hand last year and they took it 
back. So, winning it this year was a 
lot of gratification. We have been 
waiting 365 days for this." 

Pikeville finished frrst with 137 
points. Allen Central took second 
with 106 1/2 points. Fairview, 
Raceland and Menifee County 
rounded out the top five. 

Paintsville placed sixth, Cordia 
seventh and June Buchanan eighth. 

SAlE 
All Used 

Homes on Sale 
';it~ Seteettu 
On Lot Financing 

Call 

Clayton Homes 
Hwy. 23 

Harold, Ky. 

606 478-9246 

• Get big discount:-, of $70 to $I I 0 on selected models 
• Get on-the-spot financing from John Deere Credit•• 
• See us today for great deals on John Deere mowers 

"' l 

I 
I 

Computers Plus and IBM's PS/2s 
make a great BIG BLUE Team for 
you, your business, profession or home 

Just look at the Team stats 

• Proven Performance 
• 3 Year On-Site Warranty 
• Guaranteed 4 Hour Response Time 
• IBM Quality and Reliability 

COMPUTERS PLUS and IBM PS/2 -
The other famous Big Blue Teaml 

For your season ticket 
to computer success call 

COMPUTERS PLUS 
1-800-272-TEAM 

~[]f:1PUTERS 
PLUS. I I I I I I I I 

Paintsville • Prestonsburg • Pikeville 
1-800-272-TEAM 
1-800-272-8326 

• 
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Wheelwright---- (Continued from n 1) Handyman 
Specials 

58th All-District Team 

first year Wheelwright coach. "We 
placed sixth overall in the regional 
meet but there wasn't that much of a 
spread between us and the other five." 

While Harlan slipped in and took 
the lead that Wheelwright once held 
and finished frrst with 83 points, Bath 
County shared second place with 
Fleming-Neon with 79 points. Fourth 
place went to Oneida Baptist with 65 
points and Evarts was fifth with 64 
points. Wheelwright finished with 
63 points and Coach Smallwood no­
ticed the reason for the finish. 

"I just didn't have the bodies for 
other events," he said. "We didn't 
have any distance runners. And be­
cause we were not able to enter the 
distance races, we lost points." 

Wheelwright did not have anyone 
to enter the 100 meters. 1600 meters 
and 3200 meters -- a loss of a mini­
mum three points. Threepointsadded 
to the 62 would have tied them with 
Evarts for third place. 

"We were leading after the pre­
liminaries on Thursday," said 
Smallwood. "But I just ran out of 
bodies for some of the events. Next 
year, I hope that we can get more girls 
out and get some distance runners." 

Top Guns fall to Bandits 
Meliisa Tackett placed sixth over­

all in the women's 200-meter run. 
"Melissa ran her heart out for us this 
year and especially in the regionals," 
said Smallwood. • In preseason finals, 14-13 Krystal Isaac looked to be head­
ing for the state meet in the women's 
800 meters, but in the last tum a 
pulled muscle caused the racer to pull 
in with a fourth place finish. by Ed Taylor 

Sports Editor 

The Top Guns women's softball 
team is considered one of the top 
teams in the region and they dis­
played their talents in the preseason 
tournament held at Warfield Parle in 
Martin County this jmSt weekend. 

The Top Guns mowed their way 
through their opponents and almost 
pulled off a big win over eventual 
champion The Bandits. 

Top Guns fell in the title game by 
one run, 14-13, as their sixth inning 
rally fell a run short. 

Trailing 14-9 entering the top of 
the sixth inning, the Top Guns plated 
four runs in the inning to make it a 14-
13 game. 

April Stephens led off the inning 
with a walk and Michelle Tackett 
also walked before Denise Justice 
singled home Jackie Howard, who 
was running for Stephens, with 
Tackett moving to third base. 

Tracy Burke bounced to third, 
· forcing Justice at second base but the 

next batter was safe on an error at 
second base with Tackett scoring. 

With two out, D.C. Frazier lined a 
double, scoring Burke. Tammy Tack­
ett followed Frazier with a base hit 
but Frazier was cut down at the plate 
when she tried to score on Tackett's 
base hit 

After the Bandits went out in or­
der in the sixth, Michelle Justice 
singled to open the Top Guns' sev­
enth. However, Loretta Tackett 
grounded into a double play. The 
next two runners reached for the Top 
Guns, but Michelle Tackett went out 
to left field to end the inning and the 
game. 

The Top Guns jumped out to a 2-
0 lead in the frrst on consecutive base 
hits by Burke and Miller. Burke 
scored on Frazier's one-out base hit. 
The second run came in on Tammy 
Tackett's RBI single. 

Four runs came across for the 

Donations are 
needed to help 
repair wind 
damaged dugout 

The Wayland Dodgers' Little 
League team is looking for businesses 
and individuals that would help in 
replacing their dugout top that blew 
away in last Tuesday's high winds. 

AccordingtocoachRonniePatton, 
the high winds lifted the top of the 
dugout off, causing two injuries. 

"The winds started to blow real 
hard," explained Patton, "and I told 
the players to get out of the dugout. 
Eric Casebolt was walking behind 
the dugout going to his mother's car 
when the top came off striking him 
on the face and a block hit him so hard 
that it left an imprint on his shoul­
der." 

Patton explained that the top then 
landed on topofCasebolt'scar, injur­
ing the owner. 

"We were fortunate that two 
people are still alive today," he said. 

Any businesses or individuals that 
would like to make a donation to the 
replacing of the dugout top should 
contact Coach Patton at Duff Elemen­
tary. 

"All the help that we can get will 
be greatly appreciated." said Patton. 

Bandits in the bottom of the second 
as they tooka4-2lead. The Top Guns 
made it4-3 with a single run in the 
third. Burke tripled to start the frame 
and scored on a ground out. 

The fourth inning was drastic for 
the Top Guns as the Bandits sent 15 
batters to the plate and scored I 0 
times to assume a 14-3 lead. Bucky 
Hall had a two-run triple for the Ban­
dits. 

The Top Guns dropped their fmt 
game of the preseason tournament 
when they lost to KidsPlay6-3. Burlce 
had a firSt inning homerun and Miller 
tripled in thefrrst inning as they scored 
twice for a 2-0 lead. Kids Play went 
on top 3-2 with three in the second on 
a triple by Tracy Kirk, an error and 
Denise James' base hit 

Gwen Anderson had a one-out 
double for the Top Guns in the fourth 
and scored on Michelle Tackett's RBI 
single. 

Kids Play added their fmal two 
runs in the fifth on a base hit by James 
and a single by Janice Damron. Both 
runnerscamearoundtoscoreonMills1 

triple. 
Burlce had three hits in the game 

for the Top Guns. Miller collected 
two as did Anderson. 

The Top Guns had an easy time in 
game two as they posted a 20-1 win 
overtheMisfits.Tite Top Guns scored 
seven times in the first inning and in 
taking a 7-1 lead and never looked 
back. 

Frazier had a second inning home 
run for the winners and April Stephens 
tripled home three runs in the third 
when they sent 16 batters to the plate. 
Denise Justice had a two-run double 
and collected two hits in the inning. 

Frazier had three hits for the win­
ners with Stephens getting two hits 
and four RBis. 

Top Guns went on to record a 18-
~ mercy win over the Southern Eagles 
m game three by scoring eight times 
in the fifth inning. Tammy Tackett 
had two doubles in the game with 
MichelleJustice singling three times. 
Denise Justice also collected three 
hits. Burke and Frazier had two hits 
each. 

The Villagers found out what the 
previous teams discovered--that the 
Top Guns were top guns as they rolled 
to a 26-2 win over the Villagers. 

Frazier had three hits including 
two triples. Miller cracked a third 
inning three-run home run in finish­
ing with three hits. 

Top Gun posted a 17-1 win over 
KLC in game fiveofthedoubleelimi­
nationtoumament Burlc:ehadathree­
hit night and Denise Justice cracked 
a leadoff home run in the sixth. 
Tammy Tackett added a three-run 
round tripper in the same inning as 
did Gwen Anderson. 

April Stephens had a four-hit night 
with Frazier fmishing with three hits. 

It was shutout city for the Top 
Guns as they advanced into the finals 
of the losers bracket and won another 

chance for the championship. 
In the losers bracket champion­

ship game, they posted a 31-0 victory 
by bombing the Bombers. Burke and 
Michelle Justice each had five hits in 
the outing to lead the team. Stephens 
~ol~ected four hits including a third 
mmng two-run double. Burke had a 
triple in the second inning. 

Top Gun finished with a 5-1 mark 
in the event 

"I'm proud of Krystal and the way 
that she ran the race. She did not quit 
and did finish although she had sec­
ond place. I'm proud of the way she 
fmished," said Smallwood. 

In the 400-meter relays, Wheel­
wright placed sixth overall to win 
ribbons. The foursome included Char­
ity Wright, Shonnequa Oden, Tara 
Newman and Jenny Meade. 

Oden, along with Amanda Fore­
man, Wright and Jennifer Holbrook 
ran in the 1600-meter re~ys but did 
not place. 

Eighth grader Nikki Morgan is 
one of Smallwood's "pleased as 
punch" runners in the 100 hurdles. 
The eighth grader placed third in the 
regional meet. 

Morgan stumbled over the last 
two hurdles in the women's 300 
hurdles and missedastatedate with a 
fourth place finish for Wheelwright. 

"She was running second in the 
event, but stumbled over the last two 
hurdles," explained Smallwood. 

The Wheelwright 800-meter re­
lay team took fourth place as Lori 
Tackett, Krystal Isaac, Jenny Meade 
and Nikki Morgan ran for the Tro­
jans. The 3200-meter relay team fm­
ished fifth overall 

"We had a lot of personal bests in 
theregionals." said Smallwood. "Me­
lissa Tackett is looking good all the 
time. I was more excited about this 
weekend that all I have been all sea­
son. These kids did it all on their own. 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 

FREE 
Health Screening 
for Preschool and 

Kindergarten Students 
I Prevent Future Learning Problems-Have Your Child Screened j 

PRESCHOOL-3-year-old and 4-year-old children 
KINDERGARTEN-S-years-old by October 1,1993 

Screenings by professionals in: 
-Speech 
-Hearing 
-Vision 

First come, first served. 

Select the site most convenient for you: 
Osborne Elementary 
Betsy Layne Elementary 
Duff Elementary 
Prestonsburg Elementary 

Tues., June 8 
Wed., June 9 
Thur., June 10 
Fri., June 11 . 

8:30a.m. to 1:30 p.m. 
8:30a.m. to 1:30 p.m. 
8:30a.m. to 1:30 p.m. 
8:30a.m. to 1:30 p.m. 

All14 elementary schools will be served at these four locations. Kindergarten prereg­
istration will occur at each school. Call your principal for date and time. 

Jennifer C. Martin 
District Nurse, 886-2354 

We certainly need a facility for our 
kids to practice on. 

"The kids had a happy attitude and 
there was no pressure on them. They 
went down and performed and I am 
tickled with them." 

The Wheelwright coach said that 
he was a little disappointed to get so 
close to the top and not get there 
because of the lack of people to run. 

"If we can get four or five more 
runners next year we will be a strong 
team. We did well in the field events 
and we had fun. It was a learning year 
for them and me." 

Several to choose 
from 

Call1-800·264·4835 

HYLTON HoMEs 
of lvel 

for details. 
Prices starting at $1,500 

MICROSOFT WORD FOR 
WINDOWS AND EXCEL AT PCC 
~ontinuing Ed~cation/Comm~nity Services of Prestonsburg Commu­
mty College wtll offer two Mtaosoft Windows classes during June. 
The two classes will include Microsoft Word for Windows, June 1, 8 
and 15 from 6:00-8:00 p.m.; and Microsoft Excel for Windows, June 3, 
10 and 17 from 6:00··8:00 p.m. The classes will feature PBS/Micro 
:'ideo Learning Systems video tape, books and diskette, plus instruc­
uon by a PCC instructor. 
Registration can be completed by calling 886-3863 and asking 
for CE/CS. 

MIKE'S B&W 

't Pay Late 
· New Whirlpool ENERGY $AVER Refrigerators can 

"par for themselves" with savings on your electric bill! 

Whirlpool DesignerStyle1M Whirlpool DesignerStylerM 
No-Frost Refrigerator No-Frost Refrigerator 
Model ED25DQ Model ET20DM 
• 19.9 cu. ft. Total Refrigerated Volume • 25.2 cu. ft. Total Refrigerated Volume 
• Exclusive EZ Vue SystemTW • Exclusive EZ Vue System1., 

• Factory Installed ICEMAGICe 

• Exterior Moisture/Power Saver Control 
• Reversible Doors 

• No-fingerprint Textured Steel Doors 

• ThirstCrusherTW Through-the-Door Ice and 
Wat.er Dispenser with Crushed Ice Feature 

• Adjustable Slide-out Spillguardru 
• Up-front Temperature Controls & Lighting 
• Textured Steel Doors and Cabinet 

• Exceeds 1993 Energy Standards by 1 0% • Exceeds 1993 Energy Standards by 20% 

MIKE'S B&W ~~'R 
T.V. & APPLIANCES _,""' 

North Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 
HOURS: Mon.-Sat., 9:00 to S:OO 

886-9682 
• 90 DAYS SAME AS CASH 
• FREE DEUVERY 
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Damron stars on the mound, 
at the plate for Prestonsburg 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

It looked as if the 3-11 McDowell 
Daredevils were bent on pulling the 
ftrst upset in the 58th District base­
ball tournament played last week at 
no less than three different parks. 

With all the rain that in the area 
over the pa$t week, the tournament 
was played at Allen Central, Allen 
and Archer Park. 

Prestonsburg and McDowell, who 
were scheduled to meet this past Fri­
day, moved their game to Archer 
Park on Thursday, the same time that 
Allen Central and Betsy Layne were 
finishing a game that started on Tues­
day. 

Brown's home run. 
Hall, in suffering the loss, went 

the distance for the Daredevils. He 
allowed six runs on tO hits and walked 
one batter while striking out four. 

Damron gave up just the two runs 
while scattering three hits. He walked 
two and fanned three. 

McDowell finished the season at 
3-12 while Prestonsburg improved to 
18-8. 

OUTDOORS 

Clark hurls Bobcats past 
Rebels, into District finals 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

It took two days, but the Betsy 
Layne Bobcats and the Allen Central 
Rebels did get to fmish their game. 

The game was called in the second 
inning on Tuesday because of rain. It 
was picked up in the top of the inning 
on Thursday with Betsy Layne at bat. 

When it came to a conclusion, it 
was the Bobcats standing tall with a 
12-3 win and a berth in the champi­
onship of the district tournament. 

in the bottom of the sixth. Floyd got 
a one-out single and Vance reached 
on a two-out base hit. Roy John Mar­
tin lined a base hit to right, scoring 
Floyd and Vance. He scored on Josh 
Handsford's RBI single. 

The loss closed out a rather disap­
pointing year for the Rebels, who 
finish at 10-13 on the season after 
getting off to a strong start. 

Betsy Layne collected 14 hits in 
the game but it has been an inconsis­
tent offense that the Bobcats have 
seen. 

The Daredevils put a scare into the 
B lackcats after taking a 2-0 lead in 
the second inning off of Prestonsburg 
starter Sean Damron. 

But after the second frame, 
Damron was anything but hittable as 
he mowed down the next 16 batters 
he faced en route to a 6-2 win over 
McDowell. 

FISHIN' TIPS 
FROM THE HUMMINBIRD 

PROS 
~ il ·' 
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Barry Clark scattered three hits-­
allowing one run in the five innings 
that he worked. He started on the 
mound for Coach Junior Newsome 
and gave way to Derrick Newsome in 
the sixth inning. 

Clark struck out sill batters and 
walked one. Allen Central scored a 
run in the first off the righthander. 

Floyd worked the ftrst 2 1/3 in­
nings allowing eight runs on eight 
hits, striking out four and walking 
one. Vance went3 2{3,givingup four 
runs on six hits. He fanned one and 
walked one. 

Martin was untouchable in the 'IJ. 
sixth as he "K'd" all three batters he 
faced. 

Damron gave up a two-run home 
run to Ryan Brown in the top of the 
second inning but got Scott Hall to 
fly to left to end the second. 

- · " 

i 
J 
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~ields a buntl 
Prestonsburg pitcher Jason Hacksworth was not only a hard worker on 
the mound but In fielding the ball also. Hackworth had three such playa 
against Betsy Layne In district tournament play. Hackworth survived a 
rocky start to go the distance In the Blackcats 8-6 win over Betsy Layne. 
(photo by Ed Taylor) 

Newsome was touched for two 
runs in the sixth inning when Allen 
Central strung together four hits in 
the inning. 

Glen Floyd started for Allen Cen­
tral. Toby Vance and Jason Martin 
followed Floyd to the mound. 

Allen Central stranded seven base 
runners while committing five er­
rors. 

Betsy Layne left seven base run­
ners on base and were guilty of just 
two errors. 

Betsy Layne (12) Allen C.ntrat (3) 
players ab r h rbl play011 ab r h rbi 
Collins cf 5 2 3 1 Allen cf 3 1 1 0 
NewsomeW 5 1 1 2 Halcf 2 o 0 0 

Starting with retiring Hall in the 
second, Damron retired every batter 
after that as he took complete control 
from the mound. 

~., .., / , ~ ' J 

Eight batters went to the plate in 
the first inning for Betsy Layne as 
they took a 4-0 lead. Barry Collins 
started the early rally with a leadoff 
infield single. He stole second and 
moved to third on an error on the 
catcher and scored on a second error. 
A one-out base hit and an error in 
centerfield off the batofScottOusley 
plus a walk to Kidd set up the two-run 
double by Clark. Shannon Newsome 
followed with a double, scoring Clark. 

Ousleyrf 3 2 1 1 Martini 4 0 0 0 
Hunterph 1 0 0 0 Floydp 4 1 1 1 _, 
Kidde 3 2 2 2 Martin:il 3 0 1 0 

Damron starred but at the plate 
also. He collected three hits in the 
game, driving in two of his teams six 
runs. 

Almost everyone who tishes 
owns quite a collection or lures. 
However. vel) few are \\hat we 
would consider bona fide lure 
collectors. 

Duff, Martin split two Clarll p 4 1 2 3 Vance 1b 3 1 1 0 
Newsome :il 4 1 2 1 Martin 2b 3 o 1 1 
Potter ss 2 1 0 0 Handsford ss3 0 1 1 
Cast!e2b 2 1 1 o Bilghamc 0 o 0 0 

Scott Hall, although he pitched 
well enough to win, fell victim to the 
Blackcats in the fifth inning when 
they struck for four runs to take a 4-
2 lead. Nine batters faced Hall in the 
inning with Cory Reitz leading off 
with a two-base hit. A walk to Ryan 
Ortega put runners at first and second 
with Seth Hyden singling home Reitz 
for the first run. With two out, An­
thony Howell scored Ortega on a 
base hit and Damron later scored on 
an error at second base. Howell scored 
on a passed ball. 

Prestonsburg added two more in 
the sixth on a walk to Reitz and 
Ortega's sacrifice bunt where he was 
safe at ftrst on an errant throw. Both 
runners scored on Damron's two-run 
single. 

McDowell took the 2-0 lead in the 
second when James Stumbo singled 

with two out and rode home on 

Ant1que tishmg lures make very 
interesting collectibles and. like 
most oth;r antique items. cany 
worth-while values. 

As with most other collectibles, 
the older and fewer in existence. 
the more valuable the lure will be. 
Look for these old lures at nea 
markets. antique shops. yard sales 

• or talk to a senior angler. Some 
may have an old tackle box stored 
in the attic. 

You should consider investing 
in a good book on antique lures. 
This type of reference will guide 
you in evaluating the millions of 
antique fishing lures in existence. 
There are lure collectmg clubs and 
organizations with which to share 
the hobby. 

Fishin' Tips are presented by 
America's marine electronics leader. 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The Martin Reds and Duff Orioles 
faced each other in a matter of two 
days and each came away with a win 
over the other. 

The Reds posted a 5-1 win in the 
ftrst meeting at Martin and the Ori­
oles came back with a 8-4 setback in 
the second go around. 

In the ftrSt game, Duff collected 
12 hits but left several runners 
stranded as they could only score one 
run against Martin. 

Martin had the Orioles shut out 
until the fifth inning when Chris 
Combs scored. Combs had reached 
on a base hit and stole second before 
scoring on Ivan Gunnel's double. 

The Reds scored twice in the fifth 
inning to add to an already 3-1 lead. 
Hall and Kevin Goodman had doubles 
in the two-run fifth for the Reds. 

Kenneth Childers collected two 
hits for the Orioles. He singled in the 
first and again in the fourth. 

Each team collected six hits in 
game two but the Orioles came out on 
top scorewise. Duff posted the 8-4 
win with Shawn Henson getting credit 
for the victory. 

The Orioles pushed across four 
runs in the ftrSt inning against Chris 
Damron. Childers lead off the inning 
with a double and scored on Nick 
Stumbo's base hit. Chris Combs 
singled home two runs and one run 
scored on a wild pitch. 

The Reds didn't dent the plate un­
til the fourth inning when they scored 
twice off Henson. Back-to-back 
walks to Hall and Goodman leading 
off set up the two-run single by 
Meade. 

Henson fanned 15 batters in the 
game. Damron had 11 strikeouts. 

Allen Central made it a 4-1 game 
in the bottom of the ftrst inning when 
Kevin Allen singled and carne to third 
on two errors in center and left field. 
Allen scored when Glenn Floyd's 
grounderwasmisplayedatthirdbase. 

Betsy Layne scored twice in the 
second an plated two in the third as 
they jumped out to an 8-1 lead. 

Clark picked up his third RBI and 
second hit of the game with a single 
in the fourth inning. 

Collins doubled to start the sixth 
for the Bobcats and Derrick 
Newsome's single scored him for a 
11-1 score. The Bobcats finished their 
scoring in the sixth on a base hit by 
Shannon Newsome, who scored on 
an error at shortstop. 

Two runs came in for the Rebels 

Newsome 1b 4 1 2 1 Martin 1b 3 0 0 0 

B'layne ......... 4 2 2 1 2 1 0 12 14 2 
ACHS ............ 1 0 0 0 0 2 0 3 7 5 

ss 
DIIJrll Far 
IIDalirll!ll 
BllJers 

ONLY AT 

Clayton Homes 
Hwy. 23 

Harold, Ky. 

(606) 478-9246 

• WE GLADL V ACCEPT USDA FOOD STAMPS.• 
Prices effective Wednesday, May 26 thru Sunday, May 30 

We reserve the right to limit quant1t1es • Not responsible for pnnter's errors. 

MARKET 
Betsy Layne, Ky. 

HOLLYWOOD • GROCERY I FROZEN I DAIRY • · 
.:=.:t~~g':pare ribs 

Lb.$1 5~ 
BRYAN'S 

~u;l~o~~;o~.~~.~:~:~ .. ~.:: .. ~~:~;~z. $1 • 1 9 
VELOCITY GRADE A ¢ 
Extra Large Eggs ........................... Doz. 69 
NON-RETURNABLE 20-0Z. $ 
Coca-Cola ............................. 6-Pk. ctn. 2.19 
MOORE'S ALL 9¢ 
Potato Chips .......... f..~.'{.Qf.!§ .......... 6-oz. 7 

HEINZ ¢ 
Squeeze Ketsup ........................... 2o-oz. 99 
REESE'S CUP ¢ 
Candies ................................................ 10-Pk. 99 
PARAMOUNT ¢ 
Dill Pickle Chips ................................ at. 99 
RED & WHITE BRAND ¢ 
Microwave Popcorn ............................. 99 

~~~to Chips .......... &~~~§. .......... 6-0z. 89¢ KRAFT APPLE JELLY or ¢ 
Grape Jam ........................................... 2-Lb. 89 

FLAV-0-RICH $ 
Ice Cream ................................. 112-Gal. 1 . 8 9 RED & WHITE BRAND ¢ 

Margarine .................................. 3-Lb. crock 99 
~~~~ ................................... 16-0z. Botti• SJ$1 OO 

TREND $ 
Detergent ..... '" ................... Family-Size 2.99 

VIETTI $ EGGO BLUEBERRY $ 

• MEAT DEPARTMENT • 
Pork or Beef Barbeque ... 1o-oz. 1.29 
HEINZ ¢ 
Barbeque Sauce .......................... 1s-oz. 79 

Mini Waffles .............................. 12-oz. 1. 79 
TENDERS, PATIIES OR CHUNKS $ 
Tyson's Chicken ........... 12-0z. Box 2.29 

USDA CHOICE BONELESS MATCHUTE $ 
Charcoal ........................................ s-Lb. 3. 79 GENO'S ¢ 

Pizza ................................................................... 99 
DOMINO $ 
Sugar ................................................ 5-Lb. 1.99 COLE'S $ 

Garlic Bread ................................ Loaf 1.39 
M~OLA $ 
Corn Oil .............................................. at. 2.39 KRAFT $ 

Shredded Mozzarella ......... s-oz. 1.49 
HELLMAN'S $ 
Mayonnaise .................................... at. 2.29 ~~~~~~~; ................................................... 4/99¢ 

USDA CHOICE BONELESS $1 49 
Chuck Roast ............................. Lb. • 

FISCHER'S MELLWOOD $1 4 
Sliced Bacon ............................ Lb. • 9 SUMMIT 1'\ /S 1 OO 

Jumbo Paper Towels ................. ~ .... 
VELVEETA $ 
Shell Dinners ........................... 12·0z. 1.59 

COUNTRY PRIDE GRADE A 69¢ 
Cut-up Fryers .................................. lb. 
QUARTER $ 
Pork Loin ..................................... Lb. 1.59 
WEBBER'S $ 
Sausage ..................................... 2-Lb. 2.99 
WEBBER'S $ 
Johnny Ribs ........................ 13-oz. 1.99 
FISCHER'S FESTIVAL $1 9 
Boneless Ham ......................... Lb. • 6 
FISCHER'S 99¢ 
Regular Wieners ...................... 12-oz. 

FISCHER'S $1 3 9 
Thick Sliced Bologna ....... lb. • 

FISCHER'S $1 2 9 
Chunk Bologna ...................... Lb. • 

BRYAN'S $1 5 
Lunch and Munch .......... 12-oz. • 9 
BRYAN'S SUCED 

~~~::~:~r~~~ .. ~.~ ........... 10-0z. $1.79 
BRYAN'S $1 39 
Beef Corn Dogs ................ 12-oz. • 

KRAFT 21$1 OO 
Squeeze Mustard ............... 16-0z. 

PAYDAY $ 
Candy Bars ................................. 7-Pk. 1. 79 

• ·.PRODUCE DEPARTMENT • 
TEXAS, JUMBO 

Cantaloupe 

$1 3~a. 

SWEET 

Vidalia Onions 
: SUPER SELECT 

Cucumbers 

3/$100 
WITH 6 LOCATIONS YOU'RE BOUND TQ RUN INTO US! -Pikeville • Zebulon • Belfry • Betsy Layne • Elkhorn City • Hambley Blvd. 

NOTE: Prices and sale items may vary at Velocity Markets other than Betsy Layne Store. 

• 
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Sports in Kentucky 

Off to the races! 
Prestonsburg's Sean Damron races to first on a base hit In the first 
inning. Damron was the winning pitcher in the semifinals against 
McDowell. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Prestonsburg---- <Continued rrom a 1) 

ting the ball." 
Was the Prestonsburg coach con­

cerned over the perfomance in the 
frrst inning of Hackworth? 

"Yes, there was some concern," 
said Shepherd. "But I also knew that 
if he could make it through the first 
inning that he would be okay." 

Sht;pherd said that Damron's play 
at shortstop was a big play when he 
stopped the ball from going through 
the infield. 

"Had he been able to get up and 
throw out Kidd they don't score three 
runs off Jason. The first run was 
unearned. 

"I also feel that Ortega's home run 
was the turning point of the game. It 
seemed to take some wind out of 
them. Also, anotherturningpoint was 
when Betsy Layne had runners at 
second and third with no one out. 
Jason held them to one run and that 
was a big inning for us." 

Coach Shepherd said that his 

young pitcher~as successful because 
"he did what he was told to do." 

"I don't call all of the pitches, but 
the ones that I did call, he did what he 
was supposed to. He threw the fastball 
well as well as keeping the ball out­
side when he was suppose to." 

Shepherd had praise for the senior 
leadership that catcher Aaron Tucker 
showed. 

"Aaron called a great game for 
us," said the Prestonsburg coach. "He 
has done that all year for us." 

Prestonsburg ( 19-8) faced S l;lelby 
Valley (1 0-12) in yesterday's regi,onal 
tournament Betsy Layne (22-15) will 
go against Sheldon Clark (13-12) to­
night at 7:30p.m. at Johnson Central 
High School. 

Shannon Newsome had one 
strikeout and did not issue a walk. He 
hit two batters. 

Derrick Newsome fanned three 
and walked two. 

UK-Louisville football game 
could be reality in '94 

A University of Louisville-Uni­
versity of Kentucky football series 
may be on the horizon after all. 

UK director of athletics C.M. New­
ton said earlier this month that the 
Wildcats have an open date in 1994 
and reports have let it be known that 
Kentucky might be interested in play­
ing U ofL. 

Conditions? Nobody is saying so, 
but I'm betting it would go something 
like this: Howard Schnel1enberger 
takes his team to Lexington with no 
promise of a return date. 

After years of no interest in a 
football series, why would UK be 
inclined to play U of L now? Money. 

Newton is on record with: "we 
have to have seven home games" to 
break: even. This year UK has six. 

If one examines Kentucky's sched­
ule, balances it against prior seasons, 
it is easy to speculate 1993's football 
books are going to be hard to balance. 

Where does Louisville fit in? 
UK has eight bone crushers (syn­

onym for SEC foes) on its schedule, 
four at home, and needs desperately a 
non-league foe that can fill seats at 
Commonwealth. 

Wildcat fans are not fools. Central 
Michigan won't sell out Likewise, 
Kent State or East Carolina. 

A Kentucky-Louisville match 
would be a prime time ticket, with 
revenues staying in the state. 

Would Bill Olsen and 
Schnellenberger take a one-game-no­
return deal? 

You bet Negotiations would fo­
cus on "you give something to get 
something." One condition. 

When U of L opens its new sta­
dium in, say '96, the Kentucky Wild­
cats would run out of the visitors' 
locker room. 

Says here, if a '94 game at Com­
monwealth comes off, and is a sellout 
for UK; and if a '96 rematch elevates 
U of L football's image as a legiti­
mate Division I power, then an an­
nual home and away series would be 
the boon for football in Kentucky the 
way Schnellenberger has said all 
along. 

Stay tuned. 

BONDS OR PITINO 
Who's houer, Barry Bonds or Rick 

Pitino? 
Almost mystical how not a week 

has passed since the Final Four when 
a headline somewhere did not in­
clude the word Pitino. 

Even while Bonds' image adorned 
the cover of Sports Illustrated (com­
plete with likeness ofhimself on each 
wrist band), Kentucky's coach was 
doing a press conference last week to 
dispel speculations that he was talk­
ing to the Hawks, the Pacers and the 
La.kers. 

While Bonds' name was atop more 
statistical charts than Cheers TV 
promos, there was Pitino making bad 
jokes about coaching in Sicily. Or 
was it Cicely? 

Interesting, the paths of the two 
mega-names in sports, Bonds and 
Pitino, converged and came to reston 
one word. Happiness. 

Barry the Brat, with his millions, 
is still searching for it And Kentucky's 
coach was saying (mentioned in this 
space last week), happiness is here, at 
the University of Kentucky. 

RALPH WILLARD 
A question I heard more than a 

few times through the spring months 
was apparently more than idle specu­
lation. If Rick Pitino leaves UK, will 
Ralph Willard get a telephone call 
from C.M. Newton? 

Bet on it. 
HILL TOPPERS STILL HOT 
The Western Kentucky 

Hill toppers head into the summer still 
on a hot streak. The 'Toppers recruit­
ing class will be ranked among the 
best in the country, one expert has 
said. 

WKU has accepted a berth in the 
preseason NIT, joining St. John's, 
Cincinnati, Kansas, California, Geor­
gia, Minnesota and nine others. 

Western's 1993-94 schedule will 
include home dates against Kansas 
State and Louisville. And, old rival 
Alabama-Birmingham comes on the 
card. 

Look for the 'Tops to play road 
games against an Atlantic-10 Con­
ference team, and a foe from the 
west, perhaps Nevada-Las Vegas. 

AMINU TIMBERLAKE 
UK's Aminu Timberlake will 

mov~ on to Southern Illinois, freeing 
a scholarship for Anthony Epps. 

Takes care of that fuss, Marion 
County fans. 

When he signed, I thought 6-9 
Timerblake had better potential than 
Andre Riddick. But, while Riddick 
blossomed into something a bit or­
nery last season, Timberlake re­
mained a "nice kid." 

It reinforces the parity law in hoops 
today. Riddick answered the "my way 
or the highway," gettough,getgoing 
or else, challenge from Pitino. 
Timberlake has taken the highway. 

PITINO RECOMMENDO 

ArkansascoachNolan Richardson 
was talking with the Atlanta Hawks 
about the NBA team's coaching va­
cancy last week. 

Richardson was recommened for 
an interview after the Hawks failed to 
lure Rick Pitino. 

Recommended by whom? Pitino. 
The Richardson-Hawks item 

brough to mind a remark made by a 
Hogs fan I know. "Nolan can sure 
recruit 'em, but even with that 40 
minutes of hell stuff he can't coach 
'em to the Final Four." 

MARK POPE 
Mark Pope transfers to UK from 

the Left Coast. History tells us the 
UK has not been a particularly thriv­
ing place for prospects from the west. 

In quarter of a century--Califorina 
bred Rob Lock averaged 10 points in 
1987-88 and Chris Mills (89) left 
under a cloud; Coloradans La Von 
Williams ('80) and Scott Courts ('78) 
were ordinary. Courts did not letter; 
and Mark Soderberg ('70) transferred 
in a huff. 

Footnote: Never mind. Pope is 
from Nebraska. 

WORTH REPEATING DEPT. 
Mark Pope may have raised some 

eyebrows here when the 6-9 forward 
said he decided on Kentucky because 
it is a "reasonably top national pro­
gram." 

But Pope gave Wildcat fans a hint 
of how he approaches the game. Re­
counting a game last year when, with 
his team down by two and no time on 
the clock, he missed the front of a 
bonus, Pope told the Lexington Her­
ald-Leader, "I can't wait to get in that 
situation again." 

Bob Watkin$1 

Footnote: Pope shot 86 percent 
from the foul line last season. 

READERS (RIGHT) WRITE 
Wayne Onkst of Erlanger 

writes: "Since when does Coach 
Pitino have a quota of Kentucky play­
ers to fill? 

"I get sick and tired of so-called 
Kentucky fans knocking Coach Pitino 
for not geuing in-state players. Ken­
tucky is one of the elite national pro­
grams and these people should be 
proud that Kentucky can recruit suc­
cessfully nationwide. Let's face it, 
Kentucky does not have the high 
school athletes in football or basket­
ball that Indiana, Ohio, Pennsylva­
nia, New York and some others do. 

"Coach Pitino recruits players that 
fit his system whether they are from 
Kentucky or not He has brought sev­
eral Kentuckians to play for the Wild­
cats and made a valiant effort to re­
cruit several others which he lost to 
Louisville. I'm happy Coach Rupp 
didn't back off Dan lssell, Cotton 
Nash, Louie Dampier, Alex Groza, 
Pat Riley and others because they 
weren't native Kentuckians. Nor did 
Coach (Joe) Hall refuse to recruit 
Kenny Walker, Kevin Grevey, Sam 
Bowie, Rick Robey, Kyle Macy, etc. 

"Indeed, Murray, Eastern, West­
em and Louisville have more Ken­
tuckians on their squads than UK. 
(But) which of these teams were in 
the fmal eight last year and Final 
Four this year?CoachPitinohasdone 
a remarkable job. Get off his back!" 

COMMENT:Thankyouforwrit­
ing. 

PARTING SHOT 
Man bites hand that feeds him? 
ESPN announcer Bob Ryan said 

last week, "TV ratings have nothing 
to do with reality." 

And so it goes. 
Have a point of v~ew you would 

like to share? Write to Bob Watkins, 
Sports in Ky., P.O. Box 124, Glen­
dale, KY 42740. 

Will You Help Us Move? 
Sale Prices Good Thurs., 5/27; Fri., 5/28; Sat., 5/29; Sun., 5/30; Mon., 5/31 

1/3-1/2 Off 
· ·:_·.·_. .... · .. ·-:: B.EDDIN.G SALE · . 

~ '. . . . ' . . ~ . . 

OVER 100 PIECES OF BEDDING 
TO CHOOSE FROM 

AGOODSET-FULLSIZE $18688 
Mattress & Box Springs .......... Reg. $269.oo 

BmER SET-FULL SIZE $289n 
Mattress & Box Springs ......... Reg. $399.oo 

BEST SET-FULL SIZE VERY BEST SET -FULL SIZE 

Mattress & sasgaa 
Box Springs ............. Reg. $469.oo 

Mattress & $aggaa 
Box Spri~gs ............... Reg. $549.oo 

Twin Size, Queen Size, King Size-A// At Reduced Low Moving Prices. 

OVE.Ft SO..IN-STOCK ODDS-N-ENDS 
• Coffee Tables 1~ 
• End Tables 2 
• Sofa Tables Price 

Big 3-Pc. Living Room Suite 
Couch, Loveseat & Chair 

A/13 Pieces $77800 
Reg. $1299.00 list Now Starting at 

Best Buy In The House During This Moving Sale- 1 /. · 
Aluminum Cookers, Pots, Pans, Many Other Pieces /2 Price 

. 'APPLIANCE SALE 
HOTPOINT AUTOMATIC WASHER 

Heavy Duty, Large Capacity 

Reg.$469.95 Now $386°0 

HOTPOINT ELECTRIC DRYER 
Heavy Duty, Large Capacity 

Reg.$369.95 Now $286°0 

30" GAS OR ELECTRIC RANGES 
Special Moving Price 

Reg.$449.00 Now $36988 
18.2 CUBIC FT. HOTPOINT • GE REFRIGERATOR 

$699.95 Now $586.00 
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McDowell 
Video 
377-2817 

Prime Time 
Video 

Highland Plaza 

886-3327 

LeMaster 
Sports Center 

Paintsville 

789-7272 
Pikeville 

432.0777 

~Pikeville 
.a.INational® 
Da~k .and Trus't: C ompAny _,.., 

John Gray 
Auto Sales 

S. Lake Drfve 

886.0375 

Weddington Plaza 

Pikeville, Ky. 

·. 

Kentucky 
Fried Chicken 

North Lake Drive 

886-2182 

' 
Besto 

Prestonsburg Blackcats 
1993 District Champions 

Prestonsburg Lady Blackcats 
1993 District Champions 

oodlyon 
Highland Plaza 

886-1 

Music­
Carter-Hughes 

South Lake Drive 

886-9181 

Carter Hughes 
Toyota 

South Lake Drive 

886-3861 

TbeFI~~ 

luc 

Hall 
Funeral Home r 

,t 

Martin 

285-9261 



Times 

lrto all teams 

• tes 
U-Haul 

Ronald 
Adams 

886-9484 

Hyden BP 
North Lake Drive 

886-3330 

Betsy Layne Bobcats 
1993 District Runners-up 

McDowell Lady Daredevils 
1993 District Runners-up 

Strand 
South Lake Drive 

886-2696 

' e 

• 

Velocity 
Market 

Betsy Layne Location 

478-9218 
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Earl Castle's 
Jewelry 

Court Street 

886-2191 

Dairy Cheer 
N. Lake Drive 

886-8666 

Mike's Pizza Plus 
Auxier Rd. 

886-6217 

Cooley Medical 
Equipment, Inc. 

S. Lake Drive 

886-9267 

Colorama 
Glyn View Plaza 

886-6211 
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McDowell-------------ccontinued from B t) 

McDowell was quick to open the 
game with a 3-0 lead in the frrst. A 
one-out triple by Hobson, a walk to 
Brown and Mullins' RBI single ac­
counted for the first two runs. Muliins 
scored when Crystal Newsome was 
safe on a fielder's choice. 

1ne Lady Raiders made it 3-2 
with a two flrst. A triple by Deerfield 
scored Church and Deerfield came in 
on a triple by Amber Pennington. 

Deerfield had her second triple and 
scored when Amber Pennington's fly 
ball was dropped in right field. She 
scored on Jodi Pennington's base hit. 
Jessica Hall scored the final run of 
the inning. 

McDowell did score once in the 
fifth for an 8-4 game. Tackett came in 
on Hobson's third tripleoftheevening. 

In the sixth, McDowell scored 
twice to narrow the East Carter lead 
to two runs, 8-6. Stephens reached on 
a one-out error and scored on Can-

dida Hamilton's RBI single. She came 
in when Misty Shannon roped a base 
hit. 

Hobson was the losing pitcher with 
Bush picking up the win. East Carter 
collected 13 hits while McDowell 
managed 12. Hobson had four hits 
and scored twice with three RBis. 
Stephens had two hits. 

McDowell flnished the season at 
5-14 with East Carter advancing on 
to meet Boyd County in the semifi­
nals tonight. 

New Doublewide 
3-Bedroom, 2-Bath 

Vinyl siding, shingle roof, 
plywood floors, plus 

many features. 

Pay $22871 

per month with small 
down payment. 

Call Larry Keene or Homer Edmonda 

(606) 432-0026 
Call Pat or David Keene 

or Rick Bowling 

(606) 437-97 47 McDowell threatened to tie the 
game in the third when Hobson led 
off with her second triple of the game. 
But the Lady Daredevils could not 
score her as Brown popped out to the 
pitcher. Mullins hit a drive to left 
field that was caught with Hobson 
tagging up and scoring. However, the· 
home plate umpire said that Hobson 
left the base too soon and ruled her 
out 

1984 Lincoln Town Car 

Three runs crossed home plate in 
the bottom of the third for East Carter. 

Mc0owal(9) E&SI Carter (18) 

The result of a long blast! players abrhrbi players abr h rbi 
Tadlett 2b 3 2 0 0 Bushp 5 1 3 2 

Bud Kldd seems to be making a habit of circling the bases In the 58th 
District baseball tournament. Kldd heads for home after crushing his 
third home run of the tournament against Prestonsburg Saturday after­
noon at Allen Central. Betsy layne fell8-6 to the Blackcata. (photo by Ed 
Taylor) 

Qden ----------(Continued from B 1) 

Hobeonp • 2 • 3 Shemi K 5 2 2 0 
Brownss 3 1 1 1 Chlnh 1b 5 2 0 0 
Mullins I • 1 1 1 Deerfield ss 5 3 3 4 
Stephens 3b 4 1 2 0 A. P'ing1on sf4 1 2 1 
Newsomerf 4 0 0 1 J. P'ington e 4 1 1 1 
Hamikonsf 4 1 1 1 HaU3b 4 2 1 1 
Shannon d 3 0 1 1 Sparlls rf 4 3 2 2 
Reynolds c 3 0 1 0 Roseberry cf 4 2 3 2 
Howel1b 3 1 1 0 Marshal2b 3 1 1 1 

Mc0owelt... .. 3 0 o 0 1 2 3 9 12 6 
E.Carter ......... 2230110x 18135 

V /8, auto, air, all power 

$3,495 

place with 132 points. Oneida Bap­
tist finished second with 116 points 
and Wheelwright was only eight 
points behind with 108 points." . 

in the 300 high hurdles at 6:10p.m. 
on Friday and his final event will be 
the 200-meter dash scheduled for6:30 
p.m. 

LOB • tkDowel 8, Eas1 Carter 8 HR · Deerfield 38 • 
Hobson (3). Deerfield (2). A. Pennilglon. Hall 2B- Sparil 
WP- Bush lP -Hobson Umpires: Leonard Thomas, Jim 
~n Guarantee Auto Mart 

"We got beat in pole vault, sa1d 
Daniels. "We don't have anyone in 

pole vault and we lost points there. 
It's not fair, but that's the way it is." 

In the men's 400 meters, Steven 
Shelton ran his personal best and 
placed fifth overall with a time of 
55.69. Justin Ray took sixth place at 
56.61. 

Brandon Holbrook just missed a 
date in Lexington this weekend when 
he lost second place by a step in the 
men's 800-meter run. Holbrook 
placed third in the event with a time 
of2:12.78. 

"Brandon kicked too late down 
the stretch," said Daniels. 

Little took second place in the 
men's 16(X)-meter run and earned a 
berth in this weekend's state meet. 
Little had a time of 5:13.21. Little 
also placed fourth ovemll in the 3200-
meter run by posting a time of 
12:47.84. 

The men's 400-meter relay team 
had their best time of the year and 
placed fifth in the regional meet. The 
teamofKelvin Slone,John Hali,Ryan 
Johnson and Chad Slone finished in a 
time of 49.56. 

It was a third place fmish for the 
Wheelwright 1600relay team as they 
ran in at 3:56.74. The foursome in­
cluded Steven Shelton, Brandon 
Holbrook, Justin Ray and Patrick 
Tackett. 

"They ran a very good race," said 
Coach Daniels. "It was also their best 
time of the year." 

A third relay team posted a season 
best time when the 3200 relay squad 
of Holbrook, Curtis Newman, Jer­
emy and Doug Caudill ran for sixth 
place with a time of 10:12.83. 

In the field events, Greg Johnson 
makes a trip to Lexington by placing 
second in thehighjump.Johnson had 
a leap of 5' 10" in placing. 

It was in thehighjumpthatLayne 
Bailey of Wheelwright placed sixth 
in the state last year. He washe only 
Wheelwright participant to place in 
the state. 

Kelvin Slone was fourth with a 
jump of 5' 6". 

Arnold Adams was four feet short 
of a state meet berth in the triple 
jump. Adams was measured at38' l". 
Ronnie Newsome came in fourth with 
a jump of 37' 8". 

In the long jump, Adams was third 
after recording a personal best with a 
distance of 18' 10". Chad Slone placed 
fifth and had a personal best with a 
leap of 17' 3". 

Merlin Isaac came up with a per­
sonal best in the discus and took fifth 
place with a throw of 107' 5". 

Todd Daniels and Bo Rogers were 
fifth and seventh overall in the shot 
out Daniels took fifth place with a 

throw of 36' I 1 ". Rogers was mea­
sured at 35' 8". 

"I was very pleased with the effort 
of everyone on this team," said 
Daniels. "They all did their best. It 
has been a good season for us. The 
kids have gotten some recognition 
and respect that they deserve. I'm just 
real pleased with them." 

Oden, Little and Johnson will take 
part in the state preliminaries this 
Friday evening at Shively Field at 
UK. Johnson is scheduled to jump in 
the high jump at5:30 p.m. Friday. 

Oden is scheduled in the 110 
hurdles preliminaries at 5:10 p.m. 

The men'sjOOj,e.J.e.r ~wschcd­
.. uloo~~W~ 

Little is scheduled for the 1600-
meter dash at 6:50p.m. 

We buy 
clean used cars. 285-3773 We buy 

clean used cars. 

The state finals are scheduled for 
Saturday. 

C'fjiltl¢t,l51ti#i¢11 

Nt<IBA 
IS:biiU\iilit ,,.,., 

. J &J Liquors · 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 

MEET SPECIALIST GAYLE BURCHETT 
KITCHEN & BATH SPECIALIST 

• Design Service Available 
• Call For Appointment 
at the store or at you home 

606·874-9602 or 432·3241 
Ask for Specialist, Gayle 

Bob will help you plan the kitchen that's right for you ... and your budget! From a wall 
of cabinets to a custom-designed kitchen. He'll help with planning and design, 
ordering materials as well as provide you with an accurate estimate of materials, for 
free! Just bring in your measurements, and we'll give you a free three-dimensional, 
computer, accurate kitchen plan. 

·wickes 
Lumber 

Located at the ''Y" in Martin 

lt:::l 

WE DESIGN KITCHENS FOR THE WAY YOU LIVE 
Creative ideas. Helpful advice. Friendly service. A wide selection of cabinet styles 
from classic to sleek European. Bring in your room's measurements today and let 
our trained staff help you. 

We can put the same personalized planning into the rest of your house. We can 
create a custom entertainment center, wet bar or dining room hutch for your lifestyle 
and space requirements. Or give your bathroom or bedroom the extra storage it 
needs with a built-in, personal touch. Our furniture-quality cabinets provide your 
whole house with the beauty and efficiency your lifestyle demands. 

w-- 'f··tEJ YOUR SATISFACTION IS GUARANTEED 
lif'ff.~ , If you're not satisfied with your purchase, return it with your 
................ , J Z receipt within 30 days of purchase for replacement or refund. 

N 

T HOURS; 
Monday-Friday 

7:30-5:00 
Saturday 
8:00-2:00 
Sunday 
Closed 

Wickes Lumber 
US 23 North 

Allen, KY 41601 
Phone: 

874-9602 or 
432-3241 

.. 

• 
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Harold Dodgers collect first 
victory, 7-3, over I vel Reds 

New 16• wide 
Pay only 

$1,500 down 
$150 per month 

Includes delivery, 
blocked, leveled 

There was a cause for celebration 
in the Harold Dodgers' camp this 
week as coach Mike Potter's charges 
posted their first win of the season in 
the Harold-Allen-Prater Little 
League. 

The Dodgers defeated the I vel 
Reds 7-3 in extra innings with Nick 
Coleman picking up the win in relief 
of starter Bradley Brooks who worked 
the first six innings. 

The Dodgers scored four times in 
the top of the seventh inning in win­
ning for the first time. 

RobenRose led off the frame with 
a walk and scored on 1 us tin Bartley's 
two-out triple. Brooks doubled be­
hind Bartley, making it a 5-3 
ballgame. Michael Gross then lined a 
triple to center field, scoring Brooks. 
He later scored when he stole home. 

The Indians put two base runners 
on in the bottom of the seventh but 

were unable to score. Lonaz Stephens 
had a one-out double but was left 
stranded. 

The Reds took a 1-0 lead with a 
run in the first inning when Aaron 
Swiger stole home after walking and 
stealing second and third. 

Harold went in front with two in 
the fourth inning as Brooks stole home 
and Gross doubled and scored on 
Josh Meade's RBI double. 

The Reds took a 3-2 advantage in 
the fifth with two runs. Eugene Miller, 
who reached on a base hit, stole sec­
ond and scored on Swiger's RBI 
single. Swiger scored the second run 
on a double by Shawn Deskins. 

The Dodgers tied the game at 3-3 
in the sixth inning on a one-out triple 
by Gross and a run-scoring double 
off the bat of Meade. 

Brooks, in six innings of work, 
had four strikeouts. He allowed three 

Astros ''orbit'' Prater 
Creek 10-2 behind Walls 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

Chris Hall went the distance for 
the Allen Astros and Scotty Walls hit 
a two-run home run as the Astros 
posted a 10-2 win over the Prater 
Creek Indians in the Harold-Allen­
Prater Little League. 

Has big game! 

Hall fanned 10 batters in picking 
up the win for Allen. Darrin Akers 
suffered the setback for the Indians. 

The McDowell Lady Daredevils fell out of regional competition but Lisa 
Hobson had a big night at the plate. Hobson collected four hits In the 
game, Including three triples. McDowell lost to East carter 18-9. (photo 
by Ed Taylor) 

Walls collected two hits, scored 
two runs and picked up two RBis in 
the game. Seth Crisp, Nathan Leslie 
and Dusty Stephens each collected 
two hits for the Astros. 

QUAUTY SUNGLASSES 
IMPORT ANT IN FISHING 

One of bass fishing champion 
Larry Nixon's best fiShing invest­
ments isn'ta rod, reel or lme, and it 
never goes in his tackle box. 

Instead, it's a pair of quality sun­
glasses. 

"Any fisherman who cares about 
his eyes and who wants to catch more 
bass should own a good pair of sun­
glasses," says Nixon, winner of more 
than Sl million in bass tournament 
prize money and a long-time member 
of the Evinrude Outboards Pro Staff. 

"Good sunglasses not only pro­
tect your eyes from ultraviolet light, 
they also help you see and catch fish. 
I've won a number of townaments 
because I could see underwater tar­
gets better than the competition and 
pinpoint my casts more accurately." 

Ironically. when Nixon first be­
gan fishing, sunglasses gave him a 
headache so he never wore them. 
Today, he owns at least four pair for 
use in different weather conditions. 

"I just kept wearing sunglasses, 
buying better and better ones until 
fmally the headaches stopped," he 
says. "I knew I had to wear them 
because of the underwater cover they 
allowed me to see. 

"I really believe I was getting head­
aches because I was wearing cheap, 
plastic sunglasses, rather than the 
quality glass lenses I wear now." 

Optometrists generally agree pro­
longed exposme to the sun's ultra­
violetrays, as commonly experienced 
by fiShermen, can lead to eventual 
eye damage if the eyes aren't pro­
tected. Deterioration and loss of night 
vision is just one of the problems 
anglers have experienced. 

"I've had many fishermen come 
to me and say their sunglasses are the 
best invesbnent they've made in fish­
ing," says the Evinrude pro, "and I 
know personally that once you do 
begin wearing quality sunglasses 
you'll wonder why you waited so 
long to get them." 

Good sunglasses aren't cheap, 
;ontinues Nixon, with prices begin­
ning at around $75 per pair. 

''The lenses can't be plastic," he 
says, "but unfortunately, there are a 

lot of plastic sunglasses on the mar­
ket directed toward fishermen. The 
lenses have to be polarized and block 
out ultraviolet rays, and plain plastic 
doesn't do that." 

Nixon's glasses include a pair with 
lighterlensesforuseondarkercloudy 
days, and another pair with darker 
lenses for use on brighter days. 

"H you want to see more fish, see 
the cover they're using, and even see 
the changes in watercolor, you need 
a quality pair of sunglasses," Nixon 
concludes. 

"I love to see a competitor get in 
my boat without a pair of good sun­
glasses, because I know he'll never 
see the underwater casting spots I'll 
see." 

Wallstwo-runroundtrippercame 
in the fourth inning with one out. 
Alvin Reed opened the inning with a 
base hit and scored on Walls' four­
bagger. 

Allen took a 2-0 lead in the ftrst 
inning when Jason Lewis scored af­
ter reaching on a ftelder's choice. 
Lewis scored on Kelly Harrison's 
double. Harrison came in to score 
when Dusty Stephens singled. 

The Indians made it 2-1 with a run 

~' ., .• 

A mean swing! 
McDowell's Krlsty Mullins lines this pitch for 1 base hit to drive In a first 
Inning run. McDowell fell to East Carter In the women's regional softball 
tournament at Pikeville 18-9. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

A 10-Week Class on 

Ho\VTo 
Dra\VBlood 

will be taught at 
Prestonsburg Community 

College. 
Those completing this class 
will be eligible to take the 

A.S.P.T. national certification exam. 
Limited enrollment. 

For information, call: 
1-800-538-9559 

in the second. Mike Goble led off 
with a double and Adam Akers fol­
lowed with a double, scoring Goble. 
The Indians left three runners on base 
in the second inning. 

Chris Hall scored for Allen in the 
bottom of the second for a 3-1 game. 
He scored on a bases loaded walk to 
Reed. 

Prater stayed close and made it a 
3-2 game with a single run in the 
third. Ken Webb singled home Josh 
Howell in the inning. 

Dusty Stephens came on for the 
Astros and scored in the third after 
leading off with a triple. He scored 
when Hall grounded out. 

Jessie Isaacs tripled in the fifth for 
Allen and scored on Seth Crisp's 
double. Crisp came home on a double 
by Walls and he scored on Leslie's 
second hit of the game. 

runs on six hits. Coleman worked just 
the seventh in getting the win. He 
fanned one, and allowed two hits. 

"Both pitchers did an excellent 
job for us," said Mike Pouer, Dodger 
coach. 

Gross had three hits in the contest 
for the Dodgers, including two triples. 

Deskins had two doubles for the 
Reds. Swiger collected two hits. 

HYLTON HOMES 
of lvel 

Call1-800-264-4835 
for details. 

Excellent Income opportunity for self 
motivated man or woman. Must be reliable 

and need In appearance. Good benefits 
available. Experience preferred~ but not 

required. CCIII Anita at (606) 789-4066 or 
stop by John Gray Pontiac, Iuick, 
.GMC truck, Inc, ot 386 Brttat~IWIIIIY. 
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New sports offered at Kentucky's Bluegrass State Games 
The addition of karate, racquet­

ball and darts to the Bluegrass State 
Garnes is sure to draw some frrsttime 
participants this year. 

Bob Montgomery, who is chair­
ing karate, says he is hoping for a 
variety of martial arts participants to 
get involved since the competition is 
open to all styles of karate. 

There are about 50 karate schools 
in Kentucky. many of which teach 
and practice various style of karate, 
Montgomery said. There are between 
3,CXYJ and 5,CXYJ Kentuckians who 
are involved in martial arts, he esti­
mated. 

"We will do our very best to make 
this work regardless of the many 
styles. We will make sure the rules 
are fair and safe. We need every 

black belt in the state to be involved 
in this program. The more judges we 
have the faster the event will run. 
Anyone interested in being an offi­
cial should call me." 

Montgomery. who has a fifth de­
gree black belt in Shotokan, runs 
Karate Fitness U.S.A. in Erlanger. 
With some 600 students, it is one of 
thelargestkarateschoolsin the United 
States. 

There are no age limits in karate. 
There will be five karate events: 

Kata (forms); Weapons Forms; 
Kumite (sparring); Kihon (basic tech­
niques for beginners not yet profi­
cient in forms); and self defense for 
those not interested in sparring. 

The entry deadline is July 9. Any-

one with questions about the karate 
competition can call Montgomery at 
(606) 331-6669. 

July 9 is also the deadline to enter 
racquetball, which is open to any age 
and any skill level, according to event 
chair. Mark Shupe. There will also be 
a wheelchair division if there are 
enough entries for this category. 

"There are divisions for every skill 
level so you don't have to be a tal­
ented player to enter," Shupe said. 
"Don't be intimidated; go out there 
and have fun." 

Because of scheduling consider­
ations, participants can only enter 
two events within racquetball. 

Shupe, an account executive with 
Dean Witter in Lexington, is presi­
dent of the Kentucky Racquetball 

Association which has about 250 
· members. There are about 1 ,CXYJ rac­
quetball players · statewide, Shupe 
estimates. 

For more information about the 
racquetball competition, call Shupe 

at (606) 288-6011. 
The third new sport--darts--is for 

ages six and up. Participants can en­
ter singles, doubles, triples or four 
person matches. Persons can enter up 
to four events in any age group. En­
tries for doubles, triples and four­
person partners should be submitted 
together, explained darts chair Bax 
McClure. All matches are best two 
out of three. Steel tip darts will be 
used 

The event will be held at the Holi­
day-Inn North in Lexington. 

,.------------:---------------------------, There are four darting associa-

Bluegrass Games registration officially opens 
Governor Brereton Jones formally 

opened registration for the ninth an­
nual Bluegrass Suue Garnes. 

Thousands of Kentucky amateur 
athletes will arrive in Lexington July 
23, 24 and 25 to compete in 25 sports 
and try to win gold, silver and bronze 
medals. Last year more than 18,553 
athletes from 109 counties partici­
pated in the games. 

wide, the Bluegrass State Garnes is organizeandhosttheBluegrassState 
already ranked in the tops as far as Garnes once again this year," said 
participation. Lexington Mayor Pam Miller. "We 

Participants come from all walks are proud of the tradition of excel­
of life and have ranged from age 2 to lence, hospitality and family fun we 
90. have established." 

Athletes compete based on gen- Entry booklets can be picked up at 
der and skill level. Disabled athletes any SuperAmericastoreorValvoline 
can compete with the disabled or Instant Oil Change. Interested per­
non-disabled persons. sons can call 1-800-722-BGSG and 

tions in the state with a total of about 
2,CXYJ members, McClure estimated. 
The largest is in northern Kentucky 
with about 800 members. 

"I am expecting to get about 200 
darters to participate this first year,". 
she said. 

Deadline for entering is July 9. 

Am I eligible? 
Here are the factors that deter­

mine eligibility for the BGSG: 
• Participants must be residents of 

Kentucky for at least30 days prior to 
the date of the competition they wish 
to enter. College students and mili­
tary personnel who usually reside in 
Kentucky or attend a Kentucky col­
lege or university are eligible. 

• Age groups and gender require­
ments for each sport are established 
by the sport's national and state gov­
erning bodies. The athlete must be 
prepared to present a valid Kentucky 
driver's license or a birth certificate 
(or copy) on site. 

• Competition is open to all Ken­
tucky athletes meeting the amateur 

SPORT BEFORE FILLING OUT 
Tiffi ENTRY FORM. 

• Be sure to fill in each space on 
the application form. 

• Read and sign the medical con­
sent and waiver on the application 
form. If you are under 18 it must be 
signed by a parent or guardian. 

• Pull out the application form and 
enclose it with your check or money 
order for the required fee made pay­
able to Bluegrass State Games, and 
mail to Bluegrass State Games, P.O. 
Box 1463, Lexington, KY 40591-
1463. 

Other information to keep in 
mind: 

• you may enter only one sport 
(but you can enter as many events in 
that sport as rules allow.) 

• enclose your entry fee with the 
form. 

• follow-up information will be 
sent to you approximately 1-2 weeks 
prior to the Garnes. 

• be sure to adhere to the entry 

"Each year the Bluegrass State 
Games provides all Kentuckians with 
an opportunity to compete in the 
state's largest amateur athletic event," 
Governor Jones said. "I am excited to 
be a part of the games, which bring 
togetherourCommonwealth' s young 

Over 55 sites will be used for the an entry booklet will be mailed. 
various Bluegrass State Garnes corn- Deadlinesforenteringmostsports 
petitions and more than 700 volun- is July 9. Bowling, soccer, softball, 
teers will provide staff support in diving,equestrian,gyrnnastics,some 
competitionsandatopeningcererno- categories of shooting, tennis and 
nies. volleyball have earlier deadlines. 

BLUEGRASS 
STATE GAMES 

and old alike in the spirit of competi- The colorful opening ceremonies 
tion. will be held at 8 p.m. July 23 at the 

"As the games draw near, 1 look University of Kentucky's Common­
forward to sharing in the excitement wealth Stadium in Lexington. There 
that the people of Kentucky project will be the annual parade of athletes, 
as they exemplify all levels of skill frreworks and entertainment. A faro­
and determination." ily picnic from 4-7 p.m. will precede 

The 1993 Games will feature three the official opening ceremonies and 
new sports: darts, racquetball and lighting of the Bluegrass State Games 
karate. The new events are open to torch. 
almost all ages and levels of playing The torch will be lit in Frankfort at 
abilities. . 11:30 a.m. that day at the old Capitol 

Other sports whtch are back by duringaseniorsPacesetternon-corn­
popular demand are archery, chess, petitivewalkingeventandfestival.A 
wrestling, g~lf, three-?n-three ~as- team of runners will then carry the 
ketball,bow~g.~~mg/kayak~g, torch to Lexington for opening cer­
croquet, cychng, divmg, equestnan, emonies. 
fencing, gymnastics, horseshoes, The Games are organized by the 
shooting, soccer, softball, swimming, Lexington-Fayette Urban County 
table tennis, tennis, track and field Government with volunteers chair-
and volleyball. . ing the various sports. 

As one of 41 state games nab on- "Lexington is pleased to be able to 

a 

COST: 
$15.00 with photo 

$12.50 without photo 

Some shooting will be held July 17 
and 18 in Owensboro. 

Carl Frey, Chairman of the Board 
ofDirectorsofBI uegrass State Games 
and Senior Vice President for Exter­
nal Affairs for Valvoline Inc., said, 
"Valvoline is pleased once again to 
support the Bluegrass State Garnes, 
which have become the most suc­
cessful games of their type in the 
United States." 

"Coca-Cola is proud to be found­
ing sponsor of the Bluegrass State 
Garnes," said David McDonald, Sales 
Center Manager, Blue~s Coca­
Cola. Lexington Branch. "But this 
would not be possible without the 
support of our loyal customers 
throughout Kentucky, many of whom 
will participate in the 1993 Garnes. 
Because it is really those people who 
make the Bluegrass State Garnes pos­
sible." 

For more information on the darts 
competition, call McClure at (606) 
258-3400. 

HOW TO ENTER THE 
BLUEGRASS STATE GAMES 

Are you an ex-athlete and won­
dering if you still got it? Or are you 
very active now and know that you 
still have it? Prove it! 

Now is your chance to "Accept 
the Challenge" for the 1993 Blue­
grass State Garnes (July 23-25) in 
Lexington. Twenty-five sporting 
events await Kentucky amateur ath­
letes of all ages, skill levels and abili­
ties. 
requirement of the state and national 
governing body for each sport. 

a 

with the 

ounty 
Put your special message 

with or without a photo in this space. 

Deadline for copy: 
Wednesday Edition-12 noon, Tuesday; 

Friday Edition- S p.m., Wednesday. 

• Individuals with any type of dis­
ability may compete in any of the 
Garnes' events. These individuals will 
compete with non-disabled partici­
pants when ability levels are compa­
rable. If the athlete feels that his/her 
ability level is not comparable with 
non-disabled participants, he/she will 
compete against other participants 
with similar disabilities provided 
enough entries are received to hold 
competitions. Contact: Evelyn Bolo­
gna at (606) 288-2900. 

How do I enter? 
• After obtaining an entry booklet, 

look up the sport and division that 
interest you to determine eligibility 
requirements, event codes and other 
information. SEE THE RULES AND 
REGULATIONS FOR EACH 

········· .... 

deadlines indicated after every sport. 
• please mail or drop off your 

entries as phone entries are not ac­
cepted 

• contact the sports chair listed in 
the entry booklet for more infonna­
tion. 

If you still find that you have ques­
tions or need additional assistance, 
contact the Bluegrass State Garnes 
office in Lexington at 255-0336 or 
toll free, at 1-800-722-2474. 

Coors Light 
$1250 AII~~~C< 

Cans case P 

J & J Liquors 
Betsy Layne • 478-2477 

a 

Please enclose a stamped, 
self-addressed envelope 

so we can return 
your photo. 
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Rangers roll in Prestonsburg Little League 
RANGERS-CUBSBATTLEIN 

FIRST GAME OF SEASON 
The Rangers, led by Jon May, 

Drew Brown, and Kalen Harris, ral­
lied in the sixth to beat the defending 
league champions 21-17 in the frrst 
game of the season. 

After the Rangers scored four in 
the flrst and three in the second, Cubs 
coach Bobby Hackworth pulled 
pitcher Chris Prater and put team ace 
GrnntCastleonthemound. TheRang­
ers scored an additional 14 runs off 
Castle who allowed 12 hits, includ­
ing a third inning three-run blast to 
center fleld by Jon May. 

The Rangers had defensive prob­
lems also. After being shut down in 
the fiTSt, Fannin and Castle came 
alive for the Cubs. Fannin went 2 for 
4 and scored two runs while Castle 
went 3 for4 and scored twice. Ranger 
pitcher Kalen Harris allowed eight 
runs on only two hits before being 
replaced by Jon May. May allowed 
eight runs over two innings on four 
hits. Drew Brown replaced May in 
the fifth and allowed only one run 
and two hits in the fmal two innings 
to get the win. · 

After falling behind 17-16 in the 
bottom of the fifth, the Rangers ex­
ploded for five runs in the top of the 
sixth. May advanced to frrst after 
being hit by a pitch. First baseman 
Todd Kidd doubled in May to tie the 
game. Harris walked and both he and 
Kidd scored on Brown's two-run 
single to give the Rangers the lead. 
Brown later scored on Ricky Powers' 
double. Powers stole third and then 
raced home after a passed ball to give 
the Rangers a 21-17 lead. 

In the bottom of the sixth, Brown 
gave up a hit and two walks before 
striking out Neil Fannin for the fmal 
out and the victory. 

RANGERS HOLD OFF YAN· 
KEES, GO 2 AND 0 

Ranger pitcher Kalen Harris hit a 
wild streak Thursday night as he 
walked home five runs and gave up 
four more before being replaced by 
Ricky Powers in the top of the fourth 
inning. Powers gave up flve runs 
while striking out six as he held on for 
the win versus the Yankees. Gabriel 
Shepherd gave up 16 runs and 18 hits 

for the Yankees. 
The Yankees were the beneficia­

ries of wild pitching as they scored 14 
runs on only three hits. The opposite 
is true for the Rangers. They scored 
their 16 runs on 18 hits, including two 
triples by Jon May and two doubles 
by Todd Kidd. Brian Bowling of the 
Rangers went 3 for 3 and scored three 
times before injuring his thumb and 
leaving the line-up. 

The Yankees, behind 14-10 in the 
fourth, started a comeback by scor· 
ing three in the fifth and one in the 
sixth. The Rangers held on by an· 
swering with two in the bottom of the 
fifth for the win. 

The A's added one in the fifth on 
a double by Ousley while the A's 
defense held the Rangers scoreless. 

In the top of the sixth, down by 3, 
the A's frrst two batters went down 
looking at strikes by Ranger reliever 
Ricky Powers, who started the sixth. 
Powers then walked two and allowed 
them to score when his throw sailed 
over the head of the Kidd at frrst. 
Powers settled down and got 
Compton the fly to center for the flnal 
out of the game and his flrst save. 

RANGERS ON A ROLL, 
SCALP BRAVES 11·1 

Kalen Harris pitched an excellent 
game Thursday as the Rangers beat 

RANGERS SURVIVE SCARE, the Braves 11-1. Harris gave up one 
BEAT A's 10-9 run on three hits while striking out 11 

After being held scoreless for two and walking four and hitting 1. The 
innings, the A's scored nine runs in Braves countered with J.B. Hall who 
the final four innings to close within gave up 11 runs on nine hits with 12 
one of the Rangers. Hall for the A's strikeouts, 11 walks, and one hit bat-
allowed 10 runs on 10 hits, though. ter. 

The A's were scoreless in the top TheRangersjumpedontheBraves 
of the first while the Rangers scored early in the farst inning by scoring 
3. Jon May drove home Josh Shep- seven runs. Back-to-back triples by 
h d h alked 'th · 1 Ma Todd Kidd and Jon May followed by 
er • w 0 w • wt a tnp e. Y a hit batter then back-to-backdoubles 

scored on Todd Kidd's double. Kidd 
was tagged out trying to steal home. by Drew Brown and Brian Bowling 
Kalen Harris scored on a fielder's plated six of those runs. The 7th came 
choice by Drew Brown to round out when Hall walked May with the bases 
the Ranger's first loaded. The Braves put two on then 

The A's again went scoreless in had a fielder's choice sandwiched 
the second while the Ranges scored between two strikeouts. 
four. Aftergettingtwoouts,theRang- Neither team scored again until 
ers put two on for Kidd. Kidd doubled Josh Slone of the Rangers stole home 
in two runs and later scored on a in the third. 
Harris triple. Harris scored on a two- · In the fourth, Brown of the Rang­
run inside-the-park homerun by Drew ers reached on a triple then scored 
Brown. when Bowling also hit a triple. Bowl-

The A • s cracked the scoreboard in ing was lagged out at the plate after 
the third with three runs. Hall singled, he tried to steal home. The Braves 
Compton reached on an error, and scored their only run when Spriggs 
both scored on a double by Ousley. stole home on a wild pitch by Harris 
Ousley was later forced in when Drew during the bottom of the fourth. 
Brown loaded the bases then walked The Rangers added one run in the 
Combs before striking out Justice to fifth and sixth. In the fifth, Eric Jo­
end the inning. After issuing a walk seph scored on a Kidd double, while 
to Robert Spradlin, Hall struck out in the sixth, Brown scored on a Bowl-
th three ingdouble. HarrissettheBravesdown 

e next Rangers to hold them at 1-2-3 in the bottom of the sixth for the 
eight 

AftergivingupahittoHall,Brown Rangers' fourth victory and his frrst 
walked home three runs in the top of complete game of the season. 
thefourthtobringtheA'stowithin 2. RANGERS SPLIT DOUBLE· 
The Rangers answered with two in HEADER WITH METS & 
the bottom of the fourth. Both Ranger INDIANS 
runs scored on a triple by Harris. In the first game against the Mets, 

the Rangers had to score seven runs 
in the bottom of the fifth to secure the 
victory. Ranger pitchers Robert 
SpradlinandRickyPowerscombined 
for four strikeouts while giving up 
eight walks, two hit batters, and 12 
runs on 10 hits. Mets pitchers Brett 
Bentley and Paul Wallen combined 
for eight strikeouts while giving up 
eight walks, two hit batters, and 13 
runs on 10 hits. 

In the frrst, neither team scored. In 
the top of the second, Paul Wallen 
scored when the throw to third went 
off Powers' glove into left field. 
Spradlin then loaded the bases before 
striking out George Thornsberry for 
the last out The Rangers answered in 
the bottom of the second when Kalen 
Harris doubled then stole third before 
scoring on a Drew Brown single. 

After putting the Mets down 1-2-
3 in the top of the third, the Rangers 
took the lead when Todd Kidd tripled 
and then scored on a Jon May single. 
May scored on a Brown single. Brown 
scored on a Brian Bowling double. 
Bowling was stranded when the next 
batter flied out to first. 

The Mets picked up two in the top 

of the fourth. Don Shepherd scored 
when Ranger shortstop May couldn't 
make the force play at home. Hill 
scored on a single by Goble. The 

"Where is Harry Fairy?" 
Freddie James has bean doing the play-by-play for C&blaVIslon during 
taping of the Prestonsburg High School baseball games In tournament 
play. James usually brings along his friend "Harry Fairy" to help with the 
broadcast while Brent Allan gats a laugh. (photo by Ed Taylor) 
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C.S.I. 
Commercial Supply, Inc. 

~~ Pevua PUee 
Sales & Service 

Auto Parts - Auto Paint - Body Shop Supplies 
Ho.melite Equipment & Parts 

Hydraulic Hose 
Brake Rotors & Drums Turned 

' 1-800-880-5757 
Open 7 Days 

Betsy Layne, 478-9495-478-9993 
Pikeville, Ky., 432-4200-432-3955 
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Rangers also scored two in the bot­
tom of the fourth. Mets pitcher Paul 
Wallen hit Kalen Harris with the bases 
loaded to force in a run. Brown fol­
lowed with a single to score the other. 

were lagged out at third in succession 
to end the inning. 

AfterascorelessthirdfortheRang­
ers, Ranger pitcher Kalen Harris 
struck out seven straight before Adam 
Hall connected for a double in the top 
of the sixth. Hall and Leslie Setser 
scored on aRyan Man in single. Man in 
scored on a Dixon single to give the 
Indians a 6-2lead. The Rangers' two 
came in the bottom of the fourth 

when Jon May tripled and stole home 
followed by Harris who walked then 
stole his way to the score. The Rang­
ers threatened in the bottom of the 
sixth when May reached third, but 
was stranded as the next two batters 
struck out. After losing to the Indi­
ans, the Rangers remained in farst 
place, tied with the Cubs. These two 
farst place teams meet Thursday, May 
27 at 5:30p.m. 

The Mets tied the score in the top 
of the fifth when Kim Nunnery hit a 
triple torightcentertoclearthe bases. 
Nunnery scored on a fielder's choice. 
William Holbrook drove in 
Thornsberry then scored with Brett 
Bentley on a Wallen single. Wallen 
stole home to give theMets a five-run 
lead. The Rangers rally began with a 
Spradlin solo home run. Josh Slone 
and Aaron Bingham scored on a May 
single. Kidd, May and Harris scored 
on a triple by Bowling, who stole 
home the give the Rangers a two-run 
lead. 

In the sixth, Michael Fannin was 
awarded second on an obstruction 
call against Kidd and scored on a 
Nunnery single. But, it was nor 
enough as the Rangers held on to win 
13-12. 

Are You Ready 
for a Medical 
Emergency? 

In the Rangers' second game, 
things didn 'tgo as well. Indians pitch­
ing ace Adam Hall dominated the 
Rangers. He struck out 16 while walk­
ing only four and giving up just two 
runs on one hit. Ranger pitchers Drew 
Brown and Kalen Harris collected 14 
strikeouts while allowing six walks 
and six runs on six hits. 

National Emergency Medical Services 
Week, May 23-29, is a great time to check 
your emergency I Q. 

• Are the emergency numbers posted on 
your phones at home and at work? 

The Indians started off the game 
with a score when Ranger third base­
man Ricky Powers overthrew farst 
base and Indian leadoff hitter JoJo 
Crockett rounded the bases. Neither 
team scored until the top of the third. 
John Dixon singled then scored along 
with Josh Turner on a Jarrod Hall 
single. Both Adam and Jarrod Hall 

• Do all of your children know how to 
call for help in an emergency? 

• Have you replaced items in your first 
aid kit that have been used or expired? 

• Is your house number clearly visible 
from the street? 

"" ReuDaallle 
lifter Retued 

You can count on your local EMS team 
to he ready whenever an emergency 

'U'e ?teed ;e~ 
?l<n ()"" ~ 
'7~ 

strikes. But remember 
- the most impor­

tant member of our 

Call 
team is you. 

Clayton Homes 
Hwy. 23 

Harold, Ky. 

.(606) 478-9246 
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Hospice of Big Sandy joins with family and 
friends to remember these loved ones on this 

Memorial Day 

In memory of ••• 
Carlos H. Haywood by Arthur W. Haywood 
Clinton "Big Son" Collins by Sue and Jimmy Jones 
Erma Craft by Debra Coleman and Doris Marsellett 
Charles Hines by Dorothy Hines 
Bradley Delong by Mary Delong 
Paul Centers by Phyllis Centers 
John Reynolds by Loretta Reynolds 
Rev. and Mrs. Fredrick B. Cook by Dr. and Mrs. William Cook 
Mr. Hansel Preston by Shirley Scott Preston 
Charles E. Preston by Shirley Scott Preston 
Charles D. Preston by Shirley Scott Preston 
Mr. L.P. Scott by Shirley Scott Preston 
Mr. and Mrs. W. T. Scott by Shirley Scott Preston 
Mrs. Etta Stewart by Shirley Scott Preston 
Mary Shepherd by Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Tussey Sr. 
J. Paris Music by Mrs. Ova Music 
Opal (Salyers) Williams by W. Merle Williams 
Roby Crislip by Dorothy Crislip 
lliram R. Couch by Unda Couch 
B. Alvin Ree by Phyllis A. Reed 
Erman H. Ratlift by Era H. Ratlift 
My loving baby sister, Lydia Belle Jenkins, by Paul Jenkins 
Jane N. Collins by Barbara Estep, Children, Grandchildern and Great-Grandchildren 
Harry E. Hager by Barbara Estep, Children, Grandchildem and Great-Grandchildren 
Gearldine H. Hager by Barbara Estep, Children, Grandchildem and Great-Grandchildren 
Mauclie Ellen Howell by Anna Jean (Boyd) Akers and Family 
O.C. Howell by Miriam, Unda and Gayle Howell 
Mollie Williams by Lou Williams 
Mr. Leslie Cummins by Dr. and Mrs. Steve Vogelsang 
Paul Somersville by Eamestine Somersville 
Charles Truman Robinson by Mrs. Phyllis Robinson 
Rebecca Martin by Mr. and Mrs. Joe David Martin 
Randall Lawson by Janice and Richard Henson, Mark and Shelia Henson Hammond, Jennifer Henson 
Rainley (Snow) White by Hager White and Family 
H. King Claypool by Vernice Claypool 
Opal and Carlos Blankenship by Barbara Roop 
Helen and Curtis Hickman by Mrs. E. Thomas (Jerri) Pittman 
Rexford Trimble and Bertha Trimble Stambaugh by Betty Jo Burchett 
Jake Cooley by Mary Anderson 
Emma J. Campbell by Mary Anderson 
Minnie F. Simpson by Mary Anderson 
Phillip Chaffins by Mary Anderson 
Louella A. Gibson by Mary Anderson 
I vie Moore by Mary Anderson 
Cindy Blackburn by Mary Anderson 
Howard E. May by Danny, Unda, Jessica and Jayne Sparks 
Darius Roark by Anna Roark 
Dewey Allen by Areolas Allen 
Darrell Howes, my best friend, by Audrey Campbell 
Paul Osborne, by his wife Alma Osborne 
Ruth Dingus McDavid, by her husband Charles McDavid 

• 

At this time of cherishing memories of our loved ones andfrieruls, Hospice of Big Sandy joins 
with these families and friends in taking time to hold onto those precious memories and those 
whose wve we remember each day. 
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Weekend 
Specials 

We reserve the right to limit quantities 
and correct printing errors. 

Federal Food Stamps welcome. 

FRESH 

Pepsi & Pepsi Products Ground Beef 

USDA CHOICE 
WHOLE BONELESS 

20-Pack - 12-0z. Cans 

Lb. 

U.S. GRADE A ** 
FRESH SPLIT 

Chicken Breast 

18 
Lb. 

2-Liter 
Bottles 

GRADE A FROZEN 
YOUNG 

Turkey Breast 

JUICY, SWEET, WHOLE 1c-&, DELl DELICIOUS 
7' CAROLINA 

DELl DELICIOUS 
ARMOUR 

Watermelons * Turkey Breast Chopped Ham 

99 99 
Fresh 

¢ Delicious Meringue 
Sweet Pies 

Cantaloupes 2/$500 99~a. 
each Lb. 

·~ Lb. 
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/ (When You Can Buy It For less.) 

SHOP OUR NEW **' * / 
WHY PAY MORE DISCOUNT SHELF TAGS 

IN EVERY AISLE AND SAVE. 
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THE CLASS OF '57 
HAD ITS DREAM 

As the current crop of 
high school seniors 
participate in 

traditional commencement 
exercises, I can't help but 
remember when I too was turned 
loose on society. And, whenever 
I think of former classmates with 
whom I walked across the stage­
to receive my high school 
diploma - that so-called KEY 
to success; that KEY to the 
future; that KEY to happiness -
in the old Meade Memorial High 
School gym thirty-six years ago, 
I can' t help but ask, "has it really 
been that long?" 

The old saying goes, "Time 
flies when you're having fun." 
Well, for the benefit of those 
who don't know already. it 
doesn't exactly poke along ... even 
when you're not. 

It' s almost as if that little 
diploma, neatly enclosed in its 
maroon cardboard binder, 
instead of being all those magic 
"keys to" things that we always 
hear about, instead turned out to 
be nothing more than some sort 

,_. of out-of-control time machine. 
It's almost as if as soon as it 

was in our hands, life kicked to 
the "fast forward" mode and 
everything's been nothing but a 
blur ever since. 

ZIP! Suddenly we were thrust 
thirty-six years into the future. 

ZAP! The complexion of 
things changed ewe traded our 
acne for liver spots and 
wrinkles.) 

POW! Those tight-legged 
blue jeans with a waist size we 
couldn't even get a leg through 
now, changed to baggy. saggy 
trousers like .. .like old people 
wear. 

POOF! As if by magic, some 
of us have even vanished from 
the face of the earth. I mean, 
does anybody know whatever 
happened to the kid who was 
walking into the gym that 
Sunday afternoon for baccalaure­
ate services when the bird flew 
down, lit on his cap and rode the 
full length of the gym floor 
before flying off to the rafters?? 
Has anybody seen the skinny 
guy who always had a spit curl 
in the middle of his forehead? 

As the Statler Brothers' song 
says, "The class of '57 had its 
dream." 

The class of '57. That was us, 
all right. A group of sixty 
pimply-faced, insecure kids who 
now might be disappointed that 
we still have no cure for cancer; 
that one of its number has never 
made it to the silver screen; that 
one of its members has never 
graced the stage of the Grand 

• Ole Opry. Yet, on the other 
hand, we'll have to take pride in 
the fact that as we've been sped 
through time, for the most part, 
we've become productive 
citizens and have had various 
personal accomplishments that 
have exceeded the expectations 
of even the most optimistic 
dreamer among us. 

And, I know for a fact that all 
sixty of us made more of 
ourselves than many of teachers 
(bless their hearts) even thought 
we would. Even I was surprised 

• when one member of our class 
said "yes" and became my wife 
30 years ago. 

Anyway. congratulations are 
due the class of '93. And, 
although you didn't ask for it, 
here's some advice from the 
class of '57: Remember, while 
it's true that time does fly, 
dreams happen slowly. And, for 
Heaven's sake, don't do what we 
did in the Statlers' song. Don't 
" ... expect the world to change 
just to fit our needs." And above 
all, don't be surprised if you 
wake up tomorrow morning and 
instead of it being 1993, it's 
2029. 
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by Polly Ward 
Times Feature Writer 
When Russell Rice,73, retired from Kentucky/ 

West Virginia Gas Company 14 years ago, he 
wanted a bobby that would keep him busy. First, be 
tried his band at picture framing and then, eyeglass 
painting. In the latter, he hand-painted miniature 
nature scenes on old eyeglass pieces, strung them 
on chains and sold them as necklaces. Both were 
nice hobbies, but ones he didn't care to pursue. 

Then about five years ago, be made a cane or 
what could be more aptly called, a "walking stick". 

"I saw the need of my own for a cane," be 
remembered. "I needed something to occupy my 
time." 

He took a piece of wood, hand-carved it, painted 
it and made it into a work of art His daughter, 
Sharon R. Watkins, who lives nearby, liked the 
walking stick so much, she claimed it as her own 
- until a fellow from Florida visited Rice, saw the 
walking stick, and decided to buy it Watkins told 
her father to sell it to bim. Rice did, and "I saw 
there was a demand for folk art canes," he said. 

He began making canes for his own enjoyment 
and began to sell them locally, gaining notice 
through his participation in regional craft festivals 

Although Rice bas since become well-known 
in Floyd County for bis walking stick creations, his 
cane-making career, which he still considers a 
hobby, took off when he met Adrian Swain of the 
Morehead State University. 

"Adrian Swain is therodoffolkartatM.S.U.," 
Rice said. "He came to an art show at Prestonsburg 
and I asked him if he knew anyone who wanted to 
buy canes." 

Swain subsequently visited Rice for a look at 
his canes, and be liked Rice's work enough to put 
some selections in both the University's art mu­
seum and craft center. 

"fve sold most of my work through M.S.U.," 
Rice said. "They have some of my worlc and people 
see it One person tells another" and buyers show 
up to purchase the canes. 

So far, he bas made and sold over 100 canes. 
"fve got canes in Kentucky, Tennessee, Virginia, 
Alabama. New York, Massachusetts, Japan, Texas, 
California- I've got canes all over. Sailors V alen­
tine Gallery, in Nantucket, Massachusetts, has 
been here to visit me and have bought 10 or 12 
sticks from M.S.U. Swain and Susan Scbeiberg of 
M.S.U. I credit with promoting my work." 

As a result, Rice is becoming a name in the 
world of folk art. 

s'' 

Making canes 
In his workshop, Russell Rice holds up hla beat walking atlck, the 
Eastern Diamond Back Rattler. A bunch of seasafras trees, stripped of 
their bark, are seasoning In the corner behind him. "I'm only Into cane­
making now," he said. "h's better to have one project and do my best on 
it_" 

October 1992, be participated in the Tuskaloosa, 
Alabama Kentuck Show Festival, which be de­
clared was "one the best shows I've ever gone to. I 
sold more work there than any where." 

March 11, he was among fifteen Kentucky 
artists and craftsmen who were in vi ted to, and who 
participated in, the groundbreaking ceremonies of 
the Owensboro Museum of Fine Arts expansion. 
The fifteen, who have works in the museum's 
collection of Kentucky Folk Art, were also invited 
to make special shovels for the occasion. Rice 
created a walking stick handle for his shovel, 
which he donated to the museum. 

In May, he was invited to and displayed some of 
his walking sticks at the Kentucky Derby Craft 
Show at Frankfort, bis third Kentucky Derby Show. 
June 24, be beads for a cane-makers' workshop at 
M.S.U. And recently, be was invited to an art show 
to be held in New York City in January. 

The acceptance of his work in art circles is a bit 
of a surprise for Rice, a modest man, who reflected, 
"When raising my family for 35 years, I never 
picked up a brush or anything. I didn't have time for 
anything else." 

One could never tell it from his work. 
During a visit to his workshop located next to 

his bouse, Rice showed a beautifully carved "snake" 
walking stick he recently completed for a cus­
tomer. He makes bis canes out of small trees, such 
as dogwood and sassafras, that a neighbor digs up 
and gives to him, roots and aU. 

"I take the bark off and season them - allow 
them to stand and dry, some for three to five 
months, according to the time of year you get the 
wood. If the sap is down, it dries faster. January 
and February are the best months." 

In a corner of the workshop, several debarked 
sassafras trees were stacked upright in a comer 
where they have been seasoning for about five 
months. He said that it takes him a few months 
thereafter to finish a cane. 

"When I get a piece of wood, I take the bark off, 
dress it up. I don't know what I'm going to put on 
it. That personality comes to me as I work on tbe 
piece. Then I put the personality into the wood." 

He keeps his finished walking sticks - those 
be hasn't sold - in a small study in his bouse. 
Leaning against a wall are a myriad of colorful, 
whimsical walking sticks, each with a different 
"personality" be bas gleaned from the character­
the knobs, twists and turns - of the wood. His 
wife, Malta, an ardent supporter of his work, 
looked over the canes with him, and pointed out 

different ones for perusal. "I can't believe anybody 
could have so much imagination. No two sticks are 
alike and no colors are the same," she said with 
amazment. It was as if she was looking at the 
collection for the first time. 

One cane features a knob block handle on 
which be bas painted separate scenes depicting the 
four seasons. Another has the names of every 
Kentucky Derby Winner since 1875 captured in 
small painted ovals the length of the stick. Then 
there is the giraffe stick, the geneaology stick, the 
mamaw and papaw sticks, the boot stick. and on 
and on, each a product of Rice's sense of humor. 
He picked up what he considers bis best cane-a 
carved life-like replica of a Eastern Diamond­
Back Rattler coiling up a stick. 

"This stick bas 78 hours of work in it," he said, 
eyeing it. "The snake would be 7 feet and 11 inches 
if stretched out. It's too long to ever think about 
using it for a walking stick. It weighs five pounds." 

His snakesticksareso life-like that "ninety-five 
percent of the ladies who look at my sticks will 
never pick up the snake to look at it," he said. 

The walking sticks, priced at$75 and up, can be 
used to walk with, but mostly they are useful as 
"conversation pieces," he said. 

Rice gets plenty of attention when he takes one 
out on the town. 

"We went to Ashland to a restaurant and he had 
a cane," Malta related. "He got a lot of attention. 
One lady from California wanted it" 

With such success, one would think he would 
be consumed with maldng walking sticks. Not so. 
Whether he stays in bis wotk.sbop depends upon 
the weather. "If there is bad weather aU day, I'll 
stay in the workshop. Otherwise, I garden or cut 
the grass and feed the squirrels and birds. I keep 
busy doing things that don't hardly am01mt to 
anything." 

He is very active in his church, The First Church 
of God at East Point, where he is a trustee. "I also 
do a lot of visiting at hospitals," he said. He also bas 
his priorities straight 

"My family I place ftrst, my church second and 
my hobbies third," be declared.Althougb Rice 
abandoned his frrst workshop bobbies, creating 
walking sticks is a bobby Rice is likely to continue 
because "when I think I've taken a nothing, a stick, 
and made it into something somebody would like" 
be said, "I have satisfaction of heart and mind." 

Several of Rice's unique walking sticks are on 
display at Mountain Heritage Art and Crafts Cen­
ter in Prestonburg. 

E ditor's note: Dr. 
Bubba is not a 
licensed, practicing 

therapist, but has earned 
doctorates in analytical 
psychology and the theoretical 
history of side-show freaks. His 
latest novel details the life and 
times of "Big Bertha" Barker, 
whose extra" gland" earned her a 
place of honor in the Carnival 
Performers' Hall of Fame and 
wrecked marriages across the 
Southwest in the early 1920s. 
Entitled "Thanks for the 
Mammaries," the book will be 
released this fall by BubbaPress. 

your co-workers. "What do I do now? 
I can't afford to quit my job, but it's 
kind of hard to stay where you know 
you're not wanted.Pleasehelp.Exiled 
at Auxier 

after that 

Dear Dr. Bubba: I just lost my 
campaign for public office, and if the 
feelings of depression, rejection and 

Dear Up: Looks ta me like 
somebody never heard that little 
story 'bout countin' eggs before 
they's hatched. As far as advice, I 
really don't know what ta tell ya, 
' cept maybe ta offer them three 
little words that mean so much­
FAKE YER DEATH!!! Oryacould 
justmovefar,faraway. Whatever's 
easiest. Either way, ya might wanna 
start packin • some heat 

Dear Dr. Bubba: I've been 
feeling more and more lately that 
my co-workers hate my guts. At 
flfSt, I thought it wasjustacase of 
the paranoids out to get me, but 
now I'm convinced. I think what 
tipped me off was a letter I found 
on my desk the other day that said 
"Hey, wehateyourguts!!! Signed, 

Dear Exiled: As I see it, ya got a 
couple o' choices: 1) ya could try 
talkin' to 'em- sometimes a simple 
lack o' communication can result in 
terrible conflict an wreck even the 
best of relationships; 2) ya could look 
deep inside yerself to see whether or 
not yer co-workers' feelin's of 
animosity are justified an' then take 
steps ta change yer own behavior; or 
3) Y A COULD STOP WHININ' 
LIKE A PATHETIC WORM AN' 
GETONWITHYERLIFE!!! Ifnone 
o' that don't work, I say ya go inta yer 
place o • bidness, take out an Uzi, an' 
ask if anybody wants ta play "Post 
Office." I bet they'll leave ya alone 

anxiety that are completely 
overwhelming me weren't bad 
enough, I just realized that I spent 
every penny all my friends, relatives 
and I had on my campaign. I was 
counting on using aU the kickbacks I 
would receive in office to pay off my 
bills. All my contributors are mad 
now because they not only lost their 
money, they also aren't going to get 
those spiffy new jobs. Even worse, 
my winning opponent has vowed to 
run me out of business and to make 
my life a hideous, blood-curdling 
nightmare filled with anguish, despair 
and misery. What should I do? Up the 
Creek, Somewhere in Floyd County 

That's all the space we got fer 
this week, folks. Tune in next week 
fer the excitin' continuin' 
adventures o' "Ask Dr. Bubba," 
same BubbaTime, same Bubba­
Channel. 

If ya got serious problems in yer 
life ya can write me fer serious 
answers c/o the Floyd County 
Times, P.O. Box 39I,Prestonsburg, 
Ky. 41653. 

In the meantime, remember ta 
be good ta one another. But not too 
good. Ya don't want nobody ta 
think yer a sissy. 

KiDl'S 
Korner 

IspoketoareadetrecenUywbotold 
me she andherdaugbtet were sitting on 
a Wednesday even­
ing awaiting the out­
come of cbeer­
leadin$ try-outs. 

She said she 
picked up the Floyd 
County Times and 
began to read this 
column and II)' -outs 
was the topic. She ·.=.::u:::;;-;::rr:=i 
wasn't a fly on her wall writing about 
her life. 

She asked if my own daughter had 
madeitfotcheerleaderbecauseihadn't 
mentioned it and she couldn'thelp but 
wonder. 

Yes, Ashleigh made the squad. The 
feelings we experienced the day we 
found out were those good ol' roller 
coaster ones we all know so well. 

Up for joy one minute, sad for 
friends the next. 

ltseem~tbecheerleadiog "thing'' is 
starting right off the bat this yellt, and 
maybe it's because Ashleigh' s now on 
the A-team, where as she was on B­
leam last year. 

The squads have already made a 
trip to Lexington to Cheer. 

Cheers, was a great experience for 
these girls, it's like a one-<lay camp 
with a weeks worth of work. Some 
other mothers and I drove down and 
witnessed what our daughters eJrperi­
enced and all agreed, it was really nice. 

There were T-sbir1s on display along 
the walls and one thatcaugbtmy atten­
tion read, "If you think cheerleaders 
are not athletes think again!" 

Somehow, I get the feeling Floyd 
County thinks this way. 

That being a cheerleader is not as 
"good" as being a ball player. 

And in this county, withtbelawsuiti 
accompanying cbeerleading one thing 
is for sure, it's taken a wbole new 
direction. 

In the 70si wouldn't .say we were 
athletes. As cheerleaders we simply 
were cheer-leaders. Now in the 90s, a 
child is expected to flip frontward, back:­
war<t spot, climb, base, smile, and a 
whole lot more. 

The athletics involved are exten­
sive and for cheerleaders not to be 
included in our schools• athletic de­
partments- ! for one think is very un­
fair. 

No money is allotted in an athletic 
fund for cheerleaders. Parents pay for 
everything:....-:.uniforms. shoes, hair 
bows, sock&, pom poms, warm-ups, 
camp, etc. 

To have fundr~s for these ifem.s 
take~ an actofCongre~ beC•use it has 
to go before the board of education 
before a fundrai.ser .can be held. 

I bope what I'm .OOut to a:n here 
doesn'tcauseCoacbDanielsanyhavoc, 
seeing as bow it happened 15 years 
ago. .. . 

But, it's an eumple and l want to 
share it. · . . ···: ... 

Wbt!elwright was abOut to host a 
very important football game.: 

The weather was cold aDd I really 
cold. Our uniforms were sleeveless and 
the cheerleaders had llQ money for 
bfutl64's or· tutUe neclts 10 go under­
neath. 

Jeanie, Stepb and 1 went to coach 
and seeing as bow be was also the 
principal, we felt he was definitely the 
right one to go to. 

I asked coach for the school to buy 
us something to go under our uni­
forms-c--be expl;Uned the money situa­
tion-but we knew through some of 
the football players there was money 
left in their fund after their equipment 
and unifotnU were purchased . 

Coacb sb<X>k that bead of his after 
we'd asked about the "footballmoney." 
After all, we told him we are cheering 
for the football learn and you don't 
want u.s out there freezing to death and 
having to miss school from pneumo­
nia, now do you coach? Coach gave us 
the money to buy eight navy blue 
blouses to go under our uniforms. We 
were wann, the football team lostnoth· 
ing and oo one got burt 

I don't understand wby these funds 
are aJ.Jotted to the football program and 
the basketball program and the cheer­
leaders arc left bigb and dry. This. are 
not changed in 15 years, but nising the 
funds sure bas. 

We had car washes, bake sales and 
yard sales for camp and shoes and 
maybe one uniform. 

Our uniforms were handed down 
year after year and some of them were 
dry rotted and falling apart 

But you see, Coach understood our 
position years ago and handled it in a 
manner that pleaSed everyone. There 
was still money left in the football fund 
for somethlns unexpected, like foot­
ball pads tearing up or 11011\Cthing of 
that nature. 

Anyway, you get my poinl rm not 
saying cheer leaden should be equipped 
head to toe with funds fromourscbool.s. 
But our schools could sure belp more 
and the board could outline that say, for 
eJrample; three fuodraisers may be held 
throughout the year for raising money 
for cheerleaders and leave it at that 
with rules to follow. No road blockS. of 
course, but hey, everybody likes a good 
cupcake. a clean car. But nobody likes 
the red tape it takes to get them. Oh 
well, it's my opini,{)n, 

Till neJrt week. 
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ZELLA W. WELLS 

Wells receives award 
The State Board for Elementary 

and Secondary Education and the 
Kentucky Department of Education 
presented Zelia W. WcllsasaDistin­
guished Educator during a ceremony 
in Frankfort May 7. 

The presentation was made by 
Joseph Kelly, chairman for the State 
Board for Elementary and Secondary 
Education; Thomas Boysen, Com­
missioner of Education; and Sherry 
Jelsma Education Secretary to Gov­
ernor Brereton Jones. 

Wells was one of fifty distin­
guished educators from Kentucky. 
She is the daughter of Robert and 
Jane Wallace of Prestonsburg. 

Visit here 
Estill and Maxine Patton of Lima 

Ohio, and Eula and Roscoe Allen of 
Ft. Wayne, Indiana, arc visiting here 
~ntil Memorial Day. They are camp­
mg at the Jenny Wiley Campgrounds 
and would love for their many friends 
in Floyd County to drop by and chat 
with them. 

UNDER THE BRIDGE 

"I can't write poetry." 
I heard those four words last Tues­

day evening. I found myself in front 
of about fifteen high school students 
in the lobby of Hemlock Lodge at 
Natural Bridge, trying to psyche 
myself up to run a poetry workshop. 

I felt a slight twinge of panic. Here 
I am, at a writer's workshop for the 
Kentucky Telecommunications Writ­
ing Project, and some of the students 
are looking at me like they'd rather 
be in a dentist's chair than slapping 
together a poem. 

A little context is necessary here, 
I suppose. 

Back in January, I got a call from 
Carol Stumbo of Floyd County edu­
cation fame, who told me that she 
was involved in a writing conference 
for students in grades 4-12 from all 
over the state. The students' class­
rooms were connected by computer. 
Knowing my poetic slant, she asked 
me if I'd handle an on-line poetry 
workshop. 

I said yes, and for the last four 
mon tbs, I've been reading poetry from 
Wheelwright to Paducah and giving 
critiques, support and other sundry 
comments. Once I got comfortable 
with the poetry, I opened up a confer­
ence of my own to handle questions 
the high school students might have 
about college life. 

When giving comments on the 
students' works, I told them the best 
way to get better was to read other 
poets' stuff. I suggested poets from 
\Yilliam Shakespeare to Chuck D of 
Public Enemy. I wanted the students 
not to be afraid of poetry and not be 
afraid to express themselves. 

I wrote to some of the students 
several times, but I never met any of 
them, not even the ones from Wheel­
wright, face to face. 

Then came the writer's confer­
ence. 

Many of the participating high 
school students- from Wheelwright 
High and The Brown School in Lou­
isville - made the trip through those 
heavy storms to congregate, social­
ize and, I hoped, do some writing. 

So here I was, trying to keep all 
these new acquaintances of mine 
straight. I had the whole agenda set in 
my head. I had my exercises planned 
out and I was all fired up to make 
these students into bona fide poets in 
one evening. 

"I can't write poetry." 
Sigh. 
What do I do? I stick to my guns. 

I gave them a pep talk reminiscent of 
Belushi's from Animal House (you 
know, "Was it over when the Ger­
mans bombed Pearl Harbor ... ") and 
hit 'em with a brainstorming exercise 
to loosen them up. I gave them 20 
minutes to at least get started on a 
poem. 

My only rule: no rhymes. 
We took our new half-done verse 

and went to a nearby cave (at this 
point, it was about 10:30 - pitch 

Miriam Rebekahs contribute 
to National Rebekahs' 

program 
The regular meeting of Miriam 

Rebekah Lodge No. 31 was held May 
4. Noble Grand Violetta Wright pre­
sided. 

Many on the sick list were re­
ported to be improving. A member of 
the Pikeville lodge was reported to 
have had a heart attack and a card was 
signed for her. May Spradlin is now 
reported to be doing very well after 
her treatment. 

Beverly Hackworth made a report 
on a visittoMt ManorNursingHome 
on May 2. The residents enjoy the 
visits of Rebekahs on the first Sun­
day of the month. 

A monetary gift was allowed for 

the Visual Research Program, which 
is a national program of the Rebekahs 
of the world. 

Re-obligation ceremony was ob­
served and all members took part. 
Birthday greetings were extended to 
Myrtle Allen and Claudine Johns. 

Members present were Violetta 
Wright, Hope Whitten, Mabel Jean 
LeMaster, Sue Moore, Paulena 
Owens, Lorena Wallen, Susie Clif­
ton, Judy Johnson, Wanda Elste, 
Claudine Johns, Beverly Hackworth 
and Myrtle Allen. 

Members father around the altar 
at the end of the meeting to sing 
"Blessed Be the Tie That Binds." 

Local chapter Rebekahs 
invited to PaintsJ:ille Lodge 

The members of Miriam Rebekah 
Lodge met in a regular meeting on 
May 18 with the Noble Grand Vio­
letta Wright presiding. 

Those on sick list were noted and 

black) to bave a flashlight poetry 
recital a Ia Dead Poets' Society. Ex­
cept for a couple of curious bats, it 
went off without a hitch. I started 
with a poem I'd prepared and then the 
students followed, and, I must say, 
they did a remarkable job. 

It got pretty intense, especially 
when we all turned out our flash­
lights and went through an off-the­
cuff list of wbat scared us. Words 
don't do it justice. It's a clich6, but 
you really had to be there. 

Then what? Sleep? Nab. 
That night, I pretended I was 17 

again. I stayed up most of the night 
talking to some of the students about 
life, the universe and everything. I 
guess I crashed at about 5 a.m., and I 
had to do the second half of my work­
shop the next day. 

One tired Mike. 
We got into critics' circles the 

next day to edit what we'd done the 
night before, but it was pretty low 
intensity. Everyone was more inter­
estedin hanging out, walking around, 
paddleboating, flirting and just get­
ting to know everyone. I can't argue. 
When you've been talking to some­
one all year long, and these students 
had, and you fmally get a chance to 
meet face to face, the last thing you 
want is some crary adult forcing struc­
ture down your throat 

But hey, everyone left The Bridge 
with at least one new poem. Every­
one. Even the person who told me, "I 
can't" 

She did. 
And my bat's off to her, and ev­

eryone else who was there. 
It was a great experience for me. 

I'd never run a workshop like that. It 
felt great to stand up in front of these 
folks while full of adrenaline and act 
silly enough to coax them into sitting 
down and expressing themselves. 

Fortunately, most of this bunch 
didn't need much coaxing. To Amy, 
Beth, Wali, Jesse, Dieprieye, Nikki, 
Kris, Rhonda, Stacie, Candi, Alena, 
Carrie, Jimmi Lou and Angie ·- as 
well as the supervisors, Delores 
Woody, Sue "MeV" and Jan Leake 
(yeah, I guess you count as one ... ), 
you've got my thanks and my re­
spect. Peace. 

Students should write, and most 
students write better when they get 
honest feedback from something like 
K1WP. This program is a perfect 
example of how technology can en­
hance the classroom experience. I 
wish I'd had it when I was on the 
other side of the desk. I'm proud to be 
part of it. 

So, except for a bruise approxi­
mately the size of Delaware on my 
left arm from a wrestling match, the 
experience was fantastic. I've said 
somewhat jokingly that I can get any 
willing person to write poetry in less 
than 20 minutes. 

I'm glad I could make good on my 
boast. 

"I guess I can." 
Later days. 
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cards were signed to be mailed to 
them. Bills and communications were 
presented and action taken on the. 

An invitation was received from 
the Louisa Lodge regarding visit of 
assembly president on June 3. An 
invitation was also received from the 
Paintsville Lodge for the visit of the 
president on June 13. 

The lodge recently completed a 
rummage sale which proved to be 
profitable. 

Members repeated the Rebekah 
Creed, led by Jean Hickman. 

Members presented were Violetta 
Wright, Jean Hickman, Dorothy Os­
borne, Paulena Owens, Lorena 
Wallen, Beverly Hackworth and 
Rebecca Bingham. 

The next regular meeting will be 
June l at 7 p.m. in the I.O.O.F. Hall. 

Celebrate 57 years together 

ONE 
STOP 

Market 
305 N. Mayo Trail 

Old US 23 • Pikeville 

432-5959 
MONARCH $7.78 otn. 

BEST VALUE Kings $8.44 
BASIC Kings $7.78 

Pyramids $7.99 carton 
Raleigh Extra Kings S7 .54 carton 

VICeroys $3.00 off carton 
GPC'S $7.54 carton 

Cambridge~ off carton 
~~====~~~~~----~ •. WINSTON $1.49 pk. - $12.32 ctn. 

Dorais 95f pk.- $6.98 ctn. Aller Col4lQn 
Sty It pkt. Buy 1 Get 1 Free 
Capri pkt. Buy 1 Get 1 frM 

Granger Select S11.U otn. 

BEECHNUT $11.99 carton 
Red Man GB $11.99 carton 

Photograph Copies •••.•• $2.95 
We can now laminate your photos. 

SURGEON GENERAL WARNING: Cigarette 
Smoke Cor-Gins cart>on ~xlde. 

Ask for your free Ky. Lottery Puii-Tabw1th 
each S10.00 purchase of Ashland gas. 

Mr. and Mrs. Worley Ratliff will celebrate their 57th wedding anniversary 
on Sunday, May 23, at their home at Hueysville. They were married May 
23, 1936, by the Rev. D.M. Allen. They have two daughters, Mrs. Clay 
Noble of Shiloh, Ohio and Mrs. Dallas Sparkman of Willard, Ohio; two 
grandchildren, Rita Waterbeck and Derek Sparkman; and two great-
grandchildren, Jason and Shannon. •) 

~,, .. ··~·-~~~ 

Times begins 'From ~ ~ 
the Mountains' series ~~ 

The Floyd County Times recently 
began a weekly series titled 'From 
the Mountains' which is written by 
Jadon Gibson. 

Gibson grew up at Wheelwright 
where he graduated in 1958. Follow­
ing a two-year stint at Caney Junior 
College, now Alice Lloyd College, 
he graduated from the University of 
Kentucky in 1962. 

"I was in business in Missouri for 
23 years following my graduation 
from UK,"Gibsonsaidrecently. "The 
mountains seemed to be callmg me 
backandin 1985,mywife,Chris,and 
I moved to Harrogate, TN. 

"It's just across the mountain from 
Middlesboro and next to Cumberland 
Gap. It's a very historical area." 

Gibson explained that he had an 
interest in writing in high school, 
college, and that it had served him 
well in business. 

"Finally in 1989, I started doing 
some free-lance writing," he smiled. 
"I do newswriting every week but I 
started the historical column, From 
the Mountains, in early 1990 and it 
appears in several papers in Ken­
tucky, Tennessee and Virginia. 

"I write stories about interesting 
historical events that involve our 
mountain area. Many are one-part 

stories but I also write stories with 
more than one part, stories that are 
continued from week-to-week. A lot 
of folks seem to like them because 
I'll often leave them hanging and it 
creates an interest for the coming 
issue." 

Gibson is the son of Pauline and 
the late Jay P. Gibson who was a 
mine boss with Inland Steel Com­
pany. His brother and sister, Larry 
Gibson and Carol Hall also gradu­
ated from Wheelwright. 

Mr. James H. Lafferty of Prestonsburg announces the 
engagement and forthcoming marriage of his daughter Miss 
Usa Ann Lafferty to Mr. Sheridan Martin, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sherman Martin of Drift. 

Miss Lafferty is the daughter of the late Doris Spradlin 
Lafferty. She is a graduale of Prestonsburg High School, 
Prestonsburg Community College and Pikeville College. She 
is currently the owner of the House of Aowers and Gifts in 
Prestonsburg. 

Mr. Martin is a graduate of McDowell High School, 
Morehead State University, and Salmon P. Chase College of 
Law. He is currently an attorney with the Rowe and Martin 
Law offices in Prestonsburg. 

The ceremony is planned for Saturday, August 28, 1993, at 
6:00 p.m. at the Pleasant Home Daptist Church In Prestons­
burg. 

The purchase of ONE 
Crystal Pepsi or Diet 
Crystal Pepsi 2-liter, 

6·pack or 
multi-pack cans. 

CONSUMER: Only one coupon per purchase You pay lhe 
sales Ia>< and/or deposll charge. Coupon may nol be aSSJgned, 
lransterred or reprOduced Any olher use consttiUies lraud Cash 
value I! IOOc. RETAILER: We wl:l rernllurse you lor lhe face 
value plus 8c handl"'g II you and lhe consumer have oompied 
w11h our Coupon Aedemp110n Poltey avrulable a1 lhe redempbon 
address Ma•l CO\Jpons lo I'EPSI-COLA COMI'ANY. CMS Dep1 
12000. f Fawcett DriVe. 
Del RIO. TX 78840 

----------------------------------------------------~ 
• 
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Heritage on the hill day 
This Thursday, May 27, at Betsy 

Layne High School the senior citi­
zens of the Betsy Layne Center will 
participate in "Heritage on the Hiil 
Day" in which the students and se­
nior citizens will share each others 
talents, such as quilting, woodwork­
ing, line dancing, computer skills, 
science advancements, genealogy 
and much, much more. 

"We hope to make this day a great 
experience for both the senior citi­
zens and the students," remarked Lisa 
Roberts, Betsy Layne High School's 
Community Service Coordinator. 

"The response we have had from 
both groups has been remarkable." 

Anyone interested in participat-
. ing in this event is welcome to attend 

by calling Mrs. Roberts in advance. 
If any area senior citizens would like 
to demonstmte or discuss a topic they 
feel the students would enjoy, please 
call as soon as possible to be sched­
uled for this event. 

For more infonnation contact Lisa 
Roberts at 478-2025 or 478-3389 
during the day, or in the evening at 
478-3227. 

Laferty celebrates 88th birthday 

The daughter of Andy and Mable 
Bolen would like to invite you to 
her parents 50th Wedding Anni­
versary. The celebration will be 
at the Holiday Inn of Pres­
tonsburg, Saturday, May 29th, 4 
p.m. to 8 p.m. 

All Friends and Family 
are encouraged to attend. 

Micheal B. Minix, M.D. 
children who were present were: Mary 
and Tony Douridas, Joe and Opal 
Laferty, Bascom and Dottie Laferty, 
Dick and CharlotteLaferty ,Ruth Holt 
and Nellie and Paul Salisbury, Bill 
and Katie Branham. 

Doctors 

David Garrett, M.D. 
Howard Crum, O.D. 

The grandchildren present were 
Dan and Diana, Mike and Angie, 
Steven and Lisa, Tom and Debbie, 
Nick and Nanda Douridas, Shirley 
Burchett, Mason and Jan ice Holt, 
Larry and Linda Salisbury, Lisa and 
Kenny Weidman. 

Pictured are Dr. Mark Tu888y of Allen and Dr. Debra Karen Hall of 
Prestonlburg. Both were memhers of the Prestonsburg High School 
graduating Clau of 1985, of which Dr. TuSSiy was the valedictorian and 
Dr. Hall was the aatutatorlan. They each riCIIved their medical doctor 
degree from the University of Kentucky College of Medicine In gradua­
tion ceremonies May 15. 

Family Eye Examinations, Eye Surgery 
and Laser Treatment 

Darcus Laferty of Martin cel­
ebrated her 88th birthday Saturday, 
May8. 

Attending the party were two of 
her sisters, Hamie Warrix and Rubel 
Fields; two brothers-in-law, Claud 
Fields and Anderson Lafferty. Her 

The great -grandchildren attend­
ing were: Angelia Parsons, Renea 
Burchett, Ryan and Alex Weidman, 
Shelly and Scott and AM Salisbury, 
Paul Branham, Theresa and Gary 
Wons, Doug, Damon, Ryan, Megan, 
Steven, Nathan, Nadia, Nyle, and 
Leslie. and Heather Douridas. 

Otherrelatives attendingwereL.P. 
and Jackie Laferty, Helena, Mary, 
Brandon, and Karen Nelson and her 
friends from C.A.P.; Mary Ann 
Dedenback, Ed Riley, Diane Rosati, 
Janice and Dan Galenbeski. 

Sharing blessings 
The Student Council has been active this year at Wheelwright High 
School and very fortunate in their fund-raising efforts. Members voted 
to share their good fortune. On the left are Chad Slone and Kevin 
Johnson, sophomore representatives, presenting Shirley Hall with a 
gift on Secretary's Day. The group also donated $100 to their senior 
prom. 

IDGHLANDS REGIONAL 
MEDICAL CENTER 

May 7: A daughter, Christina 
Marie, to Jerry and Kimberly Price of 
Prestonsburg. 

MayS: Ason,BrandonJ. Vlanton, 
to Bradley and Crystal of Thelma. 

May 9: A daughter, Sabrina Ann, 
to Ida and James Moore of Hi HaL 

May 11: A son, Michael Sean 
Douglas, to Ella Louise Vance of 
Harold; a daughter, Keisha Renee', 
to Reva Sue Reid of Martin. 

May 14: A daughter, Kayal 
Nichole, to Tena and Stacey Dotson 
ofNippa; a son, Dustin Nathen Keen, 
to Cindy June Rogers of Prestons­
burg; a daughter, Selissa Lyn, to 
Rhonda Gail Clevenger of West Pre­
stonsburg. 

May 16: A son, Thomas Andrew 
to Judy and Thomas Skeens of Pre­
stonsburg. 

OUR LADY OF THE WAY 
HOSPITAL 

April 19: A son, Cory Landon 
Blake, to Sheila Dye of McDowell; a 
son, Jonathon Davie, to Rachel and 
John Slone of McDowell. 

April20: A son, Gary Wayne, to 
Evelyn Denise and Brian Keith 
Wrig.ht of McDowell. 

April 21: A daughter, Santanna 
Danielle, to Mary Sue and Steven 
Allen Meade of Melvin. 

April 24: A daughter, Lisa Ann, 
to Jeanetta and Tommy Dean Bray of 
Martin; a daughter, RebeccaDanielle, 
to Jeannie and Danny Fouts of Top­
most; a son, Robert Michael, to Kim­
berly A. Potter of Banner. 

April 26: A daughter, Barbara 
Elizabeth, to Barbara Benson Mul­
lins ofPikeville; a son, Lincoln Shade, 
to Shirley June and Dean Logan 
Patrick of Emmalena. 

April27: A son, Dalton Keith, to 
Mona Theresa and Brian Keith Huff 

11111/U 
KFC. 

FMU!E 
Country Time Lemonade 

STADIUM 
CUSHION 
with $10.00 Purchase 
While Supplies Last 

ll F t:. U S l S · 0 N L t' 

100% VEGETABLE OIL 

Sizzlin' Into Summer! 
9 pc. KfC® Chicken Full Meal 

•1 pt. Mashed Potatoes $1 0 9 9 
•1/2 pt. Gravy 
•1 pt. Cole Slaw 
•4 Buttermilk Biscuits I 

OFFERS GOOD THRU JUNE 30, WHITE/DARK MEAT COMBINATION 

Popcorn 
Chicl~en II 

2 pc. KfC® 
Full Meal & 
Small Drink 

$2.99 
&l OFFERS GOOD AT THESE LOCATIONS: 

•Grayson •Ashland •Russell •Prestonsburg •Pikeville 
•Hazard •Jackson •Burlington, 0. •Gallipolis, 0. 

of Martin. 
April28: A son, Cory Dwayne, to 

Angela and Orville Bentley of 
McDowell. 

Minix Eye Clinic, Inc. 
1-800-273-3 717 

886-2154 
Mountain Parkway 

Glyn View Plaza 
Prestonsburg 

789-2020 
327 Mayo Plaza 
North Mayo Troll 

Paintsville 

April29: A son, Michael Joe, to I!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!! Sandy and Joseph McGuireofTeab- • 
erry; a daughter, Angelica Rose, to 
Maria Rivera of McDowell. 

April 30: A daughter, Stephanie 
Renee, to Tina Jo and Keith Hall of 
McDowell; a daughter, Lauren Tay­
lor, to Sandra Dee and Gregory Mul­
lins of Eastern. 

May 1: A daughter, Tiffaine 
Marie, to Sondra Kay and David Allan 
Rogers of Weeksbury. 

May 4: A son, Nicholas Paul, to 
Billie and Roger C. Amburgey of 
David; a daughter, Alyssa Kay, to 
Sharon and Scotty Dale Gregory of 
Letcher. 

May 6: A daughter, Misty Chris­
tina Nicole, to Melissa Linda Miller 
of Hindman. 

May 8: A son, Christopher Marion 
Ray, to Deidra Shawn apd Steven 
Ray Bates of Wheelwright. 

Betsy Layne Pharmacy 
Hayes Complex 

478-9474 
All natural 
• Homeopathic Medicines 
• Herbal Supplements 

ATTENTION! 
Single Parents Homemakers 

Do you need a job? 
Do you need new job skills? 
Do you need to go back to school? 

Your 
TRANSITIONAL SUPPORT CENTER 

can help you make the change! 

Call Jean Rosenberg: (606) 886-3863 
Prestonsburg Community College 

Cabtnetjor Workforce Development 
Equal Education and Employment Qpportunttces 

Printed with Federal Funds 

Time's 
running out 

for . 

I 

Justice Sfzoe Store's 
Just for the Kids 

S E 
Starting at SSe 00 

lteds, Stride Rite, 
Toddler University 

and much, much more! 
with an eJltra 20% oil the sticker prlee 

This is a once in a Lifetime Closeout SALE! 
. So hurry in now ... Time's a wasting I 

2nd Street, 'Downtown, ~viffe 



C4 Wednesday, May 26, 1993 The Floyd County Times 

MONEY SAVING COUPONS :2~ the Sunflower Group® 

~~~~~~~;~~~-PM~~~~~"~~"~~.~~~~al fo~~~~~~~~. ~200~ 2~ 
sioner Billy G. Wellman presented State Police Awards Ceremony held On September 9, 1992, a woman who was in the car with her, was 

INTRODUCING 
NEW 

SUPERGnLM 
TrooperGregRoberts,PikevillePost, in Frankfort May 17. pulled into the parking lot at the having a heart attack. 
with the Kentucky State Trooper's The citation that accompanied the Pikeville Post and told Trooper Greg Trooper Roberts removed the 

lifesaving action 
Kentucky State Pollee Trooper Greg Roberts (center) was honored during a meeting of the Kentucky State 
Pollee In Frankfort. Also pictured are Billy G. Wellman (left) and Governor Brereton Jones. 

Former McDowell man named 
Kentucky distinguished educator 

STANTON R. LAFERTY 

Stanton R. Lafeity of Alexandria, 
formerly of Garrett, was recently 
named by the Commissioner ofEdu-

cation, Dr. Thomas Boysen, as one of 
fifty Kentucky Distinguished Educa­
tors. 

The Distinguished Educator pro­
gram is part of the Kentucky Educa­
tion Reform Act (KERA), which pro­
vides leadership and guidance for 
schools labeled "in crisis." 

The Distinguished Educators will 
assist in advancing the scores of the 
troubled schools to their expected 
threshold levels. 

TheassignmentsofDistinguished 
Educators to schools in Crisis will 
begin during the 1994-95 school year. 

In the meantime the group of edu­
cators will be involved in training 
programs to further prepare them for 
the task they have accepted. 

Laferty graduated from Garrett 

High School in 1966, and is a 23-year 
veteran teacher in the Campbell 
County school district in Alexandria. 
He received an Associate of Arts 
degree from Prestonsburg Commu­
nity College in 1968, a Bachelor of 
Arts degree from Morehead State 
University in 1970, a Masters degree 
in Education from Northern Kentucky 
State University in 1976, and a Spe­
cialist degree in Education Adminis­
tration from the University of Cin­
cinnati in 1979. 

Laferty is the son of Erma Jean 
Laferty of Garrett and the late Delmar 
Laferty. He is married to Ginny Bates 
~ertyofGreenup, anassistantprin­
cJpal at the John W. Reilly Middle 
School in Alexandria. 

OFF OUR 
EVERYDAY 
LOW PRICE 

woman from the vehicle and laid her 
on the pavement. He checked and 
found she had a pulse but she was not 
breathing and was beginning to tum 
blue. He repositioned the woman's 
head in an attempt to open her airway 
and after he did she began breathing. 
The woman was taken to a Pikeville 
hospital where she recovered. 

His immediate action and knowl­
edge of the situation saved the woman 
from permanent damage and, more 
likely, the loss of her life. Trooper 
Roberts brings great credit both to 
himself and to the Department of the 
Kentucky State Police. 

Roberts, 37, resides at Harold. He 
has been with the state police since 
1983. 

• memor1 
day 
sale 

I MANUFACTURERSCOUPON I ElPIRES6ZI93 J I 
SAVE ~.00 1 & 1 ROLL 
IUii~ FUJIFILM I 
~ 123797 I 
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I proeluct and StZtS •ndiCCiled 15 
more 

w•ll retmbl.lrsa you tne tace vatue ot tflts 
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I 
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Protect your family against mumps .--• Southern Photo's 
SUPER PACKAGE 

EVERY POSE WE TAKE IN ONE 

RAY JONES 

Teacher retires 
at W.H.S. 

by Amy Cox 
Steph Boyd 
Rhonda Thornsbury 
Michelle Horn 

Mumps is a fairly common dis­
case which is usually uncomfortable, 
butaboutone-thirdofthe people who 
get the mumps recover without ever 
knowing for sure that they had them. 
In the case of a child the disease is 
usually mild and normally runs its 
course in seven to ten days. Meningi­
tis and loss of hearing can occur in 
children with mumps. 

Mumps is caused by a tiny virus. 
This virus finds its way into the glands 
of the face and neck. Usually swell­
ing begins in one cheek and spreads 
to the other cheek within a few days. 
The symptoms of tonsillitis can be 
confused with mumps. Although 
similar, the infected glands accom­
panying tonsillitis cause a hard swell­
ingunderthejawbone. With mumps, 
the swelling is found just in front of, 
and under the ear, and is soft to the 
touch. 

fore, since it is in the mouth and nose 
that most of the infection is found. it 
is best that you stay away from the 
patient's face. 

You can also catch the disease by 
handling objects that have been 
handled by the patient. You should 
not drink from the same glass. Pro­
vide separate dishes, silverware and 
linens to be used only by the patient. 
When w~hing his or her dishes and 
linens, use soap and plenty of hot 
water. These precautions help keep 
the virus from spreading to other 
members of the family. 

A soft diet including broths. soft­
boiled eggs and custard is good. For 
the older child or adult, ice-packs 
applied to the face may make the 
patient more comfortable. When the 
swelling and other symptoms have 
disappeared, the patient can resume 
normal activities and return to school. 

Let's discuss the complications 
mumps can cause. While mumps is 
not as common in adults, the disease 
usually is more serious. Serious com­
plications occur in only one out of 
every 100 cases on the average. In 
most cases wherecomplicationsarise, 

father. However, if the infection af­
fects only one of his testicles, he can 
usually father children. 

The mumps virus can cause a form 
of meningitis. If nausea, vomiting, 
headache and stiff neck muscles oc­
cur, it is extremely importantto call a 
doctor. People who have had mumps 
may have hearing loss. 

If severe stomach pain including 
nausea and vomiting accompanies 
the swelling of the cheek, it may 
mean a condition called pancreatitis. 
This form of the mumps is serious but 
rare. Again. a doctor should be called 
to make a proper diagnosis. The doc­
tor can help prevent the loss of too 
many fluids caused by vomiting. 

It isagoodidea to have children in 
your family immunized with a spe­
cially developed mumps vaccine be­
fore they are exposed. Such a precau­
tion will help protect them from the 
discomforts and possible complica­
tions of the mumps. 

If someone in your family gets the 
mumps, it is a good idea to call your 
doctor for proper diagnosis, treat­
ment, and advice. 

Johnson and Tackett 
to be wed 

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Johnson of 
Hueysville announce the forth­
coming marriage of their daughter 
Angela to Jeremy Tackett, son of 
Richard and Jessica Tackett of 
Craynor. The ceremony will be held 
June 11 at Zion Regular Baptist 
Chureh 

Stanville resident 
graduates from 
Midway College 

PACKAGE-FOR .Q&PRICEI 

84 Color Porttalts 
4 Beat poaea. which may be 
apllt wtth dUJ'c:rc:nt tu bj cctl. 

IIOIXTU 04AAQI- OIQUtl 

$29.95 
plus tax on dellwry 

4 • 10 X 13 
4 • 5 X 7 

$5.00 
sltt.Lng fee 

4 • n x 1d!. 
·8·3X5 

32 GIANT WALLETS 32 W.A LETS 

NEGATIVES f Rf:f WITH PURCHASE OF PACKAGE 

COMING TOA 
LOCA TION ... NEAR "U" 

*** Wedn•day, June 2 

Ray Jones started teaching at 
Wheelwright High School in 1963. 
He taught Algebra I, Geometry and 
General Math. Boone Hall was the 
principal at Wheelwright High 
School. 

The first symptoms appear about 
two or three weeks after the patient is 
exposed. Before the swelling appears. 
the patient usually has chills, head­
aches and pain under the ear. Fever, 
vomiting, loss of appetite. and diffi­
culty in swallowing food may also 
occur. 

the virus affects more than just the · -----------­
Midway College awarded 143 

degrees during its conunencement 
ceremony Saturday, May 15 at 11 
a.m. atl.be Fannie H. Graves Amphi­
theater on l.be Midway College cam­
pus. 

Time: 2 p.m. 'til 7 p.m. 

Jones has many extra duties at 
Wheelwright High School. He had 
been the official stat keeper for the 
boys' varsity basketball team for 23 
years. He is the Beta Club sponsor, a 
St. Jude Mathathon sponsor for sev­
eral years and the "official bell 
ringer." 

Jones was picked to keep stats in 
1969-70 by Coach Francis and Prin­
cipal Jamerson. They pointed out to 
him that it wouldn' l be much trouble 
for him to keep stats because he was 
at every game anyway. 

He enjoys any class in which stu­
dents are interested but overall he 
enjoys Pre-Calculus and Chemistry 
most. 

He is married to Sue Jones who is 
also a math teacher at W.H.S. They 
have one daughter, Crystal, who at­
tends Wheelwright High. 

Jones plan to spend his retirement 
on some improvement projects on his 
home. He also plans to raise his own 
garden. 

Watson honored 
Heather Watson, senior at Allen 
Central High School was presented 
with a plaque by the Floyd County 
Board of Education for her out· 
standing achievement of becom· 
lng a finalist In the National Merit 
Scholarship. Only about one per· 
cent of students in the nation are 
selected for this honor. She Is the 
daughter of Stanton and Joyce 
Watson of Hueysville. 

Mumps is a communicable dis­
ease. That is to say, you can catch the 
mumps from another person. There-

glandsofthe face and neck. When the 
virus affects the testicles of a male, he 
may become sterile. That is to say, he 
will no longer be able to become a 

Prestonsburg bands to present concert 
The bandsofJamesD. Adams and 

Prestonsburg High School will 
present a spring band concert on 
Thursday, May 27, at 7 p.m. in the 
Prestonsburg High School gymna­
sium. 

The James D. Adams Middle 
School Band, which had 16members 
in the All-County Band, will begin 
the evening's concert with the fol­
lowing selections: "Iron view March". 

Pikeville College­
announces dean's 
list for Fall 1992 

Pikeville College Dean Charles 
Whittle recently announced the names 
of the top students for the Fall 1992 
semester. the students listed have re­
ceived grade point averages of 3.5 
(B+) or better. 

"We are very proud lo release this 
list of the College's top students," 
Whittle said. "They are all ftne ex­
amples of scholarship and dedica­
tion." 

Floyd County full-time students 
named to the Dean's list are: Lisa 
Hunt and Dreama Wells of Allen; 
Sandra Osborne of Beaver; Lenora 
Hall and Angela Newsome of Betsy 
Layne; Leigh Ann Smith of Dana; 
Rebecca Clark and Michael Mullins 
of David; Michelle Keathley of 
Dwale; Mary Allen of Eastern; Mark 
Blackburn of Endicott; Teresa New­
some of Grethel; Susan Crum, 
Melanie Kendrick, Tamatha Meade, 
Diane Robinette, Leonard Stevens, 
Victoria Taylor and Judy Vance of 
Harold; Christopher KiddofHonaker; 
Tina Hughes of Martin; Anthony 
Little and Tonja Little of Melvin; 
Larry Hyden, Nellie Pruitt and Earl 
Reno all of Prestonsburg; William 
Barker of Stanville; Brad Nicholas 
Hall of Weeksbury; William Rainey 
Jf Wheelwright; and one part-time 
student, Jalenda Shepherd of Garrett. 

"Cloverleaf Waltz," "Groovin' ", 
"Kingsridge", "Royal Empire Over­
ture" and "R.O.C.K. in the U.S.A." 

The Junior High All-County mem­
bers will be joined by the nine stu­
dents selected from the Senior High 
All-County participants to perform 
"Cat' s in the Cradle". 

The Prestonsburg High School 
Concert Band will then perform the 
following selections from their re­
cent concert band ratings festivals: 
"Columbus Celebration," "Chorale 
and Shaker Dance Ir', ''Enchanted 
Canyon Overture," "I'll Be There" 
and "Finale" from Beethoven • s Ninth 
Symphony. 

Both hands will end the evening 
by performing the music from the 
FestivalofF.A.C.E.S. paradeentitled 
"Funky See, Funky Do." 

The bands are under the direction 
of Rodney Miller. There will be an 
admission charge of $2 for adults and 
$1 for students. 

Prestonsburg High School Band 
alunmi are encouraged to attend, as 
the band is in the process of forming 
an Alumni Association and Band. 

To receive 
bachelor's degree 

Lela Conn will receive a Bachelor 
of Social Work degree at Morehead 
State University. Shels the daugh­
ter of Bob and Baa Conn of Ivai. 
She resides at Morehead. 

"Congratulations to the Prestonsburg 
Elementary School on the restoration of 
their school pianos. " 

Restored and Refinished 
Spinets and Console Pianos 

$1,095 and up 

Warranty, Bench and Delivery Included 

A piano is an expensive investment. In many situations your school, church or home piano when 
properly restored at our rebuilding plant would be a far better investment than the purchase of most 
new pianos on the market today and at a savings of sixty to seventy percent The many fine old 
rebuildable pianos, especially the Grands, even with ages up to eighty years old, when properly 
restored is the best piano investment for your money today. 

Let the professionals at the Huntington Piano Company help you or your committee select a new 
or restore your present piano for your church, school or horne. 

Ask about our no obligation piano demonstration in your church, school or home. 

HUNTliN"GTON PIANO CO MOP ANY 
24 Washington Ave., Huntington. W.VA. 

Ph:·l-304-525-5382 

Wooten to attend 
L.E.I. 

Lexington Electronic Institute 
(LE.l.) announced that Roderick 
A. Wooten of Prestonsburg, son of 
Ron and Linda Wooten of Pres· 
tonsburg, will be training in July at 
the Institute. Upon graduation 
Wooten will be awarded an Aaaoci· 
ate of Applied Science Degree In 
Electronic Engineering Technol· 
ogy. LE.I.Is a two-year electronic 
training Institute located in Lex­
Ington. · 

Melissa Ann Harmon, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Avery Harmon of 
Stanville, was awarded an associate 
of arts degree in nursing during the 
commencement ceremony. 

Midway College was founded in 
1847 and is Kentucky's only college 
for women. 

VELOCITY MARKET 
N. Mayo Trail· Hwy. 23 

in .. ,Betay Layne 
·PLUS· 

Thursday, June 3 
Time: 2 p.m. 'til 7 p.m. 

RITE AID PHARMACY #2459 
State Route 122 W•t, in ... Martin 

*** •Give Th• Gilt.. That. .. Gives All Y1ar" 
CUSTOMER SATISFACTION GUARANTEED 

The 
Kentucky Lottery's 

Best Numbers Show Up 
Here! 

This year, Kentucky Lottery retailers wiU put 
over $29,000,000 into their cash registers from 
lottery commissions and bonuses. Each and every 
one of those retailers across the state receive 
comprehensive personalized support, free 
delivery, complete installation and a marketing 
package that works. In other words, they receive 
a hassle-free product that sells. 

Once you become a Lottery retailer you'll have a 
product that attracts customers to your store, and 

requires very little effort or shelf space. Ask any 
of our 3,400 retailers which product is bringing 
more customers in, and which product is most 
profitable per foot of store space t 

Check out the Kentucky Lottery by calling Lisa 
at 1-800-444-3332 today, and you could be putting 
some big numbers into your cash register 
tomorrow. 

It's Your Gamet 

KENTUCKY 

LOnERY® 



Nash to oversee 
rural operations 
for ag program 

Bob Nash was sworn in on May 
12 as Under Secretary of Agriculture 
for Small Community and Rural De­
velopment, Secretary of Agriculture 
Mike Espy announced. 

Nash will oversee operations of 
the U.S. Department of Agriculture's 
Rural Development Administration, 
Farmers Home Administration, Fed­
eral Crop Insurance Corporation and 
Rural Electrification Administration. 

The RDA, FmHA and REA oper­
ate an array of loan and grant pro­
grams supporting housing construc­
tion, farm acquisition, job creation, 
private business development and 
community improvement in the 
nation's rural areas. The FCIC oper­
ates USDA crop insurance programs, 
which protect participating farmers 
from losses incurred due to weather­
related and oiher natural disasters. 

Garden seeds can 
stretch stamps, 
boost family's 
health and fun 

Growing your own fresh veg­
etables can be satisfying and budget­
stretching, and those who depend on 
food stamps' help to feed their fami­
lies can get into the popular pastime 
of gardening, too. 

As spring planting time peaks, ihe 
Department for Social Insurance re­
minds Kentucky's 200,950 food 
stamp families that they can buy gar­
den seeds and plants with the cou­
pons to grow fresh, healthful carrots, 
cabbage, beans, beets, tomatoes, 
greens, squash and other vegetables 
themselves. 

"This is smart stamp-stretching, 
while giving their families a boost for 
better health, too" said Social Insur­
ance Commissioner Mike Robinson. 

"Gardeners will usually be able to 
harvest considerably more produce 
then they could buy for the same 
amount of stamps at the grocery­
and they can save the stamps not 
needed during garden season for later 
use." 

Many recipients live in rural areas 
with available land, said Robinson, 
whose department operates the fed­
eral food stamp program in Kentucky. 

"But people with 'stamp-size' 
yards can be successful with mini­
plots of closely packed rows," Rob­
inson said, "and those in apartments 
or with no land to plant can grow 
vegetables in clay pots, barrels or 
other containers on porches or balco­
nies." 

It could be still smarter for fami­
lies to pool their stamps to buy seeds 
or seedlings, then share some land 
and tools and the work involved to 
grow healthful food for two or sev­
eral families. he said. 

There is no limit on the amount of 
stamps used for food seeds or plants, 
and they can be bought from any of 
the 5,500 groceries and produce 
stands across the state that are autho­
rized to accept food stamps. 

"A little confidence, a little dirt 
and a little work, with tips from neigh­
bors or extension service agents or 
anyone who has tried it is all it takes 
for the joy of feeding your family 

. just-picked vegetables you've grown 
yourself," Robinson said. 

Families can also get locally grown 
fresh fruits and vegetables at many 
produce stands with food stamps. 
Some 72 produce stands in Kentucky 
are actively participating in the food 
stamp program now, according to the 
Lexington office of the U.S . Depart­
ment of Agriculture's Food and Nu­
trition Service. 

Another 36 stands are registered 
to accept stamps and more are ex­
pected to enroll as the garden season 
progresses. Food stamp users can look 
for a sign near the front of the market 
indicating that food stamps are ac­
cepted. 

(Produce sellers can apply to par­
ticipate by contacting the USDA Food 
andNutritionService, 1460Newtown 
Pike, Lexington, KY 40511. Appli­
cations arc usually processed within 
30 days.) 

Enrolling ongoing produce stand 
or truck businesses as food stamp 
vendors expands lower-income 
Kentuckian's food choices and ex­
pands the market and income for 
Kentucky farmers at the same time, 
Robinson said. 

"Both the produce stands and the 
grow-it-yourself program help fami­
lies on public assistance help them­
selves to more food and for their 
benefits and more health benefits, 
too," Robinson said. 

Unusual dogwood 
This dogwood decorates the yard of Frank Bennett, Prestonsburg. 
Bennett, an avid nature lover, says he's been In the woods a lot and he's 
never seen a dogwood stand this tall. The tree Is roughly 40 feet tall. The 
tree Is approximately 35 years old. 

Bluegrass Feeder Pig Sale 
Total head30 

Compared to last week pigs per CWI' poorly tested; 
pigs per head poorly tested 

PERCWT 

JJ.S. 1-2 100-1051bs. $51-55.25 

PER HEAD 
U.S. 2-3 few 671bs. $45.00 
U.S. 3 few 23 lbs. $12.00 

ind. 45lbs. $22.00 

1993 Bob Evans Farins 
Craft Fair, J one 12-13 

More than 25 craftspeople will 
gather June 12 and 13 at the Bob 
Evans Farm fortheBobEvansFarms 
Crafts Fair from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. each 
day. The Homestead, Craft Bam, 
Farm Museum and tents will house 
craftspeople making and selling items 
ranging from baskets, pottery and 
dried flowers to rugs, wood crafts 
;md herbal products. 

The 1,100-acre Bob Evans Farm 
is located in southeastern Ohio about 
a mile off State Route 35. on State 

Route 588. The Farm is open to visi­
tors from 8:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. from 
Memorial Day weekend through La­
bor Day. 

Bob Evans Farms 1993 schedule 
of events: 

•Craft Fair, June 12-13 
•AntiqueCarandFarm Toy Show, 

June 27 
• Horse Show, Sept 6 
•Farm Festival, Oct. 8-10 
•Christmas Craft Fair, Nov. 27-28 

Federal-State Market News 
Wednesday, May 19, 1993 
Gat~way Livestock Market 

Cattle and calf receipts: 816. 
Total for the week: 1360. 
COMPARED TO LAST WEEK: Slaughter cows, $2-3 higher; 

Slaughter Bulls,$3-5 higher: Feeder Steers and Heifers, firm to fully $2 
higher. 

SLAUGHTER COWS: breaking Utility ·and Commercial, 2-4, 
$51.75-55.50; High Cutter and Boning Utility 1-3, $53-58; high dress­
ing individuals,$59-59.75; Cutter, 1-2,$48-52; CannerandlowCutter, 
$42.50-48. 

SLAUGHTER BULLS: Yield grade#l, 1475-1870 lbs. indicating 
80-82 carcass boning percent, $69.50-74.50; yield grade 1-2, 1285-
1935 lbs., indic~ting 78-80 percent, $64.25-69.50. 

FEEDER STEERS: Medium and Large Frame #1, 300-400 lbs., 
$110-120; 400-500 lbs., $102-114; 500-600 lbs., $92-106; include 
package 506 lbs., $106; 650-760 lbs., $84.50-87 .25; includes part load 
658 lbs., $87.25; package 875 lbs., $80.10; Small Frame #l, 300-400 
lbs., $92.50-105; 400-500 lbs., $90-100; 500-625 lbs., $85-90; Me­
dium Frame #2, 365-500 lbs., $92-102.50; 575-665 lbs., $76-85; 
package 836 lbs., $73.50; few Large Frame #2, (Holsteins), package 
548 lbs., $82.75. 

FEEDER HEIFERS: Medium and Large Frame#l, 300-400 lbs., 
$94-100; 400-500 lbs., $86-94; individual420 lbs., $96; 500-600 lbs., 
$82-90.50; includes package 576 lbs., $90.50; 645-710 lbs., $80.75-
82.95; includes 78 head string 708 lbs., $82.95; few 750-830 lbs., 
$74.50-75.50; Small Frame#l300-400 lbs., $86-92:400-500 lbs.,$82-
88.25; 500-600-lbs., $80-85; Medium Frame#2, 350-500 lbs., $80-88; 
500-685 lbs., $73-80. 

STOCK COWS AND CALVES: Medium and Large Frame #1, 
indicating 3-7 years of age, with 125-300 lb. calves at side, $840-1015 
per pair. Medium and Small Frame No. l-2, indicating 5-10 years of 
age, with 95-250 lbs. calves at side $570-775 per pair.. . . 

STOCK COWS: Medium and Small Frame #1-2, tndtcatmg 3-10 
years of age and bred 2-8 months, $385-780 per head. 

STOCK BULLS: $600-910 per head. 
BABY CALVES: $65-265 per head. 

Safety of 
ground beef 

Properly prepared hamburger can 
avoid most of the food poisoning 
which gained so much recent public­
ity when a rash of western fast food 
restaurants experienced a number of 
cases. 

More than 400 persons in the 
Northwest became ill after eating 
undercooked hamburgers. 

"If the beef had been properly 
cooked, these illnesses could have 
been avoided," said Fudeko 
Maruyama, extension food specialist 
with the University of Kentucky's 
College of Agriculture. 

The problem arose when a fast 
food restaurant switched to thicker 
meat patties and did not increase cook­
ing time. The undercooked burgers 
were contaminated with deadly 
strains of E. coli. 

E. coli can be present in such foods 
as unpasteurized milk, contaminated 
water, and apple cider, as well as 
beef. However, cooking kills these 
bacteria, Maruyama said. 

Maruyama suggests the follow­
ing guidelines to ensure safety in 
handling, storing,.and preparing raw 
meats. 

*Pick meat packages that are not 
tom and that feel cold. 

*Don't let meat juices contami­
nate other foods. 

*Don't reuse meat packaging 
materials. 

*Use soap and water to clean uten­
sils and platters that have touched 
raw meat. 

*Store ground beef at forty de­
grees or less if it is to be used within 
two days, or freeze at zero degrees for 
longer periods of time. 

*Thaw ground beef in the refrig­
erator, never on the counter at room 
temperature. 

*Cook hamburgers to 160degrees 
(medium done) or until the center is 
no longer pink and juices are clear. 

*Refrigerate uneaten hamburgers 
promptly after cooking. 

*When eating out, order ham­
burger"medium" or"well-done" and 
check fordoneness when it is served. 

For more information on ham­
burger safety, contact the county ex­
tension agent. 

Ancient Age Gordon's Jim 
Preferred Distilled Kentucky 

Stock Whiskey London Bourbon Chi-Chi's 
80 PROOF Dry Gin Whiskey Margarita 
1.75 LITER 1.75 LITER 4 YEAR OLD 1.75 LITER 
p~~= 13.99 p~~= 13.99 SO PROOF 

1.75 LITER 
Mall-ln 2 00 Mall·ln 2 00 899 Rebate - • Rebate - • 1499 Final~:~~ 11.99 Final~:~ 11.99 

li•l;l~l•111;¥i4;1f.i(fliM!J:U!Z•J1,~/#Uil 

Franzia Franzia 
Bartles & Bag in Box Bag in Box 
Jaymes Wines White 

CHABLIS, BLUSH, Zinfandel Coolers 
WHITE GRENACHE, 

5 LITER 4PACK BURGUNDY OR 
RHINE-5 LITER 1299 299 999 

Seagram's 
Riunite 7 Crown Smirnoff 

American Vodka Wines 
Whiskey 80 PROOF 1.5 LITER 

1.75 LITER 750ML Sale 6.99 Price 

Mail-In 2 50 1349 699 Rebate - • 
Your 4.49 Final Cost 

?_rt 
( I 

Bacardi 
Breezer 
4PACK 

Sale 3.99 Price 

Mail·ln 1 50 
Rebate - • 

Your 2.49 Final Coat 

.9liroe.._{ 

.Jj!fi._ fnd 

/7lit~Jfw 
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YJqy 
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Heaven Hill 
Vodka 

80 PROOF 
1.75 LITER 

AVAILABLE AT YOUR RITE AID PHARMACY 

GLYN VIEW PLAZA 
(500 W. MOUNTAIN PARKWAY) 

PRESTONSBURG,KY 
QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

Touching an underground power line with anything could result in a serious a: . . =r""a or fatal injury. Protect yourself at home and at work. Call for help in locating 
these lines before you dig. 

•· 

• 



• 

• 

• 
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APRICOT-ALMOND 
COFFEE CAKE 

3/4 cup dried apricots, snipped 
1 cup water 
Milk 
1/4 cup shortening 
3/4 cup granulated sugar 
1 egg 
1 1/2 cups sifted all-purpose flour 
2 tsp. baking powder 
3/4 tsp. salt 
1{2 tsp. ground cinnamon 
1{2 cup brown sugar 
1{3 cup sifted all-purpose flour 
1/4 cup butter or margarine 
1!3 cup chopped almonds 
In saucepan, combine snipped 

apricots and water; simmer, uncov­
ered, 15 minutes. Cool. Drain, re­
serving liquid. Add enough milk to 
liquid to make 1{2 cup. Cream to­
gether shortening and granulated 
sugar. Add egg; beat well. Sift to­
getherthe ll{lcupsflour, the baking 
powder, salt and cinnamon. Add to 
creamed mixture alternately with milk 
mixture, beginning and ending with 
dry ingredients; stir in apricots. Turn 
into greased 9x 1 1{2-inch round cake 
pan or 9x9x2-inch baking pan. 

Combine brown sugar and the 1!3 
cup flour. Cut in butter or margarine 
till crumbly; add almonds. Sprinkle 
over batter in pan. Bake at 3 SOO for 40 
to 45 minutes. Serve warm. 

(Recipe from the Floyd County 
Extension Service) 

CRUNCHY BROCCOLI 
1 package frozen chopped broc-

coli (or lib. fresh) 
3/4 cup chicken broth 
1 onion, chopped 
4 Tbutter 
1 cup seasoned bread crumbs 
1 t. poultry seasoning 
Boil broccoli in broth for 3 min­

utes. Pour into 2 baking pans or indi­
vidual casseroles. Saute the onion in 
the butter. Add the stuffing mix and 
toss together. Put the stuffmg mix­
ture on top of the broccoli mixture 
and bake in a 350" oven for 20 min­
utes, or refrigerate and then bake 25 
minutes. This willmake4 small serv­
ings. 

SLOPPY JOES 
1 pound lean ground beef 
1 onion, diced 
1/2 cup ketchup 
2 tablespoons chili sauce 
1 teaspoon prepared mustard 
1 teaspoon cider vinegar 
1 teaspoon sugar 
6 whole-wheat hamburger buns 
Brown meat and onions in a large 

skillet over medium-high beat. Pour 
off fat. 

Add all other ingredients except 
buns, mixing well. Reduce beat and 
simmer 20 to 30 minutes, uncovered. 

Spoon onto hamburger buns and 
serve immediately. 

Makes 6 servings. 
Nutrient Analysis per Serving 
270 Calories 
55 mg Cholesterol 
3 g Saturated Fat 
21 g Protein 
519 mg Sodium 
1 g Polyunsaturated Fat 
26 g Carbohydrate 
10 g Total Fat 
4 g Monounsaturated Fat 
This recipe is from the American 

Heart Association 

EASY BREAD FIX-UPS 
DillyBread:Insmallmixingbowl, 

combine 1/4 cup softened butter or 
margarine, 1{2 teaspoon prepared 
mustard, and 1/4 teaspoon dried 
dillweed, crushed. Spread butter, 
mixture on one side of8 slices French 
bread. Place, buttered side down, on 
baking sheet. Broil till golden, 1 to 2 
minutes. Turn and broil 1 to 2 min­
utes more. Makes 8 slices. 

Parsley-Onion Bread: In small 
mixing bowl, combine 1 tablespoon 
instant minced onion and l table­
spoon milk. Stir in 1/4 cup softened 
butter and 2 tablespoon snipped pars­
ley. Spread butter mixture on one 
side of 8 slices French bread. Place, 
buttered side down, on baking sheet. 
Broil 1 to 2 minutes. Turn; broil1 to 
2 minutes more. Makes 8 slices. 

Cheesy Biscuits: In small mixing 
bowl, combine half of a 5-ounce jar 
cheese spread with pimento(l/3 cup) 
and 2 tablespoons softened butter. 
Using 1 tube refrigerated biscuits (10), 
spread biscuits with cheese mixture. 
Bake on baking sheet at 425Q about 
IS minutes. Makes 10 biscuits. 

Sesame-Garlic Crisps: Cut 3 sliced 
hamburger buns in half vertically. 
Then, cut each piece in half again 
horizontally (for a total of 24 half­
rounds). Combine 1/4 cup softened 
buu.cr and 1{2 teaspoon garlic pow­
der. Spread one side of each bun 
piece with buuer mixture. Place, but- . 
tered side up, on baking sheet. 
Sprinkle with 2 tablespoons sesame 
seed. Bake at4 25° till golden, 8 to 10 
minutes. Makes 24. 
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(Recipe from the Floyd County 
Extension Service) 

HERBED POTATO FLUFF 
(Gourmet fare using instant 

mashed potatoes) 
Packaged instant mashed potatoes 

(enough for 4 servings) 
1 cup small curd cream-style cot-

tage cheese 
1{2 cup light dairy sour cream 
2 egg yolks 
2 Tbsp. snipped chives 

1{2 tsp. celery salt 
2 egg whites 
2 Tbsp. finely snipped parsley 
2 Tbsp. butter or margarine 
Prepare mashed potatoes accord-

ing to package directions. Beat in 
cottage cheese, sour cream, egg yolks, 
chivesandcelery salt Beat egg whites 
till stiff peaks form; fold into potato 
mixture along with the parsley. Turn 
into 2-quart casserole; dot with butter 
or margarine. Bake at 3500 till top is 
lightly browned, about 1 hour. Makes 
6 to 8 servings. 

ASSORTED VARIETIES 

FIG-OATMEAL MUFFINS 
1 cup sifted all-purpose flour 
1/4 cup sugar 
3 tsp. baking powder 
1 cup quick-cooking rolled oats 
1{2 cup chopped dried figs 
1 beaten egg 
1 cup milk 
3 Tbsp. salad oil 
Sift together first 3 ingredients 

and 1/2 teaspoon salt. Stir in rolled 
oats and figs. Add egg, milk and oil; 
stir just till moistened. Fill greased 

U.S. GRADE A 
TYSON I HOLLY FARMS 

muffin pans 2!3 full. Bake at 425° for 
15 to 17 minutes. Makes 12 muffins. 

FRUIT KABOBS 
1 Tbsp. cornstarch 
1/8 tsp. ground cinnamon 
1/4 cup lemon juice 
l/4 cup orange juice 
3 Tbsp. honey 
1 medium apple, cut into l-in. 

cubes 
1 can (8 oz.) pineapple chunks, 

drained 
1 can (8 oz.) mandarin orange 

sections, drained 
1 medium banana, cut into 1{2-in. 

slices 
6 wooden skewers, &.in. 
In 2-cup measure mix cornstarch 

cinnamon,lemon juice, orange juic~ 
and honey. Microwave at High 1 1{2 
to 3 1{2 minutes, or until thick, stir­
ring once or twice. 

Alternate apple, pineapple, orange 
and banana on skewers to fill each 
skewer. Brush with glaze. Refriger­
ate. Brush with glaze again before 1 
serving. Serves 6. · 

OPEN 
MEMORIAL DAY 

NORMAL HOURS 

Lays 
Potato Chips 

Chicken Breast 
Quarters 

Armour 
canned Ham 

3-lb. can 
6-oz. 

---------------------1 CAFFEINE FREE DIET COKE, DIET COKE, : 
I SPRITE OR 

1 coca cola 
~ Classic 
~ 12-Pack 12-oz. cans 

~ 2 s 
0::: 
~ 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I OF 
1 98 

LIMIT TWO 12·PAKS WITH COUPON AND 
$10.00 ADDITIONAL PURCHASE 

LIMIT ONE COUPON PER CUSTOMER 
COUPON CiOOO SUN. MAY 73·SAT. MAY 29, 1993 

KP1 

Pound 

Russet Baking 
Potatoes 

15-lb. Bag 

99 

SLICED 
FREE 

WITH MEAT AND ONION OR 
REGULAR 

Vietti 
Hot Dog sauce 

10-oz. 

4 s 



Hutchison's McDonald's 
restaurants top rated 

Five McDonald's restaurants 
owned and operated by Bob and Tom 
Hutchison and located in Pikeville, 
South Williamson, Paintsville, 
Prestonsburg and Louisa have been 
named among this year's top rated 
McDonald's restaurants. The Pitts­
burgh Regional McDonald's Corpo­
rate Office recognized the restaurants 
with its prestigious Outstanding Res­
taurant Award. 

"Wecouldn'thavewonthisaward 
withoutthefmemanagementandstaff 
at the restaurants," said Tom 
Hutchison. 

in recognition of demonstrated lead­
ership in quality, service and cleanli­
ness, staffing and training, execution 
of national and local promotion and 
public relations programs, reinvest­
ment and customer appeal of the res­
taurants. The awards are based on 
each restaurant's performance dur­
ing the last calendar year. 

GED recipient 
"We also appreciate the support 

we receive from the Pikeville, South 
Williamson, Paintsville, Prestonsburg 
andLouisacommunities,"addedBob 
Hutchison. 

"Our 38-year commitment to the 
highest standard of quality, service, 
cleanliness and value is what makes 
McDonald's successful," said Bill 
Hockett, regional vice president "But 
it's the dedication and enthusiasm of 
the operators, managers and crew 
people that make McDonald's spe­
cial. The McDonald's teams in the 
Pikeville, South Williamson, 
Paintsville, Prestonsburg and Louisa 
restaurants sure Imow how to do it 
right!" 

Wl!ma Hall, • student with the GED program sponsored by the Maytown 
;:nmily Rosource Center, received her GED certification. She took the 
test at Prestonsburg Community College on April 30, and received the 
resuhs • couple of weeks later. Also pictured Is Vonetta Hancock, 
Instructor. 

The Outstanding Restaurant 
Awards were given to the Hutchisons 

Small business loans 
seminar to be held 

The East Kentucky Small Busi­
ness Development Center and the 
Citizens National Bank of Paintsville 
will offer a seminar entitled, "Small 
Business Loans: Understanding The 
Process ... This seminar is scheduled 
for Tuesday, June 8, from 6:00p.m.-
8:30 p.m., and will be conducted by 
Mike Morley, General Management 
Consultant for the East Kentucky 
Small Business Development Cen­
ter. 

This seminar will be presented at 
the Citizens National Bank in 

MoJ.ley str~tegies 
by Charles Givens 

Banks use your money to make 
more money. For that privilege, even 
the smallest deposits should be treated 
with fairness and consideration. 

Strategy: Place your checking ac­
count in a bank that won't bold your 
deposit checks. 

Banks are glad to allow you to 
make a deposit, butmaynotcreditthe 
money to your accmmt for several 
days. 

Your bank's excuse is that the 
chances of somebody having written 
you a bad check are high enough that, 
until the bank actually receives the 
money, you won't get credit in your 
account. 

The ttuth is your bank receives the 
money from the Federal Reserve 
Bank within 24 hours. 

Prior to a law enacted in Septem­
ber 1988, banks were in the habit of 
holding deposits with out-of-town 
checks for up to three weeks. Federal 
law now limits the bank holding pe­
riod to three days for local checks and 
seven days for out-of-town checks. 

The bank still gets its money within 
24 hours, but at least the scheme bas 

been limited by law. 
Even if the bank bas held your 

deposit and collected the money, if 
you write a check against the so­
called uncollected funds, the bank 
may bounce your check and charge 
you a ''non-sufficient funds" fee. The 
bank has your money and is also 
collecting $20 from you. If the check 
you deposited was for $100, the bank 
is getting a 20 percent one-day inter­
est return. 

Here's how to overcome the prob­
lem. Introduce yourself to the bank 
manager and get an agreement that 
none of your funds will be held. Not 
ever, not for any reason. The man­
agerhas the power to give you instant 
access to all your deposits. 

If your current bank won't give 
you special benefits, you e ither 
haven' t made a friend at the bank or 
you're worldng with the wrong bank. 
If so, change banks and let your friends 
lmow which is the better bank. 

Art you in the marltet to seU or buy 1 ho1111 
while the intern! rates are so low? Why not 
call a fuli-tirnt REALTOR who it wiilinv to 
go that extra step to insurt you find what 
you nted. Contact BrenclaSturgiU at Century 
21 Amtrican Way Realty at285-9803 for all 
your rulutate need•·()ntu~ 

,, --,..2t 

Paintsville at no charge and is co­
sponsored by Morehead State Uni­
versity Small Business Development 
Center. 

The seminar will address several 
issues including, Basic Financing 
Basics, Five C' s ofFinancing, Docu­
mentation and SBA Loans. 

Anyone interested in obtaining 
GovernmentFinancing should attend 
this seminar. 

Top rated 
For additional information or pre­

registration you may contact Linda 
or Mike at the Small Business Devel­
opment Center at (606) 432-5848, or 
Susan Conley at the Citizens Na­
tional Bank, (606) 789-4001, ext 245. 

Bill Hockett, McDonald's regional vice president, presents McDonald's 
Outstanding Restaurant Award to McDonald's owner/operators Tom, 
Mary Jane and Bob Hutchison. The award recognlzesthatthe Hutchison's 
five restaurants In Pikeville, South Williamson, Paintsville, Pikeville and 
Louisa were top rated among McDonald's restaurants In 1992. 

rrfie votes are in ana fiere are tfie cfear winners!! 

u.s. 23 
Pikeville, KY 

417 S. Lake Dr. 
Prestonsburg, KY 

Located at Weddington Plaza. this Over 14,000 sq. ft. in this commer-
15,000 sq. ft. +1- building was for- cial building formerly owned by Ed 
merly the Price Hager Decorating Walters. The building is designed to 
Center. With warehouse, display, allow separate businesses for the 
and office space this facility has upstairs and downstairs. You can 
many possibilities. Over 2 acres of use what you need and rent or lease 
levelland with a total of 4 acres +1- the remainder. Located in a high 
available. The building is priced at traffic area with off-street parking, 
$325,000. Call for details on the city utilities, and much morel 
leasehold. (1 -906P) $450,000. (2-311) 

r=J Pikeville Office 432-8181 
Prestonsburg Office 886-3700 

JOB TITLE EXPERIENCE EDUCATION SALARY 
CASHIER- CHECKER 6 MONTHS ~2 $4 . 25 HOUR 
COOK, FULL SERVICE 1 YEAR 10 NEGOTIABLE 
COUNSELOR, SCHOOL CERTIFIED 16 NEGOTIABLE 
CUTTING MACHI NE OPERATOR,JOY RB- 16 1 YEAR 08 $10.00 HOUR 
DESK CLERK 1 YEAR 12 NEGOTIABLE 
EMERGENCY MEDICAL TECHNICIAN CERTIFIED 12 $4.25 HOUR 
DRIVER, MOBILE VAN 1 YEAR AGE 21 OR OLDER 12 $4.25 HOUR 
FAST FOOD WORKER, PART-TIME NONE 10 $4. 25 HOUR 
INSURANCE SALES REP. NONE 12 COMMISSION 
MANAGER, RETAIL STORE 2- 3 YEARS 14 $22,000 YEAR 
MEDICAL TRANSCRIBER !YEAR 12 NEGOTIABLE 
MEDICAL DOCTOR, GEN. PRACTICE LICENSED 19 $85 I 000 YEAR 
NURSE AIDE, PART- TIME NONE 08 $4.2"5 HOUR 
PHARMACY CLERK 6 MONTHS 12 $4 . 25 HOUR 
PHYSICIAN, INTERNIST LICENSED 19 $100,000 YEAR 
PROGRAM AIDE, PART-TIME AGE 55 OR OLDER 10 $4 .25 HOUR 
SALESPERSON/DELIVERER, FLOWERS 1 YEAR 10 NEGOTIABLE 
SECRETARY, LEGAL, PART- TIME 1 YEAR(NEED RESUME) 12 $4 . 25 HOUR 
SECURITY GUARD 3 YEARS(ANY TYPE WORK) 10 $4.25 HOUR 
SPEECH PATHOLOGIST LICENSED 17 $28,000 YEAR 
TRU~ DRIVER, HEAVY (AGE 25 OR OLDER) 1 YEAR + CDL 08 NEGO'UA!!LE 
WAITER/WAITRESS, FULL SERVICE 6 MONTHS 10 $4.25 HOUR 
MINE SUPERVISOR, UNDERGROUND 3 YEARS 10 NEGOTIABLE 

Department of Employment Service 
Job Service Office Locations: 

COUNTY . 
FLOYD- JOHNSON 
JOHNSON 
AREA 
FLOYD 
JOHNSON 
FLOYD 
MARTIN 
AREA 
AREA 
FLOYD 
FLOYD 
AREA 
KNOTT 
FLOYD 
AREA 
FLOYD 
FLOYD 
AREA 
MARTIN 
AREA 
STATEWIDE 
FLOYD 
FLOYD 

-

Prestonsburg •.• 443 N. Lake Drive ................ Monday thru Friday ..... 8 a.m.-4:30p.m. 
Paintsville ........ Room 223, Courthouse ........ Monday thru Friday ..... 8 a.m.-4:40 p.m. 
Inez ................... Room 100, Old Courthouse Thursdays only ............. 9 a.m.-2:00p.m. 
Salyersville ...... 1st Floor, Courhouse ........... Monday thru Friday ..... 8 a.m.-4:30p.m. 

Prestonsburg 
Labor Force Profile 

IDIALEMPLOYMENT AND UNEMPLOYMENT 

Estimates of Civilian Labor Force, Employment, Unemployment, and 
Unemployment Rates for Kentucky and Prestonsburg Local Office. 

Civilian Total Total 
LaborForce Emnlovmeot Unewploymsml 

KENTUCKY 1,742,459 1,622,488 119,971 
Prestonsburg 
Floyd 
Johnson 
Magoffm 
Martin 

30,822 27,349 3,473 
15,711 14,132 1,579 
8,670 7,911 759 
3,401 2,672 729 
3,040 2,634 406 

Cabinet for Human Resources 
Employment Services Office 

North Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 
Mon. thru Fri. 8:00-4:30 
Phone(606)886-2396 

BENCttMARK RE·ALTY, INC. 
Prestonsburg .· H,C. 71 , Box 192 
· Office Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 

886·2048 Morris Hylton Jr., Broker 

. lvel. 
Office 

874-9033 

NOW IS DiE TIME TO BUY THIS BENCHMARK-BUILT HOMEI This home 
consists of 3 bedrooms and 2 baths. This well-constructed home is priced to sell, 
just reduced from $49,000.00 to $45,000.001 

.e.ERME.LE-This lovely home consists of 3 bedrooms with 2 baths, situated on a 
100x100 lot Priced at $64,900.00. Cali today for further details. 
PRATER CREEK <NEAR DANA POST OFFICI;}--$74,900.00, JUST REDUCED 
TO $65,900.00111 This home offers 3 levels of everything your family needs! 1at 
floor-kitchen, dining room, living room, and garage. Ground floor-.,nfinished 
basement and laundry area. 3rd floor-3 bad rooms and 2 baths. Home offers nice 
pine trees and 10 acres± of land. This is a super-nice home with a super-nice price! 
GARBETT (LOCATED ON ROUTE 80)-3 bedrooms, 2 baths, approx. 1,152 sq. 
ft. An affordable home priced at $28,500.00. Call Hansel or Frances. 
WEST PRESTONSBURG-Handyman's speciall This home has a lot of history 
behind il3 bedrooms and 1 bath. Lot size is 33±x 100±. Priced in the teens. 
BANNER-If you are looking fora deal, then look no morel Th1s2-bedroom, 1-bath 
home is great fora couple just starting out. Priced to sell at$27,500.00. Call today! 
ABBOTT CREEK-ACBEAGE--3 developed lots and potential for 3 morel Ail city 
utilities, country privacy. Cali for details if you are looking for prime residential 
property! 
Wl.LL-This property consists of 2 acres, mostly hillside at this lime, but has the 
potential to be developed into 3lots. Lots are selling in this area for about $6,000.00 
each. includes water and electric hook-ups. 
JOHNSON COUNTY Two 25·acre tracts of land, for a total of 50 acres±. Offers 
a rc.ad easement, electricity, and phone hook·up. The timber on this property has 
not been cut in 25 years. 
MIDPLE CREEK-INVESTMENT OPPORTUNITY. 3 units bringing $800.00 per 
month in income, with approx. 5 acres of property. Has city water, low·rate natual 
gas. Minutes from Prestonsburg. Call today for further details on this exceptional 
deal! 

ROUTE 114, JUST OUTSIDE OF PRESTONSBUBG-3 mobile homes, good 
income, completely set up with state-approved septic system. Hurry!ll 

NEW LISTIN<r-A MUST·SEE to apprtelate tilt lnl• 
rlor c:l thil ~room home locatad on 1.5 ICI'H :t. 
Q.OO$.f, 

REDUCE[)..41AROLD: Eleve~room VIctorian hcult. 
Residential or commercial poealblllles. REDUCED 
$5,000.~F. 

CITY CONVENIENCES with the peace and quiet ofthl cOUillry. I thlllla what you're lookklgfor, youlhould 1ft 
thla ~bedroom homt. ~1H. 
ATTRACTIVE 5-bedfcom home on approximately 1 acre. Large~ garage, family room with kilchtnette ~ 
appliance. W·OO$-F. 
THIS COULD BE IT! You mllllt 1ft thlt btaullful3-btdroom, ~blth, brick home with 2-e.- garage,lalgt family 
room and kHchen with all appllancet, maat•·btdroom wMh drtaalng room. all on 1501115 level, tenc.cllol 
F.002.f. 
PRESTONSBURG: Ycx; muat 11tthlll ~bedroom, :Hlath, brick homt with a large rte. room, famUy room, formal 
dining and living rooma, and an txtra-llrgt kftchtn. E•y walking ICCI88 to downtown, tchoole,llld chun:h. 
W.OQS.f, 

LAHD AHD BUSINESS PROPERTY 
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY: 30 ICI'H ±, locllttd by Dewey Dam rtertatlonat Area. 1+416-F. 
MIDDLE CREEK: 15 V8CIIIIIota to build on or develop Into a aubdlvlelon. ~1H. 
SPURLOCK: 5 ACRES :t. Q.002·F. 

IB STALLARD MARTIN 
~ .......... • 

Broker-AuctionMr 880-0021 Specializing In 
·.~ SALES ASSOCIATE$: •Sales, ', ... WAYNE JOHNSON-478-6143 
@ 886·9500 DOUG WIREMAM-7fi-3a11 e Auctions, --LIHOE.R BETTY MARTIN-886-0021 

e Appraisals. UIKE DA VIS-298-00U 
:l:U North r...ke Drtn SHEILA WEST-874-$477 Pftlltou1nart. JE7. 418113 

BIG BRANCH OF BULL CBEEK-$85,000.IN­
VEST YOUR UONEY wiHiy in thil3-btdroom 
home plua 2 more mobile homea aituated on 
approximately 10 acre• nYI. 

********BEPUCED******** 
GALVESTON-$49,900. LIVE LIKE A KING IN 
YOUR OWN CASTlE in this 3-btdroom, 2-bath 
home wlfirtplact in the fam. room, carport and 
21/2 acrH m'l. Thia beauty h• a new roof, new 

carpet in the livinll & dinin!l roome, new fino- ~==;;=~~ 
leum in the kitchen & dininv am. Don't h11i- f] 
tate, thia one wont bt on the marilet for long. 

STAFEOBDSVILLE- $55,000. ENJOY THE 
SUMMER in this ~droomhomesituated on 
13 acrea of mowable land. Natural 1111 heal 
and window unit air at a price you can afford. 

LAHCfB-$159,900. LOCATION COUNTSIII 
Thie affordably-prictd investment property 
is located in downtown Preatonaburg with 
approximately 150 ft. road front at a great 
buy. 

CALL ABOUT OUR OTHER LISTINGS 
NEED QUICK CASH? CALL ALLIED ABOUT AN AUCTION!!! 



The Floyd County Tirrus 

NOTICE OF 
BOND RELEASE 

PHASE Ill 
In accordance with the 

provisions of 405KAR 
10:040, notice is hereby 
given that Coal Mac Inc., 
P.O. Box3428, Pikeville, KY 
41502, intends to apply for 
bond release on Permit 
Number 836-0013 which 
was last issued on 2-7-84. 
The application covers an 
area of approximately 59.29 
acres located 2 miles South 
of Grethel in Floyd County. 

The permit is approxi­
mately 1 ooo feet west from 
St. Rt. 979 junction with St. 
Rt. 979 and located 1/4 miles 
north of Hamilton Branch of 
Mud Creek. The latitude is 
3711 27" 52". The longitude 
is 8211 39' 30". 

The total bond now in 
effect is a surety bond for 
$30,1 oo.oo of which 
approximately 100% is to be 
released, which would 
constitute a phase Ill 
release. 

Reclamation workthusfar 
performed includes: back­
filling, final grading, seeding, 
mulching completed in 
Spring 1988. Results 
achieved include growth of 
vegetation as per the 
revegetation plan and the 
establishment of the post 
mining land use. 

Written comments, objec­
tions, requests for a public 
hearing must be filed with 
the Director of the Division 
of Field Services, #2 Hudson 

~ Hollow, U.S. 127 South, 
Frankfort, KY 40601, by date 
30 days from the last 
advertisement, which should 
be June 25, 1993. 

A public hearing has been 
scheduledforJune29, 1993 
at the Department of Surface 
Mining Reclamation Office, 
1346 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, KY, at 11:00 
a.m. 

The Hearing will be 
canceled if the Department 
does not receive any public 
request within the time frame 
stated above. 

• This is the final advertise-
ment of this application; all 
comments, objections or 
requests for a hearing or 
conference must be re­
ceived within 30 days of 
today's date. 1t. 

NOTICE OF 
BOND RELEASE 

PHASE Ill 
In accordance with the 

provisions of 405KAR 
1 0:040, notice is hereby 

.. given that Coal Mac, Inc., 
P .0 . Box3428, Pikeville, KY 
41502, intends to apply for 
bond release on Permit 
Number 836-5074 which 
was last issued on 12-15-
83. The application covers 
an area of approximately 
12.70 acres located 0.25 
miles northwest of Craynor 
in Floyd County. 

The permit is approxi­
mately 0.25 miles west from 
St. Rt. 979 junction with 
Hamilton Branch Road and 
located 0.5 miles northwest 

• ofTeaberry, Ky. The latitude 
is 3711 27' 34". The longitude 
is 8211 34' 35". 

The total bond now in 
effect is a surety bond for 
$25,600.00 of which 100% 
is to be released which would 
constitute a phase Ill 
release. 

Reclamation work thus far 
performed includes: back­
filling, final grading, seeding, 
mulching completed in 1986. 
Results achieved include 
growth of vegetation as per 
the revegetation plan and 
the establishmentofthe post 
mining land use. 

Written comments, objec­
tions, requests for a public 
hearing must be filed with 
the Director of the Division 
of Field Services, #2 Hudson 
Hollow, U.S. 127 South, 
Frankfort, KY 40601, by date 
30 days from the last 
advertisement, which should 
be June 25, 1993. 

A public hearing has been 
scheduledforJune29, 1993 
atthe Department of Surface 
Mining Reclamation Office, 
1346 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, KY, at 1:00 

• p.m . 
.,., The Hearing will be 

cancelled if the Department 

does not receive any public 
request within the time frame 
stated above. 

This is the final advertise­
ment of this application; all 
comments, objections or 
requests for a hearing or 
conference must be re­
ceived within 30 days of 
today's date. 1 t. 

NOTICE OF 
BOND RELEASE 

PHASE Ill 
In accordance with the 

provisions of 405KAR 
10:040, notice is hereby 
given that Coal Mac, Inc., 
P.O. Box3428, Pikeville, KY 
41502, intends to apply for 
bond release on Permit 
Number836-00651nc. 1 and 
Ill which was last issued on 
8-14-84. The application 
covers an area of 
approximately 67.6 acres 
located 1.4 miles north of 
Craynor in Floyd county. 

The permit is approxi­
mately 3.0 miles East from 
Hamilton Branch Road 
junction with St. Rt. 979 and 
located 3.0 miles East of 
McDowell. The latitude is 3711 
27' 25". The longitude is 822 
40' 39". 

The total bond now in 
effect is a surety bond for 
Inc. I $35,400.00; Inc. Ill 
$7,600.00 of which 100% is 
to be released, which would 
constitute a phase Ill 
release. 

Reclamation workthusfar 
performed includes: back­
filling, final grading, seeding, 
mulching completed in Fall 
1986. Results achieved 
include growth of vegetation 
as per the revegetation plan 
and the establishment of the 
post mining land use. 

Written comments, objec­
tions, requests for a public 
hearing must be filed with 
the Director of the Division 
of Field Services, #2 Hudson 
Hollow, U.S. 127 South, 
Frankfort, KY 40601, by date 
30 days from the last 
advertisement, which should 
be June 25, 1 993. 

A public hearing has been 
scheduled for June 29, 1993 
at the Department of Surface · 
Mining Reclamation Office, 
1346 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, KY, at 9:00 
a.m. 

The Hearing will be 
canceled if the Department 
does not receive any public 
request within the time frame 
stated above. 

This Is the final advertise­
ment of this application; all 
comments, objections or 
requests for a hearing or 
conference must be re­
ceived within 30 days of 
today's date. 1 t. 

NOTICE OF 
PUBUC SALE 

June4, 1993at11:00a.m. 
a 1986 Mercury Lynx, serial 
number 2MEBP5195GB-
643255 will be sold to the 
highest bidder for CASH "as 
is where is• at the First 
Guaranty National Bank, 
Martin, Ky. to satisfy the 
unpaid balance of a 
Installment Contract signed 
on January 27, 1993. The 
vehicle may be inspected 
prior to the sale. The 
undersigned reserves the 
right to bid. The buyer will 

pay all taxes and transfer 
fees. 

First Guaranty National 
Bank 

Collection Department 
Martin, Ky. 41649 

W-5/19, 5/26, 6/2 

FLOYD CIRCUIT 
COURT 

C.A. NO. 93-CI-00206 
The Firat Commonwealth 
Bank of Prestonsburg, 
Ky ••.•••.••••••••••.•.•• Pialntiff 

VS: NOTICE OF SALE 
Donald A. Baldwin, et 
ai ................ Defendant(a) 

By virtue of a Judgment 
and Order of Sale of the 
Floyd Circuit Court rendered 
at the May 17 term, 1993, in 
the above styled cause, I 
shall proceed to offer for sale 
at the Courthouse door in 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky, to 
the highest and best bidder, 
at public auction, on the 1Oth 
day of June, 1993, at 1 0:30 
o'clock a.m., same being a 
day of the regulartermofthe 
Floyd Circuit Court, for cash 
or upon a credit of thirty (30) 
days, the following 
described property, to-wit: 

A certain tract or parcel of 
land located in Floyd County, 
Kentucky on Nigh Branch of 
Arkansas Creek, and more 
particularly described as 
follows: 

Beginning at a concrete 
marker located 25 ft. from 
the creek; thence straight 
up the hill approximately 160 
feet to another concrete 
marker; thence around the 
hill in a generally straight 
line to the oroperty line of 

James Jitter .~lien; thence 
following the property line of 
James Jitter Allen down the 
hill to the intersection of the 
property line of said James 
Jitter Allen and Opal M. 
Boyd; thence following the 
property line of said Opal M. 
Boyd back to the point o1 
beginning. 

Being the same property 
conveyed to Sherry Lee 
Baldwin and Don A Baldwin, 
by Deed dated the 14th day 
of March, 1988, from Opal 
M. Boyd, single, which is 
duly recorded in Deed Book 
317, Page 295, in the office 
of the Floyd County Clerk. 

This property is sold, 
subject to property taxes due 
Floyd County, Kentucky. 

The amount of money to 
be raised by this sale shall 
be Seventy-three thousand 
eight hundred sixty-seven 
dollars and eighty-four cents 
($73,867.84), with interest 
at the rate of 11.5% per 
annum which as of March 1, 
1993, was eight thousand 
two hundred ninety-one 
dollars and nine cents 
($8,291.09), which is 
accruing at a daily rate of 
$25.2822, until Judgment 
and with interest thereafter 
at the legal rate of 12"/o until 
paid; the sum of fourteen 
thousand one hundred fifty­
three dollars and twenty-five 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR 
BID PROPOSALS 

Separate sealed bid proposals for the following work 
will be received by the Big Sandy Area Development 
District at the Big Sandy ADD office, 1 00 Resource 
Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. until 2:00p.m., local time, 
on the 15th day of June, 1993 and then at said time 
opened and read aloud. 

The work for which bids are to be submitted is a 
design-construct project to develop and construct a 
senior citizens and day care center and related 
facilities as described in detail in the Contract 
Documents. The major items to be constructed 
include: 

(1) A new single story building to house a senior 
citizens center and day care center. 

(2) Site development of said structure. 
(3) Parking lot and drive. 

Two meetings are scheduled to be held at the office 
of the Big Sandy Area ADD at 1 00 Resource Drive to 
provide further information to bidders and to answer 
bidder questions. The first meeting will be May 25, 
1993 at 2:00 p.m. The second meeting will be June 
8, 1993 at 2:00p.m. Bidder attendance is not required 
but is encouraged. 

The contract documents may be examined at the 
following locations: 

(1) Big Sandy Area Development District, 503 South 
Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 (until May 
20, 1993). 

(2) Big Sandy Area Development District, 1 00 
Resource Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 (after 
May 20, 1993). 

(3) Dodge Plan Room, 2525 Harrodsburg Rd., 
Lexington, Ky. 40504 

(4) Dodge Plan Room, 405 Capitol St., Suite 509, 
Charleston, W. Va. 

Copies of the contract documents, including 
information to bidders and required proposal forms 
may be obtained at the office of Big Sandy Area 
Development District upon payment of $30.00. Any 
unsuccessful bidder, upon returning such a set within 
1 0 days of bid and in good condition, will be refunded 
his payment and any non-bidder upon so returning 
such a set will be refunded $15.00. 

The owner reserves the right to waive any informalities 
or to reject any or all bids. Bids will be evaluated on 
the basis of lowest price, criteria for which shall 
include: useful life of materials, ease and price of 
maintenance, aesthetic appearance. Further criteria 
is defined in the Contract Documents. 

To insure the execution of a contract for which the bid • is made, all bids shall be accol"f1)anied by a certified 
check or bid bond payable to the Big Sandy Area 
Development District and in an amount equal to five 
percent of the bid. 

No bidder may withdraw his bid within 60 days after 
the actual date of the opening thereof. 

All questions should be directed to: David Gardner, 
Big Sandy Area Development District, 1 00 Resource 
Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653, (606) 886-2374. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 

NOTICE 
(OF FILING OF SETTLEMENT) 

I, Frank Derossett, Clerk of the Floyd District Court, do hereby certify that the 
following settlements of estates have been filed in my office, and anyone 
desiring to take exception to said settlement must do so on or before June 30th, 
1993, at 9:00a.m. 

Settlement Case Number Estate Fiduciary Date 
Final 92-P-00361 Ruby Akers George Akers 04-28·93 
Final 92-P-00395 lsom Bentley Missouri Bentley 04·27-93 
Final 92-P-00351 Tessie Fannin Paul A. Daniels 05·19·93 
Final 92-P-00237 Julia B. Blevins Eunice Parsons 04-30-93 
Final 93-P-0009 Sandra Wooten Gwendolyn Hammond 05·14-93 
Final 93·P·00020 Verlean Moore Roland Moore 05-05·93 
Final 92-P-00303 Minnie S. DeRossett Claude Osborne 04-29·93 
Annual 83-P-191 James F. Litz Paul Litz 05·28-93 

cents ($14, 153.25) with 
interest at the rate of 14% 
per annum which as of 
March 1 , 1993 was in the 
amount of three thousand 
two hundred sixty-one 
dollars and seventy-four 
cents ($3,261.74), which is 
accruing at a daily rate of 
$5.4138, until Judgment and 
with interestthereafter atthe 
contract rate until paid, 
including reasonable 
attorney fees, and the costs 
of this action, including costs 
of advertising of this sale 
and the fees and commis­
sions for conducting this 
sale. 

For the purchase price the 
purchaser must execute 
bond with approved surety 
or sureties, bearing legal 
interest from the day of sale 
until paid and having the 
force and effect of a 
judgment with a lien retained 
upon said property as a 
further security. Bidders will 
be prepared to comply with 
these terms. 

Given under my hand, this 
19th day of May, 1993. 

James R. Allen, 
Master Commissioner 

Floyd Circuit Court } 

FLOYD CIRCUIT 
COURT 

C. A. NO. 92·CI·00781 
Pikeville National Bank & Truat 
Compeny ..................... Piaintiff 

VS: NOTICE OF SALE 
Oelorea Stumbo ....... Oefendant 

By virtue of a Judgment 
and Order of Sale of the 
Floyd Circuit Court rendered 
at the February 18 term, 
1993, in the above styled 
cause, I shall proceed to offer 
for sale at the Courthouse 
door in Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky, to the highest and 
best bidder, at public 
auction, on the 1 Oth day of 
June, 1993, at 10:00 o'clock 
a.m., same being a day of 
the regular term of the Floyd 
Circuit Court, for cash or 
upon a credit of 30 days, the 
following described 
property, to-wit: 

A certain tract or parcel of 
land located in Floyd County, 
Kentucky, at East McDowell, 
on Frasure's Creek, and 
more particularly described 
as follows: 

Beginning at the mo~~~th of 
a hallow on the County road; 
thence running up county 
road to the Mose Frasure 
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line; thence running with 
Mose Frasure line to the top 
of the hill, thence running 
around the ridge to the 
Raymond Hall line, thence 
with the hollow to the county 
road; thence up the county 
road to the beginning. 

Being the same property 
conveyed to Delores 
Stumbo by Deed from 
German Stumbo dated June 
13, 1983, recorded in Deed 
Book 276, Page 252, 
records of the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office. 

This property is sold, 
subject to property taxes due 
Floyd County, Kentucky. 

The amount of money to 
be raised by this sale shall 
be $43,590.92 with interest 

purchaser must execute 
bond with approved surety 
or sureties, bearing legal 
interest from the day of sale 
until paid and having the 
force and effect of a 

judgment with a lien retained 
upon said property as a 
further security. Bidders will 
be prepared to comply with 
these terms. 

Given under rrry hand, this 
20th day of May, 1993. 

James R. Allen, 
Master Commissioner 

Floyd Circuit Court 
W-5/26, 6/2, 6/9 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
Upon and on this date af­

ter publication of this notice, 
I will no longer be respon­
sible for any debts incurred 
by anyone other than my­
self. 

at the rate of 1 0. 5"/o per 
annum from May 24, 1992 
until the date of Judgment; 
and at the rate of 12% per 
annum from the date of 
Judgment until paid; and 
plaintiff's attorney fees in the ' 
amount of $750.00, and the 
costs oft his action, including 
costs of advertising of this 
sale and the fees and 
commissions for conducting 
this sale. 

Wade Frasure 
H. C. 78, Box 335 

McDowell, Ky. 41647 
W-5/26, F-5/28 

* * * 
Therf' ir; nothing hard­

f'r than thf' softness of 
indifft>rf'nf"e. 

For the purchase price the -Juan ~lontalvo 

LEGAL NOTICE 
(NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT) 

I, Frank DeRossett, Clerk of the Floyd District Court, do hereby certify that the following persons have 
been appointed fiduciaries by the District Court, and all persons indebted to an estate should settle with 
the fiduciary within six (6) months from the date of appointment. 

Date of Appl Case Number 
04-27-93 93·P.00144 

04-27-93 93·P.00145 

04·29·93 93-P-00146 

04-30-93 93-P-00148 

05..05-93 93-P.00151 

05-05-93 93-P.00152 

05-05·93 93-P.00153 

05-06-93 93-P.00154 

05-11-93 93·P.00157 

05-1(}.93 93·P-00159 

05-1(}.93 93-P-00160 

05-10-93 93-P-00161 

05-11-93 93-P-00162 

05-12-93 93·P-00164 

05-12-93 93·P.00165 

05-14-93 93-P-00168 

05-14-93 93-P-00169 

05-14-93 93·P·00171 

05-17-93 93·P..Q0173 
. 

05-17·93 93-P.00174 

05-18-93 93-P-00175 

05-18-93 93-P.00176 

05-19-93 93-P-00177 

05·20-93 93-P.00178 

05-21-93 93-P-00179 

Estate of 
Thelma Miller 
H.C. 69, Box 615 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Phillip Tipton 
H.C. 73, Box 1157 
Harold, KY 41635 
Virginia Conn 
H.C. 77, Box 200 
Galveston, KY 41629 
Ruth T. Arrowood 
Drift, KY 41619 

Amanda Adkins 
H.C. 74, Box 260 
Dana, KY 41615 
Annette B. Yates 
317 Harkins Avenue 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

Frank Warrix 
H.C. 71, Box 87 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Thelma W. Dotson 
H. C. 70, Box 805 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Elsie D. Prater 
At. 1, Box 412 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Dave Roop 
Box344 
Weeksbury, KY 41669 
Emery Osborne 
Box300 
Betsy Layne, KY 41605 
Lowell McCown 
Box286 
Auxier, KY 41602 
Howard Wilhite 
400 ligon Camp Rd. 
Ligon, KY 41646 
Olivia Nikole Hall 
Box245 
AUen, KY 41601 
Denzil Ray Hall 
Box245 
Allen, KY 41601 
lucy Ransdell 
Circle Drive 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Elex P. Davis 
H.C. 74, Box 255 
Banner, KY 41603 
Dorothy Meade 
H.C. 73, Box 220 
Harold, KY 41635 
Debra Conn 
At. 122 
Hunter, KY 41641 
Abel Johnson 
H.C. 72, Box 140 
Halo, KY 41633 
Samatha Vance 
H.C. 77, Box 148 
Beaver, KY 41604 
William Henegar 
Box266 
Wayland, KY 41666 
William Wells 
H. C. 80, Box 200 
Langley, KY 41645 
Edna Mabel Tisdale 
P.O. Box 152 
Auxier, KY 41602 
Wes Campbell 
H. C. 70, Box 5025 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

Fiduciary-Address 
Isabelle Stephens 
H.C. 69, Box 615 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Glenda Tipton 
H.C. 73, Box 1157 
Harold, KY 41635 
Henry Shepherd 
rio Hershel Shepherd 
Galveston, KY 41629 
William Arrowood 
P.O. Box 157 
Drift, KY 41619 
larry Arrowood 
6300 Murray Lane 
Brentwood, TN 37027 
Linda Adkins 
H.C. 74, Box 260 
Dana, KY 41615 
Patricia Hoffman­
P.O. Box 116 
Blue River, KY 41607 
Phyllis Hayden 
317 Harkins Avenue 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Evelyn Warrix 
H.C. 71, Box 87 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Orvnle Dotson 
H.C. 70, Box 805 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Myr11e Dotson Prater 
Rt. 1, Box 412 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Merlin S. Roop 
Box344 
Weeksbury, KY 41669 
Sharlene Osborne 
Box300 
Betsy layne, KY 41605 
Stella McCown 
Box286 
Auxier, KY 41602 
Ed~h R. Wilh~e 
400 Ligon Camp Rd. 
Ligon, KY 41646 
Karen D. Hall 
Box245 
ADen, KY 41601 
Karen D. Hall 
Box245 
ADen, KY 41601 
Helen Schroeder 
4532 S. Chelsea Lane 
Bethesda, Md. 20814 
Gene D. Davis 
P.O. Box40 
Banner, KY 41603 
Gary Meade 
H.C. 73, Box 220 
Harold, KY 41635 
Perry Ed Conn 
At. 122 
Hunter, KY 41641 
Olive Johnson 
H.C. 72, Box 140 
Halo, KY 4 t 633 
Wendell Vance 
H.C. 77, Box 148 
Beaver, KY 41604 
Willadean S. Henegar 
Box266 
Wayland, KY 4 t 666 
Joy Wells 
H. C. 80, Box 200 
Langley, KY 41645 
Barbara F. Dunn 
P.O. Box 152 
Auxier, KY 41602 
Jackie Campbell 
H. C. 70, Box 5025 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

Attorney-Addresa 
John Callis 
P.O. Box606 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

James R. Allen 
P.O. Box847 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

John Mann 
P.O. Box 6090 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Jim G. Vanover 
P.O. Box231 
Pikeville, KY 41502 

Gerald DeRossett 
8 South First Avenue 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
John Allen 
P.O. Box441 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
John Coleman 
P.O. Box311 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Robert Bishop 
P.O. Box 311 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

Robert Bishop 
P.O. Box 311 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

John Kevin West 
309 N. Broadway 
Lexington, KY 40592 
John Kevin West 
309 N. Broadway 
Lexington, KY 40592 

Brett D. Davis 
P.O. Box700 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Jeanne Channell 
P.O. Box 1300 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
John Coleman 
P.O. Box 311 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
John Earl Hunt 
P.O. Box850 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
Earl Martin McGuire 
P.O. Box 1257 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

John Chafin 
P.O. Box 700 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
John Mann 
P.O. Box 1090 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
ThomasSm~h 
P.O. Box606 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 
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A public hearing will be to expend public funds to of the self-insurance, Real Estate Real Estate Au~os I 

held by the City of insure their officers, insurance, or investment For Sale l! R f 
Wheelwright at City Hall on employees, and properties programs which may be For Sa/e.:::,::: For Sale l!or Sa'e rOr en 
June 7, 1993 at 7 p.m. for against any liability or created and operated by .._ _______ ..;:.~ ~\,); n 1

1 

_ 

the purpose of obtaining property damage and to KMRMA. 
written and oral comments associate with other public Section 5. The city's 
of citizens regarding the agencies pursuant to the current workers' compen-
proposed annual Budget, Kentucky lnterlocal Coope- sation insurance coverage 
the use of Municipal Road ration Act, KRS 65.210 to is due to expire on June 30, 
Aid and Local Government 65.300, for insurance 1993. Underthelawsofthe 
Economic Assistance purposes; and Commonwealth of Kentuc-
Funds, and amending WHEREAS, KRS 65.210 ky, the city is required to 
Budget for FY 1 992-93. Any to 65.300 authorizes cities maintain workers' compen-
person(s)(especiallySenior to jointly exercise with other sation insurance coverage 
Citizens)whocannotsubmit public agencies under an on its employees. It is 

t
whreittpeunbclt'commemeetnt'ntsg,obrutattwe,.nsdh inte rloc al cooperation understood that KMRMAwill 

t begin operating a workers' 
to submit comments, should agreemen any power or compensation self-
call c1·ty Hall at 452_4202, powers, privileges or 

th it · d insurance group effective 
so that the crt· y can make au or y exerctse or 

abl f · b · · July 1, 1993, which will 
arrangementstosecurethet'r cap eo exerctse ycittes, 

d f rth h · h enable the city to obtain the 
comments. an u er aut onzes t e 

ti t · t 1 1 necessary workers' com-
Mary Ann Johnson par es o an 1n er oca 

t. t t pensation insurance 
City Clerk coopera ton agreemen o 

W-5/26 create an administrative coverage. However, unless 
entity which may be the city acts immediately to 
delegated powers for enact this ordinance, there 
conducting and admini- will be insufficient time for 
steringjointandcooperative the city to take the steps 
undertakings on behalf of necessary to become a 
the participating public member of KMRMA and a 
agencies; and participant in the workers' 

CITY OF 
WHEELWRIGHT, 

KENTUCKY 

ORDINANCE NO. 1993·2 
AN ORDINANCEAPPROVINGA 
JOINT AND COOPERATIVE 
PROGRAM FOR SEL~ 
INSURANCE, INSURANCE, AND 
THE INVESTMENT OF PUBUC 
FUNDS AMONG VARIOUS 
CITIES, URBAN-COUNTY 
GOVERNMENTS, AND OTHER 
PUBUC AGENCIES WITHIN THE 
COMMONWEALTH OF KEN· 
TUCKY; AUTHORIZING THE 
EXECUTION OF THE "INTER­
LOCAL COOPERATION 
AGREEMENT TO ESTABUSH 
THE KENTUCKY MUNICIPAL 
RISK MANAGEMENT ASSO· 
CIATION;" APPROVING THE 
ARTICLES OF ASSOCIATION 
AND BYLAWS OF THE KEN­
TUCKY MUNICIPAL RISK 
MANAGEMENT ASSOCIATION; 
AND DECLARING AN 
EMERGENCY. 

WHEREAS, Section 
82.082 of the Kentucky 
Revised Statutes (KRS) 
authorizes cities to perform 
any function and exercise 
any power within their 
boundaries that is in 
furtherance of a public 
purpose of the city and not 
inconsistent with a 
constitutional provision or 
statute; and 

WHEREAS, cities are 

Bolen Appliance 
Service · 

Repairing, Buying, Selling 
Washers, Dryers, Stoves 

af!d 
Refrigerators . 

New and Used Parts. 
Special Orders. 

When you want the Best, 
Call: 

358-9617 or 946-2529 

LEARN TO DRlVE 
TAACTOR - TRAILERS 

WHEREAS, the elected compensation self-
officials of this city have insurance group to be 
determined that it would be operated by KM RMA. 
in the best interests of the Therefore, an emergency is 
city to join with other cities, declared to exist by the 
urban-countygovernments, legislative body of the city. 
and public agencies for the Thisordinanceshallbecome 
purpose of taking joint and effective after its first reading 
cooperative action to create and upon the affirmative vote 
and establish the Kentucky of two-thirds (213} of the . 
Mun~ipaiRiskManagement members of the legislative 

Association (KMRMA) as a bocfx. 
separate administrative Section 6. The city clerk 
entity, and through KMRMA shall cause this ordinance 
to create and administer to be published in 
various self-insurance, accordance with KRS 
insurance, and investment 83A.060(6) and KRS 
programs to provide self- Chapter 424 within ten (1 0) 
insurance and third party days of its enactment by the 
insurance coverages legislative body. 
against all types of liability INTRODUCED, SECONDED, 
and property damage, and GIVEN FIRST READING, AND 
to establish programs for the APPROVED by a vote of two­
investment of public funds; thirds (213) of the members 
and of the city legislative body at 

WHEREAS, the elected a duly convened meeting 
officialsofthecityhavebeen held on the 11 day of~ 
provided copies of the 1993. 
lnterlocal Agreement to 
Establish the KMRMA and 
the Articles of Association 
and Bylaws of the KMRMA 
and have reviewed these 
documents and found them 
to be acceptable. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT 
ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF 
WHEELWRIGHT AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. The city hereby 
approves the joint and 
cooperative programforself­
insurance, insurance, and 
the investment of public 
funds as set forth in the 
lnterlocal Agreement to 
Establish the KMRMA. 

Section 2. The Mayor and 
the City Clerk are hereby 
authorized and directed to 
execute the lnterlocal 
Agreement to Establish the 

KMRMA on behalf of the 
city. 

Section 3. The city hereby 
approves and ratifies the 
Articles of Association and 
Bylaws of the KMRMA, as 
amended. 

Section 4. It is understood 
by the city that by executing 
the lnterlocal Agreement to 
Establish the KMRMA the 
city shall incur no liability for 
the payment of any funds, 
and that it shall be necessary 

Kermitt Johnson 
Mayor 

Attest: 
Mary Ann Johnson 
City Clerk 

W-5126 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
The undersigned having 

qualified as Administrator of 
the Estate of Pearleane 
Reed, Deceased, late of 
Floyd County, Kentucky, 
hereby notifies all persons, 
firms, and corporations hav­
ing claims against said es­
tate to present them to the 
undersigned on or before the 
31st day of May, 1993, or 
this notice will be pleaded in 
bar of their recovery. All per­
sons, finns, or corporations 
indebted to said estate will 
please make immediate pay­
ment to the undersigned. 

This the 12th day of May, 
1993. 

Bertha M. Brandon 
Administrator 

9100 County Une Rd. 
Kernersville, N.C. 27284 

PUBLIC NOTICE 

...--......- for the city to take further 

NOTICE is hereby given 
that EDITH NOBLE OF 
P.O. BOX 112, MINNIE, 
KY. 41651, has filed an 
application with the Natu­
ral Resources and Envi­
ronmental Protection 
Cabinet to FILL PROP­
ERTY ABOVE THE 100-
YEAR FLOOD STAGE 
FOR THE PURPOSE OF 
RESIDENTIAL AND 
COMMERCIAL STRUC­
TURES. The property is 
located 0.6 miles from 
Junction 1 086 at Minnie, 
Ky. and 1.2 miles North of 
McDowell on Left Beaver 
Creek. Any comments or 
objections concerning this 
application shall be di­
rected to: Kentucky Divi­
sion of Water, Water Re­
sources Branch, 18 Reilly 
Road, Frankfort Office 
Park, Frankfort, Ky. 41601. 
Phone: 502-564-341 0. 

action before becoming a 

JoB OPPORTUNITY 
Jerry's Restaurant in 

1972 MACK COAL TRUCK. 
250 engine, 18 speed, 55 
rears. $12,000. Interna­
tional Backhoe, $3,000. Call 
587-2827 after 5 p.m. 

1984 HONDA 1100 
MAGNA. Red. Very sharp. 
$2,000. Call285-9124. 

1985 VF700. Good condi­
tion. Only 2,975 miles. 
Pr~ed to sell. $1,600. Call 
886-3835. Serious calls 
only. · 

BOAT FOR SALE: 1978 
Tomboy, 14 ft; dinette set 
for motor home; trailer door. 
Call 886-1883. 

CORN FOR SALE: Shelled 
or ear. located just oH U.S. 
23 at Allen intersection. 
James Ailey Hall, 606-874-
2238. 

FARM EQUIPMENT: 309 
Ford Corn Planter, two row, 
like new; New Holland hay 
baler; Massey Ferguson 
mower; corn picker and 
wagon. Call 358-9407. 

FORSALE: 1974Minimotor 
home. $1,500. Call 946· 
2558. 

FOR SALE: Arrow exercise 
bike. Like new. $75. Call 
377-6881. 

FOR SALE: Queen size 
mattress with box springs. 
Five years old. $75. Call 
886-2954 or 886-1562. 

FOR SALE: Riding lawn 
mower. 11 HP. 38" cut. 
Like new. Originally cost 
$1 ,000; will sell for $475. 
Call 478-9122. 

FOR SALE: 1987 
GlassStream boat. 16 ft. 
Call358-9407. 

FOR SALE: Bassguitarwith 
Peavey IDK amp. Both like 
new. Call 285-3503. 

FOR SALE: 1984 Monte 
Carlo, $800; also, 8,000 BTU 
air conditioner. Call 886-
0560. 

FOR SALE: TO 14 Dozer. 
$3,000. Call Ron Frasure at 
886-6900. 

MOTORCYCLES FOR 
SALE: Honda 100 and 
Honda 80 dirt bikes. Will 
trade for saddle horse. Call 
886-3313. 

NEW DEVELOPMENT! 
Wooded lots. $1,500· 
$3,500. Two miles from 
LongBowMarina. Call513-
422-7726 after 5 p.m. 

ALLEN: Neat, well kept two 
bedroom home with one car 
garage. Convenient loca­
tion. VALLEY AGENCY, 
INC. 437-6284. 

CAVE RUN LAKE. Cabins 
or A-Frames on wooded lots. 
$7,995-$8,995. Call 513-
722-7726 after 5 p.m. 

Prestonsburg is now taking ap­
plications for the spring/summer 
season. Waitresses and cooks. 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC SALE 

Jerry's offers BC/8$ insur­
ance, paid vacations, meals & 
uniforms. 

APPLY IN PERSON ONLY! 

June 18, 1993 at 11:00 a.m. a 1981 Mack Coal 
Truck, (1) 16RB Cutting Machine, {1) Joy Con· 
tinuous Miner, (3) S & S Scoops, (2) Michigan 
Loaders and many other various pieces of mining 
equipment will be sold to the highest bidder for 
~ "as is, where is" at the office of Warco 
Manufacturing, Rt. 80, Martin, KY. This sale to 
satisfy the unpaid balance of a Commercial Loan 
Contract signed on April20, 1990. The equipment 
may be inspected prior to the sale. The under­
signed reserves the rightto bid. The buyer will pay 
all taxes and transfer fees. 

First Guaranty National Bank 
Collection Department 

BETSY LAYNE AREA: 14 
acres +1-. Short distance 
from 4-lane. Priced to sell !I 
VALLEY AGENCY, INC. 
437-6284. 

GOVERNMENT HOMES 
from $1 (U repair). Delin­
quent tax property. Repos­
sessions. Your area 1-805-
962-8000, ext. GH-4680 for 
current repo list. 

FOR SALE 
INVESTMENT 
PROPERTY 

Wickes' Lumber Company 
on U.S. 23 in Dwale, Ken­
tucky. Property is to be sold 
subject to a 5-year lease to 
Wickes, effective Septem­
ber, 1992, with options to 
renew for subsequent five­
fear terms. Contact lucinda 
Masterson Hall, Bankruptcy 
Trustee, (606) 233-3441 for 
more information. 

FOR SALE: Two bedroom 
trailer. Fully furnished. All 
electric. Central heat/air. lo­
cated on half acre property 
on Harold Hill. Call 432-
7752 or 437-6439. 

FOUR BEDROOM BRICK 
RANCH. 2 112 baths, laun­
dry room,living room, dining 
room, kitchen done in oak, 
den with brick fireplace, slid­
ing glass doors leading to 
patio, 15x30 above ground 
heated pool, central heat/ 
air, two car garage, two util· 
ity buildings. Owner trans­
ferring. located at Daniels 
Creek at Banner. Call874-
9675 for appointment. 

GRETHEL: Spacious three 
bedroom, 2 112 bath home 
with two fireplaces. Eight 
acres +1-. VALLEY 
AGENCY, INC. 437-6284. 

HOMES FOR SALE: Four 
bedroom, 1 1/2 story house 
at Harold. Full basement, 
fireplace, beautiful hardword 
floors. On approximately 2 
acres. Out of flood zone. 
Sell all or will separate. 432-
8210. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three 
bedrooms, 1 1/2 baths, of­
fice or den. Large block 
utility building. Nine acres 
+1- near new South Floyd 
High School. Owner trans­
ferring. Call377-6634 after 
6. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Six 
rooms, bath, utility. Central 
heat/air, large outside build· 
ing. Wheelwright Junction. 
Call 452-2761. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: 80 
acres of land and timber. 
Located near David. Gas, 
city water and cable. Call 
886-8587. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three 
bedrooms, two baths, fam­
ily room, living room, dining 
room, kitchen, utility room. 
12x16 storage building. 
1 00x150 lot. Daniels Creek 
Road at Banner. Call 874-
8921. 

LOT FOR SALE: Town 
Branch. Call874-9790. 

LOTS FOR SALE: Cave 
Run Lake. 112·10 acres. 
Three miles from longbow 
Boat Dock. At. 1693. Twin 
Oaks, Inc. Call 606-768-
3204. 

LOTS FOR SALE: Located 
at Harold, KY. Call 432-
8210. 

No phone calls, please 
Applications may be obtained 

Mon.:.Fri. 3-4 .m. onl ! Martin, KY 41649 

TRIMBLE BRANCH: Three 
bedrooms, two baths, large 
living room, family room with 
rock fireplace, formal dining 
room, hardwood floors, large 
screened-in back porch with 
skylights, partially finished 
basement, attached garage. 
All on a professionally land­
scaped lot. Priced in lower 
1 OO's. Motivated sellers. 
Call 886-7972 for appoint-L------------------..1 ment. 

SEVEN ROOM BRICK 
HOUSE for sale in New Al­
len. Has full basement and 
1 1/2 baths. Call 886-0939. 

TWO STORY HOUSE. Five 
bedrooms, kitchen, bath, 
large living room, dining 
room. Asking $12,000. 
located at Estill. Call 358-
2634. 

Autos 
For Sale 

1979 FORD 3/4 TON 
PICKUP. Good condition. 
Runsgood. $800. Call377-
6579. 

1979 OLDS CUTLASS. 
Goodbody. Tintedwindows. 
Runs good. $700. Also, 
1984 Toyota Corolla SA-5. 
$2,000. Call 587-1 088. 

1984 CAMARO Z-28. T­
Tops. Good condition. 
$2,400. Call 358-4350. 

1989 FORD F-150 4x4 
PICKUP. Five speed. 
$7,500. Call 886-9100 or 
874-9558 after 6 p.m. 

1992 CHEVY CAVALIER. 
Four door, red. Automatic, 
p.s., air, AMIFM stereo. Low 
mileage. Still under war­
ranty. Reasonably priced. 
Financing available. Call 
874-2233, evenings. 

1993 MUSTANG GT. 5.0, 
5-speed. Black with leather 
interior. All power. 3,700 
miles. $13,800. Call 886-
91 00 or 87 4-9558 after 6. 

HICKS' AUTO SALES 
114 W. MT. PARKWAY 

886-3451 
1988 Merkur. Automatic, 

ale, power windows, 
heated leather seats. 
70,000 miles. $4,500. 

1991 Chevrolet S-10 
pickup. Long bed, 
automatic, 4.3, air, 

30,000 miles. $6,900. 

1987 Nlaaan Sentra. 
Five speed, a/c, 80,000 

miles. $2,800. 

1986 Toyota Corolla 
LE. Automatic, old, ale, 

new tires. 85,000 
miles. $2,900. 

1988 Nlaaan Sentra. 
Five speed, sunroof, 

stereo. 35,000 
miles. $3,500. 

1986 Pontiac Sunblrd 
SE Convertible. Five 

speed, air. power 
windows. 70,000 

miles. $4,500. 

1988 Chevrolet Nova. 
Automatic, a/c, stereo. 
95,000 miles. $3,000. 

1985 Chevrolet c-20 
HI Top Van. Dual a/c, 
v~. power windows 
and locks. 67,000 

miles. $6,200. 

1992 Chevrolet S-10 
Blazer 4x4. Automatic, 

two door, Tahoe package, 
a/c. 5,000 miles. 

$12,500. 

19871ROC. Black, 
automatic, T-top, all 

power. 40,000 
miles. $6,200. 

FOR SALE: 1986 lsuzu 
Trooper; 19~6 Jeep CJ7; two 
1988 Suzuki Samurai. Call 
478-3100. 

FOR SALE: 1985 Plymouth 
station wagon. Good condi­
tion. Mustsell. 50Tmileson 
motor. Call 886-1431 . 

FOR SALE: 1989 Chevy S-
1 0 Blazer. Black/gray. 
Excellent condition. 64,000 
miles. Tahoe package. 
Asking $1 0,500 or best of­
fer. Serious inquiries only. 
Call 874·0127. 

GARRETT 
AUTO SALES 
GARRETT, KY 

358-4288 
1988 Chevy Cavalier. 
Four cylinder, automatic, 

stereo, cloth interior. 
Runs great $,1800. 

1984 Olda Cutlass 
Sierra. V..f3, automatic, 
air, tilt, sunroof, 2-door, 

new motor. $1,500. 

1978 Chevy Camaro 
Z·28. V-8, automatic, air, 

tilt, stereo, sunroof. 
$1,600. 

1978 Chevy Camero. 
V-8, automatic, new tires, 

air shocks, headers, 
traction bars. $800. 

1978 Chevy Chevette. 
Four cylinder, automatic, 
stereo, tinted windows, 

new tires. No rust. 
Runs great $700. 

1978 Chevy Converelon 
Van. V~. automatic, 

tilt, power windows and 
locks, front and back air 

conditioning. 79,000 
actual miles. Louisiana 

van. $1,600. 

GOVERNMENT SEIZED/ 
Surplus vehicles from $1 00. 
Fords, Chevys, Corvettes, 
Imports, 4x4's and morel For 
information call 1-800.886-
4142, ext. S4259. 

AUTO LOANS 
GUARANTEED!! 

Bad Credit? No Credit? 
Bankruptcy? Repo's? We 
will arrange low cost financ­
ing even if you have been 
turned down elsewhere. No 
co-signers necessary. 
Phone applications ac­
cepted. For more informa­
tion call Mr. Scott at 606-
437-6282. 

FOR SALE: 1985 Olds 
Cutlass Sierra. Brougham 
Edition. 64,000 actual miles. 
Good condition. Call 886-
8316. 

BOAT, MOTOR AND 
TRAILER. Willtradetogood 
horse trailer or cattle truck. 
Call606-886-3313. 

FOR SALE OR TRADE TO 
TRUCK: 1984 Mustang GT. 
White/black. Five speed. 
Caii886-0219 or 886-8085. 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
Pioneer home stereo sys­
tem. like new. $300. Call 
886-Q219 or 886-8085. 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
1979 16ft. Bass Master. 58 
HP Mercury outboard, drive­
on trailer. Lots of extras. 
Call87 4-0279 after 3:30p.m. 

· , ::· 

1,000 SQ. FT. RETAIL OR 
OFFICE SPACE for rent. 
Call Jim at 886-4001 for 
more information. 

APARTMENTS FOR RENT: 
Call Ron Frasure at 886-
6900. 

FOR RENT: Near college. 
Furnished and unfurnished 
one bedroom apartments. 
Lease and security deposit. 
No pets. Carlos Neeley, 
886-3565. 

FOR RENT: Three room 
furnished apartment with 
air conditioning. Call 874-
981 7. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
house on Cracker Bottom 
Road at Martin. Call 285-
3670. 

FOR RENT: Five room 
house at Endicott. Call87 4-
9447 after 5 p.m. 

FOR RENT: Three bedroom 
doublewide. Unfurnished. 
Located at Allen. Call 874- fl. 
8047. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
trailer. Dewey Lake area. 
$250 plus utilities. Deposit 
required. Call 874-9818 
anytime. 

FOR RENT: McDowell. One 
bedroom furnished apart­
ment. $300/month, utilities 
included. Security deposit 
required. No pets. HUD 
accepted. Call377-6881. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Large. 
Eight rooms. Located at 
Price. Call 285-9646. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Two 
bedroom. Fullyfurnishedw/ 
w carpet, air, storage build· 
ing, large lawn, nice loca­
tion. Clean. No pets. Gas, 
waterpaid. Threemilesfrom ~ 

Prestonsburg near Parkway 
(David Road). $350/month 
plus deposit. Call886-3902. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: 
Hueysville. Also, garage and 
house with property for sale. 
Located on Hwy. 80 at Gar­
rett. Call 358-3073 or 358-
4045. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Three 
bedroom log house. Cen- i 
tral heat/air, city utilities, fire- ~ 

place. Four miles from 
Prestonsburg. No pets. 
$450/month plus utilities. 
Call886-9167, days. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Five 
bedrooms. Carpet. McDow­
ell. $375/month plus lease. 
Deposit and references 
required. No inside pets. 
Call 452-2283. 

NEWLY REMODELED .) 

TRAILER. One bedroom. 
Three miles from Harold on 
little Mud. $250/month plus 
utilities. Call 478-5773, 
nights; or 478-5075 days. 

TRAILER FOR RENT: New 
Allen. References and 
deposit required. No pets. 
Call 874-8151 or 874-2114 
after 5 p.m. 

TRAILER LOTS FOR 
RENT: (1) Finance Hollow 
on old road to Martin. Out of 
flood plain. City water and 
utilities available. (2) New 
Allen. Out of flood plain. 
City water and other utilities 
available. Call 874-2212. 

BABYSITTER NEEDED: In 
home at David. Experience 
required. For 4-year-old girl. 
Pay negotiable. Call 886-
3137 after 5 p.m. 

EASY WOAKI EXCEL­
LENTPAY! Assemble prod­
ucts at home. Call toll free, 
1-800-467-5566, ext. 2246. 

KITCHEN HELP NEEDED. 
Apply in person at Peking 
Chinese Restaurant (be­
tween 2-4 p.m.), Wedding­
ton Square, Pikeville. No 
phone calls please. 

START IMMEDIATELY! 
Earn up to $800tweek label­
ing postcards from home. 
Set your own hours. No 
quotas. Call 1-900-740-
7377($1 .49 min/18 yrs+) or 
write: PAASEA-J4299,161 
S. Lincolnway, N. Aurora, IL 
60542. 

TIRED OF ASKING YOUR 
HUSBAND FOR MONEY? 
Sell Avon and make your 
own. Call Janey at 886-
2082. 



• 

Employment 
Available 

WANTED: Part time help. 
Retail furniture/electronics 
sales. Apply in person at 
Frasure's Furniture and 

iooo;:~:::;:oo~, 
GENERAL STORE. Beer 
license and gas pumps. Rt. 
979, three miles southwest 
of U.S. 23. For more infor­
mation call 478-9737. 

Available Soonf 
We are prNently taking 1p-

pticatio111 for 1-bedroom apts. 
Ill Highland TetTICe. Tnuelpb. 
are for elderly, disabled, handi-
capped, low or very low income 
applicanlt. 

H you arelnterNted, you ny 
1pply at HighlandT et111Ce office 
betwHn 8:30 a.m. and 12:00 
noon, MondaythN Friday or call 
886-1925 or 886-1119. @ 

E.O.H. 
..._ 
lE~lDGf 

Rummag~. 
Or Yard Sales 

. ,• ~ 

GRAND OPENING! Memo­
rial Day Weekend. Friday, 
Saturday, Sunday and 
Monday. The Big John's 
Creek Flea Market. Call 886-
0379 for information. 

MOVING (abroad) SALE on 
River Road, Banner. Me­
morial Day Weekend. Fur­
niture (couch, beds, desk, 
chairs, dresser, lamps), 
children's!baby items, toys, 
clothing, tools, longbedtruck 
cap, household items, lots 
more. Saturday, 9-6; Sun­
day 1-6; Monday 9 till gone. 
Also, 1989 Mazda pickup. 
Excellent condition. Call 
874-9584. 

STANVILLE FLEA MAR­
KET: Open at Stanville, 
Monday-Sunday. Set up 
free for two weeks. 1/4 mile 
off U.S. 23 on new Mare 
Creek Road. For more in­
formation call 478-5288. 

HORSEBACK RIDING . 
Now starting: 

Spring Trail Rides 
Located at Charley, Ky. 

on Rt 1760 between 
Louisa and Paintaville 

• Ovtr 2,000 tu:rf!5 of trails 
• Good Horst:~ 

TRIPLE ~FARM 
(606) 673-3031 

HITCHCOCK REPAIR SERVICE 
Service, Parts & Installation 

• Refrigerators 
• Washers 

• Dryers 1886-14 73 I 
• Freezers . . 
• Furnaces 

• Microwaves 
• Dishwashers 

One-Day Senice on Most Parts Ordered. 

JOIN OUR TEAM 

-& 
MANAGEMENT POSITIONS A V All..ABLE 

BENEATS INCLUDE: 
• Medical, Dental, Vision, Disability and Ufe Insurance 
• Stock Purchase Plan 
• Profit Sharing Plan 
• Advancement Potential 

Send resume to: 

Pizza Hut Office 
2 Weet Potomac Parkway 
WUiiamsport, MD 21795 

E.O.E. 

GOFF~ 
AUTOMOTIVE MACHINE 

AUTOMOTIVE & DIESEL 
RACCOON, KY. 

437-9456 
0\'/ned & Operal ed by 

Larry Goff 
Mon.-Thur.-Frf., &-5 

Sll. ~12 
Cloted SulKily 

* Cylinder heads rebuift including foreign and 
aluminum heads • pressure testing. * Milling-heads, and blocks * Rod re-sizing * King Pins • Piston Pins honed and mted. * Thermal cleaning system * Crankshafts-grinding and polishing * Cylinder boring and line 
boring A * Aywheels resurfaced ~ * Low prices on engine kijs c:::,:bl~7:,' 

& change 

The Floyd County Times 

Rummage 
Or Yard Sales 

MULTI FAMILY YARD 
SALE: Three miles up 
Abbott Road on right. Tues­
day, June 1 and Wednes­
day, June 2, from 9 a.m.-4 
p.m. Children's clothes and 
toys; adult clothes; house­
hold items: tools. 

YARD SALE: June 1-2from 
8 a.m.-1 p.m. Fourth house 
on right behind National 
Guard Armory. Men's, 
women's and children's 
clothing, $4/bag. All other 
items individually priced. 

Services 

DO YOU NEED a quick oil 
change, or how about a good 
wash and wax? Call Goble's 
Auto Repair and Detailing. 
We do more for less! Call 
886-9256. 

FOR SALE: Tanks, drains, 
fill dirt, topsoil, gravel, mor­
tar, sand. Also, backhoe 
and dump truck work. You 
call-we haul. Free esti­
mates. Call 789-4326. 

HILLSIDE CLEANING, gut­
ter cleaning yard work and 
hedge trimming. Phone: 
874-9847. 

I NEED A RIDE? Call Martin 
City Cab Service, Inc. 24 

.._.-,. __ ....;...;;..;.;.;..;.;.;;;;....,..-'.,.... Hour Service. Now accept-
ing Medicaid. 285-0320. 

ALL TYPES HOME AND 
MOBILE HOME REPAIRS: 
Restoration; leveling; paint­
ing (inside and out);tree trim­
ming and removal; yard 

. maintenance; hauling; 
plumbing repairs. Call for 
fre~ estimates, 886.0535 or 
886-9922. 

CHARLES R. OUSLEY 
CONCRETE 

CONSTRUCTION 
I REPAIR 

Floors; patios; walls; 
driveways; foundation 

block work; bridge 
work and repair. 
Charles Ousley 

886-6154 

FOR HIRE: 
Woods Backhoe, 

Dump Truck and Dozer. 
Will haul gravel, dirt, 

and install septic tanks. 
Call 874-2914. 

HONEYCUTT 
NEW HOMES 

I REMODELING 
Roofing; decks; interior 
and exterior painting; 
concrete work; vinyl 

siding; room additions; 
pole barns; any type 
mobile home work; 

hang wallpaper. 
References furnished. 
17 years experience. 

Free estimates. 
Phone 886-0633. 

M·FLEX NON-SKID 
CONCRETE 

SURFACING; pool 
decks ; patios; steps; 
ramps and running 

tracks. Call886-0154. 

MINE SAFETY 
CLASS 

Also, Dust and 
Noise Surveys. 

PHONE 285-0650 

R.A. TAYLOR 
PAINTING COMPANY 

& CHIMNEY CLEANING 
SERVICE 

Both services 
available anytime. 

Call886-8453. 

D&J ELECTRONICS. VCR, 
microwave oven, CB, Nin­
tando repair. We buy and 
sell VCR's. One mile from 
Highlands Regional. 886-
3484. 

ECONOMY TREE SERV­
ICE: Tree cutting, topping, 
removal, dead limbing and 
cabling. Twenty-<Jne years 
experience. licensed, in­
sured and bonded. Bill 
Rhodes, owner. Dump 
truck, chipper and winch. 
Caii1 -800-742-4188tollfree 
for free estimates. (local 
606-353-9276.) 

DOYOUNEEDSOMEONE 
TO pick up your medicine or 
dry cleaning? Or do your 
shopping? Or just need a 
break from your children? 
For these or any other odd 
jobs call 87 4-2328. 

DOZER FOR HIRE: Con­
tract or hourly. Phone 478-
2717. 

Also, stop by Judy's Pro­
duce at railroad track in 
Martin. 

PETER, PETER, 
PUMPKIN EATER 

Had a pool and 
couldn't clean 'er. 

Tried to use a 
pumpkin shell, 

But he found it didn't 
work too well. 

Call Blue Bayou 
Pool Service 

297-2789 or 349-6517. 

RELIABLE CHRISTIAN 
LADY will care for elderly 
lady. Monday-Friday. Will 
furnish references. Can 
begin immediately. Phone 
358-2459. 

JIM'S ROOFING 
AND PAINTING 
Free estimates. 
Call377-2356. 

ROOFING AND PAINTING; 
small storage buildings and 
all types of carpentry work. 
Caii886-0260 or 886-2517. 

TANNING BED REPAIRS: 
UV testing and cleaning. 
Residential electrical serv­
ice by certified electrician. 
Call 358-9953. 

VCR, CAMCORDER, NIN­
TENDO cleaning and repair. 
Fast, reliable service. Free 
estimates. For more infor­
mation call 886-6851. 

WILL HAUL GRAVEL; back­
hoe and dump truck service; 
fill dirt; install septic systems; 
building and remodeling. 
Call 886-9246 or 886-1968, 
ask for Dave. 

Miscellaneous 

PUBLIC AUCTION 
Every Friday, 7 p.m., 
on Rt. 850, four miles 

from David (three miles 
off Rt. 404). New and 
used merchandise; 
furniture; antiques. 
Dealers weloome. 

Auctioneer: 
Don Wireman 
Call 886-0706 

Miscellaneous 

BAHAMA CRUISE. Five 
days, four nights. Over­
bought. Corporate rates to 
public. Um~edtickets. $279/ 
couple. 407-767-8100, ext. 
4402, Monday-Saturday, 9 
a.m.-1 0 p.m. 

NEED A PLACE TO RENT 
for a large or small party? 
Floyd County Fish & Game 
Club has the place! For 
reunions, parties, showers 
or receptions. $225 for 24 
hours;$75 will be refunded if 
clubhouse and grounds are 
left clean and undamaged. 
Call 285-0768. 

VISIT THE LARGEST 
PANELING CENTER in 
Eastern Kentucky at Goble 
Lumbar. Over 80 different 
prafinished panels in stock 
and as low as $3.99 per 
panel. Call Goble lumber, 
874-9281. 

HENRY MOORE REUNION 
Annual family reunion for 
descendants of Henry and 
Nannie (Hunter) Moore of 
Little Mud will meet at Allen 
Convention Center on May 
29-30. 

,Business 
Opportunity 

ESTABLISHED ARCHERY 
AND FISHING STORE. 
Goodcustomerbase. Good 
location. Indoor shooting 
lanes. Priced right. Pikev­
ille. Call 432-5435. 

Mobile Hoine 
·:···sales . · 
PRIVATE SALE 

Sealed bids are now being 
accepted on a 1988 Cava­
lier 14x70 mobile home, 
serial #6592. Date and time 
of sale: June 2, 1993 at 12 
noon. Bids must be submit­
ted before date of sale. Any 
and all bids can be rejected. 
The h" 11e can be seen by 
appointment only at Hylton 
Homes, U.S. 23, Ivai, Ken­
tucky 41642; or phone 1-
800-533-9052. 

FOR SALE: 1980 Aladdin 
12x56 two bedroom mobile 
home. Central heat/air. Call 
285-5072. 

FREE APPLICATION 
DUPONT SOIL 

PROTECTOR with three 
room carpet cleaning. 

Spacial-$85. 
Servicemaster, 886-8315. 

Offer expires 
June 30, 1993. 

New='~ · Used. 
Furniture·· 

ALLEN FURNITURE 
ALLEN, KENTUCKY 

Living room suits; daybeds; 
gun cabinets; bedroom suits; 
reclinars;odd chasts;dinette 
sets; bunk beds ; odd beds; 
loungers; used washers, 
dryers, refrigerators: and lots 
morel 

Call 87 4-9790. 

Insurance 

MAJOR MEDICAL .......... 
MEDICARE 

SUPPLEMENT 
WITH NO DEDUCTABLE 

First day coverage. 
Under or over 65. 

Call Lynda Spurlock 
for a quote. 

285-9650, days/evenings. 

CAR INSURANCE TOO 
HIGH? We have 10 licensed 
and bonded contracted 
companies to serve Floyd 
County. We special ize in 
youthful drivers and those 
who have had premiums 
mcreased because of ad­
verse driving records. For a 
quota, telephone 874-2162, 
Darby and Allen Insurance, 
Allen/Prestonsburg. 

Carpentry 
Work 

CONCRETE AND 
CARPENTRY WORK 
All types of ooncreta-

driveways, patios, 
carports, basements. 
Also, block and brick 

work. Carpentry work 
of any kind. 

References furnished. 
Free estimates. 
Call 886-0718. 

RELIABLE WORK AT 
REASONABLE PRICES: 
All phases of new homes; 

additions; remodeling; 
storage buildings; 

garages and decks. 
Fifteen years experience. 

Free estimates. 
Call John or ·catfish" 
at 285-3967 anytime. 

CARPENTRY WORK 
ALL TYPES 

New homes from ground up; 
remodeling or additions; all 
finish work; drywall; paint­
ing (interior, exterior and trim 
work); All types concrete 
work-driveways, side­
walks, foundations, etc; any 
size pole buildings or stor­
age buildings; garages; 
decks. 
Over 20 years experience. 

Will furnish references. 
Robie Johnson, Jr. 

Call anytime! 
886-8896 

WILL BUILD HOUSES, 
framing, room additions, 
pole barns, roofing, siding, 
remodeling, and any type 
construction work. Vic 
Wynn, 478-1516. 

Wants To Buy 
1:::::.:-

WANT TO BUY: Refrigera­
tor and gas or electric range 
in good working condition. 
Call886-1605. 

WANTED: Maternity cloth­
ing for consignment shop 
opening in July at Harold. 
Good condition only. 478-
2025, ask for Lisa. 

WANTED 
Home 1n Wheelwright area to rent w I option to 
buy. Would Uke a 2-3 BR home preferably with 
fenced yard. Must allow pets. Moving to area 
September l. lf you have a home for rent, 
contact 

Martin Braun 
P.O. Box 414 

Melro.e, Fla. 32666 
(904) 4 76-5432 

• FOR SALE • 
20x40 IN-GROUND POOL 

DIVING BOARD & SLIDE 
Comes with heater, tank, etc. 

Ready for installation. 

'83 HONDA MOTORCYCLE 
CB11 OOF, blu&, in good condition. 

CALL FOR MORE INFORMATION 

886-3941 

Wednesday, May 26, 1993 Cl1 

--, 
Lawn Service i 

PAUL'S LAWN SERVICE 
Will do grass cutting; tree 
and hedge trimming; ceme­
teries; hillside cleaning; 
Adopt-A-Mile cleanups: 
parking lot and driveway 
sealing; exterior house 
painting. 

•Dependable Service 
·oual~y Work 

•low Cost 
•free Estimates 

874-0161 

WILL DO LAWN MOWING 
and weed eating work in 
Martin, Allen, Maytown and 
Prestonsburg areas. Call 
285-9404. 

Plumbing 
.:. 

PORTER PLUMBING 
COMPANY 

ALLEN, KENTUCKY 
Commercial, residential 

and service work. 
Licensed and insured. 
Rotor rooter service. 
drain cleaning, etc. 
CALL US FIRST! 

874-2794. 

Pets And 
Supplies 

FOR SALE: Pomeranian 
puppies. One male, one 
female. Phone 377-2285. 

SIBERIAN HUSKY PUPS 
for sale. Call 886-9~5~< 

HeatingiAJf;.,;:: 
conditioning, 

BLANTON HEATING 
AND 

AIR CONDITIONING 
Sales, Service, 

Installation. 
High efficiency 

electric and gas units. 
Electrical services 

available. 
Free Estimates. 
Call 874-2308. 

I< .. ::,;,'i=>:::t 

Cdntractilis =., 
.·~ 

FOR HIRE: Backhoe, dozer, 
dump trucks. Also do septic 
systems and sell gravel and 
fill dirt. Phone: 285-9151 or 
285-9149. 

' 

14 DAV:1TRAINING 
Transport Tra1n1ng Group can tra1n 
you to DRIVE TRACTOR TRAILERS e JnleuM!IUid 

Ro1VI you mr:t1oyl 
Cil/ /01 lfJPOtnlmftll 

14 day ~""""9 

• Tram 1n East Tennessee 
• Tram on days ott 

• C.D.L. Tram1ng & Test1ng 

1-800-868-5800 

• Pads 
• Walls 
• Bridges, etc. 

Charles Scott 

886-9522 

Charles R. Ousley 
Concrete 

CONSTRUOION & RIPAIR 

Ftoots, PAnOS, WAllS, 
DIMwATS, fa.DAnON II.OCI 

Wou, G\tmt, 
liN Wou & bAIL 

Cwus Ousm-186-61~ 

ALVIN & JUDY FIELDS 
Owners 

PROMPT 
PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICE -

';t.eU4., t)~ 

'UI~~ 
h. 1421 • Old Allen 

Allen, ICY 41101 
($01) 174-2104 

151 ~.a-yo Tl'llll 
...._...,ICY 41501 

(SOt) U2-1014 

of Martin 

Recliners 
starting at 

$149 
La-Z-Boy 
Recliners 

$299 
Parts & Service 
for most major 

brand appliances 
Open: Mon.-Fri. 

285~9620 

FOR SALE 
Complete darkroom equip­
ment set for color print de­
veloper. For details call 
Charles Collins, R/S Truck­
Body at 874-2151. 

QtEINC. Position Available 
Must have experience with computers, ICD-9 and 
HCFA procedure coding. Also, must be self moti­
vated and have good organizational skills. 

Salary commensurate wlexperience . 
Excellent benefit pkg. 

Send resumes to 
P.O.Box231 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 

.... 

•' 
•' 

~~l\e~oa-
,. fli&tllf W"IIIC • 

Larry's Marine 
& Recreation Center, Inc. 

1 019 WEST MAIN ST. 
Mor-::::-!EAD, KENTUCKY 40..151 

PHor•E (606} 784-6488 

Tee Watkin• ' Big Sandy Sales Rep. 
886-8687 after 5:00 p.m. 

~--------------------------~~----------~ 

NOW ACCEPJING APPUCATIONS 
For 1-and.2-bedtoom apartmeq,ts. 

· /' 0 ""' • • 

fl<f,gency Park_.fJlpartments 
u.s. 23 (Befow Ftosplml) ~ 

886-8318 --
from 9 a.m.-3 p.m. 

H~tl. .I 
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ASHTON 10-0ss 

Associated Designs-Eugene, Oregon 

Classic and contemporary influ­
ences combine in the Ashton to create a 
stately yet unique French country-style 
home. 

Stone-faced columns and exterior 
walls on the lower level imbue the 
home with a sense of permanence -
much needed in these times of rapid 
change. Arched windows and a wide 
balcony harken back to simpler times. 
while the curve and sweep of the 
soaring rooflines, are clearly French 
country. 

Inside. this five-bedroom home is 
bright. spacious and comfortable. 
Ceilings in the entry hall. living room 
and library extend to the second floor. 
Exterior and interior balconies bridge 
the grand entrance. The interior balcony 
also extends into the library- the only 
room truly at ground level. The rest of 
the rooms on the ground floor are three 
steps up. 

Family living and entertaining takes 
place in a huge great room with a 
kitchen at one end, dining room in the 
middle and living room with fireplace 
at the opposite end. Two sets of French 
doors crowned by arched transoms 
open onto a custom-designed patio. 

In the kitchen, a work island with 
built-in cooktop adds to the already 
generous counter space . The utility 
room has a large pantry. storage and 
counter space, and room for a freezer. 

Each of three bedrooms on the 
lower level has a built-in desk. They 
share a compartmentalized bathroom 
with double vanities. Both of the 
upstairs bedrooms have two walk-in 
closets and a private bathroom with 
twin basins. The owners' suite has a 
luxurious spa and oversized shower as 
well. 

For a review plan. including scaled 
floor plans. elevations. section and 
artist's conception. send $7.50 to 
Associated Designs. I 260 Cham elton 
St.. Suite 2. Eugene. Ore . 97401 . 
Please specify the Ashton 10-065 and 
include a return address when ordering. 

ll Pa io 

~ Dining 
~ 12'2" X 16'10" 

living 
Kitchen 

11
. x 

24
.
8 

.. 

~~-r::: ~ 
~nllit; ~, <D ~ f -::: 
U '~u"" f i2._ f:= Up 

The Floyd County Times 

II 
a.+::;;::;;;aMaster Suite 
.--~-4 15'2" X 16'10" 

II"> 

~.>Bedroom 
~ 13' X 12'2" 

~ J1Desk B ~ ~ 
.Illu. 

g -Desk 

0 Bedroom 

~;6" X 13 '6' 
.....,..,...---. 

Bedroom~, 
1+---+-+--+-~12' 8.. X 13.8.. I 

!;:::::= Entry 

Nt· 
library 

15' X 15'8" -1, 
,.. - -

Open to 
Below 

Bedroom 

Alternate Basement Stairs 

Ash.ton 3675 Square Feet 
Plan Number 10-065 

@,e;! 
Kentucky Carpet 
Factory Outlet 

and Tile City, U.S.A. Inc. 
Allen, Kentucky 41601 

Professional Carpet & 
Upholstery Cleaning 

Available 

874-2859 
or 874-2855 

To Have 
Your Ad 
Placed 

On This Page, 
Contact 

Us Here At 
The Floyd 

County Times 
at 

886-8506 

Top Five Reasons Why People Buy Spae Truly Maintenance-Free 
Fencing For Swimtning Pools 

- - ... ----
0 0 

0 
0 

FANNIN'S PLUMBING 
HEATING & ELECTRIC 

'i Srmrt ~ ,.. ~ 

~~\)\I)Rf~ 
Main St., Paintsville 

789-3696 
Hours: M-F, 8-5 

w Owners: Gary Fannin and Southie Fannin 

Ella Sammons 
Debbie Hutchinson 
Everett Stafford 
SALES REPRESENTATIVES 

U.S. 23 NORTH 
PRESTONSBURG, KY 41653 

CHAI NLINK FENCE 

LAWN STORAGE BUILDING (WOOD) 

CENTRAL HEATING 

. MOWERS, TRACTORS & TILLERS 

ACCESSORIES 

ALL MAJOR APPLIANCES 

& ELECTRONICS 

(606) 886·8135 • Monday-Saturday, 9-6 

1Mz 
298-3584 

FAMILY FEDERAL 
SAVINGS BANK 
"Keep it all in the family" 

Your family financial center since 1936 
BRANCHES 

Salyersyme 

IDII 
lif!OfiU t(I'OIIIt ..... OI(t ~If( 

@ 
1!!111....,.; 

' 1£NOtP. . 
Pajntsyille Pikeville 

437-6231 349-5128 789-3541 
Main St. 2nd St. 103 Main St. 

24 HOUR AUTOMATIC BANKING 

HEY LOOK! ---
Scott's Furniture and Carpet. Midnight Movers. 
You call-we haul. Lots of new and used furniture, 
appliances and antiques. 

Located on Rt. 122 
2 1 /2 mtles above Martin. 
I AM CARGO INSURED!!! 

PHONE: 285-3705 

If you are thanking of Installing a 
swimming pool or already have one, 
think also of what is needed to maxi­
mize your enjoyment. If you arc duing 
more maintenance than enjoying, you 
understand the purpose and impor­
tance of maintenan~:e-frcc products. 

Bufftcch now offers a compkt.: line 
of totally maintenancc-frec l'l!nc1ng 
designed especiully for the swtnuning 
pool owner. fhe fence 1s madc cnllrc 
ly from high impact, color stahihzcd, 
durable Vinyl and has a non -prorutcd 
warranty (guarantee) for a lull 20 
year~; that th.: fcncc will not ru~t. peel, 
craLk or need to bc painted. II h<l\ \afc 
>ln<loth ~urlucc~ \\ith no sphnlcr:., 
scrt:\\S. nails m :.harp cdgc, S<'\t:r.ll 
't) lc\ lire availahiL that mccl n.tt1onal 
pool codes Color:. arc v. hit..:.t<Jn. grcy 
aod mal~h popular\ inyl \lding wlor:. 
l)ulft.:d1 t'cnling I'> solid . lihtallatu•n 

rc4uires concrete and rcbar or galva­
nized steel inserts in the posts. Gates 
are built on·thc-Job to ensure proper 
fit. Latches arc self-dosing to reduce 
unwanted access. Bufftech fcnce will 
please your neighbor since 1t look~ the 
Si1111c on either side 

Bu!Ttcch offers a complete line of 
lav. n aml gardcn accent~ to complete 
the pool decor. All arc maintenance· 
fr.:c and guarantccd. 1-cnc.: 1n your 
pool, use <Jccent acce~sorics to com­
plete the selling, free up weekend>, 
and cnhancc the vuluc of your prop­
erty. A 13ufftcch vinyl l'cncc diminatcs 
w.:ckcnd fence mainlcnance and it's 
guarant.:cd. 

For infurmallon call ~00 333 OStW, 
sec your loc;tl knee d.:ah:r or write 
Bufftcch. Inc. 2525 \'\'alden An:nu.:, 
Bull<~lo, 1\c\1 "iork 11225 

I 
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