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High School 
Here Talked 
By Co. Board 

$8.5 Million Budget 
For Current Year 
Approved at Meet 
The publicly expressed concern for the 

physical condition of Prestonsburg High 
School was discussed at some length by 
the Floyd County Board of Education at 
its meeting last Wednesday, and Supt. of 
Schools E. P. Grigsby, Jr. later an­
nounced that work is under way to 
provide the school a new roof. 

Roof repair has been given main­
tenance priority in the school system, 
and interior renovation is to follow that. 

"We intend to repair the Prestonsburg 
school ceilings, and now we have a full 
crew of janitors to keep the building 
clean and top-shape," the superintendent 
said. 

A general budget of $8,583,102 for the 
current school year was approved by the 
board, to be submitted to the State Board 
of Education for its approval. <See 
complete general budget on another 
page, this edition.) 

The school tax rate of 22.9 cents per 
$100 valuation was approved. The rate is 
actually unchanged from that of last year 
when it was 52.9 cents, since the 
remaining 30 cents is assessed by the 
state for the Power Equalization 
Program adopted by the last General 
Assembly. 

The 7.6 cent gym tax here remained 
unchanged. Supt. Grigsby said this tax 
for the retirement of bonds issued to 
cover cost of construction of the 
fieldhouse here will end March 26, next 
year. 

<See Story No.1, Page4) 

District Kiwanians 
Elect P'burg Man 

H.C. "Huck'' Francis, of Prestonsburg, 
has been chosen Governor-elect of the 
Kentucky-Tennessee district of Kiwanis 
International at its 60th annual con­
vention held in Gatlinsburg, Tenn., Sept. 
8·10. The Ky.- Tenn. district includes 188 
Kiwanis clubs in Kentucky and Ten­
nessee and has a membership of 8,600. 

Mr. Francis has been a member of the 
Prestonsbw-g Kiwanis club for 30 years 
with 28 years of perfect attendance. He 
served as Lt.-Govemor, 1975-'76, and as 
International Convention chairman, 1977-
'78; was president of the Prestonsbw-g 
Kiwanis in 1954 and has held several other 
positions in the local club .. 

Serving on various boards and com­
missions in this area of the state, Francis 
has received many local and statewide 
awards for his work with the youth of 
Kentucky. 

Mr. Francis will serve in the office of 
Governor-elect for one year and will then 
step up to the office of Governor of the 
diStrict on Oct. 1, 1979. 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis, the former 
Betty Davis, of Prestonsburg, have two 
daughters. 

More Trouble for Dewey­
If Milfoil Means Trouble 

Blood Drive Slated 
Saturday at Armory 

The Prestonsburg National Guard and 
the Prestonsbw-g Fire Department will 
sponsor a blood drive Saturday, <Sept. 
16) at the National Guard building 
on the. Auxier Road. Blood donations will 
be taken between the hours of 10 a.m. to 
11:30 a.m. and 1 p.m. to 4:30 p.m. Any 
person interested in donating may 
contact any National Guard or Fire 
Department member. 

Dewey, a reservoir with a long history of 
problems, may have a brand new and 
potentially serious problem in the form of 
milfoil, a small, aquatic plant in­
troduced into the lake about two years 
ago. 

The plant, which is not native to this 
section, was apparently brought to 
Dewey by a few well-meaning local 
sportsmen from a lake ''down south" in 
the hope that the vegetation would adapt 

ARC Confirms 
$150,000 Grant 
To Water Dist. 

The $150,000 grant on which the Abbott­
Little Paint Water Pistrict had been 
depending for a part of its water system 
construction expense was approved last 
week by the Appalachian Regional 
Commission, Senators Ford and Hud­
dleston announced. 

At the same time it was announced 
locally that John T. Hill has resigned the 
post of chairman of the water district and 
that W. L. Baldridge has been named his 
successor. Delmas Saunders is scheduled 
for appointment to fill the vacancy on the 
board. Thomas Hereford, III, the third 
member, is the board's secretary­
treasurer. 

Mr. Hill said he resigned only after it 
appeared that the water district was 
"over the hwnp" in getting water service 
for the Abbott Creek and Little Paint 
Creek areas. He added that business 
interests otherwise demanded his at­
tention. 

Bids on the water district project 
which involved approximately 17 miles of 
mains, were opened July 14. The low 
bidder on phase 1, G. R. Aldennan Co., of 
Morehead, asked $555,151.48 for con­
struction of mains and foundations. The 
$36,465 bid of the Chicago Bridge & Iron 
Co., Shaker Heights, 0., was low on 
construction of a water tank on Little 
Paint. 

Total cost of the project has been set at 
$612,000. In addition to the ARC grant, the 
Farmers Home Administration will 
provide a grant of $275,000 and loan the 
district $157,000. An additional $30,000 
was added locally, mainly from hook-up 
charges. 

It is expected that within the next two­
three weeks the Public Service Com­
mission will hold a hearing to set rates 
and issue a certificate of necessity and 
convenience. District commissioners 
said they are hoping that contracts will 
be a warded early next month. 

Water to serve the district will be 
purchased from the Prestonsburg water 
system. 

to the environment at Dewey and provide 
cover for baitfish as well as enriching the 
water's oxygen content. 

Reportedly introduced in the Dick's 
Creek section of Dewey, the milfoil has 
obviously flourished, and now large 
patches of the small, leafy clusters can 
be seen along considerable stretches of 
shoreline, especially in the upper section 
of the lake. 

In a telephone interview with The 
Times, Pete Pfeiffer, assistant director of 
the state Division of Fisheries at Frank­
fort, swnmed up his position on the pros 
and cons of the plant, saying, "If I were 
faced with the choice of having too much 
milfoil in a lake or none at all, I would 
choose to have none." 

Pfeiffer emphasized that a certain 
amount of milfoil is a good thing, and 
may, indeed, provide refuge for minnows 
and other baitfish and introduce added 
oxygen to a body of water, but, he said, 
it's almost impossible to predict at what 
point the milfoil growth will abate. 

Dewey, according to Pfeiffer, is ap­
parently the only large impoundment in 

After reading and hearing predictions 
this week of blizzards, bitter cold, snow 
ice, more snow and the like ahead forth~ 
coming winter, I've begun wondering if 
Florida doesn't have a beach or so that 
needs combing. 

It may be true that the old eyesight 
isn't what it used to be, but I can still read 
my daughter Barbara's and Edith 
James' handwriting as well as I ever 
could. 

WELCOME BACK, GRAFTER 
Skimming through one of our old files 

of 40 years ago, we are reminded of 
another loss this sophisticated age has 
suffered-namely, the Indian medicine 
man who came to town at least once a 
year to gyp a willing public, the while 
staging a pretty fair show. One of the 
"star" medicine men who came here 
every year, 'way back then, was a son of 
a former commissioner of agriculture 
who at one time had lived on Abbott 
Creek and moved to Glasgow, Ky. 

The item which revived these 
recollections pertained to one such 
itinerant dispenser of medicines and 
potions ''good for man or beast,'' one Guy 
Rabbitfoot, late a resident of Somerset, 
Ky., wherein was located his plant for the 
manufacture of certain panaceas. This 
blue-eyed "Indian" wound up in quar­
terly court here, accused of making 
medicine without a pharmacist's license 
and of selling same outside a store and 
wi thoul license to do so. 

CSeeS ory No. 4, Page4l 

the state with milfoil, although several 
small impoundments of one to five acres 
in the state have been literally choked to 
death by the plant. And therein may lie 
the most potentially serious problem. 

"We can think of combatting a milfoil 
problem with herbicide treatments in a 
small body of water," Pfeiffer pointed 

CSee Story No. 3, Page 4) 

Recently, there has been a critical 
shortage of all types of blood. One of the 
major causes of this shortage has been 
due to an increase in transfusions and a 

CSee Story No.2, Page 4) 

Price Tracks 'Gangster' Weapons 

Price examines "ganster-type" weapon in his Washington office. 

Phillip R. Price, 40, works with 
"gangster-type" weapons similar to the 
ones used by AI Capone and George 
"Baby Face" Nelson in the 1920s. 

But his purpose differs from that of the 
two infamous crime figures. 

As new chief of the National Firearms 
Act Branch of the Bureau of Alcohol, 
Tobacco and Firearms in Washington, 
Price oversees the registration and 
transfer records for weapons covered 
under Title II of the Gun Control Act of 
1968, which incorporated the 1934 
National Firearms Act. 

In 1934, Congress made it illegal to own 
or possess "gangster-type" weapons 
unless registered with the federal 
government. Weapons which must be 
registered include machine guns, sawed· 
off rifles and shotguns, silencers, and 
destructive devices, such as molotov 
cocktails and hand grenades. 

Price, a native of Johnson county, 
joined ATF in 1967 as a special agent in 
Louisville. He transferred to Ft. Wayne, 

Ind., in 1969, and was made the special 
investigator in charge of the Cincinnati 
post of dtty in 1972. 

By 1977, Price moved to Washington as 
an operations officer with the progr~m 
development and planning division of 
ATF's Criminal Enforcement Office. 

Before joining ATF, Price worked 
seven years as a Kentucky s te trooper 
in Morehead and Pikeville, a from 1956 
to 1960, he served with the U.S. Air Force. 
He studied criminal justice at Northern 
Kentucky University at Highland 
Heights, Ky. 

'Price grew up in Floyd county, where 
his mother, Mrs. Lillia Mae Price, is 
postmistress at David. His sister, Mrs. 
John D. Evans, lives in Prestonsbw-g. 
Another sister, Mrs. Joe Coburn, resides 
in Oakland, Calif., and a brother, Gor· 
don, lives in Frankfort. 

Price and his wife, Roxann, are the 
parents of two children, and reside in 
Fairfax county, Virginia. 
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Court Refuses 
Park Work Pay 

~-
SUITS FILED 

Donna Blackburn vs. Nelson Mobile 
Homes, Inc. James R. Pierce, et al vs. 
Ray Hatfield. Jimmy Tackett vs. 
Patricia Rogers Tackett. J. E. Paulas, 
Welfare Dept. vs. Harry Lee Fogle. First 
National Bank vs. Wayne Porterfield, et 
al. First National Bank vs. Carl V. 
Fra5ure, et al. First National Bank vs. 
Donald L. Hom. Diane Louise Mayes vs. 
Gary Lynn Mayes. Robert J. Hardee vs. 
Ruby Lee Hardee. Com'th of Ky., Dept. 
of Hwys. vs. (in separate suits) Homer 
Tackett, James E. Bartley, Jr., and 
Barry Stumbo. W. R. Walters vs. Frank 
Hem. Jerry Smith vs. wretta Smith. 
Boyd Thomsbw-y and Stella Thomsbll')' 
vs. Darlin Newsome and Emma Jean 
Newsome. Jackie Rister, et al vs. Floyd 
Co. Sanitation, Inc., et al. Westinghouse 
Credit Corp. vs. F . & R. Coal, Inc., et al. 
Isaac Nelson vs. Connie Kriesel. 

MARRIAGES 
Sherman Slone, 49, and Thelma Goble, 

54, both of Prestonsburg. Darrell Wayne 
McKinney, 20, Harold, and Glenda Faye 
Blankenship, 17, Teaberry. 

Court Session 
Here Lengthens, 
Near-Continuous 

The Floyd circuit is asswning the 
aspect of a court of continuous session 
rather than one convened for a specified 
term. 

The present session, which has been 
called the September criminal term, will, 
for example, run into December, with a 
mixed docket of criminal and civil cases. 

Four grand Jury sessions instead r1 
three are now mandated by law: 
January, April, June, September and, 
possibly, December. It is possible that 
dates for the grand jury may be changed 
as long as four sessions are held or the 
jury is in session 20 days. 

Two criminal cases have been called 
dw-ing the current session, with defen­
dants in each case pleading guilty. John 
Paul Blair's was given two four-year pen 
terms on pleas of guilty to third degree 
burglary and theft by unlawful taking 
charges, but the two terms run con­
currently. In the second case Rodney 
Phillip Sexton was sentenced to a 1o-year 
term for first degree burglary. 

Blair, a resident of West Virginia, did 
not ask the cow-t to withhold sentence 
until a pre-sentence report was made by 
the probation officer. Asked if he had 
anything to say, he told the court, "Alii 
want is for you to send me on and let me 
begin my sentence." 

Trial of Forrest Ray Moore, who is 
charged with reckless homicide in the 

<See Story No. 5, Page 4) 

Contractor Told 
To Show Record 
On Allen Work 

The Floyd fiscal court was presented a 
bill Tuesday which it firmly refuled to 
pay until it knows more about what is 
happening in connection with the work at 
the Allen park. 

Wilton R. Fish, president of Big Wheel, 
Inc., contractor on Phase I at tbe part, 
was quizzed by the court after he had 
submitted for payment an estimate on 
the job. Eleven suits totalling $UM,OOO 
have been filed against Big Wheel, its 
bonding company and the fiscal court. 

"We paid you. What happened to the 
money? Why are we being sued?" 
County Judge-Executive Yvonne S. 
Jones asked Fish. 

The suits were filed by sub-rontracton 
and suppliers of materials. Magistrate 
Kenneth Roberts asked the head of the 
contracting firm if it was possible that be 
had spent a part of the money paid him 
by the county for work on other jobs 
outside of the county, and Fish admitted 
that this could have happened. 

The county at one time considered 
terminating Big Wheel's contract, then 
decided to stay that action and seek 
liquidated damages from its bonding 
firm. 

At Tuesday's meeting the court voted 
unanimously not to pay anything untU 
Fish produces all his recorda, showing 
invoices, and those paid as well as those 
yet due, at the next court meeting, at 1 
p.m. Sept. 26. 

The contractor claims tbat the work ia 
98 percent complete, with work promiaed 
to correct some sub-standard con­
struction items. 

Magistrate Roberts' motion to rescind 
the recent vote of the court to pay $100 a 
month for the salary ~ a trial com­
missioner for the district court lost on tbe 
deciding vote of Judge Jones. Roberts 
and Magistrate Eddie C&udill voted to 
rescind the action, Magistrates Ray 
Wilcox and Hershell Hamilton to sustain 
it . In casting the vote to keep in effect tbe 
order to pay for a trial commiaaJoner, 
Judge Stumbo explained that District 

<See Story No.6, Page 4) 

KY 80 Sector 
Nears Contract 

Work on about 4.5 miles of new KY 80 in 
Floyd and Knott counties is to be in­
cluded in the state Bureau of Highway's 
September 22 bid-letting. 

The new KY project in this COWlly is for 
about two miles of grading and draiaqe, 
near the Bull Creek road. About one-half 
mile of this section is to be surfaced 
under the project, Transportation 
SecretaryGrayson said. 

Pupil Truancy Cost 
May Be $9,000 a Day 

Floyd county's school system is losing 
an estimated $9,000 a day to pupil 
truancy, and what to do about the 
situation is a real puzzler. 

Superintendent of Schools E. P. Grigs­
by, Jr. said this week that attendance 
personnel are contacting parents, and 
that work within the system is being done 
to make school programs more inviting 
and interesting to youngsters . That 
helps- but not enough. 

And taking youngsters to court is 
virtually a waste of time. They are 
retw-ned to the custody of the parents, or 
the schools. 

The schools lose money- $8 per day per 
child out of school. The youngsters lose 
precious time. 

One attack on the problem the school 
system here has not ~mdertaken, and that 
is on the parents of truants. 

Boyd county is leading the way in that 
direction. Floyd county native Calvin 
Gearhart, who has long held the office of 
county attorney in Boyd, last week an­
nounced the plan agreed to between 
school and district court officials there 
regarding truancy cases in which the 
students are without excuse. 

"The plan," he explained, "is when a 
child attains five absences, that fact will 
be reported to the district court. Once the 
information is made available to us, we'll 
evaluate it and if it appears that there's 
no excusable reason for a child misaiq 
school, the parents will be brought to 
court." 

He added that a parent who fails to 
keep a child from becoming a truant is 
guilty ~ a first degree misdemeanor 

which is punishable by a fine of $500 and a 
jail term of not more than 12 months. 

That's getting tough, but Calvin 
Gearhart has little patience with parents 
who willingly permit their children to 
remain out of school. For he recalls hil 
own boyhood and the sacrifices hil 
father, the late Fred Gearhart, made to 
keep him in clasa. 

County Attorney Gearhart suffered a 
crippling sickness in hil childhood. 
Roads were miserable. 'lbere were no 
a\tomobiles. Blt his father got him to 
school-by sled, wagon, or on bil own 
back. 

Truancy, Gearhart maintaina, is tbe 
parents' responsibility. "It was Dad who 
kept me from being a truant. I never cld 
·see a child who wanted to go to ldlool. 
Anyone would rather play arauad tile 
house or go fishing. It's not tbe cblld'a 
fault." 

"After five days," Gearhart said 
recently. both parents will be brqbt 
before the court. Why tate the child out 
of school another day!" 

Commented Alice Tbomaa, pupil 
personnel director of tbe Aahlud school 
system: 

"Normally, we appr.O.ched tbe 
problem throu&h the c!t. r.U. tbaD 
through tbe parent, but n we're tl')'inC 
a .new approach to an prublaa. 'lbe 
aehools were in limbo. dldD't bow 
what could be done. e're ftDdiDa out 
that the schools c do it al-.," 

County Attome Gearhart aid, '"I 
don't want to onf1ae trulai:J witll 
juvenile delinqta , but tbll wiD Dip a 
lot ol juvenile !I Ia tbe bud." 
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BONANZA FREEWILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Bonanza, Ky. 
Sunday School ... - .. - -10 a.m. 
Worship ... - - - - - 11 a.m. 
{'hoirPractice • .. -7p.m., Tue&. 
Prayer Service & Bible Study 

7 p.m., Wednes 

Everyone Cordially Invited. 
Elder Scott Castle, Pastor 

7-27-tf. 

ATTENTION: 
Landlord 

leading hard line retailer 
has financially qualified 
prospects that are in search 
of a retail location in your 
area. Existing building 
desired but will consider 
your plans for new con­
struction-4,000 to 8,000 Sq. 
Foot building needed. Ap­
proved prospects willing to 
sign a good lease with you. 
For prompt reply, please 
send information regarding 
your property to 

Wholesale 
Sales Manager 

P.O. BoxZ 
Delaware, Ohio 43015 

8-30-4t. 

To .Wed September 29 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Pack, of Drift, 
announce the engagement and forth­
coming marriage of their daughter, 
Rhonda Lynn, to Kenny Joe Mitchell, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Lester Mitchell, of Ligon. 

The marriage vows will be exchanged 
on Friday, Sept. 29, at 8:00 p.m. at the 
Drift Pentecostal church. All friends and 
relatives of the couple are invited to 
attend. 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Troy Whitt wish to ex­

press our heartfelt thanks to all of our 
neighbors and friends for the food and 
flowers , for the help and kindness shown 
to us during the passing of our beloved 
husband and father. We are grateful to 
the doctors and nurses at Highland 
Regional hospital and the Floyd Funeral 
Home for their kindness and un­
derstanding during our time of sorrow. 
We are also grateful to the Regular 
Baptist ministers Hobert Halbrooks, and 
Carl Ray Tuttle. We cannot find words to 
tell all of you how much you have meant 
to us in times like this. 

May God bless all of you. 
KATE WHITI AND CHILDREN 

"You can get 
a little richer 
every day!" 

~ 

Our passbook savings 
are compounded daily at 
5 Y.a% ... that's more 
interest than your bank is 
allowed to pay·. No need to tie-up money long-term, your 
funds are always accessible. 

Floyd Federal 
Savings and Loan Association 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky 886-2383 
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BRING YOUR FEDERAL FOOD STAMPS 
1 

TO PELPHREY'S GROCERY. PELPHREY'S 
,'!!~it.!, Pelphrey's now accepts Master Charge and BankAmericard .• 

MONEY 
ORDERS 

TV DINNERS . 2for $l oo POTATOES ______________ _)0-lb. bag $1.00 
HAMBURGER--------------- _Jb 89c HEAD LETTUCE ____________ Jheads$1.00 
MIRACLEMARGARINE- ---------- lb' 59c TOMATOES _______________ J»asket$1.50 
TOWN HOUSE CRACKERS_:::~_-_-------_l6:0i:-bo~89c BREAD_------------- __ 4 loaves$1.00 
RICH AND READY ORANGE DRINK _______ gal. $1.00 MAGIC BLEACH- - - - - -- - - -- -_gal. 59c 

Pelphrey's hasalllhe latest8-Track Tapes! 

Virginians Lose Round 
In Knott Land Case Ashley Auction 

APPROX. 3-ACRE Virginians who a few years ago laid 
claim to thousands of acres of Knott 
county land have lost the first round of a 
federal court fight. 

U.S. District Judge H. David Hermans­
dorfer ruled last week in favor of M.R. 
Godley, of Charlotte, N.C., who filed suit 
in 1975 to set aside and expunge the 
records of some land transactions that 
took place several years earlier. 

Defendants in the suit were Piedmont 
Land Sales Inc. of Salem, Va.; Hugh 
Rakes, of Salem, a principal of Pied­
mont; Clinton Coal Co., in which Rakes 
also was involved; and W.F . Goff, of 
Pound, Va. 

In his decision, Hermansdorfer said 
seven deeds recorded in Knott county 
involving a series of land transactions 
have no legal force, and that Godley has 
title to the land, subject to a coal mineral 
lease made to John Graham and L.D. 
Graham. 

f\nnual Candy Sale 
Slated To Benefit 
Kidney Foundation 

Fall is at han4, and one of the 
traditions of the new season is the annual 
Tootsie Roll candy sale sponsored by the 
local chapter of the Kidney Foundation of 
Central Kentucky. 

Mike Parlier, of Prestonsburg, 
chairman of the annual campaign for the 
Big Sandy Chapter of the Foundation, 
will coordinate the local sales effort. 
Parlier, the kidney dialysis supervisor at 
Highlands Regional Medical Center here, 
said this year's goal is to raise $1,800. 
Last year's candy sales resulted in more 
than $1,500 for the Foundation. 

The Tootsie Roll Midgees for sale this 
year come in reusable banks. Printed on 
each bank is a list of the six warning 
signs of kidney disease. The cost for each 
candy-filled bank is $1. 

Proceeds from the candy sale will 
support efforts to help dialysis and trans­
plant patients, promote organ donor 
education and research and other 
Foundation activities. 

A large portion of the money raised 
remains in the area for use by local 
patients and institutions. Highlands 
Regional here has four dialysis machines 
used by some 17 patients. Each patient 
receives three treatments weekly. The 
hospital also has two dialysis machines 
that are in use in private homes in the 
area. 

The candy banks will be on sale at the 
Kidney Foundation-Highlands Regional 
Medical Center booth at the Floyd 
County Fair and also at the Apple 
Festival next month in Paintsville. 
Candy sales will continue through the 
month of October by various civic 
groups, Highlands Regional staff 
members and dialysis patients. 

HAROLD NEWS 
METHODIST WOMEN MEET 

Mrs. Areolas Allen was hostess to the 
women of Vogue-Day United Methodist 
Church of Harold at her new home at 
Banner. The meeting was conducted by 
the president, Harriet Mullins. Regina 
Daniels led in prayer. Mrs. Ruby Staton 
gave the devotionals and program, using 
the subject, "Love." Pledges and dues 
were collected. Preparing a Nursery for 
the church and Sunday school was 
discussed. Also discussed were ways of 
getting better attendance for Sunday 
school. Mrs. Mitchell Thomas, wife of the 
new pastor, joined the Women's Society. 
A special prayer was held at the closing 
of the meeting for the sick and shut-ins. 
Refreshments were served to to Mrs. 
Hattie Mae Hall, Mrs. Ruby Staton, Mrs. 
Anita Thomas, Mrs. Regina Daniels, 
Mrs. Harriet Mullins, Mrs. Margaret 
Branham, Mrs. Jackie Kidd, Mrs. Addie 
Ben Hall, Mrs. Elizabeth Spears, Mrs. 
Areolas Allen, hostess . 

The property mentioned in the suit, 
which was filed in Pikeville, covers some 
24,700 acres-all but 1,000 of them on 
Quicksand and Troublesome creeks and 
some of their major tributaries in Knott 
county. 

The uncertain status of the land first 
aroused interest in 1974 when a Bob 
Bales, of Salem, claimed ownership of 
the acreage and said he intended to mine 
it for coal . 

Bales claimed to have been assigned 
deeds by Piedmont, although there are 
other claims to the disputed land by 
families that have lived there and paid 
taxes on it-some for more than a cen­
tury-the Knott county school system 
and the University of Kentucky, owner of 
Robinson Forest. 

Although Hermansdorfer's decision 
takes notice of the possibility of other 
claims and additional litigation, it states 
the decision expresses an opinion only on 
ownership insofar as it involves the 
parties to the suit. Accompanying the 
judge's two-page order resolving the 
issue in Godley's favor is a 13-page 
memorandum opinion that outlines the 
transactions that took place in so far as 
they could be determined. 

In that opinion, Hermansdorfer notes 
the complexity of the issues and states, 
"In short, this litigation has much the 
flavor of a spirited checker game played 
on the lawn of a rural Kentucky court­
house on a summer afternoon-<me must 
stay alert to know where the checkers 
went." 

BABY FARM 
Sept. 30, 1978 Sat., 1:30 p.m. 

We have been instructed by the owners to sell their BABY FARM 
located on Hwy. 11, approx. 2 miles north of the Intersection of Hwy. 15 and 
Hwy. 11 at Waltersville, Ky., and approx. 12 miles from Mt. Sterling, Ky. 
This fine home has a chain link fence around the front yard and a beautiful 
apple orchard between the highway and the house. Also there is some un­
developed woodland behind the home. 

This home has an upstairs with a large living room, complete built-in 
kitchen with pass-thru service to the dining room, 2 nice bedrooms with 
ample closet space, 1 full bath with linen storage. Downstairs there is a large 
family room with a woodburning stove. Laundry outlets and plenty of room 
for an extra bedroom and there also is a recreation room. This home is well 
insulated and the walls are studded with 2x6, with 6-inch insulation. 

If you've been looking for a fine home located on the main road, a few 
minutes drive from the Mt. Parkway, 45 minutes drive to downtown 
Lexington, then we invite your inspection. Make your arrangements and be 
at this auction. 

OWNERS-Ray Ashley and Mrs. Eula P. Ashley 

TERMS-10 percent deposit upon signing of purchase agreement; 
balance on or before 30 days upon passing of marketable title. 

This Auction conducted by: 

The Kentucky land Auction Company 
J. 0. Briggs-Auctioneer, Realtor 

Fred Combs-Auctioneer 

On the question of fraud in connection 
with Rakes' dealings with Godley, 
Hermansdorfer found that although 
Rakes "engaged in acts of intentional 
misrepresentation," Godley had failed to 
make a case of civil fraud before the 
court because he did not establish he had 
been injured by Rakes' actions. "Any 
injury suffered by Godley arose, not from 
Rakes' misrepresentations to Godley, 
but from Rakes' subsequent transactions 
with other purported grantees (land 
purchasers)," the decision states. 

I• 
9-13-2t. 

J. Gordon Combs-App. Auctioneer, Broker 
Stanton~ Ky. 663-2519 

Your Choice! 

SAVE •1595 

EUREKA CANISTER 
Self-storing tools in l ift-out t ray 
steel construct ion with full 
c leaning power. 9 pc. tool set 
for full floor to ceil ing cleaning. 

SAVE •2995 

EUREKA UPRIGHT 
• Brill iant headlight 
• Exclusive 6-way Dial -A­

Nap rug height adjustment 
• Power-driven 12-inch 

beater bar brush roll 

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION & 4 WHEEL DRIVE 
SAVE '50°0 

2-motor 
Power Team SPECIALISTS 

COMPLETE AUTO SERVICE 

• BRAKE & ELECTRICAL REPAIR 
• AIR CONDITIONING SERVICE 

! 1886-908~ 
GEN 'S AUTO & TRUCK SERVICE 

404 S. Lake Dr .. Prestonburg 8-23-tf. 

• Powerful upright carpet 
cleaning action with 
canister versat ility. 

• Roto-Matic powerhead 
with motorized Vibra­
Groomer<!' beater bar. 
Brush roll thoroughly 
deep-cleans carpet like 
an upright . 

• Brilliant headlight and 
cleaning tools Included. 

$18995 
MODEL 1279 

Reg. S239.9S 

FRASURE 

• Wide, bright headlight helps dtscover dirt in darkest 
corners. 

• Exclusive 6-posttton dial control is easy to reach, 
adjusts front end of cleaner for best overall 
performance. 

FURNITURE 
Phone 886-6900 9·13 

9-27 
10-4 No. Lake Drive Prestonsburg 
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Special Services­

"Jesus Is Life" 
at the 

House of Prayer 
in Wayland 

Sept. 15, 16, 17 at 7 p.m. 
Come hPar Brother Bright, 

or Beckley, W.Va. 
and the Singing Sowards, 

or Marietta, 0. 

1<~\'ERYO!'IE WELCOME 

Data on Immunizations 
Target of Census Survey 

Representatives of the Bureau of the 
Census will conduct a survey in this area 
during the week of September 18-23 
to determine the extent people have been 
immunized against selected diseases, 
Joseph R. Norwood, director of the 
bureau's regional office in Charlotte, 
announced this week. The survey is 
conducted throughout the U.S. every 
year to provide information on im­
munization against measles, ,influenza, 
polio, diphtheria, whooping cough, 
tetanus, rubella, and mumps needed for 
administration of health programs 
geared to disease prevention. In· 
terviewers who will visit households in 
this area include Mrs . Mary P. Rich­
mond, Paintsville, and Cauline Martin, 
Garrett. 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

Two More Days, Wednes. & Thurs. 

Showtimes......:.7:30 and 9:30p.m. 

ONE WEEK ONLY 
FRIDAY 'THRU THURSDAY 

September 14 to September 21 

COlUMBIA PICTURES PRESENlS A MOl OWN C ASABLANCA PROOUCliON ol 

T G I F ~ 
S~c~l Guest Star• DONNA SuMMER and l HE COMMODORES 

E>ecot • • PvodtKe• NEll BOGAR' Wnllen by BARRY ARI.IYAN BERNSTEIN 
Produced by ROB COHEN Due< teo by ROBER' KlANE 

I ORIGINAL sour<DlRACK ALBUM AVAILABLE O N CASABLANCA RECORDS A"'D TAPE s I 
A PG ....,._OI.lllllla._STU_ ___ .._ ... .., .......... - o-:--1 

1: l978Cokilfttloa Pct!lf'U ntt~o~~1t11'1o Inc~ 

Showtimes-7:30 and 9:15 
Sun. Matinee, One Showing-Open at 1, start at 1:30, 

over at 3:00 

OF PRESTONSBURG 

The Floyd County Times 

Outpatient Operating Room Opens 

With the sn lp of the scissors, the new outpatient operating room at 
Highlands Regional Medical Center at Prestonsburg was opened 
to expand the surgical services offered by the hospital. Shown 
cutting the ribbon, from the left, are Les Rankin, administrator, 
Lois Burchett, RN, operating room supervisor, and Dr. William B. 
Cook, chief of surgery. Members of the hospital's surgical staff 
look on. 

Out patient surgery has a new em· 
phasis at Highlands Regional Medical 
Center here with the opening of the 
hospital's outpatient operating room. 
Highlands Regional becomes the first 
hospital in the area to provide a 
sophisticated facility, primarily for 
outpatient surgery. 

The.concept of outpatient surgery is a 
"coming thing" in hospitals and allows 
safe, effective, one-day service to 
patients for a number of surgical 
procedures, according to Les Rankin, 
hospital administrator. 

Dr. William B. Cook, chief of surgery 
at Highlands indicated that a variety of 
minor operations will now be performed 
in the new facility that were previously 
done in other operating rooms. The 
result, said Dr. Cook, will be the freeing 
of the other rooms for a greater number 
of major cases. 

With the addition of the new room 
Highlands Regional now has fou; 
operating rooms. Plans call for ap­
proximately six procedures per day in 
the new facility. Records show that more 
than 300 surgical procedures were 
performed at the hospital during the 
month of August. 

Lois Burchett, RN, operating room 

Gospel Fellowship Group 

To Meet September 16 
The Big Sandy Chapter of the Full 

Gospel Business Men's Fellowship will 
meet at 6 :30 p.m. Saturday, Sept. 16, at 
the Holiday Inn, Pikeville, with the Rev. 
Matthew J . Weide, of Spring City, Pa., 
executive secretary of Presbyterians 
United for Biblical Concerns, as the 
speaker. 

The chapter has Saturday morning 
breakfast at the Holiday Inn on the 
second and fourth Saturdays. 

supervisor at Highlands Regional , called 
the new room, "marvelous for the staff 
but , more importantly, for the patients." 
She explained that "patients can arrive 
in the morning, have their surgery, leave 
that afternoon and save a great deal of 
money." 

The expansion to build the new 
operating room was begun last 
February. 

For ' further information on this and 
other stories, contact : Russell Dean, 
Director, Development and Public 
Relations, Highlands Regional Medical 
Center, U.S. 23 N. Box 668, Prestonsburg, 
Ky . 41653 phone: 606·886-8511 . 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
HEAD START CHILDREN SOUGHT 
IN FLOYD COUNTY 

The Floyd County School System is in 
the process of recruiting four year olds 
for their Head Start Program to be 
located at Clark, Garrett, Martin, 
Osborne and Stumbo schools. Head Start 
is scheduled to open in late fall. 

All children accepted for the program 
must meet income guidelines set forth by 
the Department of Health, Education and 
welfare. 

The program also provides services for 
the handicapped children who meet the 
income- guidelines. 

ApplicationS for the program may be 
ptcked up at the Floyd County Board of 
Education located on North Arnold 
Avenue or at the CAP office at the 
courthouse. 

If further information is needed please 
call Vicki Ann Steele at the Floyd County 
Board of Education Head Start office. 
The number is 886-2354. 

lt. 

A FRIENDLY PLACE TO SHOP & SAVE FAMOUS 
BRANDS 

Foshion-y 

COSTUME 
JEWELRY 
Big Group 

Y2 Price 

Find all your fa· 
vorites, earrings, 
bracelets, neck· 
laces, stick pins! 

Famous National Brand 

Panty & Hose 
Allin One 

Look II 
There are no panty 

lines under your clothes. 
Because the panty 

is knit right in. 
Reg. $1.95 if perfect 

With cotton crotch 

NOW 

Queen-

King-

Infant' 
& 

Toddler 
Sizes PAN~ 

(ll"~one: 886-9421 
HOURS: 
Mon.-Sat., 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

• 

• Resilient 
• Odorless 
• Mat-Resistant 
• Non-Allergenic 

VISA-MASTER CHARGE-COX CHARGE-LAY-AWAY-CASH-5 EASY WAYS TO SHOP 

Handbags for Fall made of 
genume leather Snap closing, 
front pocket 

12.75 Reg. S17.97. 

Nothing sells our shoes 
better than our shoes. 

-- Section One, Page Three 

Kirby Co. Of Prestonsburg 
Only Factory Authorized Dist. In Floyd Co. 

Auxier Rd. Ph. 886-6749 
Next to Gerry & Jerry Shoe 

lt-pd. 

----~~~~~~-----· 
PRESTO SBURCi 

DRIVE- IN THEATRE 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

FRI.-SAT.-SU 
Sept. 15-16-17 

• 

Convention Girls 
plus 

Naked Rider 
R 

R 

' ,, 

f' 

* 

L-.. L-~~--~·----------~'h.a·'--'~41~--------~·--~~~--~ 
·--~· 

• ALitiAR • 
DRIVE - IN THEATRE 

ALLEN, KENTUCKY 

116\f?d!ti?JSS W??i£SiW$$W4XS@XS lfM§Qm\\SfjSWd$SS?$QI§Si22$Wil§Yi. 

FRI.-SAT.-SUN. 
Sept. 15-16-17 

Tbe F + B Amllulaftce Co. b 
looklnJ !01' a hw pod rnen ... but tbe7 

will take anJ' body the)- can Ft. 

It\ GEORGE SEGAL 
And GOLDIE HAWN 

conni nc th~ir way 
throutt\ the old 
w~s.t 1n • brisk 

&nd b&wdy 
comedy 

Open evenings and Sunday 1-6 p.m. 
Master Charge or Visa welcome. 
Sale prices good thru Sundalf. 

U.S. 23 North 

Your choice 

15.00 
A.Women's front-lace boot features 

side zipper. elast ic msert and 
thick, comfortable sole Rust 

Reg. S21.97. now S15.00 

B. Women's boot for Fall has srde 
stitched detailing, side z1pper. 

and wood·l1ke heel Brown 
Reg. $19.97. now S15.00 

C. Women's fash1on boot features 
beauti fully detailed stitchrng 

on vamp, msrde z1pper for 
comfort. and wedge heel 
Reg. $19.97. now $15.00 

Panty hose pnced wrth your budget 
rn mmd Assorted shades. 

Reg. 69C 45<= 

Near Sears Prestonsburg 
Open l>ail) 9 a .m. to 9 p.m . 
Op«"n Sunda~ 1 to 6 p .m . 
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The Danger of a Fuel Monopoly 
The proposed deregulation of prices to be charged for newly 

produced natural gas as a means of stimulating fuel production 
In the country Is drawing the headlines, these days, but the 
Administration's energy program has other equally Important 
facets. 

And It may be lacking some control provisions that could be as 
Important as natural gas production. A provision to relieve the 
national fuel supply from the danger of a monopoly, for Instance. 

Big Oil and a few other conglomerates are gradually "cor­
nering" the national fuel supply. As domestic oil production has 
dropped far short of the national need, these firms naturally 
have looked elsewhere, taking steps to remain In business In the 
future. To oil and gas production they have added coal and 
uranium -everything but solar energy. 

Meanwhile, federal regulations have become so stringent and 
Involved that few "small" coal operators are financially able 
and have the expertise to cope with them. Again, the trend is 
toward the big corporations. 

In Eastern Kentucky, where Individual operators have till this 
date shared In the financial benefits of the coal boom, coal Is 
placed at a disadvantage by the federal mine law which exempts 
operators In Wyoming from the necessity of restoring to their 
original contours the 30-40-foot holes scooped In the mining of 
huge seams of coal. Conglomerates are the main operators 
there, too. 

Conglomerates or Individuals, coal operators and producers of 
all fuels are, naturally, In business to make money. Natural gas 
producing companies have literally sat on their hands In recent 
years, awaiting the day when the price Is right. That Is what the 
deregulating of gas prices Is all about-to get them moving 
again. 

Now, If a few companies get control of production of all known 
fuels, what will be the plight of the Individual consumer and the 
nation as a whole? 

The United States may as well be held up for better prices by 
the Arabs as by our own people. 

--- 2 ---
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decrease in blood donations. Many 
regular donors are on vacation and other 
would-be donors often get busy with 
outdoor activities and do not think about 
donations unless the need is called to 
their attention, it is explained. 

More than 150 pints of blood have been 
transfused daily through the 33 hospitals 
that are supplied by the Central Ken­
tucky Blood Center, but only an average 
of 80or 90 pints have been donated daily. 
This has forced the center to go to its 
supply of blood that is kept frozen for 
emergencies, and even this supply is now 
running dangerously low, a spokesman 
for the Center said. 

--- 4 
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There was a brief trial. No, this Guy 
Rabbitfoot was not a licensed phar­
macist. Nor did he have license to use the 
courthouse lawn as a "store" for the sale 
of his medicines. The late Forrest D. 
Short, then county attorney, had a good 
case, and Acting Judge Woodrow Bur­
chett had instructed the jury what it 
could do in the matter. But Defense · 
Attorney J. D. Bond recalled in the 
course of his argument the historic 
Manhattan Swindle in which a white, 
namely, one Peter Stuyvesant-or was it 
Minuet?- bought the whole island for $24 
worth of beads. The attorney clinched the 
matter by declaring that "we shouldn't 
pit this Indian in jail, even if he sells us 
blue water for $1 per bottle." 

That did it. Forgotten were the 
''pickled" tapeworms the blue-eyed 
Indian had exhibited out there on the 
courthouse lawn, the trained dog act, the 
blackface monologue and wooden 
dummies that profaned grounds outside 
"the temple of justice." The jurors, 
smiling, if not actually snickering, 
brought in a verdict of not guilty. 

This old copy of The Times shows that 
the editor got pretty hot under the collar 
himself about this "miscarriage of 
justice,'' and said so. 

But, if I were on the jury today, I doubt 
if I would convict the poor fellow. Lo, the 
poor Indian-he was one of the more 
innocent and more gentle grafters of his 
time. 

And why not let him come back? We 
are all buying nostnuns from others that 
are just as worthless as Indian Snake Oil. 

CHURCH GROUP MEETS 
The Women's Society of the Horn 

Chapel Church met Monday evening, 
Sept. 4, at the church. The president, 
Mrs. Marietta Crager, presided at the 
business session. The secretary­
treasurer, Mrs. Willia Mae Branham, 
gave her reports. The program for the 
evening was presented by Mrs. Lula 
Wallen. Following the meeting, the 
hostess, Mrs. Belvie Wills, served 
refreshments to Mesdames Bessie 
Adkins, Jennifer Branham, Willia Mae 
Branham, Rosey Burchett, Dania 
Bingham, Marietta Crager, Pat Calhoun, 
Mollie Hyden , Linda Jerferson, Bess 
Wells, and Belvia Wills, and visitors, 
Mrs. Mag Bingham and Mrs. Mabel 
Allen 

--- 3 ---
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out, • 'but to rid a lake the size of Dewey of 
a heavy milfoil growth would be 
prohibitively expensive.'' 

Pfeiffer said the unchecked growth of 
milfoil "can completely choke a lake," 
making casting, trolling, even water 
skiing, virtually impossible. 

"In addition, baitfish are afforded so 
much cover in which to hide that they are 
almost removed from the food chain of a 
lake," Pfeiffer said. "The result in many 
lakes with a milfoil problem," he con­
tinued, "is that game fish often become 
stunted." 

Pfeiffer also cattioned that if a large 
amount of milfoil should die at one time 
as a result of some natural phenomenon, 
the rotting vegetation could conceiveably 
use up enough oxygen in the decaying 
process to cause a major fish kill. 

If the milfoil growth ever becomes a 
real problem, it will only compound a 
series of various others which have af­
fected the reservoir since its im­
poundment-problems such as: 

Suspected oversupply of gizzard shad 
with repeated rotenone poisoning to thin 
the shad schools. <Many large bass and 
other desirable fish species were killed 
as well as shad). 

Siltation caused by timbering and, 
more recently, by heavy strip-mining 
activity in the lake's headwaters which 
have made the current sedimentation 
rate three times normal. 

Consistently the lowest ratio of sport 
fish to rough fish of all Eastern Kentucky 
impoundments. 

Dewey, which is probably the best 
known "stump the biologists" problem 
lake in the state, may also be the only 
major impoundment in Kentucky which 
requires regular stocking of white bass, 
normally a prolific breeder, due to the 
fact that Johns Creek, which forms the 
lake, almost never clears adequately in 
the spring to allow the fish to spawn 
successfully. 

Besides the poisoning activity of 
fisheries personnel, the state has also 
attempted repeated applications of 
fertilizer to the lake as well as ex­
perimental stocking of several species, 
including northern pike, walleye, striped 
bass and even the shellcracker sunfish. 

Although the stocking programs never 
produced a dramatic change in the game 
to rough fish ratio or sport fishing, 
Pfeiffer said fisheries personnel "are 
excited" by new predator species which 
are now being tried within the state, 
particularly the tiger muskie, a muskie­
northern pike hybrid. 

The tiger muskie which has been 
stocked in Dewey for the past two years 
is said to be a voracious feeder and an 
excellent game fish . Pfeiffer said studies 
at Cave Run reservoir, near Morehead, 
have shown that the hybrids display a 
preference for carp, a common rough 
fish in Dewey lake as well. 

Although Pfeiffer stressed that the 
milfoil situation at Dewey may never 
develop into a real problem, he chided 
those who would introduce non-native 
plant or animal life to an area without 
first considering the possible en­
vironmental consequences. 

THE ANNUAL economic 1mpact of 
arthritis in the U.S . totals nearly $13 
billion- and is rising al a staggering rate 
of one bi Ilion dollars a year . 

The Floyd County Times 

Our Yesterdays 
(Items taken from The Floyd County 

Times, 10, 20, 30 and 40 years ago) 

Ten Years Ago 
<Sf'ptl'mber 12, 1968) 

The Martin high school gymnasiwn was destroyed Sunday morning by a 
fire of unknown origin which raged for three hours before the danger of a 
widespread conflagration through the town was past. .. The first of two 
evaluations of the Appalachian Volunteers following a study made here and 
elsewhere in Eastern Kentucky by a team from the Office of Economic 
Opportunity is a mixture of praise and censure ... James Edgar Turner, 44, of 
Wheelwright, was killed last Sunday morning from a gunshot wound s~f­
fered at Vicco ... The hot-mix plant installed near Emma during the Breathitt 
administration has been sold to the Adams Construction Company, 
Pikeville , by the Kentucky Department of Highways ... Born: to Mr. and Mrs. 
James C. Hall, of Bypro, a daughter, Sept. 3; to Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Lee 
Gray, ofRiverRouge, Mich., a son, Sept. 3; to Mr. and Mrs. George Parsons, 
of Drift, a daughter, Sept. 5; to Mr. and Mrs. Estill E . Campbell, of 
Teaberry, a daughter, Sept. 6; to Mr. and Mrs. Dennis J. Prater, Jr., of 
Hueysville, a daughter, Sept. 7; to Mr. and Mrs . Lester Johnson, of Halo, a 
son, Sept. 8; to Mr . and Mrs. Riley Newsome, Jr., of Ligon, a son, Sept. 
l. .. There died : Mrs. Mandy Meade, 79, of Printer, Sunday at Our Lady of the 
Way hospital, Martin ; Oscar Sturgill, 77, of Pike county, formerly of Floyd 

,county, last Thursday at the Methodist hospital, Pikeville; Mrs. Annie 
Layne Davidson, 91, of Prestonsburg, Monday at the Prestonsburg General 
hospital; Rev. Henry Mullins , 59, of Eastern, Saturday morning, as the 
result of an accident which occured as he worked on a car at his place of 
business at Eastern ; Wayne Howell, 74, Tuesday at East McDowell; Mrs. 
Lora <Shorty) Blair Walker, 73, of Prestonsburg, last Thursday at the 
Prestonsburg General hospital ; Oscar Farmer, 78, of Wheelwright, Sunday 
at the McDowell Appalachian Regional hospital; Lonnie Holland, 55, Sunday 
at his home at Poor Bottom, Pike county; Miss Emma Patton , 75, Aug. 28 at 
her home at Langley. 

Twenty Years Ago 
<September 11, 1958) 

All32 workers of the S.T. Kenyon Co., contractors on the flood protection 
project here, were idle Wednesday after employees had quit work on two 
complaints ... Mrs. Betty Blackburn Goble, 18, and Mrs. Jane Harris, 76, 
almost miraculously escaped apparent serious injury this morning <Thurs­
day) when the pick-up truck they were driving was hit by a coal train and 
reduced to wreckage at a crossing near the home of Floyd Goble .. . Floyd 
county's tax rate is in the lower middle category in relation to other Ken­
tucky counties with $.50 county and $1.50 school...County Judge Henry 
Stumbo was authorized by the fiscal court in special meeting Sept. 3 to sign 
blanket deeds to the state for rights-of-way on Toler Creek and Salyers 
Branch of Salt Lick where force account roads are to be built ... There died: 
Mrs. Ella G Marsh, 75, formerly of this county, last Tuesday in a road 
mishap at Culloden, W.Va. ; John Fannin, 66, last Wednesday at his home at 
Endicott; Mrs . Lunie Belle Prater, 57, Saturday at her home at Hippo; Allen 
Mims Cline, 66, formerly of Prestonsburg, Sept. 2 at his home in Boyd 
county ; Mrs. Billie Mae Litz, formerly of Wayland, Sept. 1 at Caledonia, 0 .; 
Joe Miller; 54, of Manton, last week in the mines of the Stephens Elkhorn 
Coal Co.; Mrs. Virginia S. Lockhard, 53, native of Endicott, Saturday at 
Cincinnati ; Mrs. Mary Shrewsberry, 46, of Weeksbury, last Thursday at the 
McDowell Memorial hospital ; Mrs. Rebecca Mayo Reynolds, 70, Monday at 
her home at Martin ; John A. Music, 55, Aug . 'nat his home at McDowell; 
Mrs. Malissa Hall Gree, 81, widow of Civil War Union Army veteran William 
Greer, Friday, Aug. 29 at her home at East.Point; Mrs. Dollie V. Rice, 87, of 
Garrett, Sunday at Our Lady of the :ay hospital, Martin; Mrs. Carrie Cook 
Childers, 51, of Bevinsville, Sunday at Baptist hospital, Louisville. 

Thirty Years Ago 
(September 9, 1948) 

Circuit Judge Edward P . Hill Tuesday morning called on the grand jury to 
investigate rumors to the effect that a county-owned truck is being used in 
hauling whiskey and at the same time asked that a probe be made into other 
rumors claiming bootleggers are getting protection from officials in the 
Right Beaver Creek section ... A fist fight and near-shooting scattered the 
gathering for the City Council meeting Monday night and sent Councilmen 
scurrying for cover along with their constituents ... The Glogora Coal Com­
pany building burned alledgedly by arsonists a few months ago at Glo is 
being replaced by a stone structure In a new location in the mining com­

munity at an estimated cost of $30,000, John S. Hamton, coal company 
superintendent, said Wednesday ... The 15th moonshine still to be 
captured by Knott county Sheriff ElmonWatts and deputies in the last three 
weeks was taken Friday on the Pine Tree branch of Jones Fork ... A. B. 
"Happy" Chandler, high commissioner of baseball, will take a leading part 
in the dedication on the night of Sept. 24 of Wayland's new baseball park and 
its lighting system, J . C. Wells, Wayland, announced Tuesday af­
ternoon ... Whatever gains the Republican party has made over the nation 
have been made outside Floyd county, registration figures at the office of 
County Clerk Jarvis Allen indicate ... Born: to Mr. and Mrs. Everette 
Osborne, of West Prestonsburg, a son, Everette Eugene, II, Sept. 5 ... There 
died: William Clyde Lewis, 57, Saturday at his home at Mare Creek ; Mrs. 
Eva Slone, Tuesday at her home at Lackey; Mrs. Gladys Hall, 'n, Monday at 
her home at Melvin, of tuberculosis; Mrs. Olva Rice, 26, Monday at her 
home at Galveston. 
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It was emphasized that the general 
budget reflects only estimated ex­
penditures and receipts. Supt. Grigsby 
said that a "close estimate" statement 
due in about two months will more ac­
curately reflect the board's fiscal 
situation and how much the deficit 
existing since last year has been 
reduced. 

Biggest estimated outlay item in the 
budget is $5,411,229 for instruction. In 
addition to salaries of principals, 
supervisors and regular classroom 
teachers, this item includes school 
clerical help, audio-visual and library 
materials, tests and the like. 

An expenditure of $590,000 for pupil 
transportation is expected, and plant 
operation cost of $573,643 is estimated. 
Other estimates of expenses include 
$178,000 for administration, $116,000 for 
attendance services, $375,000 for plant 
maintenance, $303,000 in fixed charges 
such as social security, insurance and 
bonds, and $294,530 for food services. 

The Kentucky School Boards 
Association has begun work on a 
program of secondary and elementary 
education in anticipation of the next 
General Assembly session, and the board 
named Ray Campbell to represent it in 
working with KSA on the program. 

Teachers employed at Wednesday's 
meeting are: 

Ruby Mayo, Martin Elementary, to 
replace Sonia Greer who retired; Oliver 
Allen, principal at Maytown Elemen­
tary ; Peggy Francis, as Homebound 
teacher, transferring from Osborne 
Elementary; Meredith Slone, at Daniels 
Creek ; Genivee Slone, at Osborne 
Elementary to replace Peggy Francis ; 
Karen Gayle Newman, at McDowell to 
replace Joan Chaffins, who is on a one­
year leave-of-absence; Cheryl Moore, 
Special Education teacher at Garrett 
Elementary; Marcella Miller Damron, 
to replace Gwendolyn Williams at Martin 
Elementary; Sandy Blankenship and 
Judy Burchell, at Wheelwright High ; 
Marilyn Barnes, at Betsy Layne 
Elementary; Mack Martin, at Martin 
Elementary to replace Judge Childers; 
Dennis King, at McDowell Elementary; 
Hazel Clifton, at Clark Elementary ; 
Shirley Harmon, from Betsy Layne 
Elementary to Betsy Layne High School ; 
Judith Childers, transferred from Martin 
Elementary to Allen Elementary to 
replace David Mosley, who was trans­
ferred to Allen and Maytown Elementary 
as p.e . teacher; Linda Holbrook, kin­
dergarten teacher at Maytown and 
Wayland schools; Clara B. Parker, 
kindergarten teacher at Harold 
Elementary; Darrell Greer, music 
teacher at Melvin, Osborne and 
Wheelwright, to replace Dallas Faye 
Sammons who is on a sabbatical leave-of­
absence; Carl Horne, transferred from 
principal to head teacher at Auxier to 
replace Chaddie Selvy who resigned; 
Patricia Martin, transffrred from 
Stumbo to Maytown Elementary to 
replace Lula Martin, who resigned; 
Rosie Brown, at Stumbo Elementary, to 
replace Patricia Martin. 

Cooks employed were Marjorie Lynch, 
at Betsy Layne, to replace Phyllis 
Stratton who resigned, and Maureen 
Tackett, part-time cook at Wheelwright 
High School. 

Substitute cooks : 
Jennifer Allen and Drucella Howell, at 

McDowell ; Kansas Ousley, at Martin 
Elementary ; Virginia Garrett, at Betsy 
Layne ; Mildred Mullins, at McDowell ; 
Phyllis Hughes, at Clark Elementary ; 
Flo Reed, at Clark, Prestonsburg High 
an~ Prestonsburg Elementary. 

Teacher aids named are : 
Brenda Tackett, at McDowell, to 

replace Marilyn Moore who resigned ; 
Madeline Heinisch, at McDowell ; Anna 
L. Scott, at Martin Elementary, to 
replace Stella Sprulock; Brenda H. 
Vanderpool, transferred from teacher 
aide to lunchroom bookkeeper at 
Prestonsburg Elementary ; Faye Smith, 
at Prestonsburg Elementary. 

Jacqueline Dillon was employed as 
clerk at Betsy Layne, to replace Sharon 
Hamilton who resigned, and Sally 
Reynolds as receptionist in the central 
office here to replace Susan Bailey, who 
resigned. 

Janitors : 
Tom Endicott, at Prestonsburg High 

School; Della Kidd, at Betsy Layne to 
replace Goldia Adkins; Charles Johnson, 
at Prestonsburg Elementary to replace 
Charles Burke. 

Certified substitute teachers : 
Sherrill Frazier, Edith Hopkins, Freda 

A. Tackett, Sharon K. Steffey, Mabel 
Allen, Sister Judy Yuker. 

Regular bus drivers: 
William Clevenger, Paul David 

Tackett, Brenda Hughes, Earl Chaffins, 
Brendel Hamilton, Leonard Johnson, 
Charles Johnson. 

Adult Education personnel employed: 
Director, Homer L. Hall; counselor, 

Ralph O'Quinn ; secretary, Charlotte 
Stumbo; para-professionals, Ramona 
Ratcliff and Barbara Tackett; 
teachers- Ramona Auxier, Betsy 
Layne; Mabel Berger, Melvin ; Willie 
Elliott, McDowell ; Denzil Hal bert, 
Martin ; Marie Osborne, Prestonsburg; 
Ruth Rainey, Bevinsville; Margie 
Watson, Wayland; Nell Watson, 
Wayland; Kathryn Youmans, McDowell. 

RECENT VISITORS HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Harlan Hall and Mr. and 

Mrs. Hershell Prater, all of Alger, Ohio, 
were visitors in Prestonsburg, recently. 
While here they called at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Perry Greene. 

CONCLUDES VISIT 
Mrs. Lurline McKinney, who was the 

houseguest here for several days of her 
all'lt, Mrs. Effie Milby, left from the 
Lexington airport , Friday, fcrr a visit 
with her sister, Mrs . Paul Warner, in 
Cleveland, Ohio, before ret,.tnaDa to her 
home in Orlando, Florida!Sbe was ac­
companied to Lexingto 111-f '«rs. Milby. 

Section one, ~ Four 
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alto death of Harold Paaj Curry, hu 
been docketed for Sept. 28. 'lbe attorney 
general's office will appear in the trial 
for the Commonwealth, since Com­
monwealth's Attorney James R. Allen 
had earlier represented the defendant's 
father in a case and disqualified for the 
trial. 

The murder trial of Randy Hall was 
booked for Nov. 27. 

Other cases docketed and their trial 
dates: 

Willie Watson, hit-nm , Nov. 6; Dewey 
Shepherd, wanton endangerment, Nov. 
21; John Mullins and Douglas Sexton, 
both charged with second degree arson, 
Nov . 29; John Melvin Kidd, first degree 
robbery, Dec. 4. 

In civil cases this week juries rendered 
judgments for two plaintiffa-$50,000 
damages for William Spradlin against 
West Virginia Mack, and $96,250 to Mr. 
and Mrs . Chester Layne in their US 23 
right-of-way suit with the Department of 
Transportation. 

--- 6 ---
(Conti nued from Page One) 

Judge Harold J. Stumbo had said he has 
$6,000 in excess fees-the annual salary 
of a trial assistant-to turn over to the 
county . 

Assistant County Attorney Eric Hall 
pointed out that District Judge Stumbo is 
seeking a trial commissioner to serve the 
Beaver Creek sections because of the 
long distance litigants must travel to 
court here. He said a trial commissioner 
does not necessarily have to be an at­
torney. 

The state's failure to pay the county 
rent on offices in the cour thouse which 
are used by the district court was also 
raised by Magistrate Roberts. The 
assistant county attorney said efforts 
have been made to reach Frankfort for 
an answer but that he hss failed to 
establish communication. He added that 
the county is required by law to furnish 
office space btt not without charge. 

The state has offered only $1800 a 
month- a figure which court members 
say is pitifully low. 

Since they can 't reach the proper of­
ficials by telephone, members of the 
court d iscussed the possibility of going to 
Frankfort next week in an attempt to· 
reach an understanding. 

Earlier, the court set September 1 as 
the deadline for the state to pay rent or 
vacate. 

To Discuss 
Industrial 
Parks 

Some 100 business and civic leaders 
throughout the state are expected to 
attend a Sept. 21·22 Lexington seminar on 
"Community and Multi-County In­
dustrial Parks: Developing Kentucky's 
Regional Resources." 

Development Cabinet Secretary 
William L . Short said several of the 
nation's experts on industrial park 
development are to participate in the 
program. Short himself will be the 
seminar's keynote speaker and is ex­
pected to discuss the role played by a 
variety of state government agencies in 
assisting with the financing of industrial 
parks. 

As development secretary, Short 
oversees several of those agencies, in­
cluding the commerce department, the 
Appalachian Regional Commission, the 
Kentucky Port and River Development 
Commission, and Kentucky's federal 
Economic Development Administration 
program. 

Short said the seminar has been 
scheduled to benefit those smaller 
Kentucky communities attempting to 
arrange a financial package for in­
dustrial parks. He explained that in­
dustrial park funding usually comes 
from several federal, state and local 
sources and that many communities may 
be unaware of such a variety of 
assistance. 

Short pointed to the Corbin Tri.County 
Industrial Park as an example of a 
business park made possible through 
several monetary sources. The park is 
still taking shape but will include por­
tions of Knox, Laurel and Whitley 
counties when complete. 

Funding has come from several 
agencies, including the Kentucky 
Development F inance Authority, the 
Appalachian Regional Commission, the 
federal Economic Development Ad­
ministration, a coal severance economic 
fund grant, the Cumberland Valley Area 
Development District and a commlUlity 
block grant from the federal Department 
of Housing and Urban Development. 

"As most communities simply do not 
have the resources and expertise at their 
fingertips for putting together such a 
complex financial package, we have 
scheduled this seminar to make them 
more aware of state and govemment 
agencies that they might consider as they 
develop local industrial parks," Short 
said. 

The seminar will be held at Lexington's 
Carnahan House on Newtown Pike. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express our deep 

appreciation for the kindness shown 
during the loss of our loved one. A special 
thanks to our family and friends who 
brought food and sent flowers, and to the 
minister of the Church of Christ for his 
comforting words, and to tbe Hall 
Brothers Funeral Home for its kindne111 
and understanding during our time of 
sorrow. 

THE FAMILY OF 
MILDRED <JEAN) LYONS 
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NOTICE OF PUBLIC SALE 
A public sale will be held by The Bank 

Josephine on the 14th day of September, 
1978 at The Bank Josephine Prestonsbw-g 
Branch Parking Lot. Time of sale 10:30 
a.m. Sale is for the purpose of disposing 
of a 1973 Chevrolet Pick-Up, Serial No. 
CCY143B 114870, 8 cyl., belonging to 
Kenneth H. Kelly, to satisfy a Security 
Agreement dated the 8th day of Sep· 
tember, 1978. 

The Bank Josephine reserves the right 
to bid. 

Terms of sale: CASH. 
9-6-2t. 

To Subscribers 
Please note date shown 

opposite your name on 
your copy of The Times 
or on the wrapper. If the 
date reads, for instance, 
"July 78" your sub­
scription will expire at 
the end of July. 

Celebrates Birthday 

Shawn Davis celebrated his first birth· 
day on Wednesday, Sept. 6. He is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Mike Davis, of 
Prestonsbw-g. 

ATIEND FUNERAL 
Out-of-town guests for the funeral of 

Because of increased 
mailing costs, notices to 
subscribers of their 
expiration dates will be 
discontinued. Subscrip­
tions which have expired 
must be cancelled within 
one month of the expira­
tion date. 

I· Mildred (Jean) Lyons were Mr. and Mrs. 

Yearly subscription 
rates are: $6.30 in Floyd 
county; $7.35 elsewhere 
in Kentucky; $8.50 out­
side Kentucky. 

Raleigh Jackson of Hyden; Mr. and Mrs. 
Culpepper and son Bob, of Suffolk, Va.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Dixon of Louisa; 
Mrs. Helen Music Lyons and daughter 
Carol, of Washington, D.C.; Charles Edd 
Stumbo of Williamson, W. Va.; Delano 
Stumbo of Ohio; Sharon Lee Stumbo, 
Lexington; Geraldine Sturgill, Ashland; 
Jimmy and Shirrell Wicker, Dayton, 
Ohio; and Mr. and Mrs. Ben Hall, of 
Somerset, Ky. 

or Your Dirt Back" 

ALL N.EWLY-INSTALLED EQUIPMENT 
Does Great Jobs-No Mirrors, Antennae Broken 

CHEVRON ( 

Reg~ Gas ____ 62.9 Gal. 

D. & D. CAR WASH 
DON HOUSTON, RON LAWSON, Owners 

9-13-tf. Phone 886-9544, No. lake Drive, Prestonsburg 

- ELECT-

HAROLD 
NEWSOME 

Of Craynor, Ky. 

Secretary-Treasurer, Dist. · 30 
Dear Sir and Brother: 

I take this opportunity to introduce myself as a candidate for District 30 
Secretary-Treasurer to fulfill the vacancy of Julius Mullins, who is now 
Chairman of the Board Trustee of the Health and Retirement Fund, and 
personal and very close friend or mine.and my family. 

I am a coal miner and a graduate of Pikeville College with a Master's 
degree, yet I chose to work in the coal Industry since it's a tradition of my 
father, brothers, and family on both sides of my parents. I have served as 
Recording Secretary of Local Union 8100 for the past 5 years. 

I am asking your support and nomination in my endeaver, for I feel I can 
do a good job and help you and this membership In many ways because of 
my education, experience, and above all my desire to serve the membership 
of District 30. 

In closing, I want to assure you I will do everything in my power to make 
you a good and honest District Secretary-Treasurer, and I can work with 
anyone elected, or whoever may be elected In the future. 

Come out and vote Thursday, September 28, 1978. 

Best wishes and kindest regards to you and your membership. 

A friend, 
HAROLD NEWSOME 
R·S-L. U. 8100 

The Floyd County Times 

KENTUCKY HORSE PARK OPENS-After seeing a 20-
mlnute film on the horse, visitors head for a walking tour of the 
farm. A $2 admission for adults, $1 for children allows visitors to 
see the film and to tour a training barn and other exhibits. A 
blacksmith shop, a harnessmaklng shop and an exhibit of horse 
breeds can also be seen at the park. A museum at the horse park 
will open later. The World Three-Day Event Championships will 
be held Sept. 14-17 at the park, beginning at 10 a.m. the first three 
days and at 11 a.m. on Sunday. An unlimited number of tickets to 
the event are available. 

Subcommittee To Investigate 
Road Maintenance Complaints 

A legislative subcommittee agreed last 
week to examine changes made recently 
by Rep. Bill Weinberg (D-Hindman >, 
attacking the state road maintenance 
system. 

The Highway Finance subcommittee of 
the Interim Joint Committee on High­
ways and Traffic Safety decided to 
conduct a follow-up investigation of 
problems in the road maintenance 
program cited by Rep. Weinberg. _ 

Weinbw-g had charged during the full 
committee's Aug. 11 meeting there were 
abuses of equipment allocation at the 
state level. His remarks have since toned 
down, but this is one of the areas to be 
examined by the subcommittee. 

"The state maintenance system in 
Kentucky itself needs maintenance and 
perhaps a complete overhaul," Weinberg 
told the 11-member subcommittee. "It is 
time for a fresh look and a new beginning 
and your committee has that op­
portlmity." 

Weinberg suggested the subcommittee 
examine the coordination of services 
between state and county highway 
departments with the aim of redefining 
divisions of responsibility along func­
tional li11es. 

funds to "get more mileage from our 
(tax) dollars. We need to attempt, if 
possible, to do full service for the road 
when it's resurfaced." 

Other areas to be reviewed by the 
subcommittee include: the lack of an 
efficient supply system, employees' 
salary scales, the setting of priorities, 
duplication of effort, equipment repair , 
inadequate equipment, bidding 
procedw-es and overweight coal trucks. 

Weinberg emphasized that he is not 
seeking a scapegoat. Instead, he noted, 
"this should be a cooperative venture 
between our two branches of government 
to assure that better services are ren­
dered the people of Kentucky." 

He added that certain aspects of the 
program should be retained, but the 
subcommittee should "examine all 
possible changes, including the 
organization of the program." 

Otto Ingram, deputy commissioner of 
Rural and Municipal Aid in the state 
Transportation Department, agreed with 
some of Weinberg's suggestions, but 
noted little can be done because of a lack 
of adequate funds. 

Section One, Page Five 

<HilL SCOt;T AREA MEETING 
Girl Scout volunteers from Area 4 are 

attending the Area Association meeting 
today <Wed.) at the Floyd county library, 
from 10 a.m to 2 p.m. The purpose of the 
meeting is to report on the progress of 
girl scouting in the area, and to make 
plans for activities during the 1978·'79 
year. 

MAD, MAD, MAD 
FEDERATED 

FURNITURE STORE 

SALE 
Among the Floyd county Girl Scout 

volunteers who are attending are Lila F. 
DeRossett, Brenda McKenzie, Ada 
Depoy, Henrietta Orsborn, Nancy 
Roberts and Joyce Everly. 

8 a.m.-6 p.m. 
Thursday thru Saturday 

Martin, Ky. 

OYOTA----
More truck for your buck. 
Standard Bed Truck 
0 More economy. Toyota's lowest-priced 
truck, famous Toyota fuel economy. 
0 More versatility. Comfort of a car, tough­
ness of a truck 
0 More standard features. 2 2 liter SOHC 
engine. power-assisted front disc brakes, 
fully transistorized ignit1on tilt-forward bench 
seat, mud flaps, electric fuel pump .. and 
more quality ·extras: 
0 More now! Don't wait for prices to go up ... 
it's time to buy So come on in, the deahns 
fine. 

31 23 
IIWAY 01Y 

Estomated EPA ••· 
suits Your moleage 
~;ar1es wtth dnvtng 
habots & •ehtcle s 
conditiOn & eqUtp. 

More than your moneys worth 

ART'S AUTO SALES 
So. Lake Drive Phone 886-3861 

"We need to look again .at how we 
divide the job of taking care of Kentucky 
roads," he began. "It's inefficient to 
have two separate crews in a county and 
two separate garages." 

He also suggested the subcommittee 
seek ways to more efficiently use state 

Samons Family Reunion 
The family of the late James and Sarah 

Frazier Samons, held its annual reunion 
at Archer Park, Sunday, Sept. S. At­
tending were: Dale Newman, In­
dialantic, Fla., Wade and Nonie Euliss, 
Burlington, N.C., Charles, Phyllis, Janet 
and Beverly Thompson, Lois and Wilbert 
Hughes, Marvin, Sharon and Jeff 
Samons and Barbara Talley all of Louis­
ville, Eula, Randy, Pam, Allan and Paul 
Re Falo, of Frankfort, Erma and Jamie 
Mayo, Hubert and Margarett Mayo, of 
Winchester, Manis and Anna Samons, of 
Lexington, David, Carolyn, Adam and 
Sarah Frazier, of Morgan and Donald, 
Lola and Anthony Peters, of London, 
Paul, Mary and Nonica Peters, of 
Ashland, Greg and Beverly Samons, 
Indianapolis, Ind., Maxine and Jim 
Thacker, Danny, Marian and Christy 
Adkins and Lynn Johnson, of Wurtland, 
Larry and Debbie Laferty, of Dry Ridge, 
Butch, Freda, Lisa and Angie Clifton, 
Canada, Ky. Aaron, Roma and Doug 
Tuttle, of Eastern, Teresa Hall and Bill 
Snapp, Richmond, Brenda Hicks, West 
Prestonsburg, David and Cara Hall, of 
Middle Creek, Fred and Valerie Hall, of 
Allen, Royce, Aduessa, Serena and 
Bobby Samons and Rhonda Mayo, of 
Dana, and the following, all from Martin: 

BUILDING OR REMODELING 
YOUR KITCHEN? 

Lynn Peters, Robert and Patsy Samons, 
Quin and Elizabeth Samons, Jesse and 
Zelda Laferty, Rupert and Katy Samons, 
Burns and Wanda Jarrell, Alroy and 
Bethel Click, Janis and Kyle Newman, 
Sandra, Gina and Geoff Crisp, Lynn 
Hughs, James, Jeri and James Ed 
Robinson, Sari Samons, Joetta Adkins, J. 
B., Marie and Missy Samons, Stacey 
Bartram, Beverly Samons, Millard 
Samons, Sharlene, Bobbie and Pam 
Hopson, Thelma Webb, Rosa Thacker, 
Luke, Dorothy, David, Thomas, Daniel, 
Mark, Jesse, and Michelle Newell, Dean 
and Garnet Laferty and Debbie and 
Susan Mullins. 

INFORMATION NEEDED 
ON FAMILY GENEALOGY 

Frasure, Thornsbury and 
Ousley families, of Middle 
Creek and Wilson Creek, 
Langley, Ky.; Combs, 
Hicks, and Conley families 
of Ball Creek In Knott 
County. 

Write to: 

ALICE FRASURE 
4382 Roundtree 

Dayton, Ohlo45432 
9-13·2t. 

Larry Keene's 
True Value Hardware, Inc. has eight 

fully set up kitchens on display 
with prices for every pocketbook. 

LARRY KEENE'S 
True Value Hardware, Inc. 

WILLIAMSON ROAD- PHONE 432-4151 
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New Council Studies 
Base Sewer Charge 
At David Set at $5 

The Kentucky Public Service Com­
mission has approved sewer rates for the 
David Community Development Cor­
poration. 

PRESTONSBURG 

DAIRY CHEER 
East Kentucky Needs Since the corporation is a non-profit 

operation, the rates were determined on 
the basis of the minimum revenues 
required to meet financial obligations 
and operations costs. 

DINE -IN OR CARRY OUT 
DALLAS & DORIS PRATER -OWNERS 

0 PEN 7 DAYS 1 0:30 T 0 11:00 Members of the Appalachian 
Development Council, a group formed by 
Gov. Julian Carroll earlier this summer 
to plan for continued economic growth in 
Eastern Kentucky, last week decided to 
tackle that responsibility by subdividing 
themselves into five major areas of 
concern. 

Gathered at the G<Jvernor's Mansion 
for their first formal meeting, members 

BLUE GRASS FARMS 

FOR SALE 
By 

Walter J. Fritts, Realtor 
119 East Main St. 

l\1t. Sterling, Ky. -198-3417 

~EW EXCLUSIVE LISTI~G. 246 
ACRE MONTGOMERY COUNTY 
BLUEGRASS FARM, located about 
3 miles north of Mt. Sterling & 164 on 
the !\la)'·sville Rd. Hwy. 11. This is a 
part of what is known as Lee Farms 
Inc. Has good 7-room frame house 
with bath, nice kitchen, concrete 
porches, storm windows & doors, 
good meathouse, 3 barns & other 
outbuildings. Has around 14,500 lb. 
tobacco base, this farm is gently 
rolling, all tractor land, most all in 
grass except cropland. Priced 
privately and shown by appointment 
only. Walter J. Fritts, Realtor. 

230 ACRES, well improved farm 
with grade "A" Dairy Operation. 
One of the finest set-ups, all level 
bottomland, but not overflow land, 
all land in beautiful meadows & 
heavy grass except cropland of 
several acres in corn & tobacco, no 
wasteland, abundant water supply 
with heated water tanks in all fields. 
Has lovely 2-story Colonial home 
with modern conveniences & spiral 
stairway. All outside buildings such 
as; tobacco barn, 500 barrel double 
corn cribs with drive through center, 
large concrete silo with automatic 
feeder, large dairy & feed barn with 
Grade "A" dairy operation 
<presently milking 38 head with 
present monthly income of $5200. or 
$173.00 per day average). Tobacco 
base approx. 7800 pounds. Price 
$335,000. and shown by appt. only. 
Watered by lakes, ponds & river. 

IN CA:\tARGO-MONTGOMERY 
CO .. KY.-5 acres of land<+->. with 
beautiful, modern 3 bedroom ranch­
type brick home, 2 baths, large 
living room, family room, 2 fire­
places, modern kitchen with built-in 
range & oven, & snack bar, utility 
room, nice carpeting, forced air gas 
heat, city water, electric service, 
aluminum storm doors & windows, 2 
patios, attached 2-car garage. This 
farm has approximately 1200 lb. 
tobacco base, & nice barn (40'x48'). 
Shown by appointment. Price 
$92,000. 

MO:-.ITGOMERY CO., KY.-Lo­
cated 5 miles southwest of Mt. 
Sterling on Levee Rd. 7 to 8 acres 
<more or less), with modern 2-story 
frame home, consisting of 6 rooms, 2 
halls, bath, enclosed back porch, 
front porch, nice kitchen, hardwood 
floors, 3 fireplace!J; storm doors & 
windows, natural gas heat, electric, 
good roof, garage, good stock & feed 
barn, (with shed & crib on side), 
meathouse, poultry house, has 2nd 
corn crib, cabin in yard, pond, well 
fenced, can be seen by appt. Price 
$62,500. 

100 ACRE (;\tORE OR LESS> 
MONTGOMERY CO. FAR:\1-with 3 
bedroom frame home, bath, large 
kitchen & dining area, living room 
with hardwood Uoor, some car­
peting, gas heating. Farm has 2,600 
lb. tobacco base, 4-bent tobacco 
barn, 15 acre corn base, 50 acres in 
good grass, new corn crib, warming 
house, storage building, has 2 ponds, 
2 drill wells, 2 hand-dug wells, lots of 
fruit trees. Property begins at 
bridge & takes in both sides of road. 
Located approx. 31~ miles from 460 
<just off Hwy. 599) on lower Spruce 
Road. Shown by appointment only. 
Price $80,000. 

100 Acre :\1ontgomery County 
Farm-All tillable land except for 
two acres that has lake, and pond. 
Has 5,700 lbs. tobacco base, 
beautiful Colonial Home. Located 
near Kldville on Hwy No. 646. Shown 
by Appt. Price $135,000. 

128 ACRE BATll CO. FARM-has 2-
story frame home, city water. Farm 
is gently rolling to level land, has 
long road frontage, 2 barns, milk 
parlor (dairy operated>, approx. 
10,000 lb. tobacco base, other out­
buildings. Located on Hwy. 11 (1-'.1 

mile north of Sharpsburg>. Shown by 
appointment. Price Per Acre $1,500. 

See Or Call For Appointments 

Walter J. Fritts, Realtor 
Mt. Sterling, Ky. 

Tel. 498·3417 
Res. Phone 498·3568 

of the council, after much discussion as 
to just what their priorities should be, 
agreed to stress transportation, en­
terprise development (the creation of a 
more diversified economy), education, 
quality of life <a heading that would 
include housing, health care, the en· 
vironment, etc.) and local, state and 
federal government relationships. 

Carroll met with the council, telling the 
group that in planning for future 
prosperity in eastern Kentucky, it should 
keep in mind a time when coal will no 
longer be abundant. "We would be 
remiss if we didn'tplan for this,'' he said. 

The governor suggested that the 
delegation include four main areas af· 
fecting eastern Kentucky when for­
mulating their proposals: the coal 
severance tax, transportation, enterprise 
development and a general development 
that "covers the gamut." 

Carroll said the strength of the 13-state 
Appalachian Regional Commission was 
based on the ability of the commission to 
ignore state boundary lines when 
developing programs. "Your strength 
can come out of ignoring county lines," 
he noted. 

Council chairman G.B. Johnson, 
Ashland banker, later seconded Carroll's 
feeling that the group should regionalize 
its thinking, suggesting that university 
personnel in Appalchian Kentucky could 
be brought together for educational 
problems, bankers for solutions to 
financing, and so on. 

Johnson also said that, although the 
council is to report to William L. Short, 
secretary of the Kentucky Development 
Cabinet, and is to make use of personnel 
from the cabinet, members should not 
rely on the Development Cabinet for 
directions. "Our advice should be in­
dependent," he said. 

J. L. Jackson, president of Falcon Coal 
Co., said he believed education was the 
number one problem in eastern Ken­
tucky, explaining that the coal industry 
has difficulty filling management 
positions with persons from the area and 
that potential employees from outside 
eastern Kentucky decline job offers after 
inspecting the school systems. 

Jackson said many eastern Ken­
tuckians are unaware that they can 
upgrade their standard of living, now 
that coal wages are above the average, 
as they have never been exposed to 
alternate styles of living. In explanation, 
Jackson said he knew of several in­
stances of eastern Kentuckinas making 
monthly mortgage payments on mobile 
homes that could be used instead for 
$50,000 or $60,000 homes. · 

Jackson further advocated a more 
diversified economy in the region, 

McDowell Hospital 

Gets $214,660 Grant 
Congressman Carl D. Perkins an­

nounced last Friday that the McDowell 
Appalachian Regional Hospital in this 
county will receive a HEW grant which 
will help tide it over financial difficulties 
common this year to hospitals in the ARH 
chain. 

A rural health initiative grant of 
$214,660 has been made by HEW to the 
hospital for the fiscal year ending next 
June 30. 

"This grant," the conf;!ressman 
commented, ''will enable the McDowell 
hospital to continue to render service to 
the people." 

FIRST CHURCH OF GOD 
University Drive 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
"\\here Salvation 

"ak('s You.\ :'llember" 
Sunda_y-
Sunday School 
\\.'orship Service 
Evening Service 
Tur<;day-
Prayer Encounter 
Wednesday­
Prayer :vreeting & 

Bible Study 

!J:45A.M. 
1():45A.M. 
6:(10P.M. 

7:00A.M. 

7·00P.M. 
Church 8u!. Will Run 
On Sunday \lorning. 

E. V. GOBLE, Pastor 
12·21-tf. X86-20:IB 

electrical 
wire & cable? 

Old U.S. 23 
Allen, KY 41601 

Thousands of types and 
sizes in stock in our network 
ot warehouses for immediate 
delivery 
• No minimum order. 
• No minimum length. 

~ALL COLLECT 
(606) 874-9263 

In or eMergency and after 
5 pm. call 800-323 8167 

• Smashburger 
stating that "In the coal industry we have 
people who don't like it (mining), but do 
it because it is the only work they can 
find." 

Monthly sewer service bills will be 
based upon the customer's metered 
water consumption, with the minimum 
bill being $5. 

• Foot Longs, Homemade Sauce 
• Pit Borbeque Council membership was originally set 

at 19 persons but Letcher County Judge­
Executive Robert Collins also has been 
named by Carroll to the body. Two more 
positions are to follow soon to allow for 
labor and agricultural representation. 

-----
The National Highway Traffic Safety 

Administration estimates the number of 
motorcyclists injured annually at more 
than 350,000. 

• Tenderloin Roost Beef Sandwich 
• Chicken • Shrimp 

Rep. William Weinberg <D-Hindman l 
was elected vice chairman. 

Other council members include C.V 
Kirkpatrick, Tompkinsville; Pikeville 
Mayor W.C. Hambley; James C. Witten 
Sr., Paintsville; Wallace G. Maffett, 
Richmond; Rep. Pete Worthington, 
Ewing; Sen. Bert E. Pollitte, Harlan; 
Janie Douglass, Harlan; W.W. James, 
Mount Vernon; Dr. Morris Norfleet, 
Morehead State University president; 
Sen. Woodrow Stamper, West Liberty; 
Nan Hagan Gorman, Hazard; Jerry 
Ikerd, Somerset; Phillip R. Dillon, 
Liberty; Monticello Mayor Carl Shearer, 
and Orin E. Atkins, Be1lefote. 

MAD, MAD, MAD 
FEDEilATED 

FURNITURE STORE 

• Fish 8. Chips • Oysters • Clams 
HOMEMADE SOFT ICE CREAM 

22 FLAVORS 

SALE I
...-REFRESH WITH---

1 .. A PEPSI! _ 
8 a.m.-6 p.m. 886-8666 

Thursday thru Saturday 
Martin, Ky. · Hf. 

U.S. HWY 23 NORTH 

OUR FOOD PRICES KEEP 
THE WOLF FROM YOUR DOOR 

Green Giant Vietti , 

WHOLE K ERNEL CORN HOT DOG SAUCE 

17-0z. 3 89~ Can for ~ ~~~· 3 for 8 9e 

GRO U ND BEE __ Lb. 99e 
Swift Pro-Ten Beer $ 

1 6 9 
CUBED STEAK ___ Lb. 

GiOiJTN DESROUND _Lb .$1
39 

Kraft's Pure 

ORANGE JUICE 
Half·Gal.$119 

- Bottle 
Dixie Belle 

SALTINE CRACKERS ];~~· 49e 
Pringle's Original-Style or Rippled 

POTATO CHIPS _ _ ,.:~~-~·ak7 se 
Downy 

FABRIC SOFTENER":~;g:J.$1 49 

REYNOLDS WRAP371hR~~iFt.79e 
Johnson's Toddler-Size 

DISPOSABLE DIAPERSBol~of$2 19 

Swift's Pro-Ten 

Cremora Instant Non-Dairy 

CREAMER __ _ 
16-0z.$119 __ Size 

Kraft Chunky BLUE CHEESE 

SALAD DRESSING _ ~~~·.sse 
Tube Rose 

SELF-RISING FLOUR5~~:·79e 
Tube Rose 

SELF-RISING MEAL 
5~~:· 79e 

Log Cabin 

PANCAKE & MIX 2-Lb.69e 
WAFFLE - - - _ Box 

Heinz 

CATSUP ___ -~~~~~89e 
Swiftning 

SHORTENING-4~~:·$1 49 

D uOGgofOOD -
5~~:·$1 59 ~ 

Magic 

LIQU D BLEACH _ _ Gal. S9C 
HI·Dri 

PAPER TOWELS .. 2 ~~~: 8Se 
Bes-Pak Heavy-Weight $ 

1 
09 

TRASH BAGS -- - ~~;:: 

P-RESTONSB URG 

.. AN D WE 
GIVE 
TOP VALU E 
STAMPS. 
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Teacher, Pupil in Reunion Here 
Mrs. Edith Fitzpatrick James of 

Prestonsburg was surprised recently by 
unexpected visitors. Dr. and Mrs. Duane 
White, faculty members of Bob Jones 
University in Greenville, S.C. , dropped in 
to chat with Mrs. James and to introduce 
her to their three children. 

The reason for the visit was that Mrs. 
White, formerly Frances Ruth Stevens, 
had been a piano pupil of Mrs. James 33 
years ago when she was a first-grade 
student at Prestonsburg Elementary 
School. Though there had been no contact 
or correspondence between her and Mrs. 
James through the years, Mrs. White 
wanted to bring her husband and 
children to meet Mrs. James, who had 
made a deep impression on her at those 
early piano lessons so many years ago. 

Mrs. White teaches voice at Bob Jones 
University, where her husband, Dr. 
Duane White, is chairman of the 
Department of Music History and 
Literature. Dr. White teaches piano, 
music history, hymnology, and graduate 
courses in musicology and sacred music. 
The Whites graduated from Bob Jones 
University in 1961, and have served on 
the faculty since that time. They were on 
leave of absence from 1967·'70 while Dr. 
White was earning the Ph. D. degree in 
musicology at the University of 
Wisconsin, where he was a student of the 
imminent Viennese musicologist, Eva 
Badura-Skeda. He studied in Europe 
during the swnmer of 1969, doing 
musicological research in Vienna, 
Salzburg, Munich, Berlin, Prague and 
London. 

The Whites were much impressed with 

Mrs. James's work in the area of Ken­
tucky folk music. Upon learning about 
her activity with annual folk music 
festivals , Dr. White remarked, "Why, 
you are an ethno-musicologist!" 

"Teachers make profoWld and lasting 
impressions on the lives of lheir 
students," say Dr. and Mrs. White. And 
one of the greatest rewards of teaching, 
according to Mrs. James, is to view, 
years later, the successes of one's pupils. 
But it is not every day that a former pupil 
whom you have not seen for more than 30 
years drops by to pay you a visit! 

Dr. and Mrs. White left with Mrs. 
James a copy of the program of the 
sacred concerts they were presenting in 
churches in West Virginia in August. 
And, in return, she gave them copies of 
programs of the Highlands Music 
Festival which she originated and of 
which she is so justly proud. 

High School Chess 
Tourney Scheduled 

The Prestonsburg CommWlity College 
Chess Society, in cooperation with the 
Community Services Department, will 
be sponsoring the third annual high 
scbool chess tournament Saturday, 
November 18, in the Martin Student 
Center. Registration will be at 8:30a.m. 
with RoWld 1 beginning at 9:30a.m. Each 
school will be allowed to enter one team 
of four members, and the top three teams 
will receive trophies. For further in­
formation , contact Prof. John D. Sam­
mons at Prestonsburg Community 
College. 

·----------· I SUPER SAVINGS ON I 
l_!!:!9~.!!!~-J 

Section One, Page Seven 

Nursing Graduate 

Charlotte Bentley, daughter of Bob and 
Dova Bentley, of Wayland, was 
graduated from the Mayo State Voc.· 
Tech. School of Practical Nursing, Aug. 
31. She will be specializing as a member 
of the medication team at Highlands 
Regional Medical Center. 

HERE FROM LOUISVILLE 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Wharton had as 
their visitors last week Mr. and Mrs. 
William Kelly, of Louisville. The 
highlight of the Kelley's visit was a trip to 
the craft center at David. 

CONCRETE BLOCKS 

, . 

MASONRY SUPPLIES LIMESTONE BLOCKS 
LITE-WATE BLOCKS ALUMINUM WINDOWS 

METAL DOORS & ACCESSORIES 

HALL CoNCRETE PRooucTs Co. 
Ronald and Bobbie Hurt, Owners 

located on Old US 23 at New Allen S·25-tf. 

ALL THIS IN ADDITION TO OUR REGULAR EVERY DAY LOW PRICES 

36" 

GAS RANGE 
White Only. 

r------- ....... -, 
Retail 

I BIGSALE I 
I DISCOUNT I 

l~!::~~~~T_l $299.95 

NOW ONLY 

4-Piece 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
Sofa; Loveseat; Chair; 
ottoman. The Best Herculon. 
Solid Oak Frame. Solid Pine 
Trim. 

r---------. 
1 BIGSALE I I 
I DISCOUNT I Reta 
~~9-~E_R~~~!J $1097.80 

NOW ONLY 

$19497 $66966 

HOTPOINT 

APPLIANCES 
10 Cubic Food Refrigerator 

Single Door 

NOW$27995 ONLY 

18 Pound Capacity 
Heavy Duty 

Washer & Dryer 

All Four Pieces 

4-Piece 

BEDROOM SUITE 
Triple Dresser, Twin Mirror, 
Large Chest, Nite Stand, 
Queen-Size Headboard. 

~--------, 

I BIGSALE I 
I DISCOUNT I 
L~~~~~~~Tj 

Retan 

$849.50 

NOW ONLY 

~:~$59995 $50970 
Both Pieces 

3-Piece 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
Sofa; Two Chairs 

100 Percent Nylon Velvet, 
Extra Heavy, Solid Oak 
Frame. 

r -------, 
1 BIG SALE I 
I DISCOUNT I Retail 
l!~~~R_C!~.!J $1,299.90 

All Four Pieces 

7-Piece 

DINETTE SETS 
ALL WOOD 

Available in Pine or Maple. 
Extra Large Table with Two 
Fillers. 

6 Arrow-Back Chairs 

NOW ONLY NOW ONLY 

$62395 $29995 
AI Three Pieces All Seven Pieces 

DOOR BUSTERS 
4-PIECE SECTIONAL 

11Jhe Pit Group" 

Wall-A-Way 

RECLINERS 
Covered In Monsanto, Wear­
Dated, Nylon Velvet. 

3-Piece 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
Sofa; Loveseat; Chair 

Solid Oak Frame, 100 percent 
Herculon, Arm Covers. 

,--------; BIG SALE 
1-BJGSALE-, : DISCOUNT : l DISCOUNT I Retail I A I 

100 Percent Genuine Suede, Two-Toned with Naugahyde 1 45 PERCENT I $299 95 I HUGE I • ,_ ______ _ :..; • 1 58 PERCENT I 

Retal 

$898.90 

r--------, Retail $1699.95 L _______ :.J. 
NOW ONLY NOW ONLY l The Big Sale I 

l Discount I 
L ~! !!r~-:.n! J 

Now$ 
ONLY 2 98 $16497 $37754 

COMPLETE 

5-Piece 

WOOD DIN TTE SETS 
- In Colors -

Red and White or Yellow and White 

Retail $299.9 5 

3-Piece 

LIVING ROOM SU 
Sofa; Loveseat; Chair 

-------r----,-----· 
IGrade No. 131 Solid 1 All 
I Imported 1 Oak 1 Loose l Velvet I Frame I Cushions 
~------~-----L----

All Three Pieces 

Deluxe 30" 

ELECTRIC RANGE 
The New Almond Color 

Continuous Clean Oven, 
Digital Clock, Lighted Back­
Splash. Many more features. 

- ------'1 
BIG SALE 1 r- - ------: 

DISCOUNT 1 Retail 1 BIG SALE I Retal 
r------- - . 
l B.ig Sale i NOW 
l D1scount 1 ONLY 
1 37 Percent l 
'---------

$ 
54 PERCENT I $999.85 : DISCOUNT : $4 8897 ,-4N5993 ;!~~~;i~oNLY 19;6 

All Five Pieees All Three Pieces 302 
3-PIECE 

BED ROO SUITE 
~-----------~-------~------------
1 Triple Dresser 1 Large 1 I 
I 1 Chest I Queen 1 
I with I 1 I 
1 T · W M 1 On I Headboard 1 I r•- ay orror I Chest I I 
~----------~--------~----------- J 

r----- - -, 
1 The Big Sale 1 
I • 
1 D1scount 1 
I I 
1 40 Percent 1 , ________ ,1 

NOW$ 

ONLY 

Retail $798.90 

2-PIECE 
LIVING ROOM SUITES 

Starting At $19995 
-------------------

RECLINERS 
From$7995 

LIVING ROOM TABLES 

Start At $9995 

For Set of 3 Tables 

2-Piece 

LIVING ROOM SU 
Sofa - Chair 

100 Percent Nylon Velvet. 
Contemporary Style. 

r-si'GsiCE"I 
1 DISCOUNT 1 Ret•il I 51 PERCENT: $799.95 ·-------- -

NOW ONLY 

$391 98 
Both Pieces 

If you REALLY want to sGJve money 
• 

~REE INSTALLATION 
PRESTONSBURG, 

r~TERMS AVAILABLE PHONE 
886-8501 

BAR 
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YD COUNTIANS SCHEDULED 
OR 7th OUR APPALACIHA DAY 

Pippa Passes, Ky.-Two musical 
JI"'IP8 and two soloists from Floyd 
CG~mty are among area musicians who 
have already Indicated they will perfonn 
.t the lleVeDth annual Our Appalachia 
Day, Sat..-day <Sept. 16) at Alice Uoyd 
Collep. 'lbey are: 

'"'lbe Buddy Ratliff Group," of Martin; 
"'De Green Mountain Boys," of Hi Hat; 
O...e Tucker, of Ligon, and FickDin 
Dewey Shepherd, of David. 

Tbe music will start at 10 a.m. and 
continue through the day. An arts and 
erafta exhibit will also open at 10 a.m. 
•d continue through 6:30 p.m. At 4:30 
p.m. the college will provide a 
traditional soup-bean supper. There will 
be to• dancina after supper from 6:30 to 
I 00 p.m. All activities are free and open 
to the public. 

New this year will be a bakina contest. 

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANS+ 

PORTATION BUREAU OF HIGHWAYS 
NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS 

Sealed bids will be received by the 
Bweau of HiJhways, at its office, Frank­
fort, Kentucky until 10:00 A.M. Eastern 
DaJlilht Time on the Dld day of SEP· 
TEMBER, 1978, at which time bids will 
be publicly opened and read for the 
improvement of: 

FLOYD COUNTY, KY RR 80 4·5, SP 36-
11: 'ftle llazard-Wateraap <KY 80) Road 
from approximately 200 feet north of Bull 
Fork Road northerly to a point on KY 3 
approximately 1600 feet north of US 23, a 
cliltance of 1.135 miles. Grade and drain 
for U03 miles and arade, drain and 
bituminous surface for 0.432 mile. 

FLOYD COUNTY, SP 36-3396: The 
Prestonlbarg.Paintsville <US 23) Road. 
Benc:blng rock cut near Pic.Pac Store at 
Pratonstn.-a, a distance of 0.102 mile. 
Grade, drain and bitwninous surface. 

'l'be Bareau of Highways hereby 
DOtifles all bidders that it will af­

firmatively insiD"e that in any contract 
tlltered into pt.K"SUant to this ad· 
vertisement, minority business en­
terpriiH will be afforded full opportunity 
tD IUIJmlt bids in response to this in­
vitlltioa, and will not be discriminated 
81alnst on the ground of race, color or 
natioaal origin in consideration for an 
award. 

Bid Proposals for all projects will be 
available t.mtil 9:00 A.M. EASTERN 
DAYLIGHT TIME, FIRDAY, SEP­
TEMBER 22. 1978, at the Division of 
Contract Procurement. Bid Proposals for 
all projec:tl will be available at a cost of 
t2 each and remittance payable to State 
Trealllrer of Kentucky must accompany 
request for proposals. 
CNON +REFUNDABLE) BID 
PROPOSALS ARE ISSUED ONLY TO 
$EQUWFIED CONTRACTORS. 
~ Proposals for all projects 

MD be avaliable to all interested parties 
It a coat of $2 eaeh <NON REFUN­
DABLE). Specimen Proposals cannot be 
IMed for bidding. 

9-5-2t. 

Entries will be judged in seven divisions 
including cobblers, pies, cates, old 
fashioned cakes, cookies, candies and 
breads. Entries should be in the hands of 
the judges by 2 p.m. on Our Appalachia 
Day. All entries will be served as part of 
the supper provided by the college. All 
are invited to brina a dessert to enter in 
the contest or just to share with the 
crowd. Persons are encoiD"aged to bring 
an old fashioned dessert, along with 
infonnation about the recipe. 

Other musicians already scheduled to 
perfonn include: 

"The Lonesome Valley Boys," of 
Vir&ie; Sonny and Susan Houston, of 
Hemphill; Melva Jean Watkins, of 
Salyersville; "The Slone Family," of 
Hindman; "The Kentucky Mountain 
Grass," of Pinetop; "The Lonesome 
Mountain Boys," of Topmost; "The 
Midnight Travelers," of Pippa Passes; 
"The Pinetop Ramblers," of Pinetop; 
Emma Smith and "The King's Harbor 
Fishennen," of Leb&rn; Doug Hutchens 
and "The Phuzz Street Knucklebusters," 
ot Ptppa Passes, and Lummy Thorns­
berry, of Pippa Passes. 

VA Not Connected 
With Offering Vets 
Free Burial Sites 

The Veterans Administration has no 
connection with any cemetery offering 
so-called free burial space to a veteran. 
This reminder was issued today because 
of advertisements and letters making 
offers of free space circulating in the 
state. 

The messages usually state that there 
are 29 million veterans and only two 
million burial sites in National 
Cemeteries. At this time the VA is 
planning more sites and even new 
cemeteries in states where none are 
located. 

A VA spokesman pointed out that the 
VA provides burial allowances of $250 for 
any honorably discharged veteran, and 
an additional $150 for a plot alowance, if 
the veteran is not buried in a national 
cemetery. 

The VA does not have any control over 
private cemeteries which advertise free 
plots for a veteran . However, it advises 
the veteran to read all of the m~·~.-ial 
carefully, for in some cases whl.le L ... 

space may be free there are other 
requirements. These range from an 
additional purchase for a member of the 
veteran's family to requirements for 
expensive vaults, as well as expenses of 
opening and closing the grave site. 

NOTICE OF MEOING 
There will be a regular meeting of the 

Floyd Fiscal Court to be held on Tuesday 
September 12, 1978 at 1:00 p.m. in the 
Floyd County Courthouse Annex Con­
ference Room. lt. 

Disc Brake Job • • • 
( IKI.._ new pads, tarn ro&on, 
laW-eomplete job) 

The latest in 
Wheel-balancing 

realy true W.cing 

pu can get today. 

H & H Service Center 
Don Houston, Owner 

517 North Lake Drive Phone 886-9544. 

~hr Oldt 
lllld 

Old fashioned Cowtesr and Senice 
Mo•m facilities and fquipment 

HALL BROTHERS 
FUNERAL HOME 

AMPLE PARKING 
PHONE 285-3262 MARTIN, KY. 

MF.MRt:R: 
K•ntudL) t'unrral Dirrctor Burial \ssociatlon 

\ socialed 1-' uneral DlrHtor \ 11ociation 
atlonal t'uneral DlrHton \ oclatioR 

Only One Type Diploma 
Planned for High Schools 

Only one type of hilh school diploma 
would be a warded to high school students 
under a regulation adopted by the State 
Board for Elementary and Secondary 
Education at Ita quarterly meeting last 
week. 

The regulation requires each student to 
satisfactorily complete high school 
graduation requirements established by 
the state board and by the local board of 
education, thus prohibiting local districts 
from awarding a diploma to exceptional 
children who cannot complete the 
requirements. 

Chairman Henry Pogue of Fort 
Thomas said, "All diplomas in all 
districts should mean the same thing." 
An attorney general's opinion issued 
earlier said that school districts do not 
have the option of giving two types of 
diplomas, one for students completing 

tne rel\iar course of studies and one for 
exceptional children. 

The regulation wiD not prohibit local 
boards from awarding special 
recognition to students for their 
achievements. 

After being approved by the state 
board, the regulation must be approved 
by the Legislative Research Com­
mission. If requested, a hearing on the 
matter wiU be held. 

t.t Dlt:~ll'AI.{ II \ltl!':\1 \Til' 
PH\ \'t:H (iltOl I' 
"Tht' l ppt'r Hoom · 

I'• ..... \Inn .;. Ill p.m. 

St. Throdorr'!i 
l atholic ('burch. Pre tons burg 

3·22 tf 

• Aluminum Sidillf •n 10 ~kWs 
e Styro-Foam Insulation 
Windows and Doors wtth Job 
ters--6 Colors, Cover E•vn 
Aluminum-10 Colors 

We Are Fully Insured • Free Estimatesl 

Give us a call Todav. 
We are local and we ca 

about your home! 
Robert Spake, Owner 

9-17·71 

RIGHT NOW, 
YOUR EST BUY IS OUR 

Amour Gold Star 

Ham 
~~ 

iiiuCO~ ~ .. 2 lk ~39 Miners .. 12 OL 79~ 
Center Cut Pork Chops ....... ~.$1 49 
End Cu Pork Chops . . . . . . . . . . ~ ~ 
Loin End Roast ............... a..$109 

iOiijnG. . . 12 Oz~ 119 Bream. . . . a.. 99~ 
Choice Top Round Steak ........ a.. $1 99 

Cube 5 eak ..................... a.. $J99 

nde ......... 84 0t.$f»9 
Hunt's 

Catsup • • • • • 
Rose 

Dog Food. • • 
Wesson 

. 2 .. 0t.asc 
25~, $339 

Oil •••• • • • • • • 
Dishwashing Detergent 

Joy •••••••••• ••o..89C 
Ionian's C 
CoHage Cheese ••• '6~· 89 

Tomatoes ... Lb. 39C 

OldYtrp .. 

Apple Sauce • • 
Del Monte W~ 1111111 

Corn ••••••• 

. 3:.~ $)00 

.3=.$)00 

Crisco ..... 3~~ $1 95 

Glass Plus ... s,..,. ••• 7'JC 
Sugar ..... . 5Lb. 

S.g 

Lettuce ..... -

801H LOCAJIONS 

Soutll Mayo Trail - Pikeville - 437-7164 • tsy ..., •• , 

11 

,. - 7 ·92 
Open 7 Days A Week - I I 
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EXAMINATION 
TO BE HELD 

TO FILL VACANCY 
IN LOCAL HEALTH 

DEPARTMENT 
The Floyd County Health 

Department has a vacancy for 
Hea lth En\·ironmentalist I. 
Beginning salary is $4.57 per hour. 
Applications are available at the 
Floyd County Health Department. 
Requirements For this position are: 

Graduate of an accredited 
college or university with a degree 
in Environmental Science; or a 
degree in the Biological or 
Physical Sciences with a minor or 
the equivalent (18 hours) in the 
Biological or Physical Sciences. 

Applications must be received by 
the :\1erlt System Office, Bureau 
for Health Services, Department 
for Human Resources, 275 East 
:\Jain Street, Frankfort, Kentucky 
40601, on or beFore midnight 
September 29, 1978. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 
9-13-3t. 

Rancher W731 

To \Ved September 16 

Mr. and Mrs. Oliver Lowe, of Boldman, 
Ky., announce the forthcoming marriage 
of their daughter, Bonnie Justine Lowe, 
to Waltust Reynolds, Jr., son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Waltus Reynolds, Sr., of Teaberry. 

Miss Lowe, a graduate of Mullins high 
school, is employed by Central Supply of 
Virginia, Inc., at Banner. Mr. Reynolds 
is a graduate of Betsy Layne high school 
and is employed by the Floyd County 
Board of Education. 

The wedding will take place at 2 p.m. 
on the afternoon of Sept. 16, at the Vogel 
Day United Methodist church of Bold­
man. The gracious custom of open 
chtn'ch will be observed. 

Give yourself 
a boot. Styling that 

starts from the in..,ide 
with rich !eat er. 

You II get a kick out of v.eanng 
these because any way you 
look at tt, Dexter makes the 

right shoe for both feet. 

Piccolo Gerry& 
Jerry'sShoes 

A2 7I 

U.S. 23 North Prestonsburg 
Phone 886-3932 

Visa and Master Charge Welcome 

and 

DRYERS 
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Interim Mining Regulations 
Win State Panel Approval 

GARRETT NEWS 
Mr. and Mrs Mark D Howard, of 

Petersburg, Mich., and Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Howard, of Ida, Mich., were the 
Lalx>r Day week-end guests here of their 
sister, Dollie Duff They also visited their 
sister-in-law, Effie Howard. 

BENTLEY REUNION 
SATURDAY, SEPT. 30 

12 p.m. All of the state's interim surface 
mining regulations have now been ap­
proved. 

The Administrative Regulations 
Review Subcommittee last Wednesday 
filed two remaining regulations that had 
been held over from a similar meeting. 
The panel also agreed to amend a 
previously approved regulation. 

Eugene Mooney, secretary of the 
state's Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental 
Protection, asked that one sentence be 
removed from the first regulation con­
sidered. The regulation concerns prime 
farmland. 

Mooney made the request because a 
federal judge has ruled against a similar 
part of the federal surface mining Jaw. 

Language in the sentence described 
prime farmland as that which has been in 
production of cultivated crops for at least 
five of the last 20 years. 

The regulation was given approval 
after Mooney agreed to use language in 
the federal act which differed slightly 
from that the state had earlier drafted. 

The second regulation concerned the 
surface effects of deep mines on two 
acres or less. 

Joe Zaluski, an attorney representing 
the coal industry, was opposed to the 
regulation because he said the federal 

Physical Fitness, Quilting 
Classes Start at PCC 

Prestonsburg Community College is 
offering separate short-term exercise 
classes for men and women. "Physical 
Fitness for Men" will be taught from 7 to 
8:00 p.m. on Mondays, beginning Sep­
tember 18 and continuing through Oc­
tober 23. "Exercise Class for Women" 
will be taught 6:30 to 7:30p.m. Tuesdays, 
September 19 through October 24. Sharon 
Meade, Prestonsburg High School, is the 
instructor. Both classes will meet in the 
Student Center at PCC. 

''Patchwork and Quilting for Begin­
ners" will be taught by Mary Pineau in 
Room 216 of the Technology Building 
from 6:30 to 8 p.m. on Tuesdays, 
beginning September 19, and continuing 
for six class sessions. 

For more information on these and 
other classes contact Connie Brackett, 
Office of Community Services, PCC, 886-
3863, extension 244. 

Two classes which were scheduled to 
begin September 7 have been postponed 
to begin September 14. These classes are 
"Caves and Caving", and "Beginning 
Knitting". There is still room for more 
people to enroll in these classes, in Block 
Laying, Brick Laying and Folk Dance. 

Grigsby and Welch 
Opponents for Spot 
On KHSAA Board 

Supt. of Floyd Schools E . P . Grigsby 
and Frank Welch, Belfry High School 
principal, are opponents in the race for 
thP vacant seat on the Kentucky High 
~c_l!_ool Athletic Association's board of 
control. 

The vacancy developed when the lx>ard 
member representing Regions 15 and 16, 
Paul Timble, resigned his post as prin­
cipal of Paintsville High School. Each 
school from the two regions are eligible 
to vote in the selection of his successor 
for the unexpired two-year term. After 
that, a member from the 16th region will 
be elected for the full four-year tenure. 

At stake is the location of regional 
basketball tournaments. 

• Refrigerators 

act exempts operations of two acres or 
less and state law cannot be more 
stringent than federal law. 

Mooney said that is partially true but 
he pointed out that the federal law does 
not address Itself to permits and state 
law does. Following that reasoning, he 
said, the state should have the authority 
to regulate the small operations. 

The legislators agreed with the 
secretary and approved the regulation. 

Subcommittee members also agreed to 
amend a regulation concerning per­
mitting requirements. There were no 
industry objections to the amendment. 

Mr and Mrs. Larry Farmer and 
daughter, Jenmfer, of Warren, Indiana, 
was the Labor Day week-end guest of 
their grandmother, Effie Howard, and 
Mr. Farmer's sisters, Brenda and Rita 
Boldins, also of Warren, accompanied 
them. 

The fatality rate on the nation's high­
ways since 1955 has fallen from 6.34 
deaths per 100 million vehicle miles to 
3 25 deaths by the end of 1977, according 
to the U.S Department of Tran­
sportation. 

At CARR CREEK 
COMMUNITY CENTER 

Rt. 582, Carr Creek 
Knott County 

Bring your favorite dish, soft 
drinks and family records. For 
more information, call 358-4264, 
358-9146 or 358-9112. In Knott 
County, call 447-2776. 

9-13-2t. 

TRUCK DEALS O F THE YEAR AT: 

B. & D. MOTOR CO. 

978 RUCK 

RANGER 
F-100 

WE'VE GOT THEM ALL! 
F-lOO's ••• BRONCOS ••• RANCHEROS ••• ECONOLI NE VANS ••• CAMPERS 

PICKUPS ••• MEDIUMS AND HEAVIES ' 
DEAL WITH THE FORD TEAM: JERRY LAFFERTY, JR., JERRY BRYAN LAFFERTY, 

~ JAMES LAFFERTY, CHESTER PACK, TIM HITES 

B. & D. MOTOR CO. 
Phone 874-2133, Lancer-Water Gap Road 

~------------------

********************************************* 

Color and Black & White and 

• Freezers • Ranges 
PHILCO STEREOS 

PLATFORM 
ROCKERS • Air-Conditioners 
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PLAN FAMILY REUNIO:\ 
There win be a reWlion of the Kennis 

Spears fami!y at the Kennis Spears 
family cemetery across from the mouth 
of Cherokee Creek, at Blaine, beginning 
on Sunday morning, September 24, at 11 
o'clock. All family members are invited 
to attend, bring a basket of food, and 
enjoy the day. The Rev. Henry Crider 
will be the speaker for this event. 

Notice of Intention To Mine 
Pursuant to Application Number 036· 

5000. 
1. In accordance with the provisions of 

KRS 350.005, notice is hereby given that 
Wade Coal Co., Harol~ Ky., intends to 
file an application for the surface 
disturbance mining of approximately 
2.30 acres located northwest of Harold in 
Floyd County. The proposed operation is 
approximately 2 miles northwest of State 
Route 1426's junction with Route 979 and 

located northwest of Sammy Clark 
Branch of Little Mud Creek, latitude 37-
32'·37", longitude 82-40'-21". The surface 
of the area to be mined is owned by 
Fedd Conn, Betsy Layne, Ky. A brief 
description of the kind of mining activity 
proposed is: Deep Mining. The ap­
plication will be filed at the Bureau of 
Surface Mining Reclamation and En­
forcement, Prestonsburg Area Office, 
431 S. Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ken­
tucky 41653. 

Persons wishing to file written ob­
jections and-()r request a formal ad­
ministrative hearing in regard to the 
above described surface mine should 
notify the Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental 
Protection within 30 days of the date of 
this notice. The written objection must 
have attached a copy of the newspaper 
clipping, and reference the above ap­
plication number. Such objection or 
request must be in accordance with KRS 
224.081 (2) and must be forwarded to the 
Director of Permits, Bureau of Surface 
Mining Reclamation and Enforcement, 
Capital Plaza Tower, Frankfort, Ken­
tucky 40601. 

2. Notice is hereby provided pursuant 
to 30 CFR 715.13 <d) (10) and KRS 350 
that the proposed post mining land 
use constitutes a change from the 
pre-mining land use: Interested 
c1tizens and local, State, and Federal 
Agencies are invited to review and 
comment, to the address listed above, on 
the proposed land use. 

lt. 

~ 

Joins First National 

The First National Bank of Prestons· 
burg announced this week that John 
Leake, Jr. recently joined its staff as 
vice-president in charge of the Real 
Estate Mortgage Department. Mr . 
Leake, a native of Floyd coWlty and a 
graduate of Prestonsburg High School, 
attended Alice Lloyd College and the 
University of Kentucky prior to entering 
the Army during World War II. He 
served four, years and was discharged as 
a captain . He remained in the Army 
Reserve and is now a retired colonel. 

Mr. Leake's experience m all phases of 
real estate lending and investing was 
acquired during some 30 years with the 
Real Estate Investment Department of 
the Prudential Insurance Company of 
America in the South and Southeast. He 
also has experience as a real estate 
broker and commerical mortgage officer 
with a savings and loan association. 

Revival To Begin Sept. 17 
At Allen Methodist 

A revival will begin at the Allen United 
Methodist Church, Sunday night, Sept. 
17, and continue through Sept. 23, with 
services daily at 7 p.m. The guest­
evangelist will be the Rev. A.A. 
Fredricks, of Inez. There will be special 
singing by Jerry B. Lafferty, Karen 
Marcum and Bonnie Spencer, The 
Reflections and others. 

The pastor, the Rev. Kenneth R. 
Lemaster, extends a warm welcome. 

THUNDERBIRD 

~ 
MUSTANG II 

~ 
CLUB WAGON 

-----
Bound Bodies 
Found in River 
In Perry County 

The bodies of a man and a woman, 
boWld together with barbed wire and 
weighted with an old plow. were foWld 
last Wednesday, floating in the Kentucky 
River, near Chavies, Perry coWlty. 

A train crew spotted the bodies floating 
about three feet beneath the surface and 
notified police. 

A spokesman for the Perry CoWlty 
Rescue Squad, which recovered the 
bodies about a mile from the Chavies 
commWlity, estimated they had been in 
the river for five to seven days. 

State police said autopsies would be 
performed probably in Louisville. Lt. 
Ray Brittain, of the Hazard post, in· 
dicated that authorities know the source 
of the barbed wire and plow. 

''We feel like we know where they 
came from, yes," he said. The officer 
would not elaborate, adding that no 
arrests have been made. 

The victims' identities were unknown, 
he said. 

Workshop To Oear 
Questions Relating 
To Unsafe Buildings_ 

Cities and counties have been left in a 
quandary by the 1978 legislature as to 
what can and cannot be done about Wl · 
safe buildings. 

The General Assembly replaced 
KRS 8620 to 8720 under a new act relating 
to coWl ties. 

This left local jurisdictions with no 
clear cut directions on how to carry out 
elimination of an unsafe building con­
dition in their city or COWlty. 

Cities of the first , second and third 
class and coWlties have authority to 
adopt ordinances relating to the subject. 
In some instances ordinances already 
exist but are in reference to the repealed 
statute. Attorneys are asking if these are 
no longer valid. 

To help resolve these and other 
questions, the Department for Local 
Government is sponsoring a one-day 
workshop September 11, at Rodeway Inn, 
Louisville, beginning at 9 a.m. 

• •• 

MEAN GREAT GOING! 
SEE ALL THE NEW 1979 FORDS SOON AT. • • 

B. & D. MOTOR CO. 
Phone 874-2133 Lancer-Water Gap Road 

TheMa • 1n 
Churc 

of Martin, Ky. 
Invites You To Hear 

Bro. louis D. Hall 
Evangelist, Southeast Asia Missions 

Friday thru Sunday Sept. u-11 
7 p.m. each evening 

• Special Music Nightly 

• Old Fashioned Night Saturday 

Dinner for All Following Sunday Mom. Services. 
Come and hear about a place where there is no delinquence, 

no problems in the families, the entire family is Christian ••• A land where 

the preacher is pleaded with by the congregation to preach one more sermon-

Just one morel A place with no divorce, no stea6ng, or other crime. 

~ dream, you say- not so- Come hear Bro. Louis Hall tell about such a place. 

Christianity makes a difference. 

Louis D. Hall is a native of Eden, N. C. After graduation from high school 
there he enlisted in the U.S. Army where he served for two years on ac­
tive duty during the Korean conflict. He enrolled in Cincinnati Bible 
Seminary in 1957 and graduated in 1961. He has held ministries in Ohio, 
Michigan, Tennessee, and for the past 13 years, he has preached in North 
Carolina. Most of Bro. Hall's ministry has been in general evangelism. 
He has traveled to 12 foreign countries and 32 states to preach the Word. 

For the past four years, Hall has served as travelling evangelist for 
Southeast Asia Evangelizing Mission. This work has taken him into India, 
Thailand, Burma, Viet Nam and Hong Kong on four different tours of 
service. He is also a private pilot and a Chaplain with the rank of 1st 
Lieut. in the Civil Air Patrol. Hall is married and has three children. 

Joe Hackworth, Minister 
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MAD, MAD, MAD 
FEDERATED 

FURNITURE STORE 

SALE 
8 a.m.-6 p.m. 

Thursday thru Saturday 
Martin, Ky. 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Bill Branham, Jr. wishes 

tot hank all those who did so much to help 
us through our recent bereavement. We 
especially thank those who brought food 
and sent flowers; the Rev. Kaminski 
Robinson and Rev. Cohen Campbell; 
Billy Jean Osborne and the Betsy Layne 
High School chorus, and the J. W. Call & 
Son Funeral Home. The prayers and 
expressions of sympathy meant so very 
much. 

Mrs. Willie Branham Caldwell and 
Family. 

FALL REVIVAL 
Allen United Methodist Church 

Allen, Ky. 

Sunday, Sept. 17, thrv Saturday, Sept. 23 
7 p.m. Nightly 

Rev. A. A. Fredrick, evangelist, 
of Elkhorn City 

Special Singing by Jerry B. Lafferty, 

Karen Marcum and Bonnie Spencer, 

The Reflections and others. 

DON GOBLE REALTY CO. 
AT $60,000 THE BEST BUY IN FLOYD COUNTY! 

Three-bedroom brick split-level home, central heat and air,two full 
baths, good closet space, nice kitchen, large bedrooms, spacious living 
room, good location near Clark Elementary School, approximately 
2,800-sq. rt. On lot approximately 100x300-ft. Concrete drive and 
parking area. Ready for immediate sale and occupancy. 

OTHER LISTINGS 
• Acreage and bulldozed lot at East Point on Ky. 1428, approximately 10 

acres. Also lots at Emma and Katy Friend. 

• Three-bedroom hoSQ~\) acres at East Point. 

• Three bt>drooms, family room, brick fireplace, approximately 1,700-
sq. ft. on a nice lot on Flat Gap road. 

• Three-bedroom hor-e_ (\ \ \>·le-Roberts Addition. $67.00 monthly­
payment loan assur,~\J\.. 

• Three-bedroom mobile home for rent. At Katy Friend. 

For Information, Please Call: 
CALL DON GOBLE, Broker or PRISCILLA HAMILTON 

Phone 886-9442 Phone 789-6386 

Patrick-Nelson 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Patrick, of 
Salyersville, announce the marriage on 
July 22, of their daughter, Sheila, to 
Kenneth Nelson, son of Mrs. Shirley 
Nelson, of Auxier, Ky. They are now 
residing in Ivyton, Ky. 

Rebekahs State Official 
Honored by Lodge Here 

Mrs. Theckley Short and Mrs. Joyce 
Allen were hostesses at a party held 
Tuesday evening in the dining room of 
the l.O.O.F. Lodge hall, honoring Mrs. 
Mabel Jean Lemaster, vice-president of 
the Rebekah State Assembly. Mrs. 
Lemaster was presented by the hostesses 
a money tree in which members had 
participated, also a gift from master 
James Kenneth Allen, a former student 
of Mrs. Lemaster's. Refreshments were 
served. 

Mrs. Lemaster has been a member of 
Miriam Rebekah Lodge No. 31, for 36 
years. During that time she has served as 
noble grand, district president, lodge 
deputy and was secretary for 26 years. 
She was named "Rebekah of the Year" 
in 1977. 

She was appointed inside guardian at 
the Rebekah State Assembly in 1954, 
assembly page in 1962, assembly mar­
shal for 1975·1976. In October, 1976 she 
was elected assembly warden and in 
October 1977 vice-president of the 
Rebekah State Assembly. She will 
preside as president of the State 
Assembly when it convenes next month. 

She will attend the annual session of 
the Soverign Grand Lodge, International 
Association of Rebekah Assemblies, in 
San Antonio, Texas, Sept. 17·22. 

IN APPRECIATION 
The family of Maggie Hatfield Stricklin 

would like to thank the many people for 
the food and flowers, and special thanks 
to Triple Elkhorn Mining Co. for the 
special things they did. Also thanks to 
Sue Martin for all that she has done. 

Thank you. 
CAR<)L YN STRICKLIN CASE 

RADIO SHACK 
No. Lake Drive Prestonsburg, Ky. 

INTRODUCES 

THE MOTOROLA EQB3000 
AUTO GRAPHIC EQUALIZER 

WITH 30-WA n AMPLIFIER 

COME IN FOR FREE DEMONSTRATION 
The Motorola EQ83000 represents a very flexible 
approach to custom1ze I stenmg cond1t1ons to match 1n­
d1v1dual preferences. Its f1ve band equalizer and buill-In 
booster power amplifier are con tamed m a s1ngle compact 
unJI In addit1on. the Motorola EQB3000 has a four spea~r 
fader control and five LED power output level IndiCators 

The EOB3000 has been designed spec1f1cally for the 
varying automot1ve env~ronment It compensates 
adequately for car acoustic levels speaker placement. 
amb1ent road noise and constrarned enclosures. 

The EOB3000 from Motorola-for the best sounds of 
today from the tect,nolog1es of tomorrow 

Motorola EQB3000 Features 
F1ve frequency bands ce'ltered at 60Hz (low range). 250Hz 
(mrd bass). 1000Hz (midrange) 3500Hz (upper mid range­
presence) 10.000Hz (h1gh frequency) 
Power output of 30 watts (15 watts RMS per channel) 
Boost 11 • 1208 nominal for each control: cut of each con· 
troiJs-1208 nom mal, range for each control IS 2408 
Totally integrated circuit design. 
Fader control for front/rear four speaker operation 
Frequency response; 35 to 20.000Hz (·308) typ1c111 
Five power output level LED mdicators 
Power ON/OFF switch wrth nd1cator loght aud1o 1s by· 
passed when sw.tch IS 1!1 OFF pos1t10n 
Input Impedance: 27 ohms nommal, O.C coup!ed 
Output load Impedance: 6 ohms mm1mum per speaker 
With four speaker operation 3 ohms w1th two speaker 
operat1on 
Total harmonic distortion: 1 0% typ1cal at 10 watts output 
Compact size, w1th "U" mountmg bracket. 

Front/Rear Fader Control 

On/Off 
Indicator 

..--.----AnENTION, MUSIC FANS!------. 

For the Latest Sound in Pop, Rock, 
and Country Music, Tune in 

THE SOUND REVIEW 
11 to 12 p.m. Saturday on Radio Station WDOC 

Brought to you by 

THE RADIO SHACK 
(Next door to Montgomery Ward's) Phone 886-6900 

MAYTOWN NEWS 
MAYTOWN P.T.A. TO MEET 

The Maytown P.T.A. will meet in the 
school lunchroom, Monday, Sept. 18 at 7 
p.m. All interested persons are urged to 
attend, 

Sgt. Chalmer R. Martin was ac­
companied to Shaw Air Base, Sumpter, 
S.C. by his brother, Thomas E. Martin 
and both returned here where Sgt. 
Martin spent Labor Day weekend with 
his family and his mother, Mrs. Nora 
Martin. 

A memorial for all the deceased in 
three cemeteries in the head of Turkey 
Creek and also the Harry Lee Moore 
family reunion was held last Sunday. 
Services were conducted by Regular 
Baptist Ministers. 

Mrs. Bradas May accompanied her 
sister, Mrs. Marie Ambrose, Asheville, 
N.C., on a three weeks vacation. They 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Ned May and family 
in Michigan, friends in Detroit, and 
relatives in Cleveland, Xenia and 
Ironton, Ohio and Ashland and Mays­
ville, Ky. before returning home. A 
friend of Mrs. Ambrose accompanied her 
home for a visit. 

Mrs. Octavia Combs was a patient at 
the Pikeville Methodist Hospital for a few 
days last week. 

M'"3. Nora Martin and Mrs. Goldia 
Salyers were among the group of senior 
citizens who visited the Smoky Moun­
tains recently. 

Dan Moore, young son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Budge Moore won a trophy for Most 
Valuable Little League Player in his 
league. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude J. Webb and 
children spent the weekend in Springfield 
and other places in Ohio visiting 
relatives. 

Sympathy is extended to the family of 
Rev. Johnnie Huffman, Albany, Ky. who 
passed away Friday following an ex­
tended illness. He was a former pastor of 
The Maytown United Methodist Church 
and more recently, the Martin Church. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Flanery, Mays­
ville, Ky. were Saturday guests of Mrs . 
Bradas May. 

Sympathy is extended to Morton 
Adkins whose brother, John Adkins, 
passed away last week. 

Mrs. Earl Webb and Mrs. Thurmal 
Click visited Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Ratliff 
at their home on Abbott Creek Sunday 
afternoon. 

Mrs. Tivis Reynolds was the SWlday 
dinner guest of !\Irs. Minnie Howell . 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Beebee and 
Daniel Moore, of Swanton, Ohio were 
guests of Tommy Moore and Mr. and 
Mrs. Rob Lewis last weekend. 

Rhonda Webb, Wanda Salisbury, 
Melissa Lykens and Wanda Murphy are 
attending classes at Caney College, 
Pippa Passes. 

Car Raf:Oe 
A 1978 Monte Carlo will be given away 

Monday night at Archer Park during the 
Prestonsburg Kiwanis vs. the Girls' All­
Star A team softball game, which begins 
at 7:30p.m. 

The winner of the car will be the person 
holding the winning raffle tlcket. Tickets 
are being sold by the Prestonsburg 
Kiwams club and a drawing will be held 
at the softball game. 

$1 donations will be accepted to attend 
the game, which promises to be an ex­
citing event as the stalwart Kiwanis club 
attempts to cover bases against the 
powerful girls' team. 

All proceeds go to the Stewart Wright 
Fund. 

THE FIRS1 ~$EMIL 1 
OF' GOD 
<Chari matte) 

West PresJonsburg, Ky. 

Sunday School - ~ - - - 1:45 
MorningWorshlp. - .It':••·•· 
Chrls&-Ambassador- - •=•P·•· 
Evening Worship .- ~ • 1 :M p.m.' 
Wednes41ay 

Prayer ServicH • - - 1 :M p.m. 
Sunday Radio and 1'V Prop-am, 
"Wings o( Healing", Rev. 
Henry ltarold Wright, 
WDOC Radio AM 
PrJ!SlonsburJ, K_Y.- Z:30-3:M p.m. 

REV. HENRY HAROLD WRIGHT. 
Pastor PhonetUZ 

Notice To All 

U.M.W.A. 

Members 

District 30 

I would like to take this opportunity to remind you of our Diltrlet 31 
election, Thursday, September 28, 1978. 

This is the time that you, the membership, wlU be In charte ol 
electing, for office of Secretary Treasurer of District 30, the penon that 
you can be conlldent In, who will strive for you In every way poaalble. 

I am a graduate of Fed's Creek High School and attended Kentacky 
Business College at Pikeville, Kentucky. My only employment baa been 
in the coal industry, except for the time spent In the United Statelarmed 
forces. I am the son of Reverend Curtis Justice wbo is a retired member 
of Local Union 8045. 

I have been active in the Local union as mine CommlUeem•n. 
Financial Secretary, and Vice-President. I also served at a delegate to 
the 47th Congressional Convention. I am a member of Loc.l anloa ZZI1. 

If I am elected your District 30 Secretary Treasurer I wiD be 
available day or night to serve both active and retired members to the 
best of my ability. 

Your vote and support will be greatly appreciated. 
Best wishes and kindest regards to you and your membership. 

Fraternally yours, 

Bobby Ray Justice 
Vice President L. U. 2267. 

No. 1 on the Ballot 

Save25¢on 
Heinz Baby Food. 

As nutritionally satisfying as your own homemade~ 

\ 
Choose Heinz Strained Baby Food and 

Heinz Juices. Or choose Heinz Junior 
Baby Food. Either way, you save 25¢. 

Heinz Baby Food is as nutritionally satisfying as your own home· 
made. Because like your own homemade, every variety is carefully pre­
pared with your baby's nutritional needs in mind. 

Heinz developed nutrition-saver cooking. A special process we use 
for most varieties, that retains more of the natural vitamins and minerals. 

And like your own homemade, Heinz adds no salt. Or artificial 
preservatives, flavors. or colors. Or sugar to most varieties. 

So when you can't make your own homemade, make it Heinz. 

• A h<IIMJC•d d•d of milk "'ld fj,. nz B.>bo, food "'n'""' tlw u 'i Rrc-.>mm<nded o.ly AJlow,mce lor 16 ,_ntkll nutnenb &tfii4 
rrl'iO-;..----- "'i----- - .. :mRE. C>UPO---, Ci97~ H J HnwCo 

••••••••••••••••••• J •••••••••••••••••••••• 
l'inlH'i 

Save25t~ 
oiT ftve jars of 

Heinz Junior Baby Food. 

~-----------------------------------------------------·····································~~~= ................... ~ 
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Win Ky. State Fair Honors 

The Betay Layne majorettes In recent competition at thla year's Kentucky State 
Fair, once again diatlnguished themselves by winning the second place trophy. 
The squad won the honor with five new starters for the coming year. Members 
Include, from left to ri.Jbt {front row) • Anita Smith, Sandy Cole and Sheila 
Wataon <second row) • Melody Conn and Edadene Boyd; <back row> • Jamie 
Syck, Jackie Hall and Lisa Meade. Betsy Layne band director Is Billie Jean 
Osborne. 

Three Floyd Grid Teams Lose 
It was a Bad Day at Black Rock for all 

three of the county's varsity football 
teams last week. 

The Prestonsburg Black Cats dropped 
their first game of the season Friday 
night to the visiting Pikeville Panthers 
who outran them to a 27-0 decision. The 
Cats next face Johnson Central at Paints­
ville and are not in top physical con­
dition, with two regulars, Estill Carter 
and Dwayne Rodebaugh , injured in the 
Pikeville game. 

Prestonsburg at Johnson Central, 
Wheelwright at Greenup, Breathitt 
County at Morgan County, West Carter at 
Lewis County, Maysville at Rowan 
County, East Carter at Lawrence 
County, Montgomery at Russell, Fair­
view at Ashland, Mullins at Virgie, 
Belfrey at Pikeville, Paintsville at 
Jenkins, Johns Creek at ·whitesburg, 
Fleming-Neon at Elkhorn City, Phelps at 
Lenore, W. Va. 

Last Week: Results 

The Wheelwright Trojans, who were 
undefeated last year in their division, lost 
their third game of the new season to 
highly regarded Belfry, 22 to 6, and the 
young Betsy Layne Bobcats were 
swamped by a much-improved Elkhorn 
City team, 61 to 0. 

Allen Central, which is not playing a 
varsity schedule, defeated Knott County 
Central, 28-26, in an overtime. 

The schedule for this coming Friday: 

Pikeville 27, Prestonsburg 0; Elkhorn 
City 61, Betsy Layne 0; Belfry 22, 
Wheelwright 6; Paintsville 76, Mullins 0; 
Russell 14, Johnson Central o; Breathitt 
County 30, Cumberland 3; Crum, W. Va. 
8, Johns Creek 6; Lynch 20, Fleming­
Neon 0; M. C. Napier 6, Morgan County 
0; Virgie 20, Phelps 14; Raceland 21, 
Lawrence County 0; Ironton, Ohio 34, 
Ashland 2; Greenup County 7, Lexington 
Tates Creek 6; Hazard 21, Cawood 14; 
East Carter 22, West Carter 13. 

ALCOHOLISM SERVICES 
VOLUNTEERS NEEDED 

• 4 to 8 hours weekly eTraining and supervision provided. 

ORIENTATION MEniNG FRIDAY, SEPT. 15 
10 a.m. to 2 p.m. 

Coleman Building, Stafford Ave. 
Paintsville, Ky. 

Or call June Tipton, 886-8572, Prestonsburg 
789-3518, P.aintsville 

If you are concerned with, fir interested in, working with people, plan to 
attend this meeting. 

A non-profit organization-Mountain Comprehensive Care Alcohol and 
Drug Unit, serving alcoholic men and women 24 hours a day: 

•Out-patient counseling, 9 a.m. to4 p.m., Monday thru Friday. 
<No charge for information.) 

•Referral fees for treatment and rehabilitation scaled to ability to pay. 

Fleming Upholstery and 
Furniture Repair Co. 

Robinson Creek, Ky. 
"Sen·ing Floyd and Surrounding Counties Since 1957" 

We specialize in every type of Furniture, upholstery and repair. 
Can Give Local References. All Work Guaranteed 

Call 639-9776 
or 639-2734, after 6 p.m. l ',J 

SENIOR CITIZENS 
Make a date to eat at your Senior Citizens Center any day 
Monday through Friday at 12 noon. ' ' 

Call the Center for transportation information. 

PRESTONSBURG-FLOYD COUNTY RES I DENTS 
Call: Archer Park Senior Citizens Center,886-6855 

MARTIN AREA RESIDENTS 
Call Paul Ritchie, 285-3091 

WHEELWRIGHT AREA RESIDENTS 
Call Katie Newsome, 452-2179 

MENU FOR WEEK OF SEPT. 13-SEPT. 19 

Wednesday-Shepherds Pie, Yellow Squash, Tossed 
Salad, Butterscotch Pudding 
Thursday-Chicken Livers, Mashed Potatoes Sliced 
Apples, Rice Pudding ' 
Friday-Lasagne, Tossed Sal•d, Broccoli Peanut BuHer 
Cookies ' 
Mond•y-Lemon Baked Chicken, Green Beans Squash 
Casserole, Fruit Cocktail ' 
Tuesday-Beef Stew, Cauliflower, Beets, Jello 

Win Awards at Cheerleaders Clinic 

More economy from 
price-tag to tank. 

Pictured above are the McDowell High School varsity cheerleaders who 
recently attended N C.A. cheerleading clinic, held on the campus of the 
University of Kentucky. The cheerleaders participated in a week of activity 
under the direction of the National Cheerleader Association staff McDowell won 
one SUPERIOR ribbon, three EXCELLENT nbbons, and the Super Star Squad 
award. Glenita Bailey, Brenda Lee Hamilton, Liz Hamilton, Carrie Howell, 
Brenda Joyce Hamilton, Pam Akers, Jerri Ward and Lisa Tackett. 

Corolla 2-Door Sedan 
More price economy. Lowest pnce of any 

Toyota. 
More gas economy. Best EPA m1leage 

ratmg of any Toyota 
More standard features. 4 speed trans 

miSSIOn power-ass1 ted front d1sc brakes 
h1-back front bucket seats fully trans1stonzed 
rgn1t1on, MacPherson strut front susp nsron 
welded un1t1zed body and more qual1ty 
extras 

More now! Don t wa1t for pnces to go up 
1t s t1me to buy So come on m the deal~n s 
f1ne 

Corolla 2·Door Sedan Former P'burg Man 
Named Nat. Service 
Officer by DA V 

Health Dept. Offers 
Weight Control Program 

The key to effective weight control is 
keeping food intake and physical exer­
cise in balance. However, lack of exer· 
ctse, as opposed to overeating, is more 
often the cause of overweight. Exercise 
can be fun, provide recreation, and offer 
opporttmity for companionship. The man 
or woman who exercises will maintain a 
better state of physical fitness and keep 
achve and healthier longer. 

More than your moneys worth 
Hershel Joseph, of Louisville, formerly 

of Prestonsburg, has been named one of 
four National Service Officers appointed 
nation·wide by the Disabled American 
Veterans organization 

Prior to his appointment as National 
Service Officer, Joseph served as 
Kentucky DA V adjutant and director of 
the Floyd County Chapter, American 
Red Cross. The 30-year-{)ld Joseph 
served with the U.S. Army in Vietnam 
where he was seriously wounded in 1969. 

A son of Mr. and Mrs. Corbin Joseph, of 
Prestonsburg, he and his wife, Bonnie, 
have three children, Jayne, Stephanie, 
and Hershel, Jr. 

The Floyd County Health Department 
offers a program of exercise and diet for 
the overweight in their Weight Control 
Class held every Tuesday night at 6:30 
p.m. in the ba~ement of the health 
department. There will be a fee of tel! 
cents per weekly visit. 

ART'S AUTO SALES 
So. Lake Drive Phone 886-3861 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

•• 

U.S. MANUFACTURED 

~F Roadmaster R 

*$5.00 WILl HOlD YOUR 
SElECTION WITH REGULAR 
BI-WEEKlY IISTAllMEilS 
PlUS A OlE-TIME 75• 
SERVICE CHARGE. 

A. 26" 
MAN'S OR LADY'S 

MIDDLEWEIGHT 

BICYCLE 

B. 20" 80 y J s MOTOCROSS 

BICYCLE 

e Mett s hae 1 1 ghtwe Qhl 21 d amond tram• 
lady 1 •S g e O.ep R.gal Slue metal c f n 1h 

hromed dtac he guard •~•~•• ol blue dec• a 
• 10 IPIId dtra lut f'lll w de flhO Q .. rtiiQ Of 
'1$ to 97 e l"tooded ••ver 1 d•pull ca per brakes 
• Chromed st .. l Man !Mnd rtc g taand 1bar 
Cl.ln•c Brua llpa e C lSI C 8hle fiCinQ Stdd 1 
w lh mprlftleel r e1t e Rat actor zad •• ret 
trap pedes easy aa h dwa 111m 1h fl•u e 26 
A ~ bll 11*1 IIIII 

D. 

Prestonsburg 

57999 
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Field Commander 

BUILDING OR REMODELING 
YOUR BATHROOM? 

Larry Keene's 
True Value Hardware, Inc. has 

over 15 bathroom displays fully set up 
with prices to fit any pocketbook. Rebecca Jane Warrix, 16-year-old 

jlUlior at Prestonsburg high school, at­
tended Marching Auxiliary Camp this 
July at Centre college in Danville. As a 
first-year Field Commander, Miss 
Warrix won 2nd place in a competition 
among 18 commanders. She also won an 
"excellent" riboon, 2 "superior" ribbons 
and 3 spirit batons. 

Miss Warrix is the daughter of Curtis 
and Minnie Warrix, of Water Gap. 

Highlands Regional 
Plans Fair Displays 

The life-saving treatment for kidney 
failure , hemodialysis, will be one of the 
interesting displays presented by 
Highlands Regional Medical Center at 
the Floyd County Fair this week. 

A dialysis machine will be on display at 
the hospital's booth from 5 p.m. to 8 :30 
p.m. today (Wednesday), Thursday and 
Friday. Highlands Regional has six of the 
machines that are used by a number of 
local residents in regular treatment 
schedules. Technicians from the hospital 
will be available at the fair to explain the 
dialysis machine. 

In addition to the dialysis machine. 
Highlands Regional has a variety of 
displays, handouts and film material . 

LARRY KEENE'S 
True Value Hardware, Inc. 

This year's fair-goers will have a 
chance to have their blood typed free of 
charge by qualified technicians. Also 
available at the Highlands Regional 
booth, which is being presented in con­
junction with the Big Sandy Chapter of 
the Kidney Foundation of Central 
Kentucky, will be a Film on kidney 
disease. The Foundation will be selling 
Tootsie Roll filled banks to raise money 
for its activities. 

Other displays by the hospital include a 
heart monitor and a slide show featuring 
the Medical Center. 

M.Y.F. TO MEET 
The Floyd county sub-district M.Y.F. 

will meet at the Betsy Layne Methodist 
Church at 7 p.m. Monday, Sept. 18, for its 
monthly meeting. The film, ''Eighteen," 
will be shown. All groups are urged to 
attend. 

9-13-3t. 

WILLIAMSON ROAD- PHONE 432-41 5 1 

How to 
stoRwondering 

aboutyour · 

• -

next electric If you'd like to smooth out 

hill 
the ups and downs of your electric 

• bilL we have a way. 
• Ifs called the Equal Payrnent Plan. 

And it's sirnple. \Ve average out your electric usage and bill )OU a fixed 
arnount each rnonth based on that average. You~ll continue to receive a 
hill each n1onth showing )OUt' actual usage, hut you~ll pay the fixed arnount. 

The twrlfth n1onth is ~~settle-up· or final payrnent rnonth. 
\Ve·ll autorualically review your account every six tnonths. so that 

you·n kno'" whE')lher your electricity costs are going up. or do'" n. or staying 
about tlw santP. 

II' an rlc<'lric hill you can hudgr-t for sounds like a good idea (and 
it does appeal to a lot of ou r cuslorners). si tnply contact us. \Ve·ll take it 

fmm then~. Kentucky lbwer Coll1pany 
Working together is the only way. 

Section One, Page Thirteen 

VALUE ALERT 
SPECIALS! 

We at Prestonsburg and Martin IGA Stores believe that you, 

the customer, want the lowest possible prices on groceries. 

Lightning has struck not once, twice, three times, but FOUR 

times-four times, which gives you four weeks, now thru 

Oct. 7, to shop our Value Alert Specials. 

IN ADDITION TO THE SPECIALS BELOW, 
CHECK FOR OUR DISCOUNTED ITEMS TO BE 

FOUND THROUGHOUT THE STORE •. 
DISCOUNT PRICES THAT WILL REMAIN 

BECAUSE WE BELIEVE YOU WANT 
THE LOWEST POSSIBLE PRICES. 

Mellwood 

BACON 

1-Lb~129 
Pkg. 

PEPSI­
COLA . 

~t~.~$129 
Bottles Plus Deposit 

Pantry Dry 

PINTO BEANS 

L? •. ggc 
Martha White 

R~~~~FLOUR 

10-Lb. $1. 3 9 
Bag 

Maxwell House 

INSTANT 
COFFEE 

~~~~·· $389 

IGA 

BATHROOM 
TISSUE 

4-Roll 59 C Pkg. 

SUGAR 
5-Lb. Bag 

ggc 
IGA 

BISCUITS 
Buttermilk and Regular 

'~c'·79 -c Cans 

Bluebonnet 
WHIPPED 

MARGARINE 
6-stick 49-c 

Ctn. 

IGA 

SALTINES 

~~:·45c 

DISCOUNT FOOD PRICES 
EVERYDAY! 

PRESTONSBURG 
AND 

MARTIN 
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REBEKAHS MEET 
Mrs. Mary Zemo, president, announces 

that the district meeting of Rebekah 
lodge will be held with the Pikeville lodge 
Saturday, Sept. 16. A covered-dish dinner 
will be at 6:30. The election of officers for 
the coming year will take place during 
this meeting. Mrs. Zemo urges all 
members of Miriam Rebekah Lodge to 
attend. 

FREE 
EAR PIERCING* 

"ith purchase of eanings 

A sterile. medically approved procedure 
performed b) trained personnel 

Quick • Sc1fe • Painless 

CLYDE BURCHETT 
Jeweler 

Phone 886-2i34 Prestonsburg 

HONORED ON BIRTIIDA Y 
Wall Hamilton was surprised on his 

birthgay, during the Labor Day week­
end, when a group of his friends and 
relatives gathered to honor him. Mr. 
Hamilton received many gifts and birth­
days calls from California, Ohio and 
North Carolina. The hostesses, Mrs. 
Belle Sturgill and Mrs . W. W. Wallen, 
served cake and other refreshments to 
the honoree, Mrs. Hamilton, the Rev. 
Walter Applegate, Mr. and Mrs. Carlos 
Roberts, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hunt, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifford Baldridge, Virgil Goble, 
Mrs. Myrtle Richmond, Mrs. Venelia 
Rinehart, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde George, 
and Teddy, 1\lrs. Rick Hale, and son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell May, and Rusty, Mrs. 
Dorothy Burke, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Brown, and Tommy, Mrs. Jettie Shreve, 
Mrs. Pauline McGuire, Mr. and Mrs. 
Oscar Syck, Mrs. Dorothy Wells, Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Gembar, Joe and Jason 
Burchett, Miss Christine Spradlin, Mr. 
and Mrs. L. B. Fairchild, Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Webb, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Callihan 
and Bill Fannin. 

HAS DINNER GUESTS 
Mrs. Dania Bingham entertained to 

dinner at her home, Sunday, having as 
her guests her daughters, Mrs. Willia 
Mae Branham and Mrs. Marietta 
Crager, her granddaughter, Miss Bar­
bara Crager, and Mrs. Lula Wallen: 

\_ee\· 
'o0~ 

\_0'-
v....oe 

-. ~
v....\' C.:,\.~ f 
S\. ~ Today's ashion 

'\~ in one word. Boots. 
-<'\\e Today's designer. Dexter. 

\. And 1fs not just good 

Houston X796 

Pre-Season 

looks. It s rich leather built on a solid 
leather sole, it s a stacked 

heel. it's distinctive styling. Any way 
you look at it, Dexter 

makes the right shoe for both feet. 

BOOT SALE 

2Q%otf 
T.aredo X797 

Entire Stock 
Ladies Boots 

5 Days Only-Wednes. thru Sunday 
September 13-17 

Gerry & Jerry's Shoes 
U.S. 23 North Phone 886"3932 Prestonsburg 

Visa and Master Charge Welcomed. 

OBSERVE BIRTHDAYS 
Among the persons from Prestonsburg 

and vicinity who have observed birth­
days recently have been:Crystal Collins, 
David N. Johnson, Wall Hamilton, 
Elizabeth Ousley, Maribeth Mann, Trent 
Nairn, William C. Frazier, Debbie 
Williams, Blake Burchett, Stephen 
Midkiff, Farley Williamson, Karen 
Osborne, Brenda Crider, Jenny 
Christian, Leah Franklin, Debbie Layne, 
Heather Walker, Bob King, Pamela Sue 
Goble, Gay Cooley, Fred Venters , and 
Billy Allen Basett. 

VISITORS FROM LOUISVILLE 
Mrs. Mary Mann had as her guests 

during the Labor Day week~nd her 
cousins, Victor Howard and Mont 
Howard, both of Louisville. 

IN ASHLAND HOSPITAL 
Mrs. · Gwyndolyn Harris Schmidt en­

tered Kings Daughters' Hospital , 
Ashland, recently, where she was to have 
undergone surgery, Tuesday of this 
week. 

HOSTESS TO LUNCHEONS 
Mrs. Elizabeth Garriott was hostess at 

May Lodge to two luncheons recently. 
During the early part of the week her 
guests were Mrs. Lillian Rimer and Mrs. 
Rimmer's houseguests, Mrs. Elizabeth 
O'Neil, of Orlando, Florida, and Mrs. 
Virginia Pitman, of Lenore City, Ten­
nessee. During the latter part of the 
week, her guests were Mrs. Effie Milby 
and Mrs. Milby's houseguest, Mrs. 
Lurline McKinney, of Orlando, Florida. 

MR. BURCHETT HONORED 
The Independent order of Odd Fellows 

was host to the various lodges in District 
4 at their district meeting, Saturday 
evening. Prior to the meeting, a covered­
dish dinner, prepared by members of 
Miriam Rebekah Lodge was served. 
During the meeting, John N. Burchett, 
one of the most faithful members of the 
lodge, was honored on his 75th birthday. 
Mr. Burchett was recognized for his 
service to the lodge and he was presented 
a gift by Bill Harvey Howard on behalf of 
the lodge membership. 

HAS GUESTS 
Mrs. Malinda Conley, of Block House 

Bottom, had as her guests for a few days 
last week her nieces, Mrs. Maude Conley, 
of Phoenix, Ariz., Mrs. Audrey Berry, of 
Tampa, Fla., and Mrs. Juanita Good­
paster, of Dayton, Ohio, and her nephew, 
Claude Montgomery, and Mrs. Mont­
gomery, of Owingsville, Kentucky. They 
were pined Thursday by Eugene Berry, 
of Huntington, for a visit at the Mont­
gomery ceme~ery, in Magoffin county. 

VISIT IN LEXINGTON 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry R. Burke and 

daughter, Jennifer, were in ~xington 
during the week~nd, guests of Mrs. 
Burke's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Mrs. 
Mark Reed. Mrs. Reed has been 
seriously ill. 

UNDERGOES SURGERY 
Mrs. Tom Graham Dingus underwent 

surgery at a hospital in Houston, Texas 
last week. 

ASKS PRAYERS 
Mrs. Lucille Montgomery, of the "Shut 

In But Not Shut Out Club," asks that the 
following persons be remembered in 
prayer: Kyle W. Castle, James T. Carter, 
Roman and Gladys Tendziegloski, 
Preston B. Castle, Mildred W. Lilly, 
Timmy Ray Marcum, Tammy Lynn 
Marcum, Lily Hall, Sue Ann Powers, 
George Archer Horn, Michael Baldridge, 
Judy Sparks Downing, and Michael 
Joseph Sparks. 

ATTEND HILL CLIMB 
Among those who attended the 

motorcycle races at Jenny Wiley State 
Park, during the Labor Day week-end, 
were Ty and Ruby Fraley. 

HOME FROM HOSPITAL 
Miss Jean Gable, who was a patient at 

the University of Kentucky Medical 
Center for a few weeks recently, has now 
returned to her home here. Her condition 
is satisfactory. 

ATTEND FUNERAL 
Mrs. Elizabeth Garriott joined 

relatives from Paintsville, SWlday, and 
with them attended the fi.Dler411 of her 
niece, Mrs. Winifred Buckingham Burns, 
at the Catlettsburg Methodist Church. 

JOE D. WEDDINGTON REALTY 
Allen-Weddington Bldg • • Prestonsburg, Ky. 

IF YOU WANT YOUR PROPERTY SOLD, CALL US. 

FOR SALE OR LEASE 
Commercial location fronting 221 feet on U.S. 23 

at lvel, Kentucky 
This property is ideally'situated for retail, wholesale, or industrial use. Located within 3 
miles of Kentucky Machinery, Machinery, Inc., Brandeis, Hayes Shopping Complex, 
and First National Branch Bank. Available immediately. Principals only. 

For further information call Joe Weddington or Bob VanHoose at 

886-3647, or night, 886-2292. 

ATTE!Io.DED 
REUNION 

THE .MORRISON Mayor Proclaims Constitution Week 
Attending the Morrison family reunion 
here this past week were: Woodrow, 
Gra~ie, Vickie, and Shari Morrison, 
Thomas Addair and Eddie Dameron, all 
of Ieager, W. Va. ; Wilson, Ann, John, 
Judy, Matt , and Mindy Morrison , 
Randall and Bonnie York, Cash , Kay, 
Jamie and Rodney Woods all of Dayton, 
Ohio; Harry D. and Mary M. Harness of 
Knox, Indiana; James B., Ella L. , James 
M. and Pam Morrison. of Ypsilanti, 
Michigan; Lois M. McKnight, Mike 
Crank, Sharon and James Sammons of 
Kenova, W. Va.; Geneviene M. Black­
burn, Lucy, Tammy, and Jeffrey Woods, 
James Montain, Sandra, and Ursula 
Harless, all of Columbus , Ohio ; Oma 
Rose of Warsaw, Indiana ; Carol, Sue, 
and Christy Mann, Irvin Morrison of 
Turkey Creek, Ky.; Bud, Janet, Mary 
Lee, and Melvin Richard Morrison, and 
Keen and Wonder Sester, all of A1len ; 
Betty June Scalf, Curtis and Lizzie Lowe 
Darrell, Mae and Patty Ratliff, all of 
Gulnare · Vernis A. and Patsy June 
Phipps, 'Jack, Margie, Carol , Regina, 
Carlo Jean, Geneivene and Rodney 
Morrison, Geraldine and Shanna But­
cher Carol Fay Fannin, James Sester 
and Gracie Musick, all of Auxier ; John 
and Lucy McGuire, Arnie and Charles 
Burke Oakley Morrison, Bill and Ricky 
Morri~n, J. G. and Norma Stepp, Eddie, 
Ruby, Rodney, and Sandra Ousley, Paul , 
Edith, Wendell, Brenda, and Scott Burke, 
and Donald Douglas Holbrook, all of 
Prestonsburg. 

D.A.R. Regent Mrs. James B. Goble is pictured with Prestonsburg Mayor 
Harold Cooley as Mayor Cooley signs a proclamation designating the week of 
Sept. 17-23, Constitution Week in Prestonsburg. The proclamation points out that 
Sept. 17 will mark the 19lst anniversary of the adoption of the Constitution of the 
United States and the mayor's statement urges "all citizens to pay special at­
tention during that week to our Federal Constitution and the advantages of 
American citizenship." 

SHOWER HONORS BRIDE-ELECT 
The Fellowship Hall of the First United 

Methodist Church was the scene of a 
miscellaneous shower , Friday, Sept. 8, at 

The original resolution designating the week as Constitution Week was adopted 
July 23, 1956. 

7:30 p.m., honoring Miss Marsha Ann 
Watson, bride-elect of Mr. Ralph Flet­
cher Heedick, Jr. The color scheme of 
yellow, green and white was carried out 
in the decorations and refreshments. 
From a table covered with a white im­
ported linen cloth, trimmed with lace, 

WORKSHOP CANCELLED 
The workshop on Crisis Intervention 

sponsored by the Kentucky Nurses 
Association, District 11 , and the 
Prestonsburg Community College 
Nursing Department , scheduled for 
September 2o-21 , has been cancelled. 

Mayo Training Class 
For Miners Sept. 25 

A 48-hour initial training class for 
beginning, inexperienced underground 
miners will be held at the Mayo State 
Vocational-Technical School, Paintsville, 
starting September 25, from 8 a.m. to 
4:30 p.m. There is no charge for this 
class. For more information contact 
Norman Goble, mine safety teacher­
coordinator, at 789-3115. 

ATTEND REUNION 
Mr . and Mrs. Luther Shive! attended 

the Shivel-McClure rei.Dlion at McClure's 
Restaurant in Ashland, Saturday night. 
On Sunday they attended the 
homecoming at the First Un ited 
Methodist Church of Gallup, Kentucky. 
They returned home Wednesday. 

HORN CHAPEL UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
Sunday School ________ lOa.m. 
MorningWorship _______ ua.m. 
Evening Worship _______ 7 p.m. 
Prayer Service (Wednesday) _ 7 p.m. 

Rev. Charles Rowe, Pastor lt . 

and having as its centerpiece a crystal 
vase of yellow fall flowers entertwined 
with green foilage, with silver 
candelabra holding yellow candles on 
either side, Miss Lynn Hicks, and the 
bride's cousin, Mrs. Debra Hicks served 
refreshments to a large number of 
guests, who called during the evening. 
Several others who could not attend sent 
gifts. Many items of china, crystal, 
silverware, linens , and other 
miscellaneous gifts were displayed on 
tables throughout the room. Hostesses 
were Mesdames Joe Weddington, 
Arthur Haywood, Donald Hicks, Chalmer ~ 
Frazier, Norman A1len, Carl Woods, Tom 
0 . McGuire, Jack Hyden, Fred Harris, 
Pearl Crum and Roy Ramey. STEAK HOUSE F:!he Finest I~, 

Maytown (Langley) tST£AKS Drs. Akers, Tackett 
Open Martin Offices 

Roger D. Akers, M.D. and Roger 
Tackett, D.M.D., announce the opening 
of a new office in Martin for the practice 
of family medicine and general den­
tistry. 

Dr. Akers formerly practiced at Bypro 
while Dr. Tackett has moved from 
another location in Martin. 

The offices are located at the Triangle 
at Martin, across from the Coal Building 
there. 

NEW HOURS: Open at 6 a.m. 
Delicious homemade buttermilk biscuits, 
sausage, gravy and eggs. 

Langley, Ky. Ph. 285-9119 
Owned and operated by Lorraine Smith 
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ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED 

Mr. and Mrs. Jody Fannin, of PrestonsbW'g, announce the engagement of their 
daughter, Elizabeth Langley, to Donald L. Chaffin, Jr., son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald L. Chaffin, also of Prestonsburg. Miss Fannin is a 1977 graduate of 
Prestonsburg high school and is presently attending Prestonsbl.D'g Community 
College. Mr. Chaffin is a 1975 graduate of Prestonsbi.U'g high school and is a first­
year medical student at the Marshall University School of Medicine. A December 
wedding is planned. 

The Finest- Stride Rite 
Stride Rite, for the best fit, longest wear. We think Stride 
Rite shoes are the very finest you can buy ... And only the 
best Is good enough for our customers. 

Ask any mother 
about Stride Rite 

LAD 'n 
LASSIE 
SHOP 

Phone 886-3142 
Prestonsburg 

IMPERIAL 

\ , 

Phone 285-3505 
Ma rtin 

Top quality leathers teamed With comfortable support. A fme 
ble'nd of Florsheim styling and craftsmanship for the man who 
appreciates fash1on at 1ts finest 

Francis Shoe Store 
Prestonburg 
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RECENT GUESTS HERE 
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Patton at 

their home on Central avenue over the 
Labor Day week-end were Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Patton, of Cincinnati, Mrs. and 
Mrs. Paul Chiconlc, Milwaukee, Wis., 
Pat Reynolds and friends, of Melbourne, 
Fla., and Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Patton, of 
Paintsville. 

ATTEND FUNERAL 
Mr. and Mrs. Benton Ousley and 

grandson, Dannie G<>ble, attended the 
flDleral of Mrs. Grace Hubbard Branham 
at Everiss Ftu1eral Home in Adrian, 
Mich., Sept. 5. 

----
LODGE TO CONFER DEGREE 

Rush Masonic Lodge No. 715 wiU hold 
its Horse Traders degree work Saturday, 
Sept. 16, at 5 p.m. at Rush. Dinner will be 
served by the Eastern Stars. All Master 
Masons are welcome. 

HERE FROM VIRGINIA 
Mr. and Mrs. CharlesF.Goble, of Falls 

Church, Va., were here Tuesday calling 
on the James E. Goble family and Mr. 
and Mrs. John R . Baldridge, Warco. 

WEEK-END VISITORS 
Mr. and Mrs. James Gunnell, of Star 

Route 1, PrestonsbLD'g, bad as week-end 
guests the following: Mrs. Annie Neeley, 
Mr. and Mrs. Garfield G<>zzard, Patsy 
G<>zzard and son Scottie, all of Lima, 
Ohio; Mrs. Josie Cecil, Miss Evelyn 
Cecil, Mr. and Mrs. Harold Morgan, all of 
Olive Hill; Mrs. Rita Mathison, Mrs. 
Reid Burton and daughter, Wilma Jean, 
all of Grayson; Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Mills 
and children, Tracy and Linnie, of 
Marion, Ohio; Walter Gunnell, of Mar­
tin; Mr. and Mrs. Beecher Woods, Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Leslie, Mrs. Bonnie 
Walters, and Miss Crystal Hall, of 
Emma; Debra GlDlnell and Dennis 
Gunnell, of PrestonsbLD'g_; Mrs. Georgia 
Gunnell and children, Rebecca, Brenda 
and Jimmy, of Portsmouth, Ohio; Mr. 
and Mrs. Daniel Cooper, Mrs. Herbert 
Gunnell and son, Jack Douglas, all of 
Colwnbus, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Woods and sons, Kermit and Joey, of 
Ypsilanti, Michigan. 

IN FLORIDA 
Mrs. Kathleen Moore, of Lexington, 

and Eva M. Allen, of Martin, were in 
Tarpon Springs, Fla., last week, guests of 
Phillips 66 Oil Company. They were 
entertained at Innesbrook Lodge. Mrs. 
Moore owns and operates the Moore Oil 
Company in Lexington. 

VISITORS FROM MOREHEAD 
Mr. and Mrs. Monroe Wicker, of 

Morehead, were guests of Mrs. Wicker's 
sister, Mrs. T. J . Allen, of Martin, Labor 
Day week-end. They also visited their 
brother, Sheldon Maggard and family, of 
Hindman, Mr. Wicker's sister, Mrs. 
Buster Sammons, a nephew, Tom 
Campbell, and a niece, Mrs. Worlington 
Wicker, all of Mousie. 

VISIT AT MARTIN 
Mrs. Arnold. Maggard, of Lexington, 

and Mr. and Mrs. Sheldon Maggard, of 
Hindman, were week-end guests at 
Martin of Mrs. T. J. Allen. 

RETURNS HOME 
Mrs. Myrtle Peters has returned to her 

horne, in Dayton, Ohio, following a visit 
of several days with her sister, Mrs. 
Helen Clark, here. Mrs. Peters, who 
suffered a broken arm in a fall while 
here, is recovering nicely. 

NEW NEIGHBORS 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Osborne are being 

welcomed as new neighbors on Riverside 
Drive. 

LUNCHEON GUEST 
Mrs. Wanda Rodebaugh was the 

luncheon guest Wednesday of Mrs. 
Lucille Montgomery at her home, on 
Davis street. 

ANNOUNCE BIRTH 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold HaJJ, Jr ., of 

Topmost, are the parents of a daughter, 
born August 31 at Our Lady of the Way 
Hospital, Martin. The baby has been 
named Debra Carol. 

Flower Bali,"the bra that's almost 
too pretty to cover up, now saves 
you $2.00. 

And while you're saving, you'll 
also be getting a deliciously 
sensuous bra. Pared-down to make 
you loo~ totally feminine. W1th our 
unique flowered embroidery 
design, for the illusion of lace, yet 
it won't scratch, pucker or 
come loose. 

Flower Bali supports you in a way 
that only Nature could. But better. 
With soft cushion-tipped under­
shapers that make Flower C:.l/ 
Bali fit and feel like IJ l11 111 
second nature to you. lJrll.j 

Della's 
Boutique 

Ph. 886-8419 
Court St. Prestonsburg 

VISIT IN FLORIDA 
Miss Debra Gunnell, of Prestonsburg, 

and Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Cooper, of 
Columbus, Ohio, spent seven days 
visiting last week in Tampa, Orlando and 
Daytona Beach, Florida. 

VISIT RELATIVES 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Patterson returned 

here last week from St. Louis, Mo., when 
they visited his mother, Mrs. George 
Patterson, and family, and attended the 
Missouri Bluegrass Festiva1. They also 
visited his brother, James Patterson, and · 
family in O'Fallon, Illinois. 

VISITS IN SOMERSET 
Mrs. Zella Archer spent Labor Day 

week-end in Somerset where she was the 
guest of her daughter, Mrs. Bill Trosper, 
Lori Ellen and Elizabeth Anna. Mr. 
Trosper had been called to Greensboro, 
N.C. upon the death of his brother·in-law, 
the Rev. Neil Yonce. 

ANNOUNCE BIRm 
Mr. and Mrs. Torn Fleming, of 

PrestonsbLD'g, announce the birth of an 8 
lb. 6 oz. son, Blake Thomas, on Aug. 30 at 
Our Lady of the Way hospital. The 
maternal grandparents are Dr. and Mrs. 
William Bryant, of Glasgow; the 
paternal grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Ross Fleming, of Millersburg, Ky. 

ANNOUNCE BIRTH 
Mr. and Mrs. John Harrison Rasnick, 

of Pikeville, announce the birth of their 
first child, a 8 lb. 13 oz. daughter, 
Kathryn Blake, Aug. 17 at Our Lady of 
the Way hospital, Martin. The maternal 
grandparents are Bobbie Goff and the 
late Shorty Goff, of Pikeville; the 
maternal grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
W. J. Martin, of Garrett. 

WEEKEND GUESTS 
Mrs. Richard Davis and daughter, 

Sylvia Helen, of the Ablx>tt Road, has as 
their Labor Day week-end guests, Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Osborne and children, 
Beth, Kathy, and Scott, of Newark, Ohio. 

DINNER HOSTESS 
Mrs. Dorothy Burke entertained to 

dinner at her home Monday evening, 
having as her guests Mrs. Peg Henilett, 
Mrs. Myrtie Davis, Mrs. Pauline Bur­
chett, and Mrs. Barbara Burke and 
daughter, Jennifer. 

VISIT RELATIVES 
Bob Daniels and Quentin Allen, of Ft. 

Mitchell, visited relatives last week 
while here on business. 

Setsers Celebrate 
55th Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. Keen Setser of Allen were 
honored with an open house Stu1day 
afternoon at the home of their daughter, 
Mrs. Rona1d C. Johnson and Mr. John­
son, on Central avenue to celebrate their 
55th wedding anniversary. 

Lovely white and green carnations and 
mwns arranged with greenery and 
stephanotis, and nanked by tapers, 
served as a centerpiece for the reception 
table. A white tiered anniversary cake 
decorated with a bride and groom and 
wedding bells, green wedding bell­
shaped mints, nuts, and pWlch were 
served by the hostess to relatives and 
friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Setser, who were wed 
September 14, 1923, at the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Benjamen En­
dicott, of Endicott, were the recipients of 
many lovely gifts from the guests. 

HERE FROM SALYERSVILLE 
Mrs. Nettie Reed and Mr. and Mrs. 

Buck Patrick, of Sa1yersville, were here 
Sunday afternoon for a visit with Mr. an~ 
Mrs. Paul Francis. 

VISITS SISTER 
Mrs. Carl Dingus, of Lexington, spent a 

part of the Labor Day week-end visiting 
with her sister, Mrs. William A. Salis­
bury, and Mr. Salisbury at Hunter Other 
recent guests of Mr. and Mrs. Salisbury 
were Mrs. Grayson Johnson and son, of 
Hindman. 

DINNER HOSTS 
Mr. and Mrs. C. M. Isaacs had as their 

dinner guests, Saturday of last week, Mr. 
and Mrs. Walt Staude and daughter, 
Rebecca. Mr. Staude is pastor of the 
Arnold Avenue Church of Christ here. 

HERE FROM COLUMBUS 
Mr. and Mrs. A. F. Rose, of Colwnbus, 

Ohio, spent the Labor Day week-end with 
his mother, Mrs. Nora Decker, of Green 
Acres, on Sunday, Mrs. Decker en­
tertained to dinner, having as her guests 
Mr. and Mrs. Rose, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Edwards. 

Prestonsburg 
Woman's Club News 

The Prestonsburg Woman's Club held 
its September meeting Wed., Sept. 6 at 
the Floyd County Library. The business 
session was presided over by Mrs. R. W. 
Ankrom. All members are reminded that 
the yearly membership fee is due and 
payable to Mrs. Jess Stover, TreasLD'e. 

Mr. Jim Blevens from KET presented 
a video tape of the 1978 General 
Federation of Women's Club Convention 
in Phoenix, Arizona. The presentation 
centered around the installation of 
Kentucky's Mrs. Oscar C. Sowards as 
President. 

Mrs. Sharon Watson, president, and 
several other members of the Prestons­
bl.D'g Junior Woman's Club were present 
at the meeting. Refreshments were 
served to the members and guests by the 
hostesses, Mrs. Edward Leslie, Mrs. 
Cha1mer Frazier, Mrs. John K. Pitts, 
Mrs. Robert BLD'chett, and Mrs. H. E. 
Midkiff. 

VISITS HERE 
Monica Blair, daughter of Mr. and 

Mrs. Dan Blair, of Glasgow, was here 
recently for a week's visit with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Copley, of Dewey lake, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Windle Blair, of Water Gap. 

DIAMOND CLUSTER 

SPECIAL 

CLY()f~' 8LRCHE1T 
"~'fill 
PHONE 116 2Tl4 

4-5-lf. PRBTONS8URG 

CARPORT SALE 
(Some Furniture) 

JAN CHAFFINS 
412 Riverside Drive, Prestonsburg 

Thursday, Friday, Saturday 
9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

ALFRED WERBER for fall .. as alv.ays designing just what you want ... 
comfortable, easy fash1ons that you'll love to wear . . and wear ... and wear. 

Shown are two from their newest collection come see all the others 
that are waiting to compliment you! 

Prestonsburg 
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GROUND BEEF 
Fresh 
3 Lbs. Or More 

BALLARD SAUSAGE 
$219 2-LB. ROLL 

Hot, Mild, Sage 

PORK STEAK 

FRESH L~ 119 

SPARE RIBS 

LB.a9e 

ALL GRINDS COFFEE 

LB. 95e 
Smoked Pork Chops 

FISCHER LB~ 189 

SPICED LUNCHEON 
ARMOUR 
2-LB. CAN 

$269 

BOILED HAM 
"From Our Deli" $ 269 

Superior LB . 

COMPLETER 
PIECES ON 
SALE NOW! 

"de~rtment store quality at superm•rket prices" 

WHOLE CHICKEN 
EAGLES PRIDE 59e 
PRE-PACKED LB. 

CORN DOGS 

WOODY'S 
$129 LB. 

Swift Premium Franks 
Beef 12·0Z. 

PKG. 

FT 
KS 

SHASTA ASSORTED 

COCA­
COL 
8 16-0z. 

Bottles 

' 
• ~ THIS WEEK'S FEATURE: 

" ' .\ •sauc•• 
~\ 8 -::"--· -.' ; :::~ & 

With 1 $3.00 
purchue 

START YOUR 

Church or Civic 
Organization 

SAVE THE LABELS 
ON HYDE PARK 

FOOD PRODUCTS! 
Hyde Puk Food Product Liibels Ire ~~ 
worth one"hillf cent uch to your ~~ 
church or CIVIC orgilniZ~tion " Stiirt ~)0 
SiiVIMIJ liibels todiiyl After iiC· ~xvs 
c~muliiflon of liibels, your church or 
CIVIC orgilnizllion should mlil the~ 
to : Milone & Hyde. Inc .• 1991 CJH'. ~~ 
porilte Ave ., Memphis, Tenn. 31132. 

Co•p•r• Gu•llty, 
Co•p•r• ltrlce. 

You'll• H tie lt•rk ~''"" 

~~ HYDI It ARK fROZIN 

CUT GRIIN 
BIAtiS 

2 160Z$ ...... 
HYDIItA•K 

SILF•RISING 

ll:~~mm~P!!!!!IIIIIIIiiiil~~s~~l~~~·~~~~ 'sLouR Deposit , 2" 
2SL.. ~ •a• 

SUNSHINE 

'!'-,_~o/QII HYDE PARK 
CREAMY OR 
CRUNCHY 

HYDE PARK 4 $1 
16-0Z. LOAVES FOR 

PACIAL TISSUI 
LADY 2 * SCOTT 200CT.ip 129 
ASSORTED BOXES 

COPPII PILTIRS 
HYDE PARK 
ALSO MR. COFFEE 
COF FE E F ILTERS 100CT .•• C 
100 CT. 99c PKG. 

70Z.,,C 
CAN 

ICED TEA MIX 

$1'·--···· ···~·-· 
HYDE PARK 

HOMOGENIZED 

MILK 
$ 5 

_,.,.,........-- Gal. Carton 

DISHWASHIR 

CASCADI 
DITIRGINT 

13cOFF LABEL 

3SOZ ••• c 
•ox 

PIC· PIC 
SUPIIIIRIETS 

Prestonsburg 
and 

Martin 
ltRICIS IPPICYIYI 

YHRU SiltY. 16, 1978 
QuantiTy R1ghts Reservecs 

( ' 



Wednesday, September 13, 1978 

' 

ON ALL 1978 M DELS IN STOCK 
YES, NOW IS YOUR CHANCE TO SAVE ON OUR END-OF-THE­
YEAR SPECIALS ON ALL 1978 CHEVROLET$ AND BUICKS. COME 
IN, SOON, BECAUSE THEY'RE GO NG FAST-FROM THE ECO· 
NOMICAL CHEVETTE AND MONZ S TO THE NEW-GENERATION 
MONTE CARLO AND MALIBU. 

YOUR CAR IS WAITING FOR YOU. 

These Salesmen Will Be 
On Hand To Serve You: 

ED MUSIC, ESTILL LEE CARTER 
PAUL HUGHES, NELSON BALDRIDGE 
BOBBY BURCHETT, EDDIE MEADE 
BERT McFADDIN, SCOTT MOORE 
CARL CASTLE 

Why you 
should buy 
lENNOX·central· 
cooling now: 

, 

1. Lennox quality central air conditioning is a 
good buy any time. 

2. Pre-seasor. savings during our "Nifty Weather 
Days" sale make it even better. 

3. Prompt installation before hot weather. 
4. Dependable, cool, clean quiet comfort for many 

summers to come. 

OUTDOOR COOLING UNIT: Compact. Isolated 
compressor and upward discharge fan make it 
quiet. Weatherproof paint keeps it looking great. 

Call now for our low price on 
a Lennox comfort system for 
your home. 

Elliott Glass & Electric Co., Inc. 

MUS I 
CHEV 

Receives Doctorate 

Among the graduates at Florida State 
University's June 10 Commencement 
was Brenda Crager Helton, native of 
Prestonsburg. Mrs. Helton received the 
Doctor of Philosophy degree in the design 
and management of postsecondary 
education. Her dissertation concerned 
the volume, source and administrative 
burden of information demands imposed 
on colleges and universities by state and 
federal agencies. 

Mrs. Helton was valedictorian of the 
1965 graduating class at Prestonsburg 
High School and received a scholarship 
to Morehead State University. She 
continued her education at Indiana 
University and was graduated with 
distinction in 1969 with a B.S. degree in 
health and physical education. While 
teaching at Pikeville College, she earned 
a Master of Higher Education degree 
from Morehead State University in 1971. 
Mrs . Helton maintained a perfect 
academic standing throughout her 
master's and doctoral studies. 

Dr. Helton has been a staff member of 
the Kentucky Council on Higher 
Education since November, 1973, where 
she is currently associate director of 
academic pt·ograms. She is the daughter 
of Mrs. Marietta Crager, Prestonsburg, 
and the wife of George Helton, Frankfort 
and Paintsville certified public ac­
countant. 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

WRIGHT'S CHAPEL 
In Jesus Name 

Sat. Evt"ningSenice-7 )l..m. 
Sunday Service-11 a.m. 

Pastor- Bro. Blankt"nship 

789-1411 • 8-9-tf. 

CARTER-HUGHES 
LET-BUICK Phone 886-9181 

South lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

t/ Chec: Out 1/ 

FIRST NATIONAL 
CHECKING ACCOUNT 

Safe- As secure as your signature. 

A valuable service when you consider what you 
Inexpensive-get-monthly statements, prompt service 

and nearby branch offices. 

Conven 
·lent- Not~ing is easier tha~ maintaining a First 

Nat1onal Bank Check1ng account. 

YOUR GOVERNMENT CHECK 
CAN BE DIRECTLY 

DEPOSITED. 
No delays, no fighting crowds or traffic. Pay your bills from the 

convenience of your own living room. 
Interested? There's lots more. Visit us soon. 

''The Bank of Personal Service" 
BURL WELLS SPURLOCK, President 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 

BANK 

MAIN OFFICE 
l North U.ke Drive 
Prestonsburg 

TWIN· BRIOGES BRANCH 
~rtin 

BETSY LAYNE BRANCH 
u.s. 23 
Betsy l•yne 

NORTH LAKE DRIVE BRANCH 
us. l3 
Prostonsburg 
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SPECIAL 

··~''''''itlrtt,. . 
I WITH THE ~ ~ 

., ~ PURCHASE OF -~ 10 ~· 
· ',\.q ANY liVING ROOM ~ LIVJN, -1-· 

r~ SUITE OF $699.95 :_ G Roo,., S. ::_ 
• : VALUE AND UP, ':i , 7 liiTts ::: 

NOW'S THE TIME TO PLAN AHEAD 
To think of winter comfort at harvest·time savings. So squirrel away a few of these unusual bargains 
now . . • Furniture and appliances, furnaces, heaters . . . Bedroom suites at 20% off, 
Living Room Suites up to 50% off, Solid M a pie Dining Room Suites up to 15% off ... 
Buy now and you'll smile this winter! 

• • • 

Buy a Large 

CEDAR CHEST 
Buy Any Buy Any 

FR E! FREE! 

BEDROOM SUITE LIVING ROOM SUITE ,:·~~ ~ 1 
YOU RECEIVE FREE ~ o,.. .X .... 

on1v $9995 ~ EUREKA UPRIGHT ~ ~ OFF ~. $49995 Au": $49995 ~r;,ct ~ VACUUM CLEANER ~ ~ 
... ,,,,,,,, \~~OR TWO TABLE LAMPS,4~1/fAUil'\\~ ~ ~~ . Get Free Sealy Innerspring Mattress Get Free 9x12 Braided Rug $69.95 VALUE. · 

~ GLASS·LINED ~~· ---------------------.-;-.;.~~--------
··S WATER HEATER .,.:_ 
~ 5-YearWarranty ~ 
... 88 • 

__ §! 30-Gal. $99 ~ 
~ Gas ~ 
~ ~ 

~ ···~~~~ $1 098~· 
TAKE\\ ITH. s . 

*SELL-OUT OF APPLIANCES* 
TWO TRAI~ERLOADS-RANGES, REFRIGERATORS, WASHERS, DRYERS-
~ ARRIVED FOR THIS GIANT SALE. DON'T MISS THE SAYINGS! 

BUY ANY 21-CU. n. HOTPOINT REFRIGERATOR, GET 

$5007 CASH DISCOUNT OFF SALE PRICE 
BUY ANY 18-CU. FT. HOTPOINT REFRIGERATOR, GET 

$5007 CASH DISCOUNT OFF SALE PRICE 

BUY ANY ENTERPRISE GAS OR ELECTRIC RANGE, GET 
~6 $50°7 OFF OUR SALE PRICE 

BUY ANY CHEST OR UPRIGHT FREEZER, GET 

$5007 OFF OUR SALE PRICE 
~-· 

7o,ooo.a.t.u. ~ BUY ANY 16-CU. FT. HOTPOINT REFRIGERATOR, GET 

fLOOR ! _$_5_0°_7 _cA_S_H--D_Is_co_u_N_T_o_FF_S~LE_P_R_IC_E_ 
BUY ANY MAYTAG AUTOMATIC WASHER, GET 

$2995 OFF OUR LIST PRICE 

.- FURNACES S .. e Take With in Carton. ~ 

BUY ANY HOTPOINT ELECTRIC RA'NGE, GET 
$5007 CASH DISCOUNT OFF SALE PRICE 

BUY ANY MAYTAG ELECTRIC OR GAS DRYER, 'GET 

$2000 OFF OUR LIST PRICE 
··~ $29988 ~~ 
~ ~~ 

I APPLIANCE SPECIALS INCLUDE THEIR WARRANTIES. FREE DELIVERY & NORMAL INSTALLATION. I 
~~IIH\ll••~ · .· · BIGGEST BEDDING SALE OF THE YEAR! SEPTEMBER SPECIALS! 

Good 

MAnRESS AND 
BOX SPRINGS 

$1~~~~0 $11 98~er Set 

Deluxe Quitted 

MAnRESS AND 
BOX SPRINGS 

List $15995 
Sl99·90 Per Set 

Super Quitted 

MAnRESS AND 
BOX SPRINGS 

List $13988 $179.90 Set 

BICYCLES .~~-h $500 OFF: 26~~!h $1 0 OFF 

WATER SYSTEMS ·;~~~~!~t'dt'~~~~~~- _ s199•• 
PLASTIC PIPE 'Hn. sef."t.; 1-ln.ll eFt. ; JIJ•In.14e Ft. 
4-I~CH 

SEWER TILE __ -4-ln.xlo-Ft.Joints ___ s3.99.Joint 

OUR BIGGEST LIVING ROOM SUITE SALE OF THE YEAR! ~ · - ~ 
·-~ Warm Mom·•ng ~ 2-Piece 2·Piece Sawyer 3-Pt"ece 147 LIVING ROOM ~ ~ Naugahyde 

'S_ GAS ~ LIVING ROOM L!~1.~?.w~.~?.,~.~.?.!.TE LIV~~.?,.,~~~M SUII~E LIVING ROOM SUITE SUITES IN STOCK 
~ HEATERS ... SUITE ChoiceorColors . ONLY$36988 /4 \ 'eiHt- Green-Gold. Sale Tagged For the Montfl - -!!!!. Olive-Chestnut-Black OFF Large Sofa . Matching Chair.Lo\'t• St-at. of June. See Us Before "- 0 ~. List $29700 $4~~~~5 $397°0 

. 

We have othe-r Sa\\ )er Suite-s 
in tock to choose from ... 

List $79988 $995.00 \11·3 f'1~c•• 
You Buy and Save Money! 

~to Y2 Off ~ l 0/ OFF~ $399.95 
··~ /0 ~· 
~ .. ~ .. 
. . ~Ill J/IIU \\ ~ s.p;.eo Mople Rnish Huge. Moplo 

BIGG'EST DINING ROOM FURNITURE SALE OF THE YEAR! 

i · DINEnE SET DINING ROOM GROUP 
~'''' I f ftj, ~ ~II Solid ~tapir 

§.~' ~~~M-aple Extension Tablt>. 4 Mates (hairs l.ar~e Bu.!. 'ixtt\a1 n1 dpl}tluHtirghh.b7a2·~1knC~hhaMira\plr Tablr \lapll' Hurfl't and Jlutl'h. :\lapll' Tahll'. -~ l.argt- Oval Tablt>. T\\O 10-lnch l .t-a\es . ~ Four \laph· Chairs 

7 ·Piece Solid Maple 

DINETTE SET 
6-Piece Mople or Oak 5-Piece Solid Maple 

DINING ROOM GROUP DINETTE SET 

4 Solid \laplt•( 'hair!. S 66-INCH ~ List $19988 FiH~ !'ixSolid:\lapi.-Chair 88 
KITCHEN ~~9•91 Pim Only S89988 A~:~~",' ss~~~~s $469~'~"'"'"'' S7~~~s$699 ;:~~!: 53~~~~5 $26988 

.... 
~ SINK : . a Formica or Porcelain Top. ~ 
~ S Vinyl LateliC- Outside White 

·~ J 1 9988 $j. ~·o~s~·p~j,j~'~'~ - - - <•••· <>•J. $6 99 ~~~~~~~~ - - ~~·": •:• '~~ ;,'(:,.. $799 p~;~•T ROUER AND TRA L _ ,.,, $1 67 

-~A~ TA"""''~Tb...._~ · ~O~s~··~AI.:';'~· r:··~n~• _,,,. "''· S799 ~OOF"PAINT _____ s., •. "''· S699 PA1Ni aRusH- ':?"~''".!"'~ _ ,,,. S297 

··~f/tl ,a•• ·. Latex- WhiteandColors $599 POHCII & FI.OOH $699 $269 FLAT WALL PAINT ____ salt-. GaL ENAMEL -- - - - - - sail'. (;aJ. PAINT THINNER_~ ____ (.a\. 

STEP & EXTENSION LADDERS r _ \\ood_or~,u~inu~~ _ 10% DISCOUNT 

~:oPr~:::~:~:rg ... A R RO WO 0 D'S HARDWARE & fURNITURE 
Phone 886-6116, So. Lake Drive • Phone 886-2703, Court Street 
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HORSE SHOW 
SEPT. 16-6 P.M. 

Big 
eal I • 

IIDI. Pump/ Air Conditioners 

Save now and later Can 
help lower heating b1lls 
&n wmter compared to 
electnc res1stance heat­
mg. plus cools all summer 
long Des1gned for years 
of trouble-f•ee operat1on 

Call today for free estimate 

BURLCO 
CONSTRUCTION CO. 

Ph. 886-6692 Prestonsburg, Ky. 
9-13-tf. 

CASH& 
CARRY ATTENTION 

COAL HAULERS 
CASH& 
CARRY 

Discount Prices On EXTRA TREAD Coal 
Truck Tires! 

BRIDGESTONE TREAD AND A HALF 

• 1000-20 12 Ply Z Rib .............. $179.00 
• 1000-22 12 Ply Z Rib ............... $189.00 
• 1000-20 12 Ply Z Lug ...•......•..• $199.00 
• 1000-22 12 Ply Z Lug ...••••..•••.• $219.00 

FEDERAL TAX INCLUDED 

FACTORY TIRE OUTLET 
Edwards-Warren 5·31· 

52t. 

...... ~ .. ~n: ... s Tire Co. Route 23 

...,......._.. Prestonsburg 

In the Location Formerly Occupied by Vance Volkswagon 

I 
Eastern Ky. Mack Donates Truck 

From left-larry Whitt, Jesse Conley, C. W. Combs, J. R. McClung. 
A brief presentation at Eastern Kentucky Mack here recently marked a con· 

tribution to the Mayo Vocational School in Paintsville. 
The contribltion was a 1969 Mack truck, which will be used to provide 

"Hands On" training to students enrolled in the school's diesel 
mechanics course. The donation by Eastern Kentucky Mack is to help the 
institution in its efforts to prepare students for careers in the trucking industries. 

Making the presentation on behalf of Eastern Kentucky Mack were Larry 
Whitt, division manager and J.R. McClung, president of Worldwide Equipment. 
Accepting on behalf of fayo School were Jesse Conley, director, and C. W. 
Combs, assistant director. 

Vocational Ed Centers Get 
ARC Funds To Stress Mining 

Gov. Julian M. Carroll has announced 
that a $110,920 Appalachian Regional 
Commission grant has been approved for 
funding of conversion of existing 
vocational education programs in 
Breathitt, Lee, Clay, Letcher and Bell 
counties. 

According to Kentucky Development 
Secretary William L. Short, Carroll's 
alternate representative to the com· 
mission, the funds will be used to update 
educational programs in Area Vocational 
Education Centers to put more emphasis 
on mining careers. 

"This is an important step toward 
meeting the expanding manpower 
requiremenu in these five Appalachian 

· Kentucky countie ,"Short said. He said 
projections by various sources of the 
demand for new mine workers In the 
entire state during the period of 1977-1985 
range between 12,060 and 16,594 workers. 

The Bureau of Mines and Minerals 
projects for Eastern Kentucky a need of 
12,058 r.ew workers who will require 48 

hours of entry-level training in mine 
safety. 

"The time to train miners is now, so 
that Kentucky may be prepared for the 
significant increase in demand of coal 
which is expected to occur," Short said. 

One project will involve the conversion 
of drafting programs previously offered 
at the Lee and Clay county centers and of 
the appliance repair program at the 
Breathitt County center into mining 
careers programs. The program:; will 
accommodate some 30 secondary 
students per center per year. 

The other project calls for the con­
version of existing auto mechanics 
programs at Bell and Letcher centers 
mto programs on diesel mechanics 
programs. Diesel mechanics is an in· 
tergral part of coal mine equipment 
maintenance. This project will also serve 
30 secondary students per center on an 
annual basis. 

Times Want Ads Get Results! 

lt·pd . 

at 

DELAND CONN STABLES 
Salisbury, Ky. (On Left Beaver) 

Ph. 285-3635 

frofassional 
clarvicas 

CARPETS 
UPHO LSTERY 

& 
DRA PERY 
CLEANING 

SPECIALISTS IN 
• Extraction Cleaning for 
Carpet . Upholstery • Draperies 

• Over 14 years Experience • Scotchguard 

• We clean all types of materials & fibers 
• Ask about our guarantee 
:t'or Appointment and E tlmates 

For Floyd, Pike. John on and Magoffin Counties, Call: 

Prestonsburg Office, 886-6488 

VISA FREE 
ESTIMATE 

7·19-tf. 

HAZELETT'S PAINT 
& WALLPAPER 
Your Glidden Paint Dealer 

Wallpaper • Vinyl wall covering • Ceramic tile, walland 
floors • Carpet by Pepperell. • Inlaid by Armstrong and 
Congoleum • Floor tile by Kent lie and Armstrong • Bruce 
pre-finished flooring, etc. 

Floor sanding machine for rent. 
We also do commercial sandblasting. 

416 N. Lake Drive 
Phones 886-2094; after 5 p.m., 886-2132 

9·13-tf. 

NEWS release 
COMMERCIAL TESTING & ENGINEERING CO. 

Division Offices: 5793 McCorkle Ave., Charleston, West Virginia 25232 
Area Code (304) 925-6631 

If you are a Social Security recipient , you can have 

your checks sent directly to your Bank Josephine 

checking or savings account . 

CHARLESTON, WEST. VIRGINIA, SEPTEMBER 11, 
1978-A change in management in our Pikeville, 
Kentucky laboratory has been announced by Jack 
White, Appalachian division Manager of Commercial 
Testing & Engineering Co. 

The new Manager, Steve Houser, has been with the 
Company for 7 years and is experienced in all aspects 
of coal sampling, preparation and analysis. Prior to 
his transfer, he was attached to the South Holland, 
Dl. office. 

This direct deposit system can save you time, trou­

ble, ahd worry. 

It means your paychecks go directly to your Bank 

Josephine account - not to your mailbox. 

So sign up today at 

PHONE 886-9101 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

Prestonsburg - Garrett - Harold - Allen 

Mt mber F. D. I. . 

The Pikeville operation has expanded its service area 
to include a greater portion of Eastern Kentucky, West 
Virginia and Virginia. It was also announced that the 
Pikeville operation has expanded their capabilities to 
provide full range washability studies of coal •. 

LOCAL CO TACTS: S. R. (Steve) Houser 
MANAGER 

W. A. (Bill) Lemberger 
MANAGER TECHNICAL SERVICES 

(606) 432-2511 
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MAINTEHAlf<Z OJ' PLANT--------··--------·--
JMiade all ..,...... for repair ucl lll&inteuace of the ~ehoellndl4inp, .......,., ud eqaip-'1 
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UMIII¥ ..... (1·~.-. GW) ~If-----­

VoWel BoDda (Prial:ipal 01117) --~tJ----­
f 

IOUIICII8 OJ' D~C'l TASATIOM 

.Ubadu~ 

··--- .... IDd Mn. 'fclmiDy ... Del cbildND, Mary Lyall ad 
~_,,"'!!!!IIUMr. and Mn. T. J. w.u.u. 
'DIIiilll' auesta of lin. llartba JaDe 

••r. and daUihter I Paula, lut 
,=~were 111'1. Kelly Kendrick, 
lj 1 W81t Vlrlblfa; Mr. and Mn. 
-·~'BUII4!1ll, GeDe Tunney Kendrick, 

' arlo; Jody Manball, 
fMI~tton; Mr and Mra. VerDOD 

• 1 and cldldreD1 Jeatca, RJ•, 
jldllatbew of Yplilanti1 MlcblpD; Mr. 

Parter. RandJ Pol't8'. 
IMil :Dou!&la• Porter 8Dd ScoUJ, Jam• 

, aDd lin. LIDda Blair ud 
-~--. Ancte and Michelle, all ~ 

WatCh, student at Cumberlad 
WiDiamlbW'I, Kentuck)', villted 

Dll•tll. Reverend and Mn. Bu-1 
and family, over tbe weekeDCI. 

~ ~illllll:sa tbole atteDdllll tbe wedciiD8 
~lllii"U.I'V Septembtr z. of DoDDa 

.. lberfol~ to Jam• Olear RatUff at 
Hill Mehtodist Cburcb iD ••m were hil mother, 111'1. La ... 

Mr. and Mn. <llarl• Miller and 
lil.rtltar, Amy, of Rural Retreat, 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Wendell 
of Allea, Mn. Jack Reed and 

Llrry, DeCanter, Indiana; Mr. •d 
Steve BeDedk:t, Mount Ven1011, 

Ullblclu; Mr.adllrl. eveBeaedletand 
lldldren, Pada and 8terie, ~ Nubvllle, 
'l'eaneasee; Jeff Ratliff, Pensacola, 

cl!' •l'lnriidJa· Mr. and Mrs. Rlcbud AileD, 
Mftll'l!h•Yld! MI. Marlene lleare, Sal,.. 
rille; lin. La•a CMnd'er, Rowoke, 
Virpua; Mrs. o. C: llil)W, and Mrl. and 

rs. Robert Tackett, formerly of 
Clllsbw'l, DOW llvtq lD tbe Paciftc 

Jallmdl. 
Lonzo.Lafferty of May VlU8p baa beea 

conftn to hil home tbla week due to 
pneumonla. Mr. Lafferty II IIOIDewbat 
improved at this time. 

JeDDJ Wiley Summer 'lbeatre playen 
who have been 1ueat1 of Mr. and Mn • 
Bennie Lafferty dtainl tbe aamm• 
months, Elilabetb Tutor, Pikeville, Usa 
Newben}', Naabvllle, Tennessee, Jane 
DucDey, Chicago, IlllDoil, and stwee 
Thill, Jacksonville, Florida, have 
returned to their retpeetive bolD-. For 
the past six d., Mr. and Mn. LllffertJ 
enjoyed a visit wlthber brother, Bea Hall 
and Mrs. Hall ol Somenet, and b.­
sister, Mrl. Grace Floyd ol GraJICIIL 
They returned home tbil put t'rldaJ. 

Code 
21-23 

31 

ll2 

33 

3-l 

36 

41 
~46 

61 

61 

63 

G 

I' 

,J 
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:S.!e of nal proper" aM eqWJtMIIlo& --··--.... -·-'------... ~I!IJIJI 
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U.S. Choice 

SIRLOIN STEAK ___ -~ ---
U.S. Choice 

PORTERHOUSE STEAK . 
Lean, Meaty 

SPARE RIBS -------- Lb~ivg.- __ ~ , ·-

_lb.$2 19 

lb.$269 

lb.$119 
Lay's -.... 51~~.99~ SMALL PICNICS 4J _ ... 

4to8 
... Lb. Avg. -:-

Armour 1-lb.$129 MIRACURE BACON -
Swift's FRESH FRYER QUARTERS 

BEEF STEW Breast Portion Leg Portion 

The Floyd County Times 

U.S. Choice 

T-BONE or 
LUBSTEAK 
$ 59 

Round White 

POTATOES 

2~~~·· 99e lb.69e lb:59e 
....-......=:~~~ 

SWIFTNING 
SHORTENING 

Hy-Top Hy-Top 

PEANUT BUTTER MARGARINE 
2-Lb.99e 

Smooth or Crunchy 

l8-0z.89e Jar Bowl 

Hy-Top 

CRACKERS 
1-Lb. 49e 
Box 

We Reserve 
The Right 
To Limit 

Quantities. 

Travt>l Just a 
Little Way and 
See How \' ou Save! 

Bt>low ,\rt' .\pproximate Distanct>s 
to our Stort'. 

Garrett. :1 :\Iiles 
Hindman. I:! .'llil~·~ 
IIUt')S\·illt>.:; ,\til{'.., 

Langlt'y . 7 :\liles I ackt·) & \lousil'. 1 :\lile 
:\tartin, 12 :\lites \Jri>o\\4'11, !l .\Iiles 

~Pippa Pas!;es, 7 :\Iiles 
J>restonsbu~g. 22 :\Iiles Topmost. 7 Miles 
Salyt>rsville, 2:; :\liles Wa\land . .t :\Iiles 
Whe£'1wright, 12 .'1-liJ(•s • 

Hy-Top 

ICE CREAM 
'h-G••-99e 

TRACK DOWN 
OUR BEST-IN-THE 
AREA FOOD BUYS! 

Field Trial 

Mcintosh 

APPLES 

Section Two, Page Five 

DOLE 

PINEAPPLES Sliced or _20:0z. 5 9e 
- - Chunks - .. S1ze 

GREEN GIANT 
Cream Style> 317-0z $1 

GOLDEN CORN <Whoi:Kernet Cans. 

OLD VIRGINIA 

APPLESAUCE _ .~ 33~~~~sze$ 1 °0 

FIRESIDE 

FIG BARS ________ ~~;:99e 
AUNT JEMIMA 

PANCAKE MIX ___ 28~~·69e 
CHEF BOY ·AR-DEE 

RAVIOLI Cheese 1S-Oz.59e 
_ _ or Beef _ ·- ·- Can 

COFFEE-MATE 

CREAMER 16-oz.$ 
- ...... - _ -- - . Jar 

Red Tokay 

GRAPES 
Lb.59e 

PUR EX 
BLEACH 

G.~.59e 
With Coupon Limit One 

and $10 Order. 

3-Lb. Bag 

CANDY 
BARS 

Mounds, Almond Joy, 
Power House, Peanut Butter 

6-Pk.8 Pkg. 

Maxwell House Hy-Top 

INSTANT TEA 
COFFEE BAGS 

1~'-389 c!~~~ 189 

EXTRA SAVINGS 

WITH 
SUPERIOR'S 

COUPON 
SPECIALS! 

-- ·((·111l·]: •· ~., 
S if 

• I 
w tn1ng 1 

SHORTENING : 
I 

4~~:· 99c : 
LIMITONE I 

With This Coupon & $10 Order .1 
Valid at Superior Market 1 

Wed. thru Sun .• Sept. 17, 1978. 1 ________ .... ,..., 
-- ·1(·1114·):1·- ~ .---l\·1'1~·):1-, 

P I I C y· I urex 1 1 ountry 1me 1 

BLEACH : : LEMONADE MIX : 

59 
1 I Lemon-Lime 1 

Gal. C : I 10-Qt. $1 59 I 
LIMIT ONE 1 I Size • I 

With This Coupon & $10 Order. 1 I With This Coupon. I 
Valid at Superior Market 1 1 Valid at Superior Market I 

Wed. thru Sun., Sept. 17, 1978 . ..) f Wed. thru Sun., Sept. 17, 1978J 

--~-------- ----------i-- ·1(·11);.]:1·-, .--·l(·llfit·):l·-, 
1 I I I 
1 LUX 1 1 Mrs. Butterworth's I 

: DISH LIQUID : I SYRUp : 
I 32:0z. 99C I I $1 49 I 
: S1ze f : ~~~~~ • : 
I With This Coupon. : I With This Coupon. I 
: Valid at Superior Market I 1 . Valid at Superior Market I 

Wed. thru Sun .• Sept.l7, 1978._. I Wed. thru Sun .• Sept.17, 1978.J 

~-------~-- ----------
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Obituaries 
Milford Tackett 

Milford Tackett, 67, of Allen, passed 
away Thursday at the Highlands 
Regional Medical Center after a short 
Illness. 

A retired carpenter, :\tr. Tackett was 
born Nov. 6, 1910, at Penny, in Pike 
county, a son of Sid and Ida Buchanon 
Tackett. He was a member of the Masons 
and a veteran of the U.S. Army. His wife, 
Otta Damron Tackett, is deceased. 

Survivors include two daughters, 
Linda Wright, of Allen, and Odette 
Lovett, Los Angeles, Cal.; two brothers, 
James Tackett, Orlando, Fla., and Sid 
Tackett, Jr., of Coco, Beach, Fla. ; four 
sisters, Margie Van Hoose of Ashland, 
Mildred Van Hoose of Somerset, Beatrice 
Goff of Hampton, Va. , Naomi Cox of 
Circleville, 0., and four grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be held at 1 p.m. 
Sunday at Hall Brothers Funeral Home 
Rev. Ed Bowes and Father Wilha~ 
Poole officiating. 

Woodman Crider 
. Woodman Crider, 64, of Prestonsburg, 

died last Thursday at Highlands 
Regional Medical Center following a long 
illness. 

::\-lr. Crider had been associated with 
Crider Brothers Tire Service which he 
owned and operated with his brothers. 
Born March 18, 1914 at Edgar, he was a 
son of the late Jake and Cora McGuire 
Crider. He was a veteran of World War II 
and a member of DA V Garrett Chapter 
128. 

Surviving are his wife, Marie; 2 sons, 
Charles and Bill Crider, both of 
Prestonsburg; a daughter, Mrs . Joann 
Hunt, of Prestonsburg; 2 brothers, 
Marvin Crider, of Prestonsburg, and 
Arson Crider, of Van Lear; a sister, Mrs. 
Anis G<>ble, of Prestonsburg ; and eight 
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted 
Sunday at the Floyd Funeral Home in 
Prestonsburg. Burial followed in the 
family cemetery at Auxier, ministers 
John Frank Ratliff and Alex Patton of­
ficiating. 

Arlene Akers Newsome 
Arlene Akers Newsome, 80, of Dana, 

passed away Monday at the Methodist 
hospital of Pikeville. Born June 20, 1898 
she was the daughter of the late Sil and 
Elsa Conn Akers of Floyd county. She 
was a member of the Dana Church of 
God. 

Mrs. Newsome's husband, James Dock 
Newsome, is deceased. Survivors are one 
son, Edward Newsome, Vermilion, 0 .; 
four daughters, Mrs. Eva Hunt of 
Stanville, ~Irs . Anna May Crum' of 
Martin, Mrs. Geneva Boyd and Mrs. 
Be.rnice Crum, both of Dana, 37 grand­
children and 58 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be conducted at 
12 noon Thursday at the residence with 
Church of God ministers officiating. 
Burial will follow in the Newsome 
cemetery at Dana under the direction of 
Hall Bros. Funeral Home. 

Maggie Hatfield Stricklin 
Maggie Hatfield Stricklin, 73, of the 

Alley Fork near East Point died 
Tuesday, Sept 5. The daughter of the late 
Jerry and Louise Clark Hatfield, she 
was born Nov. 22, 1904. She was a 
member of the Church of G<>d. 

Survivors are her husband Pat 
Stricklin; four sons, Albert, of' East 
Point, Henry and Jerry, both of 
P.restonsburg, and Lindsey, of Green­
VIlle, S.C.; one daughter, Alpha Stricklin, 
of Columbus, 0 . ; one brother, Anderson 
Hatfield, of Prestonsburg; one sister, 
Alpha Wells, of Cleveland, 0.; 18 grand­
children and one great-grandchild. 

Funeral services were conducted 
Friday at the Little Paint Church of God 
n:inisters Dewey Earl Music and Roy 
Tmcher officiating. Burial was made in 
the ~overnment Relocation cemetery at 
AuXIer under the direction of Carter 
Funeral Home. 

Felmon P. Blackmon 
Felmon P. Blackmon, 63, of 

Wheelwright, succumbed to a sudden 
illness . Saturday at the McDowell Ap­
palachian Regional hospital. Born in 
Boston, Mass., Feb. 21, 1915, he was the 
son of the late William and Molly Black­
mon, and came to this area in 1947. 

Mr. Blackmon was a retired miner 
with the Inland Steel Co . and a member of 
the Masons of Wheelwright. He was also 
a leader of the Development Club of 
Wheelwright, of the Boy Scouts and was a 
member of the NAACP and the Friend­
ship B~ptist Church of Wheelwright. 
S~v1vors are his wife, Willie Lee 

Lew1s Blackmon, Wheelwright· two 
daughters, Mrs. Mary Ellen Gato~ and 
Mrs. Valdie Delores Madison, both of 
Boston; and four grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be held today 
<Wed:) at 2 ~.m. at the Friendship 
Baptist church m Wheelwright, ministers 
~·~· . Terry and Walter Taylor of· 
f1C1atmg. Burial will be In the Davidson 
~emo.rial Gardens at Ivel under the 
d1rechon of Merion Funeral Home. 

Rev. Johnny Huffman 
The Rev. Johnny Huffman, 58, former 

pastor of the Methodist churches of 
Maytown, Salisbury, and Martin, passed 
away Friday in Albany, Ky., after an 
extended illness. Rev. Huffman trans­
!erred from his Martin church to Albany 
m June of this year . 

Survivors are his wife, Ozell, and three 
sons, Danny, of Martin, Phillip, in the 
U.S. Army, and Mark, at home. 

Funeral services were held at the First 
Methodist Church in Albany and burial 
was made in Memor1al Hill cemetery 
there. 

Sylvia Elliott 
Sylvia Elliott, 60, of East 1\lcDowell 

died Tuesday, Sept. 5, at .:\fcDoweli 
Appalachian Regional Hospital after 
an extended illness. 

Born Oct. 22, 1917, in McDowell, Mrs. 
Elliott was the daughter of the late 
Nelson and Laura Adkins Caudill. Her 
husband, Victor Elliott, preceded her in 
death in 1973. 

Survivors include two sons, Willie 
Elliott, of Drift, and Archie Elliott, of 
Geneva, 0.; two daughters, Joann Paige 
of E. McDowell, and Gloria Fay 
Balcomb, of Ashtabula, 0 .; three sisters, 
Chlora Akers, of East McDowell, Maudie 
Osborne, of Paintsville, and Josie 
Osborne, of Geneva, 0 , and eight 
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were held Friday at 
the home .Qf the deceased with Regular 
Baptist ministers officiating. 

Burial followed in the Greenbury Hall 
cemetery in East McDowell. 

Mrs. Hattie Jacobs 
.Mrs. Hattie Jacobs, 70, of Pippa 

Passes, died at her home Wednesday, 
September 6 after being stricken with a 
sudden illness. She was the daughter of 
the late Clay Huff and Belle Slone Huff. 

Survivors include her husband, Canton 
Jacobs; five sons, Levon Jacobs and 
.:\fcArthur Jacobs, both of Martin, 
Gayland Jacobs, Henry C. Jacobs, and 
Robert Lee Jacobs, all of Pippa Passes; 
six daughters, Avonell Slone, of Garner, 
Philipie Wicker and Janice Smith, both of 
Pippa Passes, Betty Sue Beckner, Joyce 
Bentley, and Genevieve Wagers , all of 
London; three brothers, Clarence Huff, 
of Wayland, Marl Huff, of Hindman, and 
Harold Huff, of Sabina, Ohio. One sister, 
Allie Jacobs, of Pippa Passes; and 23 
grandchildren and two great­
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted at 
her home on Saturday September 9, at 11 
a.m., with Bert Hall, Bill Tackett, and 
Mitchell Chaffins officiating. Burial 
followed in the Bald Point cemetery 
under the direction of Hindman Funeral 
Home. 

George E. Jon as 
George E . Jonas, educator and 

philanthropist, died August 25 in 
Rhinebeck, New York, at the age of 80. 

Mr. Jonas founded Camp Rising Sun, 
an international scholarship camp for 
gifted young men which has been at­
tended each summer since 1966 by Floyd 
county boys. 

In recognition of his work, the Dutch 
Government awarded him the highest 
honor it bestows upon a foreign national, 
the Order of Orange Nassau, presented 
by Queen Juliana. In November 1977 
Columbia College, Mr. Jonas' alma 
mater, honored him with the Alexander 
Hamilton Medal, its highest alumni 
award. 

As founder of the summer camp, Mr. 
Jonas was for almost five decades the 
benefactor of some 2000 promising 
youths of all backgrounds from various 
parts of the United States and from '$7 
foreign nations. 

John Wesley Combs 
John Wesley Combs, 58, died Friday in 

Lexington, where he resided and worked 
as a public accountant. 

A native of Knott county, he was the 
son of the late Monroe and Lula Adkins 
Combs. He was a member of the National 
Society of Public Accountants, Devotions 
Lodge 160, F . & A.M., Olieka Temple, and 
was a World War II veteran. 

Survivors are his wife, Blanche Bailey 
C~mbs, of Lexington; one daughter, Mrs. 
Michael L. Adams, Lexington · one son 
John Warren Combs, Jenki~s · thre~ 
sisters, Mrs. Bartee Estep and M;s. B. L. 
Click, both of Hindman, and Mrs. Clyde 
Breeding, Lexington ; and four grand­
children. 

Funeral services were conducted 
Monday at the W .R. Milward Mortuary­
Southland. 

Minerva Meade Moore 
Minerva Meade Moore, 76, of West 

Prestonsburg, passed away Saturday, 
Sept. 9. She was the daughter of the late 
Richard and Sara Sparks Meade and was 
born June 28, 1902. She was a member of 
the Freewill Baptist church. 
M~rried twice, her husbands preceded 

her m death; they were Homer Hamilton 
and Dewey Moore. Survivors are one son 
Bill Hamilton ; one stepdaughter, Mrs: 
Betty Mietl, San Diego, Calif.; one 
grandson, one step-grandson, and one 
great-grandson. 

The funeral was held Monday at the 
Carter Funeral Home Chapel with Rev. 
Henry Crider officiating. Burial followed 
in the Music and Akers cemetery at 
Bonaza. 

Willie McCarey 
~illie McCarey, 78-year~ld retired 

mmer of Wheelwright, died Sunday at the 
McDowell Appalachian Regional 
hospital. 

The body is at Merion Funeral Home 
where friends may call . 

Physical Assessments 
Slated by Health Care 

The B.ig Sand~ Health Care screening 
te~m Will be-domg physical assessments 
at 1ts Prestonsburg clinic, Sept. 13 and 14. 
The. assessment will include vision 
te~tmg, hearing testing, hematocrit, 
unne testing and a complete physical 
exam. 

.If a medical card is brought, the child 
w1ll be seen without charge · otherwise a 
fee is charged. The legal g~ardian m~t 
be present for the child to be seen. 

The Floyd County Times Section Two, Page Six 
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Dance To Be Held 
Davis Memorial Fund 

Area residents will have a chance to 
enjoy themselves and contribute to a 
worthy cause Saturday night, Sept. 23, at 
a dance sponsored by the Charles Davis 
Memorial Trust Fund at the National 
Guard Armory, near here. 

The fund was originally established to 
raise money to help pay the costs of a 
heart transplant for 16-year-old Charles 
Davis, of Van Lear, son of the Rev. Orin 
Davis. The youth died last month before 
he was able to receive the transplant. 

Miss Billie Post, social services 
director at Highlands Regional Medical 
Center here, and one of the directors of 
the Memorial Trust Fund, said efforts to 
raise money for the fund will continue. 

"Money raised will be used to help 
other area residents in life-threatening 
situations who are not otherwise able to 
get medical care," according to Miss 
Post. 

The Spring Water Band of Prestons­
burg will provide the entertainment, 
featuring both rock and country music. 
The band has donated their services for 
the dance. The dance will be held from 
8:00 p.m. until midnight at the National 
Guard Armory in Prestonsburg which 
has also been donated for the night. 

Notice to Public of 
Request for Release of Funds 

THE SECTION 407 
FLOOD DISASTER PROGRAM 

APPLICANT: 
Floyd County and City of Prestons­

burg, Kentucky, in care of Anna Jean 
Tackett, Coordinator, Prestonsburg C.D. 
Agency, 6 Court Street West Prestons· 
bur, Kentucky 41653 
TO ALL INTERESTED AGENCIES 
GROUPS, AND PERSONS: ' 

On or about September 23, 1978, Floyd 
County and the City of Prestonsburg will 
request the U.S. Department of Housing 
and Urban Development to release 
federal funds under Title I of the Housing 
and Community Development Act of 
1974 <as amended) to be used for the 
Section 407 Flood Disaster Program. 
PROJECT DESCRIPTION: 

The applicant proposes to provide 
assistance to households on the HUD 
Disaster Field Office <DFO) case load on 
a priority basis. Such efforts include 
assistance in leasing mobile home sites 
and provision of water, sewer, and site 
preparation to accommodate the mobile 
home. The second priority includes 
relocation of mobile homes out of group 
sites for which license by state 
authorities is unavailable. For those 
families, th'e above noted in­
frastructure will be provided plus 
minimal transport and set-up costs. 
(Transport will be provided by the DFO 
for families still on the DFO case load.) If 
funds remain, a third level of assistance 
will be provided for those already 
relocated into unsatisfactory cir­
cumstances. The total grant amount is 
budgeted at $160,000. 

An Environmental Review Record 
respecting the project has been made by 
Floyd County and the city of Prestons­
burg which documents the en­
vironmental review of the project. This 
Environmental Review Record is on file 
at the above address and is available for 
public examination and copying, upon 
request, at the PRESTONSBURG 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT OF­
FICE during normal working hours. 
Floyd County and the city of Prestons­
burg will undertake the project described 
above with Block Grant funds from the 
U.S. Department of Housing and Urban 
Development <HUD). Floyd County and 
the city of Prestonsburg is certifying to 
HUD that Floyd County and the city of 
Prestonsburg and Yvonne s. Jones in her 
official capacity as Judge-Executive of 
Floyd County and Harold Cooley in his 
official capacity as Mayor of the city of 
Prestonsburg, consent to accept the 
jurisdiction of the federal courts if an 
action is brought to enforce respon· 
sibilities in relation to environmental 
reviews, decision-making, and action; 
and that these responsibilities have been 
satisfied. The legal effect of the cer­
tification is that, upon its approval, Floyd 
County and the city of Prestonsburg may 
use the Block Grant funds, and HUD will 
have satisfied its responsibilities under 
the National Environmental Policy Act 
of 1969. HUD will accept an objection to 
its approval of the release of funds and 
acceptance of the certification only if it is 
on one of the following basis : (a) that the 
certification was not in fact executed by 
the chief executive officer or other of· 
ficer of applicant approved by HUD; or 
(b ) that the applicant's environmental 
review record for the project indicates 
omission of a required decision, finding, 
or step applicable to the project in the 
environmental review process. Ob· 
jections must be prepared and submitted 
in accordance with the required 
procedure (24CFR, Part 58) and may be 
addressed to the Federal Department of 
Housing and Urban Development at P.O. 
Box 1044, Louisville, Ky. 40201. Ob· 
jections to the release of funds on basis 
other than those stated above will not be 
considered by HUD. No objections 
rece~ved after September 30, 1978, will be 
cons1dered by HUD. 

CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICERS 
Yvonne S. Jones, Judge-Executive 

Floyd County, Ky. 
Harold Cooley, Mayor 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 
lt. 

Constitution Week is being celebrated 
September 17th through 23rd. In the 
Preamble of the Constitution of the 
United States, our founding fathers wrote 
their purpose, ''to secure the blessings of 
liberty to themselves and their 
posterity . " The Daughters of the 
American Revolution recommend 
teaching our youth the virtues of and a 
dedication to the preservation of our 
American heritage. 

KMA Annual Meeting 
Slated in Lexington 

More than 2,400 Kentucky physicians, 
guests and allied health professionals are 
expected to attend the 128th annual 
meeting of the Kentucky Medical 
Association to be held at the Lexington 
Convention Center, Sept. 25-28. 

The AssociatiOn's top policy-making 
body, the House of Delegates, will meet 
September 25 and again on September 27 
to consider business matters affecting 
the medical profession in Kentucky. 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 
Sealed bids will be received by the 

Church Housing Association of Prestons· 
burg, Inc., Prestonsburg, Kentucky, on a 
197R Model One-Half Ton Fleetside 
P1ckup Truck, 6 Cylinder Engine at the 
Housing Office, Green Acres, P;estons· 
burg, Kentucky, until 4:00 p.m., Sep­
tember 13, 1978, at which time bids will 
be publicly opened and read aloud for 
furnishing labor and materials 'and 
perfon:ning all work as set forth by this 
advertisement, for bids. Specifications 
can be obtained from the Housmg Office, 
Green Acres, Prestonsburg, Kentucky. 

:\1rs. Sue 1\lay, of Prestonsburg is pictured with two of her paintings which are 
currently on display at the Floyd County Library here. The exhibit, which will 
run through Sept. 23, al o includes works in water color, pencil and charcoal. 

Bids received after the scheduled 
closing time for reception of bids will be 
returned unopened to the bidder. Bids 
must be accompanied by a bid bond, 
payable to the Church Housing 
Association of Prestonsburg, Inc. in an 
amount not less than 5 percent of the base 
bid on the truck. 

BAPTIST W0:\1E:'\ MEET 
Women of Irene Cole Memorial Baptist 

Church met at the home of Mrs. Lois 
Williams, Monday evening, Sept. 4. The 
president, Mrs. Julia Curtiss, presided at 
the business session. In a candlelight 
service, Mrs. Janice Pack, used the 
theme, "Ye are the ligh l of the world," 
from Matt. 5:14, when she mstalled the 
following officers and leaders for the 
year 1978-'79: President, Mrs. Patsy 
Evans; vice-president, Mrs. Pat Minns; 
secretary, Mrs. Helen Clark; treasurer, 
Mrs. Julia Harrington ; program 
chairman, Mrs. Shirley Branham ; 
pr:'ly~r chairman, Mrs. Lucy Regan; 
m•ss1on study chairman, Mrs. Ruth 
Isbell; mission in action chairman, Mrs. 
Opal Dingus. Following the meeting the 
hostess served a desert course to 
Mesdames Nawonie Conley, Deliah 
Nolan, Myrtle Peters, and Pearl Crum, 
and members, Mesdames Janice Pack 
Patsy Evans, Pat Minns, Helen Clark: 
Julia Curtis, Eva Collins, Lucy Ransdell 
Docia Woods, Charlene Nunn, Luc; 
Regan, Beatrice Collins, and Opal 
Dingus. 

IN LEXINGTON HOSPITAL 
Mrs. FannieS. Jarrell is a patient at St. 

Joseph's Hospital, Lexington. Mrs. 
Jarrell's room number.is 426. She would 
be glad to hear from her relatives and 
friends . 

HAVE HOUSEGUESTS 
Mr. and Mrs. Victor Hale had as their 

houseguests last week her sisters, Mrs. 
H. T. Parrish, of Stamping Ground, and 
Mrs. Belva Hockensmith, of Lexington, 
and her niece, Miss Michelle Hamilton 
of Seattle, Washington. During the Labo; 
Day week-end Mr. and Mrs. Hale had 
with them, their daughter, Mrs. George 
Letton, Mr. Letton and daughter, Laura, 
of Dayton, Ohio. 

The first proposal for federal 
legisl~tion to provide old age pensions 
w~s - m 1907, made by Congressman 
Wilham B. Wilson <D-Pa.), who became 
the first Secretary of Labor in 1913 ac­
cording to the U.S. Labor Depart~ent 
booklet, "Labor Firsts in America." 

Gabe Kaplan, 
CF Chairman 
Gabnel Kaplan, perhaps better known 

as "Kotter" to the millions who view his 
television series, has once again renewed 
his commitment to the Cystic Fibrosis 
Foundation by accepting the National 
Chairmanship for 1978. 

Early in the year Kaplan met with 
National foster child Robbyn Fox, to 
make the CFF's educational and fund· 
raising TV and radio spots which are 
currently being aired. 

Approximately one of every 1,500 
babies are born with Cystic Fibrosis, 
which is still incurable. C·F is inherited 
when both parents are carriers of the 
recessive gene which causes C·F. It is 
believed that ten million Americans are 
symptomless carriers of this gene. 
Current research funded by the Cystic 
Fibrosis Foundation is seeking a prac­
tical test to identify these carriers, as 
well as a cure for C-F and better methods 
of treatment for all lung-damaging 
diseases. 

In event an award is made and the 
successful bidder falls to execute con· 
tract for performance of the work under 
the award then the bid bond shall be 
forfeited as liquidated damages for such 
fa1lure. 

Bids and bid bonds shall be in a sealed 
envelope bearing the bidder's iden­
tification, addressed to the Church 
Housing Association of Pre. tonsburg , 
Inc., P .O Box 230, Prestonsburg, Ken· 
tucky 41653labeled m the lower left-hand 
corner: 

"Proposal No. 1: 1978 One-Half Ton 
Pickup Truck, Fleetside Bed, 6 Cylinder 
Engine" 

The Church Housing Association of 
Pr.estonsburg, Inc. reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids, which bids shall not 
be withdrawn for 45 days subsequent to 
the opening of bids, without consent of 
the Church Housing Association of 
Prestonsburli!:, Inc. 

JULIA M . MAY, AGENT, 
Church Housmg Association 

of Prestonsburg, Inc. 
B-30-tf. 

CREG DAMRON'S 
FURNITURE PLANTATION 

Phone 437-4390 So. Mayo Trail Pikeville 

OPEN TILL 9 P.M., MON. THRU SAT. 

Open Monday thru Saturday, 
7 :30·5; Sunday. 7:30-3 

PHONE 874-9218 
ALLEN, KY. 

PRE-SEASON 

SPECIALS! 

•68 LATEX HOUSl PAIIfl 
WOOO 01 MASMY 

1161 Willi 

SALE 
PRICI<: '1.99 
PREVENT 
FROZEN PIPES 

WRAP. ON 
SOU[]·C~ACUIT 
HEAT 

3- to 15-Ft. In Stock 
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ADVER TISEO ITEM POLICY 
Each of these advert•sed •terns •s requ11ed to be read•ly 
available for sale 1n each Kroger Store . e.cept as 
spec1f1cally noted 1n th1s ad If we do run out of an adver 
t1sed •tern, we w1ll oHer you your cho•· a of a compardble 
•tern, when ava•lable, reflect•ng the same sav1ngs or a ra•n 
check wh1ch Will en IItie you to purchase the advertised •te,.., 
11 the advertised pnce w1th1n 30 davs 

TOTAL SATISFACTION GUARANTEE 
Everythong you buy at Kroger IS guaranteeo for your total 
Mtlsfacuon regardless of manufacturer 11 you arP. not 
sat1sfoed, Kroger w1ll replace your 1tem with the same brand 

a comparable brand or refund your purchase pnce • 

KROGER 20-0Z. ROUND TOP 

White 
Bread ............. . 

~ 

You Can Depend On 

COPYRIGHT 1978-THE KROGER CO. ITEMS AND 
GOOD SUNDAY SEPTEM8ER 10 THRU SATURDAY SEPTEM· 
BER 16. 1978 IN PIKEVILLE. WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO liMIT 
QUANTITIES. NONE SOLO TO DEAI.ERS, 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES. 
TO DEALERS. 

Kroger Welcomes 
Your Federal 
Food Stamps 

Iceberg 
Head Lettuce 

$ 
- ---

C0\'1 
cou'o" 
~ 

I 
I 
I • I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

OF 

Section Two, Page Seven 

5 
-lb. 
Bag 

Pillsbury 
Flour 

c 
LIMIT 1 BAG WITH COUPON AND $7.50 ADDITIONAL PURCHASE 

(EXCLUDING THIS ITEM) 
liMIT ONE COUPON PER FAMII Y 

COUPON COOD SUM OAT mT 10 THRU SATURDAY SEPT 16 1971 
SUIJ£CT TO A,PliCUL£ SUH & lDClliUES 

4 
WITH COUPON AND 

12 

THE PURCHASE OF ONE 12-CT. PKG • 

Freezer Pleezer 
Twin Pops 

12 I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

,$ Vac Pak 
Kroger Coffee 

a$ 99 
R~i~;t $ 
Baking 

29! \ KV 

c~~ .... 
COUPOII COOO SIINOU SEPT. 10 TMRU SATURDAY SEI'T 16. 1971 

SUBJECT TO APPl1ClltE STilE & lOCAl TAXES 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

0: 
-lb. 
Can 

Kroger 
Grade A 
Large Eggs ..... Doz. 

Kroger 
Cottage 24_

01
• 

Cheese ............ ctn. 
HOLLY FARMS, U.S.D.A. INSPECTED 

Mixed 
Fryer 
Parts ................ lb. 

1~-17-LB. AVG. 

Whole Fresh 
Pork 

Sliced 
Fill Into Chop• 

In One 
L • c""~nt Oln .................. Take Home Pkt. lb • 

FROM THE MEAT DEPT. 
FROZEN TURkEY. 

IEEF OR 
CHICkEN 

Jiffy 
Pot Pies 

Potatoes .......... . 
Flame Red 
Tokay 
Grapes .............. ro. 

Crisco 
Oil 

Del Monte 
Fruit 17•01 

Cocktail ....... Cans 

BoneleJs Top 
Sirloin teak 

$ 9 
USDA 
CHOICE 

19 

co~, 

(~ 2·1.8. ROll ... $2.37 

c: Gunnoe's 
Country Sausage 

12 I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

$ 19 
1-lb. 
Roll 

LIMIT 2 LBS. WITH COUPON AND $7 .50 ADDITIONAL PURCHASE I 
(EXCLUDING THIS ITEM) I 

~ OF liMIT ONE COUPON PER FAMII Y e I 
I couPON cooo SUNDAY sEPT 10 THRU SATURDAY mr 16 1971 1 1 

• I I SUBJECT ro APPliCAill mn ' tom uns •••••••••••••••••••••••••• 
(') -~ KROGER 

O.:..~'t1 Hi Nu 2% 
if.,"' ·c,~ 

0.5% Lowfat 
Kroger Milk ~~v Lowfat Milk -

Gal.$ 
Paper 
Ctn. 

$ 
Gal. 
Plastic 
Ctn. 

FROZEN 

Fres-Shore 
Perch Fillets 

1-lb.$ S9 
FROZEN Pkg. 

Fres-Shore $1 3 9 
ft~k 'N' Batter...... 1~k;~· 

~r::t.~:~:............ ~:k;~· $1 o9 
FROZEN 

Dozen Packed $199 
Stuffed Clams. . . . . . . 3:ic;~· 

~~~: $329 
FROZEN 

Fres-Shore Breaded 
Butterfly Shrimp ... 
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Kentucky Fishing Report 
Frankfort, Ky., Sept. 11-Reports from 

the state's 15 major lakes indicate that 
anglers willing to fish early and late and 
deep can expect fair to good stringers of 
crappie and black bass. The lake-by-lake 
rundown, as compiled by the Kentucky 
Department of Fish and Wildlife 
Resources: 

CUMBERLAND-Crappie fair to good 
over submerged cover on the upper lake 
and in deep coves on the lower lake in 20 
to 30 feet of water; black bass fair early 
and late on the lower lake still fishing 
crawfish off rocky points, early mornings 
on the upper lake on surface lures and by 
trolling deep runners with some walleye 
off deep banks and points; white bass fair 
on the lower lake in jumps and by trolling 
deep runners off deep banks and points; 
in tailwaters, trout good with scattered 
limits; clear to murky to muddy, falling, 
25 feet below the timberline and 82 
degrees. 

BARREN-Crappie fair to good over 
submerged cover in 8 - 12 feet of water; 
black bass good on the lower lake casting 
artificial nightcra wlers and still fishing 
crawfish off deep points, deep drop-offs 
and submerged road beds; in tailwaters, 
trout fair; clear to murky, stable at pool 
and 79 degrees. 

LAUREL-Trout good at night still 
fishing worms and nightcrawlers off 
deep banks; crappie fair around stick 
ups; clear, falling slowly, six feet below 
power pool and 79 degrees. 

GREEN-White bass good trolling 
deep runners over flats; bluegill fair off 
points and over drop-offs and submerged 
cover ; in tail waters, trout fair; clear, 
stable at pool and 80 degrees. 

ROUGH RIVER-Crappie fair to good 
over submerged cover and around stick 
ups ; black bass slow to fair on artificial 
nightcrawlers off points and over drop­
offs; clear, stable at pool and 85 degrees. 

HERRINGTON-Crappie fair over 
submerged cover and around stick ups; 
black bass fair late afternoons on ar-

THE BEATITUDES 
From The Sermon on the Mount : 
Blessed are the poor in spirit: for 

their's is the kingdom of heaven. 
Blessed are they that mourn: for 

they shall be comforted. 
Blessed are the meek: for they 

shall inherit the earth. 
Blessed are they which do hunger 

and thirst after righteousness: 
for they shall be filled. 

Blessed are the merciful for they 
shall obtain mercy. 

Blessed are the pure in heart: for 
they shall see God. 

Blessed are the peacemakers: for 
they shall be called the children 
of God. 

Blessed are they which are per­
secuted for righteousness' sake: 
for their's is the kingdom of 
heaven. 

Blessed are ye, when men shall 
revile you, and persecute you, 
and say all manner of evil 
against you falsely, for my sake. 

Rejoice, and be exceeding glad: 
for great is your reward in 
heaven: for so persecuted they 
the prophets which were before 
you. 

Ye are the salt of the earth: but if 
the salt have lost his savour, 
wherewith shall it be salted? it is 
thenceforth good for nothing but 
to be cast out, and to be trodden 
under foot of men. 

Ye are the light of the world. A city 
that is set on an hill cannot be 
hid. 

Neither do men light a candle, and 
put it under a bushel, but on a 
candlestick; and it giveth light 
unto all that are in the house. 

Let your light so shine before men, 
that they may see your good 
works, and glorify your Father 
which is in heaven. 

<Submitted and paid for by Lucille 
Sparks Montgomery) 

tificial nightcrawlers in inlets and bays 
and off deep banks; clear, stable, two 
feet above pool and 78 degrees. 

BUCKHORN Bluegill fair in inlets 
and bays; black bass fair on crank baits 
off deep points. in tail waters, catfish and 
trout slow; clear, stable at pool and 81 
degrees. 

KENTUCKY -Sauger fair trolling 
deep runners and drifting minnows over 
ridge tops; black bass fair on spinner 
baits off rocky points. in inlets and bays 
and over stump beds; in tailwaters, 
catfish and sauger fair; clear, stable, 2.5 
feet below pool and 81 degrees. 

BARKLEY-Biack bass fair on sur­
face lures and artificial nightcrawlers in 
inlets and bays; crappie slow to fair and 
improving over submerged cover and 
drop-offs; in tailwaters, catfish and 
crappie fair; clear to murky, stable, 
three feet below pool and 80 degrees. 

CAVE RUN-Musky fair on deep 
runners casting in timbered coves and 
trolling over main channel; black bass 
slow late afternoons and at night on livf7 
and artificial nightcrawlers off deep 
banks; clear, stable, two feet below pool 
and 82 degrees. 

DALE HOLLOW-White bass fair on 
plunker and fly combination 1n the 
jumps; crappie slow ovt:r submerged 
cover; clear, falling, 4.5 feet below pool 
and 81 degrees. 

FISHTRAP-Crappie fair and white 
bass slow still fishing minnows over 
submerged cover and around stick ups; 
clear, stable at pool and 83 degrees. 

NOLIN-White bass slow trolling deep 
runners over flats; black bass slow at 
night on artificial nightcrawlers over 
drop-offs; in tailwaters, trout fair; clear, 
stable at pool and 82 degrees. 

GRAYSON-Black bass slow and im­
proving on medium deep runners and 
spinner baits off mud banks and over 
submerged cover; ctappie slow around 
stick ups; in tailwaters, trout fair; clear, 
stable at pool and 80 degrees. 

DEWEY-Crappie slow around sub­
merged tree tops and stick ups; clear to 
murky to muddy, rising, six inches above 
pool and 82 degrees. 

County Schools Begin 
Head Start Enrollment 

All parents interested in enrolling their 
children in the Head Start program for 
four-year-olds are invited to come to the 
following schools on the dates given: 
Osborne elementary school, Tuesday, 
Sept. 12, from 9 - 2:40; Garrett 
elementary school, Wednesday, Sept. 13, 
from 9- 2:40; Clark elementary school, 
Thursday, Sept. 14, from 8- 2:40; Martin 
elementary school, Friday, Sept. 15, 
from 8- 2:40; Stumbo elementary school, 
Monday, Sept. 18, from 9 - 2:40. 

All interested parents are to bring with 
them one of the following forms for 
verification of income: individual tax 
form 1040, W-2 form, paystubs or pay 
envelopes, written statements from 
employers, or documents showing 
current status as recipients of public 
assistance. 

If you have any questions about what 
information to bring and eligibility, 
please call Vicki Ann Steele at the Floyd 
County Board of Education, 886-2354. 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
The Floyd County Board of Education 

will receive bids for publication of THE 
FLOYD COUNTIAN, county schools 
annual, for the 1978-'79 school year, until 
12 noon September 27, 1978. All who are 
interested may contact Ulysus C. Horne 
at the Board's central office building in 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky for 
specifications. 

The Board reserves the right to reject 
any and all bids. 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD 
OF EDUCATION 

E.P. GRIGSBY, JR., SUPT. 
9-5-3t. 

8x10 

PORTRAIT 

You Pay 50c Handling Fee 

NO APPOINTMENT NECESSARY 

Additional Subjects $1.00 Each Head - Group or Individual 
limit One (1) Free Sitting Per Family 

Must Select Free Portrait Personally 

Charges for Mailing $1 .00 if No Additional Prints are Desired 

Minors Must Be Accompanied By Parents 

DUOIMAGf 

PORTRAITS 

AVAILABLE 

Thompson's I CiA Foodliner 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

Wednesday & Thursday, Sept. 2U-tl 
Daily: ll:OOa.m. till 7:00p.m. 

Allen Central Rebels 
Down Knott Patriots 
In Two Overtimes 

The Allen Central Rebels football 
squad defeated the Knott county Patriots 
26-20 on Wednesday in two overtimes on 
the Patriots' home field. 

PUBLIC HEARING 
Floyd County 
Prestonsburg 

Section 407 Flood Disaster Program 
Will be held at the Floyd County 

Courthouse Annex Conference Room on 
Thursday, September 21, 1978 at 10:00 
a.m. 

Activities to be undertaken with these 
grant funds will be discussed. 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC SALE 
A public sale will be held by The Bank 

Josephine on the 28th day of September, 
1978 at The Bank Josephine, Prestons· 
burg Branch parking lot. Time of sale, 
10:30 a.m. Sale is for the purpose of 

-~-
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Highland Avenue 
Freewill Baptist 

Church 
disposing of a 1976 Dodge Ramcharger SUNDAY 
Truck, Serial number EtOBE6X112063, SundaySchool .. - - •• 10a.m. 
belonging to J. W. Primm to satisfy a Worship Service- - - _lla.m. 
Security Agreement dated the 22nd day Evening Service - - - - 7 p.m. 
of October, 1976. The Bank Josephine WEDNESDAY The Rebels threatened four times the 

first half and managed to capitalize on 2 
of those threats with runs of 15 yards and 
10 yards out. The Rebels were successful 
on one of two 2-point conversions. Steven 
Lafferty scored the first touchdown, and 
Tom Caudill scored the second touch­
down. Darrell Allen ran for the 2-point 
conversion. 

reserves the right to bid. Terms of sale: Prayer Meeting _ _ _ • _ 7 p.m. 

___ u_. __ c_A_s~-- __________ 9:·~13:-3:t:.. -~3~-~~5~-t~r.~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

The Rebel defense held the Patriots 
scoreless the first half. 

Due to minor injuries to running backs 
Steven Lafferty and Tom Caudill in the 
second half, the Rebels were unable to 
sustain any serious offensive threats. In 
the meantime, the afternoon heat began 
to take its toll on the Rebel players. In the 
third and fourth quarters, the Patriots 
scored two touchdowns and one 2·point 
conversion, tying the game at 14-14 at the 
end of regulation time. In the first 
overtime, both teams scored a touch­
down, the Rebels on a yard run by 
Darrell Allen. Both teams missed the 2· 
point conversion. In the second overtime, 
the Rebels managed an 8-yard touch­
down, again run by Darrell Allen, to 
capture the victory. 

FRASURE FURNITURE & APPLIANCES 
North Lake Drive Prestonsburg 

BEDROOM SUITES Dresser, Mirror, $169 88 ••••••••••••·Chest, Head and Footboard••••••••••••• • 

TSO_FAs~ CHAIR, LOVE SEAT ••••••••••••• ,Au three pieces ••••••••••••• $299.88 w1n 1ze 
~~~!~cE~~~T OR BOX SPRINGS ••••••••• Your choice ••••••••••••••• $49.88 
REFRIGERATOR-FREEZER . Bot_tom Mount $499 88 14-cubic foot • •• •• • • • • • • •. •. Wh1te or Colors............. • 

The Coach Jim Hopkins and Roger 
Johnson commented that they were 
generally pleased with the overall play of 
the Rebels, but noted a few areas to be 
worked on to improve the team. 

RQEaFRIG25E~AhTOR·FREEZER •••••••••••••••• Top Mount , •••••••••••••••• $349.88 u sar -me 

~~~!~~~nfhOLOR TV • •••••• •••• •••••• Save $50 Now ••• ••••••••••••• $649.88 
The Rebels' record stands at 1-0. The 

next game the Rebels will play is against 
the Prestonsburg Blackcats on Sep­
tember 11 at 6 p.m. at the Prestonsburg 
high school football field. 

~~~a~ ~~~~h COLOR TV ............................................ $399.88 
~2~! ABLE TV. •• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • Black & White • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • $189.88 

Motor vehicles in the U.S. consume 
about 328 million gallons of gas each day, 
according to the Federal Highway Ad­
ministration. 

AUTOMATIC WASHER •••••••••••••••••• ~~-~~~ity •••••••••••••••••• $299.88 
Financing Available Phone 886-6900 Free Delivery 

FOR SALE 
RATLIFF & LENOX REAL ESTATE 

2 story-7 rms., metal roof, on 200+- ft. front lot. A real handy man's 
special, at. a sacrifice price. Located on Royal Hollow-% mile off main 
street, McDowell. 

2 dwelling houses on large lot, 150+· front feet. 
No. 1-Main dwelling-Home-1600+- sq. ft., 4 bdrms., I. rm., kit., dining 
rm., T.V. rm., plastered walls, hardwood floors partially carpeted, cent. 
heat, natural gas, city water. Full unfinished basement. 
No. 2-4 rms. up, 2-car garage down. Newly finished hardwood floors. 
Natural gas furnace. Always rented. Will make nice payment on total 
property. Also included is about 15+- acres of hill land and timber. 
Finance Hollow between Martin and Allen. 

3 bdrms. or 4, bath, kit.-dinette, I. rm., utility rm., concrete bl. basement, 
garage, storage, new gas furnace. On lot 85' front to Beaver Creek. Good 
garden in rear. Owner transferred to Covington. Immediate occupancy. 
Priced to sell, $27,500. 

Mobile home on block foundation, on large hillside lot in Prestonsburg.-One 
bedroom, completely furnished, including curtains and drapes. Good 
retirement home. 

New! 3 bedrooms, living room, kit.-dinette, laundry-utility rm., bath, 
carport, shingle roof, guttered and down spouted, fully insulated, fully 
carpeted, total electric, thermopane, interior walls insulated, plenty crawl 
room, city water, cable T.V. On school bus route-Dickey Town. IOO'xlOO' 
lot well drained, high and dry. Reduced from $37,500 to $35,500. 

4 bdrms., I. rm., kit.-dinette, utility rm., drilled well-soft water-or city 
water. Completely paneled and carpeted up and down. Metal siding, storm 
windows & doors. Garage & workshop. One of neatest in Wayland, on lot 
60'x120'. Natural gas heat. Reduced from $23,000 to $21,000 for quick sale. 

The home of Dr. Castrodad, former home of Dr. Campbell, Pres. Com. 
College. New sewer system. Not the best home In Johnson County, but in 
one of the best communities. Not on the biggest lot, but on one of the most 
attractive, rolling, high and dry and where the hiss of the breeze plays 
sweet music in the boughs of five nice pines of your own and many others 
around you. Two-story-Full height columns, front porch. Down: Garage, 
kit.-dinette, full bath, I. rm., 2 bdrms., library, family rm., utility-w.-d. 
rm.-Can be rented separately. Up : 3 bdrms., 2 baths, I. rm., d. rm., kit.· 
dinette, T.V. outlets each rm., tel. jacks each rm., fully carpeted, fully 
pannelled, fully insulated, elec. heat or nat. gas. Located off bypass 23 and 
to right off old 23 to right about 100-150 yards, on left with our sign on lawn. 
Appt. only. Yellow color. Doctor moving to Puerto Rico. Immediate 
possession. 

Quality construction-builder's own home. Spacious tri-level on level lot in 
excellent neighborhood. Living room with woodburning fireplace, dining 
area, equipped kitchen with abundance of cabinets. Three extra large bed­
rooms and 2 baths up-Family room, lh bath, bedroom and hobby or work­
shop down. Patio and front porch, double driveway. Gas heat, central air, 
brick and shingle exterior. Approx. 3.4 miles from Prestonsburg. 

Lots of space inside and out. Well kept 4-bedroom home with Bz baths. 
Extra large, well arranged kitchen, with separate utility area. Level lawn, 
plenty of parking space. Price is $32,500. Located in Auxier. 

Lot on Jack's Creek-Suitable for small home or two mobiles. 

Prestonsburg- in town location with privacy. Lovely home for young 
family or retirement couple. Three bedrooms, one and one half baths, built· 
in Sherrich kitchen, double stainless sink. Extra large living, dining area. 
Fully carpeted. Off street parking. Good sized lot- with extra landscaping 
will be a real beauty. 

Beautiful 2-story home on large lot. Down: Large I. rm., fireplace, 2 b. 
rms., T.V. rm., kit.-dinette, Jlf2 bath, extra kitchen, laundry, canning r , 
fully carpeted. Up: 4 b. rms., hardwood oak floors. Store bldg., nice 
covered grill in yard, mobile on lot, does not go with property. Nat. gas. To 
stay: curtains & drapes, gas range, window air cond. Located between 
Price and Hi Hat. 

Country living at its best-14 miles from Pbg. on beautiful John's Creek- in 
wooded area. 3 b. rms., bath, I. rm., kit., din. rm., fireplace, partial base­
ment, unlimited free gas, floor furnace, plenty soft water-drilled well. Will 
sell house and 15 acres- or 45 acres separately or together. 

Renovated home and old brick building in Allen. 50+- front feet facing on 
Railroad St .. house is three bedroom, living room, kit.-dinette, utility­
washer-dryer room. Concrete patio for outdoor living, plenty of parking 
spact', a bargain at $22,500.00. 

The Julia Davis Estate, Wheelwright, Ky. 
No. 1 Home place, 4 b. rms., closets, 11;~ bath, small store room 
(Grocery), hardwood floors, fully carpeted, utility & w.-d. rm., com­
plet'ely newly panneled, heated by natural gas floor furnace, 2 small 
porches, on front street. Pric;ed to move at $12,500.00. 
No.2, 2 b. rms., bath, I. rm., laundry rm., kit.-dinette, utility w. & d. rm. , 
hardwood oak floors, partially carpeted, shingle roof, heated by natural 
jJas floor furnace. Sacrifice at $10,000.00. 
No. 3 Apt. Bldg.-Up: 3 b. rms., kit., d. rm., liv. rm., utillty-w.-d. rm. 
Plaster & panneling, attic storage, shingle & roll roof, floor furnace, 
natural gas. Oak hardwood floors, partially carpeted, enclosed front 
porch. On large lot. 

Down: All brick, plaster painted walls, hardwood oak floors, gas floor 
furnace, 2 b. rms., I. rm., kit.-dinettP, utility rm., w.-d. room. Cheap 
maintenance. 

Reason for selling: settling an Estate. 

Modified A-frame with wrap around deck; 3 bedrooms, family room, 2 fire­
places. Central heat and air, large basement-utility, storage, workshop 
area. Stove and refrigerator and all drapes to stay. City water. Just off 
black top on Abbott Mt. 

Three bedroom home custom built for present owners and beautifully 
maintained. Lot is 150' x 300' and kitchen and dining area with fireplace 
overlook trees, shrubs and flowers. Excellent materials were used, copper 
plumbing, hardwood oak floors, partly carpeted, custom made birch 
cabinets, an abundance of storage and a cedar walk-in closet. Total elec­
tric. City water, plus own drilled well if ever needed. 

Do you want privacy, above all high water, small farm, swimming pool? 
We have it! 4 bedrooms, blt.-in kitchen, w.d . rm., large l~·rm., fully car­
peted. Natural gas furnace, city water, 2 window air cond., carpeted and 
panelled, enough flat land for two additional home sites, 12-14 A+- hill and 
timber land. Old Rt. 23, 2 mi. North of Allen. Stays-curtains & drapes, 
range, refrig., all metal siding. 

6 Rm., 2-Story Country Home, on approx. 1 acre flat land, 240' front ft. Old 
bouse ideal for "do-it-yourselfer". Sound condition. Room for 2 additional 
homes. City water in front yard. Located on Brush Creek, t 4 mi. from store 
and P.O., on school bus route. Will sell home and lot or one or two lots 
80x150, together or separately. 

Prime, high, dry building lot. Across street from Briarwood Apts., old US 
23. Zoned multi-family units if wanted. Ideal for apts. or two home sites. 
Lot 143' Hwy. " 169' deep. 

4· Yr. old brick, on lot 100'" 150' with cent. gas heat, cent. air. 3 large b. 
rms., I. rm., family rm., kit., dinette, carpeted with good quality. 
2 rented mobile spaces in rear-$100.00 rental monthly. Highest gas bill last 
winter, $27.00. Located back of Nazarene Church on old U.S. 23. Carport. 

Need a nice home? High and dry always-all city conveniences without 
city taxes. We have it! 4 b. rms., 2 full baths, kit., dining rm., I. rm. and 
T.V. rm., 1800 sq. ft., c. h. & air, fully carpeted. Down, completely finished 
will lend itself to apts. or business. Curtains and drapes, two refrigs. stay. 
On old U.S. 23, 1 mi. below Allen. Will sacrifice at $65,000. 

We will help you sell what you have to seil-and try to flnd what you want to 
buy. Appraisals and counseling. You may be selling too low and buying too 
high. 

LISTINGS EVERY OTHER WEEK. 
OFFICE PHONE: 886-6138 
We Invite You To Call Us. 

Office Hours: 9 a.m.-3:30p.m. or By Appointment 

WAYNE RATLIFF. Broker, Office, 886-6138; Home Phone 886-6059, after7 
PHYLLIS RATLIFF LENNOX, Broker and Office Manager 

I• Phone 886-8689 after 7 p.m. 
WAYNE W. RATLIFF, JR., Salesman, Phone: Home 874-2720 after 6 p.m. 

EMMA LOU MARTIN, Broker~alesman, Ph.: Home, 874-9928, after 5 p.m. 
MAURICE MITCHELl.. Sales Representative, Phone 874-2243 

JUDY A. WIREMAN, Sales Representative, 886-8350. 
JOYCE LYNN REYNOLDS, Sales Representative, Day 874-2189 

ALTA JEAN GIBSON, Sales Representative, Phone 285-9523, 285-360:l 
VIRGIL 0. TURNER, Sales Representative. Phone 432·3367 after 4 p.m. 
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Spotlight on State 4-H Horse Show 
Each year the top 4-H equestrians in the state 
converge on Louisville the weekend just prior to 
the opening of the Kentucky State Fair to 
participate in the annual Kentucky 4-H Horse 
Show. The grooming and preparation for the 
appearance in the various events of the show 

always hold an excitement that near rivals the 
actual participation . The 1978 show wu three 
days long and was staged in the Kentucky Expoli­
tion Center in Louisville. 'Thtse photos portray 
activities of but a small part of the participant. u 
they prepped for the entrance in the show rifta. 

"HEY! DO 1 REALLY NEED A SHAVE?"- "Stellar Event," appears to be posing the question as 
her owner, Beth Saltsman, (left) lS-year-old Glasgow 4-H'er, applies the clippers in preparation for 
the horse's appearance in the show ring. Lending a hand at holding the horse steady is Beth Page, 
another 15-year-old Glasgow 4-H'er. 

WHAT'S A GOAT DOING AT A HORSE SHOW?-"Julie," a milk goat, seems a bit out of place 
in the barn area at the 1978 Kentucky 4-H Horse Show, but she's really "right at home," for 
she's the traveling mascot of a horse entered in the show by Heather Mathes. Heather, a Nicholas 
County 4-H'er, is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Mathes of Carlisle. The young miss partici­
pated in the annual show, which is held on the weekend prior to the opening of the Kentuclcy 
State Fair in Louisville. 

"HOLD STILL! I'M MAKIN' YOUR HOOVES PRETTY!"­
Mike Bowling, 17-year-old Boyd County 4-H'er from Ashland, 
paints the hooves of his horse, "Golda's Pride," before riding out 
into the arena in the walking horse division of the state 4-H 
Horse Show. It's a must to have the horse's hooves shine just 
like the boots of the rider. 

~ "WONDER WHO'S TAKING CARE OF WHOM?"- Janice Wat· 
kins, 16-year-old daughter of Dr. and Mrs. James Watkins, 
Lexington, catches a few winks in the b<1m area at the 1978 
Kentucky 4-H Horse Show in Louisville, as she awaits her tum 
in the show ring. Her horse, "Star of Freedom," appears to be 
standing guard over the young miss. But Janice had a tight hold 
on the reins despite her snooze. 

A HORSE NEEDS SPRUCIN' UP FROM HEAD TO TAIL-~ 
Betsy Plattner, 14-year-old Campbell County 4-H'er, lovingly 
braids the tail of her saddlebred hor..t:, " Royal Senior," before 
going into the ring at the 1978 Kentucky 4-H Horse Show. Betsy 
is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Plattner of Camp Springs. 

E :\'ROLI.S AT ACADEMY 
BYF IELD, Mass.-GQvernor Owner 

Academy will open its academic year 
Sept. 12 with an enrollment of 332 
s tudents including ll5 new enrollees. Of 
the new incoming students, 60 wiU be 
freshmen making this one of the largest 
classe s ever 

Did you know that of a total of twenty­
six amendments to our Constitution, 
three of them are directly concerned with 
insuring the right of citizens to vote? This 
is evidence that the Constitution is a 
working basis for government~not just a 
static document. The Daughters of the 
American Revolution urge you to 
celebrate Constitution Week, September 
17th through 23rd, by resolving to be a 
citizen who votes responsibly . 

Under the Federal Ports and Water­
ways Act of 1972, the U .S. Coast Guard 
has full authority over ships of any flag 
operating in U.S. waters to enforce 
regulations designed to prevent oil spills 
or other marine hazards. 

Completes Training 

Attending for the first time this fall will 
be Paul T . Coombs, son Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen T . Coombs, of Langley. 

There are more than 5 million 
motorcycles registered in this country 
according to figures compiled by the U .S . 
Department of Transportation. 

TRANSMITTERS WKAS 25 Morehead WKMR 38 
Ashland WKGB 53 Murray-Mayt1eld WKMU 21 

WKON 52 Bowling Green WCVN 54 Owenton 
Cov1ngton WKZT 23 P1kev1lle WKPI 22 
El1zabethtown WKHA 35 Somerset WKSO 29 
Hazard · WKLE 46 
Lex1ngton·R1chmond WKMJ 68 
LOUISVIlle WKMA 3 5 
Mad1sonv1lle 

THURSDAY, SEPT. 14 
• All Times Given Are 
Eastern/Central Times 
8:3017:30 a .m. KET IN· 
SCHOOL PROGRAMMING 
3:3012:30 p.m. LILIAS, YOGA 
AND YOU 
4:0013:00 SESAME STREET 
5:0014:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
5:3014:30 ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY 
6:0015:00 ZOOM (Captioned) 
6:30/5:30 GED "Math V: 
Percents" 
7:00/6:00 THE MACNEIL/ 
LEHRER REPORT 
7:3016:30 THE DICK CAVETT 
SHOW "HenryS. Commager" 
8:0017:00 KENTUCKY NOW In 
a special film about farming, 
a Woodford County Iarmer 
tries to reconcile and live two 
extremes of farming theory ­
the small, respect-lor-the· 
land position of Wendell 
Berry and the large-scale, 
equipment and chemicals 
position of Earl Butz. 
8:30/7:30 PERSON TO PER· 
SON Edward R. Murrow inter· 
views George Meany and 
Ethel Waters. 
9:0018:00 SHAW ON FILM 
Leslie Howard is Professor 
Henry Higgins and Wendy 
Hiller is Eliza in George Ber­
nard Shaw's rags-to-riches 
tale. 

FRIDAY, SEPT. 15 
8:3017:30 a . m. KET IN· 
SCHOOL PROGRAMMING 
3:3012:30 p.m. LILIAS, YOGA 
AND YOU 
4:0013:00 SESAME STREET 
5:00/4:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
5:3014:30 ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY 
6:0015:00 ZOOM 
8:3015:30 STUDIO SEE The 
louisville Slugger baseball 
bat factory is vi&ited. (R) 
7:0016:00 THE MACNEIL/ 
LEHRER REPORT 
7:30/6:30 COMMENT ON 
KENTUCKY 
8:0017:00 WASHINGTON 
WEEK IN REVIEW 
8:3017:30 WALL STREET 
WEEK 
9:0018:00 THE PALLISERS 
Glencora is bored and unhap­
py In her loveless marriage. 
10:30/9:30 BERNSTEIN CON· 
DUCTS This all-Ravel pro­
gram features the National 
Orchestra of France. 

SATURDAY,SEPT.16 
12:30 p.m./11 :30 a.m. NEW 
SHAPES: EDUCATION 

1:00112:00 GED "Math IV: 
Rounding Off Numbers" (R) 
1:30112:30 GED "Math V: 
Percents" (R) 
2:0011:00 GUTEN TAG IN 
DEUTSCHLAND 
2:3011:30 TEACHING LIFE 
SCIENCE IN THE ELEMEN· 
TARY SCHOOL 
3:0012:00 JOURNEY INTO 
ART Artist Ben Stahl's tip for 
the day is stretching canvas. 
3:3012:30 CROCKETT'S VIC· 
TORY GARDEN (R) 
4:0013:00 THE FRENCH CHEF 
4:3013:30 ANTIQUES "Pottery, 
Stoneware and the Southern 
Crafts" 
5:0014:00 ALL-STAR SOCCER 
6:0015:00 JAMES MICH· 
ENER'S WORLD"Hawaii 
Revisited" 
7:0016:00 ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC "What Katy Did" (R) 
7:3016:30 WILDERNESS "The 
Okefenokee Swamp" 
8:0017:00 FIRING LINE 
9:0018:00 THE LONG SEARCH 
This series examines the 
world's primary religions and 
their role in the 20th century. 
The first program is "Prates· 
tant Spririt U.S.A." 
10:0019:00 SHADES OF 
GREENE "Two Gentle Peo­
ple" Two unhappy middle· 
aged people meet in a Paris 
park. Graham Greene's short 
story finds out if it is too late 
for a fresh start. 
11 :00/10:00 THE TWO RON· 
NIES 

SUNDAY, SEPT. 17 
8:0017:00 a.m. SESAME 
STREET . 
9:0018:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
9:3018:30 ZOOM 
10:0019:00 SESAME STREET 
11:00110:00 INFINITY FAC· 
TORY 
11:30/10:30 STUDIO SEE 
12:00/11:00 REBOP 
12:30111:30 BIG BLUE MAR· 
BLE This series will take 
young viewers on interesting 
trips around the world. 
1:00/12:00 WASHI NGTON 
WEEK IN REVIEW 
1:30112:30 KENTUCKY NOW 
A Woodford County farmer is 
featured. (R) 
2:00/1:00 ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC "The Battle of 
Billy's Pond" Two young 
fishermen fight pollution (and 
big business) in their favorite 
fishing pond. (R) 
3:0012:00 THE LOS ANGELES 
PHILHARMONIC AT THE 
HOLLYWOOD BOWL (A) 
4:00/3:00 HENRY FORD'S 
AMERICA (A) 

5:0014:00 THE LONG SEARCH 
"Protestant Spirit U.S.A." (A) 
6:00/5:00 CROCKETT'S VIC· 
TORY GARDEN 
6:3015:30 ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC "What Katy Did" 
Katy is still confined to bed at 
Christmas. 
7:0016:00 THE PALLISERS 
Glencora is bored and unhap­
PY in her loveless marriage. 
8:0017:00 EVENING AT POPS 
Dancer Noel Parenti joins Ar· 
thur Fiedler and the Boston 
Pops Orchestra for tap dane· 
ing and mime. 
9:0018:01) MASTERPIECE 
THEATRE "The Mayor of 
Casterbridge" Donald Far­
frae, fired by the Mayor, starts 
his own company. The 
Mayor's daughter Is stunned 
by the story of her father's 
past. 
10:00/9:00 THE FACES OF 
COMMUNISM "Czechoslo­
vakia" 

MONDAY, SEPT. 18 
8:3017:30 a.m. KET IN · 
SCHOOL PROGRAMMING 
3:3012:30 p.m. LILIAS, YOGA 
AND YOU 
4:0013:00 SESAME STREET 
5:00/4:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
5:3014:30 ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY 
6:00/5:00 ZOOM 
6:30/5:30 REBOP 
7:0016:00 THE MACNEILl 
LEHRER REPORT 
7:3016:30 THE DICK CAVETT 
SHOW "John Reed" 
8:0017:00 ONCE UPON A 
CLASSIC "A Connecticut 
Yankee in King Arthur's 
Court" 
9:00/8:00 OPERA THEATER 
"Jack: A Flash Fantasy" In 
this first rock-opera musical 
variety show ever performed 
specifically for television, 
Gilda Radner plays Jill and 
Victor Garber is Jack. 
10:0019:00 MY KINGDOM FOR 
LOVE: ABDICATION The 
story of Edward VIII's obses­
sion for Mrs. Wallis Simpson, 
the twice-divorced American 
for whom he gave up his 
throne. 

TUESDAY, SEPT. 19 
8:3017:30 a .m. KET IN· 
SCHOOL PROGRAMMING 
3:3012:30 p.m. LILIAS, YOGA 
AND YOU 
4:0013:00 SESAME STREET 
5:00/4:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
5:3014:30 ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY 
6:0015:00 ZOOM 

TRANSLATORS 
Augusta 56 
Barbourville 12 
Boston·Butler 64 
Cowan Creek·Eoha 9 
Falmouth 56 
LOUISa 10 
P1nev1lle 8 
Wh1tesburg 66 

6:3015:30 GED "Math VI : 
Percents & Interest" 
7:00/6:00 THE MACNEIL/ 
LEHRER REPORT 
7:3016:30 THE DICK CAVETT 
SHOW "Henry Winkler" 
8:0017:00 MASTERPIECE 
THEATRE "The Mayor of 
Casterbridge" The Mayor' s 
daughter learns of her 
father' s past. (A) 
9:0018:00 DISTINGUISHED 
KENTUCKIAN: ROBERT R. 
MARTIN State Senator Martin 
reflects on his career as 
president of EKU, State Com· 
missioner of Finance and 
Superintendent of Public In· 
struction. Former Governor 
Bert T. Combs interviews Dr. 
Martin. 
10:0019:00 MSTISLAV 
ROSTROPOVICH AT THE 
WHITE HOUSE Cellist 
Rostropovich performs in the 
first of a series of perfor· 
mances by noted artists. 

WEDNESDAY, SEPT. 20 
8:3017:30 a.m. KET IN· 
SCHOOL PROGRAMMING 
3:3012:30 p.m. LILIAS, YOGA 
AND YOU 
4:0013:00 SESAME STREET 
5:0014:00 MR. ROGERS' 
NEIGHBORHOOD 
5:30/4:30 ELECTRIC COM· 
PANY 
8:0015:00 ZOOM 
8:3015:30 TEACHING LIFE 
SCIENCE IN THE ELEMEN· 
T ARY SCHOOL (R) 
7:0018:00 THE MACNEILl 
LEHRER REPORT 
7:30/8:30 THE DICK CAVETT 
SHOW "Larry Rivers" 
8:0017:00 ECHOES OF 
SILVER The story of H.A.W. 
Tabor, Colorado silver 
magnate, and his second mar­
riage, to lizzie (Baby Doe) Me· 
Court. 
8:3017:30 GREAT PERFOR· 
MANCES "live From lincoln 
Center" Zubln Mehta, directs 
guest soloist Rudolf Serkin. 
The program Includes 
Wagner's "Rienzi" overture, 
Prokofiev's "Romeo and 
Juliet" eKcerpts, and 
Beethoven's "Emperor" con· 
certo. (Two hours) 
10:3019:30 THRACIAN GOLD 
Alexander Scourby narrates 
this presentation of ar­
chaeological treasures 
recently unearthed In the 
People's Republic of 
Bulgaria. 

Yeoman 2nd Class Maynard Crwn , 
U.S.N. , native of Allen, graduated from 
Naval Submarine School at Groton, 
Connecticut, recently and will be 
stationed at Charleston, South Carolina. 
Yeoman Crwn will serve on a nuclear 
fleet ballistic missile submarine, The 
USS Nathan Hale . 

Yeoman Crwn is married to Connie 
Branham Crum . 

Notice of Intention To Mine 
PW'suant to Application Nwnber 036· 

008. 
1. In accordance with the provisions of 

KRS 350.055, notice is hereby given that : 
Diamond Capitol Mining Co. , Box 235, 
Allen Ky. 41601 intends to file an ap­
plication for the surface disturbance 
mining of approximately 19 acres located 
North of Arkansas in Floyd County. The 
proposed operation is approximately 2 
miles North of State Route SO's junction 
with Old County Road in Martin and 
located West of Beaver Creek Latitude 37 
35' 05" L<mgitude 82 44' 05". The surface 
of the area to be mined is owned by : 
Delmer Bentley Rt. 2, Allen Ky. A brief 
description of the kind of mining activity 
porposed is : Contour Stripping. The 
application will be filed at the Bureau of 
Surface Mining Reclamation and En· 
forcement Prestonsburg Area ,.Office, 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky. 

Persons wishing to file written ob · 
jections and-or request a formal ad­
ministrative hearing in regard to the 
above described surface mine should 
notify the Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental 
Protection within 30 days of the date of 
this notice, The written objection must 
have attached a copy of the newspaper 
clipping, and reference the above ap­
plication number. Such o jection or 
request must be in accordan e with KRS 
224.081 (2) and must be forwarded to the 
Director of Permits, Bureau of Surface 
Mining Reclamation and Enforcement, 
Capital Plaza Tower, Frankfort, Ken· 
tucky 40601. 

2. Notice is hereby provided pursuant 
to 30 CFR 715.13 (d) (10) and KRS 350 
that the proposed post mining land use of 
Woodland constitutes no change from the 
pre-mining land use : Interested citizens 
and local, State, and Federal Agnecies 
are invited to review and comment, to 
the address listed above, on the proposed 
land use. 

lt 

Mine Safety Day 
Slated at Park 

Coal mine safety personnel from 
Eastern Kentucky will be participating 
in m ine rescue and first-aid contests at 
the Big Sandy Safety Day event at Ar­
cher Park here, Sept. 15 and 16. 

H .N. Kirkpatrick, commissioner of the 
Kentucky Department of Mines and 
Minerals , said the purpose of the contests 
is to give rescue and first-aid teams 
"another opportunity to prepare 

themselves for something we hope 
doesn ' t happen." 

The contests will consist of simulated 
mine accident situations. Teams will be 
graded on their ability to solve a variety 
of problems, Kirkpatrick said. 

The first contest in a series of state 
events was Harlan Safety Day, Sept. 9, at 
Southeast Community College at 
Cwnberland. Mine rescue teams com­
peted. 

Western Kentucky Safety Days will be 
Sept. 22 and 23 at Earlington High School. 
Both mine rescue and first-aid teams will 
participate. 

The state contest is scheduled Sept. 29 
and 30 at the new Kentucky Horse Park 
in Lexington with mine rescue and first­
aid teams c ompeting. 

All events are open to the public. 

'Stephen Foster Story' 
Ends Its 20th Season 

"The Stephen Foster Story" closed its 
20th season Sunday evening, Sept. 3, 
after having played to a total of 73,453 
persons. 

"This was one of our best seasons," 
says Bert Ballard, the outdoor drama's 
general manager. "In spite of several 
days of adverse weather, we've managed 
to set some new records this swnmer. " 
Notable is the fact that the show broke its 
single-day attendance record on two 
successive Saturdays in August. 

The Paul Green musical will open its 
21st season next June 9. 

NOTICE 
Upon and after publication of this 

notice 1 will no longer be responsible for 
debts incurred by any persons other than 
myself. 

CLAUDE REFFETT 
PRINTER, KY. 

HOME FOR SALE 

lt-pd. 

On large secluded lot overlooking 
Prestonsburg. Private drive. 
Three bedrooms, large family 
room, two baths, plus laundry 
room,· two-car garage and more. 
Priced mid 90's. Shown by ap­
pointment only. 

Call Larry Greer 
285-3009 or 

Carolyn Greer 
886-6656 

after5:30p.m. lt. 

Promoted to Sgt. 
Robert A. Kidd, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Edgar Kidd, of Printer, was recently 
promoted to Army sergeant while ser­
ving as a senior field switchboard 
operator with the 1st Personnel and 
Administration Battalion at Fort Hood, 
Texas. 

Kidd's wife, Melba, lives in Harker 
Heights, Texas. 

JOE D. 

WEDDINGTON 
HEAL ESTATE 

886-3647 

Trim Down! 
Shape Up! 

• Landscaping 

• Trimming 

• Spraying 

Try Us! 
Hensley Nursery 

Mt. Parkway 
Phone 886-8761 

9-6-4t-pd. 

Way of the Cross 
Out reach 

THURSDAY­
Interdenominational 

Prayer Meeting, 
7:30p.m. 

Sunday-
Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:30p.m. 

TV !\11NISTRY GUESTS 
June 27- Vicki Jamison 
June 30--Don Hughes, teacher­
evangelist, PTL Club guest 
June 22- Happy Goodmans in 
Charleston, W. Va. 
June 23-The Reflections, also in 
Charleston. 

Television Ministry, Channel 57, 
Hazard, every Sunday, 10:30 to 11 
a.m .. Every Tuesday, 7 to 7:30 
p.m. 

Call886-8727 or !186·9595, 
for further information. 
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Youngsters Perform Ballet at Highlands Folk Festival 

Featured at the recent Highlands Folk Festival were the young dancers pictured above. Leslie Phelps and Daniel Runyon 
(pictW'ed at left) performed an interpretation of "The Nightingale," while the larger dance group danced to a rendition of the old 
ballad, "Barbara Allen." .Members of the group include from left to right, (kneeling)-Rynae Howard and Sarah ,Belhasen; 
Cstanding>-Marcy Deaton, Billie Griffith, Betsy Arnett. <Not pictured is Cherie Ramey.) 

The group, under the direction of Snookie Meade, wore costumes made in New York and researched for authenticity by Marie 
Pellico. 

Officers Foil 
Jail Break Try 

Although three prisoners had suc­
cessfully sawed through two bars of their 
cell at the Floyd county jail, Tuesday 
afternoon, they weren't even close to 
escaping. 

The prisoners' long hours of scheming 
and considerable expenditure of "elbow 
grease" went for naught when they were 
caught in the act by a fellow "prisoner," 
State Police Trooper Forsythe, who, 
dressed in plain clothes, patiently ob­
served the activity of the three until the 
time was right to foil their plan. 

Jailer Lawrence Hale, who was alerted 
to the escape plans early in the af­
ternoon, informed law officers, including 
Forsythe, who was "planted" in the cell 
area of the planned break. Arrested by 
Forsythe, Sheriff Doug Lewis, County 
Detective Sam Hale, Jailer Hale, Deputy 
Jailer Charles Clark and State Troopers 
Delmar Lafferty and Shelton were 
Dewayne Williams, of Harold,and Jeff 
Mullins, of Drift, both of whom were in 
jail on robbery charges, and Rocky 
Garner, of North Carolina, who was 
serving time for a number of charges 
stemming from a shooting fray of some 
months ago with State Trooper Don 
Weedman. 

Jailer Hale said a search of the jail 
turned up three "billy clubs," which had 
been made by rolling up successive 
layers of wet magazines, and a single 
hacksaw blade which had apparently 
been smuggled into the jail. 

Hale said the prisoners would be 
charged with attempt to escape jail by 
state police today (Wednesday). 

Others booked at the county jail over 
the past week, charges against each, and 
arresting officers follow: 

County Firemen Form 
Ass'n To Improve Service 

Members of nine fire departments 
from all parts of the county met at the 
Maytown grade school cafeteria Thurs­
day, Aug. 24, to organize the Floyd 
County Firefighters Association. 

By forming a county-wide 
organization, the firefighters feel that 
they can give better service to the county 
by helping each other. For example, 
becoming familiar with the various types 
of equipment each department uses will 
speed up assistance when there are 
mutual aid calls. 

Funding presents a serious problem for 
some of the county departments. "One 
department was forced to pass a hat 
around to get enough money to respond to 
a call-this is no way to get things done," 
says Ricky Davis, of the Prestonsburg 
Fire Department, who was elected 
publicity chairman at the association's 
first meeting. 

The importance of volunteer firemen 
was discussed. "These men risk their 
lives for nothing more than a job well 
done," says Davis. 

Temporary board members of the 
association are Edward F. Robinson, 
Maytown, Robert Campbell, Martin, 
Danny Stephens, Allen, Hershel! 
Hamilton, Mud Creek, Lee Johnson, 
Wheelwright, Paul Burke, Prestonsburg, 
Howard Ferguson, Auxier, Owen Short, 
Left Beaver, and .:James George, Betsy 
Layne. 

The next Firefighters Associatiqn 
meeting will be at the Allen Fire 
Department on Monday, Sept. 18 at 7 
p.m. Anyone wanting further in­
formation is asked to contact one of the 
board members. 

CARD OF THANKS 
The children of Louisa Hicks wish to 

thank the Carter Funeral Home, the Rev. 
Ashland Shepherd, the men who dug the 
grave and all who sent flowers, food or 
helped in any other way when our mother 
passed away. 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 
Prestonsburg City's Utilities 

Commission 
Sealed bids will be received by the 

Prestonsburg City's Utilities Com­
mission, Prestonsburg, Kentucky, on a 
1979 rubber-tired loader-backhoe, at the 
City's Utilities Commission Office, until 
7:30P.M., October 12, 1978, at which time 
bids will be publicly opened and read 
aloud, for furnishing labor and materials 
and performing all work as set forth by 
this advertisement for bids. 
Specifications cab be obtained from the 
office of the City Utilities Commission 
Fire Department Building, 1048 South 
Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653. 

Bids received after the scheduled 
closing time for reception of bids will be 
returned unopened to the bidder. Bids 
must be accompanied by bid bond, 
payable to the City's Utilities Com­
mission in an amount not less than 5 
percent of the base bid. 

In the event an award is made and the 
successful bidder fails to execute con­
tract for performance of the work under 
the award then the bid bond shall be 
forfeited as liquidated damages for such 
failure. 

Bids and bid bonds shall be in a sealed 
envelope bearing the bidder's iden­
tification, addressed to the Prestonsburg 
City's Utilities Commission, P .0 . Box 
468, Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653, 
labeled in the lower left-hand corner. 

FLOYD COUNTY 
HEALTH NOTES 

DONNAJ. GRIFFITH 
Health Educator 

The Floyd County Health Department 
issues the following announcements : 

1.) From September 14, through 
September 16, the Floyd County Health 
Department's mobile van will be parked 
on the Floyd county fair grounds where 
the co111munity health nurses will be 
offering glaucoma and blood pressure 
screenings, free of charge. All Floyd 
countians are urged to visit the van for 
these free screening services and also to 
pick up the free literature which will be 
available. 

2.) Thursday, September 14, a Pap 
Smear clinic will be conducted at the 
health department from 9 to 11:30 and 1 
to 2. 

This clinic provides all women with the 
opportunity to be screened for cervical 
cancer, which is a pro<'edure that doctors 
recommend for all women once a year. 

All women needing their yearly Pap 
Smear are urged and welcomed to attend 
this clinic for this free screening service. 

3.) Also, on Monday, September 18, the 
Bypro Outpost Clinic will be conducted at 
Ethel Osborne's Store from 10 to 12 and 1 
to 2. The health department nurse will be 
offering the following medical services at 
this clinic, free of charge: im­
munizations, TB skin tests, diabetes 
screening, and blood pressures. 

The public is welcome to attend. 

The Floyd County Health Department 
Family Planning Program will have the 
mobile van parked on the Osborne 
Elementary School parking lot, Friday, 
September 22. 

Family planning supplies and 
pregnancy tests will be available from 10 
to 12 and 1 to 3 for ONLY those patients 
who have an appointment. 

If you wish to attend this clinic, please 
call 886-8702 for an appointment. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express our 

gratitude and appreciation to all our 
friends and neighbors who expressed 

·their sympathy in so many ways upon the 
passing of our loved one, Dewey Gilbert 
Stumbo. The lovely floral offerings, 
visitations and words of solace will long 
be remembered. We wish to express our 
appreciation for the efficient service of 
the Hall Bros. Funeral Home, also the 
lovely music rendered by the singers and 
a special thank-you to Melvin Staggs, of 
the Freewill Baptist Church, of Wabush, 
Indiana, for his words of comfort and the 
memorials to the Kidney Foundation. 

THE FAMILY 

The U.S. Department of Tran­
sportation's Federal Aviation Ad­
ministration employs more than 1300 
women air traffic controllers. 

KOUNTRY KITCHEN 
BAKERY & RESTAURANT 
SPning Burft•t II <1.m. 

Specializing In: 
Birthday, Wedding and 

All Occasion Cakes 
and Pizzas 

• E'flPI'it•nn•d ('akl' BakP1· 
and I )tTul·a tor 

• Fn·~h 1'~.-.. tl"it•s Dail~ 

• (;uaranlt•t•cl Fn·~h 

Music Programs 
Featuring Fair 

Two evening music performances are 
early attractions at the Floyd County 
Fair at Archer Park this week, in ad­
dition to the Guthrie Shows which opened 
Tuesday night. 

The Goins Brothers will present a 
program of Blue Grass music at 7:30 
p.m. today (Wednesday), and at the 
same hour Thursday gospel music will be 
provided by the Trimbleaires, the Pack 
Family and the Corn Fork Trio. 

Admission will be without charge to 
both performances. 

Friday will be Kids' Day, with charges 
for rides reduced, and two bicycles will 
be given away at 5 p.m. Saturday. 

All exhibits, except flowers and 
livestock, are to be in place at the 
fairgrounds by 5 p.m. today <Wed­
nesday). The flower exhibits are to be 
entered by 11 a.m. Friday, and the 
livestock exhibits are due by noon 
Saturday. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
1976 Mack truck DN65SX31532, will be 

on public sale at 10 a.m. Sept. 15, 1978. Sale 
will take place at Mountaineer Mack 
Sales, Inc., 5220 Route 60, Huntington, W. 
Va. lt. 

Chtldren·s Sizes· 12\1, to 4 

LOOK 
ALIKE 
SHOES 

Section Two, Page Ten ----
Mining Course Held 
Pikeville, Martin 

Classes for Mine electricity will begin 
Sept. 19 at Pikeville college. Scheduled 
locations and times are Tues. nights at 
Pikeville college, 6-9 p.m. and Martin 
Coal Center, Thurs nights 6-9. 

A National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration report estimates that 
200,000 lives have been saved since the 
Safety Act of 1966, which began the chain 
of safety improvements in our passenger 
cars. 

This is a 30-week course giving 3 hours 
college credit; CEU credits are also 
available. Tuition is $30, with scholarship 
aid available. For more information, call 
James Ramsey 432-3161, ext. 323. 

DEVICE MAKES FINE PRINT 
Caracas-A Venezuelan experimenter, 

using a "fly's-eye"lens containing 10,000 
micro-lenses, can photographically 
reduce a 20-volume encyclopedia onto a 
space the size of a typewritten page. 

Gable-Roberts Pentecostal 
Holiness Church 

Tuesday 
Prayer Meeting ____ 7 p.m. 
Sunday 
SundaySchool- ___ -lOa.m 
MorningWorship ____ ua.m. 
EveningWorship ____ 7p.m. 

Services 4th Sat. of each month 
For church bus service call 886-
6176. 

Rev. Paul Burke, Pastor 
Everyone Welcome 5-31 tf 

1978TRANS-AM 
CLOSE OUT SALE 

BUY NOW AND SAVE THE 1979 PRICE INCREASE 
WHICH AMOUNTS TO AS MUCH AS $822 ON THESE 
CARS, IN ADDITION TO SAVING ON OUR HUGE YEAR 
END DISCOUNTS. BELOW IS A PARTIAL LIST OF OUR 
INVENTORY OF TRANS-AMS; WHICH SHOW THE 1978 
STICKER PRICE FOR A COMPARABLE CAR, AND 
OUR SALE PRICE: 

Stock 1978 Sticker 1979 Sticker SALE 
~ Model Price Price PRICE 

59 Trans-Am $8137.54 $9583.48 57995°0 

64 Trans-Am $8859.90 $9394.84 '7995°0 

90 Trans-Am $8527.54 $9109.98 57195°0 

97 Trans-Am $9057.54 $9680.48 •7995°0 

98 Trans-Am $8404.54 $9206.48 *7995°0 

113 Trans-Am $8031.54 $8414.48 *7995°0 

190 Trans-Am $8105.54 $9442.48 *7995°0 

Special Edition 
207 Trans-Am $8867.54 $9282.48 *7995°0 

215 Trans-Am $8933.54 $9312.48 '7995°0 

312 Trans-Am $8510.54 $8989.48 •7995°0 

GRAY& GRAY 
AUTO SALES 

South Lake Drive Prestonsburg 

Rugged, outdoor shoes 
with Bare-foot 

comfort built in! 
3 great new survivor·type shoes. tough, contem· 
porary ... with long wearing KRA TON Soles. And 
they·re styled for active, out-gotng men, women and 
children. They're LOOK ALIKE shoes. The family 
that plays together ... NOW, looks all together too. 
Budget priced. 

Women·s Stzes: 4 to 10 

Child,en·s Sizes 12 ', 10 4 

Women's Si2es 4 to 10 
Chtldren·s Sizes: 12 Y, to 4 

Charles Harris, assault on a police 
officer, by Park Ranger Phillip Neeley; 
Robert Hensley, assault on a police of­
ficer and drunk driving, by Park Ranger 
Phillip Neeley; Arthur Hurd, drunk 
driving, by Prestonsburg Policeman 
Kilgore; William D. Nelson, drunk 
driving,/ by State Trooper Stephens; 
Ernest Hall, theft by unlawful taking, by 
Deputy Sheriff Randall Lewis; Allen D. 
Ousley, attempt to elude police officer, 
by Prestonsburg Policeman Kilgore; 
Roy Johnson, rape, by Wheelwright 
Marshall Johnson; Danny R. Sarrath, 
drunk driving, by Prestonsburg 
Policeman Lawson; Ronnie E. Perkins, 
theft by unlawful taking, by State 
Trooper Joel Newsome; D. L. West, 
drunk driving, by State Trooper Bevins; 
Ray Lumpkins, drunk driving, by 
Prestonsburg Policeman Murdock; 
Edward H. Mason, d~unk driving, by 
Deputy Sheriffs Larry Goble and Chuck 
Akers; Gene A. Shearer, drunk driving, 
by State Trooper Sizemore; Larry 
Wright, drunk driving, by State Trooper 
Shelton; Ricky G. Dye, by Deputy 
Sheriffs Jack and Don Nelson; Walker R. 
Newsome, drunk driving, by State 
Trooper Sizemore; J. Akers, drunk 
driving, by Prestonsburg Policeman 
Murdock; Drexel Hall, drunk driving, by 
Sheriff Doug Lewis; Eddie F. Craft, 
drunk driving, by Sheriff Doug Lewis; 
Jack Whittaker, drunk driving, by 
Prestonsburg Policeman Murdock; 
James Preston, drunk driving, by State 
Trooper Shelton; M. R. Osborne, drunk 
driving, by State Trooper Shelton; Elmer 
Greer, drunk driving, by State Trooper 
Bevins; Donald Fields, drunk driving, by 
State Trooper Shelton; James E. Cole, 
drunk driving, by State Trooper Weed­
man; Obra McKinney, drunk driving, by 
State Trooper Shelton; Orville Lee Hall, 
theft by unlawful taking, by Deputy 
Sheriffs Randall Lewis and Chuck Akers; 
Creed Hall, theft by unlawful taking, by 
Deputy Sheriffs Randall Lewis and 
Chuck Akers. 

The Prestonsburg City's Utilities 
Commission reserves the right to reject 
any or all bids, which bids shall not be 
withdrawn for 45 days subsequent to the 
opening of bids, without consent for the 
Prestonsburg City's Utilities Com­
mission. 

Call 478-9845, 
Main St., Stanville 

flours: 

for active 
Americans 
from 4 to 40! 

Shoe Store 
Prestonsburg 

There are 9 million boats and 50 million 
persons engaged in recreational boating 
in the United States, the U.S. Coast 
Guard says. 

Bill H. Howard, Superintendent, 
Prestonsburg City·'s Utilities Com­
mission 

9·13-2t. 

l\lon .. Tues., \\-ed ., Fri., Sat., 
fia .m.-X IJ.m.; 

2_22.11. Thursday, 6 a .m.-5 (J.m. 
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Pupil Testing Guidelines 
Approved by State Board 

The StatE' Board for 
Elementary and Secondarv 
Education Wednesday ap· 
proved guidelines to help local 
school districts implement the 
Educational Improvement Act 
and bring competency testing 
mto Kentucky schools. 

t:nder the provisions of 
House Btll 579 passed during 
the 1978 legislature, more than 
224,000 students tn grades 
three, five, seven and 10 will be 
tested during the current 
school year. Local districts will 
develop educational im· 
provement plans to address 
educational weaknesses 
demonstrated bv their students 
during te ting. · 

make Ken tuck) 's educational 
improvement plan much 
sounder than plans tried in 
other states, Van Fleet said. 
Evaluation:> of teachers for 
tenure v.tll not be based on 
their students' test scores 
either, he said. 

James B. Graham, state 
supenntendent of public in· 
struction, expressed some 
reservation with the law. "I 
feel the program is too broad. 
Te ting in reading and math 
v.ould have been enough for the 
first year," he said. The 
legislation calls for testing in 
six basic skills areas: reading, 
Wl'lting, spelling, 
mathematics, language arts 
and the development of 
learning skills. 

During the two-day meeting, 
the board also: 

-installed two new mem· 
bers, Peggy Howard of Owens· 
boro and John Ramsey of 
Louisville; 
-approved a regulatiOn 

permitting only one type of 
high school diploma for 
Kentucky high schools; 

- approved guidelines for the 
development of kindergarten 
programs in Kentucky's public 
schools; 

-approved the revised 
annual plan for the Education 
of the Handicapped Act; and, 
-approved the general 

budgets for 1978·79 tax levies 
for 90 school districts. 

The Floyd County Times 

Proclaim Talking Book 
Library Week, Sept.l0-16 

Gov. Julian M. Carroll, has 
been joined locally by County 
Judge-Executive Yvonne S. 
Jones in proclaiming the week 
of September 1()..16 as Talking 
Book Library Week in Ken· 
tucky. 

The proclamation urges 
every Kentuckian to make all 
qualified persons aware of 
these services to the VISUally 
and physically handicapped by 
remembering the name 
Talking Book Library and the 
toll-free number 1·800·372·2968. 

The proclamation also 
pointed out that hbraries have 
established free services to all 
citizens ... the Library of 
Congress established free 
National Library Services for 
the Blind and Physically 

Handicapped ... and the Ken· 
lucky Department of Library 
and Archives has established 
special services for the blind 
and physically handicapped. 

These services are available 
to all qualified persons free of 
cost or financial obligation. 

51 j\1. 
o~-rt1e v·S, 

1/ 
=-' 
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The first vice president of the 
United States to resign from 
office was John C. Calhoun 
Ill 1832. 

section Two, 

MURPHY MART 
is now taking applications for 

full time employment for 
cashiers, restaurant, 111aintance 

and counter people. 

Apply at Murphy Mart, Weddington Plaza 
Monday through Thursdoy J 0-3. 

Dr. Donald Van Fleet, head 
of the Office of Research and 
Planning wh1ch wtll coordinate 
the testing of Kentucky's 
school children, emphasized 
positive aspects of the 
legislation for board members. 
Having no graduation 
requirements or promotional 
policy based on te t scores will 

Graham said that the 
education board had been 
working on a plan for com· 
petency testing prior to 
passage of the legislation that 
was "much more educationally 
sound. ·• Graham cited the 
delay of implementation for 
another year and greater 
hmding for remediation as 
improvements that could have 
been made in the law. 

EVERY AT LOW PRICES 
~IN1'$ I=OR 

UJ.oMEOWNER 
Till Your Garden Beautiful 

How clof's your garclen 
grow? If ~ ou 're u ing a power 
tiller on your soil, your 
Ilo\\ ers and vegetables are 
probably doing ju~t fine. Here 
are some tips for tilling safe· 
h, from the experts at the 
Outdoor Power Equipment 
Institute. 

NEVER LET ANY spilled 
gasoline go untended. 

1. :\1ake sure ~ ou know 
how all the controls and 
attachments work. The own· 
er' manual should be at the 
top of your must-read li ·t. 

2 Avoid thP po ibility of 
fire ancl explosion don't 
smoke while you refuel-wipe 
up pilled ga olin<' quicklv. 

3. Stop the engine ·and 
make sure parts are not mov· 
ing 1f you want to unclog 
blade . make repairs or refuel. 

4 Make sure guards and 
shields are always in place. 

5. Wear heavy-duty, rough· 
soled :shoe~ for the best 
footing 

These safety t1ps should 
ht> 1 p you - till the roses 
bloom. 

Graham cautioned educators 
and the public not to "view it 
(the Educational Improvement 
Act> as the panacea for all 
educational ills." 

Department officials em­
phasized the lack of funding for 
the program. The Department 
of Education will receive 
$338,000 during the first year 
for testing and $1.75 million 
during the second year for 
remediation. 

But no hmds were allocated 
for additwnal staff to aid local 
dtstricts tn the implementation 
of the law or for workshops to 
familiarize local teachers and 
administrators with the 
program, education officials 
said. 

Dr. l\Iitchell Davis, of 
Glasgow, chairman of the 
Advisorv Committee for 
Educati~nal Improvement. 
said futher legislatures will 
have to look for extra funding 
for remedial work if the 
program is to be successful. 

The board also approved 
experimental programs for 
twelve school districts and two 
private schools. The programs 
include creative band for gifted 
and talented students in 
Danville High School, personal 
mathematics for Campbell 
County High School students, 
career exploration projects in 
Bowling Green and Warren 
County. and a career in· 
ternship program at Fort Knox 
High School 

Hen·• 
Vo~k 
Roofs 

VISA -4DAYS­
WED.-SUN., SEPT· 13-16 

·~ ..._.~ 

PIRPICT FOR WORK OR SPORTS! 
8·1NCH LEATHER BOOTS 
leather uppers with welt 
construction for durobdi­
ty . Reinforced stitchrng. 
Sure-gr•p soles resist oil 
and gas. Butternut color. 

1618 
REGULAR '19.97 

THI WORKING MAN'S FAYORITII 
6·1NCH LEATHER BOOTS 
Durable and comfortable 
leather uppers with welt 
construcllon. Reinforced 
stitch1n~. Oil and gas re­
Sistant soles Bullernut . 

1418 
REGULAR '17.97 

WEDDINGTON PLAZA 

Parnts~ll e 

~ 

~" 
"" 

~'EAST KENTUCKY'S LARGEST AND OLDEST BUILDING MATERIALS PEOPLE " 

cash&carry 
(Delivery available at a slight additional charge) 

PRE-CUT STUDS --
2"x4"x92 5/8" K.D. Const. .......... '1 44 

Each 

2"x4"x8' ·~r 16' C t K D 5285 ons . . . . . _ PP• M 

2''x6"x8' '" 16' Const. K.O ..... ....... ~.285 P~>• M 

2"x8"x8' ·~. 16' 2 Y.P. K.O ...... ... '305 Pe• M 

1"x10" Sheathing ......... . .. . '295 Pprl/i I 
;4L 'l 

SHINGLES 
·' t. 

.2 .' ~v 

CABLE 
2)0 R ·t *1810 

CABLE 
STORM DOOR .. -· .. $3795 

White 
2'l0 Rol '2140 

PLYWOOD 

1/ 4"x4'x8' Ext. One Side Good ....... S 6 75 
rar" 

3/ 8"x4'x8' Exterior One Side Good .. ~.995 
Each 

112"x4'x8' C.D. Exterior . 

5/ 8"x4'x8' Particle Board ......... '495 
lA h 

: 2 .~. :£ 

SHEETROCK .... ......... ~.490 [arh 

'Gal RP<l• M' 

DRYWALL ... ~:~:~: .............. •665 
£ach 

CLOSET COM Bl NATION .. !3450 ......__ __ --J 

l uan r~ 

18'th 36"' '3750 DOOR UNITS .......... :.~ ......................... .. 
6" x 6" x 5' no. 10 

REINFORCING WIRE .•.. ~.3950 From '5975 EXTERIOR DOOR UNITS. .......... . 
Wood Double-Hung ..1 

WINDOW non~9 
STOCKING 
OEAlfR! 50 lbs. 8 common NAilS ... _ .$1595 

UNITS···· .$32 up 
Andersen· 
~1W'~AW" 50 lbs. 16 ~ommon NAILS . . . .. $15~5 

f)' Glass Preflnrsh 

SLIDING DOOR 
·o 

PANELING ............................ ~395 UP 
I •••nperPd l11s 11 on And~rsen Wmdo"' Un1ts See 0 1 Complete L rP' 01 
N l t "'"11 fl Hl• r, I '' • 20 o/o OFF VANITIES 

II $1 34 SO At lO>'v f V>'t1d~~ P• 1"\ 

Complete Line Of Plumbing And Electrical Supplies. 
PRICES GOOD AT 

PAINTSVILLE YARD PRESTONSBURG YARD 

1 !ll'···••l•m 1 yri(,l' toPant••I··S 66'.)~ 
II•· A· ~I;' c IIPL Cti ' 

· F.S. VanHoose & Co 

A II Prices Subject To Change 

"' 

''b7746 

,,~ 
. 

:Ill 

PAINTSVIa.,LE LOCATION PRESTONSBURG LOCATION 
Rt. 40 to Inez -+ :::0 

~ C&O Depot ~ ..-
...- " 

~ Prestonsburg 
_p. 

~' ~' ' "' 

~ 
F. 5. VanHoose 

F.s.J ' ' \ 3: -Rroad .va~ t? :::0 " - ~ ~ ~ -- .... 
' 

::o:-

1/,~ - ~ 
~ Archer ~ 

Rt 23 /?"" Rt 23 toP-burg VanHoose Park 
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# PRESTONSBURG'S DISCOUNT FOOD MARKET 

O\\\ ~ \\\\\\\\Q ~~~U\ PLUS WEEKLY SPECIALS 

·a ~~s~\\ f,\\o\l\l~ts 
U .5. CHOICE TESTENDER 

CHUCK ROAST 
e Lb. 

DISCOUNT FOODS 

U.S. CHOICE TESTENDER (BONELESS) 

SHOU DER ROAST _______ lb.$1 5' . 

SJEWI G HENS _________ Lb.49c 
Lean $139 

U.S. Choice Testender STEWING BEEF - - - - Lb. 

Center Cut $ 09 
Chuck Steaks ______ lb. 1 

Glad 

Trash Bags 30:Gal. 10-Ct. 99 C 
- - - Size - - - Box 

Maxwell House 

COFFEE 
ALL GRINDS 

YELLOW ONIONS _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ 38~:· 49c 
YELLOW CORN _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ __ 5 Ears 59c 
APPLES, Red or Gold Delic. _____ 38~:· 89c 

Farmbest Pixie 

Novelties __ :;~D~.~~~~- -'2·Paclr 85c 
CHECK THESE 7 DAYS A WEEK DISCOUNT PRICES 

Valleydale $ 189 @J 
HOT DOGS 1•12-Lb. t\ii..Y.· _ _ ~ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ Pkg. 

~ Gunnoe's $339 @J 
~SAUSAGE ___________ 2R~~· ···-: 
~ Old Farm 99~ @J 
~ BACON - - - - - - - - - - - - ~~: M- . 
r@ CUBEo BEEF STEAKS _ _ _ _ _ _ _ •;-k~~· $1 39 r@l 
@ BATTER DIPT. COD PORTIONS- - - Lb. $1 79 @J 
@J BANANAS __________ 4 Lbs. $1 00 8 

IF ANYONE CAN SAVE YOU MONEY SAV-U CAN 



I 

I 

I, 

Wednesday, September 13, 1978 

One Fifth of Kentucky Students 
May Need Remedial Reading 

About 20 percent of Ken­
tucky's students will need 
renwd 1 a! training when the 
state's competency testing 
program goes into effect this 
year, a Department of 
Education official last week 
told the state advisory com­
mittee on educational im­
provement. 

Dr. Donald Van Fleet, head 
of the education department's 
Office of Research and 
Planning, said that 15 to 24 
percent of the students tested! 
would score beneath the ac­
cepted standards. He based his 
prediction on student per­
formances on tests ad­
ministered over the past few 
years. The Comprehensive 
Tests of Basic Skills, which will 
be used to determine student 
competencies, is already used 
by 160 Kentucky districts. 

Teacher judgement and test 
scores would both be taken into 
account when local school 
sistricts plan remedial 
programs for students under 
the Educational Improvement 
Act, passed during the 1978 
General Assembly, Van Fleet 
said. 

House Bill 579, which calls 
for statewide competency 
testing program and remedial 
training for those students with 
educational weaknesses, also 
provides for an advisory 
committee for educational 
improvement to advise the 
governor and the department 
of education on im­
plementation of the act. 

The 18-member panel, made 
up of citizens, parents, 
teachers and administrators, 
met for the first time last week 
to organize and discuss its 
duties as an advisory body. Dr. 
Mitchell Davis, of Glasgow, 
was elected chairman of the 
committee. Davis is also a 
member of the steering 
committee for the Governor's 
Task Force on Education. 

Henry Pogue, member of the 
committee and chairman of -the 
State Board for Elementary 
and Secondary Education, 
urged the committee to make 
recommendations to the 
elementary and secondary 
education board soon con­
cerning implementation of the 
educational improvement 
program. 

REED BLAST HOLE DRILLS 
BIG MACHINE FEATURES 

WITHOUT BIG MACHINE CO 

Reed SK-25 
a new, compact rotary blast 
hole dnll with 25,000 pounds 
pulldown capacity for dnll1ng 
5%" to 6Y." holes 

Call 

~ KENTUCKY CO. 

Louisville 
502/3681621 

Hazard 
606/ 436-3111 

Princeton 
502 365 7591 

The board has not adopted 
any regulations govermng the 
implementation in the coming 
school year, Pogue said. "We 
would like input from this 
committee before we adopt any 
regulations," he said. 

Van Fleet told the committee 
that 200,000 Kentucky students 
in grades 3, 5, 7 and 10 will be 
tested next April and May to 
determine their competencies 
in six basic skills areas­
reading, wriring, spelling, 
language arts, mathematics 
and the development learning 
skills. 

Calling competency-based 
education a "national 

~
ovement," Van Fleet said 

hat 33 states have mandated 
orne form of competency 

education, either through state 
1board of education action or 
legislative action. 

He pointed out two dif­
ferences between Kentucky's 
program and the programs 
developed by other states. 
Kentucky's law has no man­
dated test score for graduation 
from high school and it makes 
no provision for the promotion 
or retention of students based 
on their test scores. 

The state Department of 
Education will be responsible 
for purchasing and scoring the 
screening tests, which will 
idneti fy students with 
weaknesses in the basic skills 
areas, and for providing 
technical assistance in 
developing remediation plans. 
Department personnel will also 
help local districts interpret 
test scores. 

Local districts will ad­
minister the screening tests 
during the coming school year 
and develop a local plan for 
educational improvement. 

THE U.S. LABOR Depart­
ment's job banks are an im­
portant tool of the public 
employment service. They are 
computerized daily printouts of 
available jobs listed by em­
ployers in a labor market area 
and are available for use by 
job seekers in most of the public 
employment services 2,500 
local offices. 

-=======~====================::. ___________________ _ 
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Scotties Restaurants & Equipment 
d/b/a SIM-CO Company by Court Order #77-54 

1l1i~ i' a Bask tlartiollist in each rcsJat1rant 
location: Soft Ice Cream \lachine, Ice \lJ~· 
er, Grill, Coffee Maker, Toaster, Stainle\.~ 
Steel Sink, Soft Drink Foumain Dis1Jcnsor, 
Cash Registers, Refrigerator, Freezer. Coun· 
tcr, Stools, Disioes, Siherware & other item" 

Sales willlx' conducted on tloe following dates 
and locations: 

Monday-Sept. 18th 
LOCATION: Monticello, Ken lucky · South Moin Street 

TIME 10;()() A.M. C.D.T. 

1973 Ford Utility Truck, 1968 International (Tractor) Truck, Office Equipment, Furnishmgs and Supplies , also 
3 otherScott1es Restaurants & Equipment which have been moved from Morehead, Harlan, & Columbia. These 
have been moved 10 Monticello and w1ll be sold at this location. 

Tuesday-Sept. 19 t~ 
LOCATION: LANCASTER, KI:NTUCKY on US 17 North 

TIME 10 OOA.M. E.D.T. 

LOCA liON: STANFORD, KI:NTUCKY on U.S. 27 By Pass 

TIME 11•00 A.M. LD.T. 

LOCATION: SOMERSET, KENTUCKY on U.S. 27 Soutlo 
TIME: 2:00P.M. E.D.T. 

Wednesday - Sept. 20t~ 
LOCATION: HAZARD, KENTUCKY 

TIME: 10:00 A.M . E.D.T. 

LOCATION: PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

TIME: 2 00 P.M. E.D.T. 
Friday-Sept. 22nd 

LOCATION: MANCHESTER, KENTUCKY 

TIME: IO;Qi) A.M. E.D.T. 

TlRMS: Cash or Acceptable Check on Bid, Tloe Day of Sale. 
POSSESSION: Day of Sale. 

M>TF.· We have been commio;sioned by JUdgement in bankruptcy number 77-54 to sell at Publlc Auction on the 
above times and dates for the account of Simmons & Cooper, Inc. d!b!a SIM-CO Company 
For further details, contact Taft A. \lcKiru.try, Tru,toe 

Lexington, Ktnlucky 
(606) 252-6731 or S.l .. Ag•nl 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT SELLING AGENT 

SAMUEL AAV GODBY, AUC:TION((A &. ._f:Al.TOR 

•·Anno.,;ncemantt O•Y Of S.tJe Take Prtc:•d•nu Out Wr11ten,. 

The Floyd County Times 

13-0Z. SIZ 
CONCENTRATE READY-TO·FEED 

BABY BABY 
FORMULA FORMULA 

59 Simi lac 
s;milao age Enfamil Enfamil 
or 
SMA 

~ 

GOOD FOR so~~ CASH 

WIL-CAR 

PAIITY 
HOSE 
Assorted Sizes 

and Shades 

59c 
WIL-CAR 
ALL NUDE 

PAIITY 
HOSE 
"SHEER WAIST 

TO TOE" 

sac 
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PROCTOR-SILEX 

AUTOMATIC 
10 CUP DRIP 

COFFEE lAKER 
With Automatic Switch 

Control and Brew For Two 

$29.95 $1&·· Value 

GILLETTE 

PRO Ill 
COMPACT 1200 WT. 
HAIR DRYER 

$1&•• 
WRIGLEY MARS 

ORBIT SUPER BARS 
3 MUSKETEER BUBBLEGUM 

MILKYWAY OUR REG. 
Our Reg. 25c Each 25cEACH 

5/89c 2/25c 
With Your Purchase Of 

With Your Purchase Of With Your Purchase 
Bag of 80 of Any 

TEDDY BEAR NEWBORN 4-0z. Size 

DISPOSABLE DIAPERS NEET LOTIOII TIMEX OR EST WATCH 

LEXINGTON PEN TAB UNITED SUAVE 
45-Piece HAIR SPRAY 4-SUBJECT POCKET 

THEME BOOK MEMO BOOK 

09 2 c 
*5·144-4 

*211·01 $988 
Ostervibra Massage Vibrator ................ . 

SHELL 
FLYIIIG 

INSECT KILLER MAGNAD~NE IILKM-CB $588 
CB Slide Mounting Bracket ............... . . . 

150 Watt $389 
Sylvania Outdoor Flood Bulb ............... . 

$2.09 Value Each 

Hartz Creme Shampoo ...................... $1 79 SUMMER CLEARANCE SALE!! 
WHILE QUANTITIES LAST 

Hartz Cat Wormer .......................... $1 79 

................... $211 

.................. $191 
Hartz Hot Dog Play Toy .................... . 

Hartz 5/8" Weather Proof Collar ............. . 

79c #785-12E POLORON 

One Gallon Picnic Jug 
#P14E POLORON 
30 at. Plastic Ice Chest 
#P248 POLORON 
48 at. Plastic Ice Chest . ................. $1488 

$288 #721 -24 Poloron 
1 at Insulated Canteen .................. . 

$388 MARSHALLAN 
18" Hang-It-Up Grill .................... . 

6.4-0Z. SIZE 
The Winning Combination For 

eight Loss TAKE WEIGHT ~ ~~: AIM 
II ~~;· TOOTHPASTE 

One a day ag:;,..u;t ·;,t 1.250 caloue dtet pl1n 
appettte .... ;~~:~·~~" ~ helps you · utlhtn 

suppressant I dellctously so you can 
~~~~~t· works hour I! illJfj lgse pounds & tnchu 
- Jfler hour k wtthout gotn; hungry 

Dexatrim One·A·Day Capsule and Diet 
Plan can help you shed pounds and inches BOX OF 56 
- wJthoJt strenuous exercises or expensive 
trea!ments So start today . . become 
the slim, trim person you want to be! 
Read and follow all label Info rmation 

16-0Z. SIZE 

ROYAL OELUX 

BALSAM 
SHAMPOO 

or COIIDITIOIIER 

YOUR ggc 
CHOICE 

1·0Z. SIZE 

L'OREAL 
PREFERENCE 

SHAMPOO 

$149 

24-0Z. SIZE 

SCOPE 
MOUTHWASH 

$2.69 VALUE 

L'OREAL 
PREFERENCE 

PERMANENT 
CREME-IN 

HAIR COLOR 

$255 

~ WITH 

~~l~ 
1-0Z. SIZE 

CLEIRISIL 
CREAM MEDICATION 

$175 $2.29 
Value 

TINTED 
OR VANISHING 

DR. SCHOLL'S 
ODOR 

DESTROYING 
INSOLES 

OFF Prolam1ne T1me Capsules work 4 ways 
(1) Helps control appetite. count-eract hunger 
w1th one of the most powerful appetite sup­
pressan!s available w1tll-~~-~ 

out prescroption. (2) Gentle d1uretic action ~--·-··-· 
helps your body elimmate excess water. ~=--==.:: _ 
(3) Mild stomulant helps you feel alove and _.,::---. -
alert as you take we1ght off. (4) Diet plan P-f91am•n! 
shows how to eat well, ea! less and take --;;=.::::..,­
weight off successfully $ 8 9 ' ----·-· · · · .. · 

BOX OF 50 

instapure water filter PKG. OF 3 
.~ ~u • .,l'i 

Turn to cleaner, TRACS 
better tasting 

80·MINUTE water. CASSETTE 

~~ . $29.95 BLANK RECORDING 
. , t ,!LYALUE TAPE 

; $169 t~J $2488 

SHELL 
AIR-PILLO PROFESSIONAL 

STRENGTH 
INSOLES 

FLYING INSECT 
• All sizes 
• Mens or KILLER 

Womens 

age 15-0Z. 77c 
SIZE 
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USED AND NEW 

BAND 
INSTRUMENTS 
OWENS MJ.ISIC CENTER 

Ph. 886-8337.62 So. Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

S-23-6t. 

WANTED: 
Reading Instructional Assistant 
Prestonsburg Community ColleJZe 
Bachelor's Degree required, 
Master's Degree preferred with 
college courses in reading. 
Contact Linda Little at 886·3863 
for an appointment. 

Immediate Employment. 
Equal Opportunity Employer. 

lt. 

You Can Work 
And Still Be Home When 
Your Family Xeeds You 

SELL AVON 
Phone 886-2838 and 452-2320 

1· 11 -tf 

Hey, Look! 
EASTERN TRADING POST 

Eastern, Ky. 

RE-OPE!'II!\G SI<:PT. 18 

Good pre-owned furniture, ap­
pliances. antiques, miscellaneous. 

Everything 20 percent off first 
day. 

lt-pd. 

Buy From l's or 
We Both Lose. 

TURKEY SHOOT 
Every Sunday, 10 a.m. 

Across creek from Garth 
Vocational School at 1\lancie Bent­
ley's . 

9-13·3t-pd. 

DOZER WORK 
AND 

USED 
MOBILE HOMES 

FOR SALE 
From $219500 
886-9683 or 886-6093 

7-12-tf. 

BIG 
WHAT'S IN STOCK 

TIRE SALE 
0 
N 
L 
y 10% OVER 

COST 
plus installation 

• All Sizes for Cars and Trucks 
• White Spoke Wheels 

Cash and Carry-

No Prices Quoted by Telephone 

BOBBY WATSON TIRE SALES 
406 So. Lake Drive Prestonsburg 

9·13-2t. 

The Floyd County Times 

DIXON NUNNERY 
REALTOR 

Wi II Sell or Buy 
Your Real Estate. 

886-2189 
.J.t f. 

lt. 

Re-opening 

HOLBROOK'S 
GARAGE 

Expert Body-Paint Work 

Main St. 
W. Prestonsburg 

<across from Betsy Ross) 

Call 886-6437 

FOR SALE 
On North Arnold Ave. 4-
bedroom home, 21!2 baths, 
living room with fireplace, 
dining room/ kitchen, full­
size basement with large 
family room, fireplace, 
kitchen, utility room, two 
other rooms that can be 
used as bedrooms or hobby 
rooms~ large partially 
finished attic. Over 3800-sq. 
ft. altogether. Many extras 
included. Shown by ap­
pointment only. 

Phone 886-2968 
9-6-4t. 

SALES 
Industrial fasteners, truck 
parts, hydraulic hose and 
fittings. Ca II on industrial 
and automotive accounts. 
Prestonsburg-Pikeville area. 
Salary and commission. Call 
Tom Brown, Mayo Trail in 
Pikeville, 4 to 7 p.m., Sept. 
13-14. Phone 437-4041. 

TIFCO INDUSTRIES 

Don't settle 
for less than 
a quality 

,..,,.,.,. * 
Air Command 
gas furnace for your 
home. Call for an 
estimate 

lt. 

L WE SERVICE- WHAT \VESELL.] 

SANDY VALLEY 
HARDWARE 

Phone 87-1·9218 Allen, Ky. 

9-13·2t. 

PROPERTY FOR SALE 
With three house seats and 
two dri lied wells. 

Phone 886-3674. 
8-16-4t. 

FOR SALE 

1978 CORVETTE. 
One owner. Only 7,000 miles. 
Loaded. 

8_30_4t . Phone 606-885-6916 

Hamilton 
Cabinet Shop 

CUSTOM AND 
STOCK CABINETS. 

Stock ('a binet on Display. 

Phone 478-5261 or 478-5034 

tf. 
Stanville, Ky. 

WHAT ABOUT YOU? 
Are you energetic, ambitious , in­
dependent, a self-starter . Plenty of 
people start with us part-time and 
keep right on going to a full-time 
cart'er. Phone 60!i-!!74-9041. 

An Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 

8·16-tf. 

PART TIME MONEY 
Earn money part-time while 
children are in school. Be alert, in­
telligent and ready to assume 
responsibility. Phone 606-!!74-9041. 

An Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 

8·16-tf. 

Insulate your home 
befO're winter with insulated 
aluminum siding from . . . 

LEE'S 
ALUMINUM COMPANY 

Aluminum siding in 10 
colors, soffet and overhang 
work. All work guaranteed 
- Free estimates. 

Phone 874-9123, after 5: 30p.m . 
Bank financing. 

8-23-tf. 

* IMMEDIATE OPENINGS * 
For two •nechanically inclined 
persons who arf' ablf' to work \\ell 
with other people to sen:ice our 
product. If .1 ou are not no\\ earning 
at least $150 IH'f'kly, \\e \\ant to 
talk to ) 011. This is a permanent 
position with a na tiona I 
organi1ation. Local work with 
opportunity for advancement to 
right person. Phone ti!HHOS bet­
ween !I and 10 a.m . 

3-29-tf. 

GUNS & AMMO 
at 

FRASURE'S GUN SHOP 
Route 1427 Bonanza, Ky. 

7-5-tf. 

OUSLEY CONCRETE 
CONSTRUCTION, INC. 

Commercial & Residential 

West Prestonsburg. K.Y · 
Kox 1!11 

J.\:\IES Ol'SLEY 
8Hfi-83i3 

HOUSE FOR SALE 

7-20-tf . 

On Abb~tt :\ltn. 5-bt>droom, 2 baths, 
living room. dining room, den , and 
large kitcht>n. Fully carpt>ted, city 
water , total E-lectric , and a 
beautiful mountain l'iew. Les~ than 
2 ytars old . 

Shown by appointment only . · 
Phone 886-8654 after 6 p.m. ~-.~~. 

GRAVEL 
FOR SALE 

Minimum 12 Tons, 
Delivered. 

PHONE 874-2166 
6·7-tf. 

GENE MEADE 
CONCRETE 

Phone 789-6787 
We specialize in floors , driveways, 
patios, porches and retaining 
walls. Also stucco, new or repair; 
cracked walls and foundation 
work. ,\nything in concrete. 26 
years' experience. If we please 
you, tell others; if not, tell us. 

8_23_tf. Call, collect, Anytime. 

DON'T ••• 
Give your 5-wheel drive 
away. We will definitely 
give you more than you can 
realize on a trade. 

\ 
I 
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WALLACE TV 
<On old Ht . ;!:1, brtiH't'n ,\lien and 
Pn•stonsburg l ~ 

Authorized RCA, Zenith, 
Quasar Factory Service 
Center. 
Open 512 days a week, Mon­
day thru Saturday. 

Phone 874-2644 
4-1\Hf. 

-----------1 HELP WANTED I 
I WAITRESS, CARHOPS I 
I COOKS I 

Cl.r\SSIFI ED ADVERTISING 
HATES 

!!c l'er \\ord, if paid in advance 
Hlc Per word on charge account 

($1.50 minimum) 
Display cla:.sified advertising 
$2.:15 p<>r column inch. 
Headline for ads: ~p.m. :\1onda,y. 

.. 

Water Well 
Drilling 

Most wells drilled in half a 
day by Hotary Machine. 

· Kinzer Drilling Co. 
Allen, Ky. 

* Phone 874-2258 

LENNOX 
uJ 

i\IH CONDITIO!'IING' • IIEATI!'IG 

For free estimates, or service 

EllioH Glass & Electric I Apply in person between 3 and 4 I 
I p .m. I Phone !!!!6-2781, Prestonsburg 
I !\o Phone calls please. I '----------.;....~ 
IJERRY'S RESTAURANT I 
I 

3
t Prestonsburg I 

18-30· I ----------
EXPERIENCED CARPENTER 

• !'lew Additions • Remodeling 
• Roofing • Painting 

CALL 285-9644 
8-30-3t. 

COAL LAB TECHNICIAN 
Permanent position for ex­

perienced person. Offers attractive 
salary plus incentive . Analyst 
Superintendents, the world's oldest 
and largest independent inspection 
company, will open new laboratory 
in the Paintsville-Prestonsburg 
area to offer multiple services to 
the coal mining industry. Appli­
cants apply by letter outlining 
experience in detail to: 

9-6-2t. 

1\lr. Larry Jones 
Chief Chemist 
Superintendents Co., Inc. 
Mobile, Alabama 36601 

~----------1 I MANAGEMENT POSITION I 
I OPEN I 
I Expanding business needs I 
I manager for Long John Silver's I 
I Seafood Shoppe. I 

Send resume to 

IJERRY'S RESTAURANT I 
1 Attn: Boyd Thompson 1 
I Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 I 

(Interviews will be set 
I at a later date.> I 
I S-3o-3t. I ----------

FOR SALE 
USED 

MACK PARTS 

• Maxidyne engines. 

• Maxidyne transmissions. 

• Thermodyne engines. 

•18-speed Quad transmissions 

• Rear ends, springs, etc. 

S-30-4t-pd. 

Charles West 
Phone 874-2027 

CONCRETE 
WORK 

• Patios' Driveways • Steps 
• Sidewalks• Block Work 

FREE ESTIMATES. 

EUGENE OUSL~Y 

Phone 886-3092 
4-26-tf. 

We are taking applications 
for good management 
personnel. Must be 18 years 
or older and eager to work, 
learn and make something of 
themselves. Available for 
expansion. Salary $600 to 
$1000 plus benefits. Good 
future for aggressive person. 
If this is you, send resume, or 
see Steve Harp or Vincel 

Cooley. •l; b • 

N. Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Equal Opportunity Employer 
9-13-2t. 

BILLY R. WHITT 
Painting- Paper Hanging 

Ceramic Tile 
Phone 874-245-t Free Estimates 

8·9-lOt· d. 

Sandy Valley Monument 
and Building Stone Co., Inc. 
Phone 874-2273--Allen. Ky. 

PORTABLE 
CONCRETE 
STEPS 

MARBLE AND STONE SUPPLIES: 

• Marble Landscape chips 
• Marble Window Sills 
• Limestone Window Sills 
• Limestone Veneering 
• Vermont Slate 

Located On Old U.S. 23 
In New Allen 

l-21-tf. 

WRIGHT'S 
SEAMLESS G.UTTER 

Phone 377-6606 :Minnie, Ky. 

NO LEAKS- BAKED ON ENAMEL $ 
NEYER NEEDS PAINTING ••• 
CHOICE OF SIX COLORS ••• 

120PER FOOT 
INSTALLEu 
Slightly more 

for color. 

FREE ESTIMATES 
We Do Aluminum Eave Work. 

Reasonable Prices - Work Guaranteed 



F.O RBNT- oblle home loti 
moatb. 280 AMP All-Sl81otrll4ti 
telephoM, t levi ion, cabl 
clerpouad. Allc:e LloJd OllleCe 
and atlonal lllnel. C.udiD'a 
Home Park. ,.,a P--., KJ PhGfte --.Alit ror Juanita. •a.•. 

FOR SALB-1• 4-dDor SedM De Ville 
cadlllac. Alr-coadWaDed. WID .t 
1oocfreuoaable prlc:e. Goad CGIMIIUDD. Pbc.e-.rm. 1t.pd. 

FOR SALE-4 draDI aDd I duclrl. call 
...... lt-pd. 

Vlsrr 1be ChancUel' Hou.. Trea_... 
from the put. Jeffenoa Ave. , Paiat· 
svWe, Kentucky. 4-lJ.tf. 

SALE! SALE! SALE!-Qaala liDk feaee. 
Any heilbt. Relldeallal aad c.n· 
mercial. Free eetimatet. H. L. Sitler, 
8M-3D73or_... 1-17-tf. 

ELI!CTROLYI 
Permanent hair relllOV-. witlllout any 

aida damqe. Safe and peinJew. ()pta 
Monday, TQeldq, Friday and 
Saturday, t a.m.·l p.m., located OD 
CoUece Street .,_. tbt bridle· can 
co8tet.,..... far appaiatmeat. N-tf. 

CUSTOM-IIADB draPe~ ad matchinl 
~ell. bJ a. w. NOl'IIWl aac1 
~ ............ to fit. BEN 
FRANXLIN STORB, pllaDe -.21a, or 
SaiiJ Goebel, pboM .. .,. 5-11-tf. 

WATal REPAIR-If ,.a want tbe belt 
job, briDI watcb nplln and jewelry 
repaln to WIUGJIT BROS. 
JEWELERS. 

CHAIN LINK FENCE-Relldeatial md 
commen:ial. PaiatmDe Feadaa. can 
(Collect) 718-1321. J.J+tf. 

CUSTOM DRAPERIII:B-Excluslve 
AERO Drapery dealer far this area. 
Save oQ CUitom Draperiea. OUr 
deeontGr will brilll fabric to your 
home for your selection. Free 
estimate. can NOW for appoiatllleat. 
7IN533 or 718-1752. PaintsvUie Fabric 
I& SewiDI CeDta'. 11-Hf. 

IDterior and ateriGr Porter pelat, 1,. 
colon to cboole from. BEN 
FRANKLIN STORE, pbaae ... 21., 
PreltGDIIMq. 1-IHI. 

FOR SALJ:-8aad, •ubed ud 
sereeaed. , dr1 er . -...t feir 
1DiDe fll baUdhlp SANDS OF 
RQCKCAS'1'LE CRBEK, IDea, Ken­
tucky, pbaDe ...... day, -.a14, 
nllbt. 11·17-tf. 

BRICK AND BLOCK WORK. 
Specializiq in firep1a.:.. Eveainp, 
phone 217-t080. 7-•1ot-pd. 

OFFICE SUPPLIES, FURNITURE 
AND CALCULATORS-V.I.P. Office 
Supply, lac., beside Maloney's 
Dilcolmt Store. See Troy Ca1bauD or 
BradlaCbilden,Pbone•IMt. 11-21-tf. 

LAND FOR SALE-,._., acre~ oa C8Dey 
Creek, Knott couety ne.r National 
Miaee. Known aa HiraiD GINoD place. 
Phone -.-1. Viva Gibloa, Box 14, 
Wayland. l+tf. 

111E GUITAR MAN-:-tee or eal1 Troy 
CalbcQa, )'Oaf local deal• lor Guild 
and Yamaha pitan. PbGae •••tor ...... ....,. 

BUILDING LOTS FOR SALE....Qa Stone 
Coal Creek at Garrett. Ra1J1b O'QIIbm, 
.... 1-..U. 

BLAIR'S ROOFING-Industrial, 
camaa8'0ial and re.tdllltial. Fully 
1-.d .IDd all work ,......... Ia 

• Pne utlmatee. PboDe .,... 
-. G._ Blair, Box 115, 'l'taelma 1CJ. 
41.a S.1.U. 

YARD SALE-W.aael_,, Sept. 11, at 
lllneJ ( ..... ) P*lttaa's, Nlll' of 
.................... .,... It-pd. 

WE BUY USJ:D "FURNITURE-One 
piece or fUll. 1lhCIIle .... 
bet..-t adiiiDa .sat. after I p.m , 

..... -· 1-IS-tt-pd. 
FOR SALE I J0t1D bau• with bllb and 

lara• pelce PI'GI*tr· Di'iUed well, 
nat .... ps aad above llaod levil. At 
HueyiYWe. call-.uJl. cart LayDe. ..... 

FOR SALB---AX.C. Nllltend Cock• 
puPIJHI,sev• old. can---. 

.... -pd. 

SEVJ:RAL FAMILY GARAOB SALE­
Sept. 14, 11, and 11, OD ~ load I 
milel ftom lltn. Parhiy, Billie 
....... lt. 

TRAILER FOR REN'I'-tl71 ID4M,Itldy 
plus $100 deposit. No .... c:auplel 
prefened. Call17+J'121after I p.m. lt· 
pd. 

LIVING ROOM 
GROUPS ....... , .. 

.... ....... •111Mil .. lll 
.. o.. ••• ......... 
,, ....... 
.,. Deak ....... , 

See Cl•nnce Mllrtin 
or Mllry Lou a.iley 

MARTIN'S 
FURNITURE 
Open 9-S, Mon.-S.t. 

Ptl. 174-9921 

3 Miles North of Allen, 
011 Old u.s. 23 

Urll GIIC 4 x 4 J»ICKUP FOR SALE­
Six-cylinder, tbnHpeed transmillion 
on column, sliclllll rear window. Brown 
in color. New with factory warrantJ. 
•·••· Phone88Wl4t <uk for Mike.> 

lt. 
HOUSE FOR SALE-For Information, call-... f.13-2t-pcl. 

HELP WANTED-Sports·minded 
.....,.n, Ult be neat in appearance, 
have car, md desire to earn money. 
call -.. •• Wednelday and Tbun­
dayoalJ. U-pcl. 

FOR SALE-1170 Cadlllae. Loaded-air­
coadltloninl, AM·FM 8-traet, all 
power, cndle control. Very 'ood 
~Uan. Alldal $1300. Allo one 
Mediterran.n sola, red, $30, and one 
ldtebea table, IOlid wood, MO. can .. 
61Maft• 5 p.m. u-pd. 

HOUSE FOR SALE-7-room, batb and 
utillty at Shop Fort, Waylad Pbone 
-..e71t. Harlan Pafle, Jr. R.R. 1-A, 
Wayland •t-tf. 

TAXJDDUOST-Il yean' experience 
IDCIUitiDa pme beads, fllb, ete. Pad 
Rablll Taxidermy, loelted six mtlel 
Ill& e1 lllihom Oty, on Rowe 110. 
PIIGDt701o81.... • 1-11-llt. 

t.&T YOU--IIal1 your awn 
b._ With aae of tbe Jeaclnl West 
Vlrpda ............ TraalpoltaUaD 
aile aaee -paid, but mut haft 
~ na.portatian. Teriitoriet 
opia ............... Left Beav.-, 
Alhft, P . can Randy Worrell, 
m:.ta, fartllerlnlormltian. M-tf. 

HOWARD RRY, Geaeral paintial 
anddrJ U.,, minor earpeatry. Call 
-.l11aaltr4p.m. 5-1G-1et-pd', 

LAW 0 &R ..... mall outboard 
motors llld t1llen ,.,.arecs. HORN: 
R&PAIR SHOP, Pbeae -.rrn. 

·1~. 
fOR ALE AKC Doberman PID1c:ber 

,..._.. red female, 1 black m81e. 
................... 1t-pd; 

MOBILE HOME OF LEGAL SALI: 1 used 
..-.. Bill Hall D-'ft rru CaterpUiar Dl Tractor, 8-N lOK.._ -· y • n ··~· andoutllt 1aewAJJmaadMaxi-IJte,S.: 

J'OR SALE-Grocery N 107704, a it, wh .. II, lor eath to the 
lhelvmg. Taylor Price, hilbelt bidder at tbe Whayne SUpply 
3832. COmpMJ, U.S IS South Ma,o Trail, 

D 0 N A H U E G U N S M IT HI Pikeville Keatucty, on Friday, Sep-
GWlamithing, plus new and Qlld temb.-11, 1t'llll10 a m. <local time) . 
with all types ammWlitiCIDI LU-.r~K.:. SeU.. reserve~ tbe rilbt to bid 
Ky. 41645. Phone 285-3743, WHAYNE SUPPLY COMPANY. f.s-at. 

SALE-Irllh Setten-1 male and 1 
HOUSE FOR SALE-Five-roam, female. Price, $50 C.ll17+~. after 5 

frame at Goble-Roberti :.~=~· p.m. lt-pd . $29,000. Phone 1-298·7821. 
DuncanRay,City. ABYSITTING POSITION 

A V AILABLJ:-()ccallonal after-echool 
FOR SALE-8ingle 24-inch Salem and we*day•veninl work. Call 886-

with 150 ft. of steel; eleetrio 8634. It-pd. 
generator. $95,000, or beat offer Tel•:/;t;. 
available. Phonet74-680'1. 1979 FORD F-110 4 x 4 Cor sale. Six-

cylinder eqlae, 4-lpeed traasmiuion, 
FQR. RENT-Two-room busim• power steeriDI; radio,~. slidinl 

.aad two-room apartment. Call rear window, 1oq wide bed, rear step 
T.I:.Neeley. bwnper, mud and saow tires and 

more! Br ... ad new with factory 
FOk RENT-Two-room busine11 warranty. $7,111 ~UI tax and llcenae. 

CaU886-3154.T.E.Neeley. Phone88H1fiUutforVic.) lt. 

6-F AMIL Y RUMMAGE SALE-Wed., 
Thurs., Fri., 9 to 4 daily. Furnitw-e, 
clothes, dishes, odds and ends. ¥4 mile 
up Com Fork ~ Brandykeg. For in­
formation, call886-9873. lt-pd. 

CLERK WANTED-Experience 
necessary. Good references. Male or 
female. Preston~g Jewelry Store. 
886-273t. lt. 

4-FAMILY YARD SALE-Lots of stuff! 
Saturday, 8-~ in Auxier at moutb of 
Depot Hollow. Judy Music and Brenda 
Allen. It-pd. 

FOR SALE-1976 Ford Falcon; four· 
door, at.tomatic, 289 engine, easy on 
gas, excellent condition. $475. Phone 
35H383. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE-A CB 400 F Honda. Good 
condition. $700. BarUy Bartrwn, Call 
285-3348. lt·pci. 

WEIGHT-Safely & fast with X-11 
Plan $3.00. Reduce Excess Fluids 

X·Pel $3.50. Fountain Korner 
8-23-1~pd. 

SALE-1973 Docile Dart. Alia 1966 
van and White Rock pullets. 

GROCERY, Drift, Ky. 1-ZI-

SALE-10' x 56' 2-bed room mobile 
e, ~.00; 8' x rJ' 2-bed room 

-eel, $1,795; 12' X 50' 19'72 2-bed 
,a,om "Buddy," $4,200; 10' x t5' 2-bed 

m, $1,386; lG-ton Low Boy $1,581. 
one -..a. lt·pd. 

i'PERIENCED MACHINIST WAN· 
1'EI>-with tools. Halbert's Machine I& 

eldinl Shop, Printer, Ky. PhODe 2a&­
t-13-a. 

RTUNITY 
h ....... I. 
100. 
• uilclng. 

together. 

WANTED TO Btl¥ 
ap~,odd1 
9181,anytime 

REAL ESTATE-We 188 and. bdy laM 
and real estateo. call Robett DeftoiiiU, 
pbone&-3114. 11-'ltf. 

HELP WANTED ExperieDced canere&e 
finisher Must have hand tooll and 
transportation. Wa1e1 open PbaDe-. 
8373, West Prettoasburg. Ouster 
Concrete Cout , Inc s.22-tf'. 

FOR SALE-Office macblaes, oUlee 
supplies, office ha'niture <new and 
used>. Service on all makel of oflee 
machines. Phone or write BERT 
BIBEE, HOME OFFICE SUPPLY 
co., phone t36-5711, Hazard Ky. 

WANTED SECURITY GUARDS. Storm 
Sectrity Systems, IDe., t4l South Lag 
Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky., bact of May 
Sign Company. We are ac:eept1a1 
applications for security guards. All 
applicants must be 21 years of age and 
have a clean police record. Our pard~ 
are bonded, licensed and illiUI'8d. 
Storm Secw-ity Systems is Kentueky'1 
largest privately owned security 
company. our home office is Lonea, 
Ky., with branch officee in Hazard and 
Prestonsburg. All employees wUI be 
)llred from this area. 

11-11-tf. 
MOUNTAINEER MACK SALES AND 

SERVICES, witb facilitlet iD Hta· 
tinston, W. Va.,andLowmansville, Ky. 
Has position openiDp for Clul A 
diesel mechanics and service ei..U. A 
great opportooity to grow with a 
growinl company. Exp.-ieace necee­
ary. Salary commensurate with 
experience. Paid vacations, 
hospitalization, pension plan, and ather 
frlqe benefits. Pleue note: e're 
looldftl for experienced mechaaica. Ia 
West Virginia call (304) 73Htll. Ia 
Kentucky call (606) 217-etol. 1-»tf. 

FOR SALE -4GO-acre Moataoaery 
County farm sui~ble for dairy, bonl, 
or catUe farm. Improved witla four 
houses, five tobacco blml, one new 
largebarn,size80x 156-ft.1,001-toD.UO 
with altomatic feeder, two 2.00Hillll 
silos with at.tomatic feederl. 1• acre~ 
of this farm is all level. lt,-.lb 
tobacco base, watered by I poads, 1 
lake, 2 creeks. IAcated abed I mllel 
east of Mt. Sterllq, Ky. 

185-acres Clark County fann located 
about 3 miles from Winebelter, X,. 
Improved with t tobacco barns, 1 old 
two-story house; watered by t polldl 
and creek. Good fencla&. Lolli road 
frontal•. 1,800-lb. tobacco bale. 

231-acre Bath County farm. Four 
tobacco barns, two houses, a,-.lb 
tobacco base. Watered by 5 poadl, 2 
sprinp and creek. Eay terms have 
been arranged for eadl of tbell fann1 
at 8 percent ln.-. 

RA POTTER R 
BROKER, AUCTIO 1• Mt. Sterlllll. 

AL BSTAT& 
,PbaDe­..... 
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TWO HOUSES FOR SALE-in West 
Prestonsburg. Call886-9460 or 886-2157. 

9-13-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Three-bedroom brick, near 
Prestonsburg. Full size basement with 
kitchen and playroom: fireplace up· 
stairs and down. Phone 886·2604 after 5 

9-5-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-1975 Yamaha RD 350; 6-
speed, expansion chambers. Call 886-
2230. 9-13-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-1976 MG, in good condition. 
Phone 874-2640. 9-13·2! -pd. 

FOR SALE-1973 trailer, 12' x 45,' 2-
bedrooms, furnished. Price, $3,500. 
Call Dena Patton 886-8781 after 5 p.m. 

9·13·2t. 

FOR SALE-1976 Monza 2- 2, 4-cylinder. 
automatic. Low mileage. Good con­
dition. Call358-9308. 9-13-2!-pd. 

FOR SALE-Female Siberian husky, 18 
months old. Call358-9716after 4 p.m. 9-
13-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Seven-room house in 
Martin, with garage, new gas floor 
furnace, new gas water heater. All city 
conveniences. On large lot. Call only if 
interested. Phone 285·9527. EUGENE 
MCKINNEY, Martin, Ky. 9-13·2t. 

LARGE FARM FOR SALE-by owner. 
119 acres, 4 mi., from Cave Run 
Reservoir. Located on Hwy. 1639, 
Korea, Ky. Also one 1973 Ferguson 
:\lodel 135 tractor, 2 plows, disc. 
mower, used one season, 124 Ferguson 
hay baler and rake. JIMMY JOHN­
SON, Korea, Ky., Phone 768-3302. 9-13-
21. 

MOBILE HOME FOR SALE-Deluxe 12' 
x 55' 1978 model, 3-bedrooms. Call John 
Adkins, 606-478-9246. 9-13-2!. 

COUNTRY LEAD GUITARIST WAN­
TED-Must be able to work days and 
travel locally. $40 per day plus ex­
penses. Call between 10 a.m. and 6 
p.m., 452-4441. 9-13-2!-pd. 

FOR SALE-1969 Chevrolet, runs good, 
$450 phone 285-9096. Lula Tackett, 
Printer. 9-13-2t. 

FOR SALE-1970 Mercury Montego. Call 
886-2997. 9-13-2t-pd. 

PART-TIME HELP NEEDED-Quality 
stamp store, Rt. 23 North, Prestons­
burg Must be 18 years of age or older. 
Please apply in person No phone calls 
please. 9-13-2t. 

FOR SALE-1976 Jeep Renegade CJ5. 
New chocolate brown top, 40,000 miles. 
Very good condition. $4,200. If in­
terested, call 377-6372 or 377-6703 after 
5:30p.m. 9-13-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE- Three-year old brick house 
at Shelbiana in the low 60's also, small 
hillside lots at Branham Heights; also. 
approximately one-acre lot, one mile 
up mare Creek at Stanville. Call 432-
4192 or 437-4377. Patty West, Pikeville, 
Ky. 9-13-2!. 

LOTS FOR RENT-Suitable for flea 
market or rummage sale. Excellent 
location Call886-8307 after 5. 9-13-3t­
pd. 

FOR SALE-Five room house, newly 
remodeled in Prestonsburg. Call 886-
3466after 5p.m 9-13-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Two lots located on Rt. 80, 3 
miles from Allen Central high school. 
One has well with pump and water 
softener. septic tank, electric hook-up, 
telephone and TV cable. Other is newly 
leveled. Call358-4135 or 358-9532. 9-13-
31. 

BRICK WORK-All type fireplaces. 15 
years experience. Free estimates. Call 
297-6228. 9-13-31-pd. 

HOUSE FOR SALE-at Hueysville, Ky., 
near church, store, postoffice. Call 
ALLENE COMBS, 277-6363, Lexington, 
Ky., 40504. 9-13-3t. 

FOR SALE-2 lots, 50' ~ 100', within lh 
mile of Paintsville Dam. Owner will 
finance. Call886-2566. 9-13-3t-pd. 

FOR RE!\'T-Furnished room, share 
bath, 17 Westminister Street, for one 
working man. Phone886-6627. 9-13-2!­
pd 

QUICK CASH-Paid for good used 
wringer type washing machines, 
refrigerators, and stoves. Phone 358-
9161 - anyt1me. 9-13-4t-pd. 

WA!\'TED-Running bad and dirty cars 
or trucks, will pay thirty to $100, 
depending on condition. Call Len after 
5 p.m. anytime weekends, 377-6741. 9-
13-4t. 

''GRAPEFRUIT PILL" with Diadax 
plan more convenient than grapefruits 
-Eat salisfying meals and lose weight. 
Potter Clinic Pharmacy. 9-13-4t·pd. 

LOTS FOR SALE- All lots at Brandy 
Keg Estates, Jenny Wiley State Park 
road,. Negotiable, very small down 
payment, with balance at 8 percent 
over 10 years by owner. Phone 342-3570, 
252-3059 or 293-0408 9-13-6t. 

FOR SALE-House. Call358-9185, 
9-13-&t-pd 

Business Opportunities 
Three estate auctions, Saturday. 

September 23, 1978 to settle the estate of 
the late Emily Mann: two farms and two 
houses and lots. 

AUCTION NO.1: 10: A.M. EDT on the 
premises, about seven miles east of Mt. 
Sterling on the Spencer Pike and Hope 
Road near Antioch Church in Mont­
gomery County, Kentucky. Farm con­
tains about 112 acres and is improved 
with one two-story farm house, one eight­
bent tobacco barn, one three-bent stock 
barn, one double com crib, one hay shed. 
Tobacco base for 1978 is 5,278 lbs. 
Average fencing, watered by pond, creek 
and spring; lays extra good. 

AUCTION NO. 2: 11:30 A.M. EDT on 
the premises. Two houses and lots 
located in Camargo about five miles 
southeast of Mt. Sterling in Montgomery 
County, Kentucky on Highway No. 460 
across from Mt. Sterling National Bank. 
House No. 1 has four rooms, one bath, 
city water and gas. House No.2 has three 
rooms, one bath, city water and gas. 

AUCTION NO.3: 2:00P.M. EDT on the 
premises. 123·1·z acre farm located about 
seven miles east of Owingsbille near 
Olympia in Bath County, Kentucky on 
Kentucky Highway 36. Farm 
improved with one farm house, two four­
bent tobacco barns, one three-bent stock 
barn, one crib, average fencing and long 
road frontage. Tobacco base for 1978 is 
2,107 lbs. New city water line in front. 
Two springs and creek. About 75 acres in 
good grass and cropland and rest in 
timberland. 

All three sales can be shown by ap­
pointment with Ira Potter, real estate 
broker, Mt. Sterling, Kentucky. (606} 498-
1609. 

LEWIS A. WHITE 
MASTER COMMISSIONER, 

MONTGOMERY CIRCUIT COURT 
Mt. Sterling, Kentucky 

9-6-3t. 

FOR SALE--6-room house with bath and 
another 36 x 18ft. building on lot 60 x 100 
ft. On KY 80 at Maytown. CLAUDE 
LAYNE, Phone 285-9196. 9-6-4t-pd. 

HOUSE FOR SALE-3 bedrooms, all 
electric, brick, central heat and air, 2 
baths, kitchen furnished with all ap­
pliances. Stone fireplace in living 
room, double carport, 2 utility 
buildings, on large lot at Thelma. 
Shown by appointment only Call 789-
1944. Price $59,000. KENNETH 
COLLINS, Box 106, Thelma, Ky. 9-5-4t. 

WALLEN'S TRADING POST AND TIRE 
SALES says, ''Our low overhead lets us 
give you the best prices on all our tires 
and appliance wheels. Better check our 
prices and get your car, truck and van 
ready for winter " Phone 874-2289, or 
after 5, 874-2248. 9-6-4t. 

TRUCKS FOR SALE-1973 Chevy 
pickup; 1972 Chevy 4-wheel drive 
pickup; 1969 Jeep pickup. Phone 874-
2289, or after 5, 874-2248. 9-6-4t. 

FOR SALE-Qne-year-old Blue Tick 
coon hound. Call874-2084. 9-6-tf. 

FOR SALE-1974 Pontiac Grand Prix. 
Equipped with power steering, brakes 
and windows, air-conditioning, AM-8-
track, CB, four new tires and new 
exhaust system. Excellent condition. 
Phone 886-8440, after 5 p.m. 9-6-tf. 

FOR RENT-Newly-furnished mini­
efficiency apartment. Extremely nice. 
Sutable for young lady. Air­
conditioned. No pets, please. $225 per 
month plus $125 initial deposit. Utilities 
included. If interested, call 886-3565 
after 3:30p.m. 9-6-tf. 

BIG GARAGE SALE-Thurs. and Fri., 9 
till? About two miles from Martin an 
Buck's Branch. Lots of good clothes, 
material and household items. Bill 
Maynard. lt-pd. 

FOR SALE--4-room house at Auxier; 
bath, all under fence. Phone 886-8628. 

lt-pd. 

WANT TO TRADE- Wide, longbed 
pickup camper top for narrow, short­
bed camper top. In good condition. Call 
Sandy Valley Hardware, 874-9219. lt. 

HELP WANTED-Person needed 5 days 
- 35 hrs. week - $2.65 hr. Duties will be 
to work on forms, research material 
for proposals, general office work as 
needed, recreation planning, im­
plementation and programs. Must 
have math skills, be able to work with 
people, and be a high school graduate. 
Applications taken 9-5, Mon-Fri. until 
Wednesday, Sept. 20, 1978, 5:00p.m. at 
the David Community Development 
Corporation, David, Ky. 886-8508. 
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EM-
PLOYER. lt. 

FOR SALE- Clothes, bedspread, metal 
table, old hot water heater, dishes, 
misc. All for $25. Antique oak chest $30. 
886-6247. lt-pd. 

MAD, MAD, MAD 
FEDERATED 

FURNITURE STORE 

SALE 
8 a.m.-6 p.m. 

Thursday thru Saturday 
Martin, Ky. 

FOR SALE-Farm, house and trailer. 
Also '77oldsmobile. Call874-2529. 9-13-
4L 

TRUCKS FOR SALE-1972 Chevy 4-
wheel drive pickup; 1969 Jeep pickup. 
Phone 874-2289, or after 5, 874-2248. 9-13· 
4t. 

FOR SALE BY OWNER-One six-room 
house with bath. Copper plumbing, 
good well with pump, also city water 
with the turn of cut-off. New storm 
windows and doors. One large block 
building. Lot 280 x 75 feet, new chain 
link fence. At Stanville, Ky. Priced for 
quick sale. Phone 478-9521 9-13-4t-pd. 
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FOR SALE-Beautiful lot. Scenic view of 
Dewey Lake Call 216-857-5001 or 216-
263-1386. 8-30-lt 

FOR SALE-Modular home, 2•2 miles 
upon Abbott, now being bricked Phone 
886·6781. Mrs. George Music, 
Prestonsburg. 9-13-tf. 

PART-TIME JOB-Positton of city clerk 
for the town of Wayland now open. 
Requires one day per week. Make your 
own hours Apply in writing to: Town of 
Wayland, Box 293, Wayland, Ky. 41666. 
Include qualifications. Refer any 
questions to Sue Potter, 358-2271. 9-13-
tf. 

Clark Elementary 
Horse Show 

(RAIN OR SHINE} 

Archer Park Prestonsburg, Ky. 
October 15 1:00 p.m. 

TROPHY AND RIBBONS ONLY 
22 CLASSES 

• Lead In Pony & Horse, $2 entry fee; all others $5. 
• Pleasur(" Pony (58" & under) 
• Lead In Palamino • Lead in Stallion 
• Couple Class <walk, favorite Galt> No canter 
• Western Plea ure <walk, trot. canter) Western tack 
• Barrel Haec • Ladies Pleasure <Favorite Gait) <Pads permitted) 
• Style Pacing (Judged on style> <Pads permitted) 
• Flag Hace • Men's Pleasure <Pads permilted> 

FOR HlRE-Track loader and tandem FOR SALE-1974 Olds. station wagon 
dump truck. If you've got dirt to move, ' and 1965 Corvair Phone 886-3629. 9-13-

• Speed Pacing< Judged on speed not stylel (No Pads) 
• English Pleasure <Eng. Tack, Pleasure GaUl 

we'll do it for you. Muncie Meade, Jr., tf. • Amateur Walking <No canter) • Rescue Race 
Dema, Ky. Phone 447-2728. 9-13-4t. 

LAND FOR SALE-25 x 100 ft. lots in 
Knott county. Call447-2161. 9-13 4t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Tract of land at Little 
Paint, suitable for subdividing. 
WILLIAM PRATER, RT. 2, 
<:e>rgetown, Ky. 40324, phone 502-863--
0759 after 5 p.m. 9-13-4t-pd. 

FOR RENT-Mobile home-2 bedrooms, 
2 baths, nicely furnished including 
washer-dryer. Ideal location with large 
yard. Couples only. No pets. Mrs 
Raymond Turner 874-2587. ~ 13~tf 

FOR SALE- 14 x 70 1978 Norris mobile 
home Less than 4 month old Call 874-
9676. 9-13-3t. 

• Open Hacking !Pads permitted) 
• Style Racking <Pads permitted) Judged on style 
• Three Gaited Class (walk, trot, canter) 
• SpeE-d Racking <Pads permitted) Judged on speed not st)'le 
• Open Pleasure (No pads) Pleasure Gait 
• Stake Walking • Trophy Dash 

9-13-2!. 
For More Information, Call 874-2088. 

PRICES GOOD THRU SEPT. 19, 1978 
MEAT PRICES, SEPT. 14·17 

QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED. 

SA\/ SUM 

FOOD STAMPS WELCOME. 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE 

ROUND 
STEAK 

-'"LLCUT $139 
LB. 

~~i£" ..................................... ~;~:.89 c 

[8i~~RK···· ····· · · · · · · · ·· · ····· ...... ··. ··· -~~~:.8 9 c 
T-BONE $249 
STEAK ........................................ ~~ ... .. 

INDIANA " TASTEE" ROUND 

WHITE 
POTATOES 

$119 20LB. 
BAG 

GA RDEN FRESH ' c 
GREEN CABBAGE .................. --~~ ... 10 
FRESH 5 $1 RIPE BANANAS.......................... LBS. 

GA RDE N FR ESH 2 49c 
CRISP CARROTS ............ ~~:s. 

PARKAY (QUARTERS) 49c 
MARGARINE ...................... _ ......... -~~;~. 
PILLSBURY COUNTRY STYLE OR BUTTERMILK& $109 
BISCUITS................................. ~oAC:s 
FREEZER QUEEN ASSORTED $139 
MEAT ENTREES .......................... ~~;· .. 
SEALTEST (SMALL CURD) 99c 
COTTAGE CHEESE ...................... ~!.~-: 

llcOFF 
LABEL 

DISHWASHER DETERGE NT 

CASCADE 

3SOZ. ggc 
BOX 

FAM ILY 
SIZE 

480Z. 
BTL. 

MAR IN'S BESTWAY MARKET 

DISH LIQUID 

DAWN 

$159 

McDowell, Ky. 
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QUARTZ 
HALOGEN 

FOG LIGHT 
Glare-free, extra powerful. Improves 
visibility in fog, snow and· rain. 
Easy to install. Clear or amber. 

AT LEAST 24 PER STORE 

Heck's Reg . $14 .99 Each 

AUTOMOTIVE DEPT. 

TRASH BAGS 
WITH 2 EITRA BAGS FREE 

HECK 'S REG. 

$2.49 

HOUSEWARE DEPT. 

AMERICAN 
ELECTRIC 

MINI­
FRYER 
Steel conslruct•on, leflon" 
cooled ,ns.de and out, 2Y? cup 

7000 

copooty, chrome full wtre fry $ 
basket ,.,th fold,ng handle, 8 8 8 
wrap-around heat.ng ele 
ments for even heal d,st,bu. 
han, cool safety handle, snap 
on storage cover detoc:hoble 
cord. lhe•mostot.colly con 
trolled Heck's Reg . $14 .96 

JEWELRY DEPT. 

FULL SIZ• 

QUILTED BEDSPREAD 
~;'~~~.a;~~~~:o~:~~k~~~=~~ HReclc's $1688 
')'OU wont IO loo&c Fu'l ~u.: bed) eg . 

$25 .99 

The Floyd County Times 

LEE 
SPIN ON TYPE 

OIL FILTERS 

CODE 
518 

• SIZES TO FIT MOST 
AMERICAN MADE CARS 

AT LEAST 500 PER STORE 

$166 
Heck1s Reg . $2.59 

AUTOMOTIVE DEPT. 

I GALLO 

CLORO 
BLEAC 

69c HECK'S 
REG. 
$1" 

HOUSEWARE DEPT. 

ONE POUND 
POLISHING CLOTH 

$100 
Heck's Reg. $ J .79 

IVE DEPT. 

30" PADDED 

UTILITY 

SI'OOL 

SOAP TUB 2 '" podded loom top, 13 '" top 
d1omerer. 1 9' 16 •n heovy wood 
legs, fr u•f wood ftmsh on 
hardwood Heavy e)[ ponded sup· 
ported v'nyl 

HECK'S 
REG. 

$1.09 
69( $844 

HOUSIWAII 
DIPT. 

Heck's Reg . $ 14 .88 

HOUSEWARE DEPT. 
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OIL DRAIN 

PAN 
AT LEAST 48 
PER STORE 

ggc 
Heck's Reg . $1 .48 

AUTOMOTIVE 
DEPT. 

SUNBEAM 

BATTERY OPEPA TED 
PORTABLE 

AM·FMRADIO 
PENCIL SHARPENER 

Turns on outomottcolly when penctl•s 
•nserted, off when remo-.,ed Cordless 
boHery powered tokes four AA pen­
lrte boHenes. delivers hundreds of 
shorpen•ngs Pencils not 1ncluded 

JEWELRY DEPT. 

Heck's Reg . 
$11 .96 

NORTHERN 

LIGHTED 
MAKE-UP MIRROR 

Sok glare-free lamps beh;nd lenses 
Cool shadow. free hght Two sw;vel 
mirrors: regular and mogrufy.r"'g Up 
front on· off sw1tch Cord storag~ 1n 
bock. Ideal lor su,tcose travel Ul 
t;sted. 

Heck's 
Reg . 

$14 .96 

$999 
JEWELRY DEPT. 

POLYESTER 

BED PILLOW 

8 TRACK 
TAPE 

PLAYER 
AMJFM rod1o porloble 8 
track player has sliding 
controls for volume , tone 
ond AMJ. Tope automatic 
or manual frock change 
w1th track 1ndtcotor l1ght. 
AODC. AC Cord & Ear· 
pnone tncluded Sw1vel 
telescopic antenna 

$3999 
Heck's Reg . 

49.96. 

LADIES' 

SAnN This pillow is especially $200 
designed to give you comfort 
with las ting plumpness. 
Odorless, resilient, non-
allergenic, mat resistant. HECK'S REG. $3.19 

CLOTH/II' 

BASEBALL 
JACKET 

JEWEL•'Y l)ffiT. Ztpper front witn '1 pockets bond bottom 

-----------------+----~--------------1 and cuffs Size S-M -Loll n ew fall dusty col­

DEPT. 

CLOTHING DEPl'. 

MAX KAHil 
POAM BACK•D 

DRAPES 
Great to •mprove the looks o f any room 
A. f•ne qval1ty ala low cost Help5 to~eep 
the cold OH out and the worm Olf 1n for the 
long Winter oheod ...... , .. . ........ 
sgaa $1Q88 

Heck's Reg . Heck's Reg . 

$ 14 .99 $ l 5.99 

MIN'S ACRYLIC 
TRIPLE KNIT 
JOGGING SUIT 

Two p1ece 100% tnple kn1t acryhc togging su1ts 
are ovodoble m SIZes S- M· L· Xl. Select from four 
colors 

Heck's Reg. $1288 
$19.99Set SET 

CLOTHING DEPT. 

ors 

:~~: $1 osa 



tOTAL RBCIIPTS 

AL llLARCI l IICIIPTS 

1,828.60 
289.91 
161.25 
25.25 

feea 1976 14,565.90 
2,392.90 

396.00 
1,625.73 
1,351.96 
9,378.30 
3,704.38 
6,066.69 

$ 423.98 
1,876.02 

• 6,000.00 
4,750.02 

3,969.00 
3.307.50 

202.50 
uo.oo 

1,600.00 
3.200.00 

191.00 
81.00 

140.46 
• 169.13 

52.97 
480.94 
143.38 

3,602.36 
.34.00 

567.80 
2c205.oo 

211.57 
133.67 

98.08 
364.31 
243.75 
98.60 
18.97 

1 1.39 
2Q8.11 
427.40 

10.30 

$585,249.70 

794,820.44 

$16,757.52 

9,226.50 

7,410.00 

2,370.00 

2,300.00 

10,750.02 

7,276.50 

312.50 

4,800.00 

3,800.00 

2,646.00 

7,668.04 

1,986.15 

5,040.00 

14,301.75 

4,258.79 

BOAR 

Susie Roal"k J•••• A. Duff 
ElUa Martin 
Joe Tatea 

COUNTY II§A§URER SALARY 

DavU D. Allen 

COU~J TREASURER SUPPLIES 

Action Office Supply 
Mountain Printing Co 
Harp Enterprises, Inc 

COUNTY TR£ASUIBR-IQUIPM£NT 

I8H Corporation. 
Legialative leaearch Co .. iasion 

CQUNTY AUDITOR 

Gary L Goble, CPA 

lOUTH AUTHORITY 

Loneaome Pine Council Boy Scouts 

CIVIL DEFENSE 

Floyd County Civil Defenae 

EHERCENCT RESCUE SQUAD 

Floyd County Eaergency Rescue 

CPHHPNWBALTH ATTOfti£!-SALARY 

Jaaea A, Allen 

CQMNONWEALTH ATTORNEY-SECRETARY 

Pe111 v. Fraley 

GIARD JURI REPORTING 

Susan Chrys Lindstrom 

COMMONWEALTH pETBCTIVE 

Jaaea R. Ultn 

SNOW REMOVAL 

T-1-A 

CONSTABLE EXPENSE 

Bob Hackworth 
Corbin Joseph 
Paul Stilton 
Buddy Bryant 

MAGISTRATES SALARY 

Leroy Akers 
Dewey Roberta 
Kenneth Roberta 
8111 Wells 
Edward Caudill 
Uraal Ray Wilcox 
Hershel Hamilton 

COURT STENOGRAPHER 

Susan c. Lindstrom 

LIBRARIAN-SALARY 

Frank DeRossett 

HOSPITAL CARE 

Our Lady or the Way Hospital 
Dr.Larry H. Leslie 
Rose Rexall Drug 
Dr. David White 
International Clinical Laboratotr 
Highlands REsional Medical Cent.r 

MEDICAL CARE 

McDowell Appalachain Regional 
Goldie Johnson 

JUVENILE COURT JUDGE 

R. Donald Goble 

lDin CLAIMS 

Mary Wallen 

DOG WARDEN-SALARY 

Williaa Sherman Cook 

LIVESTOCK INSPECTOR-SALARY 

Willia• Sher .. n Cook 

ELECTION COMMISSIONERS 

William Gordon Francia 
Joe Helton 
Goraan ColUna 
Le•uel Meade 
c. ft0111e" lobinaon 
Douglas Lewia 

ELECTION OFFICERS 

PRINTING I APJIIIISEHENT 

Harp Enterpriaea, Inc 
Preatonaburc Publiahinc Co 
Post•aater 

TABULATORS 

David Chat(ina 

2 • 0 
5 0 
50 00 __ -A5o.oo 

82 00 
550 52 
73,48 

• 774.00 
~9.p5 

1,200.00 
1,200.00 
1,200.00 
1,200.00 

$4,020.72 
4,020.72 

10,425.72 
4,020.72 
6,405.00 
6,405.00 
6,405.00 

• 

30.50 
25.00 
18.26 
19.00 
29.00 
78.24 

25.00 
zs.oo 

210.00 
165.00 
210.00 
472.00 
45.00 
41,00 

• 

2,400.00 

706.00 

• 1,143.05 

1,200.00 

500.00 

6,000.00 

5,040.00 

7,200.00 

2,765.60 

2,000.90 

~9 .. 6l1.64 

15,992.82 

4,800.00 

• 41,702.88 

1,701.96 

1,200.00 

200.00 

100.00 

3,200.00 

38.00 

2,625.00 

1,050.00 

1,147.00 

• 6,896.69 

ROAD CONSTUctrpN HATI!J ... , 

Sandy Valley Pardware 
Harvin Huaic Diatribu'or JdO 
Slone's Gulf Service 8$a\i06 
Ken's Gult Station 
Right Beaver Rlady Mix 
John K Buckley 
Bob's Luaber Co 
Moore & S I T Hardware 
East Kentucky BxplotiYe lac 
Cecil Trucking Co 
Sta Rite Industries lac 
Frank Johnson 
Hay Sign Co Inc. 
Terry Ottice Supplr 
Hartin Standard Oil 
Hackworth's Texaco 
Farm I Home Store 
Adaaa ConatructionCor~ 
Harold Hardware I Furniture 
Stumbo's Texaco Station 
Ratliff Fara Supplr 
Goose Creek Luaber Co 
Allen 1 Allen General Mercbandiae 
Porter Llaeatone 
a••• H Lattertr 

~ittle'a Hardware 
Leroy Akers 

ROAD ENGINEER-SALARY 

saa H. Fitzpatrick 

ROAD HACHINER! REPAIRS 

R/S Truck Body Co Inc. 
Brad Rasan, Inc 
Prestonsburs Auto Parta, Inc 
Eastern Kentucky Hack 
Cody Equip•ent • SupplJ 
Baat Kentucky Auto Parts 
Floyd Auto Parta 
Porter Industries 
Wells Machine Shop 
Carburetor I Electrical SerYice 
B I D Motor Co Inc 
Brandies Machinery 
Ron Williaaa, Clayton's 
Machinery, Inc. 
Sa• H Fitzpatrick 
Adams Used Auto Parts 
Duddy's Inc 
Whayne Supply 
Little's Hardware 
Hackwortb'a Texaco 
Sandy Yall•y Hardware 
Kentucky Machinery In.c 
Ha•old Deroaaett 
Pike Automotive Supplf 
Mitchell'• Gulf Statioa 
Allen Luaber Co 
R. V. Hay Co 
Bypro Gulf Service It 
Jerry Banks 
A I R Gulf Station 

FLOATING DIBT 

EHERGE!CIEI 01 RI§BIJI 

" Tereaa Fitapatrick 
T-1-A ACCOIInt 
Revenue Sbarint Fund 
Susan c. Lihdatroa 
Jeanette HcCiuler 
Lowell I. Spencer 

Dewey Rober•• c~~~t/j~. 
Hall·Clark Inaurance -
Peuy Y. Fraler 
Bob Hackworth 
Frank Deroaaett 
ICaye A. Rowland 
Ashland Prin 1., C. 
The Herald Diape\0 
Kenneth llollertl 
Anita F. I 1 d 
teene Auto Pa 1 
l>irectoriee 
llarp En trft' 
rit:e'a Pic 

Meana hr 
Diaponeu• 
Sharun Li 
Donahoe'• 
Ira 8. Pouer 
David Wh1 
flishlanda .-.~,-~l 
Stewart uw•li•l""' 

491.54 
442.96 

43.39 
99.10 

372.50 
2, 711.04 

zs.o.o 
9.60 

125.00 
459.08 
15~.07 

3,905.20 
75 00 

248.83 
118.10 

s.oo 
2,50le02 

577.06 
141.57 e.oo 

11.26 
260.36 
300.10 
89.93 

355.13 
223.52 
1tt.60 
2IS6.29 

•• 96 
21.00 

500.00 
400.00 
535.08 
394.90 

13.170.01 
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(Continued from Preceding Page) 

Joe Wheeler Burchett 
Larry Robinson 
Bobby Spurlock 
Ann Friend 
Samuel Hale 
Bobby & Nancy Spurlock 
C. Ollie Robinson 
Reba Martin 
Lee Alley 
Western Union Credit Corp 
Beecher Woods 

PUBLIC COURTHOUSE BONDS 

Floyd County Public Courthouse Bonds 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

GENERAL FUND 

CASH-RECAP 

85 . 00 
35.00 

600.00 
200.00 

4,800.00 
100.00 

56.00 
1,200.00 

200.00 
11.48 

240.00 8,:352.48 

13,543.20 

$ 617,169.89 

JULY 1, 1977 through June 30, 1978 

BALANCE- July 1, 1977 

RECEIPTS 

LESS: DISBURSEMENTS 7-1-77 to 6-30-78 

BALAICE- June 30, 1978 

EQUIPMENT OPERATIQN ACCOUNT 

T-1-A 
JULY 1, 1977 through JUNE 30,1978 

Bank Balance-July 1, 1977 

RECEIPTS 

Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky SJ;ate Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equi pmeni 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer- Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-EQuipment 
Ky State Treasurer -Equipment 
Ky State Treasurer-Truck Registration 
Revenue Sharing Fund 
General Fund 
General rund 
General Fund 
General Fund 
General Fund 

TOTAL RECEIPTS 

TOTAL BALANCE & RECEIPTS 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Linzie Conn Jr 
Philip Hagans 
Ballard Harris 
Troy Jarrell 
Willie L1 ttle 
Bernard }!artin 
Ronald Mullins 
Jack Nelson 
Roy Ousley 
Dolvin Ratliff 
Phineas Roberts 
Clell Stephens 
Larry Stewart 
Harold Dean Boyd 
Opal B. Conn 
Danny Mullins 
Stanley Stephens 
David Fitzpatrick 
Ralph Scott 
Clyde Burke 
Robin Humphrey 
Michael McCormick 
Anthony Castle 
Danny Martin 
Eddie C. Caudill 
Clennis Caudill 
Sam ~leade 
Ray Moore 
Patrus Newsome 
Waltrust Reynolds 
Blue Cross-Blue Shield of Ky 
Eddie flamilton 
Jolin Chapman 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

$6,204.00 
3,876.00 
6,732.00 
9,440.00 
8,160.00 
9,424.00 
6,768.00 
5,552.00 
4,712 .00 
7,632 .00 
6,576.00 

11,408.00 
6,208 .00 

51,701.04 
5 '523. 77 

13,170 . 02 
8,948 . 00 

11,341.26 
1,051.33 
41651.56 

$ 7,292.52 
6,930.48 
4,146.40 
5,276.40 
7,733 .04 
7,206 . 33 
7,1'/1.84 
7,344.24 
6,102 . 80 
6,468.08 
5,927 .60 
4,146.40 
4,965.12 
3,733.95 
3,572.10 

$3,.517 .32 
1,518.40 
1,781.20 

58.40 
6,964.96 
1,430.80 
1,635.20 
3,737.60 
3,066.08 
2,241.20 
2,275.68 

700.80 
1,781.20 
2,34i/.64 
1,825.00 

68.00 
1,446.32 

275.84 

$1241685.94 

EQUIPMENT OPERATION ACCOUNT 

T-1-A 

July 1, 1977 through June 30, 1978 

Balance-July 1, 1977 

Receipts 

Less: Disbursements 7-1-77 to 6-30-78 

Balance June 30, 1978 

$ 209,570.74 

58~1249.70 

$ 794,820.44 

6171169.89 

$ 171650.55 

$(30,876.06) 

$1891078.98 

1581202.92 

$(30,876.06) 

189,078.98 

$158,202.92 

1241685.94 

$ 33 , 516.98 

The above and foregoing report of Floyd County Treasurer 

covers the period July 1, 1977 through June 30, 1978, showing receipts 

and dis~ursements. 

Dated this the 8th day of September, 1978. 

Floyd County Treasurer 

••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 
• VISIT • • • 

. : FLANERY & DINGUS 
• • 
II 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

T.V. and ELECTRONICS 
Incorporated 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

.------Modem Service Facilities for ----""'1 
RADIO, PHONO, STEREO, HI-FI, TELEVISION, MASTER 

T.V. SYSTEM DISTRIBUTION, AMPLIFIERS and 
----ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT.---___. 

Where Progress Is Planned, Not Just an Accident! 
Phones 886-888J and 886-6414 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • ••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

Our Constitution, the cornerstone of 
our freedoms, was v. ritten to protect 
every Amer1can from the abuse of power 
by political parties as much as from 
abuses by kings. Without the deter­
mination to restrain the tempting ex­
cesses of political power, our Republic 
will perish. The Daughters of the 
American Revolution urge that y, e study 
the value of public service during Con­
stitution Week. Today's problems call for 
the highest character of leadership. Read 
your Constitution. 

In the course of your lifetime, your feet 
will take you an average of 65,000 miles, 
or more than 21h times around the earth, 
the September Reader's Digest informs 
us . To keep feet healthy, foot doctors 
advise propping them up on any handy 
surface as often as you can 

5 1977 F-5070 Paystars wilh 8V-7 1-
318 Detroit Die5el, RT0·958·LL Ful · 
ler transmission, 65,000 lb. Rockwell 
tandem, RT-500 Hendricksen suspen· 
sion, Jake Brake, aor, 12_00 x 24 tires, 
21' coal body, pamt slripe and more• 
Stock nos. 6T-178, 179, 181, 182, 
183. 1979 list price $76,500. 

NOW 867,600 

lAVE 819,000 

Fl RST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Lorie Vannucci, Pastor 

Phone 285-JOS 1 
Martin, Ky. 

SWlday Scnool 
Morning Worship 

lOa.m. 
na.m. 
6p.m. 
7p.m. 

Youth Service 
Evangelistic Service 
Wednesday, 7p.m. Family Night 

Fortran portatlon call 
285·3051 or 285-9114. 
Everyone Welcome. 

COME IN­
WE ARE 

OPEN ON 
SUNDAY! 

Check 'em out! These are just a few of our new Paystars in stock! We've 
got over 50 brand new International Paystars ... every one geared up and 
ready to haul! PLUS - the price of every new Pays tar in stock is slashed 
from $15,000 to over $19,000 off 1979list price! Prices will never be this 
low again - the savings will never be greater than they are right now! 
Check over our inventory, then come get yours at Campbell Motors or 
Campbell Ford in Bristol, or Campbell Motors in lvel, Kentucky! 

S 1977 F-5070 Paymrs wi1h NTC-230 
Cummins, RT0-958-LL Fuller trans· 
mission, SSH0-44,000 lb_ Rockwell 
tandem, RT-441 Hendricksen suspen· 
>ion, Jake Brake, 11 00 x 22 !ires, 
19Y>' coal body, pain I stripe and more! 
Stock nos. H-111, 112, 126, 128 & 
133. 1979 list price $62,595. 

NOW 844,760 

lAVE 817,846 

20 1978 F 5070 Paystars wi!h NTC-
350 Cummins, RT0-12513 Fuller 
transmission, SSH0-44,000 lb. Rock· 
well tandem, RT-441 Hendricksen sus­
pension, Jake Bra I.e, custom cab, air, 
11.00 x 22 tires, 1911' coal body, 
AM/FM, pain! stripe and morel Stock 
nos . 8T-78, 96, 97, 103, 104, 106, 
107 108, 109, 115, 119, 122, 123, 
124.144,147, 155,157,166,& 172. 
1979 lost price $68,800. 

NOW 86!,786 

SAVE 818,006 

21 1978 F-5070 Paystar~ w1th PT-270 
Cummins, RT0-958-LL Fuller trans· 
mission, SSH0-44,000 lb. Rockwell 
tandem, RT-441 Hendricksen ~uspen· 
~ion, Jake Brake, air, cu~tom cab, 
11 00 x 22 t1res, AM/FM, 19W coal 
body, paint wipe and morel Stocl. 
nos. 8T·58, 59, 60, 70, 71, 76, 116, 
117, 121, 125, 143, 148, 1S6, 160, 
161,162,165,171, 173,174,& 180. 
1979 list price S6S,900. 

NOW 848,886 

lAVE 816,906 

FREE TRUCKING OUTFITS I FREE CB RADIOS I 
What a great deal! After you've saved thousands on a new Paystar, we'll mount a 40-

channel Cobra CB in your cab, complete with whip, straps and cable! AND, we'll outfit 
you in a Levi's jacket and pants! That's a deal-sweetener that's just too good to pass up! 

ON-THE-SPOT FINANCING AND INSURANCE! 

Campbell Ford 
NEW KINGSPORT HIWAY 
(615) 968-2131 

Bristol, ln . 

NO PAYMENTS FOR 45 DAYS I 

- -
Campbell Motors 

LEE HIWAY 
(703) 669-7157 

Bristol, Va • 

U.S. 460 BETWEEN PIKEVILLE 
AND PRESTONBURG 
(606) 285-9811 

lvei,Ky. 
A CAMPBELL COMPANY 
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C&R Strip-Mining Fines Total $44,000 
TRENCHING COMPANY 

P.O. Box 59 
Betsy Layne, Ky. 

Specializing in 

• Ditching 
eWater Pipelines 
•small Backhoe Work 

("on tracts and Free Estimates. 

Owners: l.arry Cecil, Ph. 478·5962 
and !\1ichael Robinette. 478·9705 

6·28-tf. 

KOUNTRY KITCHEN 
BAKERY & RESTAURANT 

Sen ing Buffet II a.m. 

Specializing In: 
Birthday, Wedding and 

All Occasion Cakes 
and Pizzas 

• Experienced Cake Baker 
and Decorator 

• Fresh Pa.,tries Dail~ 

• Guaranteed Fresh 

Call 478-9845 

Main St., Stanville 
Hours: 

Mon .. Tues., Wed., Fri., Sat .. 
6 a.m.-8 p.m..; 

Thursda)". 6 a.m.-5 p.m. 

2·22-tf. 

The state Department for 'atural 
He ouces and Environmental Protection 
collected $44,000 from 14 coal companies 
during August for violations of tate strip 
mine regulations. 

D & R Coal and Eqwpment, of West 
Liberty, and :\1arty Corp., of E\·anston, 
paid the largest fines of $6,000 each. D & 
R was fined for stripping outside the 
permttted area at one location. distur· 
bing a second area off the permit, and 
allowing material to slide into a stream 
in Elliott county. 

:'llarty Corp. was fint'd for failing to 
repair and certify a dam on 1ts site in 
Breathitt county and allowing black 
water onto the out slopes of another mine 
site in Magoffin cOWlty. 

Other companies fined were: 
General Refractories Co., $5,000 for 

placing spoil into a stream ap· 
proximately 200 yards from Grayson 
Lake. The company also failed to backfill 
its mine site near Airport Road in Carter 
county and did not follow the approved 
box cut method of mining. 

Ky. Coal Co., $5,000 for allowing a 
slide to occur off the permitted area on 
one of its sites in Breathitt coWlty. On 
another site in Pike coWlty, the company 
failed to properly backfill, grade, seed 
and mulch the permitted area and 

eglected to properly construct a hollow 
fill. 

-Jim Smith Construction Co., $4,000 
for failing to provide adequate silt 
control on its strip mine site in Webster 
county. 

-Hilltop Energy Corp., $2,000 for 
blasting rock off the permitted area in 
Pike coWlty, causing minor off-site 
damage. 

River Coal Co., $2,000 for allowing 
two slides to occur which caused 
material to leave the permitted area and 

HEARING TESTS SET 
For Prestonsburg 

ELECTRONIC 
DEARING TESTS 

Will Be Given By 
Mr. Jack Radcliffe Hearing Aid 

Specialist 

BEL TONE Consultant \Vho \Viii Be At: 
Ky. Motel, Prestonsburg, Ky.-Tues., Sept. 19, 9 a.m. to 12 noon 

Anyone who has trouble hearing is welcome to have a hearing test using the 
latest electronic equipment to determine if his loss is one which may be 
helped, Some of the causes of hearing loss will be explained and diagrams 
of how the ear works will be shown. 

We Also Service and Repair All Makes of Hearing Aids. 
Batteries And Supplies For All Makes For Sale. 

IF YOU CANNOT COME IN-
CALL FOR A HOME APPOINTMENT. 

PHONE 886-2387 

go into a stream near Sewell in 
Breathitt coWlty. 

-Elom Coal Corp .. $2,000 for failing to 
maintain adequate backfilling and 
grading and allowing a sudden release of 
water onto the outslopes of its site near 
Coalton in Boyd coWlty. 

-Wells Coal Co., $2,000 for allowing 
spoil over the outslopes whtle con· 
structing a fill road and failing to 
maintain adequate silt control on its site 
near Farler in Perry cOWlty. 

-Alpine Coal Co., $2,000 for stripping 
prior to having a silt structure certified 
by a registered engineer on its site near 
Buskirk in Morgan coWlty. 

-Arthur Coal Co., $2,000 for failing to 
maintain adequate silt control and 
constructing an access road off the 
permitted site near War Creek in Morgan 
county 

Floyd County 
Girl Scout News 

Local Girl Scout volWlteers held their 
organizational meeting Thursday (Sept. 
7) at Allen Methodist Church. Lila F. 
DeRossett, Girl Scout chairman for 
Floyd COWl ty, presided over the meeting, 
along with Wilma Castle, field director. 
Other leaders attending were Brenda 
McKenzie, Ada Depoy, and Henrietta 
Orsborn. 

Floyd coWlty girl scouts currently 
operate 13 girl scout troops. All girls 
from 6-17, or in the first through the 
twelvth grades, are welcome to join. 

Troop leaders and assistant leaders 
are needed in McDowell, Maytown, 
Martin, Goble-Roberts, Prestonsburg 
and Auxier. Anyone interested in con­
tinuing these troops, please contact Joan 
Chaffins. Glenda Hicks, Eulene Ratliff. 
Nancy Roberts, Kathy Music, Pamela 
Newberry, Brenda McKenzie, or Lila 
DeRossett at 874-2844. Wilma Castle, 
field director for Area 4, will work with 
all the Girl Scout volWlteers, helping 
them to carry out the program. 

Some of the activities the local Girl 
Scouts will be enjoying this year are 
Songs and Games workshop; Brownie 
FW1 Days; "Jamboree" JWlior En­
campments; Cadette and Senior ''Almost 
Anything Goes" Encampment; Kings 
Island Scout Day; Red-White-Blue 
parade; Christmas caroling; Thinking 
Day; Friendship Day; Sleep-Ins; 
Summer Programs; and many more. 

For more information about Girl 
Scouting, call Lila F. DeRossett, 874-2844. 

In 1823 Justice Johnson of the United 
States Supreme Court wrote that the 
Constitution was "The most wonderful 
instrument ever drawn by the hand of 
man " The Daughters of the American 
Revolution urge you to discover precisely 
what he meant during Constitution Week, 
September 17th through 23rd, the one 
hWldred ninety-first anniversary of the 
writing of this comprehensive document. 

-Vote For A Stronger-
UMWA 

VOTE FOR 

ALBERT SHEPHERD 
For Secretary-Treasurer District 30 

Thursday, September 28, 1978 
Dear Sir & Brother: 

I would like to take this opportunity to announce that I am a candidate for the office of Secretary-Treasurer of 
District 30, United Mine Workers of America. 

I am a Union Coal Miner and a member of Local Union 1741. I have served as Financial Secretary for the past 
three C3> years and Chairman of both the Mine and Safety Committee for the past five (5) years. I also serve on the 
Burial Committee. I am a third generation Union Coal Miner. My father is a retired Union Miner and a 37 year 
member of Local Union 7788 at David, Ky. 

I was a delegate to the United Mine Workers 47th Constitutional Convention and the District 30 Constitutional 
Convention held in March of this year. I have been active in Local Union 1741, as well as District 30. 

I actively seek your support and the support of your membership for election to the office of Secretary­
Treasurer. If elected, I will dedicate myself to honest, efficient service for all of the membership of District 30, not 
just a select few. I will be the kind of officer the membership can depend on, not just during office hours, or when It Is 
convenient, but at any time the officers or the membership of this District need assistance. 

li_rl~cted I will work full·tlm~to~ 

• Recover the several thousand dollars the International Dues System owes District 30 and the Local Unions. 

•With the help of the membership and Local Union officers, work toward a massive Organizing Drive in District 
30. 

•Send a full Financial Report to each Local Union every six months, Including itemized listings of salaries and 
expenses, so the membership will know how their Dues Money is being spent. 

•Make myself available to the membership by attending Local Union meetings and visiting mine portals and 
bathhouses. 

9-13-2t. d. 

Fraternally yours, 

Albert Shepherd 
L. U. 1741 

Come out and vote for a stronger Union 
Thursday, September 28, 1978 

To \Ved September 16 
ALLEY & HALL FAMILIES REUNION 

at 

ARCHER PARK, 11 a.m. to 4 p.m. 
SEPTEMBER 30 

All relatives of Joe Alley and "Tickey" John Hall families 
are invited. Each family is to bring their favorite dish and 
choice of refreshment. _ .. 

9·13·21 -vu· 

HOUSING ASSISTANCE PROGRAM 

Mrs. Betty Patton, of AuXIer, an· 
nounces the engagement and forth­
coming marnage of her daughter, 
Suzanne, to Anthony Ray Moore, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Moore, of Pnce. 

Marriage vows will be exchanged at 7 
p~m. Saturday, September 16, at the 
Community Methodist Church in Auxier 
Immediately following the service, a 
reception will be held at the Plantation 
motel. The gracious custom of open 
church will be observed. 

Miss Patton's father is the late Harold 
L. Patton, of Auxier 

IN 1912, THE FIRST child labor bureau 
(Federal Children's Bureau) was 
established by Congress within the 
Department of Commerce and Labor, in 
1913, the bureau became part of the 
Department of Labor, accordmg to the 
U.S. Department of Labor booklet, 
''Labor Firsts in America." 

For 

Floyd County 
(Prestonsburg) 

Provides housing assistance payments for lower-income 
families to rent decent, safe, and sanitary housing. 

Pays part of your rent directly to your landlord. 

WHO-'A.tLOU.ALlF...Yl 
A family of two or more persons 

A single person, from this area, may qualify if he or she is 
over 62 YEARS OLD, or HANDICAPPED, or DISABLED, 
or DISPLACED. 

Eligibility is based on annual income and number of 
people in the family. 

tf..__'(__QJ) THIN.!L"COU MAY QUALIFY CALL: 
Prestonsburg Housing Authority (Section 8} 
P. 0. Box 230 {Green Acres Office) 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 
Phone: 886-2717 

AND EVERYTHING ON 
THE LOT'S FAIR GAME! 

DRAW A BEAD ON THESE 
HARD· TO-FIND SPECIALS: 

1977 CHEVROLET PICKUP 
Black with red interior, Scottsdale package. Long bed, automatic 
transmission, power brakes, power steering, air-conditioning, CB 
radio. 12,000 miles. One owner. See to believe. Drives like new! 

1978 TRANS-AM T-TOP 
Silver. Has automatic transmission, po\\er steering, power brakes, 
tilt & cruise, AM·F:\-'1, among other options. Brand new "ith full 
factory warranty. 

1-4-tf. 

1977 TRANS-AM SMOKEY & 
BANDIT SPECIAL EDITION 

1976 DODGE ASPEN SPECIAL 
EDITION STATION WAGON 

T-top, high performance T·A engine. A black beauty 
loaded with options. Check this one! 

1977 OLDSMOBILE 442 
Blue with white accent stripes. Factory mags, white 
raised letter tires, white interior, bucket seats, 
automatic transmission, air-conditioned, power 
steering, power brakes, tilt wheel. AM-FM stereo 
tapeplayer, power windows and seats. 20,000 actual 
miles. One of the last of the big Olds 442's. One 
owner. 

1975 CHEVROLET NOVA 4-DOOR 
White with black vinyl top, black interior. Auto­
matic transmission, power steering, power brakes, 
air-conditioned, 350 cubic inch engine. Sharp as a 
pin! 

1975 DODGE DART SWINGER 
With a 6-cylinder engine. a real gas saver for the 
little lady. Equipped with automatic transmission, 
power steering, power brakes, air-conditioning. 
Excellent condition, must see to believe! 

1974 MERCURY COMET 4-DOOR 
:\tetallic brown vinyl top and tan interior. Equipped 
with automatic transmission, power steering, 
po\\er brakes, air-conditioning and 6-cylinder 
t>ngine for t'xcellent gas mileage. 

1976 MONTE CARLO 
Gold with gold vinyl top, tan interior and tan accent 
striping. Automatic transmission, power steering, 
power brakes, air-conditioning. 32,000 miles. Drives 
like a dream, purrs like a kitten. 

Extra sharp! Blue with wood-grain panelling, auto­
matic transmission, power steering, power brakes, 
air-conditioned. 23,000 actual miles. :\lust see to 
believe. 

.----BUCK LAYNE'S-~ 
SQUIRREL Y DEAL OF THE WEEK! 

The first customer to buy a car or truck from Buck 
La)"ne and bring in six squirrel tails gets this 196-l 
Pontiac Le:\lans absolutely FREE! 

1975 HURST OLDSMOBILET-TOP 
White with gold accent stripe , gold factory mags, 
white raised letter tires, W-30 Hurst Oldsmobile 
engine, black interior, bucket seats, tilt \\heel, 
power steering, power brakes, A!\1-F:\-1 tapt'player, 
air-conditioned. !\lust see to belleVt'! 

HUEY. GRAY'S AUTO SALES 
520 So. Lake Drive Ph. 886-2772 Prestonsburg 
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Church of God 

Of Prophecy 
West Prestonsburg, Ky. 

SundaJ School 
Worship enice 
Sunday :\ ight Service 
WednE'sday Night 

lOa.m. 
lla.m. 
7p.m. 
7p.m. 

Pastor, JI:\1MIE BAKER 
8·23·4t. 

COMMUNITY FREE WILL 

BAPTIST CHURCH 

Goble-Roberts Addition 
Prestonsbur~. Ky. 

Pastor, David Lykins 
.\ss't. Pastor. 

Lin"el Campbell 

Wednesday, 
Prayer Meeting • .••.• ·~ . 7 p.m. 
Sunday 
Church Service .. _ •• .. _ ••. 7 p.m. 
Sunday School __ • _ .• __ _10 a .m. 

Regular meeting, fourth Saturday 
each month. 8_2_tf. 

KET EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 0. Leonard Press {left), looks 
on as Robert Hillenmeyer, chairman of the Kentucky Authority 
for Educational Television (KAET), presents a videocassette to 
Sen. Joe Prather. The senator was Instrumental In securing 
funding for KET's coverage of the Legislature during the spring 
sessions. State librarian Barbara Williams and Howard Good· 
paster (right), director of the Division of Archives and Records 
Management, were also present to receive the library of 
videocassettes. 

PRESTONSBlJRG1 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Eastern Kentuckians Booked 
On Illegal Strip-Mining Counts 

c \'ocal :\lusic) 

South Lake Dr. 
Sun., 10 a.m .-6 p.m.< EST> 

. 7p.m.CEDTl 

Wednesday, 7 p.m. 

\\DOC -:\lon.-Fri., 9:30a .m. 

Bro. BE'nnie Blankenship, Minister 

Kentucky's war against illegal strip 
miners has shifted into high gear. Last 
week, the state's Department for Natural 
Resources and Environmental 
Protection announced that illegal strip 
mining charges have been filed against 
nine persons in Eastern Kentucky. The 
announcement followed the earlier 
arrests of two western Kentucky men on 
similar charges. Phone 886-3379 

1-5-tf. 

1¢~$~1 
Backhoes - Dozers 

Wheel Loaders 

In LaW'el county, inspectors from the 
department's Bureau of Surface Mining 
Reclamation and Enforcement obtained 
a search warrant from LaW'el district 
court after observing an alleged illegal 
operation near Lily. Accompanied by 
state policemen, the inspectors went on 
the site and arrested five Corbin area 
men, two truck drivers and three 
operators . The truck drivers were 
identified as Clyde Hopkins and Robert 
Hurd and the operators as Bobby Alsip, 
Charles Miller and Terry Steele. All five 
were taken to the LaW'el county jail and 
charged with strip mining without a 
permit. 

Sales- Rental-Service 

Call 
DON SCHUL 

Office 606-874-9288 
Night 606-789-5712 

U.S. ROUTE 23 south 
Allen, Kentucky 41601 

8-30-4t. 

Similar charges were filed in Whites­
burg against former Letcher County 
Judge Stephen Estill Blair and Lonnie 
Lewis. The two, along with a Virginia 
man, were identified as officials of B.H. 
& L. Coal, Inc. Blair and Lewis each 
posted $200 of a $1 ,000 bond and were 
scheduled to appear in Letcher district 
court for arraignment. The warrant had 
not been served on the Virginia man as of 
last Thursday. 

Senior Citizen Bus Schedule 
Monday & Wednesday- Auxier Road, 

Spradlin Branch, Auxier, Cliff Road, 
Abbott, and Little Paint. 

Tuesday & Thursday- Middle Creek, 
David, Spurlock, Town Branch, Bull 
Creek, Allen Bridge, and Dwale. 

Friday-south U.S. 23, Tram, Stanville. 
Tom's Creek, Betsy Layne, and 
Harold. 

Monday thru Firday- Prestonsburg, 
Lancer, Black Bottom, Green Acres, 
Indian Hills, West Prestonsburg. 

If you are a senior citizen and you need a 
ride to the Center, or in cases of 
emergency, please call 886-6855. 

LENNOX IS MAKING 

A LOT OF OTHER 
HEAT PUMPS OBSOLETE. 

HP10 
Energy 
Saver 
Heat Pump 

EFFICIENCY - The HP10 is !)Ur most efficient heat pump y eti In cold 
w eather it takes solar heat from outdoor ai r to del1ver up to 3~~: of heat for 
every 1¢ of energy used. In warm w eather the HP10 air conditio ns yo ur 
home w ith Energy Efficiency Ratios• over 8 .0, f ar better than past heat 
pum p mdustry performance. 

DEPENDABILITY - The HP10 is built w ith our most dependable compo­
nents. You not only get economical heatmg and cooling, but the durabil· 
ny and long life Lennox equipment IS know n for. The HP1 O's i ndoor 
partner, the CBP10, is a specially matched coi l blow er unit that ensures 
maximum perfo rmance and effici ency. 

SERVICE - As an independent Lennox dealer, w e prov1de fast, e ffect1ve 
service. We're experts - you can count on us to inst all and servi ce your 
equipment r ight. Call or visit us, the energy savers at : 

•Rat•o of coolmg our put to energy mput Tile h1gher the ratmg the more elf1C1ent the urn IS 

Elliott Glass & Electric Co. 
Inc. 

South lake Drive Phone 886-2781 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 41653 

B.H. & L. has three operations in 
Letcher county with two of them iden· 
tified as deep mines. Department of· 
ficials, however , con tend the sites are 
actually being stripped. 

A special strike force, established in 
the office of the secretary of natural 
resources solely to seek out illegal strip 
mines, gathered the information on the 
B.H. & L. case and another one in Perry 
county. 

In the Perry county case, Leroy Miller, 
of Grapevine, was charged with 
operating an illegal strip mine near 
Stacy's Branch. He pleaded innocent to 
the charges in Perry district court. 

Larry Arnett, coordinator of the strike 
force , said the purpose of his unit is to 
"supplement the role of the reclamation 
inspectors.'' 

The force was created by department 
Secretary Eugene Mooney earlier this 
swnmer. 

DINWOOD NEWS 
Alma Dingus was the guest of honor at 

a housewarming shower given at the 
Dinwood Church, August 11. She was the 
recipient of many useful gifts. 

Helping her to celebrate the occasion 
were Wanda Gregory, Chris Adams, 
Bessie Stwnbo, Georgia Allen, Helen 
Flannery, Veronica Ward, Ernestine 
Ward, Judy Ward, Annie Dingus, Alka 
Allen, Wilma Mayo and sister, Georgia 
Keene, Wanda Moore, Debbie Pack, 
Margarette Conn and granddaughter, 
Wanda Simon, Juanita Compton, Terena 
Ward, Karen Ward, Kim Ward, Marcella 
Ward, Teresa Johnson, Billie Jean Ward, 
Katina Krull, Rosemary Spears, 
Michelle Spears, Trish Osborne, Phillip 
and Patricia Osborne, Fannie Dud­
dleson, Eliza Cisco, Shirley Layne, Apryl 
Layne, Connie Cisco, Sadie Hunter, 
Trudy Hunter, Debbie Hunter, Kelly 
Mullins and Renee. 

Those who could not attend but sent 
gifts were Mae Wohlford, Mrs. Dick 
Wohlford, Bessie Patton, Margie 
England, Tina England, Alice Hayes, 
Lassie Crisp, Opal Joseph, Lillie Osborne 
and Jean, Joan Isaac, Sandra Wright, 
Beulah lsaac, Patsy Stwnbo, Kathy 
Isaac, Helen Isaac, Mrs. Morris Isaac, 
Mrs. George Isaac, Linda Gregory, 
Lillian Gregory, Mary Hayes, Gail 
Martin, Mrs. Randy Osborne, Maxine 
Bailey, Mrs. Ralph Moore, Lucille 
Everidge, Mary Moore, Virginia Manuel, 
Johnnie Sizemore, Mrs. Danny Flannery, 
Ocie Manuel, Brenda Manuel, Susan 
Compton, Bonita Compton, Naomi 
Combs, Mrs. J . 0 . Dingus, Ruthie 
Shelton , Mrs. Colin Dingus, Mrs. Gary 
Baldridge, Yvonne Mosley, Mr. Waldo 
Dingus, Peggy Flannery, Janet Horn, 
Alice Baldridge, Sherry Ward, Sheila 
Ward, Brenda Everidge, Joyce Martin, 
Sherry Flannery. 

The Daughters of the American 
Revolution remind us that September 
17th through 23rd has been proclaimed by 
the President of the United States as 
Constitution Week. If our Nation is to 
remain vital, it must maintain the spirit 
of liberty expressed in our Constitution. 

To Subscribers 
Please note date shown 

opposite your name on 
your copy of The Times 
or on the wrapper. If the 
date reads, for instance, 
"July 78" your sub­
scription will expire at 
the end of July. 

Because of increased 
rna iling costs, notices to 
subscribers of their 
expiration dates will be 
discontinued. Subscrip­
tions which have expired 
must be cancelled within 
one month of the expira­
tion date. 

Yearly subscription 
rates are: $6.30 in Floyd 
county; $7.35 elsewhere 
in Kentucky; $8.50 out­
side Kentucky. 
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LEGAL NOTICE 
:"~;OTICE IS HEREBY GIVE~ THAT THE PUBLIC 
SERVICE C0!\1:\IISSIO~ OF KE~TUCKV HAS 
SCtll-:DUI.ED A Pt;BLIC HEARING FOR 1:30 P .:\1., 
:\-10~DAV, SEPTEMBER 25, 1978, AT ITS OFFICE AT 
7:10 SCHE:"~;KEL LANE, FRANKFORT, KENTUCI<V, ON 
THE IMPLE~1E..,TATION 8V KE..,TL'CKV POWER 
CO:YIPA:\V OF THE C0:\1MISSIO~'S MA:'I:DATED 
STA:"~;DARD FL'EI. ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE, WHICH 
WILL REQUIRE THE COMPANY TO REVISE ITS 
8 ,\SE RATES. THIS STANDARD FUEL ADJUSTME:'IIT 
CL\t:SE A~D THE REVISED BASE RATES ARE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ft:EL ADJ'CSTMENT CLAUSE 

Applicable. 

To Tariffs R.S., G.S., L.P ., C.P.O., L.C.P, H.T.P., T.P., 
M.W .• E.H.S., E.H.G .. S.S. AND C.P. 

Rate. 

This rate shall provide for periodic adjustment per kilowatt· 
hour when the unit cost of fuel ( F < m ) - S ( m l l used to meet the 
Company 's Net Energy requirement <S (m ) l is above or below 
the base unit cost of 1.200 cents per kilowatt-hour c F Cbl • S Cbl >. 

The charges provided for in the net monthly rate shall be In­
creased or decreased respectively by the product of the 
kilowatt-hours furnished during the month and a Fuel Ad­
justment Clause Factor <A l, where "A", calculated to the 
nearest .001 cent per kilowatt-hour, Is as defined below: 

Adjustment Factor <A > 
F Cm l 
S <m> 

In the above formula, "F" is the expense of fossil fuel in the base 
Cb l and current (m) periods; and "S" Is the KWH sales in the 
base <bl and current < m ) periods, all as defined below. 

2. Fuel Costs <Fl shall be the most recent actual monthly cost, 
based on weighted average inventory costing, of: 

a . Fossil fuel consumed in Kentucky Power Company's 
generating plants and the Company's share of fossil and nuclear 
ruel consumed in jointly owned or leased plants, plus the cost of 
fuel hich would have been used in plants suffering forced 
generation or transmission outages, but less the cost of fuel to 
substitute generation, plus 

b . The actual identifiable fossil and nuclear fuel costs 
associated with energy purchased for reasons other than 
identified in paragraph <c> below. but excluding the cost of fuel 
re lated to purchases to substitute the forced outages, plus 

c. The net energy cost of energy purchases, exclusive of 
capacity or demand charges <irrespective of the designation to 
such transaction) when such energy Is purchased on an 
economic dispatch basis. Included therein may be such costs as 
the charges for economy energy purchases and the charges as a 
result of schedule outage, all such kinds of energy being pur· 
chases by the Company to substitute for Its own higher c011t 
energy. less 

d The cost of fossil fuel recovered through inter-system 
sales including the fuel costs related to economy energy sales 
aad other energy sold a economic dlapatcb basis. 

3. The cost of fossil fuel shall Include no Items other than the 
invoice price of fuel Ins any cash or other discounts. The Invoice 
price of fuel Includes the cost of the fuel Itself and necessary 
charges for transportation of the fuel from the point of 
acquisition to the unloading point, as listed in Account 151 of 
FERC Uniform System of Accounts for Public Utilities and 
Licenses. 

4. Forced outages are all nonscheduled losses of generation or 
transmission which require substitute power for a continuous 
period of six (6) hours. Where forced outages are not as a result 
of faulty equipment, faulty manufacture. faulty design, faulty 
installations, faulty operation, faulty maintenance, but are Acts 
of God, riot, Insurrection or acts of the public enemy, then the 
Company may, upon proper showing, with the approval of 
Public Service Commission, Include the fuel cost of substitute 
energy in the adjustment. 

5. Sales CS> shall be all kilowatt-hours sold, excluding Inter­
system sales. Where, for any reason, billed system sales cannot 
be coordinated with fuel costs for the billlng period, sal8 may 
be equated to the sum of (I) generation, (II) purchasn, <Ill> 
interchange-in, len <ivl energy associated with pumped storage 
operations, less <vl system sales referred to In section (2) <dl 
above, less (vi) total system losses. Company used energy shall 
not be excluded in the determination ofsales <Sl. 

6. Sales CS) shall be modified to reflect line losses on the Com­
pany's delivery of energy to Kentucky Jurisdictional 
Customers. 

Rate. 

TARIFF R. S. 
<Residential Service) 

First 30 kwhrs per month 
Next 40 kwhrs per month 
Next 130 kwhrs per month 
Next 300 kwhrs per month 
Next 1000 kwhrs per month 
Over 1500 kwhrs per month 

Rate 

TARIFF G.S. 
<Central Service) 

6.957c per kwhr 
5.807c per kwhr 
3.917c per kwhr 
2.837c per kwhr 
2.SI7c per kwhr 
2.257c per kwhr 

Kwhrs equal to first SO times kw of monthly billing demand : 
First30kwhrs 7.118c per kwhr 
Over 30 kwhrs 5.594c per kwhr 

Kwhrs equal to next ISO times kw of monthly b111ing demand: 
First 3,000 kwhrs 3.9-17c per kwhr 
Over 3,000 kwhrs 2.849c per kwhr 

Kwhrs in excess of 200 times kw of monthly 
billing demand. 

Rate 

TARIFF L.P . 
(Large Power) 

2.240c per kwhr 

Kwhrs equal to the first 30 times the kva 
of monthly billing demand 6.419c per kwhr 
Kwhrs equal to the next 170 times the kva of monthly billing 
demand as follows : 

First 3,000 Kwhrs 
"lext3,000 Kwhrs 
Next4,000 Kwhrs 
Next 10,000 Kwhrs 
Next 80,000 Kwhrs 
All over 100,000 Kwhrs 
Kwhrs equal to the next 160 times the kva 
of monthly billing demand 
Kwhrs in excess or 360 times the: kva 
of monthly billlng demand 

Ratt 

TARIFF C.P.O. 
<Capacity Power - Optional) 

K\\.hrs equal to the first 30 times the kva of 

3.634C per kwhr 
3.388c per kwhr 
3.142c per kwhr 
2.897c per kwhr 
2.651c per kwhr 
z..t06c per kwhr 

J.927c per kwhr 

1.682c per kwhr 

monthly billing demand 
Kwhrs equal to the next 170 times the kva 
of monthly billing demand as follows: 

First 3,000 kwhrs 
~ext 3,000 kwhrs 
~ext 4,000 kwhrs 
:\ext 10,000 kwhrs 
:\ext 80,000 k~hrs 
All over 100,000 kwhrs 

Kwhrs equal to the next 160 times the kva 
of monthly billing demand 
Kwhrs in excess of 360 times the kva 
of monthly billing demand 

Rate. 

TARIFF L.C.P. 
<Large Capacity Power> 

Primary Portion: 
First 1,000 kw of monthly billing demand 

)';ext 3,000 kw of monthly billing demand 
All over 4,000 kw of monthly billing demand 

6.5ttc:: per kwhr 

3.725c per kwhr 
3.472c per kwhr 
3.220c per kwhr 
2.M7c per kwbr 
2.714c per kwbr 
2.46Zc per kwhr 

1.969c per kwhr 

l.717c prr kwhr 

S8.341 per kw 

•1.111 per kw 
S7.061 per kw 

The customer shall be allowed 315 kwhrs for each kw of 
monthly billing demand billed hereunder. 

Secondary Portion: Energy ln excess of 315 kwhrs per kw of 
monthly billing $.01618 per kwhr. 

Rate Adjustment. 
In any monthly period when metered kwhrs are less than 315 

kwhrs per kw of monthly bllllng demand, the customer shall 
receive a credit on such deficiency In kwhra at a rate of 1.100c 
per kwhr. 

TARIFF H.T.P. 
(High Tension Power> 

Rate. 

Rate Per Kva Per Month 

For 61 kv For 138 kv 
Delivery Delivery 
Voltage Voltage 

A. When measured demand Is equal to or exceeds 
minimum monthly blllinl( demand: 

First 10,000 kva of measured demand 
per month $13.410 S13.271 
All o\·er 10,000 kva of measured demand 
per month $13.117 Sl3.065 

B. When measured demand is less than minimum 
monthly billing demand: 

Each kva of measured demand per month at above rate. 
For each kva of difference between minimum 
monthly bllllng demand and measured 
demand per month 10.260 $10.086 

Minimum Monthly Charge. 
This tariff Is subject to minimum monthly charge of "Rate" 

as applied to minimum monthly billing demand under the 
customer's contract but not less than $134,145 for 69 kv delivery 
voltage or $132,768 for 138 kv delivery voltage, each subject to 
adjustments as determined under the "Fuel Adjustment 
Clause". 

Rate. 

Primary Portion : 

TARIFF T.P . 
<Transmission Power) 

For 34.5 - 69 kv 
Delivery 
Voltage 

For the first 25,000 kva of 
month billing demand $6.870 per kva 
For all over 25,000 kva of monthly 
billing demand $6.470 per kva 

Secondar} Portion: 

For 138 kv 
Delivery 
Voltage 

.6.672 per kva 

$6.459 per kva 

Energy In excess or 300 kwhrs per kva 
ofmonthlybllllngdemand $0.146 pl"r kwhr. 

TARIFF M.W. 
L\luniclpal Waterworks > 

Rate. 
First 10,000 kwhrs used per month 
Next 90,000 kwhrs used per month 
All over 100.000 kwhrs used per month 

TARIFF E.H.S. 
<Electric HeatinJ: Schools) 

Rate. 

2.951c per kwhr 
2.287c per kwhr 
2.164c per kwhr 

First 500 kwhrs per month multiplied by the: 
number of classrooms In entire school 4.255c per kwhr 
Balance of kwhrs 2.310c per kwhr 
Where every energy requirement, Including, but not limited 

to, heating, cooling and water heating, or an Individual school 
building or an addition to an edstlng school building Including 
college and university buildings Is supplied by electricity fur­
nished by the company , all energy shall be billed at Z.310c 
per kwhr 

Rate. 

TARIFF E.H.G. 
<Electric Heating General) 

For the first 200 kwhrs or any part 
thereof used in any month 
For the next 6800 kwhrs used In the 
same month 
For all over 7000 kwhrs used in the 

$9.40 

2.940c: per kwhr 

same month 2.560c per kwhr 
There shall be added to the above kwhr charges .1.50 for 

each kw of monthly demand In excess of 30 kw. 

Minimum Charge. 
This tariff is subject to a minimum monthly charge of P.40 

plus $1 .50 for each kw or monthly billing demand in excess of 30 
kw, 

Rate 
.\11 t"IH' I')(,\ 

Rate. 

TARIFF S.S. 
<&hool Service> 

TARIFF C.P. 
(Capacity Power) 

4.080c per kwhr 

Primary Portion : 
Kwhrs equal to 100 times the kva of contract capacity 11 

follows : 
100 times first 50 kva 
100 times next 50 kva 
100 times next 50 kva 
100 times next ISO kva 
100 times all o'l.'er 300 kva 

4.927c per kwhr 
4.450c per kwhr 
3.Z58c per kwhr 
3.020c per kwhr 
2.781c per kwhr 

~·tundan Portw11 : 
KwhNi i~ t>xcess of 100 times the kva of contract capacity as 
follows : 

First 50,000 kwhrs 
Nut 50,000 kwhrs 
:'l:ut 200.000 kwhrs 
All over 300,000 kwhrs 

KPntucky Power Company 
R. E . Matthtws 
Ext>cuthe VIet Prnldent. 

2.781c per_kwhr 
2.662c per kwhr 
2.54_;1c per ~whr 
2.t83c per kwhr 



s·HORT ROWS 
By Nevyle Shackelford 

Gardening T1ps from Extens1on Specialists at the 
University of Kentucky College of Agriculture 

Since the dawn of history, 
and not without considerable 
justification, therapeutic 
marvels have been attributed 
to plants and herbs. At lea-it 
two of these have been 
onions and garlic . 

In Egyptian folklore work­
ers building the pyramids 
were sustained by a diet that 
included the two. Ancient 
Romans put such great stock 
in garlic that they used 1t fo r 
everything from food and 
medicine to a charm agamst 
werewolves and vamptres. Up 
until recent years some back­
woods Kentuckians used 
onions in the treatment of 
colds. 

To prepare the remedy, a 
large onion was roasted m a 
bed of hot ashes until well 
done. Then the juice was 
squeezed therefrom into a 
mug or teacup. Just before 
going to bed. the person 
suffering from a cold dtank 
the juice and ate the onion. 
By morning his cold was 
gone, or at least a lot better. 

For those who may be 
skeptical, not too long ago 
medical researchers 
discovered that onions and 
garlic contamed a powerful 
antibiotic called "allicin,'' a 
milligram of which is equal ~o 
25 units of penicilim. This 
antibiotic IS valu ;tble m th e 
treatment of infectious 
diseases and unlike some of 
the other antibio tics m wtde­
spread use, does not harm the 
good bactena in the hum.in 

body and wh1ch the body 
needs to remam robust and 
heal thy. So the onion cold 
remedy may have had some 
virtue after ILL 

Medkal sc1ence has also 
dtscovered that these two 
vegetables contain an ingredi­
ent that breaks up fibnn, the 
cause of blood clots, all of 
which lends credence to the 
Shakespe.uean statement, "0, 
mick.le 1~ the powerful grace 
that lies 1n herbs, plants, ... 
and their true qua!Jties." 

A learned physician said 
only recently that medical 
s c 1ence w.1~ becoming less 
smug in thf'ir erudition, was 
taking J closer look, and 
takmg a less dubious attitude 
toward old home remedies. In 
many, many cases, he added, 
these old remedies were 
found to have a lot of merit 
and from both wild and 
domestJcated plants have 
come many of our most 
valued medicines. 

Medical researchers are 
now beginnmg to operate as 
never before on the assump· 
tion that this old folk wisdom 
concerning medicinal values 
of plJnts has a solid basis in 
fact . More and more they are 
t1nding sohd e.vidence to back 
up the (ISsumption. With this 
!--md ol an attitude, no telling 
what t h ·: ~e tescan.:hers will 
lind out ncx t. In plants they 
may dtscover specifics for the 
d read diseases of cancer, 
leukemia and others . 

WE'RE FIGHTING FOR YOUR LIFE t 
Reduce 

If Overweight 
American 
Heart 

Association 

.11 very 
REFINED 
Gentleman 

OR how 
NORBfRT RILUEUX 

was the 
oPiginaJ 

Sugar Dad4y. 
On August 26, 1842, Norbert R11lieux put a patent 

on a sweet idea. 
It was a way to ref me sugar. 
To help the sugarcane juaces evaporate more quickly, 

he enclosed condensation coils in a vacuum chamber. 
A process that's macle tbmgs a lot s111eeter ever since. 

You can make your future a httle sweeter. too, by 
buyang U.S. Savings Bonds through your Payroll 
Savtngs Plan. 

They're the dependable 111ay to save for an educatton, 
vacation. or even retirement. Because they always pay 
off w1th interest. 

So buy U.S. Savtngs Bonds. 
And be a "sugar daddy" in your spare ttme. 

St•ru·:-; E Bond ., pay 6°,'J lnten·l'it wh1·n hdd to m OJt urit , · of 5 ~· · ·ars 
<4 1ha" thf' first vt•ar) fnlP n ·-..t t 'l nut r,.u bjt><.·l tu slnt .. of loc·a l 
lnl""Om t· t axt•ft . a nd ft·dt·ra l tax mc\V ht· ddl: rn·rl un td n·d•·m pti r>n 
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SUBAREA HEALTH COUNCIL 
TO ACCEPT NOMINATIONS 

Nominations to the Big Sandy Subarea Health Council will 
be accepted through October 1. The council will act as a local 
advisory body to the East Kentucky Health Systems Agency, 
Inc. <EKHSA) in all matters relating to health planning and 
development in Region 11. 

The nominee and the group or individual submitting the 
nomination must be members of the EKHSA and must reside 
in Floyd, Johnson, Magoffin, Martin or Pike counties. To 
become a member of EKHSA or to submit a nominee to the 
BigSandy Subarea Health Council, write Big Sandy Subarea 
Health Council, 552 South Lake Drive, Prestonsbw-g, KY 
41653, or call Lara Hopkins at 886-&869. 

BOOKMOBILE SCHEDULE 
Wednesday, Sept. 13,-Teaberry community stop, Beaver 

postoffice, home stops ; Thursday,- Martin Station s top, 
Senior Citizens' center, home stops, J & M Fw-mture, 
Pageant Hill Housing Project ; Friday,- Abbott community 
stop, liome stops ; Monday,- Middle Creek, Dotson's 
Grocery, home stops; Tuesday-spur lock Branch home stop, 
Senior Citizens Center at Archer Park. 

For more information, call Buddy Ratcliff, 285-3578. 

• 8 sPECIAL 
• sALE 
• pRICE • • • 

• FLOOD INSURANCE 
• HOMEOWNERS INSURANCE 
• AUTOMOBILE INSURANCE 
• LIFE INSURANCE 

INSURANCE AGENCY INC. 
1 1 S. LAKE DRIVE 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 41653 

Phone 
886-2318 

TO MOTIVE CENTER A 

• Four-ply polyester cord 

$22 
$22 
$22 
$23 

A78-13 blackwall tubeless, $ $2
26
s plus $1 .69 F.E.T. 

and tire off your car. 

Whitewalls add $3.00 per tire. $27 
FREE TIRE MOUNTING AND $28 
ROTATION WITH TIRE PURCHASE 

$29 

878-13 plus $1.77 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
C78-13 pi us $1.90 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
C78-14 plus $1.93 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
E78-14 plus $2.13 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
F78-14 plus $2.26 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
G78-14 plus $2.42 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
G78-15 plus $2.45 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
H78-14 plus $2.60 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car. 
H78-15 plus $2.65 F.E.T. 
and tire off your car . 

CHECK OUR OTHER FISK ANNIVERSARY 

f toRQUE 

\ 

WRENCH 
oual Scale 

• A must lor o works 
anvone wh 10 mot11le 

\! seas 
tT ~ 76-C) 

SPECIALS! AS LOW AS 
$31 

AS LOW AS 
$21 

tR-79) 

ROADPACER 
Heavy-Duty Muffler 

INSTALLED • Most compact & 
Intermediate cars 

ROADPACER 
Heavy-Duty Shocks 
GUARANTEED FOR THE 

L1 FE OF YOUR CAR 

DISC BRAKES 
(front only) 

• Install front d1sc pads 

FISK 36-MONTH 
BATTERY 

Premier 
Battery 

(Any addtt1onal parts 11r sorvtces needed b~.Jt not 
It sled w ill carry a supplemental charge) 

MOST AMERICAN CARS 

$5?c~ 
INSTALLATION 
AVAILABLE 

... ......... ..... . "~ ....... 
....... .. H, l.,.l•~U" 

UIU ~ IO 

•••' •••• • •·••u•• •• Oou 

~~\:f~·::Y.:~i~;~ 

• Resurface ro tors. 
• Road- test car 

(Any add•t•onal parts or serviCes needed but not 
•Sl ed w111 carry a supplemental charQe) 

MOST AMERICAN CARS 

With $2878 
Exchange <GROUP 22F) 

MOST AMERICAN CARS 

• 
WEDDINGTON PLAZA • PHONE 432-0277 

Open Monday- Saturday 10-9 • Sunday 12-7 
Offer Ends Sept. 19 
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Twin Sisters Observe 80th Birthday 

Mrs. Bertha Gurner Hollbrook (left), 
of McDowell and Mrs. Milford J. (Birdie) 
Hall, of Lexington, celebrated their 80th 
birthday with their children, grand­
children, great-grandchildren and many 
other relatives at a covered dish picnic at 
Jenny Wiley State Park, July 29. 

The sisters are the only surviving 
children of the late Ben and Lucy 
Hopkins Hall. 

Mrs. Holbrooks children and grand­
children present were Mrs. Adrian Hall 
and Mr. Hall, of McDowell; Mrs. Haskell 
Hall and Mr. Hall, of Weeksbury; Mrs. 
Glenn Pack and Mr. Pack, of McDowell; 
Mrs. Bob Crissman and Mr. Crissman, 

KATY FRIEND 
FREEWILL BAPTIST 

CHURCH 
West Prestonsburg 

Sumla.' Sdwol •• - - • -IOa.m. 
\\ur!>.hip. - - - - - -11 a.m. 
l'ra~t'l \!Pt'lln~- - - - IJ).m .. 
and llibh· '\Huh \\ t•dnP..,day 

1·. ' t·r~ mu• C urdia II~ In\ ilt>d. 
J:ldt·r Hill ('ampbt'll, Pa~tor 
Eldt•r Bill \mburgt>~. \sst. pastor 

4-26-1 t. 

Announcing 

"Victory in Jesus" 
Program 

Every Sunday Morning 
8:00-8:30 

WDOC RADIO 
Elder Bill Campbell, Pastor, 

KatyFriend 
Freewill Baptist Church 8_23_tf. 

Amelia, 0.; Mr. and Mrs. Rick Hall, Erin 
and Allison, Dr. and Mrs. Donald Hall, all 
of Huntington, W. Va.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Sexton and Megan, of Win­
chester; Mr. and Mrs. Gary Caldwell, 
Steve, Tod and Ben, and Jimmy Darryl 
Hall, of Weeksbury; Gary, Steve, Allen, 
Mark and Kevin Pack, of McDowell; 
Cheryl, Terry, and Carla Crissman, of 
Amelia, Ohio. 

Mrs. Hall's family present were her 
husband, M. J. Hall, and two daughters, 
Mrs. Edward B. Leslie and Dr. Leslie, of 
Prestonsburg; and Mrs. Lloyd Waddell 
and Mr. Waddell, of Lexington; Dr. and 
Mrs. Rondall Hall Leslie, Kathy, Ronnie, 
Jr.,andLara Lea, Dr. and Mrs. Larry M. 
Leslie, Elizabeth Ann and Larry, Jr., and 
Dr. Keith Leslie, all of Prestonsburg; Dr. 
and Mrs. Edward D. Leslie, of Frank­
fort; and Mrs. Sherrill Mercer, Lisa and 
Ray, of Chadbourn, N.C. 

Other relatives present were Dr. and 
Mrs. John L. Hall and Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Farley, of Flemingsburg; Mr. and Mrs. 
James W. Johnson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Jones and Angie, of Mt. 
Sterling; Mrs. Henry Manning and Ted 
Hall, of West Milton, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Hall, of Lexington; Mr. and Mrs. 
James "Jitter" Allen and Greg, of 
Martin; Ellis Martin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Stumbo, Matthew Thomas and 
Marsha, Mr. and Mrs. Greg Stumbo, of 
Prestonsburg; Mrs. Eula Mae Jones, 
Mrs. Georgia Martin, Miss Sherlene 
Martin, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Collins, of 
Dema; Mrs. and Mrs. Dewey Martin, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jake Cooley, Mrs. Carol 
Patton, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Martin, David 
and Traci, of McDowell, and Mrs. Sylvia 
Newman, of Price. 

PLAN MEMORIAL MEET 
A memorial meeting will be held at the 

Shepherd cemetery on the David road 
next Sunday (Sept. 17), beginning at 10 
a.m. 

A Checking Account safeguards your cash 

Because your cash is in the Bank. Furthermore, 

C ancel led checks are valid receipts. 

D on't delay-- open your Checking Account now! 

FIRST GUARANTY BANK 
of Martin, Kentucky 

:\lt>mber Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation 

Southern 
States 

Double 
Zinc-coated 

Barbed 
Wire 

Sale $19.45 
80-Rod Roll 

"Motto" brand 4-point. 15Y2 gauge. Long life. 
High tensile strength. No springback. 

White Mountain Apple Parer 

Sale $10.25 
Regular suggested 

Peels, cores and 
slices an apple in 
only 5 seconds. 
No 6·66670W 

Birmingham "Ponderosa" 
Deluxe Wood Heater 

Sale $325.00 
Handcrafted heavy welded steel construction for 
life-time service. Lined with heavy-duty firebrick. 
Fast starting, slow burning. No. 24. 

Aqua-Pure 
Water Filter 
Sale $28.00 
Regular suggested price $39.95 

Efficiently removes dirt, rust 
particles, other sediment from 
drinking water. 
No. AP 100 

Humane Ani al Trap 
Sale $12.35 

Regular suggested price $1 5. 80 
Traps unwanted squirrels, muskrats, rabbits , skunks, mink 
without harming them. No. 6 · 16482W 

Lufkin 12-ft. 
Steel Tape 

Sale $3.99 
Regular suggested 

price $5.40. 
No. 8312 

Deluxe 
Lawn Rake 
Sale $4.50 

Regular suggested price $6.10 

Resilient spring steel tempered 
tines . 22" wide . 48" handle. 

No 19·359 

Ames 12" 
Brush Cutter 

Sale $5.95 
Regular suggested 

price $7.40 

No. 23-158 

ALL SALE 

Capri 9.9-cu. ft. 
Long 

Handle 
Shovel 

Chest Freezer 

Sale 
$4.50 

Regular 
suggested 

price $5.95 
Round pomt 16· 
gauge, high· 
carbon, heat-

Sale $249.00 
15·831 

created steel.' 
No. 15·613/ Compact space-saving size. Fiberglass wall insulation 

... polyurethane on bottom Adjustable temperature 
control. Sliding storage basket. Key lock. Counter· 
balanced lid has tightening-sealing gasket. All-steel 
wrap-around construction. No. C1 O·B. 

Aluminum 
Snow 

Shovel 
2-Window 
Storm Kit 
Sale 59t; Sale 

$4.50 
Regular 

suggested 
price $5.25. 

Regular suggested price 75• 

Contains 2 sheets of plastic, each 36" 
x 72", plus molding and nails 

No. 16-390 

U nico Heavy Duty 
10X12-ft. 

Tarp 
Sale $40.75 
Regular suggested price $50.92 

Durable cotton·synthet1c Treated for 
water, m1ldew res1stance. Rope m 
hem. Reinforced 

Energy-saving Harthglass rM 

Fireplace 
Screen 

Sale $79.00 
Regular suggested 

price $105.95 
Tempered glass doors. 
Antique brass. Fits open· 
ing 35" to 43h' wide by 
28" to 31 'h" high. lncl 
screen No 6·67940W 

Quality 
Light Bulbs 

Sale 
2 for 73t; 

Regular suggested price 63' ea_ 
Choose 40, 75 or 1 OO·watt size. Long· burning, top-quality 
bulbs 

33/4-gal. Galvanized Scrub Tub 

Sale 
$3.05 

Regular suggested 
price $3.95 

Heavy·duty Long·lasttng 
construction. Superior rust 
protection. 

No 44 

Lemon Mild 
Dish Detergent 

Sale &gc qt. 
Regular suggested price 79• 

Gentle for hands. One squeeze gets 
a sink full of dishes sparkling clean. 

I 

No . 2P24 

Prolin Rat & 
Mouse Killer 
Pellets 
Sale $3.50 sibs. 

Regular suggested 
price $455 

Gets hard-to-kill rats . Ready for I use No pre-bMtng necessary 

I 

WAAFARIN Rodeo11id<it 

4-lb. 
Wedge 

Regular suggested 
price $4.50 

No.4W 

'Commander" 
Flashlight 

Sale 
$1.25 

Less Battenes 

Regular suggested 
pnce$165 

No 5251 BP 

10" 
Vise-Grip 

Pliers 

Sale 
$3.99 

Regular suggested 
pnce $5.55 

No.C10WR 

PRESTONSBURG 
FARM & HOME STORE -VIS-4' 

600 5. Lake Drive 
Phone 886-8596 • Prestonsburg 

You Can Live Without Heart Disease! 
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Working 
for YOU I 

All Flavors 
IGA 

~~--_.. Ice Cream 

half .~~ 
gallon ~ • 

Prices Effective 
through 

Sunday, Sept. 17th 

Each pkg. contains: 3 
forquarters with back, 
3 hindquarters with 

back and 3 
wings plus giblets 

Section Three, Page Twelve 

«!fiiil» 
~"'" ~ --::::::::l Smooth or Chunky 

Skippy 
1/&1 .. ~ Peanut Butter 

$ .05 
12 pak 1 8 oz. Jar 

A Variety of Meat Values I 

Fresh 99~ Fryer Breasts . . . . . . . . . Lb. 

Fresh 89~ Fryer Legs ........... Lb. 

Fresh 79~ Fryer Thighs . . . . . . . . . . Lb. 

Fischer's Meat or Beef 

Wieners .......... . 12-0z.99~ 
• Pkg. 

Harmel 

Platter Bacon • • • • • • • • Lb.89~ 

FISCHER'S Fischer's Whole 

SMOKED PICNIC 79~ 
SHOULDERS ..•.• Lb. 

Crisco 
Shortening 

$1!! 

HEALTH AND 
BEAUTY AIDS 
40 ct. Tablets or 12 oz. Liquid Bottle 
Geritol. ................. •2.59 

Flintstone Regular (30 FREE!) 
Vitamins ............ 60 ct. *1.99 

Rose Milk Unscented or Regular 
Lotion. . . . . . . , • • • • • . 8 oz. 9 9 c 

Nasal Spray 
Vicks Sinex. . . . . . . . . . 5 oz. •1.19 

Syrup 
Vicks N uil ........ ,. . 6 oz. •1.59 

Spam 
Luncheon Meat 

•• c 

hite or Golden 

Bush's Hominy 
14.5 oz. cans 

ShowBoat 
Pork & Beans 

..-fARM FRESH PRODUCE--
TableFresh Red or Golden 

Delicious Apples. . . . . . . . . . 31b. bag SI.IO 
TableFresh 

Red Potatoes ............ 1 Olb. bag SI.S 0 
TableFresh 

T
vablencia Oranges ......... 41b. bag SI.IO 
a leFresh 

Carrots ................. 21b. ba SOC 

MELLWOOD BACON 
~-~· $1.29 USDA Choice 

RIB EYE Whole$269 
STEAK ...•... Lb. 

Sliced Free 

Cut or Shelly 
Bush's 

Green Beans 

Vs1 
15 oz. cans 

Limit 4 

ush's 
Chili Hot Beans 

Turnip or Spinach 
Bush's 

Chopped Greens · 
15 oz. cans 

TableFresh 
Red Grapes 

Bush's 
Kidney Beans 

Cheese, Sausage, Pepperoni, Hamburger 
Chef Boy-ar-dee 

Frozen Pizza 
13.5 - 15 oz. boxes 

8 

Bush's 
Pinto Beans 

Purex 
Detergent 

Limit 1 
42 oz. box 

THOMPSON'S PRESTONSBURG • MARTIN 

GA UPERMARKETS 
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