
Weekend Edition, Jan. 11-13, 2019

Archer Clinic

400 University Drive

Prestonsburg, KY 41653

606-886-3831

Accepting New Patients

MATT TURNER MDMATT TURNER MD

Family

Practice
All Ages Accepted

Balanced Blackcats 

handle Jenkins

 Sports, 1B

Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Mary Meadows

Attorney Greg Jensen, representing Quest Energy, 

apologizes to the Wayland City Commission for not 

in a contract for the removal of coal on previous-

ly-mined property the city owns.

Quest apologizes 
to Wayland

BY MARY MEADOWS 

STAFF WRITER 

A month after the 

Wayland City Commis-

sion voted to end its con-

tract with Quest Energy, 

representatives from the 

company came to a city 

meeting to apologize.

The company’s law-

yer Greg Jensen ad-

dressed the commission 

on Jan. 8, about a month 

after commissioners vot-

ed to end its contract with 

Quest, citing a breach of 

contract. 

“We recognize and 

respect and appreci-

ate the decision you all 

had to make in your last 

meeting,” Jensen said. 

“And, what we really just 

hope to do is have fur-

ther conversations with 

a way to work together, 

Wayland gym project moves forward 

BY MARY MEADOWS 

STAFF WRITER 

When Kevin Gilliam 

of Summit Engineering 

bids submit ted for the 

Wayland gym renovation 

project was $409,000, 

Mayor Jerry Fultz let out 

an audible gasp. 

That ’s because, un-

like the last time bids 

were opened for the 

renovation project, that 

$409,000 base bid came 

in well below the current 

project budget, as did 

the other three bids that 

were opened during a 

Jan. 8 meeting. 

Fultz said the gym 

See QUEST, Page 3A

BY MARY MEADOWS

STAFF WRITER 

Prestonsburg Tour-

ism Director Samantha 

West said the agency 

will expand its efforts to 

highlight artists, includ-

ing musicians and story-

tellers in 2019.

During a telephone 

interview this week, West 

planning to develop a 

new Prestonsburg Story-

tellers series. 

The program is still 

being planned, but West 

described it as a series of 

mini-documentaries that 

will be broadcast by Pres-

tonsburg Tourism online 

and on social media.  

“That can go out, 

P’burg Tourism to 

highlight musicians, 

storytellers this year

See TOURISM, Page 7A

Senate Caucus 

Chair Johnny 

Ray Turner, 

D- Prestons-

burg, confers 

with Senator 

Julian Carroll, 

D-Frankfort, 

on Senate 

business on 

Tuesday, the 

opening day 

of the 2019 

Legislative 

Session. 
Submitted photo 

Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by LRC Public Information

Rep. Robert Goforth, R-East Bernstadt, speaks with Rep. Sal Santoro, R-Flor-

ence, and Rep. Ashley Tackett Laferty, D-Martin, in the Kentucky House.

BY MARY MEADOWS

STAFF WRITER 

Floyd County legisla-

tors returned to Frank-

fort this week for the 

opening of a 30-day leg-

islative session.

Rep. Ashley Tacket t 

Laferty, D-Martin, and 

Sen. Johnny Ray Turner, 

D-Prestonsburg, started 

that work on Jan. 8. 

On Wednesday, 

Turner introduced a 

bill that, if approved, 

would allow convictions 

for reckless homicide 

to be vacated. The bill, 

which was unsuccessful 

last year, proposes that 

convictions for reckless 

homicide could be va-

cated and expunged if 

the offender has been 

granted a partial pardon 

by the governor.

Turner said Thurs-

day that he’s not sure 

whether the bill will 

move in the legislature 

this session, but he 

hopes to see its pas-

sage. 

This is among sev-

eral legislative matters 

that Turner will be sup-

porting this session. 

“Though this is the 

short or 30-day session, 

the legislators are facing 

some complex issues in-

cluding pension, charter 

Legislators are back 

in session

See SESSION, Page 9A

Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Mary Meadows

Pictured left to right are Kevin Gilliam of Summit Engineering, Rusty Justice of 

Jigsaw Enterprises, commissioners Susie Mills and Charles Bentley, Mayor Jerry 

Fultz, attorney Tyler Green and Commissioner Curtis Lee. 

Nearly $1 million in projects 

underway in the city

See WAYLAND, Page 9A



A FLOYD CHRONICLE

AND TIMES STAFF REPORT

 

The Kentucky Attor-

water loss rate case re-

-

the Attorney General’s 

-

-

-

year that more than half 

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

First Month FREEFirst Month FREE
Starting at $750.00 
2 bedroom 2 1/2 bath, garage with washer and 

dryer hook up, stove and refrigerator included. 

Check us out on facebook at MAP properties 

apartments with pictures of units included!

If interested call 

606-432-4653 or text 606-794-1463
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Rate increase proposed for some Floyd gas customers

AG asks to intervene 
in water rate case 
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Prestonsburg man accused of fighting with officer
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EDITORIAL

GUEST COLUMN

BY SJ RUTH

APPALACHIAN NEWSPAPERS

Trumpty Dumpty sat 
on a wall. The end.

What’s that? I’ve got 
another 495 words to go? 
Do I really have to spoil a 
perfect summation of our 
country today with more 
verbage?

Well, I guess if you 
say so. Here goes.

Emergency personel 
across the country re-
ported a sharp increase 
in alcohol related deaths 
on Wednesday morning. 
The deaths appear to 
be a result of a drinking 
game in which partici-
pants take a shot each 
time the Donald lied in 
his nationally-televised 
speech.

According to Ruth 
Mitchell, spokesperson 
for Reno 911, things could 
have been much worse.

“Many Americans are 
just too naive today to 
understand the conse-
quences of this game. 
Historically, presidents 
have bent the truth about 
once every hundredth 
paragraph. Trump does it 
once every seven words. 
No one with a function-
ing liver could survive. 
It’s like playing Russian 
Roulette with six loaded 
chambers. “

“But we feel we 
dodged a bullet. First, 
the speech was under 10 
minutes. If he’d gone 15, 
casualties could have tri-
pled. Second, the ratings 
were worse than the last 

year of Happy Days. I 
don’t think a shark would 
have helped.”

In Kentucky, alcohol 
related mishaps were al-
most non-existent thanks 
to a cleverly scheduled 
UK basketball game. 
While Kentucky is heavy 
in Trumpets, few outside 
Louisville would miss the 
Cats for the Cheetoh.

For those of you who 
completely missed it, 
Trump made the asser-
tion the situation on our 
southern border was a 
crisis of the soul. While 
that line spurred innu-
merable shots across the 
country, it’s likely they 
were misinterpreted.

The soul of our coun-
try is in crisis because the 
occupant of the Oval Of-

do the religious and polit-
ical charlatans that claim 
some sort of divine man-
date for Trump.

The facts, which are 
meaningless to around 
30 percent of our voting 
population, show that il-
legal immigration has 
consistently fallen since 
2005. The facts also show 
that more people come in 
legally and stay until they 
aren’t than come in ille-
gally. The facts show far 
more people on terrorist 
watch lists are appre-
hended in airports than 
along our borders. Finally, 
the facts show far more 
illegal drugs enter our 
country by car, boat and 
airplane than by mules 
crossing the border.

The soul of our coun-
try is in crises because 
some have decided to 
ignore the symbolism of 
the Statue of Liberty and 
adapt a wall as a nation-
al symbol. A wall that is 
meant to keep brown 
Americans out of our 
country.

If it were really about 
national security, wouldn’t 
we be talking about a 
wall on our southern and 
northern borders? Seems 
like nobody’s scared of 
those fair-haired Canadi-
ans, though.

The greatness of 
America has always been 
in our diversity, a fact 
Trump and his ilk prefer 
you forget: Diversity in 
religious beliefs, diversity 
in national origin and ra-
cial makeup, diversity in 
our political makeup.

If our country has a 
crisis of the soul, it’s in 
those who believed we 
needed to Make America 
Great Again by return-
ing to the 19th century 
and adapting prehistoric 
technology and beliefs 
to erase Obama’s legacy. 
And that’s what this is re-
ally all about.

Trumpty Dumpty sat 
on a wall. The end.

Summing up

“The Allen City Com-
mission has spent more 
than a month trying to 
determine whether the 
city hired a paving com-
pany without approval.”

It’s hard to believe 
— and deeply troubling – 
that this newspaper had 
to print a sentence like 
that in a story about a lo-
cal government body. 

The taxpayers of Al-
len deserve more than 
this lack of accountability. 

pledge to uphold the laws 
of this state and they 
pledge to do their best 
to carry out the duties of 

We expect them to 
spend money wisely and 

to account for every dime 
that is spent.

-
cials of any city more 
than a month to deter-
mine whether they voted 
or didn’t vote to spend 
around $30,000 to pave 
streets, then what does 
that say about other ac-
countability measures 
this city should be tak-
ing?

If you recall, this 
round of funding marked 

-
ceived municipal road aid 
in at least a decade, be-
cause the state withheld 
the funds after the city 

-
cial reports, as required, 
for years. 

The city spent this 
funding after tossing out 
a completely legitimate 
bid, claiming it was not 
legitimate, and accept-
ing an invoice as a “bid” 
from the company that 
did the work—with that 
invoice being dated four 
days after the commis-
sion tossed out the other 
bid and voted to hire this 
one instead.

Months later, the 
commission talked about 
hiring the company 
again, but took no action, 
no vote, and when Com-
missioner Eilene Kinzer 
asked whether the city 
got more bids the follow-
ing month, she learned 
that the work was al-

ready done and the com-
pany had been paid. In 
December, she was told 

meeting minutes and call 
a special meeting, which 
didn’t happen, and the 
same thing happened 
when she brought the 
topic up again this week.

Kudos to Kinzer for 
continuing to push for 
answers about this. We 
hope she doesn’t stop 
asking until she hears the 
answer to her question 
once and for all.

And kudos to City At-
torney Beth Shortridge, 
who has repeatedly tried 
to teach the Allen City 
Commission about its 
requirements under the 

law.
On Monday, she talk-

ed about the importance 
of the commission tak-
ing actions during pub-
lic meetings and the re-
quirements for calling a 
special meeting, among 
other things that city of-

a government body for 
decades should already 
know. 

They should already 
know this stuff by heart. 

With the latest steps 
Allen has taken in the 
wrong direction, it’s nice 
to see Kinzer’s willing-
ness to ask the same 
questions repeatedly 
and Shortridge’s repeat-
ed attempts try to ed-

who somehow don’t un-
derstand these rules and 
regulations. Those ef-
forts are about the only 
glimmer of hope Allen 
has left. 

We’ve suggested that 

training in the past, and a 
couple of them, the new-
est members, have.  

This week, we em-
phatically suggest that 
all commission members 
and the mayor under-
go the training that the 
taxpayers of Allen de-
serve and begin to heed 
the law and basic ethical 
standards under which a 
government body should 
operate.

Allen taxpayers deserve more than this
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P’burg man faces 

sexual abuse charge

AN APPALACHIAN NEWS-

PAPERS

STAFF REPORT

Appalachian Newspapers photo by Chase Ellis

The East Kentucky Expo Center’s Larry Miller and Josh Kesler were joined by 

“PAW Patrol’s” Chase and Marshall in announcing the Expo Center’s summer 

shows of “PAW Patrol Live! Race To The Rescue.” “PAW Patrol” will hold four 

shows over two days at the Expo Center on June 1 and June 2.

‘PAW Patrol’ coming 

to the rescueA FLOYD CHRONICLE 

AND TIMES STAFF REPORT 

Grand jury to consider 

charges in stolen truck case 

A FLOYD CHRONICLE 

AND TIMES STAFF REPORT 

Frontier gas seeks PSC 
approval for transfer

TOURISM
Continued From Page 1A



PRESTONSBURG SEVENTH DAY ADVENTIST 

CHURCH

421 Jack Arnette Branch, Prestonsburg

Phone: 606-886-3459

Pastor Tony Kelley

SATURDAYS

Sabbath School – 9:30 a.m.

Worship – 11 a.m.

TUESDAYS

Evening Prayer Meeting – 7 p.m.

ST. FRANCIS OF ASSISI CATHOLIC CHURCH

137 Bryan Street, Pikeville

Phone: 606-437-6117

Father Richard Watson

SATURDAYS

Mass - 5 p.m.

SUNDAYS

Mass – 10 a.m.

ST. JAMES’ EPISCOPAL CHURCH

562 University Drive, Prestonsburg

Phone: 606-886-8046

The Rev. Sr. Judy Yunker, Vicar

Email: stjamesdiolex@gmail.com

Website: www.stjamesdiolex.org

Diocese: Lexington

ST. MARTHA CATHOLIC CHURCH

60 Martha’s Vineyard, Prestonsburg

606-874-9526

Fr. Brandon Bigam

SATURDAY

Services – 5 p.m.

SUNDAY

Services – 11:15 a.m.

TRIMBLE CHAPEL CHURCH

79 Trimble Chapel Square, Prestonsburg

Pastor David Bowling

SUNDAY

Sunday School – 10 a.m.

Services – 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

WEDNESDAY

Services and Youth Group – 6 p.m.

VOGEL DAY METHODIST

US 23, Harold

Pastor Dennis Love

SUNDAY

Sunday School – 10 a.m.

Worship – 11 a.m.

Healing Service – 7 p.m. on last Sunday of month

WEDNESDAYS

Prayer Meeting & Youth Fellowhip – 6:30 p.m.

AA Meeting – 8 p.m.

ALLEN BAPTIST CHURCH

354 US HWY 23 South, Prestonsburg, At junction of 

HWY 23 and RT 80

Phone: 606-874-9468 � Find us on Facebook

Pastor Dr. Tim Searcy

http://allen-baptist-church.twenty28cms.co

SUNDAYS

Bible Study – 9:45 a.m.

Worship – 10:45 a.m. & 7 p.m.

WEDNESDAYS

Evening Worship – 7 p.m.

Local Church Directory
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 A church in the Lex-

ington area made a shift in 

their leadership. They al-

lowed an openly gay man, 

who is married to another 

man, to become a deacon 

in the church. Just to clar-

ify, a deacon is a leader of 

the church. Leaders of the 

church – as well as every 

member of the church – are 

representatives of Christ. 

And the church belongs to 

Christ. He bought and paid 

for it when He died on the 

cross for our sins.

 When I was looking at 

Christian book releases for 

the month of January I ran 

across this title: “Modern 

Kinship: A Queer Guide to 

Christian Marriage.” What?

I did a double take. Is this a 

play on words? I glanced at 

the author names, two men. 

Okay, maybe it’s not a play 

on words. I clicked on the 

link to see what the book 

was about. The summary 

read, “Same-sex marriage 

may be legal in America, 

but it’s still far from the ac-

cepted norm, especially in 

Christian circles. So where 

can LBGTQ Christians who 

desire a lifelong, covenant-

al relationship look for dat-

ing and marriage advice 

when Christian relationship 

guides have not only simply 

ignored but actively exclud-

ed same-sex couples? Da-

vid and Constantino Khalaf 

struggled to fi nd relational 

role models and guidance 

throughout dating, their 

engagement, and the early 

months of their marriage. 

To fi ll this void, they began 

writing Modern Kinship, a 

blog exploring the unique 

challenges queer couples 

face on the road from sin-

gleness to marital bliss. 

Part personal refl ection, 

part commentary, and full 

of practical advice, “Mod-

ern Kinship” explores the 

biblical concept of kinship 

from a twenty-fi rst-century 

perspective. This import-

ant resource tackles sub-

jects such as dating out-

side of smartphone apps, 

overcoming church and 

family issues, meeting your 

partner’s parents, deciding 

when and how to have chil-

dren, and fi nding your mis-

sion as a couple. “Modern 

Kinship” encourages queer 

Christian couples to build 

God-centered partnerships 

of trust and mutuality.” 

 Oh, no. No!

 This is false doctrine. 

This is false teaching. This 

is NOT the word of God. 

The reason that Christian 

relationship guides have ig-

nored and excluded same-

sex couples is simple: This 

is not what God stands for, 

but instead is what God is 

against!

 Let’s see what the Bi-

ble says, shall we?

 God gave the law to 

Moses. In Leviticus chap-

ter 18, there’s a whole list 

of laws on sexual relations. 

These laws include, “Do 

not have sexual relations 

with a man as one does 

with a woman; that is de-

testable (18:22).”

 Timothy writes, “We 

also know that the law is 

made not for the righteous 

but for lawbreakers and 

rebels, the ungodly and 

sinful, the unholy and irre-

ligious, for those who kill 

their fathers or mothers, 

for murderers, for the sex-

ually immoral, for those 

practicing homosexuality, 

for slave traders and li-

ars and perjurers—and for 

whatever else is contrary 

to the sound doctrine that 

conforms to the gospel 

concerning the glory of the 

blessed God, which he en-

trusted to me (1 Timothy 

1:9-11).” 

 The New Testament 

says, “Or do you not know 

that wrongdoers will not in-

herit the kingdom of God? 

Do not be deceived: Nei-

ther the sexually immoral 

nor idolaters nor adulterers 

nor men who have sex with 

men nor thieves nor the 

greedy nor drunkards nor 

slanderers nor swindlers 

will inherit the kingdom of 

God (1 Corinthians 6:9-

10).”

 “It is God’s will that 

you should be sanctifi ed: 

that you should avoid sex-

ual immorality; that each of 

you should learn to control 

your own body in a way 

that is holy and honor-

able… The Lord will pun-

ish all those who commit 

such sins, as we told you 

and warned you before. 

For God did not call us to 

be impure, but to live a holy 

life. Therefore, anyone who 

rejects this instruction does 

not reject a human being 

but God, the very God who 

gives you his Holy Spirit (1 

Thessalonians 4:3-8).”

 The Bible clearly says 

homosexuality is wrong. 

How can a church know-

ingly elect a married ho-

mosexual man to be part 

of its leadership? How 

can we ignore the laws of 

God and think that’s okay? 

Fact: It’s not okay. It’s not 

upholding the Word of God 

and instead is taking on 

the characteristics of the 

world. The church is to be 

set apart from the world. 

The church doesn’t belong 

to us. It belongs to Christ! 

Therefore, we do not have 

the authority to make up 

our own rules! “Wrongdo-

ers will not inherit the king-

dom of God.” Anyone who 

rejects His word rejects 

God.

 I do want to say one 

thing before I end. God 

hates the sin, but not the 

sinner. God loves us de-

spite our fl aws and fail-

ures. Likewise, we are to 

extend that same love to 

others. Jesus said, “Love 

your neighbor as yourself 

(Matthew 22:39).” It may 

be diffi  cult for some to un-

derstand, but just because 

Christians don’t agree with 

someone’s choice does 

not mean we don’t love 

and care for you. In fact, 

we want nothing more than 

everyone to come to Christ 

and have eternal life. Just 

realize, His Words are not 

to be altered. Once, we 

decide to follow Christ, we 

live for Him, not ourselves.

The church belongs to Christ

BY JAMI E BECKETT

CHRONI CLE & TI MES

The Bible versus the world
We cannot aff ord to let down our Christian standards just 

to hold the interest of people who want to go to hell and 

still belong to a church. – A.W. Tozer

You may think you can live fi ne without Christ, but you 

cannot aff ord to die without him.  – Charles Spurgeon

We must not confuse the command to love with the dis-

ease to please. – Lysa Terkeurst

Make sure Satan has to climb over a lot of scripture to get 

to you. – John MacArthur

Satan’s target is your mind and his weapon is lies, fi ll your 

mind with God’s word. – Author Unknown

The devil knows if he can capture your thought life he has 

won a mighty victory over you. – Smith Wigglesworth

The greatest single danger in this end time is not sick-

ness, nor poverty, nor persecution. It is deception. – 

Derek Prince

How can you expect to dwell with God forever, if you so 

neglect and forsake Him here? – Jonathan Edwards

If private revelations agree with Scriptures, they are need-

less; and if they disagree, they are false. – John Owen

Satan continues his eff orts to make sin less off ensive, 

heaven less appealing, hell less horrifi c, and the gospel 

less urgent. – John MaArthur

We must not adopt the world’s view and then tweak it to 

make it Christian. We must draw a line in the sand and 

stand fi rm in the radical teachings of Christ and His gos-

pel. We must preach the truth and be the examples of the 

truth we preach. – Paul Washer

There’s one thing we need above everything else: It’s 

something we don’t talk about these days. We need a 

mighty avalanche of conviction of sin. – Leonard Ravenhill

When a person becomes a Christian, it is no longer a 

priority to listen to the world. It is no longer a priority to 

care what the world may think.  Everything changes. 

The world looks completely diff erent. All of the temporal 

pleasures of this world become less enjoyable because a 

greater joy has been found. Thus you place your fi ngers 

in your ears, for you no longer care about the world’s 

opinion, and  you run like a lunatic crying, “Life! Life! Eter-

nal life!” – John Bunyan

Do not add to what I command you and do not subtract 

from it, but keep the commands of the Lord your God that 

I give you. – Deuteronomy 4:2

Fill your mind with God’s Word and  you will have no 

room for Satan’s lies. – Author Unknown

Telling the truth

W
e live in an age where some justify lies by 

calling them “alternative facts” and where 

people accept a sophomoric relativism which 

says that one is entitled to believe whatever one wishes, 

even when one is believing blatant falsehoods. The 

fact that people can believe things which are easily 

shown to be false only illustrates how naïve and gullible 

we can be. This inability 

to distinguish truth from 

falsehood is something 

which we see most clearly 

in children. Young children 

will believe almost anything 

(e.g., the tooth fairy, the 

Easter bunny, and Santa 

Claus, to name just a few). 

As children get older, we 

expect them to discern truth 

from falsehood, and to tell 

the truth. Some parents 

question the wisdom of 

lying to children about such things as Santa Claus, as it 

sends several questionable messages. As children grow 

out of the naivete of early childhood, we teach them to 

be critical and discerning, for example, telling them not 

to trust strangers, and requiring them to tell the truth 

at all times. Like the little boy who cried wolf, we have 

trouble trusting those who have repeatedly deceived us. 

We are not relativists in our everyday life, knowing that 

there is an objective truth about factual matters. And 

while it may be wise to suspend judgement on some 

issues until the facts are better known, we should not 

deceive ourselves into believing that there are alternative 

versions of reality. Truth is one.        – Christopher Simon

“Then we will no longer be infants, tossed back and 

forth by the waves, and blown here and there by 

every wind of teaching and by the cunning and 

craftiness of people in their deceitful scheming.”

—Ephesians 4:14 NIV



project has been “a long 

time coming.”

“This is exciting for 

me. I  don’t know about 

anybody else, but this is 

exciting,” Fultz said as 

Gilliam started opening 

bids.

The base bids from 

Goggan’s Construction, 

Wade Smith Inc., Alliance 

Corporation and Jones 

Contracting ranged from 

$314,000 to $447,000, 

with Goggan’s submit ting 

the lowest base bid. 

Gilliam said he will 

evaluate all bids and 

make a recommendation 

to the commission at a 

later date. 

gym renovation to begin 

soon after the winning 

bidder is approved, and 

the work is expected to 

last around six months. 

I t ’s among almost $1 

million in work that ’s un-

derway in Wayland. Work 

is already underway on 

a $364,000 drain project 

and an Abandoned Mine 

Lands project totaling 

more than $100,000 that 

would divert water run-

off from an old mine in 

the city. The gym project 

budget tops $470,000.  

The city has been 

planning this project 

since about 2011, and it ’s 

one of several projects 

planned to improve the 

quality of life in Wayland. 

The building was previ-

ously stabilized with coal 

severance funding in the 

initial phase of work, and 

after this six-month reno-

vation phase is complete, 

additional phases call for 

an addition to be built 

and improvements to be 

made to the exterior of 

the building.  

-

er, the gym can be func-

tional after this phase is 

complete. I t is rented for 

activities currently, but 

the building needs a new 

roof, heating and cooling 

and lighting.   

“I t will be a function-

ing community center/

wellness center and mu-

seum,” said Rusty Jus-

tice, the project manager 

from Jigsaw Enterprises 

and Bit Source. He said 

plans call for the gym to 

“We’ve worked very 

this thing pays it way so it 

won’t be a burden to the 

city,” he said. “So many 

things, they become a 

burden, but this thing 

will have a low operating 

overhead, and will have 

enough revenue coming 

in to be functional.” 

He said when the 

-

plete, it will include a 

walking track, the Moun-

tain Sports Hall of Fame 

Museum and other ame-

nities.

“Wayland’s the lit-

tle town that could, I ’m 

telling you,” Justice said, 

talking about a Smithso-

nian exhibit held at the 

Mountain Sports Hall 

of Fame. “I  always say 

if you can bring people 

here, where you see peo-

ple doing the right things, 

the right way, for the 

right reasons, this is the 

true meaning of grass-

roots here.”

He said coming to 

Wayland makes him 

“hopeful” about the fu-

ture of former coal min-

ing camps in Eastern 

Kentucky.

“These coal camps 

are assets, not liabilities, 

and they just need to 

be thought about differ-

ently,” Justice said. “And 

Wayland, if we can help 

Wayland succeed, then 

Van Lear and Jenkins and 

Stone, and all of these 

people will have a road-

map to follow ... I t ’s more 

than Wayland. I t ’s the 

roadmap that says, this is 

how you go about it.”

Gilliam said the bid 

evaluations should be 

once a recommendation 

is made, a notice to pro-

ceed will be issued. Work 

can then begin within 10 

days after that. 

In other news, the 

commission also: 

-

cial report, showing the 

city has $41,600 in its 

road fund and $59,400 in 

its general fund and that 

around $2,000 in bills 

were paid. I t also provid-

ed an update on proper-

ty tax collections ($200), 

insurance premium tax 

collections ($4,500) and 

franchise tax collections 

($500) and highlighted a 

year-to-date budget com-

parison, showing that the 

city has spent about 58 

percent of the funds bud-

geted in administration, 

35 percent budgeted for 

public safety, 57 per-

cent budgeted for public 

works, 61 percent bud-

geted for other expens-

es, 49 percent budgeted 

for payroll and 52 per-

cent budgeted for utilities 

to re-hire city clerk Sha-

ron Anderson, who re-

signed last month.

-

ly to create a part-time 

clerical position at mini-

weekly and hired Kaylee 

-

tion.

Recreation report from 

Commissioner Michael 

Caudill, who said the 

city’s donation helped 

-

chase fruit which it gave 

away at Christmas. 

report from Chief Bri-

an Ratliff, who said the 

department will be con-

checkpoints in January at 

the junctions of Ky. 7 and 

Ky. 1086, Ky. 1086 at the 

Wayland Fire Department 

and Ky. 7 at the Martin 

Branch intersection.

Advertisement for Floyd County Schools

Local Planning Committee 

Meeting and Public Forum
The Floyd County Schools’ Local Planning Committee will con-

duct a meeting on January 22, 2019, at 6 p.m., at Adams Middle 

School, Prestonsburg KY, 41653.

This meeting is an orientation meeting for the committee and is one 

of a series of meetings to develop a District Facilities Plan for the 

Floyd County Schools.

There will be a Public Forum conducted at 7:00 p.m. This forum is 

to encourage local participation in determining how existing school 

facilities are used as well as the construction of new school facili-

ties. Suggestions will be used as input to the Local Planning Com-

mittee as a new district facilities plan (DFP) is developed. Hope to 

see you there. 

   The Family Hope Project provides evidence-based
    behavioral health treatment and wraparound community
     support for children, youth, and their families who have
      witnessed or experienced domestic violence.

     A team of Child & Family Therapists and Peer/Community
    Support Associates will work to develop a plan for the entire
   family to meet their needs and off er recovery and hope.
   

Approximately 15 million children
  are exposed to domestic violence each year.

    When violence occurs in a family,
      there is help - and HOPE.

To learn more about the Family Hope Project,
contact Mountain Comprehensive Care Center at any

of the following locations:

Prestonsburg Clinic
(606) 886-4350

104 S Front Ave
Prestonsburg, KY

Martin City Clinic
(606) 285-3142

112065 Main Street
Martin, KY

Belfry Clinic
(606) 353-1287

26229 US 119 N
Belfry, KY

Pikeville Clinic
(606) 432-3143

18 River Road
Pikeville, KY

Paintsville Clinic
(606) 789-3518

1110 South Mayo Trail
Paintsville, KY

Salyersville Clinic
(606) 349-3115

1410 Royalton Road
Salyersville, KY

Inez Clinic
(606) 298-7902

Rt. 3 Rockcastle Rd.
Inez, KY

www.mtcomp.org

24 Hour Helpline
1-800-422-1060

This training/publication is supported by grant number 90EV0448-01-00 from the Administration for Children, Youth, and Fami-
lies, Family and Youth Services Bureau, U.S Department of Health and Human Services. Points of view in this document are those 
of the authors and do not necessarily re� ect that position or policies of the U.S Department of Health and Human Services.

schools, school safety 

and others,” a statement 

He was part of the 

bi-partisan 2018 School 

Safety Working Group, 

-

-

tonsburg in December. 

That group’s chairman, 

school safety bill as the 

senate’s highest prior-

ity bill, Senate Bill 1, on 

Wednesday, and Turner 

said Thursday that Wise 

expects the House to set 

this bill as its priority bill 

this session. 

“That just shows that 

it ’s the most important 

issue that we’re talking 

about this session,” Turn-

er said. 

He said he is honored 

to be part of the working 

group. 

“The chairman was 

really good about not do-

ing a knee-jerk reaction 

when we have the inci-

dent down in West Ken-

tucky last year,” Turner 

said about the Marshall 

County school shooting. 

“I t ’s easy sometimes to 

do a knee-jerk reaction 

but the commit tee and 

the chairman, along with 

the co-chair, chose to 

go around the state and 

get all the stakeholders 

involved, and get input 

from everybody, law en-

forcement people, school 

come up with an idea 

about what we need to 

do.” 

The 30-page bill de-

tailing the School Safe-

ty and Resiliency Act 

proposes several school 

safety measures, includ-

ing the implementation 

of a school security mar-

shal who will report to 

the Department of Crim-

inal Justice Training and 

the Kentucky Center for 

School Safety. The bill 

proposals penalties and 

sanctions for schools that 

fail to correct safety de-

corrections and it would 

require, among other 

things, that the Kentucky 

Department of Education 

help school districts de-

velop a “ trauma-informed 

approach” to education.

“One thing about the 

bill is that it does not in-

clude any measures that 

deals with guns,” Turner 

said. “There’s nothing 

in the bill that says that 

teachers have to use 

guns or have to handle 

guns. I t doesn’t mention 

guns, training or anything 

like that.”

Turner said the bill 

can be broken down 

into four sections, call-

ing for improvements in 

personnel, systems and 

structures, a “culture of 

student connection” and 

accountability.

“I  think the most 

important thing about 

the bill is that we’re go-

ing to try to seek more 

and more mental health 

professional to put them 

in schools and it does 

establish some training 

that ’s required for them,” 

Turner said. “School dis-

tricts will be required to 

appoint a school safety 

coordinator and they will 

have to receive training 

and then they will pro-

vide school safety train-

ing, and that will include 

active shooter situations. 

One other thing is that 

it revises the school sui-

cide training law to re-

quire public and middle 

school administrators to 

show suicide prevention 

awareness information or 

give out suicide aware-

ness information by video 

or live presentation.”

He said the commit-

tee’s goal was to have 

at least one mental 

health professional for 

every 1,500 students in 

schools.

“I  think it ’s a good 

start, and, like I  said, the 

chairman has been really 

good about not rushing 

anything,” he said. “He 

and he’s let ting it sit out 

there. We leave Friday 

and won’t be back until 

Feb. 2. So, he’s let ting all 

the groups, anybody that 

wants to have some input 

between now and then to 

give us that input so we 

may tweak it. What we’ve 

done, it may need some 

tweaking, so he’s allow-

ing it to sit there so peo-

ple to look at it and give 

any constructive criticism 

or anything that might 

help the bill.”

Legislators have 

note to show how expen-

sive this bill would be. 

Turner said legislators are 

“putting mechanisms into 

to place” so that funds 

can be allot during next 

year’s budget session in 

the Kentucky General As-

sembly.

Both Turner and La-

ferty have also pledged 

to support Kentucky 

teachers in matters re-

lated to state pensions 

during this session. 

legislator, Laferty report-

ed that she was selected 

to serve on commit tees 

for transportation, eco-

nomic development and 

tourism.

Among her priori-

-

ing a way to move the 

completion of the Min-

nie-to-Harold connector 

project up on the state’s 

priority list. She said the 

project, which has stalled 

for years under Gov. Matt 

Bevin’s administration, 

poses a safety risk for 

the public. 

She said the Min-

nie-to-Harold connector 

is a “shovel ready road 

that is within three miles 

of completion” and leav-

safety issues.

SESSION
Continued From Page 1A

WAYLAND
Continued From Page 1A

Current and former Wayland residents walk into the old high school gym for a luncheon during the Wayland 
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PIKEVILLE — An 

agreement that will pro-

-

-

(PharmD) degree at ACP 

-

-

the Memorandum of 

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

open their own pharma-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

the region with appropri-

-

-

-

-

-

-

program in the Com-

Founded in 2003, the 

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

Appalachian College of Pharmacy and 
UPike sign memorandum of agreement

Appalachian Newspapers photo by Chase Ellis

From left, UPike President Dr. Burton Webb, UPike Provost Dr. Lori Werth, Ph.D., Coleman College of Business Dean Dr. Howard Roberts, 

to pursue a MBA through the collaboration with UPike.
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CHRONICLE AND TIMES

Floyd County 

Schools Superintendent 

Danny Adkins released 

the county’s elementa-

ry academic teams this 

week.

The Jan. 9 press 

academic teams at May 

-

schools who also earned 

honors.

Adkins said in the 

-

tions May Valley Elemen-

-

-

runner up overall and in 

-

-

tive the season was.”

and our individual stu-

dents who placed in the 

Governor’s Cup competi-

and hope everyone will 

support our academic 

teams.” 

In the Governor’s 

-

mentary students will 

-

-

call will take place Feb. 

9. 

May Valley will host 

-

mentary on those days 

South Floyd will host 

Betsy Layne and John 

M. Stumbo in District 

132.

May Valley 

Elementary 

academic 

team mem-

bers earned 

overall this 

season and 

quick recall.

Submitted 

Floyd students earn 
academic honors

Elementary 

academic 

team mem-

bers earned 

overall and in 

quick recall. 

Math

Allen
2nd place: Drake 

3rd place: Miles 

Science
1st place: Ally Hamil-

2nd place: Noah 

3rd place: Miles 

4th place: Kaylee 

5th place: Isaac 

Social studies
1st place: Braxton 

2nd place: Kaden 

Allen
4th place: Isabella 

5th place: Bryson 

Science
1st place: Allie Ham-

2nd place: Ally Ham-

South Floyd

5th place: Kylie Con-

Arts & Humanities

2nd place: Amelia 

3rd place: Braxton 

4th place: Adrianna 

5th place: Allie Ham-

English Composition

2nd  place: Ava 

-

4th place: Queenie 

And the winners are

A FLOYD CHRONICLE-TIMES

STAFF REPORT

 

sponsor Gearheart Com-

munications will conduct 

home school and private 

Gearheart Auditorium on 

Auditions are open to 

any student who is home 

schooled or at tends a pri-

Two students will be 

selected to compete in 

-

petition to be held in 

March at the Mountain 

Arts Center. 

-

-

kctcs.edu

 Big Sandy I dol 
auditions open 

for home,
private school 

students

SPECIAL TO THE FLOYD 

CHRONICLE AND TIMES 

-

-

awarded membership to 

the Technical Commit tee 

-

Sciences and Renewable 

-

best practices in research 

and development in the 

sciences and renewable 

present research about 

-

ic ecosystems as an alter-

-

-

-

tors and others who seek 

-

BSCTC official to 
present research  

in I ndonesia

SPECIAL TO THE FLOYD 

CHRONICLE AND TIMES 

Term Ombudsman Pro-

-

budsman volunteers. 

An ombudsman is an 

care homes. 

-

and help resolve com-

-

dents. 

Local residents who 

would like to be involved 

-

Volunteers sought

A FLOYD CHRONICLE 

AND TIMES STAFF REPORT

The Eastern Kentucky 

Concentrated Employ-

and One East Kentucky 

-

cility” in Perry County.

$25 per hour.

-

-

tucky and Kentucky Ca-

-

workers within the local 

-

-

tions” the company could 

-

-

-

-

residents to participate. 

-

Local workforce study underway
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Balanced Blackcats handle Jenkins, 90-63

Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Steve LeMaster

Blake Slone plays defense for host Prestonsburg on Wednesday night as the Blackcats entertained Jenkins. 

BY STEVE LEMASTER

SPORTS WRITER

PRESTONSBURG — 

In a balanced effort, 

Prestonsburg received 

scoring from 13 differ-

ent players on its way to 

beating 15th Region rival 

Jenkins 90-63 in a boys' 

high school basketball 

game at the Fieldhouse 

on Wednesday night.

With the win, Pres-

tonsburg improved to 8-7.

Jenkins dropped to 

1-12 with the loss 

Excelling offensively, 

Prestonsburg shot 60.3 

percent (35-of-58) from 

the fi eld. The Blackcats 

See BALANCED, Page 2B

Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Steve LeMaster

Blackcat Clayton Smith looks to deliver a pass during the second quarter of Prestonsburg's home game against Jenkins earlier in the 

week.

Lady Blackcats top East Ridge, 87-72
BY STEVE LEMASTER

SPORTS WRITER

LICK CREEK — Pres-

tonsburg returned to the 

win column away from 

its home earlier in the 

week, upending host 

East Ridge 87-72 in a 

girls' high school bas-

ketball game on Monday 

night.

With the win, Pres-

tonsburg improved to 

9-6.

East Ridge slipped to 

3-12 with the loss. 

Prestonsburg shot 

57.7 percent (30 of 52) 

from the fi eld. The Lady 

Blackcats were eight of 

12 (66.7 percent) from 

three-point range. 

Prestonsburg shot 50 
Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Steve LeMaster

Freshman forward Faith Lazar contributes to Prestonsburg's win over Magoffi  n County last Friday night at Prestonsburg. See BLACKCATS, Page 2B
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percent (19 of 38) from 

the free-throw line. 

Kaitlyn Keathley 

poured in a game-high 

31 points to lead Pres-

tonsburg to the win. 

Joining Keathley in dou-

ble fi gures and regis-

tering a double-double, 

Caroline Aiaz added 23 

points and a game-high 

10 rebounds for the 

Lady Blackcats. 

Reesce Endicott 

accompanied Keathley 

and Ariaz in double fi g-

ures for Prestonsburg, 

scoring 11 points. 

Both Alison Camp-

bell and Alivia Slone 

nearly reached double 

digits, fi nishing with 

nine points and eight 

points respectively.

Faith Lazar (four 

points) and Annabelle 

Trusty (one point) ac-

counted for the rest of 

the Lady Blackcats' in-

dividual scoring in the 

victory. 

East Ridge shot 

45.3 percent (24 of 53) 

from the fi eld. The Lady 

Warriors were only two 

of 12 from three-point 

range. 

East Ridge shot 61.1 

percent (22 of 36) from 

the free-throw line. 

Owning an advan-

tage inside, East Ridge 

outrebounded Pres-

tonsburg 37-31. 

A balanced East 

Ridge scoring effort 

featured fi ve players 

in double fi gures. Ha-

ley Parks led the Lady 

Warriors with a team-

high 14 points. Sarah 

Tackett and Haylee Me-

ade followed, adding 

13 points apiece for the 

Lady Warriors. 

Also reaching dou-

ble fi gures for East 

Ridge, Kelsi Slone and 

Leah Wells posted 10 

points apiece. 

Kyra Looney and 

Sylvia Ratliff rounded 

out the East Ridge indi-

vidual scoring, chipping 

in seven points and fi ve 

points, respectively. 

Looney led East 

Ridge inside, pulling 

down eight rebounds. 

Prestonsburg is 

slated to face 58th Dis-

trict rival Betsy Layne 

in the opening round 

of the 15th Region All 

"A" Classic at the East 

Kentucky Expo Center 

in downtown Pikeville 

at 6:00 p.m. on Friday. 

BLACKCATS
Continued From Page 1B

BALANCED
Continued From Page 1B

were fi ve of 13 (38.5 per-

cent) from three-point 

range. 

Prestonsburg shot 72 

percent (15 of 20) from 

the free-throw line.

Adam Slone, a junior 

guard, led Prestonsburg 

with 20 points. The accu-

rate-shooting Slone shot 

88.9 percent (eight of 

nine) from inside of the 

arc. 

Four Prestonsburg 

players reached double 

fi gures in the scoring col-

umn as Blake Slone add-

ed 15 points, Grant Jus-

tice net ted 13 points and 

Graham Burchett fl ipped 

in 10 points. 

Finishing one fi eld 

goal short of reaching 

double fi gures, Josh Hall 

tossed in eight points for 

the Blackcats. 

Clayton Smith (sev-

en points), Jacob Martin 

(fi ve points), Kaleb Jarvis 

(two points), Isaiah Col-

lins (two points), Nathan 

Collins (two points), Will 

Gullet t (two points), Kane 

Scarberry (two points) 

and Garrison Yates (two 

points) provided the rest 

of the Blackcats' scoring 

in the convincing victory. 

Prestonsburg is 

scheduled to visit 16th 

Region title contender 

Morgan County on Mon-

day. Tip off for the Pres-

tonsburg-Morgan County 

boys' basketball game is 

set for 7:30 p.m. in West 

Liberty.  
Floyd Chronicle and Times photo by Steve LeMaster

Prestonsburg’s Grant Justice pulls down a rebound as the Blackcats hosted Jenkins on Wednesday night.



Floyd County Chronicle & Times • Friday, January 11,, 2018 • Page 3B

A few New Year’s 
Cup resolutions

We are already a week 
into the New Year and I 
would like to let you in on a 
few on my resolutions that 
I have made for not only 
myself but also a few that 
I have for the Monster En-
ergy NASCAR Cup Series.  
Now we all know that it is 
easier to make resolutions 
that to keep them so with 
that theme in mind, let’s get 
started.

I’m going to get the 
obvious out of the way fi rst 
because my ever popular 
“eating smarter in 2019” 
resolution has not started 
off like I envisioned but I 
will say that after a week 
my resolution of exercising 
is still intact.  Those are my 
two resolutions for the year 
and if I can bat 500, 2019 is 
going to be a heck of a year.

Now to my racing res-
olutions and this fi rst one 
is going to be tough as it 
deals with our family trip 
to Daytona’s Speedweeks.  
I have convinced my wife 
that this is the “big” win-
ter break that everybody 
dreams about but she keeps 
saying that she heard there 
was a beach there and that 
people enjoyed seeing the 
ocean in the middle of win-
ter.  Up to this point I have 
her convinced that you can’t 
spend enough time around 
the track and that whatever 
night they drop a green fl ag 
that it is mandatory that you 
be there.  She never used to 
complain as long as Rusty 
Wallace was on the starting 
grid but since he is retired, 
I feel like I am going to have 
to drive by the ocean one 
year so she can send home 
a picture of the beach.

This next resolution 
is another tough one as I 
love talking racing to any 
fan I come across and this 
doesn’t mean just in person 
as social media has really 
given us the opportunity to 
expand our racing fan base. 
I resolve to never again 
argue the merits of the 

system that is now used to 
determine the series cham-
pion. I still come across fans 
that have the mindset that 
the old point system was 
better and that it crowned 
the true champion.  I don’t 
have any problem with the 
old point system as I have a 
lot of “old school” in me and 
I respect all the champions 
that were crowned but the 
system that is in place now 
continues to build drama 
from February to Novem-
ber.  That just wasn’t always 
the case back in the day.  
It also gives a driver that 
you might not think has a 
chance to win the champi-
onship the opportunity to 
fi nish on top.  Just ask Joey 
Logano how he feels about 
this system.

I also resolve to sit back 
and really enjoy all that the 
veteran drivers bring to the 
sport this season.  I am as 
guilty as any fan of not ap-
preciating how much the 
elder statesmen of the sport 
bring to each race on the 
schedule. The retirements 
of drivers like Jeff Gordon, 
Tony Stewart and Dale 
Earnhardt Jr. have us miss-
ing them not only for their 
driving but also for their 
personalities. I’m all for 
the young drivers coming 
up and would be the fi rst to 
admit that their success is 
so vital to the health of the 
sport but with experience 
comes wisdom and that 
shows up on race day.

This resolution hurts 
more than any of them as 
I resolve to never go to a 
race this season and lament 
over the way the atmo-
sphere around the track has 
changed.  I always loved the 
midway activity outside of 
the track as there was so 
much to do and unfortu-
nately for the family bud-
get, there was also so much 
to buy.  I know those days 
are gone and now it is up 
to NASCAR to make sure 
the fans get the experience 
they want with the racing 
at each stop on the sched-
ule.  If that means tweaking 
the rules and I sure hope it 
also means an overhaul of 
the schedule down the road 
then make the changes. It’s 
time that the sanctioning 
body listens to the fans and 
also the drivers to create a 
rule book with a schedule 
that keeps everyone en-
gaged from the fi rst green 
fl ag at Daytona to the last 
checkered fl ag at Miami. 

Steve Mickey
Racin’

Betsy Layne beats Buckhorn to end skid 
BY STEVE LEMASTER

SPORTS WRITER 

BUCKHORN - Return-
ing to the win column on 
the road, Betsy Layne 
beat host Buckhorn 50-
44 in a girls' high school 
basketball game on Mon-
day night. 

The victory allowed 
Betsy Layne to halt a 
nine-game losing skid. 

With the win, Betsy 
Layne improved to 3-12. 

Buckhorn stumbled 
to 5-9 with the loss.

Betsy Layne shot 37.2 

percent (16 of 43) from 
the fi eld. The Lady Bob-
cats shot 59.3 percent 
(16 of 27) from the free-
throw line.

Sophomore Katie 
Kidd led Betsy Layne to 
the win, scoring 14 points 
and grabbing eight re-
bounds. Kidd was 4-of-5 
from the free-throw line 
in the Lady Bobcats' vic-
tory.

Freshman Madilyn 
Meade accompanied 
Kidd in double fi gures for 
Betsy Layne, scoring 13 
points. 

Lauryn Watkins nar-
rowly missed logging a 
double-double for the 
visiting Lady Bobcats, tal-
lying nine points and pull-
ing down eight rebounds. 

The other scorers for 
Betsy Layne in the win-
ning effort were Alexan-
dria Jarvis (six points), 
Kimberly Akers (four 
points), Kenadie Boyette 
(two points) and Amelia 
Blackburn (two points). 

Betsy Layne claimed 
its fi rst win since beating 
Oneida Baptist Institute 
60-37 on December 8. 

The Lady Bobcats' recent 
skid included losses to 
Phelps, Lawrence Coun-
ty, Floyd Central, Garrard 
County, East Jessamine, 
Madison Central, John-
son Central and Belfry. 

Betsy Layne is sched-
uled to face 58th Dis-
trict counterpart Pres-
tonsburg in the opening 
round of the 15th Region 
All "A" Classic at the East 
Kentucky Expo Center 
in downtown Pikeville at 
6:00 p.m. on Friday. 
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Use your imagination and creative skills to
help you move forward. Listen to your intu-
ition, not to what someone tells you. Distance
yourself from indulgent people or takers.
Focus on personal gains and improved health.
Be responsible and do your own thing.
Concentrate on a special relationship and
romance.

CAPRICORN (Dec. 22-Jan. 19) --
Determination and discipline will be required.
Say no to anyone trying to manipulate or
coerce you into doing things that aren't in your
best interest. Surround yourself with responsi-
ble people. 

AQUARIUS (Jan. 20-Feb. 19) -- Follow
through with a lead someone gives you. A
chance to make a professional change will
spark your interest. Discuss your intentions
with a loved one. Sharing will lead to romance. 

PISCES (Feb. 20-March 20) -- Don't let
confusion set in and override your common
sense when it comes to personal matters.
Someone will not be who he or she appears to
be. 

ARIES (March 21-April 19) -- Before you
take a giant leap, consider all the angles. You
are best off taking a moment to rethink your
options. A romantic evening will help you clear
your head. 

TAURUS (April 20-May 20) -- A sugges-
tion will intrigue you. See where following it
leads you, and be open to change and willing
to roll with the punches. An improvement
could result.

GEMINI (May 21-June 20) -- Don't let
anyone interfere with your plans. Look at an
opportunity and figure out how to best reach
your goal. Observing someone's response will
help you make a decision. 

CANCER (June 21-July 22) -- You'll be
drawn to someone or something unusual.
Study all the possibilities and consider how
best to fit into something you want to be a part
of. A partnership looks inviting. 

LEO (July 23-Aug. 22) -- Focus on activi-
ties that require strength, agility and determi-
nation. Participation will lead to a new friend-
ship with someone who will alter your life.
Romance is in the stars.

VIRGO (Aug. 23-Sept. 22) -- Get involved
in something that makes you feel good. Lend a
helping hand, organize an event that includes
loved ones or make a point to learn something
new. 

LIBRA (Sept. 23-Oct. 23) -- Don't let
someone's criticism get you down. Look at
your attributes and build on what you know
you do well and what you enjoy doing. Live life
your way. 

SCORPIO (Oct. 24-Nov. 22) -- A gather-
ing with the people you know and love will
lead to interesting discussions that will clear
up some of the questions you have about your
lineage. A new beginning is within reach.

SAGITTARIUS (Nov. 23-Dec. 21) -- Don't
believe everything you hear. An emotional sit-
uation will escalate and cause a problem with a
loved one. Don't let someone from your past
disrupt your life.

+

ACROSS
1 Big coconut exporter
5 Dawns, in poetry
10 Baja Ms.
14 Advance, as money
15 Depth charge target (hyph.)
16 Ayla’s creator
17 Not theirs
18 — voce (softly)
19 Former Italian money
20 Basic nature of a thing
22 Vast
24 Aunt or bro.
25 JFK lander
26 More clever
30 Bullet size
34 Scared-looking
35 Hedge
37 That, to Juanita
38 Malamute’s load
39 Showing a lack of experience
40 Electrical measure
41 — capita
42 Handbag logo
43 Proofer’s mark
44 Furtiveness
46 Utility room
48 Ms. Novak
49 Diner sandwich

50 Loudness unit
54 Artist’s colors
58 Civil disorder
59 Taxpayer’s dread
61 Kind of control
62 — Major (constellation)
63 Juicy steak (hyph.)
64 Quechua speaker
65 Las Vegas transactions
66 Factions
67 Marquee sign

DOWN
1 Iceberg
2 Debtors’ notes
3 Broad-mouthed containers
4 Included new text
5 Biceps
6 Clarinet kin
7 Undergo decomposition
8 Defense org.
9 Fort
10 Deli buy
11 Decay
12 Hatcher or Garr
13 Obi-Wan player
21 Herr’s refusal
23 She, to Marie
26 Yellow jackets

27 Small land mass
28 Not here
29 Contact
30 Quibble
31 Five o’clock shadow
32 Organic compound
33 Tattered
36 Crooner — Damone
39 Kernels
40 Desired admission (2 wds.)
42 Smug
43 Weed out
45 Stiff-coated dogs
47 Diminishes
50 Defeat badly
51 Limerick locale
52 Price tag
53 Grease job
54 Ale serving
55 Adjust a piano
56 Baja fast food
57 Panache
60 MD, familiarly 

TODAY’S CROSSWORD PUZZLE

TODAY’S SUDOKU PUZZLE

HOW

TO

PLAY:

• Each column 

has to have 

numbers 1 to 9

• Each row has to 

have numbers 1 

to 9

• Each 3x3 Box 

has to have 

numbers 1 to 9

GRIZZWELLS

FRANK & ERNEST

THATABABY

BORN LOSER

BIG NATE

All answers are in today’s edition

ARLO & JANIS

DAILY

ASTROGRAPH
by Eugenia Last
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TO OUR READERS

PPPPUUUUBBBBLLLLIIIISSSSHHHHEEEERRRR’’’’SSSS
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE

All real estate ad-
vertising in this 
newspaper is sub-
ject to the Fair 
Housing Act 
which makes it il-
legal to advertise 
“any preference, 
limitation or dis-
c r i m i n a t i o n
b a s e d
on race, color, re-
ligion, sex, handi-
cap, familial sta-
tus or national 
origin, or an in-
tention to make 
any such prefer-
ence, limitation 
or discrimina-
tion.” Familial in-
cludes children 
under the age of 
18 living with pa-
rents or legal cus-
todians, pregnant 
women and peo-
ple securing cus-
tody of children 
under 18.
This newspaper 
will not knowing-
ly accept any ad-
vertising for real 
estate which is in 
violation of the 
law. Our readers 
are hereby in-
formed that all 
dwellings adver-
tised in this 
newspaper are 
available on an 
equal opportunity 
basis. To com-
plain of discrimi-
nation, call HUD 

toll-free at 1-800-
669-9777. The 
toll-free number 
for the hearing 
impaired is 1-
800-927-9275.

PPPPOOOOLLLLIIIICCCCIIIIEEEESSSS
The Floyd County 
Chronicle and 
Times reserves 
the right to edit, 
properly classify, 
cancel or decline 
any ad. We will 
not knowingly ac-
cept advertising 
that discrimi-
nates on the basis 
of sex, age, reli-
gion, race,
n a t i o n -
al origin or physi-
cal disability.

PPPPLLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE    
CCCCHHHHEEEECCCCKKKK

YYYYOOOOUUUURRRR AAAADDDD
Please read your 
ad the first day it 
appears in the 
Floyd County 
Chronicle and 
Times. Report 
any errors imme-
diately and we 
will gladly correct 
any errors pub-
lished. Credit will 
be issued for one 
(1) day only. Af-
ter the first day 
the ad can be cor-
rected for the re-
maining number 
of runs, but credit 
will not be issued 
for days ad ran 
incorrectly.

PPPPEEEERRRRSSSSOOOONNNNAAAALLLL
AAAADDDD    PPPPOOOOLLLLIIIICCCCYYYY

Ads will be print-
ed at publisher’s 
discretion. 
Publisher not re-
sponsible for re-
sults, parties re-
sponding to or 
placing ads.

FOR SALE

NNNNEEEEEEEEDDDD    EEEEXXXXTTTTRRRRAAAA
CCCCAAAASSSSHHHH???? Run a 
Classified Ad. 
They Work!
Call (800)539-
4054 Today!

APARTMENTS-
UNFURNISHED

TTTTHHHHRRRREEEEEEEE    BBBBEEEEDDDD----
RRRROOOOOOOOMMMMSSSS,,,,    AAAAPPPP----
PPPPRRRROOOOXXXXIIIIMMMMAAAATTTTEEEELLLLYYYY
5 minutes from 
HRMC. Laundry 
room, porch. 
$575mo. 606-793-
2762.

2222    BBBBRRRR    AAAAPPPPAAAARRRRTTTT----
MMMMEEEENNNNTTTT five mi-
nutes from 
H R M C .
$460/month. 606-
793-2762.

2222BBBBRRRR    DDDDUUUUPPPPLLLLEEEEXXXX,,,,    
CCCC EEEE NNNN TTTT RRRR AAAA LLLL
heat/air, total 
electric. Close to 
P r e s t o n s b u r g .  
Call 606-886-9007 
or 606-889-9747.

HOUSES FOR RENT

HHHHOOOOUUUUSSSSEEEE    FFFFOOOORRRR    
RRRREEEENNNNTTTT
2BR, 1BA, Cen-
tral heat/air. 
Close to MAC. No 
HUD, deposit and 
references re-
quired. Serious
i n -
quiries only. Call 
886-2163

3333BBBBRRRR,,,,    1111BBBBAAAA
HHHHOOOOUUUUSSSSEEEE ffffoooorrrr    rrrreeeennnntttt....
Carport, large 
yard. Located be-
tween Prestons-
burg and Paints-
ville. Call 606-
886-9007 or 606-
889-9747.

MOBILE HOMES FOR

RENT

MMMMOOOOBBBBIIIILLLLEEEE    HHHHOOOOMMMMEEEE    
FFFFOOOORRRR rent. 16x72, 
2BD, 2BA, 4-1/2 
miles from MAC 
Arts, Rt. 114. 
Large private lot. 
Call 886-2896.

TTTTWWWWOOOO    MMMMOOOOBBBBIIIILLLLEEEE    
HHHHOOOOMMMMEEEESSSS for rent. 
HUD approved. 
Call (606)285-
9641

OFFICE SPACE

FOR RENT

FFFFOOOORRRR    LLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE
RRRREEEETTTTAAAAIIIILLLL or Of-
fice Space on 
North Lake Drive 
in Prestonsburg. 
Parking. Availa-
ble now. Call 859-
771-1139

HOUSES FOR SALE

HHHHOOOOUUUUSSSSEEEE    FFFFOOOORRRR    
SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE.... 3 Bed-
room, 2 bath, liv-
ing room, dining 
room, kitchen, 
family room, 2 car 
garage. Lots of 
storage. Call 606-
422-8217. Leave 
message if no an-
swer.

HOUSES FOR SALE

FFFFAAAARRRRMMMM    FFFFOOOORRRR    
SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE 70 acres 
more/less House, 
Shed and Trailer, 
739 Harper 
Branch Road, 
West Liberty KY. 
Call (606)743-
9669.

MOBILE HOMES FOR

SALE

MMMMOOOOBBBBIIIILLLLEEEE    HHHHOOOOMMMMEEEE    
FFFFOOOORRRR SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE. 2BR 
1BA. basement, 
large lot at Mar-
tin. Call 606-874-
2000.

EMPLOYMENT

OPPORTUNITY

HHHHEEEELLLLPPPP
WWWWAAAANNNNTTTTEEEEDDDD::::

Earn extra in-
come managing a 
campground with 
site rentals, horse 
barns, trails, etc. 
Special skills re-
quired in person-
nel, client, and 
property manage-
ment. Carpentry, 
electrical, mainte-
nance of equip-
ment and 
grounds. Reply 
with resume to: 
Resume, PO Box 
1711, Prestons-
burg, KY 41653.

LEGALS

PPPPUUUUBBBBLLLLIIIICCCC    
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE

Notice is hereby 
given that Greg 
Hopper of East 
Point has filed an 
application with 
the Natural Re-
sources and Envi-
ronmental Protec-
tion Cabinet, to 
replace an exist-
ing bridge with a 
new bridge, with-
in the floodplain 
of Little Paint 
Creek near the 
community of 
East Point, KY. 
The site is located 
on the south side 
of Route 1100 in 
Floyd County, 
Kentucky. More 
specifically at lati-
tude 37°42'58.87" 
N and longitude 
82°48'24.62" W. 
Any comments or 
objections con-
cerning this appli-
cation shall be di-
rected to: Ken-
tucky Division of 
Water, Water Re-
sources Branch, 
300 Sower Boule-
vard, Third Floor, 
Frankfort, KY 
40601.  Phone: 
(502) 564-3410

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    00009999----CCCCIIII----00000000999944447777
TAX EASE LIEN 
INVESTMENTS 

1, LLC
PLANTIFF

V.
U.S. BANK, 

LEGALS

NATIONAL
ASSOCIATION 
FKA FIRSTAR 

BANK, NA
DEFENDANT 

CROSS-
CLAIMANT  

V.
JEWELL
CRIDER, 

CENTRAL
FINANCIAL

SERVICES, INC., 
FLOYD 

COUNTY, 
CHASSITY

MEEKS, REMIT 
CORPORATION, 

TAX EASE
LIEN INVEST-
MENTS 1, LLC, 

UNKNOWN
SPOUSE, IF 

ANY, OF 
JEWELL
CRIDER         

DEFENDANTS
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Final 
Judgment and Or-
der of Sale en-
tered by the Floyd 
Circuit Court in 
the above styled 
action, and so as 
to raise the 
amounts as set 
forth therein, 
with a principal of 
$21,544.56, plus 
interest and other 
costs, please be 
advised that I, the 
Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, in 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 21 Crid-
er Drive, Pres-
tonsburg, KY 
41653
MAP NUMBER: 
001-00-00-013.01
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to 
Charles Crider 
and Jewell Crider, 
from Callie Salyer 
and Myrtle Saly-
er, husband and 
wife, by Deed dat-
ed 08/20/1994, 
Deed Book 380, 
page 69, Floyd 
County Clerk's 
Records.  Subse-
quently Charles 
Crider died on 
03/11/2009.
A D D I T I O N A L
INFORMATION:

LEGALS

The manufac-
tured home situ-
ated on the prop-
erty, which is a 
1992 Inda Bran-
dywine manufac-
tured home with 
V I N
AL14681926882 
shall be sold along 
with the real 
property to be 
sold herein.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 
7.74000% per an-
num from the 
date of sale until 
paid in full.  Said 
bond shall mature 
in thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 

LEGALS

pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
January, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11112222----CCCCIIII----333355557777

TAX EASE LIEN 
SERVICING,

LLC
PLANTIFF

V.
KENTUCKY TAX 

BILL
SERVICING, 

LEGALS

INC.
DEFENDANT/

CROSS-
CLAIMANT

V.
JEFFREY 
HOWLL, 
BRENDA
HOWELL,

ASSET ACCEPT-
ANCE, LLC, 
UNKNOWN

OCCUPANTS OF 
14811 KY RT 122, 

IF ANY,
FIRST GUARAN-
TY BANK AND 

COMMON-
WEALTH

OF KENTUCKY, 
COUNTY OF 

FLOYD
DEFENDANTS

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of $845.57, 
plus interest and 
other costs, please 
be advised that I, 
the Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, in 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 14811 
KY RT 122
MAP NUMBER: 
053-10-01-004.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Jef-
frey Howell and 
Brenda Howell by 
deed dated July 
25, 2006 and re-
corded in Deed 
Book 526, Page 
531 of the Floyd 
County Kentucky 
Records.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-

LEGALS

suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 12% 
per annum from 
the date of sale 
until paid in full. 
Said bond shall 
mature in thirty 
(30) days and 
shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-

LEGALS

erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
Janaury, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11116666----CCCCIIII----00000000444499993333

NATIONSTAR 
MORTGAGE

LLC 
d/b/a

CHAMPION 
MORTGAGE 

COMPANY
PLANTIFF

V.
LOLA FAYE 

MOSLEY, et al    
DEFENDANTS

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-



LEGALS

ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of 
$158,377.67, plus 
interest and other 
costs, please be 
advised that I, the 
Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, in 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 16 Size-
more Road, Min-
nie, KY 41651
MAP NUMBER: 
051-00-00-049.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Lola 
Faye Noble by 
deed dated Febru-
ary 10, 1969, re-
corded in Deed 
Book 198, Page 
443 of record in 
the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 12 % 
per annum from 
the date of sale 
until paid in full. 
Said bond shall 
mature in thirty 
(30) days and 
shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
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duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
Janaury, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr
111199999999    NNNNoooorrrrtttthhhh    LLLLaaaakkkkeeee    

DDDDrrrriiiivvvveeee
PPPPrrrreeeessssttttoooonnnnssssbbbbuuuurrrrgggg,,,,    

KKKKYYYY    44441111666655553333
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222333399991111
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222777777776666    

((((ffffaaaaxxxx))))

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIIIIIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11116666----CCCCIIII----00000000555599992222

U.S. BANK 
NATIONAL

ASSOCIATION
as Indenture 

Trustee for CIM 
Trust 2015-3AG

Mortgage-Backed 
Notes, Series 

2015-3AG        
PLANTIFF

V.
BILLY J. MAY, 

et al
DEFENDANTS

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the In Rem 
Judgment and Or-
der of Sale en-
tered by the Floyd 
Circuit Court in 
the above styled 
action, and so as 
to raise the 
amounts as set 
forth therein, 
with a principal of 
$40,266.84, plus 
interest and other 
costs, please be 
advised that I, the 
Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
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auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, In 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: Box 30 
Route 1428, Allen, 
KY 41601
MAP NUMBER: 
061-40-03-013.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Billy 
J. May, no mari-
tal status shown, 
by deed dated No-
vember 4, 1970, 
recorded in Deed 
Book 203, Page 
563, of record in 
the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 6.0 
% per annum 
from the date of 
sale until paid in 
full.  Said bond 
shall mature in 
thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
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record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
Janaury, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIIIIIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11116666----CCCCIIII----00000000777744445555
JPMorgan Chase 
Bank, National 

Association
Successor by 

merger to Bank 
One, N.A.

PLANTIFF
V.

Monnie Osborne 
aka Monnie Rie 

Beverly;
Bruce Osborne; 
Shoreline Tax 
Services, LLC     

DEFENDANTS
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of $79,110.38, 
plus interest and 
other costs, please 
be advised that I, 
the Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Janu-
ary, 2019, in the 
Floyd County Fis-
cal Courtroom 
(Old Circuit 
Courtroom) on the 
second floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 1363 Ky. 
Route 1100 East, 
East Point, KY 
41216

LEGALS

MAP NUMBER: 
032-00-00-033.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Mon-
nie Rie Beverley, 
a single person, 
by deed dated Oc-
tober 14, 1983, re-
corded in Deed 
Book 279, Page 
542, of record in 
the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 8.5 
% per annum 
from the date of 
sale until paid in 
full.  Said bond 
shall mature in 
thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
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tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
January, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase II bond 
release on ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
8888000088880000 which was 
last issued on Au-
gust 31, 2016. 
The application 
covers an area of 
approx imate l y  
12.00 acres locat-
ed at Hite in 
Floyd County.
The permit area is 
approx imate l y  
0.35 miles north-
east from KY 
Route 122's junc-
tion with CR-1220 
and located 0.04 
miles east from 
Left Fork Beaver 
Creek.
The bond now in 
effect for the per-
mit is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$21,600.  Approxi-
mately twenty-
five percent (25%) 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$21,600 is includ-
ed in the applica-
tion for release.
Reclamation work 
performed in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
July 2014.  Re-
sults thus far ach-
ieved are backfill-
ing, grading, reve-
getation of distur-
bed areas and es-
tablishment of the 
post-mining land 
use. 
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-
burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.
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NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase I bond 
release on Incre-
ments 3, 7 and 10 
of ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    nnnnuuuummmm----
bbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----0000444444445555
which was last is-
sued on June 22, 
2018.  Increment 
3 covers an area 
of approximately 
27.09 acres, Incre-
ment 7 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 24.47 
acres and Incre-
ment 10 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 18.75 
acres located 0.6 
miles south of 
Hite in Floyd 
County, Ken-
tucky.
The permit area is 
approximately 0.6 
miles northwest 
from the junction 
of KY Route 122 
and KY Route 
2030 and located 
in the vicinity of 
Osborn Branch.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 3 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$103,000.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$103,000 is in-
cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 7 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$115,600.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$115,600 is in-
cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 10 is a sure-
ty bond in the 
amount of 
$92,300.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$92,300 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 3 in-
cludes backfilling, 
grading and seed-
ing which was 
completed in 
Summer of 2017. 
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 7 in-
cludes backfilling, 
grading and seed-
ing which was 
completed in Fall 
2017.  Reclama-
tion work per-
formed for Incre-
ment 10 includes 
backfilling, grad-
ing and seeding 
which was com-
pleted in Fall of 
2013.  Results 
thus far achieved 
are backfilling, 
grading, and ini-
tial revegetation 
of disturbed 
areas.
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
March 4, 2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
March 5, 2019 at 
10:00 a.m. at the 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
En fo rcement ' s  
Prestonsburg Re-
gional Office, 
3140 South Lake 
Drive, Suite 6, 
P r e s t o n s b u r g ,  
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by March 
4, 2019.
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NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase II bond 
release on ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
5555666644448888 which was 
last issued on 
June 10, 2018. 
The application 
covers an area of 
approximately 4.3 
acres located at 
Tram in Floyd 
County, Ken-
tucky.
The permit area is 
approximately 0.8 
miles south from 
Powell Branch 
Road's junction 
with US 23 and 
located along Po-
well Branch. 
The bond now in 
effect for the per-
mit is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$30,000.   Approx-
imately twenty-
five percent (25%) 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$30,000 is includ-
ed in the applica-
tion for release.   
Reclamation work 
performed in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
August 2015.  Re-
sults thus far ach-
ieved are backfill-
ing, grading, reve-
getation of distur-
bed areas and es-
tablishment of the 
post-mining land 
use.
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-
burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11117777----CCCCIIII----00000000555500002222

FREEDOM 
MORTGAGE 

CORPORATION
PLANTIFF

V.
R.J. KIDD        

DEFENDANTS
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of $54,302.39, 
plus interest and 
other costs, please 
be advised that I, 
the Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Janu-
ary, 2019, in the 
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Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 6448 KY 
Route 2030, Hon-
aker, Kentucky 
41603
PROPERTY DE-
SCRIPTION:   Be-
ginning at a stake 
at Ima Sue Kidd 
Collins' line three 
feet from the 
blacktop road; 
thence up the 
road eighty-six 
feet to Joann In-
nis' line; thence 
across the bottom 
with Joann Innis' 
line to a stake at 
the creek; thence 
with the creek to 
a stake at a cor-
ner of Ima Sue 
Kidd Collins' line; 
thence across the 
bottom with Ima 
Sue Kidd Collins' 
line to a stake at 
the beginning.  An 
easement for wa-
ter rights or water 
line of any de-
scription and its 
maintenance is 
hereby conveyed 
with this proper-
ty.
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to R.J. 
Kidd, by Deed 
dated February 3, 
1987 and recorded 
February 3, 1987, 
of record in Deed 
Book 307, Page 
296, in the Office 
of the County 
Clerk of Floyd 
County, Ken-
tucky.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 
3.750% per an-
num from the 
date of sale until 
paid in full.  Said 
bond shall mature 
in thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
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LEGALS

successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
January, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr
111199999999    NNNNoooorrrrtttthhhh    LLLLaaaakkkkeeee    

DDDDrrrriiiivvvveeee
PPPPrrrreeeessssttttoooonnnnssssbbbbuuuurrrrgggg,,,,    

KKKKYYYY    44441111666655553333
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222333399991111
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222777777776666    

((((ffffaaaaxxxx))))

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIIIIIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11117777----CCCCIIII----00000000777733335555

U.S. BANK 
NATIONAL

ASSOCIATION, 
as Trustee

For the holders of 
the Specialty 

Underwriting and 
Residential 

Finance Trust 
Mortgage Loan 

Asset-
Backed 

Certificates, 
Series 2007-BC2

PLANTIFF
V.

SHEILA
TACKETT 

VANCE AKA
SHELIA ANNE

VANCE AKA
SHEILA

TACKETT AKA
SHELIA

TACKETT 
VANCE, et al      

DEFENDANTS
NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-

LEGALS

tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of $80,334.98, 
plus interest and 
other costs, please 
be advised that I, 
the Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, in 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 61 Shel-
ton Hollow Road, 
Martin, KY 
41649
MAP NUMBER: 
038-00-00-020.01
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Shei-
la Tackett Vance 
and Cola Vance, 
her husband, from 
Timothy Potter 
and Donna Potter, 
his wife dated 
January 3, 2007 
and recorded at 
Deed Book 531, 
Page 272 in the 
records of the 
Floyd County 
Clerk.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 9.99 
% per annum 
from the date of 
sale until paid in 
full.  Said bond 
shall mature in 
thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 

LEGALS

above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
Janaury, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY

FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    
CCCCIIIIRRRRCCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    
CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT

DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII
CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11118888----CCCCIIII----00000000111199999999

PENNYMAC 
LOAN 

SERVICES, LLC
PLANTIFF

V.
RONALD 

MEADE
DEFENDANTS

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of $70,898.57, 
plus interest and 
other costs, please 
be advised that I, 
the Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 
during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Janu-
ary, 2019, at the 
door of the old 
Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 

LEGALS

Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 47 Jack-
son St., Prestons-
burg, KY 41653
MAP NUMBER: 
045-20-07-018.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Ro-
nald Meade by 
deed dated Octo-
ber 22, 2008, re-
corded in Deed 
Book 551, Page 
697 of record in 
the Floyd County 
Clerk's Office.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 
6.625 % per an-
num from the 
date of sale until 
paid in full.  Said 
bond shall mature 
in thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 
record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 

LEGALS

encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
January, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase II bond 
release on ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
5555555566668888 which was 
last issued on 
May 24, 2018. 
The application 
covers an area of 
approx imate l y  
17.71 acres locat-
ed 2.5 miles 
northwest of Blue 
Moon in Floyd 
County.
The operation is 
approximately 0.4 
miles east from 
KY 2030's junc-
tion with Gun-
stock Branch 
Road and located 
on Gunstock 
Branch.
The bond now in 
effect for the per-
mit is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$38,400.   Approx-
imately twenty-
five percent (25%) 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$38,400 is includ-
ed in the applica-
tion for release.   
Reclamation work 
performed in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
spring 2015.  Re-
sults thus far ach-
ieved are backfill-
ing, grading, and 
initial revegeta-
tion of disturbed 
areas.
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-
burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.
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NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase I bond 
release on ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
5555666666664444 which was 
last issued on 
May 8, 2017.  The 
application covers 
an area of approx-
imately 5.91 acres 
located 1.31 miles 
east of Drift in 
Floyd County.
The operation is 
approx imate l y  
1.80 miles east of 
KY Route 122's 
junction with the 
Simpson Branch 
County Road and 
located 0.10 miles 
north of Simpson 
Branch.
The bond now in 
effect for the per-
mit is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
Reclamation work 
performed in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
April 2018.  Re-
sults thus far ach-
ieved are backfill-
ing, grading, and 
initial revegeta-
tion of disturbed 
areas.
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-
burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.

CCCCOOOOMMMMMMMMOOOONNNN----
WWWWEEEEAAAALLLLTTTTHHHH    OOOOFFFF    
KKKKEEEENNNNTTTTUUUUCCCCKKKKYYYY
FFFFLLLLOOOOYYYYDDDD    CCCCIIIIRRRR----
CCCCUUUUIIIITTTT    CCCCOOOOUUUURRRRTTTT
DDDDIIIIVVVVIIIISSSSIIIIOOOONNNN    IIII

CCCCIIIIVVVVIIIILLLL AAAACCCCTTTTIIIIOOOONNNN    
NNNNOOOO....    11118888----CCCCIIII----00000000222211116666

U.S. BANK 
NATIONAL

ASSOCIATION 
as Successors by 
merger of U.S. 
Bank National

Association, ND
PLANTIFF

V.
RICKY JUSTICE

LORETTA
JUSTICE, et al    
DEFENDANTS

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    SSSSAAAALLLLEEEE

So as to comply 
with the Judg-
ment and Order of 
Sale entered by 
the Floyd Circuit 
Court in the 
above styled ac-
tion, and so as to 
raise the amounts 
as set forth there-
in, with a princi-
pal of 
$212,203.49, plus 
interest and other 
costs, please be 
advised that I, the 
Floyd County 
Master Commis-
sioner, has been 
ordered by the 
Floyd Circuit 
Court to offer for 
sale to the highest 
and best bidder 

LEGALS

during a public 
auction to be held 
at the hour of 
10:00 a.m., on the 
17th day of Ja-
naury, 2019, in 
the Floyd Fiscal 
Courtroom (Old 
Circuit Court-
room) on the sec-
ond floor of the 
old Floyd County 
Courthouse, 149 
South Central 
Avenue, Prestons-
burg, Kentucky, 
(behind the Floyd 
County Justice 
Center), and sub-
ject to the follow-
ing terms and 
conditions, the 
property descri-
bed to wit:
PROPERTY AD-
DRESS: 3194 
Toler Creek, Har-
old, KY 41635
MAP NUMBER: 
108-20-01-006.00
SOURCE OF TI-
TLE: Being the 
same property 
conveyed to Ricky 
Justice by deed 
dated October 11, 
1984, recorded in 
Deed Book 316, 
Page 538 of record 
in the Floyd 
County Clerk's 
Office.
A.  The property 
address and map 
number contained 
herein are for con-
venience only.  All 
property will be 
transferred pur-
suant to the legal 
descriptions con-
tained within the 
Judgment refer-
enced above. 
B.   The successful 
bidder shall the 
bid amount, in 
full, by cash or 
certified check, on 
the date of the 
sale or shall pay a 
non-refundable 
deposit equal to 
10% of the pur-
chase price with 
the balance due in 
full within thirty 
(30) days.  If the 
bid is not suffi-
cient to pay the 
expenses of said 
sale, then along 
with the purchase 
price, the success-
ful bidder shall 
pay additional 
sums required to 
cover said costs. 
On the date of 
said sale, the suc-
cessful bidder, if 
only paying 10%, 
shall be required 
to execute a bond 
with good surety 
thereon.  The sur-
ety must own land 
in Kentucky and 
have equity in the 
land that is great-
er than the bid 
amount.  Said 
bond shall be for 
the unpaid pur-
chase price and 
shall bear interest 
at the rate of 
5.2400 % per an-
num from the 
date of sale until 
paid in full.  Said 
bond shall mature 
in thirty (30) days 
and shall have the 
force and effect of 
a Judgment. A
lien shall be re-
tained upon the 
above described 
real estate as ad-
ditional surety 
thereon.  In the 
event the pur-
chase price is not 
paid in full within 
thirty (30) days, 
then the property 
may be subject to 
immediate re-sell.  
In the event the 
Plaintiff is the 
successful bidder, 
said Plaintiff 
shall be entitled 
to a credit pur-
suant to the Judg-
ment referenced 
above and not be 
required to pro-
duce a bond.
C.  The purchaser 
shall be required 
to assume and 
pay the taxes or 
assessments upon 
the property for 
the current year 
and all subse-
quent years.  All 
delinquent taxes 
for prior years 
shall be paid from 
the sale proceeds 
along with the 
payment of other 
assessments prop-
erly claimed or 
filed within the 
above referenced 

LEGALS

record.  Any taxes 
or assessments for 
prior years which 
are validly owed 
and are not paid 
by the sale pro-
ceeds shall re-
main liens on the 
subject property 
and will be as-
sumed by the pur-
chaser. 
D.  The property 

described above is 
sold subject to any 
easements, re-
strictions, stipula-
tions, defects, or 
encumbrances of 
record affecting 
said property; any 
assessments for 
public improve-
ment; and any 
matters disclosed 
by an accurate 
survey or inspec-
tion of the proper-
ty.  The property 
is also sold subject 
to rights of re-
demption which 
may exist in favor 
of the United 
States of America, 
the Defendants 
and/or record 
owners of said 
property.  
E.     The property 
shall be sold “AS 
IS.”  The Court 
and the Master 
C o m m i s s i o n e r  
shall not be 
deemed to have 
warranted the ti-
tle of the subject 
property to the 
purchaser.  
F.     Any an-
n o u n c e m e n t s  
made on the date 
of sale shall take 
precedence over 
printed matter 
contained and as 
published within 
the Floyd County 
Chronical and 
Times.
This 7th day of 
January, 2019.

GGGGrrrreeeeggggoooorrrryyyy    AAAA....    
IIIIssssaaaaaaaacccc

FFFFllllooooyyyydddd    CCCCoooouuuunnnnttttyyyy    
MMMMaaaasssstttteeeerrrr    

CCCCoooommmmmmmmiiiissssssssiiiioooonnnneeeerrrr
111199999999    NNNNoooorrrrtttthhhh    LLLLaaaakkkkeeee    

DDDDrrrriiiivvvveeee
PPPPrrrreeeessssttttoooonnnnssssbbbbuuuurrrrgggg,,,,    

KKKKYYYY    44441111666655553333
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222333399991111
((((666600006666))))    888888886666----2222777777776666    

((((ffffaaaaxxxx))))

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase I bond 
release on Incre-
ments 2, 5, 12 and 
13 of ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
0000444444444444 which was 
last issued on De-
cember 14, 2017. 
Increment 2 cov-
ers an area of ap-
proximately 27.15 
acres, Increment 
5 covers an area 
of approximately 
31.53 acres, Incre-
ment 12 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 26.23 
acres and Incre-
ment 13 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 23.05 lo-
cated 0.76 miles 
south of Printer in 
Floyd County, KY.
The permit area is 
approx imate l y  
0.06 miles west 
from the junction 
of KY Rt. 122 and 
Akers Branch 
Road and located 
in the 0.85 miles 
northwest of 
Akers Branch.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 2 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$129,200.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$129,200 is in-
cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 5 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$128,300.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$128,300 is in-
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cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 12 is a sure-
ty bond in the 
amount of 
$107,600.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$107,600 is in-
cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 13 is a sure-
ty bond in the 
amount of 
$95,500.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$95,500 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 2 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring 2016.  Rec-
lamation work 
performed for In-
crements 5 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Winter 2017. 
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 12 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Fall 2017.  Recla-
mation work per-
formed for Incre-
ment 13 includes: 
backfilling, grad-
ing and seeding 
which was com-
pleted in Spring 
2017.  Results 
thus far achieved 
are backfilling, 
grading, and ini-
tial revegetation 
of disturbed 
areas.  
Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-
tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00  a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-
burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.

NNNNOOOOTTTTIIIICCCCEEEE    
OOOOFFFF    BBBBOOOONNNNDDDD
RRRREEEELLLLEEEEAAAASSSSEEEE

In accordance 
with KRS 
350.093, notice is 
hereby given that 
Spurlock Mining, 
LLC, 3228 Sum-
mit Square Place, 
Suite 180, Lexing-
ton, Kentucky 
40509 has applied 
for Phase I bond 
release on Incre-
ments 1, 4, 5, 6, 7, 
8 and 9 of ppppeeeerrrrmmmmiiiitttt    
nnnnuuuummmmbbbbeeeerrrr    888833336666----
0000444444447777 which was 
last issued on Ju-
ly 18, 2018.  In-
crement 1 covers 
an area of approx-
imately 21.75 
acres, Increment 
4 covers an area 
of approximately 
15.73 acres, Incre-
ment 5 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 16.23 
acres, Increment 
6 covers an area 
of approximately 
15.44 acres, Incre-
ment 7 covers an 
area of approxi-
mately 13.40 
acres, Increment 
8 covers an area 
of approximately 
7.49 acres and In-
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Adult

LOOKING FOR
LOVE or just a
friendly chat?
Connect with

Latino singles in
your area. 18-Plus

Call 1-866-686-
5936. Try it free.

MAKE ACON-
NECTION. Real

People, Flirty Chat.
Meet singles right

now! Call Livelinks.
Try it FREE. Call
now. 1-888-979-

2264

TIRED OF THE
same old dating
sites? Meet real

people in your area
and make a new

connection on your
terms! 18 plus only.
Call 1-855-850-1741

Announcements

ADVERTISE your
JOB OPENING,
EVENT, ITEMS

FOR SALE, AUC-
TION, etc. in this
newspaper plus 85
other newspapers

in KY for only $250.
Save time and

money by making
one call for all! For
more information,
contact the classi-
fied department of
this newspaper or
call KPS at 1-502-
223-8821, email:

sparry@kypress.co
m

Automotive

DONATE YOUR
CAR, TRUCK OR
BOAT TO HER-

ITAGE FOR THE
BLIND. Free 3

Day Vacation, Tax
Deductible, Free

Towing, All
Paperwork Taken
Care Of. CALL 1-

866-713-1593

GOT AN OLDER
CAR, VAN OR
SUV? Do the

humane thing.
Donate it to the
Humane Society.
Call 1-855-443-

0865

DONATE YOUR
CAR FOR

BREAST CAN-
CER! Help United

Breast Cancer
Foundation educa-
tion, prevention, &
support programs.
FAST FREE PICK-

UP - 24 HR
RESPONSE - TAX
DEDUCTION 1-

877-624-2030

Business Services

HughesNet
SATELLITE
Internet FOR
BUSINESS.

25mbps for just
$69.99/mo! Get

More Data  FREE
Off-Peak Data.

Built-in WiFi for
wireless devices.
FREE Standard

Installation. CALL
1-855-893-3174

Cable/Utilities

DIRECTV NOW.
No Satellite

Needed.
$40/month. 65

Channels. Stream
Breaking News,

Live Events, Sports
& On Demand

Titles. No Annual
Contract. No
Commitment.

CALL 1-844-448-
9318

DISH TV -
$59.99/month for

190 channels. $100
Gift Card with

Qualifying Service!
Free premium

channels
(Showtime, Starz,

& more) for 3
months. Voice

remote included.
Restrictions apply,
call for details. Call

1-855-303-4767

DISH TV $59.99
For 190 Channels
$14.95 High Speed

Internet. Free
Installation, Smart
HD DVR Included,
Free Voice Remote.
Some restrictions
apply. Call 1-855-

633-4574

DIRECTV &
AT&T. 155

Channels & 1000s
of Shows/Movies

On Demand
(w/SELECT

Package.) AT&T
Internet 99 Percent
Reliability.Unlimite

d Texts to 120
Countries w/AT&T

Wireless. Call 4
FREE Quote CALL

1- 866-292-5435.

Cellular

GET ASMART-
PHONE for $0
DOWN* with

AT&T Next® and
AT&T Next Every
Year® $250 Gift

Card for Switching
to AT&T! (*Reqs

well-qualified cred-
it. Limits & restrs
apply.) 1-866-478-

8859

Farm Equipment

GOT LAND? Our
Hunters will Pay
Top $$$ To hunt

your land. Call for
a FREE info pack-
et & Quote. 1-866-

309-1507.
www.BaseCampLe

asing.com

Farm - Livestock

SPRING CALV-
ING Bred Heifers.

Calving now
through April.

www.heifersales.co
m - David

Sandusky (270)
692-7793

Financial Services

REDUCE IRS TAX
Debt! Resolve Back

Taxes! Stop
Penalties &

Interest! Stop
Garnishments!
100% FREE

Consultation Call
Now 1-855-398-

3085

REVERSE MORT-
GAGE:

Homeowners age
62+ turn your home
equity into tax-free
cash! Speak with an

expert today and
receive a free book-
let. 1-800-495-8446

FINANCIAL BEN-
EFITS for those fac-
ing serious illness.
You may qualify for

a Living Benefit
Loan today (up to
50 percent of your

Life Insurance
Policy Death
Benefit.) Free

Information. CALL
1-855-701-9081

HAVE $10K IN
DEBT? Credit
Cards. Medical
Bills. Personal
Loans. Be Debt
Free in 24-48
Months. Call

NATIONAL DEBT
RELIEF! Know

Your Options. Get a
FREE debt relief
quote: Call 1-877-

934-0632

Grocery

ENJOY 100%
GUARANTEED,
delivered to-the-

door Omaha
Steaks! Makes a

great Holiday gift!
SAVE 75% PLUS

get 4 FREE
Burgers! Order The

Family Gourmet
Feast - ONLY

$49.99. Call 1-855-
995-4780 mention
code 55586FFH or

visit www.oma-
hasteaks.com/excel-

lent20

Health Services

START SAVING
BIG On

Medications! Up To
90% Savings from

90DAYMEDS! Over
3500 Medications

Available!
Prescriptions Req'd.
Pharmacy Checker
Approved. CALL
Today for Your

FREE Quote. 844-
274-9350

**STOP STRUG-
GLING ON THE
STAIRS** Give

your life a lift with
an ACORN STAIR-
LIFT! Call now for

$250 OFF your
stairlift purchase

and FREE DVD &
brochure! 1-855-

709-8829

CRAFTMATIC
ADJUSTABLE

BEDS for less! Up
to 50% Off Leading

Competitors. #1
Rated Adjustable
Bed. Trusted Over

40 Years. All
Mattress Types

Available. Shop by
Phone and SAVE!
CALL 1-855-890-

7656

VIAGRA and
CIALIS USERS!
Cut your drug

costs! SAVE $$! 50
Pills for $99.00.
FREE Shipping!

100% Guaranteed
and Discreet.

CALL 1-855-535-
2511

SLEEPAPNEA
PATIENTS - If you
have Medicare cov-
erage, call Verus

Healthcare to quali-
fy for CPAP sup-

plies for little or no
cost in minutes.
Home Delivery,
Healthy Sleep

Guide and More -
FREE! Our cus-

tomer care agents
await your call. 1-

877-349-8574

Help Wanted -
Truck Drivers

NEW STARTING
BASE PAY - .50
cpm w/ option to
make .60 cpm for

Class ACDL
Flatbed Drivers,

Excellent Benefits,
Home Weekends,
Call 800-648-9915
or www.boydand-

sons.com

Home Improvement

BATHROOM REN-
OVATIONS. EASY,
ONE DAY updates!

We specialize in
safe bathing. Grab

bars, no slip flooring
& seated showers.
Call for a free in-

home consultation:
1-844-519-3621

Home Services

CROSS COUNTRY
MOVING. $799
Long Distance

Movers. Get Free
quote on your long
distance move 1-

800-864-4508

CALL EMPIRE
TODAY® to sched-

ule a FREE in-
home estimate on

Carpeting and
Flooring. Call

Today! 800-860-
0392

VIVINT SMART &
COMPLETE Home

Security. Easily
manage anywhere,

Professional
Installations early
as Tomorrow, $0

Activation. Call For
a Free Quote,

Contract Options. 1-
800-878-7568

DEALING WITH
WATER DAMAGE
requires immediate
action. Local profes-
sionals that respond

immediately.
Nationwide and

24/7. No mold calls.
Call today! 1-800-

218-7180

Insurance Services

DENTAL INSUR-
ANCE. Call

Physicians Mutual
Insurance Company

for details. NOT
just a discount plan,
REAL coverage for

350 procedures.
844-478-8530 or
http://www.den-
tal50plus.com/26

Ad# 6118

Internet/Phone
Service

AT&T INTERNET.
Get More For Your

High-Speed

Internet Thing.
Starting at

$40/month w/12-mo
agmt. Includes 1 TB
of data per month.
Ask us how to bun-
dle and SAVE! Geo
& svc restrictions

apply. Call us today
1-877-686-4720

EARTHLINK
HIGH SPEED
INTERNET. As

Low As
$14.95/month (for

the first 3 months.)
Reliable High

Speed Fiber Optic
Technology. Stream
Videos, Music and

More! Call
Earthlink Today 1-

866-930-8254

FRONTIER COM-
MUNICATIONS

Internet Bundles.
Serious Speed!
Serious Value!

Broadband Max -
$19.99/mo or

Broadband Ultra -
$67.97/mo. Both

include FREE WiFi
Router. Call for

Details! 1-855-766-
1835

HughesNet SATEL-
LITE INTERNET -
25mbps starting at

$49.99/mo! Get
More Data FREE
Off-Peak Data.
FAST download

speeds. WiFi built
in! FREE Standard

Installation for
lease customers!

Limited Time, Call
1-844-804-1300

SPECTRUM

TRIPLE PLAY! TV,
Internet & Voice for
$29.99 ea. 60 MB
per second speed.

No contract or com-
mitment. More

Channels. Faster
Internet. Unlimited
Voice. Call 1-844-

359-2853

VIASAT SATEL-
LITE INTERNET.

Up to 12 Mbps
Plans Starting at
$30/month. Our

Fastest Speeds (up
to 50 Mbps) &

Unlimited Data
Plans Start at

$100/month. Call
Viasat today! 1-866-

654-6129

Legal Services

UNABLE TO

WORK due to
injury or illness?

Call Bill Gordon &
Assoc., Social

Security Disability
Attorneys! FREE
Evaluation. 1-888-

965-8450 Mail:
2420 N St NW,

Washington DC.
Office: Broward Co.
FL. (TX/NM Bar.)

Legal/Real Estate

ARE YOU
BEHIND on your

mortgage pay-
ments? Could your
house go into fore-

closure? The
Foreclosure Defense

helpline can help
save your home.

Call now. 1-800-758-
4070
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crement 9 covers 
an area of approx-
imately 31.08 
acres located 1.00 
miles southeast of 
Printer in Floyd 
County.
The permit area is 
approx imate l y  
1.10 miles south-
east from KY 
Route 2030's junc-
tion with KY 
Route 122 and lo-
cated on Shop 
Branch.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 1 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$91,800.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$91,800 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 4 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 5 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 6 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 7 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 8 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$75,000.  Approxi-
mately 60% of the 
original bond 
amount of 
$75,000 is includ-
ed in this applica-
tion for release.  
The bond now in 
effect for Incre-
ment 9 is a surety 
bond in the 
amount of 
$123,400.  Ap-
proximately 60% 
of the original 
bond amount of 
$123,400 is in-
cluded in this ap-
plication for re-
lease.  
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 1 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring of 2018. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 4 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Summer of 2016. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 5 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring of 2013. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
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backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 6 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring of 2018. 

Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 7 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 

was completed in 
Spring of 2016. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-
crement 8 in-
cludes: backfill-

ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring of 2016. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.
Reclamation work 
performed for In-

crement 9 in-
cludes: backfill-
ing, grading and 
seeding which 
was completed in 
Spring of 2016. 
Results thus far 
achieved are 
backfilling, grad-
ing, and initial re-
vegetation of dis-
turbed areas.

Written com-
ments, objections, 
and request for a 
public hearing or 
informal confer-
ence must be filed 
with the Director, 
Division of Mine 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement, 300 
Sower Boulevard, 
Frankfort, Ken-

tucky 40601 by 
February 18, 
2019.
A public hearing 
has been sched-
uled for Tuesday, 
February 19, 2019 
at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Division of 
Mine Reclamation 
and Enforce-
ment's Prestons-

burg Regional Of-
fice, 3140 South 
Lake Drive, Suite 
6, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653. 
The hearing will 
be cancelled if no 
request for a 
hearing or infor-
mal conference is 
received by Feb-
ruary 18, 2019.
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